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Borden Ladner Gervais 

Our File # 339583-000238 

By electronic filing 

August 14, 2017 

Kirsten Walli 
Board Secretary 
Ontario Energy Board 
P.O. Box 2319 
2300 Yonge Street 
27th  floor 
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 

Dear Ms. Walli 

Re: 	Ontario Power Generation Inc. ("OPG") 
Application for Payment Amounts from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 
Board File #: EB-2016-0152 

Pursuant to the Board's Procedural Order dated July 11, 2017, we enclose a Cost Claim on 
behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME"), for services rendered up to 
and including May 29, 2017. 

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to OPG as instructed in the Procedural Order. 

Please note that the time claimed on behalf of Vincent J. DeRose includes the time recorded 
while he was a partner at this firm, as well as time recorded as co-counsel to CME as a member 
of the firm of Tereposky & DeRose LLP. Mr. DeRose's hourly rate of $290.00 applies to all 
hours recorded in this Cost Claim. 

Based upon the hours spent by all counsel, CME's total fees in this claim would be 
$184,424.00. We have voluntarily reduced Scott Pollock's fees by $15,130.00, which reduces 
the total fees to $169,294.00. 

At the time of the Pre-hearing Conference and the Technical Conference, CME confirmed that 
they would not be billing Scott Pollock's time for these activities, which represent 23.6 hours 
and $4,000.00. The reduction of $15,130.00 includes removal of all of his time dealing with the 
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Borden Ladner Gervais 

Pre-Hearing Conference and Technical Conference, and also includes a substantial reduction for 
the time attributable to the Oral Hearing and Argument Preparation. 

The overall reduction is intended to address overlap between Mr. Pollock and Ms. Blanchard 
and Mr. DeRose, which overlap was necessary in order to bring Mr. Pollock up to speed on the 
complex issues involved in this case. 

We hope the Board will appreciate our proactive review of the reasonableness of this Cost 
Claim. 

Please contact us if you have any questions or require any additional information. 

Yours very truly 
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August 14, 2017 

AA  
ure of 	iant 

orn or affil d before me at the City of 

in the Province of 	Ontario 

Ottawa 

, on 

Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements 

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and 

electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in 

the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed. 

Instructions 
- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations. 

All claims must be in Canadian dollars, If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency. 

Rate: 
	

Country: 

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements 

Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and 

Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. 

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. 

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff. 

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided. 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment amounts for 

File # EB- 2016-0152 	 Process: the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Affiant's Name: Emma Blanchard 

    

HST Number: 	10807 5482 RT0001 	 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00% 

	

Full Registrant 	❑ 	 Qualifying Non-Profit 	❑ 

	

Unregistered 	❑ 	 Tax Exempt 	❑ 

	

Other 
	

1 

Affidavit 

Emma Blanchard , of the City of 	Ottawa 

   

in the Province of 
	

Ontario 	 , swear or affirm that: 

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being 

Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements 

Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process 

referred to above. 

4. This cost claim does:not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in 

sect' .s 6.05 ancf6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. 

(date) 

Commissioner for taking Affidavits 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Affidavit and Summary $f Fees and Disbursements 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment 

amounts for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 

File # EB- 2016-0152 
	

Process: 2021 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Legal/consultant/other fees $169,294.00 

Disbursements $9,424.35 

HST $23,233.38 

Total Cost Claim $201,951.73 

Payment Information  

Make cheque payable to: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 

Send payment to this address: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP 

Attention: Emma Blanchard 

World Exchange Plaza 

100 Queen Street, Suite 1300 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

File # EB- 2016-0152 

Ontario Power Generation Inc, Application for payment amounts 

Process: for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 

    

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Service Provider Name: Vincent J. DeRose 

Service Provider Type 	(check one) 

	

Legal Counsel 	ig 

	

Articling Student/Paralegal 	❑ 

	

Consultant 	❑ 

	

Analyst 	❑ 

	

For Consultant/Analyst: 	❑ 	CV attached 

❑ CV provided 

Year Called to 

Bar 
Completed Years Practising/Years of 

relevant experience 

16 2001 

within previous 

HST Rate Charged 

24 months 

Hourly Rate: 	$290.00 

(enter %) 	13% 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Pre-Hearing Conference 

Hours Hourly rate Subtotal HST Total 

Preparation 50.5 $290.00 $14,645.00 $1,903.85 $16,548.85 

Attendance $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Technical Conference 

Preparation 27.3 $290.00 $7,917.00 $1,029.21 $8,946.21 

Attendance 9.0 $290.00 $2,610.00 $339.30 $2,949.30 

Interrogatories 	 Preparation 44.4 $290.00 $12,876.00 $1,673.88 $14,549.88 

Responses $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Issues Conference 

Preparation $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Attendance $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

ADR - Settlement Conference 

Preparation 20.4 $290.00 $5,916.00 $769.08 $6,685.08 

Attendance 16.7 $290.00 $4,843.00 $629.59 $5,472.59 

Proposal Preparation $290.00 

Argument 	 Preparation 17.2 $290.00 $4,988.00 $648.44 $5,636.44 

Oral Hearing 	 Preparation 

Attendance 

81.5 

19.9 

$290.00 

$290.00 

$23,635.00 

$5,771.00 

$3,072.55 

$750.23 

$26,707.55 

$6,521.23 

Other Conferences 

Preparation $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Attendance $290.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$170.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Case Managemen 

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES $83,201.00 $10,816.13 $94,017.13 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

File #: 	EB-2016-0152 

Process: 
	

Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG) 2017-2011 Payment Amounts Application 

Party: 
	

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters (CME) 

Name: 	Vince DeRose (VJD) 

Mar 29-16 Review Stakeholder material; prepare for teleconference with 1.5 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Intervenors 

Mar 30-16 Meeting with E. Blanchard; prepare for and attend meeting with 3.4 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Intervenors 

May 27-16 Review Application 1.7 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

May 29-16 Review Application and evidence 4.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

May 30-16 Review Application 4.5 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

May 31-16 Review Rate Impacts of Application 1.1 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

June 1-16 Review evidence 1.8 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

June 3-16 Review evidence re benchmarking 1.3 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

July 8-16 Review Application re Rate Impacts on commercial and 
manufacturing sectors 

2.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

July 13-16 Review evidence re benchmarking 3.6 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

July 26-16 Meet with E. Blanchard re benchmarking experts 0.2 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Aug 2-16 Review Application and evidence 4.3 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Aug 4-16 Review Application and evidence; participate in intervenor 
teleconference re issues identified and division of labour 

5.3 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Aug 5-16 Review Application and evidence 3.7 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Aug 22-16 Review evidence 2.3 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Sept 1-16 Prepare for and attend OPG presentation 1.8 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Sept 7-16 Review evidence re business planning 2.1 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Sept 8-16 Review evidence for development of Interrogatories 3.2 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Sept 19-16 Review evidence and prepare Interrogatories 6.3 Interrogatories Prep 

Sept 20-16 Draft Interrogatories and review related evidence 5.3 Interrogatories Prep 

Sept 21-16 Review evidence re Interrogatories 6.6 Interrogatories Prep 

Sept 22-16 Prepare Interrogatories 3.8 Interrogatories Prep 

Sept 28-16 Review correspondence re experts; review and respond to 
emails from intervenors related thereto 

0.6 Interrogatories Prep 

1 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Sept 29-16 Review Board Staff Interrogatories and prepare CME 5.3 Interrogatories Prep 

Interrogatories 

Sept 30-16 Review evidence and continue drafting Interrogatories 2.3 Interrogatories Prep 

Oct 1-16 Review Board Staff Interrogatories; draft Interrogatories, 
including review of relevant evidence 

5.2 Interrogatories Prep 

Oct 2-16 Review Board Staff Interrogatories; draft Interrogatories including 
review of relevant evidence 

3.6 Interrogatories Prep 

Oct 3-16 Review Board Staff Interrogatories; draft Interrogatories including 
review of relevant evidence; finalize Interrogatories 

5.4 Interrogatories Prep 

Oct 31-16 Review Interrogatories of other intervenors 5.8 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 1-16 Review Decision re Confidential Filings and Procedural Order 0.3 Tech Conf. Prep 

No. 3 

Nov 3-16 Review Interrogatory Responses 6.6 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 4-16 Review Interrogatories 3.2 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 9-16 Review Interrogatories; draft email to V. Binette re time estimates 4.4 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 11-16 Prepare for Technical Conference 1.4 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 13-16 Prepare for Technical Conference 1.4 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 14-16 Prepare for Technical Conference 2.3 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 14-16 Attend Technical Conference 4.5 Tech Conf. Attend 

Nov 15-16 Prepare for Technical Conference 1.9 Tech Conf. Prep 

Nov 15-16 Attend Technical Conference 4.5 Tech Conf. Attend 

Nov 23-16 Review Board Staff Expert Report 2.7 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Jan 3-17 Prepare for Settlement Conference 2.3 Settlement Conf. Prep 

Jan 4-17 Prepare for Settlement Conference 5.9 Settlement Conf. Prep 

Jan 5-17 Prepare for Settlement Conference 5.8 Settlement Conf. Prep 

Jan 6-17 Prepare for Settlement Conference 5.3 Settlement Conf. Prep 

Jan 9-17 Prepare for Settlement Conference 1.1 Settlement Conf. Prep 

Jan 9-17 Attend Settlement Conference 6.8 Settlement Conf. Attend 

Jan 10-17 Attend Settlement Conference 6.2 Settlement Conf. Attend 

Jan 11-17 Attend Settlement Conference 3.7 Settlement Conf. Attend 

Jan 16-17 Prepare for hearing 3.7 Oral Hearing Prep 

Jan 17-17 Review draft settlement 0.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Jan 19-17 Prepare for hearing 4.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Jan 20-17 Review revised settlement wording and draft email confirming 
support 

0.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Jan 24-17 Prepare for hearing 2.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

2 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Jan 25-17 Prepare for hearing 5.6 Oral Hearing Prep 

Jan 31-17 Review Decision on Confidentiality; prepare for hearing 3.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 2-17 Review OPG Expert Comparison Report, Technical Conference 
transcripts on Darlington Refurb and related evidence in 
preparation for hearing 

6.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 7-17 Prepare for hearing 3.7 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 9-17 Meet with E. Blanchard; review evidence and Interrogatories re 4.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Darlington Refurbishment 

Feb 13-17 Review hearing plan 0.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 13-17 Review OPG amendments to evidence 0.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 15-17 Prepare for hearing 4.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 21-17 Prepare for hearing 4.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 22-17 Prepare for hearing 5.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 23-17 Review revised Settlement Agreement 0.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 23-17 Review OPG submission on the settlement and prepare for 
hearing 

4.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 23-17 Prepare for hearing 1.9 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 24-17 Review correspondence from counsel for OPG and consider 
prioritization of issues 

0.6 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 26-17 Prepare for hearing 3.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 27-17 Prepare for hearing 1.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 27-17 Attend hearing 6.6 Oral Hearing Attend 

Feb 27-17 Prepare for hearing 2.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 28-17 Prepare for hearing 1.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 28-17 Attend hearing 7.2 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 9-17 Review Darlington Economic Benefits and Compensation 
evidence 

2.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 27-17 Prepare for hearing 4.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 28-17 Prepare for hearing 6.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 29-17 Prepare for hearing 3.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 30-17 Attend hearing 6.1 Oral Hearing Attend 

May 24-17 Review OPG Submissions and Board Submissions; emails to 
and from E. Blanchard re CME Submissions 

4.5 Argument Preparation 

May 26-17 Review CME draft Submissions and related evidence and 
transcripts 

4.5 Argument Preparation 

May 27-17 Review CME draft Submissions and evidence re Compensation 3.7 Argument Preparation 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

May 28-17 	Review and amend draft Submissions 4.5 	Argument Preparation 

Total Hours for Vince DeRose: 	286.9 

Hours 

Pre-hearing Conf. Prep 50.5 

Pre-hearing Conf. Attend 0.0 

Technical Conf. Prep 27.3 

Technical Conf. Attend 9.0 

Interrogatories Prep 44.4 

Interrogatories Responses 0.0 

Issues Conf. Prep 0.0 

Issues Conf. Attend 0.0 

Settlement Conf. Prep 20.4 

Settlement Conf. Attend 16.7 

Settle. Conf. Proposal Prep 0.0 

Oral Hearing Prep 81.5 

Oral Hearing Attend 19.9 

Argument Prep 17.2 

Other Conf. Prep 0.0 

Other Conf. Attend 0.0 

286.9 

x $290.00/hr 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

x $290.00/hr = 

Total Fees for Vince DeRose:  

Fees  

14,645.00 

0.00 

7,917.00 

2,610.00 

12,876.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

5,916.00 

4,843.00 

0.00 

23,635.00 

5,771.00 

4,988.00 

0.00 

0.00 

$83,201.00 

OTT01: 8038025: vl 
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Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Service Provider Name: Vincent J. DeRose Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 

$168.15 $1,293.50 $1,461.65 

$0.00 Transcripts 

Travel: Air 

$0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 Travel: Rail 

$0.00 $0.00 Travel: Other: 

$7.25 

$23.24 

$55.75 

$178.75 

$63.00 

$201.99 

Parking 

Taxi 

$61.03 $530.50 $469.47 Accommodation 

$0.00 $0.00 Meals 

$4.88 Other: Baggage Fee $37.50 $42.38 

$2,299.52 $264.55 $2,034.97 TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment amounts 
Process: for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 File # EB- 2016-0152 

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed 
Net Cost 

Scanning/Photocopying: 	copies @ $0.25 each 

Colour Photocopies: 	copies @ $1.00 each 

Printing 

Courier 

Telephone/Fax 

Telephone Conference Calls 

Telephone Long Distance (from hotel bill) 

Total HST 



Thank y u for flying Porter 
Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: K4CZ5C 

Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to 
departure so we can all depart on 
time. 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

PD 	11:55 PM 
230 
	

Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Arrive at nirpori b 12:57 PM 

-.13.00 PM 
• 

Toronto, CA (Y'I'Z) 

Duration: ike 

5min 

Seats: 11B 

From: 
	

PorterAirlinesatlyporter.corn 

Sent: 
	

February-23-17 1:55 PM 

DeRose, Vincent J. 

Subject: 
	

Porter Airlines Itinerary Ottawa - Toronto - Sun 26 Feb 2017 

SUN 26 FEB 2017 
OTTAWA, CA (YOW) TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ) 

 

E 28 FEB 2017 
RONTO, CA (YTZ) TO OTTAWA, CA (VOW) 

 

PD 
241 

Arr 

4:45 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

by 4:15 PM 

-i5:41 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Duration: .56 

minutes 

Seats: 114 

Vincent J DeRose 

VIPorter Passport 3700003625 

Checked baggage policy 



$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 

Weight 
fee per 

bag 
above 
23kg 

1st bag 2nd bag 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 

Ottawa 

Toronto 
Firm fare 
class 

Toronto 

Ottawa 
Flexible 
fare class 

$77.50 

$89.13 

$77.50 

$89.13 

ay at airport 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please 
be prepared to present your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 —$129.38, taxes 

included. 
See all ca -on ba a e rules 

+ Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

Ii IChecked bags 

Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

OAdd a bao 

OAdd a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

Seat selection 
Ottawa - Toronto 

"Foronto Ottawa 

Enhance your travel experience 

1 reserved seat 

I reserved seat 

Upgrade seats 

COUpgrade seats 

Hertz Car Rental 
(See details) 

2 



$493.00 CAD 

$183.02 CAD 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

CHANGE FEES 

Same-day change per 

passenger" 
Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - 

Toronto 
Firm fare class 

$75 $75 per direction +/- fare difference 

Toronto - 

Ottawa 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 

All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid 
government issued photo identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you 
soon! 

Rated top small airline in the world by 	 Porter Airlines is proud to be rated 
Conde Nast Traveler's Readers 	 an official 4 Star Airline by 
Choice Awards 	 SKYTRAX 
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A, CA (YOW) cto,  

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
	

FW: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - ioronto - Thu 30 Mar 2017 

From: PorterAirlines©flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.corn]  
Sent: March-29-17 11:42 AM 
To: DeRose, Vincent J. 
Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Thu 30 Mar 2017 

 

 

Thank you for flying Porter 
Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: HCSDJH 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to departure so we can 
all depart on time. 

THU 30 MAR 2017 
OTTAWA, CA (YOW) TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ) 

PD 208 	-18:00 AM 
	

9:05 .A. 	 Duration: I he 5min 

'Ottawa, CA (YOW) 
	

Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

)0I1' by 7:14,9 
	 Seats: I 5C 

PD 245 	 M
"Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

7:41 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Duration: 56 minutes 

Seats: 1.!C 



Checked baggage policy 

Vincent J DeRose 

'Val& Passport 3700003625 

1st bag 2nd bag 
Weight fee per bag 

above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto -
Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 
your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes included. 
See all can -on ba 	e rules 

+ Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

liliChecked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto Ottawa 

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

OAdd a bag 

OAdd a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

Seat selection 
Ottawa Toronto 

Toronto Ottawa 

I reserved seat 

I reserved seat 

OUpgrade  

011p_ger 	seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

2 



Hertz Car Rental 
R-,ce detail0 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

$610.00 CAD 

$175.63 CAD 

$785.63 CAD 

Same-day change per passenger' Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

Toronto - Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 
All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 
identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you soon! yporter.com  

Rated top small airline in the world by Conde Nast 	 Porter Airlines is proud to be rated an official 4 Star 
Traveler's Readers Choice Awards 	 Airline by SKYTRAX 



DeRose/Vincent 
	

Issue Date: 26Feb17 
	

Agent: 1628 
	

Reservation: K4CZ5C 

	

1-1 PD 230 N 26Feb17 YOWYTZ 01:55-03:00 	Passenger Fees 

	

PD 241 8 28Feb17 2272011 04:45-05:41 	II  1BAG 	42.38 CAD 

Lj SET 	22.60 CAD 

0 

r
Li 

, 
Payments 	

/ 	,,,,v 

26Feb17 VI XXXXXXXXXXXX2028 	42.38 CAD ) 

....--- 

Z",  

www.flyporter.com 
	

'NOT VALID FOR TRAVEL' 

Aeroport -'Ottawa Airport 
CAN-klv 9b4 OTTAWA 

NSTggVH 898569942RT.CAD 

Exit 3. 	28/02/17 20:01 
Receipt 036721 

Ticket/Billet 
P1 - No. 019620 
26/02/17 12:59 
28/02/17 20:01 
PeriOd 2d7h3' 
(CAN) 

Total 

Payment Recei 
VISA 
XXXXXXXXXXXX2028 
APR#: 	 428121 
REF#: 662597600019693570S 
01 APPROVED-THANK YOU 027 
01 APROUVEE-MERCI 	027 

$63.00 

$63.00 

$63.00 

PA \ 

`1 5 

(4 	 ,7? 

CL? LI 
	

)6) 

Sub Total 
	

$55.75 
.- HST 	13% 
	

$7.25 



Roccipt for The Fah-rnont Royal York, "-.Ioronto 	 Page I of I 

Toronto 
26 Feb 2017 - 28 Feb 2017 

	
Itinerary 1/ 7247198561491 

Booked Rer s 
	

Cost Summary 

Hotel: The Fairmont Royal York 

100 Front St West, Toronto, ONM5J1E3 

Check-in: 26/02/2017 I Check-out: 28/02/2017, 1 room) 2 nights 

Traveller Information 

Vince derose 

Room 1: Room, 1 King Bed, Non Smoking (Fairmont Room) 

Booked Date: 26 Feb 2017 

Room Price 	 C$530.50 

2 nights 	 C$228.65 /night 

Taxes & Fees 	 C$73.20 

Total: C$530.50 
Collected by Expedia 

Paid: C$530.50 
[Visa 2028] 

All prices quoted in CAD, 

tt.) ci 	ri 

to 0 



. n t Date 

*1 -7 (kr) ) 
(AMOUNT 	k ° 	DATE 

I' 0F3 E  

, A 	? 

RECEIPT FOR FARE 

FROM 

TO 	'4-1 d 	')  

CAR NO. 	 DRIVER 

Thanks - Call Again 

Cab No. c) 	 H.S.T. 

From Yo../.--5.s t Cy-4 

To 

Dat 

Signature 

RECEIPT 

Cab No.: 

Amoun $ 

From 

To 
N-■ 

Date 	 Signature 

	G,S,T.it 

For Crown Taxt Corporate & Prepald Card'! 
Please Call 416.750-0224 

or Vlsit wwvherowntaxi.corrA 

DATE 

FROM 

TO 	  N. 
DRIVER'S NAME 

INCLUDES HST 

Tla Darer 	 Witatt,t,f. poi,  HST l000t ism. oLly Go d-.ant.1 
Etc, tticAlc4lar IN  Htottod tho ttthts's HST LegOltood onotoo. odt Lvoot-trf ItHi  Ltd. 

81 LL 

Cab No. 

From .1 " 

TO /7-1 

, Date 

Signature 

Thank You 

vvww.diamondtaxi.ca  

664868 416-366-6868 
' 

HST# 



Service Provider Name: Emma Blanchard 

Year Called to 

Bar 
Completed Years Practising/Years of 

relevant experience 

10 

Hourly Rate: 

HST Rate Charged (enter %) 

$230.00 

13% 

$230.00 $12,443.00 

$230.00 $15,318.00 

File # EB- 20160152 

Legal Counsel 

Articling Student/Paralegal 

Consultant 

Analyst 

For Consultant/Analyst: 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment amounts 

Process: for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 

Ej 	CV provided within previous 24 months 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours 

Pre-Hearing Conference 

Subtotal 	HST 	 Total 

Preparation 	12.3 

Attendance 	3.0 

$2,829.00 

$690.00 

$367.77 	 $3,196.77 

$89.70 	 $779.70 

$230.00 

Technical Conference 

Interrogatories 

Preparation 

Attendance 	4.5 

Preparation 	5.4 

Responses 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 

$1,035.00 	$134.55 

$1,242.00 	$161.46 

$0.00 	$0.00 

$0.00 

$1,169.55 

$1,403.46 

$0.00 

Issues Conference 

Preparation 

Attendance 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 	 $0.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 	 $0.00 

ADR - Settlement Conference 

Preparation 

Attendance 

Proposal Preparation 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 	 $0.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 	 $0.00 

Argument 

Oral Hearing 

Preparation 	54.1 

Preparation 	66.6 

$1,617.59 	 $14,060.59 

$1,991.34 	 $17,309.34 

Attendance $230.00 $10,580.00 $1,375.40 $11,955.40 

Other Conferences 

Preparation 

Attendance 

$170.00 

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES 5,737.81 	 $49,874.81 

Hourly rate 

$230.00 

44,137.00 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Service Provider Type 	(check one) 

2007 E.❑I. 
E 

E 
E1 	CV attached 

$230.00 

$230.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

File #: 	EB-2016-0152 

Process: 	Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG) 2017-2011 Payment Amounts Application 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Name: 	Emma Blanchard (EB) 

Mar 21-16 Attend OPG Stakeholder Information Session re Darlington 8.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Refurbishment Project 

Mar 30-16 Conference with stakeholder representatives re retainer of 
experts to assist in review of Application and division of labour 

1.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

May 19-16 Attend Stakeholder session to review OPG Payment Amounts 
Application (remote attendance by webex/teleconference) 

3.0   Conf. 
Attend 

May 30-16 Prepare materials for brief report to Energy Committee of 0.4 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters re rate application filed on 
May 27, 2016 

July 28-16 Preliminary review of Application re benchmarking reports filed in 
support 

0.5 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Aug 3-16 Conference with CME re review of benchmarking reports 
submitted with Application 

0.2 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Aug 15-16 Review Procedural Order No. 1 0.2 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Sept 22-16 Review materials re Darlington Refurbishment Project 2.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Sept 23-16 Attend untranscribed Technical Conference re nuclear rate 
smoothing proposal and Darlington Refurbishment Project 

4.5 Tech. Conf. Attend 

Sept 23-16 Continue review of Application re Darlington Refurbishment 1.0 Interrogatories Prep 

Project 

Sept 27-16 Prepare Interrogatories 0.2 Interrogatories Prep 

Sept 29-16 Continue drafting Interrogatories 2.4 Interrogatories Prep 

Sept 30-16 Continue drafting Interrogatories 0.7 Interrogatories Prep 

Oct 1-16 Continue drafting Interrogatories 1.1 Interrogatories Prep 

Feb 2-17 Develop hearing strategy with V. DeRose and S. Pollock 0.7 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 21-17 Conference with V. DeRose and CME to confirm instructions for 
treatment of Darlington Refurbishment related issues in 
upcoming hearing 

0.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 27-17 Prepare for cross-examination of Panel 1B 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 28-17 Conference with V. DeRose re Variance Account for Darlington 1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Refurbishment cross-examination questions; develop approach 
to Schiff Hardin and Pegasus panel cross; review transcripts of 
hearing 

1 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Mar 5-17 Prepare for cross-examination notes for Panel 2Aii 1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 7-17 Review Schiff Hardin report and Interrogatories for the purpose of 
developing cross-examination questions 

2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 8-17 Continue review of Schiff report in preparation for cross-
examination 

3.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 9-17 Continue reviewing Interrogatory Responses prepared by Schiff 2.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Hardin and complete cross-examination for Schiff Hardin witness; 
prepare notes for cross-examination of Panel 2aii (Nuclear Rate 
Setting Framework) 

Mar 9-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Schiff Hardin 
witness 

6.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 9-17 Continue review of Interrogatory Responses in preparation for 1.7 Oral Hearing Prep 

Nuclear Rate Setting panel 

Mar 10-17 Continue preparation for cross-examination of Panel 2aii re 2.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Nuclear Rate Setting and Business Planning; review of pre-filed 
evidence and Interrogatory Responses 

Mar 10-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Panel 2aii 1.5 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 13-17 Review PEG report in preparation for cross-examination of 0.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Panels 2Ai and 2B 

Mar 14-17 Prepare for hearing; e-mail to V. Binette; continue review of PEG 
report 

0.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 17-17 Review Interrogatory Responses in connection with preparation 
of cross-examination of Panel 3 B (Nuclear Operations) 

0.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 19-17 Continue reviewing PEG report 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 20-17 Review transcript from hearing of examinations of Panel 2ai re 
overview of Hydro Electric rate setting mechanism; complete 
review of PEG report and LEI report; review Interrogatory 

7.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Responses; prepare notes for cross-examinations 

Mar 21-17 Continue preparing notes for cross-examination of Panel 2aii; 
preparing notes for cross-examination of PEG 

1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 21-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Panel 2aii 7.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 22-17 Prepare notes for cross-examination of PEG; prepare notes for 
cross-examination of Panel 3B (Nuclear Operations) 

3. 5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 23-17 Continue preparing notes for cross-examination of PEG; 
reviewing Nuclear Benchmarking Report (OPG), Scott Madden 
report and Goodnight report; prepare notes for cross-examination 
of Panel 3B 

2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

2 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Mar 23-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Dr. Lawrie 6.5 Oral Hearing Attend 

(PEG) 

Mar 24-17 Attend hearing 2.5 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 24-17 Review benchmarking reports; prepare notes for cross-
examination of Nuclear Operations panel 

2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 26-17 Continue reviewing Interrogatory Responses in preparation for 
cross-examination of Nuclear Operations panel 

2.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 27-17 Attend hearing 7.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 27-17 Continue preparing cross-examination notes for Panel 3B 5.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 28-17 Continue preparing for cross-examination of Panel 3B 1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 28-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Panel 3B 6.5 Oral Hearing Attend 

Nuclear Operations panel 

Mar 29-17 Conference with V. DeRose to review strategy for cross-
examination of Compensation panel and evidence provided re 
staffing levels 

0.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 30-17 Receipt and review of Undertaking responses provided by OPG 
re staffing numbers including allocated staff 

0.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 31-17 Review Concentric Report and work with S. Pollock to develop 
cross-examination questions 

0.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Apr 3-17 Continue working with S. Pollock to prepare cross-examination 1.2 Oral Hearing Prep Oral 

questions for Concentric panel; receipt and review of additional 
answers to Undertakings 

Hearing Prep 

Apr 4-17 Prepare for cross-examination of Panel 5B Corporate Groups, 
Nuclear Liabilities, etc. 

4.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Apr 5-17 Continue preparing for cross-examination of Panel 5B; 
conference with S. Grice (AMPCO), J. Girvan (CCC) to 
coordinate cross-examination topics; telephone call to R. Aiken 
re inflation factor for OM&A costs 

7.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Apr 6-17 Finalize cross-examination questions for Panel 5B 1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Apr 6-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Panel 5B 6.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

(Corporate Common Costs, Deferral and Variance Accounts, 
Nuclear Liabilities) 

Apr 11-17 Review update N3-1-1 and revised Interrogatory Responses; 
preparing notes for cross-examination of Rate Smoothing panel 

2.8 Oral Hearing Prep 

Apr 12-17 Attend hearing and conduct cross-examination of Panel 6 (Rate 3.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

Smoothing) 

Apr 12-17 Finalize cross-examination notes for Panel 6 cross-examination; 
reviewing answers to undertakings 

2.5 Oral Hearing Prep 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FCR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Apr 13-17 E-mail to CME to report on conclusion of hearing; developing 
strategy for preparation of written submissions; brief review of 
transcript of further cross-examination of Panel 6 re Rate 

0.4 Argument Preparation 

Smoothing 

Apr 25-17 Discuss high level outline of submissions on key issues with 0.6 Argument Preparation 

CME 

May 1-17 Continue preparing outline of final submissions 0.8 Argument Preparation 

May 5-17 Prepare for and host intervenor telephone call for the purpose of 
coordinating intervenor final submissions 

2.1 Argument Preparation 

May 8-17 Continue preparing outline of final submissions 1.0 Argument Preparation 

May 12-17 Continue drafting final written submissions 0.4 Argument Preparation 

May 16-17 Continue drafting final written submissions 0.7 Argument Preparation 

May 18-17 Continue developing position re Nuclear Liabilities, including 
review of 2007 decision 

0.5 Argument Preparation 

May 21-17 Review Board Staff submissions; continue drafting CME final 
written submissions 

4.5 Argument Preparation 

May 23-17 Continue drafting final submissions 2.0 Argument Preparation 

May 24-17 Continue drafting final submissions 4.0 Argument Preparation 

May 25-17 Continue drafting final submissions; correspondence with CME to 
confirm instructions re submissions on key points; reviewing draft 
submissions shared by SEC to avoid duplication; review draft 
submissions shared by LPMA to avoid duplication 

12.6 Argument Preparation 

May 26-17 Continue drafting final submissions; review position on key 
issues with CME 

5.5 Argument Preparation 

May 27-17 Draft final submissions 6.7 Argument Preparation 

May 28-17 Continue drafting final submissions 5.2 Argument Preparation 

May 29-17 Final review of submissions; e-mail to CME re final review of 
submissions 

7.1 Argument Preparation 

Hours 

Pre-hearing Conf. Prep 12.3 

Pre-hearing Conf. Attend 3.0 

Technical Conf. Prep 0.0 

Technical Conf. Attend 4.5 

Interrogatories Prep 5.4 

Interrogatories Responses 0.0 

Total Hours for Emma Blanchard: 	191.9 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr 

x $230.00/hr = 

Fees 

2,829.00 

690.00 

0.00 

1,035.00 

1,242.00 

0.00 

4 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Issues Conf. Prep 

Issues Conf. Attend 

Settlement Conf. Prep 

Settlement Conf. Attend 

Settle, Conf. Proposal Prep 

Oral Hearing Prep 

Oral Hearing Attend 

Argument Prep 

Other Conf. Prep 

Other Conf. Attend 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr = 

x $230.00/hr = 

Total Fees for Emma Blanchard: 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

15,318.00 

10,580.00 

12,443.00 

0.00 

0.00 

$44,137.00 

0.0 

0.0 

0.0 

0.0 

0.0 

66.6 

46.0 

54.1 

0.0 

0.0 

191.9 

5 



Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment amounts 

File # EB- 2016-0152 	 Process: for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Emma Blanchard 

   

Statement of Disbursements Bein  'claimed 
Net Cost 
	

HST Total 

Scanning/Photocopying: 3,615 copies @ $0.25 each $903.75 $117.49 $1,021.24 

Colour Photocopies: 63 copies @ $1.00 each 

Printing 

$8.19 

$0.00 

$71.19 

$0.00 

Courier $0.00 $0.00 

Telephone/Fax $0.00 $0.00 

Telephone Conference Calls $16.38 MEM $18.51 

  

Telephone Long Distance (from hotel bill) 

Transcripts 

Travel: Air 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$538.74 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$4, 682.98 $4,144.24 

Travel: Car 

Travel: Rail 

Travel: Other: 

Parking 

Taxi 

Accommodation 

Meals 

Other: 

$28.32 

$612.47 

$70.52  

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$3.68 

$79.62 

$0.00 

$9.17  

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$32.00 

$692.09 

$0.00 

$79.69 

$0.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $5,838.68 $759.02 $6,597.70 



From: 	 Castanza, Suzanne 
Sent: 	 March-11-16 1:18 PM 
To: 	 Velho, Paulina 
Subject: 	 Mt: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa to Toronto Mon 21 Mar 2016 

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  
Sent: March-11-16 1:13 PM 
To: Blanchard, Emma 
Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa to Toronto - Mon 21 Mar 2016 

Thank you for flying Porter 
Booking status: Con firmed 
Porter confirmation number: GCK75U 

Porter only accepts debit or credit payments at check-in and the gate. 
We are now cash free. 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

MON 21 MAR 2016 
OTTAWA, CA (YOW) TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ) 

PD 	16:15 AM 
242 	Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

rrive at airport Sr 5:15 4111 

'7:25 AM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

Duration: 1 hr 

Otn it 

Seats: 44 

 

MON 21 MAR 2016 
TORONTO, CA (YTZ) T 

PD 	:55 PIV1 
269 	Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

Arrive of a' 	5:25 )W 

6:51 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Duration: 56 

minutes 

Seats: 5% 



Blanchard 

tority 1130000825 

 

Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd bag 
Weight fee 

per bag above 
23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at 
airport 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Firm fare 
class 

$0 $0 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 
$77.50 - 
$89.13 

Toronto - 
Ottawa 
Flexible fare 
class 

$0 $0 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 
$77.50 - 
$89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please 
be prepared to present your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

See all carry-on baggage rules 

Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

IliChecked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

OAdd a bag 

OAdd a bag 

   

Scat selection 
Ottawa - Toronto 	 1 reserved seat 	 Upgrade seats 

Toronto - Ottawa 	 1 reserved seat 	 ektipgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

Hertz Hertz Car Rental 
(See details) 

2 



Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

b73i.;„'t 

Same day airport change per 
passenger* 

Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Firm fare class 

$75 $75 per direction +/- fare difference 

Toronto - 
Ottawa 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability 

See all fare rules terms and conditions 

Identification requirements 

All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid 
government issued photo identification 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

, 

We look forward to seeing you 
soon! 

flyportTer.cot 

Rated top small airline in the world by 	 Porter Airlines is proud to be rated 
Conde Nast Travelers Readers 	 an official 4 Star Airline by 
Choice Awards 	 SKYTRAX 

9 



,C OU Tor 

Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: PZM3XR 

Porter only accepts debit or credit payments at check -in and the gate. 
We are now cash free. 

-ter 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

241 YTZ 

PD 	14:59 PM 	15:55 PM 
YOW 

Seats: 54 

Art •-t ai:Tort by 4:29 PM Seats: 54 

Madly ltur.BookIng 

Emma Blanchard__,/ 

VIPorter Priority 1130000825 

PD 	7:25 PM 	-18:25 PM 
246 	YOW 	 YTZ 

BAGGAGE POLICY 

I I Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd bag 
Weight fee per 

 
bag above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at 
airport 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
 

YOW - 
YTZ 
Firm fare 
class 

$0 

$0 

$0 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

YTZ 
YOW 
Flexible 
fare class 

$0 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please 

2 



*Checked bags 
YOW YTZ 
	

Bags not added 
	

CPAdd a bag 

YTZ-YOW 
	

Bags not added 
	

Add a bag 

Seat selection 
YOW - YTZ 
	

1 reserved seat 	 °Upgrade seats 

YTZ - YOW 
	

1 reserved seat 	 °Upgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

Hertz Hertz Car Rental 
(See details) 

RE INFORMATION 

Air transportation charges 
	

$254.00 

Taxes, fees and charges 
	

$129.35 

Total Fare Price 
	

$383.35 

Same day airport change per 
passenger* 

Advance change per passenger 

VOW - YTZ $75 
Firm fare class 

YTZ - VOW 
Flexible fare 	Complimentary 
class 

$75 per direction +/- fare difference 

$50 per direction +/- fare difference 

be prepared to present your Onerary at the airline cheek-in counter. 

Sce full checked barta4ge_rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will he checked at the gate for a be of $47.50 ---- $129.38, 

taxes included. 

See all carry-on baggage rules 

SUMMARY OF PURC 

+ Flights 
YOW - YTZ (paid) 

YTZ - YOW (paid) 



PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  

March-0347 10:45 AM 

Blanchard, Emma 

Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Wed 8 Mar 2017 

Fr:m: 

Sent: 

To:  

Subject: 

i6:41 PM PD 	:j5:45 PM 
243 	Toronto, CA (YTZ) 	 Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Arrive 	 5.:15 PM  

- 

Boarding doses 10 minutes prior to 
departure so we can all depart on 
time. 

WED 8 MAR 2017 
OTTAWA, CA (YOW) TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ) 

155,tration: I lir 

5in in 

Seats not 

assigned 

7--  9:25 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

PD 	18:20 PM 
248 	Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

/1i6 	airport .by 7:20 PM 

Thank you for flying Porter 
Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: N863YJ 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

FRI 10 MAR 2017 
TORONTO, CA (YTZ) TO OTTAWA, CA 

Duration: 56 

ininhies 

Seats not 

assigned 

Emmanlanchard_ 

'---V-113orter Passport 1130000825 

7. 



Checked baggage po 

1st bag 2nd bag 

Weight 
fee per 

bag 
,i)ove 

2.!)kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa 

- $77.50 

Toronto $27.50 - 831.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 - 

Flexible 
fare class 

$89.13 

Toronto 
$77.50 

Ottawa $27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 - 

Flexible 
fare class 

$89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please 
be prepared to present your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked b 	e rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes 

included. 

See all carr -on ba 	e rules 

SUMMARY OF PASFS 

+ Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

." 
ILJChecked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 
	

Add a bag 

Bags not added 
	

OAdd a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

Seat selection 

	

Ottawa - Toronto 	 Seats not assigned 	QUegrade seats 

	

Toronto - Ottawa 	 Seats not assigned 	°Upgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

Hertz Car Rental 

	

(See details) 	- 



$523.00 CAD 

$164.32 CAD 
. 	„„„.. 

$687.32 CAD 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, lees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

Same-day change per 
passenger* 

Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

Toronto - 
Ottawa 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

DAY OF TRAVEL 

Identification requirements 

All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid 
government issued photo identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you 
soon! 

f yporic 

Rated top small airline in the world by 	 Porter Airlines is proud to be rated 
Conde Nast Traveler's Readers 	 an official 4 Star Airline by 
Choice Awards 	 SKYTRAX 



Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to departure so we can 
all depart on time. 

MON 20 MAR 
OTTAWA, CA TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ) 

16:41 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Camtior2: 

PD 220 	12:00 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Prh)e 	 11:00 Aii,1 

1:05 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

Diwation: the 5min 

Seii.s not assigned 

Thank you for flying Porter 
Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: IYVMMN 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

Siviero, Maria 

Sent: 	 March-16-17 4:14 PM 

To: 	 Velho, Paulina 

Subject: 	 FW: Porter Airlines Itinerary Ottawa - Toronto Mon 20 Mar 2017 

Booked with firm credit card for C/M: 339583/238. 

Thanks 

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  

Sent: March-16-17 4:13 PM 

To: Blanchard, Emma <EBIanchard@blg.com> 

Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Mon 20 Mar 2017 

Setits not as.: 



Emma Blanchard -/ 

V [Porter Passport 1 130000825 

Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd img 
Weight fee per bag 

above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto -
Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 
your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes included. 

See all carry-on baggage rules 

.4- Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

Checked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

Add a bag 

Add a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

Seat selection 

Ottawa Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Enhance your travel experience 

Seats not assigned 	 Upgrade seats 

Seats not assigned 	 Upgrade seats 



Grtz Car Rental 
(See details) 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

$598.00 CAD 

$174.07 CAD 

Same-day change per passenger* Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +1- fare difference 

Toronto - Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +1- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 
All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 
identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you soon! 

Rated top small airline in the world by Conde 
Nast Travelers Readers Choice Awards 

Porter Airlines is proud to be rated an official 4 
Star Airline by SKYTRAX 



Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to departure so we can 
all depart on time. 

Duration: 1 hr .5m in 

Seats not assigned 

'8:15 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

PD 244 I 	7:10 PM 
--Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Ar,, ye at iii5Tiori 6},  6: 10 

Thank you for flying Porter 
Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: N97FHT 

within 24 hours of 
departure 

AR 2017 • . 	. 	. 	. 	. 	. 
RONTO,..CA:(yTz).TQ .OTTAWA;,•CAlyQW) • • 	"•.  

Pro a: 	 Siviero, Maria 

Sent: 	 March-22-17 9:25 AM 

To: 	 Velho, Paulina 

Subject: 	 FW: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Wed 22 Mar 2017 

Booked with firm credit card for C/M: 339583/238. 

Thanks 

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  

Sent: March-22-17 9:24 AM 

To: Blanchard, Emma <EBIanchard@blg.com> 

Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Wed 22 Mar 2017 

243 - 	PM 	 6:41 PM 
r oronto, CA (YTZ) 	 Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Durwicm: .36 mii,wes 

fu a. 



Emma Blanchard 

V I Porter Passport I 130000825 

BAGGAGE. POLICY 

1 1 
	

Checked baggage policy 

1st bag ±.nd bag 
Weight fee per 1-4,1 

above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto -
Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 

your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes included. 

See all car -on b 	e rules 

MARY OF PURCHAS 

+ Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

  

illiChecked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

Add a bad 

Ackilixi ba 

   

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

=am— Seat selection 

Ottawa Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Enhance your travel experience 

Seats not assigned 	 Upgrade seats 

Seats not assigned 	 Upgrade seats 

2 



Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

$605.00 CAD 

$174.98 CAD 

$779.95 CAD ) 

See more information 

tlyport 

Hertz Car Rental 
(See details) 

rtl 

Same-day change per passenger* Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

Toronto - Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 
All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 
identification. 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you soon! 

Rated top small airline in the world by Conde 
Nast Travelers Readers Choice Awards 

Porter Airlines is proud to be rated an official 4 
Star Airline by SKYTRAX 



within 24 hours 01 
departure 

Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: I6LLTM 

Thank you for flying Porter 

Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to departure so we can 
all depart on time. 

SUN 26 MAR 2017 
OTTAWA, CA (YOW) TO TOR 

3 

Fr 	 Siviero, Maria 

Sent: 	 March-22-17 1:30 PM 

To: 	 Velho, Paulina 

Subject: 	 FW: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto Sun 26 Mar 2017 

Booked with firm credit card for C/M: 339583/238. 

/  5, 

Thanks 

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  

Sent: March-22-17 1:30 PM 

To: Blanchard, Emma <EBlanchard@blg.com > 

Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Sun 26 Mar 2017 

PD 234 	,4:00 PM 	 -15:05 PM 
	

ati-atiori.. I 

"'"Ottawa, CA (YOW) 	 --Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

al airpori by 3:00 
	 Seats not assigned 

PD 243 . 5:45 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

 

to) 

 

Dataltion: .56 minaies 

   

 

Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

 

Seats on assign, 



Emma Blanchard 

VlPorter Passport 1130000825 

BAGGAGE, POLICY 

I 
	

Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd bag 
Weight fee per bag 

above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advali ee 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto -
Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 
your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked b 	e rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes included. 
See all carry-on baggage rules 

+ Flights 

Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

II1Checked bags 

Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

OAdeatg)a 

CilAdd a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

- Seat selection 

Ottawa - Toronto 
	

Seats not assigned 
	

°Upgrade seats 

Toronto - Ottawa 
	 Seats not assigned 

	
OUpgl<Ide seats 

Enhance your travel .4wrience 

2 



$506.00 CAD 

$162.11 CAD 

$668.11 CAD'', 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

See Complete R 

liertz Car Rental 
Rc dctail) 

Same-day change per passenger* Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

Toronto - Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +1- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 
All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 
identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you soon! 
	 rte. v.com  

Rated top small airline in the world by Conde Nast 
Travelers Readers Choice Awards 

Porter Airlines is proud to be rated an official 4 Star 
Airline by SKYTRAX 

   



,D 12 APR 20.17.  
NTO, CA (YTZ) TO OTTAWA, CA (YOW) 

Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to 
departure so we can all depart on 
time. 

Thank you fwi.  flying P rt 
Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: V5I8RS 

within 24 hours of 

departure 

245 
16:35 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

t airpori b,t 6:05 Pn'i 

-17..31 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Duration: 56 

minutes 

Seats not 

assigned 

PD 

Emma Blanchars1.• 

VlPortcr Passport 1 130000825 

From: 
	

PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  

Seat: 
	

April-0447 9:41 AM 

To: 
	

Blanchard, Emma 

Subject: 
	

Porter Airlines Itinerary - Toronto - Ottawa Wed 12 Apr 2017 

Cloaking 

In Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd bag 

Weight 
fee per 

hag 
aboVC 

Po, in P.m ;enn, 

231tp, 

> 0.--1-1;,,,,  .-a 4 esir,,,,'• 



See all car -on ba 	rules 

$235.00 CAD 

$79.28 CAD 

$314.28 CAD 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

Air transportation charges 

Advance change per passenger 

Hertz Hertz Car Rental 
(See details) 

tnOlete 

advance 	 advance 

Toronto 
$77.50 

Ottawa 
	$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 

Flexible 
	

$89.13 

fare class 

if you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please 
be prepared to present your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See  full checked  bag ea.g.e. rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes  

included. 

4' Flights 
Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

jChecked bags 

Toronto - Ottawa 

Auk-Seat selection 
Toronto - Ottawa 

Bags not added 	 OAdd a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per bag when you pay online 

Seats not assigned 	 Upgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 



passenger* 

Toronto 
Ottawa 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction 41- fare difference 

' Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of-carriage, 

Identification requirements 

All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid 

government issued photo identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We took forward to seeing you 
soon! 

iyporter.coni 

Rated top small airline in the world by 	 Porter Airlines is proud to be rated 
Conde Nast Travelers Readers 	 an official 4 Star Airline by 
Choice Awards 	 SKYTRAX 



within 24 hours o) 
departure 

Booking status: Confirmed 
Porter confirmation number: KDVV6R 

Th nk y u for flying Porter 

APR 2017 
WA, CA (VOW) TO TORONTO, CA (YTZ) 

16:41 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

PD 	215:45 PM 
243 	Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

by 5:75 PM 
Seats not 

assigned 

Emma Blanchard 

V Worter Passport 1130000825 

GGAGE POLICY 

THU 6 APR 2017 
TORONTO, CA (YTZ) TO OTTAWA, CA (YOW) 

r m: 
	

PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  

Sent: 
	

April-04-17 9:37 AM 

To: 
	

Blanchard, Emma 

Subject: 
	

Porter Airlines Itinerary Ottawa - Toronto Wed 5 Apr 2017 

Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to 
departure so we can all depart on 
time. 

PD 	i:10 PM 	'8:15 PM 
	

Duration: I hr 

244 
	

Ottawa, CA (YOW) 	 Toronto, CA (YTZ) 
	 5in in 

Arrive at airport by 6:10 551' 	
Seats not 

assigned 



Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd bag 

Weight 
fee per 

hag 
above 
23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa 
- $77.50 

Toronto $27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 - 

Flexible 
fare class 

$89.13 

Toronto 
$77.50 

Ottawa $27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 - 

Flexible 
fare class 

$89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please 
be prepared to present your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

Carry-on baggage policy 
TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes 

included. 

See all carry-on baggage rules 

+ Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

nitChecked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

  

  

Bags not added 

Bags not added 

Add a bag 

Add a bag 

Save $10 plus tax per hag when you pay online 

*IA- Seat selection 
Ottawa - Toronto 	 . Seats not assigned 	0Upgrade seats 

Toronto - Ottawa. 	 Seats not assigned 	°Upgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

Hertz. Car Rental 
(Sec details) 



DAY OF TRAVEL 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, hies and charges 

Total Fare 

$610.00 CAD 

$175.63 CAD 

$785..(i 1, CAD 

 

Same-day change per 
passenger'5  

Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +1- fare difference 

Toronto - 
Ottawa 
Flexible fare 
class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 

All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid 
government issued photo identification. 

See more information 

Please click here for departure airport information. 

We look forward to seeing you 
soon! 

flyportenc o 

Rated top small airline in the world by 
	

Porter Airlines is proud to be rated 
Conde Nast Traveler's Readers 

	 an official 4 Star Airline by 
Choice Awards 
	

SKYTRAX 



RECEIPT FOR CAB FARE 

6 0 	 /4)11 
A111011k. 	 Date  

T"Far 

To 

No. 	 !Myer 
included In rooter tare 

tc prix 410100 In T.0.1 Mr" 
Emmterit_. 

 

 

' 
Date 

From 

To 	 tiJ et -K 
.27 

Cab No, 	 Driver 	. j. 
•.- 

ilfro/t/ • 

Ltob 1  
REcerPT, FOR CAR FARE 

,.---- (--7 — 
( Arnouf    

,--'  ----  
----------te -- ti / .,•/..., r*. 

From 	 ..',.,-(  ' 	) 	f:',:tte' • 

,„,-/•.-..";;;;;;/,,?;,..etr------T'...„,../ - 

Cab No. 	..•• 	,--///t.'a  Drf,,,, 	,/ 	/ 

/...i-t  ;i'efr'l  FliS T. Included in J.:refare 	' 

To 



- - --Fe.e tiE-C-a-EtiP ii" li-  0 liril, rifi reis, El l• ii \ ril E 	i 

.-:-  
( f.,,, ,,, „/) ., ,._ ,(5),_,,,/' 	Da IL.,V) 1 ( i...n i 7 
' - 	- 	,„.. 	- - - 	,..:' .-„.  

Frio,. 'iii 	• — 	- 	 , 

to 

Co!) No. 
Driver 

/1 11111 1 

p'1,1 

DATE  P.  

A M OLP 

CALL NO. 

CA F.3 NO. 

DRIVER'S NAME _ 

FROM 

TO 

Nor:: &mot/ MT 5 41,21MilABOVE,' iiii.CLIILlES1-157  

in an 	 C=i`araea, aa 	 Jil 

mayb mOlolied "FiOrlottAL."v pCak,ti 	or 

icio aro:Alain mmorror, mit C 	Ciro, 

Job 

RECE.1 PT FOR GAO FARE 

ArreO 
DOte 

From  

TO  

Cob No. 

loctioical in enter faro 

Driver 

Date:„ 

From: 	• 	 e 

To: 

Cab No.: 	 Driver., 

Crodit rap tic claimed at "NOTIM AL" or eprif.c d lo DRIVERS 	
Ere  AD 

Nutt: tom u5t shvie 	in,-Ivh5 G. SI Ortur en lad  cluld3nt watadot,any 

Rt9isirantimbor, not eilepto tsar Tent. 

'1 FOR CAB 
©( 	Au-sou 

cratx4c9 7ortattAa °weir 25 covalz4, 

   

TO 

DRIVER'S FISTrit . 	. „„ 

CABtt 	 • 	.._ FARE PICLUDES HST 

he driver is To Inclopollifil 	 HST inpul crfdid ruay t.11 chddi(di 

DI applied 	, 	1151 registxred numbK, 3 floy;::1 Taxi: 



a 
• - 

(8t, No. 

FrOnI 

- 

To 

w‘vp r  

;--„„ 

eg e-Yee'41; 

.L2'2? 

To 

Date __L 

Signature__ 

CAN 

(613) 744 	3333 

H.S.T. Cab No. 	) 

From 

To 

Date__ „ 

Cab No._ 161 	 

From __ 

To 

Dat 

Signature 

,M(.2  7L. 

r 

Cab No.f7/-- H.S.T. 
'7-777  7' 

 
From 	 :f 	

f 

Merchant. 10: 43260314 

Driver W 52661 

Record NA; 0052 

Sale 

itp,1 	1.0be..1: V t=n 

xxxxxxxxxxxx6009 
AID: 42100D003010 

Entry MAhod: Chip 

Total: CADS 	28. 

011421 	 1R;5i:05 

Re5P Cock: 0,0 
CVO: matuaao 
vu: rio 

C00456 
	

Nde Code: R1821 

4R1rod: Online 
	

Batchil: FJ02 

1R4 Ref R: 

Validati OR C06.: 

BECK TA XI 
CREDiT UNION DR 

Toronto OR M4A 256 
vivwtheck.Wxi,tom 

(416)751-5555 

SALE N\ (P
. 

MID: 5:I13528 
Tit A519528 	REPP: 00000009 
Batch 	158 	SEQ: 158001001009 
03122/17 	 22:51:43 

CVC: 
APPR CODE_ 033281 
VISA 

" '-" "6005p 

\As Ccedit 
AD: A0000000031040 
TVR: OG 05 00 00 00 

.11"0111i Ye..11.A for Choosing 
Ber.iii Taxi 

a Ways try Ord 

G A 



G.S.T. 

BECK TAXI 
 

• 

Cab No. 

1.11:liCS111 tr 

From 	 .,- 62 

To 

A*unt.A., 

r;ercoaric 

ti;',;COPE 	; tvw, 

5.. 

EntrY *thud: ChiP 

24,51 
5 	3.69 

28. 26 

19:1?.:07 

APED CODE: 041741 

VISA 

AMOUNT 
TIP 
TOTAL 

00 _ APPROVED 

Visa Oredt 
Aweaootomolo 

TVR: ea 00 00 00 00 

!2.4:11  1  

$31.63 

Inv11: 0'39510 	Wr Cole: 02191 

Wrvd: Online 	Batchli: (l10948 
TRN Ref Ii, 	997083853273 .5 

Validation Code: 	 50i 

, 
bale 

APoii;:aion 

XXXXXX: .XX 

AID: 
VIS /t1 

flfriunt: 

lip: 

Total e CADS 

2017/03,211 
Re9 Code: 00 
TYR: NWQ8a0 
TS!: I8(50 

;AIG35G5 
A.6663•585 

Catch 4 OCA 
03124117 

FIEEC: 00000003; 
SEC: c01001001003 

1E:30:59 
CVG: Y I 

Thank You for OhousiTig 
Book Taxi 

3 Ways to Ordos- 
pliONE.-*B-APP 

IF 
CAB 375 

IMPERIAL TAXI 
INYNFORD DR 
SUITE 105 

NORTH YORK ON tMC 1,15 
(416) 603-1680 
CAR A507 

SALE 

MR. 6760047 
TO: V0760047 	 00000002 
Batch #: 095 	.5F.O: 05001001002 
03127117 	 23:40:22 
APPR CODE: 049761 
VISA 

AMOUNT 	$21.00 

OD - APPROVED; 41 — 

Visa Credii 
A0000000031D10 

TVR: 00 00 00 00 00 

AC,-  

CL6 



R: 1.,:! 

VSLICO 

TotalICADS 20, 	) 

A4U 

2238  DUNDAS ST W 

TORONTO 	ON f';',A131 I Al_ TAXI 

SALE 

ri:F;;"•; 2722:; 19:2 

01-03.7 

Thank YOU for Ohoosino 
Beck Taxi 

3 nays to Order 
PHONE-INB3-AFP 
-------- 

CAB 2832 
2832P 

BaCK TAXI 
1 CREDIT UNION DR 

Toronto ON, M4A 256 
wvonkbecktaxleorn 

(416)751-555 

MID; 4340946 
TID: A4340846 	REF#: 00000006 
Batch #; 181 	SEQ: 181001001006 
04106117 	 10:03:36 

CVO: Y 
APPR CODE: 000951 
VISA 
f /,4•44.41,ASI,4,1,6009p 

AMOUNT 	 $28.80 
TIP 	_54,2_1 
TOTAL 	 ( $32,76'; 

00 APPROVED 001 

Vi 	Credit 
AID: A0000000031010 
TVR: 00 00 00 00 00 

Thank You for Cl-too*lq 
Tax: 

ep lAlays to Order 

ILRI'153tAt. 	 114 

	

14): 	 VI:AlIf) 

	

12 = 	 rin 

	

; 	 Olio!,SI 

Kitt' 1-10WEIt 
: 

F e 	 • 

CL 610:•:!: 	Cf. .1-8'ic,1•,14::-22i3.2 

CARD 	y_vf " ""600, 

CARD TYPE; - 	 VISA 

DATE 	 2017/04/12 

TIME 	0686 16:41:47 

RECEIPT NUMBER 

C85047216-001401-5980 

--------------- 

PURCHASE 

AMOUNT 

TIP 

TOTAL 

Visa Credit 

A0000000031010 

H9029B224.36E171 

00800080P0-U00 

D7037FYr':Dt.:6G0 

008000M:1i-01300 

ED: 5.985171 
TID: A55-01.72 	I 	00,:if:11005 
Batch 	210 	.0„ 
028117 	 17:4134 

7 
APPR CODE: 0402-9 
VISA 

AMOUNT 	$36.00 ) 

00 - APE'ROVED - 001 

Visa Crecht 
AID: 	3101 0  
TVft CO 80 00 80 00 
Ta F8 CO 

APPROVED,  c,,I.'rr,97r1 
00//00 

pia-17 
CLIS I oil LI COS' Y 

4.!".-;51 Wit 10X1 
eta 

CA(_L NO. 

CA NO. 331 Cl  B  

DRIVER'S NAME 

FROM 	 

TO 	 

N:02g 

NOTE.. AMOUNT SHOWN ANOVE INCIAIDSS RS'S 	r- 
, DRIVER'S HST NO 

.11s,  AST 1:-,/scn Crew, 
mA, 	 •rs, 	 ...f..•••••■• 

• 

DATE 0\109ft 7.  
... 	„.  

, 
AMOUNTS 	 1  

.) 

$31.00 

W00 



ADroport d'Ottawa Airport 
CAN-kiv-  9b4 OTTAWA 

H5TftTVH 896$699420.CAD 

04 	F-Kit_2 	06/04/17 	19:30 
Rect.,  I Pr 	092093 

4' r 
Ticket/B111et 
124 	- 	No: 	075425 
OS/04/1/ 
06/04/12 	19:39 
Period 	:d11133° 
(CAN) $32.00 

Total $32:00 .) 

Payment Received 
VISA 532:00 

1.4 

XXXXXXXXXXXX6000 
APR#: 0152HI 
REF#: 6625976000100763005 
01 APPROVED-THANK YOU 027 
01 ARROUVEE-MERCI 	027 

Sub Total 
1:HST 	13% 
	

$3.68 



I 

PUS-V.1'H ft 

4EIC341E TO PUS-A1EEIS 
M.PUSACRLS.CCIP: 
175 Yonne SL:-ect 
TOKIITO, TJARTO 
416-2€5-3130 

Late: 03/0/2011 	Tia:IS:36 
Trans ft:133102'30356 RegIster:CO2 
Type:lq 

... 	 . 
MALL sap 	 6.99 TO 
1.00 ea ti /0.99/ea 
Dal -  SALADS SELF SERVE 	6.12 TO 
0,54 lb to $11.34 /15 

-- 
3A5 PELLEG51110 GRAPEFRUIT 	1,29 VD 

Sub-Total: 
HST 

5345% 
53418 

Total A210:11i; 

$20.39 f4s.,. ctz,  

3.95 

	

$3.66 	 jj  

	

$1.05( 	Kl) 	I '46 
$23,05 

	

9EBIT 
	

$23.05 

	

Total Tendered: 
	

$23.05 V z 

Thank Yuu For Your Businass • 
Follow us on Facebook 

and %Mel-  11 FusaterisFoods 
HSTP811117-787810001 

Return Policy 
All perisnahle products tf.ot - e returned 

within 48 hours Or  purchase. 
.411 dry goods Aist be retuned 
,lithin 14 days of purchase. 

Re urns or mol-hmg, mst be amoxinied 
by both the product and the receipt. 

\o refunds Of exchange ON danagad goods 
Refunds Will re processed to a gift card 
or bock to original [lethal of pug:el.,. 

TRANiSACTIOn 860050 == 

Hercant TO: 0000102150x04 

ier,k TO: (702 	Ref: 108102903560 
Clerk ID: 70€ 	Shift 6: 

Trans Type 
Gard 4 
Acrocrit 

Entry Mode 

20;7/03/0 
Trace: 06303412 
List-  g: 002 
Metrieval; 000002?4 

PLIRCHAST_ 
XO,WXXXial(4507 

CHEBUM 
Interac 

CHIP 

19:37:18 

B -atth 	555001 

23.05 AELLtrit: 

Totz--1;' 0000 

APPROVR T1T17151 



v Cut 
Silly 	a1? 

Lty Ceotre fermtual Corp 

a b (1,: 	Oil 41 

Frans 	1428920 	 ;1-  
312412017 	55 NJ 	 11  Cus 

Wan Det-T1-ipt. 	 Cost 

tft:  HEALTHY HEAD 

Nei 

• • 	 ' 

B4 1 58 30-13R I 00D I 

113 	R 	s 	(.1 nit 
b8 13  0 7'e l H E 00() 



iii.shon Cain 1-iL,• u, 

Centre irmiml Uurp 

Hf; ' 	• 	alt'zi 

Sem mumuL 
r,nki 

I J; 

$11,30 

MHly UffMnp CdfP 
(dty 	 if,orp 

d 	e 	71" 
li: 	1i378615;Thrv: SITNIANNI!- 

4112P5IY 	CI! 	 ; 
ff, 

1 US HEALTHY IIEAN 	 $/,25 
I DEEP OHIO AGED CHEDDAR 	,p9 

,,,,... 

totrd: 	'.510.1,10 
PST 

HELCOME TO PUSATERfS 
NWH,PUSATERTS,C,OM 
175 Yonge Street 
TORONTO, ON1ARTO 	t, 	/ 
416-355-3130 

Date: 	O'dk27/2011 	Time:IB:12 
Trans 0:10810337907 Re(,',Oster. :003 
Type SAIL 	 Cashier:747 

	

adANt3INA SiWKLINh 	hEVElo 	1,99 HD 
PUSATERI'S SPAGHETTI. & ME 	0.99 

II) 

1.00 EA 0 /$8,99/E4 
ENJOY °OULU_ CHOCOLATE.  CO 	1,29 0 

. _ 

	

Sub-Total: 	$12,27 

	

HST 	$0,26 

	

H3r5% 	$0.45 

	

HSTFO 	$0,12 

	

Total Amount : 	$13.70 

	

VISA 	$13.70 
Total Tendered:C- $13.107  

Thank You For Your Bminess 
Fellow us on Facebook 

end hater 4 PusaterlsFoodF, 
08108111177871110001 

- 1)1 ii."38.  3C) l•',3 Frl 0001 



Moderate, 	 Tel # 	 C.0:,;frmm3,r # 	 Contact 

Emma Bla.- . rArd 	 613-237-5160 	6861,16 	 11!1,-)s. 	Ottawa 	 416-350-2599 

Date / 'flaw 	 Reservation 6 	Billing Reference 	Resemm Lines 	Used Line:, 	Service Typ; 	Reserved Minutes 

5/5/17 1:52 PM 	1000227090 	339582000235  Rt,:wrvationless 	 N/A 

Conference Connection 	 Long Distance 

Participant 	 Start 	 End 	 Duration 	Description 	 Service 	I Toll Free 	Amount 

6132375160 	 1:52:01 PM 	1:56:01 PM 	00:04:00 	Local 	 $0.06 	 $0.00 	$0.06 

Sub-Total 	 $0.06 	 $0.00 	$0.06 

Other Charges 

Type 
	

Description 
	

Quantity 
	

Amount 

Sub-Total 

	

Sub-Total Reservation 6 
	

1000227099 
	

$0.06 

	

HST - Ontario 869413443 
	

$0.01 

	

Grand-Total Reservation 
	1000227099 
	

$0.07 

Moderator 	 Tel 6 	 Customer 6 	 Contact 	 Tel 6 

Emma Blanchard 	 613-237-5160 	686146 	 Facilities Ottawa 	 416-350-2599 

Date / Time 	Reservation 6 	Billing Reference 	Reserved Lines 	Used Lines 	Service Type 	Reserved Minutes 
5/5/17 1:55 PM 	1000227099 	339583000238 	 200 	 12 	Reservationless 	 N/A 

Conference Connection 	 Long Distance 

Participant 	 Start 	End 	 Duration 	Description 	 Service 	I Toll Free 	Amount 

4162600225 	 2:01:08 PM 	2:12:08 PM 	00:11:00 	Local 

4162601109 	 2:10:58 PM 	3:40:58 PM 	01:30:00 	Local 

4163227936 	 2:00:46 PM 	3:40:46 PM 	01:40:00 	Local 

4164833300 	 2:00:11 PM 	4:09:11 PM 	02:09:00 	Local 

4164833300 	 2:03:11 PM 	3:40:11 PM 	01:37:00 	Local 

4169649223 	 1:59:51 PM 	3:40:51 PM 	01:41:00 	Local 

5193514331 	 1:56:34 PM 	3:40:34 PM 	01:44:00 	Local 

6047255484 	 2:01:37 PM 	3:40:37 PM 	01:39:00 	Local 

6132375160 	 1:55:46 PM 	3:40:46 PM 	01:45:00 	Local 

6474084501 	 2:01:02 PM 	2:57:02 PM 	00:56:00 	Local 

9055422250 	 2:07:21 PM 	3:40:21 PM 	01:33:00 	Local 

Participant 	 2:02:03 PM 	3:44:03 PM 	01:42:00 	Local 

Sub-Total 

Other Charges 

Type 	 Description 	 Quantity 

Sub-Total 

$0.16 $0.00 $0.16 

$1.35 $0.00 $1.35 

$1.50 $0.00 $1.50 

$1.94 $0.00 $1.94 

$1.46 $0.00 $1.46 

$1.52 $0.00 $1.52 

$1.56 $0.00 $1.56 

$1.48 $0.00 $1.48 

$1.58 $0.00 $1.58 

$0.84 $0.00 $0.84 

$1.40 $0.00 $1.40 

$1.53 $0.00 $1.53 

$16.32 $0.00 $16.32 

Amount 

Sub-Total Reservation 6 	1000227099 
	

$16.32 
HST - Ontario 869413443 

	
$2.12 

Grand-Total Reservation 	1000227099 
	

$18.44 



$0.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment amounts 

Process: for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 File # EB- 2016-0152 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Service Provider Type 	(check one) 

Legal Counsel 

Articling Student/Paralegal 

Consultant 

Analyst 

For Consultant/Analyst: 
	

❑ 	CV attached 

Completed Years Practising/Years of 

relevant experience 

Hourly Rate:I 	$170.00 

HST Rate Charged (enter %) 
	

13% 

Service Provider Name: Scott Pollock 

Year Called to 

Bar 

2016 

❑ CV provided within previous 24 months 

Statement of Fees Being Claimed 

Hours Hourly rate Subtotal Total 

Pre-Hearing Conference 

Technical Conference 

Preparation 

Attendance 

Interrogatories 	 Preparation 

Responses 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$170.00 

	

$0.00 	$0.00 

	

$0.00 	$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Preparation $170.00 

 

Attendance $170.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Issues Conference 

Preparation 

Attendance 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$ao() 	$0.00 

$0.00 	$0.00 

ADR - Settlement Conference 

Preparation 

Attendance 

Proposal Preparation 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$170.00 

	

$0.00 	$0.00 

	

$0.00 	$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

121.7 Argument 	 Preparation $170.00 $20,689.00 	$2,689.57 $23,378.57 

Oral Hearing 	 Preparation 

Attendance 

$13,804.00 

$7,463.00 

$1,794.52 

$970.19 

$15,598.52 

$8,433.19 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$170.00 

$170.00 

TOTAL. SERVICE PROVIDER FEES 	 $41,956.00 

$0.00 

$5,454.28 	 $47,410.28 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FC77. HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

File #: 

Process: 

EB-2016-0152 

Ontario Power Generation Inc. (OPG) 2017-2011 Payment Amounts Application 

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 

Name: Scott Pollock (SP) 

Nov 14-16 Attend Technical Conference for the Darlington Refurbishment 0.0 Tech, Conf. Attend 

Project 

Nov 15-16 Attend Technical Conference for the Darlington Refurbishment 0.0 Tech. Conf. Attend 

Project 

Nov 16-16 Review OPG's Rate Application evidence package 0.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Nov 17-16 Review OPG's Rate Application evidence package 0.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Nov 18-16 Review evidence submitted by OPG in their rate application 0.0 Pre-Hearing Conf. Prep 

Jan 10-17 Review OPG's Application, the Willis Towers Watson report on 2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Compensation benchmarking, and the London Economics 
International LLC Total Factor Productivity report 

Jan 11-17 Review the London Economics International LLC Total Factor 1.6 Oral Hearing Prep 

Productivity report and the Navigant benchmarking report 

Jan 23-17 Review Total Factor Productivity reports from Pacific Economics 3.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Group Research LLC and London Economics International LLC 

Jan 24-17 Review Total Factor Productivity reports from Pacific Economics 5.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Group Research LLC and London Economics International LLC 

Jan 25-17 Review Total Factor Productivity reports from Pacific Economics 2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Group Research LLC and London Economics International LLC 

Jan 26-17 Review Dr. Villadsen's report on Common Equity Ratio for 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

OPG's Regulated Generation 

Jan 27-17 Review Total Factor Productivity reports from Pacific Economics 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Group Research LLC and London Economics International LLC 

Jan 30-17 Review Total Factor Productivity reports from Pacific Economics 1.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Group Research LLC and London Economics International LLC 

Jan 30-17 Review Common Equity Ratio reports from Concentric Energy 2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Advisors and the Brattle Group 

Jan 31-17 Review Common Equity Ratio reports from Concentric Energy 2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Advisors and the Brattle Group 

Feb 2-17 Meet with V. DeRose and E. Blanchard regarding preparation 
for hearing 

0.7 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 2-17 Review Common Equity Ratio reports from Concentric Energy 4.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Advisors and the Brattle Group 

1 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Feb 7-17 Review Common Equity Ratio reports from Concentric Energy 0.9 Oral Hearing Prep 

Advisors and the Brattle Group 

Feb 22-17 Review the Darlington Refurbishment Program report by Schiff 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Hardin, LLP 

Feb 23-27 Review the Darlington Refurbishment Program report by Schiff 0.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Hardin, LLP 

Feb 27-17 Meet with E. Blanchard re OPG cross-examination schedule 0.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Feb 27-17 Review CME and SEC Interrogatories; review the Pegasus 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Global report on Risk Management 

Feb 28-17 Review of Pegasus and Schiff Hardin reports 0.6 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 2-17 Attend cross-examination of Panel 1B 6.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 3-17 Attend cross-examination of Panel 1B 3.7 Oral Hearing Attend 

Mar 3-17 Review cross-examination transcripts of the previous days for 
future submissions to the Board 

1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 6-17 Attend cross-examination of Panel 1B and P. Galloway of 5.7 Oral Hearing Attend 

Pegasus Global Holdings 

Mar 6-17 Review cross-examination transcripts of the previous days for 
references to Schiff Hardin and the Memorandum of Agreement; 
review transcripts for future submissions to the Board 

1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 7-17 Attend cross-examination of P. Galloway of Pegasus Global 6.0 Oral Hearing Attend 

Holdings and Panel 2aii 

Mar 8-17 Assist with preparation for cross-examination on K. Roberts and 2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Panel 2aii; meet with E. Blanchard 

Mar 9-17 Review the Schiff Hardin testimony in preparation for E. 1.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Blanchard's cross-examination 

Mar 10-17 Review cross-examination on the Brattle Group's report; 
reviewing hearing transcripts prior to making submissions 

2.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 11-17 Review transcripts of Panel 1B and P. Galloway in preparation 
for submissions 

2.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 12-17 Review transcripts of Panel 1B and P. Galloway in preparation 
for submissions 

1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 13-17 Review transcripts of Panel 1B and P. Galloway in preparation 
for submissions 

1.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 14-17 Review the Nuclear Operations panel Interrogatory Responses 
in preparation for cross-examination 

2.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 14-17 Review March 9 and 10 hearing transcripts for use in final 
submissions 

2.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

2 



Ontario. Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Mar 15-17 Review Interrogatories for the Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

1.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 16-17 Review Interrogatories for the Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

1.9 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 17-17 Review Interrogatories for the Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

4.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 18-17 Review Interrogatories for the Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

2.4 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 20-17 Review Interrogatories for the Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

2.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 20-17 Review hearing transcripts for use in final submissions 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 21-17 Review hearing transcripts for use in final submissions 1.0 8ral Hearing Prep 

Mar 22-17 Meet with E. Blanchard re Nuclear Operations cross-
examination; prepare materials for compendium for Nuclear 

1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Operations cross-examination 

Mar 23-17 Review Interrogatories for Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

3.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 23-17 Review Interrogatories and other materials for cross-
examination of the compensation witness panel 

0.7 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 24-17 Review Interrogatories and other materials for cross-
examination of the Compensation Witness panel 

1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 24-17 Review hearing transcripts in preparation for final submissions 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 24-17 Review Interrogatories for the Nuclear Operations Panel in 
preparation for cross-examination 

1.2 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 26-17 Review Interrogatories for cross-examination of the Nuclear 0.3 Oral Hearing Prep 

Operations panel 

Mar 27-17 Review hearing transcripts in preparation for final submissions 1.5 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 30-17 Prepare for cross-examination of Panel 5Ai on Capital Structure 
and Cost of Capital 

1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Mar 31-17 Prepare for cross-examination of Panel 5Ai and 5Aii on Capital 4.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Structure and Cost of Capital 

Apr 1-17 Prepare for cross-examination of Panel 5Ai and 5Aii on Capital 4.1 Oral Hearing Prep 

Structure and Cost of Capital 

Apr 2-17 Prepare for cross-examination of Panel 5Ai and 5Aii on Capital 1.0 Oral Hearing Prep 

Structure and Cost of Capital 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

Apr 3-17 Attend hearing regarding Compensation and Cost of Capital; 
prepare for cross-examination of Panel 5Ai and 5Aii on Capital 

8.7 Oral Hearing Attend 

Structure and Cost of Capital 

Apr 4-17 Attend hearing regarding Cost of Capital; cross-examination of 8.7 Oral Hearing Attend 

Panel 5Ai on Capital Structure and Cost of Capital; prepare for 
cross-examination of Panel 5Aii on Capital Structure and Cost of 
Capital 

Apr 5-17 Attend hearing regarding Cost of Capital; cross-examination of 5.1 Oral Hearing Attend 

Panel 5Aii on Capital Structure and Cost of Capital 

Apr 21-17 Examine the hearing evidence in preparation for final 
submissions 

1.6 Argument Preparation 

Apr 24-17 Review evidence in preparation for final submissions 2.6 Argument Preparation 

Apr 25-17 Summarize issue positions and review hearing transcripts in 
preparation for final submissions 

3.1 Argument Preparation 

May 1-17 Meet with E. Blanchard regarding final submissions positions 0.7 Argument Preparation 

May 1-17 Create final submissions outline 3.8 Argument Preparation 

May 2-17 Create final submissions outline 3.8 Argument Preparation 

May 3-17 Create final submissions outline; review OPG's Argument-in- 8.1 Argument Preparation 

Chief 

May 4-17 Create final submissions outline; review OPG's Argument-in- 4.2 Argument Preparation 

Chief 

May 8-17 Meet with E. Blanchard regarding final written submissions 7.3 Argument Preparation 

May 9-17 Meet with E. Blanchard regarding final written submissions 7.2 Argument Preparation 

May 10-17 Draft final written submissions 6.4 Argument Preparation 

May 11-17 Draft final written submissions 0.6 Argument Preparation 

May 16-17 Review other intervenors' submissions; continue drafting final 
written submissions 

2.6 Argument Preparation 

May 17-17 Draft final written submissions 5.8 Argument Preparation 

May 18-17 Draft final written submissions 2.4 Argument Preparation 

May 19-17 Draft final written submissions; review Board Staffs submissions 2.8 Argument Preparation 

May 23-17 Review Board Staff submissions; continue drafting final written 
submissions; meet with E. Blanchard regarding submissions 

11.4 Argument Preparation 

May 24-17 Continue drafting final submissions 7.1 Argument Preparation 

May 26-17 Draft final submissions 8.7 Argument Preparation 

May 26-17 Draft final submissions; review submissions of other intervenors 9.5 Argument Preparation 

May 27-17 Draft final submissions 11.9 Argument Preparation 

May 28-17 Draft final submissions 6.5 Argument Preparation 

4 



Ontario Energy Boar 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees being Claimed 

May 29-17 	Finalize and submit CME submissions 3.6 	Argument Preparation 

Total Hours for Scott Pollock: 	246.8 

Hours Fees 

Pre-hearing Conf. Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Pre-hearing Conf. Attend 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Technical Conf. Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Technical Conf. Attend 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Interrogatories Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Interrogatories Responses 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Issues Conf. Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Issues Conf. Attend 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Settlement Conf. Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Settlement Conf. Attend 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Settle. Conf. Proposal Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Argument Prep 121.7 x $170.00/hr = 20,689.00 

Oral Hearing Prep 81.2 x $170.00/hr = 13,804.00 

Oral Hearing Attend 43.9 x $170.00/hr = 7,463.00 

Other Conf. Prep 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

Other Conf. Attend 0.0 x $170.00/hr = 0.00 

246.8 Total Fees for Scott Pollock: $41,956.00 

5 



Ontario Power Generation Inc. Application for payment amounts 

File # EB- 20160152 
	

Process: for the period from January 1, 2017 to December 31, 2021 

Party: 	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters 	Service Provider Name: Scott Pollock 

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed 
Net Cost 	 HST Total 

$0.00 

$1,490.01 

$60.69 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$193.70 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$7.89  

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$1,683.71 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$68.58 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Scanning/Photocopying: 	copies @ $0.25 each 

Colour Photocopies: 	copies @ $1.00 each 

Printing 

Courier 

Telephone/Fax 

Telephone Conference Calls 

Telephone Long Distance (from hotel bill) 

Transcripts 

Travel: Air 

Travel: Car 

Travel: Rail 

Travel: Other: 

Parking 

Accommodation 

Meals 

Other: 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $1,550.70 $201.59 $1,752.29 

Ontario Energy Board 

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed 



Good MorningP.aulina,--... 

Below /s flight info for Scott Pollock -%339583-000238. 

Thank you, 

Casta 

From: 
Sent: 

To: 

Subject: 

Cambareri, Angela 

March-03-17 10:03 AM 

Velho, Paulina 

FVV: Porter Airlines Itinerary Ottawa - Toronto - Wed 1 Mar 2017 

Angela Ca.rnbareri 
Practice Assistant to Dan Palayew, Duncan Ault and Scott Pollock 

T 613.237.0234 ext.30461I F 613.230-8842 I acambareriP,b1q.com   

World Exchange Plaza, 100 Queen St, Suite 1300, Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9 

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP I It begins with service 

Calgary I Montreal I Ottawa I Toronto I Vancouver 

blci.com   

Please consider the environment before printing this email. 

This message is intended only for the named recipients. This message may contain information that is privileged, 

confidential or exomet from disclosure under applicable Piw. Any dissemination or copying of this message by anyone 

other than a NI:Tied recTpient is sidotly prohibited. If you are not a named recipient or an empioyee or agent 

responsiPie for delvering it s messego to .s named recipient, pfease notify us immediately, and permanently destroy 

this message and any copies you may have. Warning: Erna:: May not be secure unless properly encrypted. 

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  

Sent: March-01-17 10:23 AM 
To: Cambareri, Angela 
Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Wed 1 Mar 2017 

Ihaf k y 	r flym 
Booking status: Confirmed 	 within 24 hours of 

departure Porter confirmation number: ISCC9T 



Join VlPorter 

17:41 PM 
- Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Duration: 56 minutes 

Seats: 50 

Modify Your Hooking 

PASSENGER 

Scott Pollock 

OTTAWA, CA (YOW) 

PD 245 	.16:45 PM 
---Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

Arriw 	 by 6:15 PM 

WED 1 MAR 2017 
OTTAWA, 

7:10 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

! y 

1 8:15 PM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

PD 244 Duration: I hr 

Seats: 3D 

'carding closes 10 minutes prior to departure so we can 
all depart on time. 

BAGGAGE 

Checked baggage policy 

1st bag 2nd bag 
Weight fee per bag 

above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto -
Ottawa 
Freedom fare 
class 

$0 $0 $0 $0 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 
your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked ba_goge■-ules 

Carry-on baggage policy 

TWO items of earry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will he checked at the gate for a -fee of S47.50 — $129.38, taxes included. 



$697.00 CAD 

$218.02 CAD 

$915.02 CAD 

C 

See all carry-on 1:)aaaL.,e rules 

Flights 

Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto - Ottawa (paid) 

Checked bags 

Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

*AI Seat selection 

Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

1 bag 	 OAdd a bag 

I bag 	 OAdd a bag 

1 reserved seat 

1 reserved scat 

OUpgrade seats 

Upgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

Hertz Car Rental 
Hertz (See details) 

Air transportation charges 

Taxes, fees and charges 

Total Fare Price 

Same-day change per passenger* ;edvaance change per passenger 

Ottawa - Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +1- fare difference 

Toronto - Ottawa 
Freedom fare class 

Complimentary Fare difference 

" Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identificatior. requirements 

All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 
identification. 



'air? 

From: 

Sent: 
To: 

Subject: 

/I 	• 

Cambareri, Angela 
March-29-17 4:20 PM 

Velho, Paulina 
FW: Porter Airlines Itinerary Ottawa - Toronto - Thu 30 Mar 2017 

Good Afternoon Paulina: 

Bel (w flight k to be charged to 339583-000238 f 4 Scott Pollock.'  

Thank you. 

Angela Cambareri 
Practice AsSistant to Dan Palayew, Duncan Ault and Scott Pollock 
T 613.237.0234 ext.30461IF 613.230-8842 I acambareria.bld.com   
World Exchange Plaza, 100 Queen St, Suite 1300, Ottawa, ON, Canada KIP 1J9 

Borden Ladner Gervais LLP I It begins with service 

Calgary I Montreal I Ottawa I Toronto I Vancouver 
blg.corn  

Please consider the environment before printing this email. 

ThIs 

 

massage is intended only for the named recipients. This message may contain information that is privileged, 

confidential or exem from disdosure under applicable law. Any dissemination or copying of this message by anyone 

other than a named re
pt 

 cipient is virally prohibited. If you are not a named recipient or an employee or agent 

responsido for dolivoring his message to a named recipient, dease notify usimmediately, and permanently destroy 
ens message t:tr,:t any copies you may have. Warning: Email !nay not be secure unless properly encrypted. 

From: PorterAirlines@flyporter.com  [mailto:PorterAirlines@flyporter.com]  

Sent: March-29-17 4:16 PM 
To: Cambareri, Angela 
Subject: Porter Airlines Itinerary - Ottawa - Toronto - Thu 30 Mar 2017 

Thank youf r fly g Pert 
I3ooking status: Confirmed 	 within 24 hours 01 

,i,Torture Porter confirmation number: T7JPEIZ 



tog In doh VIParter 

Checked baggage policy 

10:05 AM 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

P1)212 	9:00 AM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

Toronto, CA (YTZ) 

zIrripe at a 	 7 e pm 

7:41 PM 
Ottawa, CA (YOW) 

10 minutes ;iof to departure so we cyan 
an depart on time 

Seats: I6C 

5 APR 2017 
RONTO, CA (YTZ) TO OTTAWA, CA (YOW 

PD 245 	16:45 PM Duration: 56 minutes 

Seats: 3D 

Modify Your Booking 

Scott Pollock 

1st bag 2nd bag 
Weight fee per bag 

above 23kg 

Pay in 
advance 

Pay at airport 
 Py in 

adavanc e 
Pay at airport 

Ottawa - 
Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto - 
Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

$27.50 - $31.62 $37.50 - $43.13 $37.50 - $43.13 $47.50 - $54.63 $77.50 - $89.13 

If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 
your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules  

Carry-on baggage policy 

TWO items of carry-on baggage are permitted, free of charge, per passenger. 

Oversized carry-on bags will be checked at the gate for a fee of $47.50 — $129.38, taxes included. 

See all carry-on baggage  rules 



Air transportation charges 
	 $540.00 CAD 

Taxes, fees and charges 
	 $228.69 CAD 

Total Fare Price 
	 $768.69 CAD 

e Complete Receipt 

CHA 

0,1Fle,1 

Flights 
Ottawa - Toronto (paid) 

Toronto Ottawa (paid) 

1MChecked bags 
Ottawa - Toronto 
	 I bag 

	
GAM a bag 

Toronto Ottawa 
	 I bag 

	
OAdd a bag 

ita-- Seat selection 
Ottawa - Toronto 

Toronto - Ottawa 

1 reserved seat 

1 reserved seat 

Upgrade seats 

Upgrade seats 

Enhance your travel experience 

Hertz Car Rental 
(See details) 

Same-day change per passenger' Advance change per passenger 

Ottawa - Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +1- fare difference 

Toronto - Ottawa 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary $50 per direction +/- fare difference 

* Subject to availability. 

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

Identification requirements 
All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 
identification. 

See more information 
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