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Ontario Energy Board %%7‘
T

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

T

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the
Affidavit portion is sighed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.
Rate: Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed™ {comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

_ Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB- 2016-0296 & EB-2016-0300 Process: Cap and Trade Costs Compliance
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Affiant's Name: Robert Woon
HST Number: 113627988RT0001 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%

Full Registrant Qualifying Non-Profit [E]

Unregistered L] Tax Exempt O
Other []
Affidavit

1, Robert Woon , of the City/Town of Toronto
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1. | am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party"} and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. | have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of

Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as

described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto p

in the Province/State of Ontario ,on Mov 16, 2015
> (date)

2 i _— -
e~ I"{’/‘{',;’/j_,_/;/i_/’f'

Ze6mmissioner for taking Affidavits

Soctio il [2iBa— SZ/P50
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Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2016-0296 and EB-2016-0300 Process: Cap and Trade Costs Compliance

feh

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant/other fees S 25,022.00
Disbursements S 374.84
HST S 3,301.59
Total Cost Claim S 28,698.43

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Send payment to this address: 1 Toronto Street, Suite 900

Toronto, ON M5C 2V6

Page 2 of 10



Ontario Energy Board E%i
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS r—

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File# EB- 2016-0296 and EB-2016-0300 Process: Cap and Trade Costs Compliance
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Service Provider Name: Joanna Vince
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (checkone) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel 6 |
Articling Student/Paralegal OJ '
Consultant U Hourly Rate:
Analyst []
For Consultant/Analyst: [] cV attached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):
CV provided within previous 24 months
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours | Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation S 170.00|S - S - S -
Attendance $ 17000 (S - IS - S =
Technical Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 | $ - |S - |S »
Attendance $ 170.00 | $ - 1S - |$ -
Interrogatories
Preparation 1.60[$ 170.00|S  272.00 | S 35.36 | $ 307.36
Responses $ 170.00 S - S . S -
Issues Conference
Preparation S 17000 | S - S s S -
Attendance $ 17000 (S - IS - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 17000 $ - S - S -
Attendance S 170.00 (S - S - S .
Proposal Preparation S 170.00 (S - S - S -
Argument
Preparation 9.40| S 170.00 | $ 1,598.00 | S 207.74 | S 1,805.74
Oral Hearing
Preparation 1050/ $ 170.00($ 1,785.00|S 232.05( S 2,017.05
Attendance 19.40| § 170.00|S 3,29800(|S 42874 | $ 3,726.74
Other Conferences
Preparation S 17000 | S - S - S -
Attendance $ 170.00 | S - S - $ v
Case Management 2.60 170.00| S 442,00 | S 57.46 | $ 499.46
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | [$ 7,395.00|3 96135/ $ 8,356.35

30f10



File # EB- 2016-0296 and EB-2016-0300

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Assc

Process:

Service Provider Name:

Cap and Trade Costs Compliance

Wit e

Joanna Vince

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

Scanning/Photocopy

S

362.00

Printing

Courier

12.84

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

[Travel: Car

[Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): ]

[Parking

[Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

W || |nninninninnininninin

1
W[ || W] W ] V] W] V] N ] ] v ||V

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

374.84 | $

4873 | $

423.57

4 0of 10




Ontario Energy Board Eﬁ%’%

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS ——
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0296 and EB-2016-0300 Process: Cap and Trade Costs Compliance
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Service Provider Name: Robert Woon
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (checkone) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel 3 [
Articling Student/Paralegal i
Consultant ] Hourly Rate:
Analyst L]
For Consultant/Analyst: [] cv attached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):
CV provided within previous 24 months
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours [ HourlyRate| Subtotal T HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 | $ - |s E S -
Attendance $ 170.00 | $ - | - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 | $ - s - $ -
Attendance $ 170.00(S - S - S .
Interrogatories
Preparation 5.70( S 170.00 | $ 969.00 [ S 12597 | S 1,094.97
Responses $ 170.00 | $ - | - |S =
Issues Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 | $ - 1S - |S -
Attendance $ 170.00 | $ - | - ]S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 17000 (S - s - $ -
Attendance S 170.00|$ - S . S -
Proposal Preparation S 17000 | S E S - S Z
Argument
Preparation 11.10| $ 170.00 (S 1,887.00|S$ 24531 [ S 2,132.31
Oral Hearing
Preparation 10.00|$ 170.00|S 1,700.00|S 221.00| S 1,921.00
Attendance $ 170.00 | $ - | - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation $ 17000 (S - s - S <
Attendance $ 17000 (S - 1S 3 S -
Case Management 4.30 170.00{ S  731.00|$ 95.03 | § 826.03
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES [ |$ 5,287.00($ 687318 5,974.31
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Ontario Energy Board @
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS e

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0296 and EB-2016-0300 Process: Cap and Trade Costs Compliance
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Service Provider Name: Victoria Chai
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (checkone) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel ] 2017 |7 |
Articling Student/Paralegal
Consultant & Hourly Rate: $100
Analyst ]
For Consultant/Analyst: [] CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours | Hourly Rate | Subtotal HST Total

Pre-hearing Conference

Preparation $ 100.00 (S - S - $ =

Attendance $ 100.00 | $ - ]S - S »
Technical Conference '

Preparation $ 100.00 | $ - |S . S 2

Attendance $  100.00 | $ - |$ - S S
Interrogatories

Preparation 7.00|$ 100.00 (S 700.00 | 91.00 | $ 791.00

Responses $ 100.00 | $ - ]S - |S :

Issues Conference

Preparation $ 100.00|$ - S E $ .

Attendance $ 100.00 | $ - 1S - |$ -

ADR - Settlement Conference

Preparation $ 10000 (S - s . S -
Attendance S 100.00 (S - |s - S .
Proposal Preparation $ 100.00 | $ - | - S -

Argument

Preparation 31.40| $ 100.00 | § 3,140.00 | 40820 | $ 3,548.20
Oral Hearing

Preparation 27.20($ 100.00|S$ 2,72000(S$ 35360 S 3,073.60

Attendance $ 100.00($ . $ - S =
Other Conferences

Preparation $ 100.00 (S - S - S -

Attendance $ 100.00|$ - S - $ .
Case Management 5.00 100.00| S 500.00 | $ 65.00 | S 565.00
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | [s 706000]$ 917.80[$ 7,977.80

7 of 10



Nov/16/2017

Date

Entry #

1341
7067
Jan 30/2017
1790336

Jan 30/2017
1790371

Jan 31/2017
1790628

Feb 1/2017
1791916

Feb 1/2017
1791963

Feb 1/2017
1792008

Feb 2/2017
1792141

Feb 8/2017
1793811

Feb 16/2017
1796252

Feb 17/2017
1796422

Feb 21/2017
1796728

Feb 21/2017
1797537

Feb 22/2017
1797712

Feb 23/2017
1798015

Feb 23/2017
1798021

Feb 24/2017
1798344

Feb 24/2017
1798463

Mar 16/2017
1804807

Mar 20/2017
18091387

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Client Fees Listing
To 0ct/31/2017
Fee / Time Working Lawyer
Explanation _ Type
Ontario Sustainable Energy Association
Re: Cap & Trade Compliance Plans: EB = 2(

Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 57 57
review procedural order no 1; emails Time
with N, Risse and M. Fraser to discuss
draft issues list and next steps;
Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74
consider cap and trade compliance plans Time
procedural orders with R. Woon, review

ROBERT WOON SE!

VICTORIA CHAI

timelines;
Lawyer: 74 2.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review procedural orders for Time

requirements; compile and review

documents from OEB regulatory document

database; consider same with R. Woon;

research requirements for declarations

and undertakings;

Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74
find declarations and undertaking rules Time

and form, consider draft issues list

with J. Vince and R. Woon; consider

next steps; prepare for teleconference

with Nicole and Marion;

Lawyer: 57 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 57 57
review draft issues list and consider Time
comments to same; telephone call with

N. Risse and M. Fraser to discuss draft

issues 1list;

Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
review issues list; telephone call with Time

client to discuss issues list and

likely areas for intervention;

Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
fill out declaration and undertaking Time

forms for J. Vince and R. Woon; have

them sign it and instruct A. Van

Weston to file it with OEB;

Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE
review comments on draft issues list by Time

other intervenors and natural gas

VICTORIA CHAI

ROBERT WOON SE

utilities;

Lawyer: 57 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE
review correspondence from OEB about Time

deadlines for interrogatories;

Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI
emails with M. Fraser re draft Time

interrogatories; review

correspondence from Board re

procedural order no 2 and

correspondence from Enbridge re timing

for responses to interrogatories;

Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
consider interrogatories and review of Time

compliance plan applications with R.

Woon;

Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE
review draft interrogatories prepared Time

by M. Fraser;

Lawyer: 74 2,40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review issues list and compliance plan Time

applications and determine questions

for interrogatories; format

interrogatories into OEB rules format;

Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 S 57 - ROBERT WOON SE]
review application and draft Time

interrogatories;

Lawyer: 74 4.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review compliance plans and determine Time

questions for interrogatories, draft

interrogatories and review with R.

Woon;

Lawyer: 57 4.00 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE]

review Enbridge and Union applications; Time

revise draft interrogatories; emails

and telephone calls with N. Risse and

M. Fraser to finalize interrogatories;

Lawyer: 48 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
review interrogatories from various Time

parties; review and finalize OSEA

interrogatories;

Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review timelines for cap and trade Time

hearing;

Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI

recieve utilities' responses to Time

Hours

Amount Inv#

85.

40.

220.

160.

170.

170.

60.

51.

17.

68.

40.

68.

680.

272.

208

60.

00

00

00

00

00

00

00

00

Billing

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Page:
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Nov/16/2017 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page: 2
Client Fees Listing
To Oct/31/2017
Date Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Amount Inv# Billing
Entry # Explanation Type

interrogatories,; discuss
interrogatories and next steps with R.

Woon ;
Mar 21/2017 Lawyer: 74 1.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 1.20 120.00 Unbilled
1807795 consider strategy and next steps for Time

upcoming cap and trade hearing with J.
Vince and R. Woon; extract responses
from utilities to OSEA
interrogatories; extract other
interrogatories referenced in
responses to OSEA;

Mar 22/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.40 40.00 Unbilled
1808032 extract responses to other Time
interrogatories that were referenced

in the utilities' responses to OSEA
interrogatories; consider same with R,

woon/
Mar 23/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI 0.30 51.00 Unbilled
1808279 emails with N. Risse and M. Fraser re Time

utilities responses to interrogatories
and arrange telephone call to plan for
oral hearing;
Mar 24/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
1808942 emails with N. Risse and M. Fraser re Time
arranging telephone call to discuss
oral hearing and responses to

interrogatories;
Mar 26/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 ~ VICTORIA CHAI 0.60 60.00 Unbilled
1809201 read and review responses to OSEA Time

interrogatories by Union and Enbridge,
review responses to other related

interrogatories;
Mar 27/2017 Lawyer: 74 3.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 3.60 360.00 Unbilled
1810367 review interrogatories responses to Time

other intervenors for related issues;
consider oral submissions with R.
Woon; prepare questions for OEB
hearing; review specific references to
Compliance Plans in interrogatories
responses;
Mar 28/2017 Lawyer: 48 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE 0.50 85.00 Unbilled
1810477 review responses to interrogatories and Time
consider questions for hearing and
OSEA'’s position and objectives;
Mar 28/2017 Lawyer: 74 3.00 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 3.00 300.00 Unbilled
1810492 consider utilities’ cap and trade Time
forecasting, emissions cap and
interrogatories responses with R.
Woon; research emissions cap; consider
questions and strategy for OEB hearing
with R. Woon and J. Vince;
Mar 28/2017 Lawyer: 57 '2.40 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI 2.40 408.00 Unbilled
1810530 review responses to interrogatories and Time
prepare for oral hearing;
Mar 30/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE] 0.30 51.00 Unbilled
1811029 telephone call with M. Fraser and N. Time
Risse re key points for submissions at
oral hearing;
Mar 30/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.20 20.00 Unbilled
1811042 teleconference with N. Risse and M. Time
Fraser to discuss strategy and next
steps for Cap and Trade hearing;

apr 5/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.20 20.00 Unbilled
1813666 review hearing plan from OEB counsel Time
for upcoming Cap and Trade hearing;
Apr 6/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 57/ 57 - ROBERT WOON SE] 0.30 51.00 Unbilled
1814033 receive and review email and letter Time

from OEB re hearing schedule; send
email to N. Risse and M. Fraser re
Ministry notice of proposed changes to
cap and trade;
Apr 7/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE] 0.60 102.00 Unbilled
1814354 review issues list and consider timing Time
required for each issue at hearing;
emails with M. Fraser re timing
estimates for hearing and potential
questions for hearing;
Apr 10/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.40 40.00 Unbilled
1814643 discuss required materials for upcoming Time
OEB hearing; discuss preparation of
questions for cross examination;
Apr 10/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE] 0.50 85.00 Unbilled
1814674 review issues list; emails with M. Time
Fraser re issues and timing for
cross-examination; email Board staff



Nov/16/2017

Date

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Apr

Entry #

11/2017
1816150

12/2017
1816385

12/2017
1816499

1372017
1817161

13/2017
1817164

13/2017
1880142

15/2017
1817299

17/2017
1817431

17/2017
1817542

18/2017
1817610

19/2017
1818283

20/2017
1818288

2172017
1818346

21/2017
1818375

24/2017
1820047

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Fee / Time
Explanation

re estimated time and issues for
hearing plan;

Lawyer: 74 1.40 Hrs X 100.00

review notes and research on Cap and
Trade compliance plans; review
interrogatory responses; prepare
questions for cross examination of
Union and Enbridge for OEB hearing;
consider with R.Woon and J. Vince;
Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00

review and revise draft questions for
hearing;

Lawyer: 74 4.40 Hrs X 100.00

review hearing plan for Cap and Trade
hearing; review interrogatories for
reference in cross examination; draft
cross examination questions and
submissions and background context for
submissions; review DSM attribution
agreement; prepare materials for Cap
and Trade hearing; consider with R.
Woon,;

Lawyer: 57 1.20 Hrs X 170.00

review draft cross-examination
guestions and prepare for hearing;
Lawyer: 74 5.40 Hrs X 100.00

prepare binder of materials for hearing
(evidence, exhibits, interrogatories
and responses); prepare questions for
cross examination; discuss/ same with
R. Woon and J. Vince; research RNG;
review hearing plan and correspondence
from OEB; review revised interrogatory
response to Environmental Defence;
review attribution rules for GIF;

Lawyer: 48 2.60 Hrs X 170.00

review draft questions and prepare for
hearing;

Lawyer: 74 5.80 Hrs X 100.00

draft and revise questions for Cross
Examination of each utility; research
Fortis BC and Hamilton projects;
incorporate excerpts from utilities
evidence and interrogatories responses
to questions; review interrogatories
responses to other intervenors for
relevant guestions and responses;
instruct A. Van Weston to incorporate
new materials into binder for hearing;
Lawyer: 57 3.40 Hrs X 170.00

email with M. Fraser re questions for
cross-examination; review and revise
draft cross-examination questions;
Lawyer: 48 4.60 Hrs X 170.00

review interrogatories and evidence;
prepare questions for Union and
Enbridge;

Lawyer: 48 9,40 Hrs X 170.00

prepare for Enbridge panel; travel to
and attend hearing for cross
examination of Enbridge witnesses;
review and revise questions for
Enbridge panel based on question from
other intervenors and responses;
Lawyer: 48 2.80 Hrs X 170.00

review questions for Enbridge and
revise based on questions already
asked; prepare questions for union;
Lawyer: 48 10.00 Hrs X 170.00
prepare for, travel to and attend
hearing; discussions with counsel for
other intervenors to coordinate
questions;

Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00

review outcome of cross-examinations
and discuss written submission;
Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 100.00

discuss hearing and next steps for
preparation of submissions with R.
Woon;

Lawyer: 74 2.00 Hrs X 100.00

review transcript from oral hearing
first day and mark relevant sections
to be included in written submissions;
review ED compendium;

Client Fees Listing
To ©Oct/31/2017
Working Lawyer

Type

74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
Time

57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE
Time

74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
Time

57 57 — ROBERT WOON SE
Time

74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
Time

48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
Time

74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
Time

57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE]
Time

48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
Time

48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
Time

48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
Time

48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
Time

57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE)
Time

74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
Time

74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
Time

Hours

10.00

Amount Inv#

140.00

136.00

440.00

204.00

540.00

142

580.00

782.

1598.

476.

1700.

68

20.

200.

.00

00

00

00

00

.00

00

00

Page:

Billing

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled



Nov/16/2017

Date
Entry #

Apr 25/2017
1821203

Apr 28/2017
1821840

May 2/2017
1822901

May 2/2017
1824596
May 3/2017
1823103

May 3/2017
1823165

May 4/2017
1823588

May 5/2017
1824496

May 5/2017
1824574

May 8/2017
1827398

May 9/2017
1825363

May 9/2017
1825393

May 15/2017
1827673

May 15/2017
1827685

May 16/2017
1828162

May 17/2017
1828372

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Client Fees Listing
To Oct/31/2017

Fee / Time Working Lawyer

Explanation Type

Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
consider review of undertakings and Time

transcript from hearing with J. Vince;

Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review deadlines for reply submission; Time

consider timing and next steps with R.

Woon and J. Vince;

Lawyer: 74 3.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
consider deadlines and timeline for Time
submission with R. Woon; reciept and

review of instructions from J. Vince

regarding transcripts from hearing,
undertaking responses, and

submissions; review transcript for

expunged portion; review Union and

Enbridge undertaking responses for

relevancy to OSEA submissions;

consider same with R, Woon and J.

vince; consider transcripts with R.

Woon,; review transcript volume two and

mark items for relevancy to submissions;

Lawyer: 48 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
review responses to undertakings; Time
Lawyer: 74 1.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review transcript from OSEA portion of Time

cross examination and mark items for
relevancy for submissions; consider '
submissions and strategy with R. Woon;

Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI
review and discuss key arguments for Time

written submission;

Lawyer: 74 1.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
create template for written Time

submissions; review transcripts from

second day of hearing and mark for

relevancy to OSEA submissions;

Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
pull and review Enbridge undertaking Time

responses from remainder of hearing

days,; review transcript from hearing

second day;

Lawyer: 48 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE
initial review of arguments from Time

utilities and responses to

undertakings;

Lawyer: 74 5.80 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 — VICTORIA CHAT
draft written submissions for Enbridge; Time [
consider with R. Woon; review

examination in chief of Enbridge:

review ED compendium and Cap and Trade

Framework; review transcripts for

submissions;
Lawyer: 74 2.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
draft Enbridge submissions; consider Time

with R. Woon; review transcript from
Union examination in chief and cross
examination;

Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE
discuss and review draft written Time

submission;

Lawyer: 74 1.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
consider submissions with J. Vince; Time

review draft submissions for Enbridge
with R, Woon,; discuss strategy and
language of submissions;

Lawyer: 57 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE)
review draft written submission and Time

provide comments on same;

Lawyer: 74 5.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review ICF presentation filed for Time

Enbridge evidence; revise draft

written submissions, combine with

Union to form one joint submission;

draft sections of submission for

Union; consider with R. Woon;

Lawyer: 74 4.20 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI
review arguments in chief from each Time
utility; continue to draft and revise

joint draft reply submissions for

union and enbridge; input referencing

into submissions; consider submissions

with R. Woon and J. Vince; research

cap and trade program in support of
submissions; review transcript volume

three;

Hours

Amount Inv#

20.00

40.00

320.00

272.

140.

85.

140.

60.

306.

580.

420.

00

00

00

00

00

00

00

.00

.00

.00

.00

.00

00

Billing

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Page:
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Nov/16/2017 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page: 5
Client Fees Listing
To Oct/31/2017

Date Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Amount Inv# Billing
Entry # Explanation Type -

May 17/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE) 0.40 68.00 Unbilled
1828415 review draft written submissions; Time

May 18/2017 Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 1.60 160.00 Unbilled
1828616 discuss and review submissions with R. Time

Woon; review J. Vince's edits with R.
Woon and make changes; research Pan
Canadian framework; format and revise;

May 18/2017 Lawyer: 57 5.00 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI T.80 850.00 Unbilled
1828621 revise draft written submission; Time

May 18/2017 Lawyer: 48 4.20 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE 4.20 714.00 Unbilled
1828631 review and revise final arguments; Time

May 19/2017 Lawyer: 57 2.80 Hrs X 170.00 57 53 - ROBERT WOON SEI 2.80 476.00 Unbilled
1828747 finalize written submission; emails Time

with N. Risse and M. Fraser re written
submission;

May 19/2017 Lawyer: 74 1.40 Hrs X 100.00 74 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 1.40 140.00 Unbilled
1828847 revise submissions; review with R. Time
Woon,; review submissions by other
intervenors;
May 19/2017 Lawyer: 48 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE 1.80 306.00 Unbilled
1828853 rfinalize arguments; Time
May 25/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE} 0.50 85.00 Unbilled

1830954 telephone call with N. Risse re follow Time
up questions on written submissions
submitted to OEB;

Jun 3/2017 Lawyer: 48 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 48 48 - JOANNA VINCE 1.60 272.00 Unbilled
1833748 review reply submissions from Enbridge Time
and Union;
Jun 6/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 57 5 - ROBERT WOON SEI 0.50 85.00 Unbilled
1835529 review reply submissions by utilities; Time
Sep 20/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE] 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
1866411 review letter from OEB re advance Time

review of decision and send same to J.
Wilkinson for instructions;

Sep 21/2017 TLawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI 0.40 68.00 Unbilled
1866933 review OEB Cap and Trade decision and Time
send same to J. Wilkinson and M.
Fraser;
Oct 16/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE] 0.40 68.00 Unbilled
1872409 review utilities submissions on draft Time
Rate Order;
Oct 18/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 Sil) 57 - ROBERT WOON SEI 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
1872613 emails with M. Fraser and J. Wilkinson Time

re whether OSEA has comments on draft
Rate Order;
Oct 19/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SE) 0.60 102.00 Unbilled
1872831 review draft Rate Orders from Time
utilities, including updated versions;
email with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser
re no comments from OSEA on draft rate

orders;
Oct 23/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 Sih 57 ~ ROBERT WOON SEI 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
1874321 review OEB's submissions on draft rate Time
orders;

Unbilled: 145.20 19742.00

Billed: 0.00 0.00

Total: 145.20 19742.00

Percent Billed: 0.00 0.00

*** Summary by Working Lawyer ***
Working Lawyer | Hours | Fees |
Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld
48 - JOBRNNA VINC 43.50 29.96 0.00 100.00 43.50 0.00 7395.00 37.46 0.00 100.00 7395.00 0.00
57 - ROBERT WOON 31.10 21.42 0.00 100.00 31.10 0.00 5287.00 26.78 0.00 100.00 5287.00 0.00
74 - VICTORIA CH 70.60 48.62 0.00 100.00 70.60 0.00 7060.00 35.76 0.00 100.00 7060.00 0.00
Firm Total ~"145.20 100.00  0.00 100.00 145.20 0.00 19742.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 19742.00 0.00
*** gummary by Responsible Lawyer ***

Responsible Lawyer | — - Hours |1 Fees |
Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld
31 - JULIE ABOUC 145.20 100.00 0.00 100.00 145.20 0.00 19742.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 19742.00 0.00
Firm Total 145.20 100.00 0.00 100.00 145.20 0.00 19742.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 19742.00 0.00

REPORT SELECTIONS - Client Fees Listing

Layout Template Default (1)

Advanced Search Filter None

Requested by Amanda {Security Restrictions)

Finished Thursday, November 16, 2017 at 10:59:30 AM
Ver 14.1 (14.1.20150324
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Oct/17/2017 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page 1
Client Costs Journal
To Oct/17/2017
Date Paid To Source Matter Client Name Ref# G/L Acct Amount
Entry# Explanation
Jan/31/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 23.25
1791691 Photocopies
Total for Jan/31/2017 23.25
Feb/ 1/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5I§.0 . RECOVERY 17.25
1792420 Photocopies
Total for Feb/ 1/2017 17.25
Feb/ 2/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1792621 Photocopies
Feb/ 2/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1792622 Photocopies
Total for Feb/ 2/2017 1.50
Feb/ 8/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.25
1795341 Photocopies
Feb/ 8/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.00
1795342 Photocopies .
Total for Feb/ 8/2017 1.25
Feb/22/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2.00
1799325 Photocopies
Total for Feb/22/2017 : 2.00
Feb/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2.00
1799547 Photocopies
Feb/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.50
1799572 Photocopies
Total for Feb/24/2017 2,50
Mar/15/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 01$25
1806723 Photocopies
Total for Mar/15/2017 0.25
Mar/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 3.50
1810043 Photocopies
Mar/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 . RECOVERY 2.50
1810044 Photocopies
Total for Mar/24/2017 6.00
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.50
1811771 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.50
1811772 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.50
1811775 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1811778 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ohtario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1811779 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 . RECOVERY 2.25
1811781 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.50
1811787 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1811788 Photocopies
Mar/27/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1811789 Photocopies
Total for Mar/27/2017 11.25
Mar/28/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY M50
1811919 Photocopies
Mar/28/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 3.50
1811920 Photocopies ’
Total for Mar/28/2017 6.00 S
Mar/31/2017 A & B COURIER AP 7067 Ontario Sustainable 5065 DELIVERY 12.84
1813430 Celiveries
Tectal for Mar/31/2017 12.84
Apr/12/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 4,00
1816835 Photocopies
Apr/12/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 250
1816844 Photocopies
Apr/12/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY %75
1816845 Photocopies
Total for Apr/12/2017 8.25
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.25
1818698 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1,205
1818707 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 4.50
1818710 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2,50
1818711 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.50
1818712 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1818725 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.25
1818726 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.00
1818730 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2.00
1818736 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 25%)



Oct/17/2017 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page 2
Client Costs Journal
To Oct/17/2017
Date Paid To Source Matter ‘Client Name Refifl G/L Acct Rrount
Entry# Explanation o
1818737 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1E2i5
1818738 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.50
1818739 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.50
1818742 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl S170) RECOVERY 0.25
1818743 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 + CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.25
1818746 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2.00
1818749 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 = CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 8.25
1818773 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.75
1818899 Photocopies
Bpr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 3N
1818900 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2.50
1818912 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.50
1818922 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.50
1818923 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.50
1818924 Photocopies
Apr/13/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 1.75
1818926 Photocopies
Total for Apr/13/2017 : 42.75
Apr/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 96.50
1819072 Photocopies
Total for Apr/17/2017 : 96.50
hpr/18/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 3.25
1819152 Photocopies
Total for Apr/18/2017 3.25
Bpr/19/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.25
1819484 Photocopies
Total for Apr/19/2017 0.25
Apr/24/2017 i CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 8,75
1820381 Photocopies
Apr/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.25
1820392 Photocopies
Apr/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 14.75
1820466 Photocopies
Apr/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 2.25
1820471 Photocopies
Apr/24/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.50
1820472 Photocopies
Total for Apr/24/2017 21.00
May/ 9/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 6.50
1826615 Photocopies
Total for May/ 9/2017 : 6.50
May/15/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 4.00
1829439 Photocopies
Total for May/15/2017 4.00
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 19,25
1829856 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl S0 RECOVERY 110425
1829858 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 4,25
1829861 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 4.00
1829862 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 217.25
1829863 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 5.75
1829867 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 11.50
1829868 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 8.00
1829869 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 0.75
1829870 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 10.50
1829878 Photocopies
May/17/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5179 RECOVERY 6.25
1829879 Photocopies
May/17/2017 . CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5170 RECOVERY 8.00
1829894 Photocopies
Total for May/17/2017 106.75
Sep/ 5/2017 CER 7067 Ontario Sustainabl 5171 RECOVERY 1.50

1863886

Photocopies
Total for Sep/ 5/2017 : 1.50




Oct/17/2017 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page 3
Client Costs Journal
To Oct/17/2017
bate - Paid To Source Matter Client Name Ref# G/L Acct Amount

Entry# Explanation

*x* Client Costs Journal - G/L Account Summary ***

G/L Account Debit Credit

1210 - CLIENT DISB.-RECOV. 374.84

5085. - DELIVERY CHARGES 12.84

ﬁo ~ RECOVERY - LASER/PH 360.50

5171 - RECOVERY - SCANNING 1.50
Total: 374.84 374.84
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COURIER / Since 1980
York Region 905 853 4444

Toronto 905 881 9444
Date: 3/16/2017 10:44:34 AM

BILL OF LADING

Delivery Information Order Number

#6042312

ACC#: 20445
WILLMS & SHIER

4 KING STREET WEST, Unit 900

Toronto, ON MSH1B6

CANADA Sort To:

RECEPTION Ph: (416)863-0711 A & B - YONGE/EG
Service Deliver

B

SHIP TO: ¢ HOUR raa

Ontario Energy Board .

2300 Yonge Street, Unit 27th Floor Packages Bgl‘fj':'ed
1 LETTER(S) $0.00

Toronto, ON M4P1E4

CANADA Weight CcOD

Kirsten Walli 1 Lbs 50.00

Reference

7067

Instructions

***Signature Required***

AGREEMENT TO TERMS:

By sending and/or receiving your shipment with us, you agree, regardless of whether you sign the
waybill for yourself and/or as an agent for and on behalf of any other person having interest in the
shipment, to all terms on the non-negotiable waybill, in any applicable tariff, and in our current
Terms and Conditions of carriage, copies of which are available on request. No one is authorized to
alter or modify the terms of our agreement. You agree that the terms limiting our liability set out on
the current Terms and Conditions at www.abcourier.com apply to this shipment. Maximum liability of
$2.00 per pound unless declared valuation states otherwise. A surcharge is applicable when the declared
value is in excess of $2.00 per pound for all transport shipments. A&B Courier’s liability is limited
to a maximum of $50 per shipment regardless of the circumstances for all courier shipments.

Shipper's Signature:

Driver's Number:

Consignee's Signature:

Time:

Name (printed):




Order #6042312

Pickup Information

WILLMS & SHIER
4 KING STREET WEST, Unit 900
Toronto , ON M5H1B6

YORK REGION 905.853.4444
TORONTO 905.881.9444

Delivery Information

Ontario Energy Board
2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor
Toronto ON M4P1E4

CANADA CANADA
RECEPTION Kirsten Walli
P: (416)863-0711 P:
F: F:
Order Information
Ready 3/16/2017 10:44 Ordered By LIBA KOCIAN Waiting Time 0 min.
Deliver By 3/16/2017 14:44 Dept. Insurance YES
Service 4 HOUR Reference 7067 Declared Value $0.00
Vehicle CAR Waybill #: 0 COD $0.00
Package Details Tracking Information
1LETTER(S) = e 1 lbs Status Finalized
Total Weight 1 Lbs Picked Up 3/16/2017 10:53
Ch arges Delivered 3/16/2017 11:20
POD Fatima
Base Amount: $12.00
Fuel Surcharge: $0.84
Subtotal: $12.84
HST - 13% (13.00%) $1.67
Total: $14.51
(\ 0
Comments

***Signature Required™*

Order Notes



Ontario Energy Board %i
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS ——

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0296 & EB-2016-0300 Process: Cap and Trade Costs Compliance
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Service Provider Name: Marion Fraser
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel ] [:] 35 |
Articling Student/Paralegal ]
Consultant Hourly Rate:
Analyst L]
For Consultant/Analyst: [ cvattached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours | Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 330.00(S - S - S -
Attendance $  330.00|$ - 1S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation $  330.00(S . S - S '
Attendance $ 330.00|5$ - |S - S 3
Interrogatories
Preparation 16.00| S 330.00|$ 5,280.00|S 686.40]| S 5,966.40
Responses $ 330005 - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation $ 33000]|5$ - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00|$ - 1S - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 330.00(%S R E - 1S -
Attendance $ 33000|(S - 1S - $ -
Proposal Preparation S 330.00 | $ = S = S =
Argument
Preparation $  330.00]|5$ - | - S -
Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 330.00]S - S - S =
Attendance $  330.00]$ - |$ - 1S -
Other Conferences
Preparation $ 330005 - s - S -
Attendance S 330.00($ - S - S -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - 1S - | =
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | [$ 528000 686.40]$ 5,966.40

9 of 10



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

File # EB- 2016-0296 & EB-2016-0300 Process:

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Assc

Cap and Trade Costs Compliance

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Service Provider Name:

Marion Fraser

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): l

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

wnwnnnnnninininlunmlninininin

»nuwvnnnnnnnmninmininninlunlniunkn

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

W

wr

10 of 10




FORM 1 Appendix "B"

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL
A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB-2016-0300 Enbridge Cap & Trade OSEA
Board File Number Party Name
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Marion Fraser 85 Fraser & Company
Consultant Name Years Relevant Experience Consultant Firm

(curriculum vitae must be attached)

Hours Hourly Rate ~ Sub-Total HST Total

Preparation 8 $330.00 $2,640.00 $343.20 $2,983.20
Attendance - Working Group Meeting 0 $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance- Settlement Conference 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Argument - Prep 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Research support 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTALS 8 $2,640.00 $343.20 $2,983.20

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate , and country of initial currency:




FORM 1 Appendix "B"

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL
A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB-2016-0296 Union Gas Cap & Trade OSEA
Board File Number Party Name
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Marion Fraser 35 Fraser & Company
Consultant Name Years Relevant Experience Consultant Firm

(curriculum vitae must be attached)

Hours Hourly Rate Sub-Total HST Total

Preparation 8 $330.00 $2,640.00 $343.20 $2,983.20
Attendance - Working Group Meeting 0 $330.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance- Settlement Conference 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Attendance - Oral Hearing 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Argument - Prep 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Research support 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTALS 8 $2,640.00 $343.20 $2,983.20

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate , and country of initial currency:




