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Lisa (Elisabeth) DeMarco 
Senior Partner 

5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 
Toronto, ON  M5R 2E1 

TEL  +1.647.991.1190 
FAX  +1.888.734.9459 
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16 November 2017 

Kirsten(Walli(
Board!Secretary!
Ontario!Energy!Board!
P.O.!Box!2319,!27th!Floor!
2300!Yonge!Street!
Toronto!ON!M4P!1E4!

Dear Ms. Walli: 

Re:  EB-2016-0160 Cost Claim 

We! are! counsel! to! Anwaatin! Inc.! (Anwaatin)! in! the! aboveMmentioned! proceeding! (the!
Proceeding).!Please!find!attached!the!cost!claim!of!Anwaatin.!

Anwaatin! respectfully! requests! an! award! of! 100%!of! its! eligible! costs,! given! its! strategic! and!
principled! participation,! which! reflected! the! unique! interests! of! seven! First! Nations.! Anwaatin!
submits!that!this!request!is!supported!by!the!following!considerations:!

(i)! Anwaatin! participated! very! effectively! in! this! Proceeding,! taking! a! surgical,!
principled,! and! coordinated! approach! to! the! issues.! Anwaatin! initiated! and!
undertook! coordination! with! other! intervenors! to! avoid! overlap! and! maximize!
efficiency!in!all!aspects!of!the!Proceeding.!

(ii)! Anwaatin! participated! responsibly! and! made! reasonable! efforts! to! ensure! that! its!
participation! was! not! unduly! repetitive! and! was! focused! on! relevant! and!material!
issues,!in!particular:!(i)!Hydro!One's!processes!to!determine!and!address!the!needs!
of!Indigenous!customersX!and!(ii)!the!impacts!of!Hydro!One's!customer!engagement!
and! transmission! planning! and! spending! on! Indigenous! customer! needs! and!
preferences!and!Hydro!One's!proposed!spending.!No!other!party!represented!these!
views.! The! resulting! record! and! supporting! exhibits! were! relied! upon! by! hearing!
participants,!including!Board!Staff,!in!their!final!submissions.!

(iii)! Anwaatin! contributed! to! the! Board's! better! understanding! of! issues! in! the!
Proceeding! by! filing! interrogatories,! submissions! on! the! Issues! List,! and! expert!
evidenceX! examining! witnesses! in! the! Technical! Conference! and! oral! hearingX!
calling! its!consultant,!Dr.!Don!Richardson,!as!a!witness!to!provide!direct!evidenceX!
and! producing! and! filing! video! testimony! from! First! Nation! community! leaders!
speaking! directly! to! the! disproportionate! and! significant! impacts! that! they!
experienced!during!their!many!transmission!system!unreliability!events.!!
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(iv)! Anwaatin!staffed!its!participation!in!the!hearing!in!a!very!efficient!manner,!allocating!
work! to! the! appropriate! level! of! authority! and! responsibility! among! a! technical!
consultant! and!senior!and! junior! legal! support.!Each!and!any! time!more! than!one!
Anwaatin! lawyer! attended! on! any! activity,! Anwaatin! was! only! charged! for! one!
lawyer's! time! and! the! resulting! inefficiencies! of! additional! communications! were!
avoided.!

We trust that this approach maximizes both efficiency and the right of otherwise unrepresented 
and important First Nation customers to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's 
mandate and statutory objectives. Based on the foregoing and the relative costs of Anwaatin in 
comparison to other intervenors who played less or more active roles, Anwaatin respectfully 
requests a full award of eligible costs. Please note that we are having difficulties transmitting 
Shared Value Solutions receipts and that they will follow shortly. 

 

Yours!very!truly,!

!

Lisa!(Elisabeth)!DeMarco!





Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Affidavit(and(Summary(of(Fees(and(Disbursements
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File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

%

19,687.50$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Summary(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed
148,416.00$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
3,026.29$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Anwaatin(Inc.

Hydro(One(Transmission(Rate(Application2016D0160

Canada

Legal/consultant/other%fees

Payment(Information

Total(Cost(Claim
HST

171,129.79$((((((((((((((((((

Disbursements

Send%payment%to%this%address:%%

Make%cheque%payable%to:%% DeMarco+Allan+LLP

20025+Hazelton+Ave
Toronto,+ON
M5R+2E1
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File(#((EBC Process:(

Party:

SERVICE(PROVIDER(TYPE (check%one )
Year(Called(to(

Bar

Legal(Counsel 1997

Articling(Student/Paralegal
Consultant Hourly(Rate: "$330"

Analyst
For"Consultant/Analyst: """""""""""CV"attached 13.0%

"""""""""""CV"provided"within"previous"24"months

Hours Hourly(Rate Subtotal HST

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

9.90 330.00$""""""""" 3,267.00$""""""" 424.71$"""""""""

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

11.10 330.00$""""""""" 3,663.00$""""""" 476.19$"""""""""

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

5.40 330.00$""""""""" 1,782.00$""""""" 231.66$"""""""""

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

Attendance 330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

Proposal"Preparation 330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

4.50 330.00$""""""""" 1,485.00$""""""" 193.05$"""""""""

48.00 330.00$""""""""" 15,840.00$""""" 2,059.20$""""""

44.30 330.00$""""""""" 14,619.00$""""" 1,900.47$""""""

330.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

3.60 330.00$""""""""" 1,188.00$""""""" 154.44$"""""""""

170.00$""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""" G$""""""""""""""""

41,844.00$""""" 5,439.72$""""""

Service(Provider(Name: Lisa"(Elisabeth)"DeMarco

16,519.47$""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

PreChearing(Conference
Preparation

ADR(C(Settlement(Conference

Oral(Hearing
1,678.05$""""""""""""""""""""""

Case(Management

Preparation

Attendance

Responses

Issues(Conference

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Anwaatin%Inc.

47,283.72$((((((((((((((((((((TOTAL(SERVICE(PROVIDER(FEES

Preparation

Attendance

Preparation G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Argument

Other(Conferences

Preparation

Preparation

Attendance 1,342.44$""""""""""""""""""""""

17,899.20$""""""""""""""""""""

20

Completed(Years(Practising/Years(
of(Relevant(Experience

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Technical(Conference
Preparation

Attendance

3,691.71$""""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

HST(Rate(Charged"(enter%% ):

Statement(of(Fees(Being(Claimed
Total

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""Attendance

4,139.19$""""""""""""""""""""""

G$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Interrogatories
Preparation

2,013.66$""""""""""""""""""""""
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File(#((EBC Process:(

Party:

HST
&$""""""""""""""""
2.62$""""""""""""""

13.84$""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""

Travel((Other): &$""""""""""""""""
17.83$""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""

34.29$""""""""""""

TRUE FALSE FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE

&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
Other: &$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Service(Provider(Name: Lisa%(Elisabeth)%DeMarco

Scanning/Photocopy

Statement(of(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Transcripts

Travel:(Rail
Travel:(Car
Travel:(Air

120.31$"""""""""""""""""""""""""

TotalNet(Cost

22.78$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Parking

20.16$"""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
106.47$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

298.09$(((((((((((((((((((((((((

Meals

TOTAL(DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

263.80$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Printing
Courier
Telephone/Fax

201670160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Other:

Anwaatin%Inc.

155.00$"""""""""""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Taxi
137.17$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""

Accommodation

&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
&$""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""
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File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

SERVICE(PROVIDER(TYPE (check%one )
Year(Called(to(

Bar

Legal(Counsel 2014
Articling(Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly(Rate: %$170%
Analyst

For%Consultant/Analyst: %%%%%%%%%%%CV%attached 13.0%
%%%%%%%%%%%CV%provided%within%previous%24%months

Hours Hourly(Rate Subtotal HST

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

6.80 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 1,156.00$%%%%%%% 150.28$%%%%%%%%%
17.00 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 2,890.00$%%%%%%% 375.70$%%%%%%%%%

29.50 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 5,015.00$%%%%%%% 651.95$%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

1.50 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 255.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 33.15$%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Proposal%Preparation 170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

79.20 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 13,464.00$%%%%% 1,750.32$%%%%%%

42.60 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 7,242.00$%%%%%%% 941.46$%%%%%%%%%
22.00 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 3,740.00$%%%%%%% 486.20$%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

33,762.00$%%%%% 4,389.06$%%%%%%TOTAL(SERVICE(PROVIDER(FEES 38,151.06$((((((((((((((((((((

Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Case(Management <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Preparation 8,183.46$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 4,226.20$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Other(Conferences

Argument
Preparation 15,214.32$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Oral(Hearing

ADR(D(Settlement(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Issues(Conference
Preparation 288.15$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Interrogatories
Preparation 5,666.95$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Responses <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Technical(Conference
Preparation 1,306.28$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 3,265.70$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

PreDhearing(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

3

HST(Rate(Charged%(enter%% ):

Statement(of(Fees(Being(Claimed
Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Cary%Ferguson

Completed(Years(Practising/Years(
of(Relevant(Experience
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File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

HST
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel((Other): <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

TRUE FALSE FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE

TOTAL(DISBURSEMENTS: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% D$((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((

Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Meals <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Taxi <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Accommodation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Parking <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel:(Car <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Rail <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Transcripts <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Air <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Courier <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Telephone/Fax <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Scanning/Photocopy <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Printing <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Cary%Ferguson

Statement(of(Disbursements(Being(Claimed
Net(Cost Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application
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File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

SERVICE(PROVIDER(TYPE (check%one )
Year(Called(to(

Bar

Legal(Counsel 2017
Articling(Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly(Rate: %$100%
Analyst

For%Consultant/Analyst: %%%%%%%%%%%CV%attached 13.0%
%%%%%%%%%%%CV%provided%within%previous%24%months

Hours Hourly(Rate Subtotal HST

100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

2.00 100.00$%%%%%%%%% 200.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 26.00$%%%%%%%%%%%%
100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Proposal%Preparation 100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

1.80 100.00$%%%%%%%%% 180.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 23.40$%%%%%%%%%%%%

14.90 100.00$%%%%%%%%% 1,490.00$%%%%%%% 193.70$%%%%%%%%%
100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
100.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

5.00 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 850.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 110.50$%%%%%%%%%

2,720.00$%%%%%%% 353.60$%%%%%%%%%TOTAL(SERVICE(PROVIDER(FEES 3,073.60$((((((((((((((((((((((

Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Case(Management 960.50$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Preparation 1,683.70$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Other(Conferences

Argument
Preparation 203.40$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Oral(Hearing

ADR(D(Settlement(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Issues(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Interrogatories
Preparation 226.00$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Responses <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Technical(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

PreDhearing(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

0

HST(Rate(Charged%(enter%% ):

Statement(of(Fees(Being(Claimed
Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Jonathan%McGillivray

Completed(Years(Practising/Years(
of(Relevant(Experience
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Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

8%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

HST
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel((Other): <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

TRUE FALSE FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE

TOTAL(DISBURSEMENTS: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% D$((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((

Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Meals <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Taxi <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Accommodation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Parking <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel:(Car <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Rail <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Transcripts <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Air <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Courier <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Telephone/Fax <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Scanning/Photocopy <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Printing <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Jonathan%McGillivray

Statement(of(Disbursements(Being(Claimed
Net(Cost Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application
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 INVOICE 
 

Invoice #16206 
Date: December 31, 2016 

 
5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 
Toronto, ON 
M5R 2E1 
Canada 
Email: accounts@demarcoallan.com 
www.demarcoallan.com 
 
Anwaatin Inc. 
3034 Mississauga Road, R.R. #6 
Hagersville, ON 
N0A 1H0 
 
 
Services 
!
Item Completed Hours  Rate  SubTotal Attorney 
IRP - Call w/L. Sault and D. Richardson; 
follow-up w/D. Richardson; instructions 
to J. McGillivray; 

2016-07-25 2.3 $330.00 $759.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

CMT - Drafting letter of intervention for 
Anwaatin in EB-2016-0160; 

2016-07-26 2 $170.00 $340.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHP - Communications w/D. 
Richardson on participating First 
Nations; 

2016-07-29 0.3 $330.00 $99.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Review OEB Procedural Order #1 
and email to client on instructions; 

2016-07-29 0.8 $330.00 $264.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Reviewing application; 2016-08-02 4.5 $170.00 $765.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

IRP - Reviewing and revising letter to 
OEB; 

2016-08-03 1.2 $330.00 $396.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Reviewing application and 
evidence for Anwaatin issues; 

2016-08-03 2.6 $170.00 $442.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

IRP - Communications w/M. Oreckin; 
communications w/D. Richardson re 
evidence; review evidence; 

2016-08-04 4.4 $330.00 $1,452.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Reviewing application and 
evidence; 

2016-08-04 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

IRP - Instructions re Chiefs of Ontario 
and approach; communications and 
review evidence; 

2016-08-05 2.2 $330.00 $726.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Preparing interrogatories; 2016-08-08 3.6 $170.00 $612.00 Cary 
Ferguson 



CMT - Preparing update letter re 
Anwaatin members; 

2016-08-10 1 $170.00 $170.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

IRP - Preparing interrogatories; 2016-08-11 2.2 $170.00 $374.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

IRP - Revising interrogatories; 2016-08-12 2.2 $330.00 $726.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Working on strategy; 2016-08-12 0.9 $330.00 $297.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Hydro One rate case; final IRs; 2016-08-15 1.2 $330.00 $396.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

IRP - Formatting and referencing draft 
interrogatories; 

2016-08-16 2 $100.00 $200.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

IRP - Reviewing evidence; 2016-08-17 6.3 $170.00 $1,071.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

IRP - Reviewing application and 
evidence; 

2016-08-18 5 $170.00 $850.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

IRP - Reviewing application and 
evidence; 

2016-08-19 0.7 $170.00 $119.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

CMT - Reviewng interrogatories of all 
parties; 

2016-08-19 1.2 $170.00 $204.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

IRP - Reviewing application and 
evidence; 

2016-08-24 3.1 $170.00 $527.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing interrogatory 
responses; 

2016-08-31 0.3 $170.00 $51.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing interrogatory 
responses; 

2016-09-02 3.6 $170.00 $612.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing interrogatory 
responses; 

2016-09-06 2.2 $170.00 $374.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing IRRs; 2016-09-06 1.8 $100.00 $180.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OCA - Attendance at OEB Hearing; 2016-09-08 3 $330.00 $990.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

TCP - Reviewing and summarizing PO2 
for client; 

2016-09-08 0.5 $170.00 $85.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing request for 
confidentiality; 

2016-09-12 2.1 $170.00 $357.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Call with L. DeMarco, D. 
Richardson and L. Sault to discuss 
strategy; 

2016-09-13 0.9 $170.00 $153.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Drafting submissions on 
confidentiality; 

2016-09-13 0.8 $330.00 $264.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing evidence; 2016-09-13 1.2 $170.00 $204.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Formulate strategy and call; 
follow-up email; 

2016-09-13 4.2 $330.00 $1,386.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

TCP - Preparing letter re: technical 
conference areas of questioning; 

2016-09-15 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 



TCP - Meeting w/Anwaatin re 
instructions; 

2016-09-16 2.3 $330.00 $759.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

TCP - Reviewing Hydro One 
submissions on confidentiality; 

2016-09-16 0.3 $170.00 $51.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

TCP - Preparation for technical 
conference; review IR responses and 
instructions to C. Ferguson re drafting 
for technical conference; revising and 
drafting letter on technical conference 
for OEB; call with D. Richardson; 

2016-09-19 5.7 $330.00 $1,881.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

TCP - Preparing for technical 
conference; 

2016-09-21 3 $170.00 $510.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

TCP - Preparing for technical 
conference; 

2016-09-21 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

TCA - Attending technical conference; 2016-09-22 8.5 $170.00 $1,445.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

TCA - Attending technical conference; 2016-09-23 8.5 $170.00 $1,445.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Communications w/C. Ferguson; 
review transcript of technical 
conference; instructions on follow-up 
instructions; 

2016-09-26 1.7 $330.00 $561.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Review draft issues list and seek 
instructions on proposed additions from 
client; instructions to C. Ferguson; 

2016-09-27 0.9 $330.00 $297.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Revise/redraft letter on Issues 
List; instructions to C. Ferguson; review 
motion; 

2016-09-28 1.4 $330.00 $462.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

ICP - Preparing submissions on issues 
list; 

2016-09-29 0.5 $170.00 $85.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

ICP - Review EP disclosure; 
instructions to C. Ferguson; 

2016-09-29 0.3 $330.00 $99.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

ICP - Preparing reply submissions on 
issues list; 

2016-09-30 1 $170.00 $170.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Review response from Hydro 
One; communications w/client, 
proposed response; instructions to C. 
Ferguson; 

2016-09-30 1.9 $330.00 $627.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

TCP - Instructions to C. Ferguson re 
what questions to ask/calculations for 
tech conference; 

2016-09-30 1.6 $330.00 $528.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

ICP - Draft letter and response to issues 
list; 

2016-10-02 4.3 $330.00 $1,419.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

APR - Preparing motion materials; 2016-10-03 2 $170.00 $340.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OCA - Attending Board Staff issues list 
conference call; 

2016-10-03 0.6 $330.00 $198.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 



OHP - Call w/relevant 
stakeholders/client; finalize and send 
out letter; call to G. Nettleton; 

2016-10-03 2.7 $330.00 $891.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

APR - Preparing motion materials; 2016-10-04 3 $170.00 $510.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Preparing motion materials; 2016-10-05 0.2 $170.00 $34.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Procedural Order; review and 
implementation; email to D. Richardson 
re customer bills and evidence; 

2016-10-12 0.7 $330.00 $231.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Call w/D. Richardson and follow-
up; 

2016-10-13 1.2 $330.00 $396.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing letter to OEB re 
evidence; 

2016-10-17 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Follow-up instructions to C. 
Ferguson; call with D. Richardson; 

2016-10-17 2.1 $330.00 $693.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing letter re: intervenor 
evidence; 

2016-10-18 1 $170.00 $170.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing COO notes; 2016-10-18 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

APR - Reviewing previously filed 
confidential materials; 

2016-10-18 1.1 $170.00 $187.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

ICP - Revising letter on intervenor 
evidence; 

2016-10-19 0.8 $330.00 $264.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing evidence; 2016-10-26 1 $170.00 $170.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Review Procedural Order No. 3 
from OEB; communications with client 
re evidence and next step outlining of 
instructions for D. Richardson; 
instructions to C. Ferguson; 

2016-10-28 4.1 $330.00 $1,353.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing materials for L. 
DeMarco call with D. Richardson re: 
evidence; 

2016-10-31 0.5 $170.00 $85.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Call with Larry and follow-up 
drafting; 

2016-11-01 1.2 $330.00 $396.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing evidence materials; 2016-11-03 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Preparing evidence; 2016-11-08 5 $170.00 $850.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Preparing evidence; 2016-11-09 9.5 $170.00 $1,615.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

CMT - Correspondence w/ H. Thiessen 
re procedures for submission of video 
evidence to Board; 

2016-11-09 0.6 $170.00 $102.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

CMT - Correspondence with OEB re 
video evidence; 

2016-11-09 0.2 $170.00 $34.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 



OHP - Preparing appendices to 
evidence; completing citations in 
evidence; reviewing and copy-editing 
evidence; 

2016-11-09 1.7 $100.00 $170.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHP - Revisions to evidence; 2016-11-09 4.7 $330.00 $1,551.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing for oral hearing; 2016-11-14 0.5 $170.00 $85.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Preparing for hearing; 2016-11-18 1.3 $100.00 $130.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHP - Preparing for oral hearing; 2016-11-18 1 $170.00 $170.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Preparation of materials for 
hearing (direct and cross examination); 

2016-11-21 4 $100.00 $400.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHP - Preparing oral hearing materials; 2016-11-21 1.5 $170.00 $255.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Hearing prep; 2016-11-22 4.2 $100.00 $420.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHP - Preparing oral hearing materials; 2016-11-22 1.3 $170.00 $221.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Revisions to direct examination 
binder per L. DeMarco; 

2016-11-23 0.7 $100.00 $70.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHA - Attendance at hearing; 2016-11-24 7.5 $330.00 $2,475.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Legal research and preparing 
hearing materials; 

2016-11-24 7 $170.00 $1,190.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHA - Attendance at hearing; 2016-11-25 7.5 $330.00 $2,475.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHA - Attendance at hearing; 2016-11-28 7.5 $330.00 $2,475.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing hearing materials; 2016-11-28 1 $170.00 $170.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHA - Attending oral hearing; 2016-11-29 3 $170.00 $510.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Preparing for oral hearing; 2016-11-29 1.3 $170.00 $221.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Preparing materials for Planning 
panel cross-examination; 

2016-11-30 3 $100.00 $300.00 Jonathan 
McGillivray 

OHA - Attendance at hearing; drafting 
of cross examination for Cary; 
communications; 

2016-12-01 10.5 $330.00 $3,465.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHA - Attendance at oral hearing; 
review of transcript; 

2016-12-02 4.9 $330.00 $1,617.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Prepare cross examination for 
Planning Parcel; revise R/RR/RRR 
approach; 

2016-12-04 4 $330.00 $1,320.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing undertakings chart; 2016-12-05 1.9 $170.00 $323.00 Cary 
Ferguson 



OHP - Research for L. DeMarco cross 
examination; 

2016-12-05 2.8 $170.00 $476.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHA - Attending oral hearing; 2016-12-06 7.5 $170.00 $1,275.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Review communications from 
Board Staff; 

2016-12-07 0.6 $330.00 $198.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHA - Attending oral hearing; 2016-12-08 4 $170.00 $680.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Review transcript; 2016-12-08 2.1 $330.00 $693.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Review transcript; 2016-12-09 1.3 $330.00 $429.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparation for cross 
examination and direct of Anwaatin; 

2016-12-11 3.4 $330.00 $1,122.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHA - Attendance at hearing; 
instructions to C. Ferguson; 
communications with D. Richardson; 

2016-12-12 2.5 $330.00 $825.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing undertakings chart; 2016-12-13 0.5 $170.00 $85.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHA - Attending oral hearing; 2016-12-14 7.5 $170.00 $1,275.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

OHP - Review transcript; instructions to 
C. Ferguson; 

2016-12-14 0.4 $330.00 $132.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Meeting with D. Richardson; 
witness prep - ethical directions, duty to 
OEB; revise direct; instructions to C. 
Ferguson and J. McGillivray re binders 
for me and Don; review materials; 

2016-12-15 6.7 $330.00 $2,211.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHA - Preparation and attendance at 
hearing; 

2016-12-16 3.9 $330.00 $1,287.00 Lisa 
DeMarco 

OHP - Preparing for oral hearing 
materials requested by L. DeMarco; 

2016-12-16 2.6 $170.00 $442.00 Cary 
Ferguson 

 
 

Services Subtotal: $66,976.00 
 

Expenses 
 
Description Type Date Subtotal 
[DISBURSEMENT] courier to OEB; Expense 2016-07-27  $15.41  
[DISBURSEMENT] courier to OEB; Expense 2016-08-04  $15.41  
[DISBURSEMENT] courier to OEB; Expense 2016-08-15  $15.41  
[DISBURSEMENT] United Messengers Ltd. 
courier to OEB; 

Expense 2016-10-04  $15.41  

[DISBURSEMENT] United Messengers Ltd. 
courier to OEB; 

Expense 2016-11-10  $15.41  



[DISBURSEMENT] PAYPAL - Merged PDF file; Expense 2016-11-21  $3.66  

[DISBURSEMENT] The Printing House; Expense 2016-11-23  $16.50  

 
Expenses SubTotal: $97.21  

 
 

Invoice Subtotal: $67,073.21 
HST (ON) (13%): $8,719.52 

Total: 75,792.73 
 



5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200
Toronto, ON
M5R 2E1
Canada
Email: accounts@demarcoallan.com
www.demarcoallan.com

INVOICE
Invoice # 17287

Date: 11/16/2017
Due On: 12/16/2017

Anwaatin Inc.
3034 Mississauga Road, , R.R.#6
Hagersville, ON N0A 1H0

[16-0032] Anwaatin Inc. – EB-2016-0160 Hydro One Transmission Rates

Services

Date Attorney Description Hours Rate Total

01/11/2017 Cary APR - Drafting final argument; 0.50 $170.00 $85.00

01/17/2017 Cary APR - Drafting final argument; 6.30 $170.00 $1,071.00

01/18/2017 Cary APR - Preparing final argument; 6.10 $170.00 $1,037.00

01/19/2017 Cary APR - Preparing final submissions; 5.20 $170.00 $884.00

01/20/2017 Cary APR - Preparing final submissions; 5.70 $170.00 $969.00

01/22/2017 Cary APR - Preparing final submissions; 4.50 $170.00 $765.00

01/23/2017 Cary APR - Preparing Anwaatin response to Hydro One
submissions;

3.90 $170.00 $663.00

01/26/2017 Cary APR - Preparing response to Board Staff submissions; 3.90 $170.00 $663.00

02/01/2017 Cary APR - Preparing final argument; 4.80 $170.00 $816.00

02/02/2017 Cary APR - Preparing final submission; 9.80 $170.00 $1,666.00

02/06/2017 LD APR - Instructions to C. Ferguson re cost claim prep
receipts;

0.40 $330.00 $132.00

09/28/2017 Cary APR - Attending decision release lockup; reviewing and
summarizing decision;

5.40 $170.00 $918.00

09/29/2017 Cary APR - Reviewing decision; Preparing letter to OEB re:
Decision;

5.00 $170.00 $850.00
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10/03/2017 LD APR - Instructions to Cary; 0.20 $330.00 $66.00

11/01/2017 Cary APR - Preparing letter to OEB re: interim cost award; 1.20 $170.00 $204.00

11/01/2017 LD APR - Instructions from D. Richardson re: cost letter,
instructions to C. Ferguson, review and revise cost
letter;

1.40 $330.00 $462.00

Quantity Subtotal 64.3

Services Subtotal $11,251.00

Expenses

Date Description Quantity Rate Total

11/24/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

11/25/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

11/28/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

12/01/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

12/02/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

12/05/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

12/16/2016 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $17.70 $17.70

01/12/2017 Hearing Parking Ticket, (13% HST); 1.00 $13.27 $13.27

10/19/2017 Good Foot Support Services - Delivery, (+13% HST); 1.00 $20.42 $20.42

11/06/2017 Good Foot Support Services - Delivery, (+13% HST); 1.00 $9.00 $9.00

Expenses Subtotal $166.59

Time Keeper Hours Rate Total

Lisa DeMarco 2.0 $330.00 $660.00

Cary Ferguson 62.3 $170.00 $10,591.00

Quantity Total 64.3

Subtotal $11,417.59

HST (ON) (13.0%) $1,484.29

Total $12,901.88

Please make all amounts payable to: DeMarco Allan LLP
HST #79471 3495 RT0001
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If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees
charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently $17.50.

Please pay within 30 days.
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Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

9%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

SERVICE(PROVIDER(TYPE (check%one )
Year(Called(to(

Bar

Legal(Counsel
Articling(Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly(Rate: %$330%
Analyst

For%Consultant/Analyst: %%%%%%%%%%%CV%attached 13.0%
%%%%%%%%%%%CV%provided%within%previous%24%months

Hours Hourly(Rate Subtotal HST

330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

23.00 330.00$%%%%%%%%% 7,590.00$%%%%%%% 986.70$%%%%%%%%%
330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

2.50 330.00$%%%%%%%%% 825.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 107.25$%%%%%%%%%
330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Proposal%Preparation 330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

33.50 330.00$%%%%%%%%% 11,055.00$%%%%% 1,437.15$%%%%%%

81.50 330.00$%%%%%%%%% 26,895.00$%%%%% 3,496.35$%%%%%%
15.00 330.00$%%%%%%%%% 4,950.00$%%%%%%% 643.50$%%%%%%%%%

330.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
13.00 330.00$%%%%%%%%% 4,290.00$%%%%%%% 557.70$%%%%%%%%%
1.50 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 255.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 33.15$%%%%%%%%%%%%

55,860.00$%%%%% 7,261.80$%%%%%%TOTAL(SERVICE(PROVIDER(FEES 63,121.80$((((((((((((((((((((

Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 4,847.70$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Case(Management 288.15$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Preparation 30,391.35$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 5,593.50$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Other(Conferences

Argument
Preparation 12,492.15$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Oral(Hearing

ADR(D(Settlement(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Issues(Conference
Preparation 932.25$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Interrogatories
Preparation 8,576.70$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Responses <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Technical(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

PreDhearing(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

20

HST(Rate(Charged%(enter%% ):

Statement(of(Fees(Being(Claimed
Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Don%Richardson

Completed(Years(Practising/Years(
of(Relevant(Experience



Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

10%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

HST
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

136.71$%%%%%%%%%
49.88$%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel((Other): <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
14.25$%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

90.03$%%%%%%%%%%%%
68.25$%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

359.12$%%%%%%%%%

FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE TRUE FALSE

TOTAL(DISBURSEMENTS: 2,762.49$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% 3,121.61$((((((((((((((((((((((

Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Meals 525.00$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% 593.25$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Taxi <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Accommodation 692.55$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% 782.58$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Parking 109.65$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% 123.90$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel:(Car 383.67$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% 433.55$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Rail <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Transcripts <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Air 1,051.62$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% 1,188.33$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Courier <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Telephone/Fax <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Scanning/Photocopy <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Printing <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Don%Richardson

Statement(of(Disbursements(Being(Claimed
Net(Cost Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application



Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

11%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

SERVICE(PROVIDER(TYPE (check%one )
Year(Called(to(

Bar

Legal(Counsel
Articling(Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly(Rate: %$290%
Analyst

For%Consultant/Analyst: %%%%%%%%%%%CV%attached 13.0%
%%%%%%%%%%%CV%provided%within%previous%24%months

Hours Hourly(Rate Subtotal HST

290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Proposal%Preparation 290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

0.50 290.00$%%%%%%%%% 145.00$%%%%%%%%%%% 18.85$%%%%%%%%%%%%

25.00 290.00$%%%%%%%%% 7,250.00$%%%%%%% 942.50$%%%%%%%%%
9.50 290.00$%%%%%%%%% 2,755.00$%%%%%%% 358.15$%%%%%%%%%

290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
290.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

10,150.00$%%%%% 1,319.50$%%%%%%TOTAL(SERVICE(PROVIDER(FEES 11,469.50$((((((((((((((((((((

Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Case(Management <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Preparation 8,192.50$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 3,113.15$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Other(Conferences

Argument
Preparation 163.85$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Oral(Hearing

ADR(D(Settlement(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Issues(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Interrogatories
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Responses <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Technical(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

PreDhearing(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

14

HST(Rate(Charged%(enter%% ):

Statement(of(Fees(Being(Claimed
Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Alison%Fraser

Completed(Years(Practising/Years(
of(Relevant(Experience



Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

12%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

HST
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel((Other): <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE TRUE FALSE

TOTAL(DISBURSEMENTS: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% D$((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((

Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Meals <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Taxi <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Accommodation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Parking <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel:(Car <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Rail <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Transcripts <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Air <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Courier <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Telephone/Fax <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Scanning/Photocopy <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Printing <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Alison%Fraser

Statement(of(Disbursements(Being(Claimed
Net(Cost Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application



Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

13%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

SERVICE(PROVIDER(TYPE (check%one )
Year(Called(to(

Bar

Legal(Counsel
Articling(Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly(Rate: %$170%
Analyst

For%Consultant/Analyst: %%%%%%%%%%%CV%attached 13.0%
%%%%%%%%%%%CV%provided%within%previous%24%months

Hours Hourly(Rate Subtotal HST

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance 170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Proposal%Preparation 170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

24.00 170.00$%%%%%%%%% 4,080.00$%%%%%%% 530.40$%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
170.00$%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

4,080.00$%%%%%%% 530.40$%%%%%%%%%TOTAL(SERVICE(PROVIDER(FEES 4,610.40$((((((((((((((((((((((

Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Case(Management <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Preparation 4,610.40$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Other(Conferences

Argument
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Oral(Hearing

ADR(D(Settlement(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Issues(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Interrogatories
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Responses <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Technical(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

PreDhearing(Conference
Preparation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Attendance <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

4

HST(Rate(Charged%(enter%% ):

Statement(of(Fees(Being(Claimed
Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Frances%Dietrich<O'Connor

Completed(Years(Practising/Years(
of(Relevant(Experience



Ontario(Energy(Board
COST(CLAIM(FOR(HEARINGS

Detail(of(Fees(and(Disbursements(Being(Claimed

14%of%14

File(#((EBD Process:(

Party:

HST
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel((Other): <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE TRUE FALSE

TOTAL(DISBURSEMENTS: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%% D$((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((((

Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Meals <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Other: <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Taxi <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Accommodation <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

<$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Parking <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Travel:(Car <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Rail <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Transcripts <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Travel:(Air <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Courier <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Telephone/Fax <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Scanning/Photocopy <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%
Printing <$%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%%

Anwaatin%Inc. Service(Provider(Name: Frances%Dietrich,O'Connor

Statement(of(Disbursements(Being(Claimed
Net(Cost Total

2016,0160 Hydro%One%Transmission%Rate%Application



Anwaatin Invoice number 00401 Invoice date 04/30/2017
Page 1

Invoice subtotal 78,662.49
HST 10,226.12

Invoice total 88,888.61

HST # 811269109 RT0001  

Interest on overdue accounts are charged at the rate of 10 percent per annum from the date of invoice.  

Payment terms are net 30 days on all accounts.  

Early payments (less than 30 days from date of invoice) are eligible to receive a 3 percent discount.  

Electronic remittance advice should be sent to: accounting@sharedvaluesolutions.com  

Wire Payment Instructions:  
Branch Address: RBC Main Branch, 74 Wyndham Street North, Guelph ON N1H 4E6  
Branch Phone: 519-824-6800  
Branch transit # 1762  
Institution # 003  
Account # 1007475  
Routing/ABA # 021000021 (if sending funds from the U.S.)  
SWIFT BIC: ROYCCAT2 (if sending funds from outside of North America)

Total of fees and expenses - Billing Report attached 78,662.49
Total 78,662.49

Description
Current  

Billed

Shared Value Solutions Ltd.
62 Baker Street
Guelph, ON N1H 4G1

Anwaatin
64 Baker Street,
Guelph, ON
N1H 4G1

Invoice number 00401
Date 04/30/2017

Project OEB HYDROONE RATE HEARING



Hearing testimony 12/16/2016 4.00

Billable Time
Date Total

Don Richardson

OEB HydroOne Rate Hearing
Hearing Testimony

All Dates
Employee/Activity Total

9/13/2016 1.00

9/16/2016 1.00

9/23/2016 8.00

10/3/2016
2.00

10/4/2016 1.00

10/24/2016 2.00

10/25/2016
4.00

11/1/2016 1.00

9/15/2016 2.00

11/3/2016 0.50

11/8/2016 2.00

11/9/2016
4.00

Review of IR responses, correspondence with First 
Nation clients
IR response review

Confidentiality request response to OEB

Call with Aroland reps and Nipigon reps regarding 
hearing testimony
Review of Hydro One response re confidentiality, 
discussion with clients
Attendance at OEB Hydro One rate increase technical 
workshop, with travel
Research on Hydro One's previous engagement with 
First Nations on transmission rate increase application to 
OEB
Research on Hydro One First Nation engagement on 
transmission line rate applications
Research on previous Hydro One First Nation 
consultation approaches
Research on previous Hydro One First Nation 
consultation approaches; review of filing information to-
date
Research and review of filings

Corresondence on hearing evidence

Notes for legal counsel on hearing outcome approach

Regulatory filing review, communication with clients

Hearing presentation - drafting, reviewing Hydro One 
submissions and background on 2007 rate increase 
evidence
Hearing preparation, with call with legal counsel 11/21/2016 2.50

11/4/2016 1.00

9/2/2016 6.00

9/9/2016 1.00

1/30/2017 2.00

11/24/2016 1.50
12/22/2016 1.50

1/23/2017 4.00
1/24/2017 5.00
1/25/2017 4.00

1/26/2017 3.00

Hearing filing reviews

Transcript review

Reviewing intervenor submissions

Reviewing intervenor submissions

Reviewing Hydro One application and submissions

Communication with First Nation client group on hearing 
status, final comments
Review of A4L reliability issues and data

Follow-up with First Nation clients on transmission line 
reliability issues 1/31/2017 3.00

Billing Rate $330 22,110



8/2/2016 1.50

8/4/2016 3.00
8/3/2016 4.50

8/9/2016 5.00
8/10/2016 5.00
11/9/2016 5.00

Research into energy poverty in Aroland.

Energy poverty research.

Energy poverty research, including phone calls to 
Aroland Band Office.
Phone calls (Aroland Band Office) and research.

Energy poverty and rate increase research.

Energy poverty research, new rates research.

Tranmission research, communication with lawyers

8/4/2016 1.00

Date Total
Billable Time

Alison Fraser 8,250.00

Employee/Activity Total
All Dates

Research
OEB HydroOne Rate Hearing

Travel to Aroland First Nation

Interview related to AFN hydro issues and concerns
Travel from AFN to Guelph

9/29/2016 12.00

9/28/2016 5.00
9/27/2016 5.00

Frances Dietrich-O'Connor 7,260.00

9/16/2016 1.00

9/19/2016
2.50

9/27/2016
4.00

9/28/2016 8.00

9/29/2016 12.00

9/30/2016
2.50

10/4/2016 1.00

Meeting with legal counsel

Call with Aroland Chief Towedo on situation with Hydro 
One rate increase hearing, preparations for gaining video 
and testimony at Aroland
Travel to Thunder Bay - in prep for Aroland / Geraldton 
trip for video interviews and fact finding on transmission 
reliability
Meetings in Aroland / Geraldton -  video interviews and 
fact finding on transmission reliability
Meetings in Thunder Bay with WZI members and Aroland 
- fact finding on transmission reliability, return travel
Meeting with Larry Sault on hearing testimony 
preparation, issues list.  Discussion with legal counsel on 
issues list and input for OEB issues list
Expense claim for Thunder Bay, Aroland, Geraldton trip

Situation update with Aroland Chief and Council 10/5/2016 1.00

Billable Time 32.00
Date Total

Don Richardson 10,560.00Billing rate $330/hour

Billing rate $330/hour

Billing rate $330/hour



Preparation of hearing video 11/9/2016 2.00
Date Total

Billable Time 2.00
Frances Dietrich-O'Connor 660.00

Research on First Nation and rural Ontario energy 
poverty, including review of Bruce-Grey United Way 
report

8/14/2016
3.00

Preparation for hearing 12/13/2016 5.00

Review of hearing filings for this week 12/9/2016 2.00

Review of filings posted this week 12/2/2016 2.00

Review of hearing materials, submission of c.v., review of 
Hydro One submission 10/19/2016 6.00

Review of Hydro One IR responses, notes for clients, 
preparation of testimony 9/9/2016 4.00

Participation in Hydro One hearing - Hydro One 
presentation, review of Hydro One IR responses 9/8/2016 5.00

IR preparation 8/22/2016 4.00

Reading Hydro One application, preparing IRs 8/18/2016 8.00

Reading Hydro One application, preparing IRs 8/17/2016 8.00

Meetings with Aroland First Nation and other Matawa 
First Nations 8/11/2016 3.00

Hearing attendance with travel 12/14/2016 11.00

Intervenor request 8/8/2016 1.50

Call with Nipigon representatives, correspondence to 
First Nations 8/12/2016 1.50

Hearing preparation 12/15/2016 8.00

Date Total
Billable Time 72.00

Don Richardson 23,760.00

2/23/2017 0.50

HONI Meeting in Toronto

Strategy call with SVS and legal team

2/8/2017 9.50
Date Total

Billable Time 10.00
Alison Fraser 3,300.00

Total Labour 75,900.00

All Dates
Preparation for testimony

Employee/Activity Total

OEB HydroOne Rate Hearing

Billing rate $330/hour

Billing rate $330/hour

Billing rate $330/hour



9/29/2016 450.00

12/16/2016 30.00

9/29/2016 271.19

75.00

9/29/2016 79.65

9/29/2016 112.48

12/16/2016 139.49

9/28/2016 279.00

9/29/2016 1,051.62

9/29/2016 274.06

Airfare - return trip to Thunder Bay (2 flights)

Hotels in the field - 2 rooms for 1 night

Hotels in the field - 2 rooms for 1 night

Perdiem (3 days for 2 people at $75/person/day)

Rental car expense

Gas for rental car

Parking at Toronto Airport

Hotel in Toronto - 1 room for 1 night

Perdiem (1 day for 1 person)

Parking in Toronto

Travel and accomodation

All Dates
Expenses

Employee/Activity Total

OEB HydroOne Rate Hearing

12/16/2016

$2,762.49
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Alison Fraser, M.Sc.  
Risk Assessment Specialist,  Shared Value Solutions Ltd. 

Overview  
 
Alison Fraser is a risk assessment specialist with a strong background in human 
health and ecological risk assessment, as well as environmental toxicology. Alison has 
managed, reviewed and conducted environmental risk assessments for residential, 
parkland, commercial and industrial sites across Canada. She has a strong 
background in third party peer reviews of both human health and ecological risk 
assessments. She is a Qualified Person for Risk Assessment (QPRA) under Ontario 
Regulation 153/04. 
 
Alison’s passion is working to minimize the health risks associated with 
environmental contamination, by incorporating technically sound science and the 
needs of affected communities. Alison is a long-time member of the Society of 
Environmental Toxicology and Chemistry (SETAC) on both a regional and national 
level. In 2013, she was awarded the SETAC Presidential Citation for Exemplary 
Service. 
 
Specialties 
 
Project management | human health risk assessment | ecological risk assessment  | 
environmental toxicology | environmental impact assessment and environmental 
site assessment 
 
Selected Experience 
 
Technical Review of a Phase 1 Environmental Site Assessment (ESA).  Aroland First 
Nation. 
2017 – present 
Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. A technical review of a Phase 1 ESA 
was conducted to identify any data gaps in the assessment results. This included 
community meetings to discuss the ESA and obtain feedback from community 
members, as well as a site visit. 

 Contact 
alison.fraser 

@sharedvaluesolutions.com 
(226) 706 8888 ext. 117 

 
62 Baker Street 

Guelph, ON 
N1H 4G1 

 
Professional History 

 
April 2016 – Present 

Risk Assessment Specialist 
Shared Value Solutions Ltd. 

 
2002 – 2015 

Risk Assessment Specialist/Associate 
Dillon Consulting Ltd.  

 
2001 – 2002 

Junior Risk Assessor 
Golder Associates Ltd. 

 
1999 – 2001 

Teaching Assistant (Biology) 
Trent University 
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Technical Review of a Proposed Transmission Line EA 

2017 – present 

Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. Reviewed the EA, and associated 
supporting documentation, related to the development of a proposed transmission 
line that would traverse two Indigenous communities in Northern Ontario. Potential 
environmental risks were identified subsequent to the review, and community 
meetings were held to obtain community input and discuss the review results.   
 

Technical Review of the East West Tie Transmission Line EA 

2017 – present 

Risk Assessment Specialist. Conducted a technical review of the project EA, with a 
focus on potential impacts to human health, on behalf of six Indigenous communities.    
 

Magnetawan First Nation (MFN) Environmental Management Plan 

2016 – present 

Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. Developed an Environmental 
Management Plan for MFN, intended to provide guidance on the management of 
lands, and potential environmental risks, under the community’s land code.  
 
Aroland First Nation Community Energy Plan 

2016 - 2017 

Risk Assessment Specialist. A Community Energy Plan (CEP) was completed for 
Aroland First Nation. The plan included the collection and analysis of energy 
use data from residential and community/commercial buildings on reserve 
lands. Using recent Hydro One bills, a financial assessment was also completed. 
The results of the assessment were used, in conjunction with a needs 
assessment, to develop the Aroland CEP. 
  
Technical Review of the Energy East Pipeline ESA. Grand Council Treaty #3. 

2016 - 2017 

Risk Assessment Specialist. A review of potential risks to both human and ecological 
receptors was conducted on behalf of Grand Council Treaty #3, for the Energy East 
Pipeline Project. The review focused on the rights and interests of community 
members, and considered their strong reliance on the land for food, recreation and 
cultural practices.  
 

Technical Review of the Energy East Pipeline Project ESA. Mi’gmawe’l Tplu’taqnn 
Incorporated (MTI).  

2016 - 2017 

Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager.  Conducted a technical review of 
the pipeline project ESA for MTI communities. Potential risks to both human and 
ecological health were identified. Community meetings, and meetings with the 
proponent, were carried out to present and discuss the review results. The project 
also included the provision of NEB process support.  
 
 

 

Education 
 

M.Sc. Environmental Science 
Trent University 

 
B.Sc. Environmental Science 

(Honours) 
University of Guelph 

 
 

Years of Experience 
 

15 
 

Training and Certifications 
 

Qualified Person for Risk Assessment 
under Ontario Regulation 153/04 

2012 - Present 
 

Soil Vapour Assessments 
Laurentian SETAC Short Course 

2015 
 

Decision Making Over Project Life 
From Exploration to Site Closure and 

Important Statistical Decisions 
Laurentian SETAC Short Course 

2014 
 

Multivariate Statistics 
Laurentian SETAC Short Course 

2011 
 

Review of Environmental Risk 
Assessments 

Laurentian SETAC Short Course 
2011 

Professional Affiliations 
 

Cambridge Environmental Advisory 
Committee Member 

2015 – Present 
 

Society of Environmental Toxicology 
and Chemistry (North America) 

2000 – Present 
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Technical Review of Greenstone Gold Mine Environmental Assessment on behalf of 
Aroland First Nation 
2016-Present 
Risk Assessment Specialist. Assisted in a technical review of the Greenstone Gold 
Mine Project on behalf of Aroland First Nation. The review focused on the potential 
risks to both human health and the environment, associated with the project. 
 
Sisson Mine Project Draft Comprehensive Study Report and Environmental 
Assessment Review. Mi’gmawe’l Tplu’taqnn Incorporated (MTI).  
2016 
Risk Assessment Specialist. Conducted a review of the human health and ecological 
risk components of the EA on behalf of MTI. Data gaps and technical issues related to 
potentially unacceptable environmental risks were identified. Proposed mitigation 
measures to address risks were also evaluated in the review.  
 
Site-Specific Human Health and Ecological Risk Assessment – RCMP Detachment 
Site, Nunavut. Public Works and Government Services Canada.  
2014 
Risk Assessor. Completed a human health and ecological risk assessment for an 
RCMP detachment site in Nunavut. Historical sampling conducted at the site, as well 
as sampling conducted as part of the supplemental site investigation, indicated the 
presence of petroleum hydrocarbons and metals in soil above applicable guidelines. 
A risk assessment was completed at the site, which included an assessment of 
background concentrations of metals in soil. A soil vapour assessment was also 
conducted. No unacceptable risks were found to occur, thus no risk management 
measures were required. 
 
Site-Specific Human Health and Ecological Risk Assessment – RCMP Detachment 
Site, Northwest Territories. Public Works and Government Services Canada.  
2013 
Risk assessor. Completed a human health and ecological site-specific risk assessment 
at an RCMP detachment site in Northwest Territories, known to have PHC impacted 
soil and groundwater. A supplemental site investigation was conducted to further 
delineate groundwater impacts. A vapour assessment was conducted within the 
onsite building located in the area of PHC impacts, to quantify potential migration of 
vapours into indoor air. Potential risks to human and ecological receptors present on 
the site were quantified. 
 
Risk Assessment – Frontenac Correctional Institution, Public Works and 
Government Services Canada.  
2012 - 2013 
Risk Assessment Specialist. A site specific human health risk assessment and 
screening level ecological risk assessment was conducted for the Frontenac 
Institution, a correctional institution in eastern Ontario, on behalf of Corrections 
Services Canada. The site was located adjacent to a wetland area, with several 
streams traversing the site.  
 
Third-Party Peer Review of Risk Assessments, Ministry of Environment and Climate 
Change. 2011-2015 

Society of Environmental Toxicology 
and Chemistry (Laurentian Chapter) 

Member, VP, President and 
Committee Lead 

2002 - Present 
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Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. Conducted third-party peer reviews 
of Ontario Regulation 153/04 risk assessments on behalf of the MOECC.  The risk 
assessments were for a variety of land uses including commercial, industrial, 
residential and parkland, with the intent to file a Record of Site Condition. 
 
Risk Assessment/Risk Management, Commercial Property and Retail Store, 

Ontario.  

2010 – 2015 

Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. A human health and ecological risk 
assessment was conducted for a site located above a known chlorinated solvent 
groundwater plume. The risk assessment identified the migration of chemical 
vapours from groundwater to indoor air as having the potential to cause adverse 
health effects to indoor employees. A subslab vapour depressurization system was 
designed and installed at the site to mitigate unacceptable risks. A Record of Site 
Condition was obtained for the site.  
 
Human Health Risk Assessments – Light Stations, Public Works and 

Government Services.  

2010 - 2011 

Risk Assessment Specialist. A site specific human health and screening level 
ecological risk assessment was conducted for five sites that house light 
stations in Ontario, on behalf of the Department of Fisheries and Oceans. 
Supplemental site investigations, including soil, groundwater, and surface water 
sampling, were conducted on the sites to support the risk assessments. The 
results of the assessments were subsequently used to prioritize sites for 
potential future remediation.  
 
Sediment Management Strategy, Sarnia Harbour, Transport Canada and Public 

Works and Government Services Canada.  

2009 – 2011 

Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. A detailed sediment assessment was 
conducted for the Sarnia Harbour. The project included the assessment of potential 
risks to both human and ecological receptors exposed to sediments of the harbour. 
Both sediment and surface water sampling was carried out as part of the 
assessment. A preliminary quantitative risk assessment (PQRA) using the triad 
approach (chemical analyses, benthic community assessment and sediment toxicity 
testing) was completed for the harbour. The results of the assessment suggested no 
risks to human health or ecological receptors would be expected, however, 
additional sampling and analysis were recommended to address the previously 
identified data gaps. As a result, a second sampling event was conducted and the 
triad approach was once again applied. The results formed the basis of a detailed 
quantitative risk assessment (DQRA) conducted at the site. The results once 
again suggested no risks to human or ecological health.  
 
Environmental Site Assessment and Risk Assessment – Lighthouse  Sites, 

Public Works and Government Services Canada.  

2009 - 2010 

Risk Assessor. Environmental site assessments were conducted at six sites in 
Ontario that housed either lighthouses or day markers, on behalf of the 
Department of Fisheries and Oceans. Contaminants of concern identified at the 
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sites included metals and polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbons. The results of the 
site investigations formed the basis of both human health and ecological risk 
assessments for each site. The results of the assessments were subsequently 
used to prioritize sites for potential future remediation.  
 

Environmental Assessment, Confidential Power Generating Company 

2009  

Risk Assessment Specialist. In support of the environmental assessment 
process in Ontario, screening level human health and ecological risk 
assessments were conducted for two sites that were planned for redevelopment 
in order to house new power generating facilities. The assessment included the 
quantitative modeling of deposition and subsequent exposure of both humans 
and ecological receptors to emissions from the power plants. No unacceptable 
risks were found.  
 
Human Health and Ecological Risk Assessment, Wetland Property 

(Ontario) 

2008 - 2015  

Risk Assessment Specialist and Project Manager. A human health and 
ecological risk assessment was conducted for a site that contained a 
provincially significant wetland and historical landfill. The site contained 
elevated concentrations of metals and polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbons in 
soil, groundwater, surface water and sediment. Risk management measures 
implemented at the site included a restriction on the construction of buildings 
on the site and a prohibition on the use of the site for potable groundwater.  
 
Quantitative Ecological Risk Assessment, Confidential Petroleum Sector   Client 

2006 

Risk Assessor. A quantitative ecological risk assessment was carried out at a former 
bulk plant property in Eastern Canada due to the presence of benzene, toluene, 
ethylbenzene, and xylenes and petroleum hydrocarbons in soil and groundwater on 
the site. Potential risks to both the terrestrial habitat on-site and the aquatic habitat 
in the adjacent river were quantified.  
 
Risk Assessment, Former Sodium Chlorate Manufacturing Facility.  

2005 - 2010 

Risk Assessor. A human health and ecological risk assessment was completed at an 
environmentally sensitive site due to the presence of organic chemicals and metals 
in the soil, groundwater and surface water. The site was considered to be part of a 
wider area of abatement under O. Reg. 153/04. As such, public consultation was 
carried out throughout the risk assessment process. A Record of Site Condition was 
obtained for the site.  
 
Toxicological Reference Values Review, Health Canada. 

2004 

Risk Assessor. A comparative review of toxicological reference values (TRVs) was 
carried out on behalf of Heath Canada. This entailed compiling TRVs from numerous 
regulatory agencies. A screening process was then used to identify those chemicals 
for which variation among TRVs was greatest. The rationale used in the derivation of 
the values was then evaluated to identify possible causes for the observed variation. 
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