ﬂ PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE

LE CENTRE POUR LA DEFENSE DE L'INTERET PUBLIC
November 22, 2017

PIACFILE # 6674

Ms. Kirsten Walli
Board Secretary VIA E-Mail — boardsec@oeb.ca
Ontario Energy Board
Suite 2700 12 pages
2300 Yonge Street

Toronto, ON
M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: Board File No. EB-2016-0066 — E.L.K. Energy Inc.
Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

We have attached the cost claim of the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) associated with
its participation in the above-noted proceeding. We have also directed a copy to the Applicant as well as
their Counsel.

Thank you.

- —— :
Donna Brady
Office Administrator

cc: E.L.K. — Mark Danelon — mdanelon@elkenergy.com
Counsel —John Vellone —jvellone@blg.com

1204-ONE Nicholas Street, Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7 Tel: 613-562-4002 Fax: 613-562-0007 piac@piac.ca www.piac.ca




Ontario Energy Board E%;{
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS =N

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the
Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.
Rate: Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed™ (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB- 2016-0066 Process: E.L.K. Energy Inc.
Party: Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition Affiant's Name: Donna Brady
HST Number: 13059 2405 HST Rate Ontario: 3.94%
Full Registrant ] Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered O Tax Exempt ]
Other ]
Affidavit
Il Donna Brady , of the City/Town of Ottawa
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1.1am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2.1 have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements
Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of
Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the
Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

e A S - / :

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Ottawa L
in the Province/State of Ontario , 0N A0l ZZ - L "-’)//
(date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits
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Ontario Energy Board @
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS o

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2016-0066 Process: E.L.K.Energy Inc.

Party: Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant/other fees S 16,145.00
Disbursements S 18.45
HST S 636.11
Total Cost Claim S 16,799.56

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Public Interest Advocacy Centre

Send payment to this address: 1204-ONE Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
K1N 7B7
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Ontario Energy Board @
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0066 Process: E.L.K. Energy Inc.
Party: Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition Service Provider Name: Cynthia Khoo
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel L I
Articling Student/Paralegal ]
Consultant ] Hourly Rate:
Analyst ]
For Consultant/Analyst: ] CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter % }:
U CV provided within previous 24 months
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours | Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 17000 (S - |3 - S -
Attendance $ 17000 (S - |s - |S -
Technical Conference
Preparation $ 17000 (S - |s - |S -
Attendance $ 170.00|$ - S . S -
Interrogatories
Preparation $ 170.00]| ¢ - S . S =
Responses $ 170.00|$ - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation S 170.00|$ . S - S -
Attendance $ 17000 | $ - 1S i -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation 8.80| S 170.00 | S 1,496.00 | $ 58.94 | S 1,554.94
Attendance 21.00$ 170.00|$ 3,570.00|S 14066 S 3,710.66
Proposal Preparation 1470 $ 170.00 | $ 2,499.00 | $ 98.46 | S 2,597.46
Argument
Preparation $ 17000 | $ - IS - |$ .
Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 170.00| S - |S - S "
Attendance $ 170.00 | $ - |s - |$ -
Other Conferences
Preparation $ 170.00 | $ - ]S - |S -
Attendance S 17000 (S - S : S -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - IS - | S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | [$ 7,5565.00]$ 298.06]$ 7,863.06
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PIAC FILE # 6674

Cynthia Khoo

External Counsel, Regulatory Affairs
Public Interest Advocacy Centre

1139 College Street

Toronto, ON
M6H 1B5

604.725.5484
_ckhoo@piac.ca

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
November 22, 2017
TO: VULNERABLE ENERGY CONSUMERS COALITION
c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre
Suite 1204
ONE Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
KIN 7B7

Re: EB -2016-0066
E.L.K. Energy Inc.
Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)
Cost Claim

For Services Rendered as Counsel in the above-noted matter. RATE: $170.00 per hour

To receipt, review, attend on behalf of VECC in the above-noted proceeding.

May 2017 to October 2017
TO: Hours

44.5 Hours @ $170.00 per hour 7,565.00
HST @ 13% 983.45

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND OWING: $ 8,548.45

Cynthia Khoo — HST # 739361897



Ontario Energy Board -- EB-2016-0066 E.L.K. Energy Inc. -- Cynthia Khoo -- Time Docket

Date People Client Project Task Start Finish Duration Hours Rate . Note

2017-05-14 CK Wulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Review/Process Documents 2:00 PM 2:45 PM 0:45:00 0.8 $170.00 Review notes from BH to prepare for ADR
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-14 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Review/Process Documents 2:45 PM 3:20 PM 0:35:00 06 $170.00 Read ELK application Exhibit 1
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-14 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Review/Process Documents 3:35PM 4117 PM 0:42:00 0.7 $170.00 Read ELK application Exhibit 1
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-14 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OQEB - Prepare for Settlement T15PM  9:00 PM 1:45:00 1.8 $170.00 Review briefing notes from MG, process for setflement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) Conference conference, cross-reference w/ interrogatories, exhibits, ete.

2017-05-14 CK Wulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Prepare for Settlement 10:00 PM  11:00 PM 1:00:00 1.0 $170.00 Review briefing notes from MG, process for settlement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) Conference conference, cross-reference w/ interrogatories, exhibits, etc.

2017-05-15 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 ELL.K. OEB - Prepare for Settlement 6:57 AM  7:47 AM 0:50:00 0.8 $170.00 Review briefing notes from MG, process for settlement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) Conference conference, cross-reference w/ interrogatories, exhibits, efc.

2017-05-15 CK Vuinerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Attend Settlement Conference 9:30 AM 5:00 PM 7:30:00 75 $170.00 ELK settlement conference - Day 1
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-16 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 ELK. OEB - Prepare for Settlement 1205 AM 1230 AM  0:25:00 0.4 $170.00 Update MG & BH; review new information from ELK
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0068)  Conference

2017-05-16 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Prepare for Settlement 8:50 AM 9:05 AM 0:15:00 0.3 $170.00 Review new information from ELK — OEB precedent for
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) Conference departing from RSC, Appendix 2-KA; review IRRs

2017-05-16 CK Wulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. QEB - Prepare for Settliement 10;18 AM  11:00 AM 0:42:00 0.7 $170.00 Review new information from ELK — OEB precedent for
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) Conference departing from RSC, Appendix 2-KA; review IRRs

2017-05-16 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Attend Settlement Conference  12:00 PM _ 2:30 PM 2:30:00 25 $170.00 Settlement Conference - Day 2
Coalition (VECC) {EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-16 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Attend Settlement Conference 400PM  530PM 1:30:00 1.5 $170.00 Settlement Conference - Day 2 (cont'd)
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-17 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Attend Settlement Conference 9:30 AM  5:00PM 7:30:00 7.5 $170.00 Settlement Conference - Day 3
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-19 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers  VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Research 703 PM 8:00 PM 0:57:00 1.0 §170.00 Research components of ulility "operational review", regulatory
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) audit, etc.

2017-05-20 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Research 12:20PM 1258 PM 0:37:50 0.6 $170.00 Research components of utility "operational review”, regulatory
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) audit, ete,

20170520 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 ELL.K. OEB - Research T19PM 2:14PM  0:55:19 0.8 $170.00 Research components of utility "operational review”, regulatory
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) audit, etc., compile & organize into email

2017-05-30 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 ELK. OEB - Review/Process Documents 910 AM  10:07 AM 0:56:55 0.9 $170.00 Review draft settlement agreement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-05-30 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 E.L.LK. OEB - Review/Process Dacuments 427 PM 450PM 0:23:.00 0.4 $170.00 Review draft settlement agreement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

201705-31 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 ELK. OEB - Review/Process Documents 11:06 AM  11:21 AM 0:15:00 0.3 $170.00 Review draft settlement agreement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-06-02 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE D006 EL.K. QEB - Attend Settlement Conference 1:30PM  2:30 PM 1:00:00 1.0 $170.00 Conference call to revise agreement wording
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-06-12 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL K. OEB - Review/Process Documents 8:40 AM  9:53 AM 1:12:42 12 $170.00 Review/give comments on E.L K.-revised settlement agreement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

201706-14 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Call/lMeeting 1150 AM  12:51 PM 1:01:33 1.0 $170.00 Conference call to further discuss settlement agreement
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) (outstanding issues)

2017-06-14 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers  VE 0006 ELK. OEB - CalllMeeting 240PM 3:115PM 0:35:17 06 $170.00 Intervenors' conference call caucus to discuss remaining process
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) issues

2017-06-20 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Review/Process Documents 1:22PM 146 PM 0:24:19 04 $170.00 Review settlement agreement
Caalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-06-22 CK Wuinerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. (QEB - CalliMeeting 12:30 PM  12:57 PM 0:27:00 05 $170.00 Conference call - all parties
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-06-22 CK Vuinerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. (QEB - Call/Meeting 12:59 PM 1:08 PM 0:10:45 0.2 $170.00 Conference call - all parties
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-08-29 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Call/Meeting 11:00 AM 1145 AM  0:45.00 08 $170.00 All-parties conference call re OEB decision/how to respond
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-09-01 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0008 E.L.LK. OEB - Review/Process Documents 1:42 PM 2:51 PM 1:09:49 1.2 $170.00 Review notes for examples of E.L.K. operational concerns
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-09-13 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers  VE 0006 EL.K. OEB - Prepare for Settlement 1.08PM  3:111PM  2:02:07 2.0 $170.00 Review file/emails/research & prep for conference call

Coalition (VECC)

(EB-2016-0066)

Conference




2017-09-15 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers  VE 0006 E.L.K. OEB - Attend Settlement Conference 10:15AM  11:15 AM 1:00:00 1.0 $170.00 All-parties teleconference to move forward new settlement

Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) agreement (1585 and Board requests re concems with ELK
application)

2017-09-20 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 00068 EL.K. OQEB- CalliMeeting 1:.05PM  2:30 PM 1:25:00 1.4  $170.00 Review settlement agreement; prep for call + call
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

2017-09-23 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers  VE 0006 ELK. OEB - Review/Process Documents 431PM 540 PM 1:09:00 1.2 $170.00 Review intervenor & staff discussions
Coaliion (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

201709-26 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers VE 0006 ELK. OEB- CalliMeeting 11:.00 AM  12:00 PM 1:00:00 1.0 $170.00 ELK conference calls re appendices, 1595, 1589; review
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066) appendix e

2017-10-02 CK Vulnerable Energy Consumers  VE 0006 ELK. OEB - CalllMeeting 3:45PM 450 PM 1:05:00 1.1 $170.00 Review materials and all-parties conference call
Coalition (VECC) (EB-2016-0066)

Total: 44.5



File # EB- 2016-0066

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Process:

Party: Vulnerable Energy Consumers Ci

Service Provider Name:

E.L.K. Energy Inc.

Cynthia Khoo

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Scanning/Photocopy

$

18.45

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): [

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

A A0 0 [0 A0 [0 [ [0 [0 [0 [ [0 [0 [ [ |

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

18.45 [ $

W

18.45
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Donna Brady

To: Donna Brady
Subject: Cost claim for: E.L.K. Energy Inc. / 2017 Rates

From: Cynthia Khoo [mailto:ckhoo@piac.ca]

Sent: Thursday, November 09, 2017 10:02 AM

To: Donna Brady

Subject: Re: FW: Cost claim for: E.L.K. Energy Inc. / 2017 Rates

Hi Donna,

Please find my time attached.

Can you also please add 123 copies.

I

Thanks,
Cynthia
=
<y
“:Cynthia Khoo
- External Counsel, Regulatory Affairs
“Public Interest Advocacy Centre
1139 College Street
. Toronto, ON M6H 1B5
1604.725.5484
ckhoo@piac.ca

o B
M 1
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
File # EB- 2016-0066 Process: E.L.K. 2017 Rates
Party: VECC Service Provider Name: Mark Garner
Completed Years
Year Called to Practising/Years of Relevant
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel ] I:] 29 |
Articling Student/Paralegal ]
Consultant Hourly Rate:
Analyst ]
For Consultant/Analyst: El CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):
CV provided within previous 24 months
Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours | Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 330.00]|S$ I - IS -
Attendance $ 330.00]|5$ - |s - |$ =
Technical Conference
Preparation $ 330.00|$ - |s - _|$ =
Attendance $ 330005 - |s - | S :
Interrogatories
Preparation 80/$ 33000|S$ 264000|$ 104.02| S 2,744.02
Responses 50/$ 33000(S$ 1,650.00]|5$ 65.01| S 1,715.01
Issues Conference
Preparation $  330.00 (5 : |8 B ) £
Attendance $  330.00(5$ - |S - |$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation 6.0[S 330.00|S$ 1,980.00|5S 7801 | S 2,058.01
Attendance $  330.00($ - S -~ |% -
Proposal Preparation S 330.00|$ - - - S -
Argument
Preparation $ 330.00|5S - S - S -
Oral Hearing
Preparation $  330.00|$ - |s - 1S 2
Attendance $ 330.00]|5S - S - -
Other Conferences
Preparation S 330.00(S - S - S .
Attendance $ 330005 - 1S - | $ -
Case Management $ 17000 S - 1S - |$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | [$ 6027000[$ 247.04]$ 6,517.04
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Ontario Energy Board

‘COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

s

File # EB- 2016-0066

Process: E.L.K. 2017 Rates

Party: VECC

Service Provider Name: Bill Harper

Completed Years
Year Called to

Practising/Years of Relevant

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one) Bar Experience
Legal Counsel 0 I:l [ 37 [
Articling Student/Paralegal ]
Consultant Hourly Rate:
Analyst O

For Consultant/Analyst:

O CV attached
CV provided within previous 24 months

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours | Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total

Pre-hearing Conference

Preparation $ 330.00]9 - 1S - S -

Attendance S 33000 - IS . S -
Technical Conference

Preparation $ 33000|(5S - S - S -

Attendance $  330.00($ - |s - |S £
Interrogatories

Preparation 2.8|S 330.00(5$ 907.50 | $ 35.76 | S 943.26

Responses $  330.00(¢$ - 1S - ]S -
Issues Conference

Preparation $ 330.00(S - S 2 S £

Attendance $  33000]$ - |S - |S -
ADR - Settlement Conference

Preparation 43|S 330.00| S 1,40250| S 5526 | S 1,457.76

Attendance $ 33000]5S - |$ - | S 2

Proposal Preparation $ 330.00($ - 1S - |S$ :

Argument

Preparation $  330.00$ - |$ - |$ -
Oral Hearing

Preparation $ 330.00|5S - S . 2

Attendance $  330.00|5$ - |s - |$ ;
Other Conferences

Preparation $  330.00|$ - 1S - | S =

Attendance S 330.00]|S - S - S .
Case Management S 170.00 | S > S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | |$ 231000[$ 9101[$ 2,401.01
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Econalysis Consulting Services Inc.

Statement of Costs

34 King St East
Suite 630 Date File #
Toronto, Ontario 11/8/2017 2017033
M5C 2X8
Bill To
Public Interest Advocacy Centre
Suite 1204
1 Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
K1N 7B7
Terms Docket No.
Net 30 EB-2016-0066
Project
ELK 2017 Rates
Serviced ltem Description Hours Rate Amount
3/25/2017 Interrogatories Preparation BH 0.75 330.00 247.50
3/26/2017 Interrogatories Preparation BH 2 330.00 660.00
3/30/2017 Interrogatories Preparation Interrogatory Prep/Review 6.5 330.00 2,145.00
file/Intervention/Notes
313112017 Interrogatories Preparation Interrogatories/finalize/notes 1.5 330.00 495,00
5/1/2017 ADR Preparation BH 3.25 330.00 1,072.50
5/11/2017 ADR Preparation BH 0.5 330.00 165.00
5/13/2017 Interrogatorics Responses Review interrogatory 3 330.00 990.00
responses/notes
5/14/2017 ADR Preparation Prepare brieifing notes for CK for 6 330.00 1,980.00
ADR/prepare follow-up IR
questions
5/15/2017 ADR Preparation BH 0.5 330.00 165.00
5/15/2017 Interrogatories Responsces Attend ADR for purpose of 2 330.00 660.00
follow-up and clarification
questions/brief CK
Subtotal 8,580.00
HST on Sales 13.00% 1,115.40

Please make cheque payable to "Econalysis Consulting Services Inc."

HST #10160 6028 $1,115.40

Total $9.695.40




