Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

	Instructions	
- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shad	led fields. Formulas are present in the	document to assist with the calculation
of the cost claim.		
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applic	cable, state exchange rate and country	
	Rate:	Country:
- A separate "Statement of Disbursements Being student/paralegal. However only one "Statemer Being Claimed" covering the whole of the party's - The cost claim must be supported by a complet - A CV for each consultant must be attached unle process within the last 24 months Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Pract	nt of Fees Being Claimed" and one "Sur s cost claim should be provided. ted Affidavit signed by a representative ess, for a given consultant, a CV has be	mmary of Fees and Disbursements e of the party. en provided to the Board in another
File # EB- 2015-0245	Process: Natural Gas	DSM EAC
Party: Energy Futures Group	Affiant's Name:	Chris Neme
HST Number:	HST	Rate Ontario:
Full Registrant	□ Oualifvi	ng Non-Profit □
Unregistered		Tax Exempt □
Other		
Other		
	Affidavit	
I, Chris Neme	, of the City/Town of	
in the Province/State of	Vermont	_, swear or affirm that:
1. I am a representative of the above-noted part 2. I have examined all of the documentation in some Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement of F 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disburse of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only of participation in the Ontario Energy Board proced 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the	support of this cost claim, including the ees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) ements Being Claimed", "Statement of costs incurred and time spent directly fess referred to above. Work done, or time spent, by a persor	e attached "Summary of Fees and of Disbursements Being Claimed". Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) or the purposes of the Party's
Simple of Afficient		
Signature of Affiant	this a state of	
in the Province/State of	ty/Town of My buy o	11/30/20/7

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

In Affidavits

Process: Natural Gas DSM EAC MINISTER OF SON COMMINISTRATION OF SON COMMI Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB- 2015-0245

Party:

Energy Futures Group

Summary	Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed						
Legal/consultant fees	\$21,285.00						
Disbursements	\$0.00						
HST	\$0.00						
Total Cost Claim	\$21,285.00	CAD					

Payment Information

U.S. Draft to: Prepare

Make cheque payable to: Energy Futures Group

Send payment to this address: P.O. Box 587

Hinesburg, Vermont 05461

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activity is found on the third tab of this workbook.

Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the fourth tab of this workbook.

Ontario Energy Board





Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed

SECTION SERVICES SERVICES SECTION SERVICES AND ADMINISTRATION OF THE SECTION SECTION SERVICES	
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:	Year Called Practicing/Years of Relevant to Bar Experience 31 CV not required:
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:	Completed Years Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience CV not required:
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:	Completed Years Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience CV not required:
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:	Completed Years Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience CV not required:
Name: Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:	Completed Years Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience CV not required:

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed

File # E 2015-0245

Process Natural Gas DSM EAC

Party Energy Futures Group

Post Mortem multiplied by | Up to 3 hours | multiplied by | Up to 2 hours | Up to 1 hour Evaluation Respond -Question-11 2015 naire 1.50 Review and Comment -Evaluation RFP SOW 10 2016 EAC Meeting 00.9 - Draft 2015 Meeting Time CPSV/NTG 6 Report 3.00 Review and Comment -**Draft 2015** CPSV NTG Results ∞ Report 2.00 Site Reports -Meeting Time 2015 CPSV EAC Call -Batch #7 Up to 20 hours Up to 1 hour Floor Memo Review and Comment -Efficiency Enbridge 9 Boiler 6.25 Reports (52) Review and Comment CPSV Site Batch #7 multiplied by Call Batch #6 2.50 Site Reports -Meeting Time 2015 CPSV EAC Call -4 4.00 Reports (48) Review and Comment -Up to 20 CPSV Site hours Batch #6 3 1.50 Site Reports -Meeting Time multiplied by 2015 CPSV EAC Call -Batch #5 7 0.25 Up to 8 hours Reports (22) -Review and Comment -CPSV Site Batch #5 Total: \$330.00 Hourly rate Whose Fees Individual are Being Chris Neme Claimed HST Rate:

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed



			Total	\$21,285.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
			HST	8	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
			Subtotal	\$21,285.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$21,285.00
21	ks (please of ask, md hours im)	Varies	Rationale						
21	Ad Hoc tasks assigned to individuals (please note date of assigned task, purpose, and hours in your claim)	Var	Hours	29.00					29.00
20	EAC Call – 2016 Procurement Process	Meeting Time multiplied by 1.5	Hours	1.50					1.50
19	EAC Call – Using Utility Metered Consumption Data to Measure Savings	Meeting Time multiplied by 1.5	Hours						00.00
18	EAC Call – Various Updates	Meeting Time Meeting Time Meeting Time Meeting Time Meeting Time multiplied by multiplied by multiplied by multiplied by 1.5 1.5 1.5	Hours						00.00
17	EAC Call – Various Updates	Meeting Time multiplied by 1.5	Hours						0.00
16	Review and Comment - EAC Call - EAC Call - TRM Process 2015 Annual 2015 Annual Review Verification Verification Submission Report Report	Meeting Time multiplied by 1.5							
15	EAC Call - 2015 Annual Verification Report	Meeting Time multiplied by 1.5		2.00					
14		Up to 2 hours		0.75					
13	Review and Comment - 2015 Annual Verification Report	Up to 3 hours		4.25					
12	EAC Call - 2015 CPSV/NTG Debrief & 2016 SOW	Meeting Time multiplied by 1.5							

9/29 to 10/13

Total legal/consultant fees: \$21,285.00

asked to serve on review evaluation proposal review committees by OEB (Valerie Bennett): review/scoring of 4 sets of proposals in response to evaluation RFPs; various calls w/OEB and other reviewers to discuss, select winners

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2073

Job Code:

1026

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

April 1-30, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
04/03/17	00	00	0.25	EAC emails
04/13/17	00	00	1.50	EAC CPSV call
04/26/17	00	00	4.00	Batch 6 file reviews and comments
04/28/17	00	00	2.50	prep for and particiapte in Batch 6 CPSV mtg
-				
			8.25	

PO Box 587

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2107

Job Code:

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

May 1-31, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
05/06/17	00	00	1.75	Review Batch 7 project reports
05/07/17	00	00	4.50	Review batch 7 project reports; send comments
05/10/17	00	00	2.00	call on CPSV Batch 7
			8.25	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2137

Job Code: 1026

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

June 1-30, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
06/06/17	00	00	3.00	Review and send comments on draft 2015 CPSV/NTG report
00/00/17	00	00	3.00	Review and send comments on draft 2015 CPSV/NTG report
06/22/17	00	00	6.00	EAC mtg
			9.00	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2167

Job Code:

1026

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

July 1-31, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
07/12/17	00	00		Review draft RFP SOWs; review comments of other EAC members; draft and send comments
			1.50	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2192

Job Code: 1026

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

August 1-31, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
08/09/17	00	00	1.25	review draft audit report
08/10/17	00	00	3.00	review draft audit report, send comments
08/16/17	00	00	0.75	Review and draft comments on TRM updating process
08/30/17	00	00	2.00	EAC call
			7.00	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2221

Job Code:

1026

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

September 1-30, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
09/29/17	00	00	1.50	Review CPSV proposals, scoring criteria, etc.
			1.50	

Hinesburg, VT 05461 Phone: (802) 482-5001 Fax: (802) 329-2143



Task Description

Invoice #

2252

Job Code:

1026

Job Name: OEB Evaluation Advisory Committee

Period:

October 1-31, 2017

Date	Phase #	Project #	Hours	Task Description
10/02/17	00	00	6.00	review and score responses to CPSV, residential proposals
10/03/17	00	00	7.00	review and score RFP responses; calls w/Review team
10/04/17	00	00	3.50	Review and score RFP responses; comments on Valerie's follow up to Econoler Res proposal
10/05/17	00	00	1.75	Review and score RFP proposals
10/06/17	00	00	6.25	review and score proposals; review team calls on CIPSV, custom meas life
10/11/17	00	00	1.50	EAC call
10/12/17	00	00	0.50	Review Econoler proposal elaboration
10/13/17	00	00	1.00	OEB review committee call
10/25/17	00	00	1.50	EAC call
			29.00	