

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair: GAIL REGAN
Treasurer, Cara Holdings
MAX ALLEN
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio
ANN CAVOUKIAN
Executive Director, PBDI, Rycrson University
DAVID CAYLEY
Writer
ANDREW COYNE
Columnist, National Post
GLENN FOX
Professor of Economics, University of Guelph

IAN GRAY
President, St. Lawrence Starch Co.
CLIFFORD OR WIN
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto
ANDREW ROMAN
Barrister & Solicitor
ANDREW STARK
Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto
GEORGE TOMKO
Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto
MARGARET WENTE
Columnist, Globe and Mail

January 3, 2018

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary, Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Please find the attached cost claim by Energy Probe Research Foundation ("Energy Probe") for the IESO proceeding (EB-2017-0150).

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly, Brady Yauch

Consultant for Energy Probe Research Foundation



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

	lr	nstructions		
 Required data input is indicated by yellow-shadlers. If apperation of the control o	olicable, state ex Rate: Being Claimed [®] each lawyer, an ursements" cov eted Affidavit sip ached unless pro	(comprising a "Statement of alyst/consultant and articlir ering the whole of the party gned by a representative of ovided to the Board as presontative of the party and as presontative of the board as presontative of the	initial currency. Country: of Fees Being Cla ng student/paral y's cost claim sho the party. cribed on the Co	nimed" and a "Statement of egal. ould be provided. st Award Tariff.
File # EB- 2017-0150		Process: EB-2017-0150	IESO 2017 fee	es
Party: Energy Probe Research Found	lation	Affiant's Name: P	atricia Adams	
HST Number: 10730 5146 RT0001		HST R	ate Ontario:	6.50%
Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifyin	g Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
		Affidavit		
I, Patricia Adams		, of the City/Town of _		Toronto
in the Province/State of	<u>Ontario</u>	,	swear or affir	m that:
1. I am a representative of the above-noted pa 2. I have examined all of the documentation in Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Cl 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disburs Disbursements Being Claimed" include only cost Ontario Energy Board process referred to abov 4. This cost claim does not include any costs fo described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Boar	support of this aimed" and "Sta ements Being Clasts incurred and re. r work done, or	cost claim, including the att itement(s) of Disbursement laimed", "Statement(s) of Fo time spent directly for the time spent, by a person tha	cached "Summar s Being Claimed" ees Being Claime purposes of the	ry of Fees and Disbursements ". ed" and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in the
Signature of Affiant				
Sworn or affirmed before me at the Ci in the Province/State of		oronto , on	Jan 1, 7 (date)	2018.

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2017-0150 Process: EB-2017-0150 IESO 2017 fees

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

	Summary of Fee	s and Disbursen	nents Being Claimed	
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	20,110.00		
Disbursements	\$	E		
HST	\$	1,307.15		
Total Cost Claim	\$	21,417.15		

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Send payment to this address: 225 Brunswick Avenue

Toronto, Ontario

M5S 2M6

Attention: Brady Yauch



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0150		Process: EB-20		
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundati	on	Service Provide	r Name: Roger Higgin	
			Year Called to	Completed Y Practising/Years o	f Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one) Bar	Experience	ce
	Legal Counsel			30	
	Articling Student/Paralegal		, 		
	Consultant	✓		Hourly Rate:	\$330
	Analyst				
	For Consultant/Analyst:			IST Rate Charged (enter %):	6.5%
		Ľ CV pr	ovided within previous 24 n	nonths	

	CV prov	ided	within previo	ous 2	4 months					
Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	240	\$	#÷:	\$		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$) - 1	\$		\$	15	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$) <u>H</u>	\$	3	\$	i i	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	(#E	\$	14 8	\$		
Interrogatories										
Preparation	10.00	\$	330.00	\$	3,300.00	\$	214.50	\$	3,514.50	
Responses		\$	330.00	\$) - (\$	9	\$	Ę	
Issues Conference										
Preparation	4.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,320.00	\$	85.80	\$	1,405.80	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	(#Y	\$; = 0	\$		
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation	5.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,650.00	\$	107.25	\$	1,757.25	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	120	\$	20	\$	21	
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	= 8	\$	*	
Argument										
Preparation	5.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,650.00	\$	107.25	\$	1,757.25	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(4)	\$	-	\$	#	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	=:	\$	#:	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$.=.	\$		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	3	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	325	\$	3	\$	=	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	7,920.00	\$	514.80	\$	8,434.80	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0150	Process:	EB-2017-0150 IESO 2017 fees	

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Roger Higgin

	Net Cost	HST		Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	. \$	
Printing		\$ -	\$	<u> </u>
Courier		\$ -	\$	*
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$	
Transcripts		\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$	
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$	=
Travel: Rail		\$	\$	2
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$	
Parking		\$ -	\$	-
Тахі		\$ -	\$	
Accommodation		\$	\$	=
Meals		\$.	\$	-
Other:		\$ -	\$	
Other:		\$.	\$	
Other:		\$	\$	



INVOICE :

Cus	tomer						
Name	Energy Probe R	esearch Foundation					
Address	225 Brunswick Avenue						
City	Toronto	Province Ont	P.C. M5S 2M6				
Attn	Brady Yauch						

Date 17/12/2017
Project No IESO
Title 2017 Fees
EB-2017-0150

Attn	Brady Yauch			EB-2017-015
Hours		Description Of Services	Unit Price	TOTAL
	DATE			
3.00	June 28 2017	Prepare comments on Proposed Issues List #1	\$330.00	\$990.00
4.00	•	Review Prefiled Evidence make notes	\$330.00	\$1,320.00
5.00	•	Prepare draft Interrogatories send to client	\$330.00	\$1,650.00
1.00	•	Review Client Comments on Issues List #2	\$330.00	\$330.00
	Aug 08 2017	Review IRs in context of revised issues list	\$330.00	\$330.00
	Sept 27 2017	Review Settlement Proposal	\$330.00	\$330.00
	Oct 23 2017	Prepare draft notes on outstanding issues	\$330.00	\$1,320.00
	Nov 3 2015	Review IESO AIC	\$330.00	\$660.00
	Nov 5 2017	Review Clients Draft on Outstanding Issues	\$330.00	\$660.00
1.00	Nov 06 2017	Comments on Clients Final Draft Argument	\$330.00	\$330.00
4.0	Total			\$7,920.00
_ P:	ayment Details		SubTotal	\$7,920.00
		_		\$0.00
$\overset{\smile}{oldsymbol{ol}}}}}}}}$	Cash	Taxes	HST	\$1,029.60
	Cheque		PST	0001000
\circ	Other		TOTAL	\$8,949.60
Name Date	CHEQUES PAYA	ABLE TO SPA		



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0150		Process: EB-2017-0150 IESO 2017 fees					
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	on	Service Provider Name:	Brady Yauch				
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant				
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one	e) Bar	Experience				
	Legal Counsel			6				
	Articling Student/Paralegal		·					
	Consultant	V		Hourly Rate: \$230				
	Analyst			92				
	For Consultant/Analyst:		ttached HST Rate C provided within previous 24 months	harged (<i>enter</i> %): 6.5%				

Statement of Fees Being Claimed									
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	3	\$	Ē	\$	<u> </u>
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	72	\$	- 1	\$	¥
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	<u>}</u> ₩	\$	7#6	\$	=
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$: = :	\$	254	\$	H
Interrogatories									
Preparation	9.25	\$	230.00	\$	2,127.50	\$	138.29	\$	2,265.79
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	17 4 8	\$	}⊈:	\$	×
Issues Conference									
Preparation	8.00	\$	230.00	\$	1,840.00	\$	119.60	\$	1,959.60
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	i.e.	\$	3	\$	=
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	11.25	\$	230.00	\$	2,587.50	\$	168.19	\$	2,755.69
Attendance	12.50	\$	230.00	\$	2,875.00	\$	186.88	\$	3,061.88
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	5.00	\$		\$	ē
Argument									
Preparation	12.00	\$	230.00	\$	2,760.00	\$	179.40	\$	2,939.40
Oral Hearing									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	e	\$:::	\$	
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$		\$:#:	\$	
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	79	\$	=
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	¥	\$:#E	\$	-
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	8 = 0	\$	A.
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				١٤	12,190.00	\$	792.35	\$	12,982.35



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0150	Process:	EB-2017-0150 IESO 2017 fees

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Brady Yauch

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$ į
Printing		\$ -	\$ ì
Courier		\$ -	\$ 5
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$
Transcripts		\$ -	\$
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$
Parking		\$ -	\$
Тахі		\$ -	\$
Accommodation		\$ -	\$
Meals		\$ -	\$ ş
Other:		\$ -	\$)
Other:		\$ -	\$
Other:		\$ -	\$

Brady Yauch

67A Auburn Avenue Toronto ON M6H 2L8 GST/HST 802822023 RT0001

Bill To:

Mr. Frank Cianflone Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6

For:

Intervenor services for EB-2017-0150 Independent Electricity System Operator 2017 Revenue Requirement

DATE: 12/21/17

Date	Description of Task	Time
June 23, 2016	Reviewed evidence and provided comments on draft issues list	2.75 Hours
June 26, 2016	Reviewed evidence and provided comments on draft issues list	3.25 hours
July 20, 2017	Wrote and edited response to PO2 on comments on issues	1.25 hour
July 21, 2017	Wrote and edited response to PO2 on comments on issues	.75 hour
August 6, 2017	Reviewed evidence, as well as Brattle report, and wrote IRs.	3.25 hours
August 7, 2017	Reviewed evidence, as well as Brattle report, and wrote IRs.	3.25 hours
August 8, 2017	Reviewed evidence, as well as Brattle report, and wrote IRs.	2.75 hours
September 11, 2017	Reviewed IR responses and prepared for settlement conference	4.25 hours
September 12, 2017	Reviewed IR responses and prepared for settlement conference	3.5 hours
September 13, 2017	Reviewed IR responses and prepared for settlement conference	3.5 hours
September 14, 2017	Attended settlement conference	6.5 hours
September 15, 2017	Attended settlement conference	5.5 hours
September 15, 2017	Conference call as part of settlement conference	.5 hours
October 30, 2017	Wrote and edited argument	4.25 hours
October 31, 2017	Wrote and edited argument	4 hours
November 7, 2017	Wrote and edited argument	3.75 hours
	Total Hours	53 hours
	Rate	\$230
	Hours x Rate	\$12,190.00
	HST (13%)	\$1,584.70
	Total	\$13,774.70