

THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Chair: GAIL REGAN
Treasurer, Cara Holdings
MAX ALLEN
Producer, IDEAS, CBC Radio
ANN CAVOUKIAN
Executive Director, PBDI, Ryerson University
DAVID CAYLEY
Writer
ANDREW COYNE
Columnist, National Post
GLENN FOX
Professor of Economics, University of Guelph

IAN GRAY
President, St. Lawrence Starch Co.
CLIFFORD OR WIN
Professor of Political Science, University of Toronto
ANDREW ROMAN
Barrister & Solicitor
ANDREW STARK
Rotman School of Management, University of Toronto
GEORGE TOMKO
Resident Expert, PSI Initiative, University of Toronto
MARGARET WENTE
Columnist, Globe and Mail

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary, Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Please find the attached cost claim by Energy Probe Research Foundation ("Energy Probe") for the Five Nations Energy Inc. (FNEI) proceeding (EB-2016-0231).

Should you require additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly, Brady Yauch

Consultant for Energy Probe Research Foundation



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions							
- All claims m - A separate Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	ata input is indicated by yellow-shad nust be in Canadian dollars. If appli "Detail of Fees and Disbursements I its Being Claimed") is required for e ly one "Summary of Fees and Disbu im must be supported by a comple ch consultant/analyst must be attac cept as provided in section 7.03 of	cable, state exchange Rate: Rate: Reing Claimed" (cach lawyer, analy rsements" coverited Affidavit signoshed unless provide	omprising a "Statement st/consultant and articling the whole of the particle by a representative odded to the Board as presented to the Board as pre	of initial currency. Country: of Fees Being Clair ing student/paraleg ty's cost claim shou of the party. scribed on the Cost	med" and a "Statement of gal. Ild be provided. Award Tariff.		
File # EB-	2016-0231	P	rocess: EB-2016-023	1 FNEI rates			
Party:	Energy Probe Research Founda	ation	Affiant's Name:	Patricia Adams			
HST Numbe	er: <u>10730 5146 RT0001</u>		HST I	Rate Ontario:	6.50%		
	Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit Tax Exempt			
		Af	fidavit				
l,	Patricia Adams	, o	f the City/Town of		Toronto		
in the Prov	ince/State of	Ontario		, swear or affirn	n that:		
1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant							
Sworn or a	affirmed before me at the Cit	v/Town of	Toronto				
	rince/State of	_	, on	Jan 01, (date)	7018		
And the same of th							

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2016-0231 Process: EB-2016-0231 FNEI rates

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed							
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	15,887.50					
Disbursements	\$						
HST	\$	1,032.69					
Total Cost Claim	\$	16,920.19					

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Send payment to this address: 225 Brunswick Avenue

Toronto, Ontario

M5S 2M6

Attention: Brady Yauch



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2016-0231		Process: <u>EB-2016-0231</u>	FNEI rates
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundati	on	Service Provider Name:	Roger Higgin
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel			30
	Articling Student/Paralegal		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
	Consultant	V		Hourly Rate: \$330
	Analyst			
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV atta	ached HST Rate C	harged (enter %): 6.5%
		☑ CV pro	vided within previous 24 months	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·

St	atement o	of Fe	es Being	Clai	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ 9 * 5
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$ -	\$:=:
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	2.1	\$ 2	\$ *
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ 2	\$ 3 # 1
Interrogatories							
Preparation	6.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,980.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 2,108.70
Responses		\$	330.00	\$		\$ -	\$
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	241	\$ 2	\$ 3.83
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	3)	\$	\$:=:
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	14 7	\$ 18	\$ (=)
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	90	\$ ¥	\$ 2 €)
Argument							
Preparation	6.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,980.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 2,108.70
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	6.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,980.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 2,108.70
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	(#):	\$ -	\$ (#)
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(20	\$ 	\$
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	¥	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	==:	\$ 2	\$ (#:
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES		,		\$	5,940.00	\$ 386.10	\$ 6,326.10



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0231 **Process:** EB-2016-0231 FNEI rates

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Roger Higgin

	Net Cost	HST	Т Т	otal
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$	-
Printing		\$ -	\$	
Courier		\$ -	\$	82
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$	
Transcripts		\$ 2	\$	78
Travel: Air		\$ Ĥ	\$	5-1
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$	
Travel: Rail		\$ 	\$	
Travel (Other):		\$ 8	\$	
Parking		\$ =	\$	283
Taxi		\$ -	\$	7
Accommodation		\$ 	\$	13*1
Meals		\$	\$	
Other:		\$ 9	\$	
Other:		\$ ¥	\$	141
Other:		\$ -	\$	149



INVOICE:

Cus	tomer				
Name	Energy Probe R	esearch Foundation	1 [Date	17/12/2017
Address	225 Brunswick A	Avenue		Project No	FNEI Transm.
City	Toronto	Province Ont	P.C. M5S 2M6	Title	2017 Rates
Attn	Brady Yauch				EB-2016-0231

Attn	Brady Yauch				EB-2016-0231
Hours		Description Of Services		Unit Price	TOTAL
1.00 6.00 4.00	DATE April 12 2017 April 18 2017 Jun 28 2017 Aug 10 2017 Aug 11 2017	Review IRRs and Prepare notes Attend conference re Next Steps Review IRRs & Prepare Hearing Notes for Clien Review FNEI AIC, provide notes for EP Argume Comments on Client's draft Argument		\$330.00 \$330.00 \$330.00 \$330.00	\$1,650.00 \$330.00 \$1,980.00 \$1,320.00 \$660.00
(• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	Total ayment Details Cash Cheque Other CHEQUES PAY		axes	SubTotal HST PST TOTAL	\$5,940.00 \$5,940.00 \$0.00 \$772.20 \$6,712.20

HST NUMBER 88413 6714 RT0001



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2016-0231		Process: EB-2	016-0231 FNEI rates
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundati	on	Service Provic	ler Name: Brady Yauch
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check oi	ne) Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel			6
	Articling Student/Paralegal		-	
	Consultant	~		Hourly Rate: \$230
	Analyst			· ·
	For Consultant/Analyst:	□ cv	attached	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 6.5%
		☑ cv	provided within previous 24	months

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clai	med		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	9	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	×	\$:=	\$: -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$		\$	\$:::::
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$		\$ A.	\$ 審
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	9	\$ i in	\$
Interrogatories							
Preparation	4.25	\$	230.00	\$	977.50	\$ 63.54	\$ 1,041.04
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	and the same of th	\$ =	\$ 30
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	2	\$ -	\$:=:
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	*	\$ -	\$ 9 # 4
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	·	\$ Ŧ	\$ 3
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	<u> </u>	\$ =	\$ \$ 2 2
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$		\$ 2	\$:#::
Argument							
Preparation	23.00	\$	230.00	\$	5,290.00	\$ 343.85	\$ 5,633.85
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	7.00	\$	230.00	\$	1,610.00	\$ 104.65	\$ 1,714.65
Attendance	9.00	\$	230.00	\$	2,070.00	\$ 134.55	\$ 2,204.55
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$		\$ ₽.	\$ Æ
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	- 8	\$ ē	\$
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	all	\$ 2	\$
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	9,947.50	\$ 646.59	\$ 10,594.09



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2016-0231 Process: EB-2016-0231 FNEI rates

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Brady Yauch

	Net Cost	HST	 Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$
Printing		\$ -	\$ -
Courier		\$ -	\$ 14
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$ -
Transcripts		\$ -	\$ 100
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$:
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$ 74
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$ 54
Parking		\$ -	\$ 1-
Тахі		\$ -	\$ -
Accommodation		\$ -	\$ ŝ
Meals		\$ -	\$ 3
Other:		\$ -	\$ 34
Other:		\$ -	\$ 5=
Other:		\$ -	\$

Brady Yauch

67A Auburn Avenue Toronto ON M6H 2L8 GST/HST 802822023 RT0001

Bill To:

For: Intervenor services for EB-2016-0231 FNEI Rates

DATE: 12/21/17

Mr. Frank Cianflone Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6

Date	Description of Task	Time
June 28, 2017	Reviewed evidence and IRs	4.25 hours
June 29, 2017	Prepared notes for cross examination	2 hours
July 4, 2017	Prepared notes for cross examination	2.25 hours
July 5, 2017	Prepared notes for cross examination	2.75 hours
July 6, 2017	Cross examination and attended oral hearing	7.5 hours
July 7, 2017	Attended oral hearing	1.5 hours
August 08, 2017	Wrote and edited final argument, included reviewing transcripts, evidence and FNEI's final argument	7.5 hours
August 09, 2017	Wrote and edited final argument, included reviewing transcripts, evidence and FNEI's final argument	7.25 hours
August 22, 2017	Wrote and edited final argument, included reviewing transcripts, evidence and FNEI's final argument	7 hours
August 23, 2017	Formatted final argument	1.25 hours
	Total Hours	43.25
	Rate	\$230
	Hours x Rate	\$9,947.50
	HST (13%)	\$1,293.18
	Total	\$11,240.68