

#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			Instructions		
- All claims m - A separate ' Disbursemen However, onl - The cost cla - A CV for each	ust be in Canadi "Detail of Fees a its Being Claimed ly one "Summary im must be supp ch consultant/an	ated by yellow-shaded fields. If applicable, state Rated Disbursements Being Claim. It is required for each lawyer, of Fees and Disbursements orted by a completed Affidavialyst must be attached unless. It in section 7.03 of the Practical and the section 7.03 o	e exchange rate and country of te: ed" (comprising a "Statement analyst/consultant and article covering the whole of the part t signed by a representative of provided to the Board as presentative of	of initial currency.  Country:  t of Fees Being Clail  ling student/parake  ty's cost claim sho  of the party.  scribed on the Cos	imed" and a "Statement of egal. ould be provided. st Award Tariff.
File # EB-	EB-2017-0051		Process: Hydro One R	Remotes' Applica	ation for 2018 Rates
Party:	<b>Energy Probe</b>	Research Foundation	Affiant's Name:	Elizabeth Brubal	ker
HST Numbe	er: 10730 5	146 RT0001	HST	Rate Ontario:	6.50%
		Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualifyi	ing Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
			Affidavit		
l,	Eli	zabeth Brubaker	, of the City/Town of		Toronto
in the Prov	ince/State of	<b>Ontario</b>		, swear or affir	m that:
2. I have example Being Claimer 3. The attached Disbursement Ontario Energy 4. This cost cl	mined all of the od", "Statement(sed "Summary of ts Being Claimed gy Board process laim does not inconsections 6.05 and	e above-noted party (the "Part documentation in support of the documentation in support of the of Fees Being Claimed" and " Fees and Disbursements Being "include only costs incurred a streferred to above. Clude any costs for work done, de 6.09 of the Board's Practice I	his cost claim, including the a Statement(s) of Disbursemer g Claimed", "Statement(s) of and time spent directly for the or time spent, by a person th	ttached "Summary nts Being Claimed" Fees Being Claimed e purposes of the I	y of Fees and Disbursements d" and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in the
=		r <b>e me</b> at the City/Town o	f Toronto		
	ince/State of	<u>Ontono</u>	, on	Apnl 18, 2 (date)	olb .

**Commissioner for taking Affidavits** 



#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB- EB-2017-0051 Process: Hydro One Remotes' Application for 2018 Rates

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed						
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	16,980.00				
Disbursements	\$	-				
HST	\$	1,103.70				
Total Cost Claim	\$	18,083.70				

#### **Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: Energy Probe Research Foundation

Send payment to this address: 225 Brunswick Avenue

Toronto, Ontario

M5S 2M6

Attention: Brady Yauch



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	EB-2017-0051		Process: Hyd	ro One Remotes' Application for 2018 Rates
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundati	on	Service Provi	der Name: Roger Higgin
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one )	Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel			30
	<b>Articling Student/Paralegal</b>			
	Consultant	<b>V</b>		Hourly Rate: \$330
	Analyst			
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Charged (enter %): 6.5%
		CV prov	ided within previous 24	months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed									
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	( <b>2</b> )	\$	=	\$	2 <b>9</b>
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	S#(0	\$	¥	\$	) <del>=</del> :
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	<b>=</b> (	\$		\$	(5)
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	- 5	\$		\$	
Interrogatories									
Preparation	14.00	\$	330.00	\$	4,620.00	\$	300.30	\$	4,920.30
Responses		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	(e:
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	9	\$	98	\$	<b>E</b>
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	<b>1</b>	\$	¥	\$	2 <b>4</b>
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	4.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,320.00	\$	85.80	\$	1,405.80
Attendance	0.00	\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	C#4
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	8	\$	329
Argument									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	æc	\$		\$	:( <del>*</del> :
Oral Hearing									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$		\$	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$	988	\$	14
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	Œ:
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	¥	\$	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$		\$	5	\$	in the second
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,940.00	\$	386.10	\$	6,326.10



#### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB- EB-2017-0051 Process: Hydro One Remotes' Application for 2018 Rates

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Roger Higgin

	nent of Disbursements Being Clair Net Cost		HST	T -	otal
	Net Cost		пэт		
Scanning/Photocopy		\$		\$	1925
Printing		\$		\$	(·
Courier		\$	-	\$	3#3
Telephone/Fax		\$		\$	ē=
Transcripts		\$	÷	\$	t <del>s</del>
Travel: Air		\$	=	\$	~
Travel: Car		\$	-	\$	S <b>=</b> 1
Travel: Rail		\$	-	\$	
Travel (Other):		\$		\$	(=)
Parking		\$	¥	\$	
Тахі		\$	=	\$	120
Accommodation		\$	2	\$	-
Meals		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$		\$	(20)
Other:		\$	é	\$	
Other:		\$	2	\$	720
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	-  \$	#	\$	-



15 Malabar Place Don Mills, Toronto, Ontario M3B 1A4 (416) 391-0738 fax (416) 391-0738

### **INVOICE**:

Cus	stomer ———				
Name	Energy Probe F	Research Foundation		Date	17/04/2018
Address	225 Brunswick	Avenue		Project No	H One Remotes
City	Toronto	Province Ont	P.C. M5S 2M6	Title	2017 Rates
Attn	Brady Yauch				EB-2017-0050

Hours		Description Of Services		Unit Price	TOTAL
	DATE				
8.00	20-Nov-17	Review Application prepare briefing n	\$330.00	\$2,640.00	
3.00	28-Dec-17	Prepare notes for IRs	\$330.00	\$990.00	
3.00	31-Dec-17	Prepare Draft IRs send to client		\$330.00	\$990.00
4.00	04-Feb-18	Review IRRs Prepare Notes for Settle	\$330.00	\$1,320.00	
	Total			SubTotal	\$5,940.00 \$5,940.00
Pa	yment Details				\$0.00
0	Cash		Taxes	HST	\$772.20
$\odot$	Cheque			PST	
$\circ$	Other			TOTAL	\$6,712.20
Name Date	CHEQUES PAY	ABLE TO SPA		•	



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	EB-2017-0051	<b>Process:</b> Hydro One Remotes' Application for 2018 Rates					
Party:	Energy Probe Research Foundation	on	Service Provider Name		Brady Yauch		
			Year Called to		Complete Practising/Year	rs of Relevant	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one )	Bar		Experi	ence	
	Legal Counsel				6	1)	
	Articling Student/Paralegal						
	Consultant	V			Hourly Rate:	\$230	
	Analyst				-		
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Ch	harged (enter % ):	6.5%	
		☑ CV prov	rided within previo	us 24 months			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed									
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	<b>=</b> :	\$	<del>=</del>	\$	3#3
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$		\$	*	\$	
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	5.1	\$	-	\$	<b>(6)</b>
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	<b>=</b> 7	\$	=	\$	741
Interrogatories									
Preparation	12.75	\$	230.00	\$	2,932.50	\$	190.61	\$	3,123.11
Responses		\$	230.00	\$		\$		\$	(.5)
Issues Conference		18							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	黨(	\$	=	\$	22,
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	<b>9</b> 5	\$	4	\$	360
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	23.75	\$	230.00	\$	5,462.50	\$	355.06	\$	5,817.56
Attendance	11.50	\$	230.00	\$	2,645.00	\$	171.93	\$	2,816.93
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	₩/.	\$	=	\$	82
Argument									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	(*)	\$	-	\$	[c#0
Oral Hearing	j								
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	30	\$		\$	*
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	<b>4</b> %	\$	22	\$	REF
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	<b></b>	\$	-	\$	
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	<b></b>	\$	il I	\$	)÷
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	**	\$	ē	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	11,040.00	\$	717.60	\$	11,757.60



#### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB- EB-2017-0051 Process: Hydro One Remotes' Application for 2018 Rates

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundati Service Provider Name: Brady Yauch

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed									
	Net Cost	HST		Total					
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$	12					
Printing		\$ -	\$	(*)					
Courier		\$ -	\$	S=-					
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$	19					
Transcripts		\$ -	\$	-					
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$	828					
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$	**					
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$	//=					
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$						
Parking		\$ -	\$	(*					
Тахі		\$ -	\$	746					
Accommodation		\$ -	\$						
Meals		\$ -	\$	j. <b>=</b> ;					
Other:		\$ -	\$						
Other:		\$ -	\$						
Other:		\$ -	\$	-					
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	l \$	- \$ -	\$						

### **Brady Yauch**

67A Auburn Avenue Toronto ON M6H 2L8 GST/HST 802822023 RT0001

Bill To:

Energy Probe Research Foundation 225 Brunswick Avenue Toronto, Ontario, M5S 2M6 For:

Intervenor services for EB-2017-0051, Hydro One Remotes rates 2018-2022

**DATE: 4/18/18** 

Date	DESCRIPTION	Time
December 27, 2017	Reviewed evidence and wrote interrogatories.	4.5 hours
December 28, 2017	Reviewed evidence and wrote interrogatories.	4 hours
December 29, 2017	Reviewed evidence and wrote interrogatories.	4.25 hours
February 2, 2018	Reviewed interrogatories and prepared for settlement	5.5 hours
February 5, 2018	Reviewed interrogatories and prepared for settlement	5.25 hours
February 6, 2018	Attended settlement conference	7.5 hours
February 7, 2018	Attended settlement conference	4 hours
February 15, 2018	Reviewed draft settlement and provided comments	1.5 hours
March 13, 2018	Reviewed amended settlement, spoke with Energy Probe members about next steps. Reviewed evidence in preparation for settlement conference.	3.5 hours
March 14, 2018	Prepared notes for amended settlement agreement and prepared for settlement hearing.	5 hours
March 19, 2018	Prepared for and attended oral hearing	3 hours
	Total Hours	48
	Rate	\$230
	Hours X Rate	\$11,040
	HST (13%)	\$1,435.20
	Total	\$12,475.20
	te	