

Lisa (Elisabeth) DeMarco Senior Partner

5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5R 2E1

TEL +1.647.991.1190

FAX +1.888.734.9459

lisa@demarcoallan.com

September 20, 2018

VIA RESS AND COURIER

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2017-0335 Anwaatin Motion to Review and Vary the Decision in EB-2016-0160 Revised Cost Claim

Please find attached the revised cost claim of Anwaatin Inc. (**Anwaatin**) for the above-referenced proceeding (the **Proceeding**), filed at the request of the Board to correct certain deficiencies. This cost claim was originally filed on August 30, 2018, pursuant to the Board's Decision and Order dated August 23, 2018.

Anwaatin respectfully requests an award of 100% of its eligible costs. Anwaatin submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (i) Anwaatin adduced evidence in EB-2016-0160 concerning poor electricity system reliability and disparate reliability impacts in Indigenous communities and was subsequently forced to bring the motion initiating this Proceeding to ensure that the Board expressly addressed this evidence;
- (ii) Anwaatin participated effectively in all aspects of the Proceeding, taking a leadership role to assist the Board in complying with its mandate to protect the interests of consumers with respect to prices and the adequacy, reliability and quality of electricity service;
- (iii) Anwaatin undertook settlement discussions in a manner that efficiently and effectively worked toward full and final resolution of the issues and was guided by the Board's *Practice Direction on Settlement Conferences*, as amended; and

(iv) Anwaatin helped to lay the foundation for a first-of-its-kind pilot project aimed at improving extremely disparate and inadequate Hydro One Networks Inc. system reliability in Indigenous communities in Northern Ontario.

We trust that these considerations highlight both efficiency and the right of otherwise unrepresented and important Indigenous communities to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's mandate and statutory objectives. Anwaatin respectfully requests a full award of eligible costs.

Yours very truly,

Lisa (Elisabeth) DeMarco



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or

		Instructions	
- All claims must - A separate "De Disbursements E However, only o - The cost claim	input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formula be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchanges in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchanges in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchanges in Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed (co. Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analysine "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering must be supported by a completed Affidavit signer consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice	nge rate and country of initial currency. Count omprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claime t/consultant and articling student/paralegal ng the whole of the party's cost claim should d by a representative of the party. ed to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Aw	try: eo and a Statement or be provided. vard Tariff.
File # EB- E	B-2017-0335	Process: MRV Hydro One Transmis	ssion Decision
Party: A	Anwaatin Inc.	Affiant's Name: Jonathan M	cGillivray
HST Number:	794713495 RT0001	HST Rate Ontar	io: 13.00%
	Full Registrant Unregistered Other	Qualifying Non-Pro Tax Exem	
		Affidavit	
l, _	Jonathan McGillivray	, of the City/Town of	Toronto
in the Province	ce/State of Ontario	, swear or	affirm that:
2. I have examing Claimed" "State 3. The attached Being Claimed" 4. This cost claim sections 6.05 and	n does not include any costs for work done, or time and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Aug.	claim, including the attached "Summary of F of Dishus ements Reine Claimed" ned", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" for the purposes of the Party's participation in spent, by a person that is an employee or of	ees and Disbursements Being and "Statement(s) of Disbursements In the Ontario Energy Board process
0.			
	rmed before me at the City/Town of	Toronto	,
in the Province	ce/State of Ontario	THE CONTRACT OF THE PARTY OF TH	20, 2018
LISA Der	er for taking Affidavits LACO, A Commissioner of B-2017-0335	Oath S - Process: MRV Hydro One Transmis	ssion Decision



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	le # EB- EB-2017-0335			MRV Hydro One Transmission Decision
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.			
		Summary of Fee	s and Disburse	ments Being Claimed
Legal/cons	ultant/other fees	\$	66,064.00	
Disbursem	ents	\$	106.67	
HST		\$	8,592.31	
Total Cost	Claim	\$	74,762.98	
. 0 (4	, ,,, 02.30	

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: DeMarco Allan LLP

Send payment to this address: Bay Adelaide Centre

333 Bay Street, Suite 600

Toronto, ON M5H 2T6



File # EB-	EB-2017-0335		Process:	MRV Hydro One	e Transmission D	ecision	
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.		Service I	Provider Name:	Lisa DeMarco		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar 1997		Completed Years I of Relevant I	Experience	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst				Hourly Rate:	\$330	
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attack	ned ded within previous		Charged (enter %):	13.0%	

	Statement of	of Fe	es Being (Claiı	med		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation	34.80	\$	330.00	\$	11,484.00	\$ 1,492.92	\$ 12,976.92
Argument							
Preparation	19.80	\$	330.00	\$	6,534.00	\$ 849.42	\$ 7,383.42
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	11.80	\$	330.00	\$	3,894.00	\$ 506.22	\$ 4,400.22
Attendance	10.00	\$	330.00	\$	3,300.00	\$ 429.00	\$ 3,729.00
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management				\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	25,212.00	\$ 3,277.56	\$ 28,489.56



File# EB-	EB-2017-0335	Process: MRV Hydro One Transmission Decision		
Partv:	Anwaatin Inc.	Service Provider Name:	Lisa DeMarco	

		bursements Being Claimed Net Cost	T	HST	Total
		Net Cost		пэт	TOTAL
Scanning/Photocopy			\$	-	\$ -
Printing			\$	-	\$ -
Courier		\$ 30.67	\$	3.99	\$ 34.66
Telephone/Fax			\$	-	\$ -
Transcripts			\$	-	\$ -
Travel: Air			\$	-	\$ -
Travel: Car			\$	-	\$ -
Travel: Rail			\$	-	\$ -
Travel (Other):			\$	-	\$ -
Parking			\$	-	\$ -
Taxi			\$	-	\$ -
Accommodation			\$	-	\$ -
Meals			\$	-	\$ -
Other:			\$	-	\$ -
Other:			\$	-	\$ -
Other:			\$	-	\$ -
TOTAL DISBURSEMENT	S:	\$ 30.67	\$	3.99	\$ 34.66



File # EB-	EB-2017-0335		Process: MRV Hydro One Transmission Decision						
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.			Service Pr	ovider Name:	Cary Ferguson			
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check	k one)	Year Called to Bar 2014		Completed Years of Relevant	Experience		
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst					Hourly Rate:	\$170		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attach	ned ded within previous 2		Charged (enter %):	13.0%		

	Statement o	of Fe	es Being (Clai	med		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	_	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	_	\$ -	\$ -
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ =	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	_	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	_	\$ -	\$ -
Argument							
Preparation	39.80	\$	170.00	\$	6,766.00	\$ 879.58	\$ 7,645.58
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	53.40	\$	170.00	\$	9,078.00	\$ 1,180.14	\$ 10,258.14
Attendance	6.00	\$	170.00	\$	1,020.00	\$ 132.60	\$ 1,152.60
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management	3.60	\$	170.00	\$	612.00	\$ 79.56	\$ 691.56
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	17,476.00	\$ 2,271.88	\$ 19,747.88



Party:	Anwaatin Inc.	Service Provid	ler Name:	Cary Ferguson	
File # EB-	EB-2017-0335	Process:	MRV Hydro (One Transmission Decision	

	Statement of Disbursements Being Claime	d	
	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$ -
Printing		\$ -	\$ -
Courier		\$ -	\$ -
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$ -
Transcripts		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$ -
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$ -
Parking		\$ -	\$ -
Taxi		\$ -	\$ -
Accommodation		\$ -	\$ -
Meals		\$ -	\$ -
Other:		\$ -	\$ -
Other:		\$ -	\$ -
Other:		\$ -	\$ -
•	·		
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -



File # EB-	EB-2017-0335		Process:	MRV Hydro One	? Transmission D	ecision	
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.		Service F	Provider Name:	Jonathan McGi	llivray	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years of Relevant	.	
	Legal Counsel		2017		1		
	Articling Student/Paralegal						
	Consultant				Hourly Rate:	\$170	
	Analyst						
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ned ded within previous		Charged (enter %):	13.0%	

9	Statement o	of Fe	ees Being (Clair	ned		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	9	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation	13.10	\$	170.00	\$	2,227.00	\$ 289.51	\$ 2,516.51
Argument							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management	5.50	\$	170.00	\$	935.00	\$ 121.55	\$ 1,056.55
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	3,162.00	\$ 411.06	\$ 3,573.06



Darty	Anwagtin Inc	Sarvica Provider Name	longthan McGilliyray	
File # EB-	EB-2017-0335	Process: MRV Hydro O	ne Transmission Decision	

St	catement of Disbursements Being Cl	aimed			
	Net Cost	Н	ST	To	tal
Scanning/Photocopy		\$	-	\$	-
Printing		\$	-	\$	-
Courier	\$	- \$	-	\$	-
Telephone/Fax		\$	-	\$	-
Transcripts		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Air		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Car		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Rail		\$	-	\$	-
Travel (Other):		\$	-	\$	-
Parking		\$	-	\$	-
Taxi		\$	-	\$	-
Accommodation		\$	-	\$	-
Meals		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	- \$	-	\$	-



File# EB-	EB-2017-0335		Process: MRV Hydro One Transmission Decision							
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.	_	Service Provider Name	: Travis Allan						
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar 2010	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience						
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate: \$230						
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ned HST Rate ded within previous 24 months	Charged (<i>enter</i> %): 13.0%						

	Statement o	of Fe	es Being (Clain	ned			
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference							_	
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Technical Conference							_	
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Interrogatories								
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Issues Conference								
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference								
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ _	\$	
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Argument								
Preparation	1.80	\$	230.00	\$	414.00	\$ 53.82	\$	467.82
Oral Hearing								
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Other Conferences								
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
Case Management				\$	-	\$ -	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	414.00	\$ 53.82	\$	467.82



File # EB-	EB-2017-0335	Process: MR\	/ Hydro One Transmission Decision	
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.	Service Provider Na	me: Travis Allan	

State	ement of Disbursements Being Claim	ed	
	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$ -
Printing		\$ -	\$ -
Courier		\$ -	\$ -
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$ -
Transcripts		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$ -
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$ -
Parking		\$ -	\$ -
Taxi		\$ -	\$ -
Accommodation		\$ -	\$ -
Meals		\$ -	\$ -
Other:		\$ -	\$ -
Other:		\$ -	\$ -
Other:		\$ -	\$ -
·	·		
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	- \$ -	\$ -



File # EB-	EB-2017-0335		Process: MRV Hydro One Transmission Decision							
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.		Service l	Provider Name:	Don Richardson	1				
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	I	Completed Years of Relevant 2	Experience				
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst	0 0		•	Hourly Rate:	\$330				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attack	ned ded within previou:		Charged (enter %):	13.0%				

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
						r		ı		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	_	\$	-	\$	-	
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	=	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	_	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$	-	
Proposal Preparation	38.00	\$	330.00	\$	12,540.00	\$	1,630.20	\$	14,170.20	
Argument										
Preparation	2.50	\$	330.00	\$	825.00	\$	107.25	\$	932.25	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation	2.00	\$	330.00	\$	660.00	\$	85.80	\$	745.80	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Case Management				\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	14,025.00	\$	1,823.25	\$	15,848.25	



Party:	Anwaatin Inc.	Service Provid	ler Name:	Don Richardson	
File # EB-	EB-2017-0335	Process:	MRV Hydro (One Transmission Decision	

	Statement of Dis	bursements Being Claimed		
		Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy	,		\$ -	\$ -
Printing			\$ -	\$ -
Courier			\$ -	\$ -
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$ -
Transcripts			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Car		\$ 76.00	\$ -	\$ 76.00
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$ -
Travel (Other):			\$ -	\$ -
Parking			\$ -	\$ -
Taxi			\$ -	\$ -
Accommodation			\$ -	\$ -
Meals			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL DISBURSEME	NTS:	\$ 76.00	\$ -	\$ 76.00



File # EB-	EB-2017-0335		Process: MRV Hydro One Transmission Decision							
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.		Service I	Provider Name:	Larry Sault					
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years of Relevant	Experience				
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst				Hourly Rate:	\$330				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ned ded within previous		Charged (enter %):	13.0%				

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
						ı				
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	,	Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Proposal Preparation	17.50	\$	330.00	\$	5,775.00	\$	750.75	\$	6,525.75	
Argument					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·					
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Oral Hearing						Ì				
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-	
Other Conferences			_			Ė				
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-	
Case Management		Τ	333.30	\$	_	\$	-	\$	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,775.00	\$	750.75	\$	6,525.75	



			
Party:	Anwaatin Inc.	Service Provider Name:	Larry Sault

	Net Cost	HST	T	otal
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$	-
Printing		\$ -	\$	-
Courier		\$ -	\$	-
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$	-
Transcripts		\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$	-
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$	-
Parking		\$ -	\$	-
Тахі		\$ -	\$	-
Accommodation		\$ -	\$	-
Meals		\$ -	\$	-
Other:		\$ -	\$	-
Other:		\$ -	\$	-
Other:		\$ -	\$	-

INVOICE



Invoice # 17341 Date: 12/28/2017 Due On: 01/27/2018

5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5R 2E1 Canada Email: accounts@demarcoallan.com www.demarcoallan.com

Anwaatin Inc. 3034 Mississauga Road, , R.R.#6 Hagersville, ON N0A 1H0

17-00527-Anwaatin Inc.-EB-2017-0335 Motion to Review and Vary Hydro One Transmission Decision

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
10/02/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing letter to OEB re: Decision;	2.20	\$170.00	\$374.00
10/03/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing letter to OEB re: decision;	0.50	\$170.00	\$85.00
10/10/2017	Cary	APR - Research re: appeals and standards of review;	6.00	\$170.00	\$1,020.00
10/10/2017	LD	APR - Motion to review;	3.20	\$330.00	\$1,056.00
10/11/2017	LD	APR - Communications with D. Richardson re: Hydro One appeal; Instructions to C. Ferguson;	0.40	\$330.00	\$132.00
10/17/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing motion to review and vary;	3.50	\$170.00	\$595.00
10/17/2017	LD	APR - Revise and redraft appeal;	2.20	\$330.00	\$726.00
10/18/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing motion materials; Preparing motion record;	3.10	\$170.00	\$527.00
10/18/2017	TA	APR - Research supporting appeal submission per. L. DeMarco;	1.80	\$230.00	\$414.00
10/20/2017	Cary	APR - Drafting motion factum;	0.90	\$170.00	\$153.00
10/27/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing motion factum;	1.40	\$170.00	\$238.00
11/23/2017	LD	Review objections to cost-claim;	0.20	\$330.00	\$66.00
12/04/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing factum;	1.30	\$170.00	\$221.00
12/05/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing factum;	2.10	\$170.00	\$357.00
12/07/2017	Cary	APR - Preparing factum;	0.90	\$170.00	\$153.00

		Quantity Subtotal	31 4
12/08/2017 Cary	APR - Preparing factum;	1.70 \$170.00	\$289.00

Time Keeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Travis Allan	1.8	\$230.00	\$414.00
Lisa DeMarco	6.0	\$330.00	\$1,980.00
Cary Ferguson	23.6	\$170.00	\$4,012.00
		Quantity Total	31.4
		Subtotal	\$6,406.00
		HST (ON) (13.0%)	\$832.78
		Total	\$7,238.78

Please make all amounts payable to: DeMarco Allan LLP HST #79471 3495 RT0001

If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently \$17.50.

Please pay within 30 days.

INVOICE



Invoice # 18265 Date: 06/29/2018 Due On: 08/26/2018

5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5R 2E1 Canada Email: accounts@demarcoallan.com www.demarcoallan.com

Anwaatin Inc. 3034 Mississauga Road, , R.R.#6 Hagersville, ON N0A 1H0

17-00527-Anwaatin Inc.-EB-2017-0335 Motion to Review and Vary Hydro One Transmission Decision

Services

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
01/08/2018	Cary	CMT - Preparing response to intervention requests; Call with G. Nettleton re: motion; Confirming transmission lines serving First Nations with reliability issues;	2.40	\$250.00	\$600.00
01/08/2018	LD	APR - Instructions to Cary re: letter and instructions to D. Richardson;	0.30	\$850.00	\$255.00
01/09/2018	Cary	APR - Case law research;	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00
01/12/2018	Cary	APR - Preparing factum; Correspondence with client;	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00
01/12/2018	LD	APR - Work on Factum;	3.20	\$850.00	\$2,720.00
01/15/2018	Cary	APR - Preparing factum; Preparing motion record; Preparing book of authorities;	10.20	\$250.00	\$2,550.00
01/15/2018	LD	APR - Preparing Factum;	10.00	\$850.00	\$8,500.00
01/16/2018	Cary	APR - Preparing factum; Preparing motion record; Preparing book of authorities;	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00
01/16/2018	Cary	APR - Preparing factum; Preparing motion record; Preparing book of authorities;	3.40	\$250.00	\$850.00
01/16/2018	LD	APR - Communications with D. Richardson and L. Sault;	0.30	\$850.00	\$255.00

01/22/2018	Cary	OHP - Correspondence with client re: oral hearing preparation;	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00
01/22/2018	LD	OHP - Review Board Staff Submissions; Review VECC submissions; Review Board Staff Book of Authorities; Instructions to C. Ferguson re: follow up on portions of case law cited;	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00
01/23/2018	Cary	OHP - Correspondence with client; Reviewing Board Staff and VECC submissions in preparation for oral hearing;	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00
01/25/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing for oral hearing;	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00
01/29/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing for oral hearing; Preparing supplementary Book of Authorities;	6.40	\$250.00	\$1,600.00
01/30/2018	Cary	OHP - Reviewing and preparing response to Hydro One and SEC submissions;	5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00
02/01/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing responses to Hydro One and Board Staff submissions;	5.20	\$250.00	\$1,300.00
02/02/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing responses to Hydro One and Board Staff submissions;	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00
02/06/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing response to Hydro One and Board Staff submissions;	6.00	\$250.00	\$1,500.00
02/07/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing for oral hearing;	4.10	\$250.00	\$1,025.00
02/08/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing for oral hearing;	6.40	\$250.00	\$1,600.00
02/09/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing for oral hearing;	5.70	\$250.00	\$1,425.00
02/10/2018	LD	OHP - Oral Hearing Prep;	3.00	\$850.00	\$2,550.00
02/11/2018	LD	OHP - Oral Hearing Prep;	3.00	\$850.00	\$2,550.00
02/12/2018	Cary	OHP - Preparing for oral hearing;	13.20	\$250.00	\$3,300.00
02/12/2018	LD	OHP - Oral hearing prep;	5.00	\$850.00	\$4,250.00
02/13/2018	Cary	OHA - Attending oral hearing;	6.00	\$250.00	\$1,500.00
02/13/2018	LD	OHA - Oral Hearing;	10.00	\$850.00	\$8,500.00
02/14/2018	Cary	CMT - Reviewing and sending transcript corrections;	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00

Quantity Subtotal

114.8

Services Subtotal

\$50,060.00

Expenses

Date Descrip	ion Quantity	Rate	Total
--------------	--------------	------	-------

01/09/2018	Good Foot Support Services - Delivery, (+13% HST);	1.00	\$9.00	\$9.00
01/17/2018	United Messengers Ltd Delivery to Ontario Energy Board, (+13% HST);	1.00	\$12.67	\$12.67

Expenses Subtotal \$21.67

Time Keeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Lisa DeMarco	35.6	\$850.00	\$30,260.00
Cary Ferguson	79.2	\$250.00	\$19,800.00
		Quantity Total	114.8
		Subtotal	\$50,081.67
		HST (ON) (13.0%)	\$6,510.62
		Total	\$56.592.29

Please make all amounts payable to: DeMarco Allan LLP HST $\#79471\ 3495\ RT0001$

If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently \$17.50.

Please pay within 58 days.

INVOICE



Invoice # 18269 Date: 07/30/2018 Due On: 08/29/2018

5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5R 2E1 Canada Email: accounts@demarcoallan.com www.demarcoallan.com

Anwaatin Inc. 3034 Mississauga Road, , R.R.#6 Hagersville, ON N0A 1H0

17-00527-Anwaatin Inc.-EB-2017-0335 Motion to Review and Vary Hydro One Transmission Decision

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
04/13/2018	LD	SPP - Email to Hydro One and IESO meeting;	2.00	\$850.00	\$1,700.00
04/13/2018	LD	SPP - Work on 2 pager;	1.20	\$850.00	\$1,020.00
04/13/2018	LD	SPP - Aroland Emails/BD;	0.30	\$850.00	\$255.00
04/20/2018	LD	SPP - Prep for and attend OEB panel re: consultations with Indigenous stakeholders;	0.50	\$850.00	\$425.00
04/23/2018	LD	SPP - Communications with Ferio Pugliese and Don Richardson re: status;	0.40	\$850.00	\$340.00
04/24/2018	LD	SPP - Communications re: OEB leter instructions with HONI; communications with HONI and IESO;	1.60	\$850.00	\$1,360.00
04/25/2018	LD	SPP - Emails and calls with D. Richardson, R. Lu, and H. Jung; review definitions in FIT 4 contract and FIT rules; emails to group on "Deemed Single Property";	2.10	\$850.00	\$1,785.00
04/26/2018	LD	SPP - Communications with team re: Phased approach, work on approach;	1.50	\$850.00	\$1,275.00
04/27/2018	JM	CMT - Prepare draft letters for First Nations; prepare draft DA LLP / HONI letter per L. DeMarco;	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
04/27/2018	LD	SPP - Draft letter for WZI and email to Ferio re: proposed 2 phased approach;	2.50	\$850.00	\$2,125.00
04/30/2018	LD	SPP - Communications with Richard, Don, communications with Ferio;	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00

05/01/2018	JM	CMT - Prepare joint letter for Anwaatin and Hydro One per L. DeMarco;	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
05/01/2018	LD	SPP - Instructions to JM re: Gantt chart, cover letters, form of	1.70	\$850.00	\$1,445.00
05/02/2018	JM	CMT - Prepare Gantt chart for settlement agreement;	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
05/03/2018	JM	CMT - Prepare Gantt chart for settlement agreement;	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
05/04/2018	JM	CMT - Prepare and file joint Anwaatin / HONI letter re notice of settlement negotiations with OEB;	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
05/04/2018	JM	SPP - Prepare Settlement Agreement heads of terms;	6.80	\$275.00	\$1,870.00
05/08/2018	LD	SPP - Communications with D. Chum; draft SA;	1.30	\$850.00	\$1,105.00
05/10/2018	LD	SPP - Draft SA for Anwaatin/HONI/Abundant;	8.60	\$850.00	\$7,310.00
05/14/2018	JM	CMT - Update and re-circulate Gantt chart per L. DeMarco;	0.30	\$275.00	\$82.50
05/17/2018	JM	SPP - Internal communications re Settlement Proposal; email correspondence from F. Pugliese; prepare draft joint cover letter;	3.20	\$275.00	\$880.00
05/17/2018	LD	SPP - Communications from HONI; instructions to JM;	2.10	\$850.00	\$1,785.00
05/18/2018	JM	SPP - Coordinate adjustments to draft Settlement Proposal; file letter advising Board of status;	2.10	\$275.00	\$577.50
05/25/2018	JM	SPP - Call with HONI and McCarthy Tetrault re status of Settlement Proposal;	0.80	\$0.00	\$0.00
05/25/2018	JM	SPP - Revise draft joint cover letter for filing of Settlement Proposal, circulate to HONI and McCarthy Tetrault;	0.30	\$275.00	\$82.50
05/25/2018	LD	SPP - Call with HONI; call to client; call with McCarthy Tetrault re: Settlement Proposal;	3.70	\$850.00	\$3,145.00
05/30/2018	JM	SPP - Review correspondence from G. Nettleton re settlement progress;	0.10	\$275.00	\$27.50
06/01/2018	JM	SPP - Initial review of HONI changes to draft Settlement Proposal;	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
06/01/2018	LD	SPP - Communications with Don Richardson and Gordon Nettleton Re: Settlement agreement; Review and revise; instructions to JM;	2.30	\$850.00	\$1,955.00
06/07/2018	JM	SPP - Revisions to draft Settlement Proposal per L. DeMarco;	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
06/14/2018	JM	SPP - Initial review of June 14 version of Settlement Proposal;	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00

06/14/2018 LD	SPP - Review and revise Settlement Agreement; Communications with Don Richardson, Henry Jung re: Revised Version of Anwaatin IR update;	0.70	\$850.00	\$595.00
06/15/2018 JM	CMT - Draft cover letter for settlement proposal; file settlement proposal; discussions re same;	1.50	\$275.00	\$412.50
06/20/2018 JM	CMT - Communications with D. Richardson re WZI / Phase 2;	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
06/26/2018 LD	SPP - Review support letters from Aroland and MoCreebec and call with Don re: next steps for WZI;	0.60	\$850.00	\$510.00
07/02/2018 LD	SPP - Review and revise letter of assurance to WZI; communications from Richard, Harry and Don;	0.90	\$850.00	\$765.00

Quantity Subtotal 53.3

Time Keeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Lisa DeMarco	34.8	\$850.00	\$29,580.00
Jonathan McGillivray	17.7	\$275.00	\$4,867.50
Jonathan McGillivray	0.8	\$0.00	\$0.00
		Quantity Total	53.3
		Subtotal	\$34,447.50
		HST (ON) (13.0%)	\$4,478.18
		Total	\$38,925.68

Please make all amounts payable to: DeMarco Allan LLP HST $\#79471\ 3495\ RT0001$

If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently \$17.50.

Please pay within 30 days.

INVOICE



Invoice # 18277 Date: 08/24/2018 Due On: 09/23/2018

5 Hazelton Avenue, Suite 200 Toronto, ON M5R 2E1 Canada Email: accounts@demarcoallan.com www.demarcoallan.com

Anwaatin Inc. 3034 Mississauga Road, , R.R.#6 Hagersville, ON N0A 1H0

17-00527-Anwaatin Inc.-EB-2017-0335 Motion to Review and Vary Hydro One Transmission Decision

Services

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
07/26/2018	JM	CMT - Prepare and file letter re Anwaatin First Nation support for Settlement Proposal (condition precedent);	0.90	\$275.00	\$247.50
		Q	uantity Subt	otal	0.9
		Se	ervices Subt	otal	\$247.50

Expenses

Date	Description	Quantity	Rate	Total
07/27/2018	Good Foot Support Services - Courier to OEB, (+13% HST);	1.00	\$9.00	\$9.00
		Expenses Subto	ıtal	\$9.00

Time Keeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Jonathan McGillivray	0.9	\$275.00	\$247.50
		Quantity Total	0.9
		Subtotal	\$256.50
	1	HST (ON) (13.0%)	\$33.35

Please make all amounts payable to: DeMarco Allan LLP HST #79471 3495 RT0001

If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently \$17.50.

Please pay within 30 days.



Shared Value Solutions Ltd. 62 Baker Street Guelph, ON N1H 4G1

> Hydro One Networks Inc. 483 Bay Street, South Tower, 8th Floor Reception Toronto, ON M5G 2P5

Invoice number 00803 Date 06/30/2018

Project HYDROONE DISTRIBUTION RATE **INCREASE**

Description	Current Billed
Total fees and expenses - billing report attached	46,062.55
Total	46,062.55
Invoice subtotal	46,062.55
HST	5,988.14
Invoice total	52,050.69

HST # 811269109 RT0001

Interest on overdue accounts are charged at the rate of 10 percent per annum from the date of invoice.

Payment terms are net 30 days on all accounts.

Early payments (less than 30 days from date of invoice) are eligible to receive a 3 percent discount.

Electronic remittance advice should be sent to: accounting@sharedvaluesolutions.com

Wire Payment Instructions:

Branch Address: RBC Main Branch, 74 Wyndham Street North, Guelph ON N1H 4E6

Branch Phone: 519-824-6800

Branch transit # 1762 Institution # 003 Account # 1007475

Routing/ABA # 021000021 (if sending funds from the U.S.)

SWIFT BIC: ROYCCAT2 (if sending funds from outside of North America)

HydroOne Distribution Rate Increase					
Project Management and Admin					
Labor Group: Employee Type/Employee/Activity Expense & Consultant Group: Type/Vendor/Activity		Hrs/Unts		Amount	
abor		3.50		1,075.00	
Billed as Fee		0.00		0.00	
Managing Partner		3.00		990.00	
Don Richardson		3.00		990.00	
Billable Time		3.00		990.00	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
Notice of Intervention	6/13/2017	1.00	330.00	330.00	
Notice of Intervention review and revision	6/14/2017	0.50	330.00	165.00	
Memo to update First Nation client group on hearing issues and process	9/15/2017	1.50	330.00	495.00	
Junior Consultant		0.50		85.00	
Meaghan Langille		0.50		85.00	
Billable Time		0.50		85.00	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
Call with DeMarco Allen LLP	9/15/2017	0.50	170.00	85.00	

HydroOne Distribution Rate Increase					
Hearing Participation					
Labor Group: Employee Type/Employee/Activity Expense & Consultant Group: Type/Vendor/Activity		Hrs/Unts		Amount	
abor		6.50		1,105.00	
Billed as Fee		0.00		0.00	
Intermediate Consultant		2.00		340.00	
Mitchell Avis		2.00		340.00	
Billable Time		2.00		340.00	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
Preparation of letter summarizing presentation to Panel	5/3/2018	2.00	170.00	340.00	
Junior Consultant		4.50		765.00	
Andrew Peach		4.50		765.00	
Billable Time		4.50		765.00	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
Preparation of memo from transcript of OEB hearing with Anwaatin.	2/14/2018	4.50	170.00	765.00	

Labor Group: Employee Type/Employee/Activity					
Expense & Consultant Group: Type/Vendor/Activity		Hrs/Unts		Amount	
r		132.25		38,002.50	
illed as Fee		0.00		0.00	
lanaging Partner		97.00		32,010.00	
Don Richardson		97.00		32,010.00	
Billable Time		97.00		32,010.00	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
Call with Aki Energy to prepare for interview	5/2/2017	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Briefing note for legal on client strategy	5/4/2017	0.50	330.00	165.00	
Review of hearing materials, preparation of IRS and evidence	9/15/2017	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Call with legal on IR submission	12/7/2017	1.00	330.00	330.00	
IR submission	12/8/2017	1.50	330.00	495.00	
Review of recent HONI Dx application filings	1/9/2018	1.50	330.00	495.00	
Interogatory research, HONI application review, drafting IRs for legal review	1/18/2018	4.00	330.00	1,320.00	
Research on Distributed Energy Resources and HONI Dx approaches	1/23/2018	3.00	330.00	990.00	
Call with legal counsel on Distributed Energy Resource issues with HONI Dx application, hearing preparation	1/30/2018	1.00	330.00	330.00	
Research on DERs work in Ontario LDCs	2/14/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Review and reading recent hearing submissions	2/16/2018	2.50	330.00	825.00	
Review of recent filings, memo for legal on technical conference	2/26/2018	2.50	330.00	825.00	
Review of recent filings, memo for legal on technical conference	2/27/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Review of intervenor submissions, inputs to legal for technical conference	2/27/2018	1.50	330.00	495.00	
Call with legal counsel on hearing evidence preparation	3/21/2018	1.00	330.00	330.00	
Hearing evidence preparation	3/22/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Research for hearing evidence	3/28/2018	1.00	330.00	330.00	
Preparation of evidence	4/2/2018	5.00	330.00	1,650.00	
Review of intervenor submissions	4/24/2018	1.50	330.00	495.00	
Interrogatory response preparation	5/1/2018	2.50	330.00	825.00	
IR response research and drafting	5/2/2018	5.00	330.00	1,650.00	
IR response research and drafting	5/3/2018	3.00	330.00	990.00	
IR response research and drafting	5/4/2018	5.00	330.00	1,650.00	
IR research and drafting responses	5/7/2018	1.00	330.00	330.00	

HydroOne Distribution Rate Increase

Research

Expense & Consultant Group: Type/Vendor/Activity		Hrs/Unts		Amount	
or		132.25		38,002.50	
Don Richardson		97.00		32,010.00	
Call with legal, review of recent OEB submissions	5/23/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Call on HONI reliability improvements, follow-up with legal	5/29/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Follow-up with legal on SAIDI / SAIFI, research on related metrics	5/31/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Review of hearing approach with Anwaatin leadership	6/1/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Draft agreement review and markup	6/7/2018	2.50	330.00	825.00	
Review of revisions to Settlement Proposal	6/12/2018	1.50	330.00	495.00	
Call with HONI; call with legal counsel; review of revisions to Settlement Agreement	6/14/2018	3.50	330.00	1,155.00	
Note to First Natinos: Call with HONI; review of revisions to Settlement Agreement; correspondence with legal counsel	6/15/2018	5.50	330.00	1,815.00	
Memo to WZI, MoCreebec and with regard to Settlement Agreement filed with the OEB	6/18/2018	2.00	330.00	660.00	
Correspondence with WZI and MoCreebec	6/19/2018	1.00	330.00	330.00	
ntermediate Consultant		21.25		3,612.50	
Mitchell Avis		21.25		3,612.50	
Billable Time		21.25		3,612.50	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
Meet with DR to discuss hearing details and exchange information; Become familiar with the OEB website and submission information; Review Hydro One submission information;	10/23/2017	2.50	170.00	425.00	
Research and review Hydro One application submission materials for Indigenous and distributive energy comments;	10/25/2017	6.50	170.00	1,105.00	
Review Ontario's new Long Term Energy Plan and prepare summary memo on first nations issues;	10/26/2017	3.50	170.00	595.00	
Research and review Hydro One submission documents for consultation notes with First Nations and Metis communities; Write memo summarizing submission information;	10/27/2017	6.25	170.00	1,062.50	
Complete research; organize application documents; Send summary to DR;	11/1/2017	1.25	170.00	212.50	
Write memo to Anwaatin providing comments on Hydro One Submission	4/2/2018	1.25	170.00	212.50	
Marketing (14.00		2,380.00	
Mike VanEgmond		14.00		2,380.00	
Billable Time		14.00		2,380.00	
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount	
AKI Energy Video editing	3/6/2018	0.50	170.00	85.00	
AKI Energy Video for Hearing	3/7/2018	12.00	170.00	2,040.00	

Research				
abor Group: Employee Type/Employee/Activity xpense & Consultant Group: Type/Vendor/Activity		Hrs/Unts		Amount
	<u> </u>	1113/01113		
nse				105.05
illed as Fee				0.00
on Richardson				105.05
Mileage		191.00		105.05
Employee		191.00		105.05
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount
DR return trip to Hydro One offices in Toronto	4/3/2018	191.00	0.55	105.05
ultant				5,775.00
illed as Fee				0.00
nwaatin				5,775.00
Consultant		17.50		5,775.00
Consultants		17.50		5,775.00
	Date	Hrs/Unts	Rate	Amount
			330.00	5,775.00

132.25

43,882.55

Invoice/June 30, 2018

Please make cheques payable to Larry Sault Payable Upon Receipt

Larry Sault Mississauga of The New Credit First Nation 3034 Mississauga Road, R.R.#6, Hagersville, Ontario NOA 1H0.

Shared Value Solutions 62 Baker Street Guelph, Ontario, Canada N1H 4G1	
OEB HydroOne Distribution Rate Increase Project Hydro One Meetings and meetings with legal counsel 17.5 hours.	\$5775.00
Subtotal HST	\$5775.00 \$750.75
Total Due	\$6,525.75



Shared Value Solutions Ltd to Shared Value Solutions Ltd

Drive 190 km, 2 h 22 min

Don Richardson - 4/3/2018

Shared Value Solutions Ltd

62 Baker St, Guelph, ON N1H 4G1

Get on	ON-401	F/ON-6	S in Morristo	'n

1	1.	Head south on Baker St toward Chapel Ln	
L	2.	Turn right onto Quebec St	210 n
1	3.	Continue onto Paisley St	62 n
4	4.	Turn left onto ON-6 S/ON-7 Continue to follow ON-6 S	2.3 kn
'n	5.	Keep left at the fork, follow signs for ON-401 E/Toronto/Hamilton/ON-6 and merge onto ON-401 E/ON-6 S	12.3 km
			1.0 km
onti	nue	on ON-401 E. Take Gardiner Expy E to Bay St in Old Toronto, Toronto. Take the Bay Street exit from Gardiner Expy E	——————————————————————————————————————
*	6.	Merge onto ON-401 E/ON-6 S 1 Continue to follow ON-401 E	
4	7.	Keep left to continue on Ontario 401 Express	45.7 km
۳	8.	Use the right 2 lanes to take the ON-427 exit toward Renforth Drive	6.8 km
4	9.	Keep left, follow signs for 427 N N/427 S S	2.1 km
7	10.	Keep right at the fork, follow signs for 427 S S/Route 427 S and merge onto ON-427 S	300 m
٦	11.	Use the left 2 lanes to take the Gardiner Expressway exit toward Toronto	7.7 km
*	12.	Merge onto Gardiner Expy E	1.3 km
۳		Take the Bay Street exit	13.1 km
		Take the Day Guest GAR	950 m
•	14.	Turn left onto Bay St Destination will be on the right	

1 h 12 min (95.2 km)

Hydro One

*

483 Bay St, Toronto, ON M5G 1P5

Get on Gardiner Evny W from Bay St

20. Merge onto Gardiner Expy W

† 15	5.	Head south on Bay St toward Albert St	8 min (1.8 km)
ጎ 16	6.	Use any lane to turn slightly left to stay on Bay St	——— 150 m
→ 17	7.	Use the right 2 lanes to turn right onto Lake Shore Blvd W	——— 1.1 km
7 18	8.	Use the right 2 lanes to turn slightly right toward Gardiner Expy W	160 m
1 9	9.	Use any lane to take the Gardiner Expressway W ramp	300 m
ontinu	ie oi	n Gardiner Expy W. Take ON-401 W to ON-6 N in Morriston. Take exit 295 from ON-401 W	
			6 min (77.7 km)

r	21.	Use the right 2 lanes to take exit 139 for ON-427/Brown's Line/Sherway Gardens Road toward Ontario 401	
L →	22.	Keep right, follow signs for ON-427/ON-401/Airport	600 m
†	23.	. Continue onto ON-427 N	900 m
'n	24.	. Use the left 2 lanes to take the ON-401 W exit	6.6 km
4	25.	. Use the left 3 lanes to follow signs for QEW/Ontario 403/Ontario 410/Brampton/Hamilton	————— 4.8 km
Ý	26.	. Keep left at the fork, follow signs for Ontario 401 W	————— 1.0 km
t	27.	. Continue onto ON-401 W	4.4 km
۴	28.	. Take exit 295 for ON-6 toward Guelph	————— 45.2 km
Cont	tinue	on ON-6 N. Drive to Baker St in Guelph	850 m 77 min (15.0 km)
<u>,†</u>	29.	Continue onto ON-6 N	12.2 km
L →	30.	. Turn right onto Paisley Rd (signs for Paisley Road E)	
4	31.	. Turn left onto Yarmouth St	————— 2.3 km
Ļ	32.	. Turn right onto Woolwich St	350 m
L ,	33.	Turn right onto Baker St Destination will be on the right	————— 49 m
			100 m

1 h 11 min (94.5 km)

Shared Value Solutions Ltd

62 Baker St, Guelph, ON N1H 4G1

These directions are for planning purposes only. You may find that construction projects, traffic, weather, or other events may cause conditions to differ from the map results, and you should plan your route accordingly. You must obey all signs or notices regarding your route.

Subject: Your Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery) receipt [#1009-0377]

Date: Tuesday, January 9, 2018 at 3:51:55 PM Eastern Standard Time

From: Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery)

To: Katherine Watson

EB-2017-0835



C\$10.17 at Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery)

VISA 0964

January 9, 2018 #1009-0377

Have a question or need help? Send us an email or give us a call at +1 416-572-3771.

Something wrong with the email? View it in your browser.

You are receiving this email because you made a purchase at Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery).

Subject: Delivered - Re: GoodFoot Order #42437

Date: Tuesday, January 9, 2018 at 3:51:45 PM Eastern Standard Time

From: GoodFoot Delivery **To:** Katherine Watson

Hello DeMarco Allan LLP,

Your delivery was just completed by sebastian and recieved by / delivered to: Fatima.

Delivered to: 2300 Yonge Street, Toronto, ON, Canada

The time & date of the delivery: 2018-01-09 15:51:45.

Bills are sent monthly, or you can pay now for this order by clicking here.

While we have your attention, take one more huge step to help our organization champion the cause of employment for those with disabilities. Here is how:

Tweet us a shout out! Like us on Facebook Or best, make a donation - 100% tax deductible.

Thank you for supporting GoodFoot Delivery!

Best.

The GoodFoot Team GoodFoot Delivery - Orders o. 416.572.3771 w.https://www.goodfootdelivery.com t. https://twitter.com/good_foot UNITED MESSENGERS LTD. 270 DRUMLIN CIRCLE CONCORD, ON L4K 3E2

PHONE: (905) 738-6447 FAX: (905) 738-9625

DEMARCO ALLAN LLP ACCOUNT#: ZIZZ1F DATE: 1/31/2018

5 HAZELTON AVE STE200 INVOICE#: 921790 PAGE: 1

TORONTO, ON M5R2E1 P.O.: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

Waybill Date Cost Centre/Refnum From To Description Amount 1379 1/17/2018 EB-2017-0335

cn:Katherine

DEMARCO ALLAN LLP

5 HAZELTON AVE STE200

TORONTO, M5R2E1

RECEIVED BY: Razma Ontario Energy Board

2300 YONGE ST TORONTO, M4P1E4

TIME: 10:45

SAMEDAY FUEL:

TOTAL:

HST:

11.00

1.67

12.67 1.65

TOTAL NUMBER OF WAYBILLS:

TOTAL ALL WAYBILLS:

1

\$12.67

R105452981 HST: \$1.65 TOTAL BILLING: \$14.32

UNITED MESSENGERS LTD. 270 DRUMLIN CIRCLE CONCORD, ON L4K 3E2

PHONE: (905) 738-6447 FAX: (905) 738-9625

DEMARCO ALLAN LLP ACCOUNT#: ZIZZ1F DATE: 1/31/2018 5 HAZELTON AVE STE200 INVOICE#: 921790

TORONTO, ON M5R2E1 P.O.: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

TOTAL BILLING: \$14.32

Paid In Full By Credit Card

Card Number Card Type Action Total XXXXXXXXXXXX3700 Visa Purchase \$14.32 Date Time: 2/7/2018 09:05 Response: 0-1-00-ISO: 00 Auth: 05037G

Subject: Your Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery) receipt [#1511-8139]

Date: Friday, July 27, 2018 at 12:05:51 PM Eastern Daylight Time

From: Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery)

To: Katherine Watson



Receipt from Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery)

Receipt #1511-8139

 AMOUNT PAID
 DATE PAID
 PAYMENT METHOD

 C\$10.17
 July 27, 2018
 VISA – 0964

SUMMARY

Payment to Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery)

C\$10.17

Amount paid C\$10.17

If you have any questions, contact us at info@goodfootdelivery.com or call at +1 416-572-3771.

Something wrong with the email? View it in your browser.

You're receiving this email because you made a purchase at Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery). Good Foot Support Services (Good Foot Delivery) partners with Stripe to provide secure invoicing and payments processing.

Stripe, 510 Townsend Street, San Francisco CA 94103

Subject: Delivered - Re: GoodFoot Order #50324

Date: Friday, July 27, 2018 at 12:05:46 PM Eastern Daylight Time

From: GoodFoot Delivery (sent by order=goodfootdelivery.com@mg.goodfootdelivery.com

<order=goodfootdelivery.com@mg.goodfootdelivery.com>)

To: Katherine Watson

Hello DeMarco Allan LLP,

Your delivery was just completed by kathy and received by / delivered to: Pat.

Delivered to: 2300 Yonge Street, Toronto, ON, Canada

The time & date of the delivery: 2018-07-27 12:05:45.

Bills are sent monthly, or you can pay now for this order by clicking here.

Thank you for your support. Take one huge step to help our organization champion the cause of employment for those with developmental disabilities. Here is how:

<u>Tweet</u> us a shout out! <u>Like us on Facebook</u> Or best, <u>make a donation</u> - 100% tax deductible. Every dollar raised through our delivery service or donations goes to create more opportunities for individuals with developmental disabilities.

\$100 funds 1 day of training, \$500 funds a week of training, \$1000 funds vocational placements, \$5000 funds 3 months of placement - Do Good, donate today.

Thank you for supporting GoodFoot Delivery!

Best, The GoodFoot Team GoodFoot Delivery - Orders o. 416.572.3771 w.https://www.goodfootdelivery.com t. https://twitter.com/good_foot

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

EDUCATION & TEACHING	Adjunct Professor, University of Toronto, Faculty of Law	2011-Present
	Call to the Bar of Ontario	2010
	Call to the Bar of New York	2009
	University of Toronto, Juris Doctor	2008
	Thesis: A Law and Economics Analysis of Production and Process Measure Restrictions Under the World Trade Organization	
	Universiteit van Amsterdam, Exchange Program	2007
	University of British Columbia, B. A. (Hons.)	2005
LEGAL WORK	DeMarco Allan LLP (formerly Zizzo Allan PC) Partner	2009 – Present Toronto, ON

- Advising corporate, public and not-for-profit clients on energy, corporate, environmental, electricity and climate change law.
- Providing advice on energy sector M&A and financing including due diligence, deal structure, financing and closing.
- Advising governments, utilities, private companies and foundations regarding electric vehicle and land use policies.
- Providing advice to various domestic and international companies on limited partnership agreements, joint venture agreements, multi-party commercial leases, unanimous shareholder agreements, licensing agreements, energy service performance agreements and emissions reduction purchase agreements.
- Undertaking multi-disciplinary policy research with economists, engineers and urban planners relating to environmental issues such as climate change adaptation, urban sprawl, greenhouse gas reporting and renewable energy production.
- Leading national stakeholder research consultations for private and public sector clients.
- Negotiating and drafting innovative commercial partnerships between charity clients and private entities.
- Counsel to large international organization of business leaders advising and negotiating on sponsorship agreements with major funder.
- Negotiation and drafting related to the transfer of environmental attributes between private parties, both domestically and internationally.

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

- Drafting reports for various international clients on securities disclosure of environmental risks.
- Reviewing and advising on procurement contracts and RFPs (both drafting and response) for a variety of private sector clients and a First Nation government.
- Preparation of a report on legal issues related to municipal third-party greenhouse gas quantification and verification contracting along with model contractual language for the Federation of Canadian Municipalities.
- Advising an international engineering firm on its greenhouse gas quantification and verification policies and associated contracts.
- Providing advice to a large carbon credit developer on issues relating to the legal ownership and transfer of attributes.
- Acting as lead counsel to one of Canada's largest industry associations in front of high-level government policy review panel considering streamlining regulations and sectoral consolidation in the electricity distribution sector.
- Effectively representing one of Canada's largest industry associations in front of a provincial administrative tribunal conducting a policy consultation considering efficiency, safety and adequacy of the framework for electricity regulation, as well as numerous other policy consultations.

Donnelly Law

- Articling Student
- Represented First Nations at consultation and accommodation meetings with private developers and government.

2009 Toronto, ON

• Advised on renewable energy project development for a co-op.

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom

- Associate and Summer Associate
- Provided legal services to a variety of the world's largest multi-national corporations including complex research and analysis of loan and other financial covenants in the context of international project financing and restructuring.
- Conducted due diligence regarding the acquisition of large group of Latin American power generation facilities.

2008 – 2009 New York, NY

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

University of British Columbia

Research Assistant to Dr. Katherine Baylis

Co-authored 3 articles and provided the research for a 2004 - 2005book chapter on property rights issues surrounding the Vancouver, BC creation of a Canadian emissions trading system. Project Neutral, Board Member and Chair 2012 - Present Climate Change Lawyers Network, Co-Chair 2010 - Present Ontario Land Trust Alliance, Governor 2012-2015 Advocates' Circle, University of Toronto, Co-Chair 2006-2007 University of Toronto Responsible Investment Working 2006 - 2007Group, Founding Member

REPORTS AND PUBLICATIONS

SELECTED

GOVERNANCE

Allan, T. (2017) "Regional Developments: Canada" *International Energy Law Review* (Sweet & Maxwell) Vol. 35 (forthcoming).

Allan, T. (2017) "Regional Developments: Canada" *International Energy Law Review* (Sweet & Maxwell) Vol. 35 Issue 1, 3.

Allan, T. and McGillivray J. (2017) "Undelineated Built-Up Areas: A Gap That Could Undermine the Growth Plan". Commissioned by the Neptis Foundation.

Allan, T. (forthcoming) "Canadian Renewable Energy Markets" *Financier* Worldwide.

Allan, T. "Update on Selected Canadian and Energy Law Developments" *International Energy Law Review* (Sweet & Maxwell) Vol. 34 Issue 7, 282.

Allan, T. and McGillivray, J. "REVving Up: Legal & Policy Changes to Support EV Uptake—Leader Jurisdictions". Proceedings of the EVS29 Symposium (June 19-22, 2016).

McVey, I., Sharma, C., Allan, T. (co-authored with various others) (2016) "Research and Information Gathering on Climate Change Mitigation and Adaptation" (Ministry of the Environment and Climate Change).

Zizzo, L., Allan, T. and Kyriazis, J. (2014) "Understanding Canadian

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

Electricity Generation and Transmission Sectors' Action and Awareness on Climate Change and the Need to Adapt".

Zizzo, L., Allan, T. and Kocherga, A. (2014) "Stormwater Management in Ontario: Legal Issues in a Changing Climate" (Credit Valley Conservation Authority).

Burda, C., Allan, T (co-authored with various others) (2012) "Live Where You Go: Encouraging location-efficient development in Ontario" (Pembina Institute).

Allan, T. (co-author with various others) (2012) chapter on Securities Disclosure relating to Climate Change excerpted in "Facing the Elements: Building Business Resilience in a Changing Climate: Advisory Report" by the National Roundtable on the Environment and the Economy.

Zizzo, L. and Allan, T. (2011) "Provincial Climate Change Update: Greenhouse Gas Emissions Reporting, Securities Disclosure, Emissions Trading and Municipal Considerations." Ontario Bar Association - Institute 2011 (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2010) "Regulatory Requirements to Measure and Report Greenhouse Gases in 2010." *Innovation* (Journal of the Association of Professional Engineers and Geoscientists of BC).

Allan, T. & Baylis, K. (2005) "Sinks, Emissions Intensity Caps and Barriers to Emissions Trading." *Canadian Journal of Agricultural Economics* 53 (4), 291-305.

Allan, T. & Baylis, K. (2005) "Property Rights and Climate Change: Legal Issues and Economic Consequences." CSALE Working Paper, University of Saskatchewan.

SELECTED PRESENTATIONS

Allan, T (2017) "Electric Vehicles and Utilities: Planning for Success" Electricity Distributors Association (EDA) Electric Vehicle Forum, (Mississauga, Ontario).

Allan, T (2017) "Multi-Unit EV Charging: Lessons from the Leaders", EMC-MEC EV 2017, (Markham, Ontario).

Allan, T (2017) "Climate Change & the Global Energy Challenge" guest lecture in Law 6563, Demand Side Management: Policy and Regulation Osgoode Law School LLM Program (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2017) Guest Lecture on Property and Contract Law and Climate Change, University of Ottawa Law School (Ottawa, Ontario).

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

Allan, T. (2016) "Ontario's Low-Carbon Energy Future: Strategizing for Ontario's Climate Action Plan", EUCI Canada's Carbon Market Future Conference, (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2016) (Moderator) "Potential Next Steps in the Development of Cap and Trade in Ontario", Association of Power Producers (APPrO) 2016 28th Annual Canadian Power Conference and Networking Centre, (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2016) "Climate Change Liability", Ontario Climate Consortium Emergency Management and Extreme Weather Workshop (Parry Sound, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2016) "Ontario's Low-Carbon Energy Future: Strategizing for Ontario's Climate Action Plan", EUCI Canada's Carbon Market Future Conference, (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2016) "What's Measured: Progress, Indictors and Regional Planning for Adaptation" 2016 Livable Cities Forum: Changing Climate, Changing Communities. (Presentation available)

Allan, T. (2016) Moderator: "Legal Liability and Regulatory Mechanisms as Catalysts for Action on Climate Change" 2016 Livable Cities Forum: Changing Climate, Changing Communities.

Allan, T. (2016) Panel discussion: "Climate & Urbanism: How is it Affecting Communities and Developments?" (Canadian Real Estate Forums, Land & Development Conference, Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2016) "Communities in a Cap and Trade Environment: Role of Municipalities" (Insight 5th Annual Cap & Trade Forum, Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2016) Guest Lecture on Climate Change Law, Osgoode Hall Law School, Climate Change Law Seminar.

Allan, T. (2015) Keynote Address (Commerce & Engineering Environmental Conference, Queens University).

Allan, T. (2015) "Climate Change: An Indigenous Discussion on the Road to Paris," (Hagersville, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2015) The Institution of Structural Engineers Ontario Regional Group "Responsibilities and Risk Management in a Changing Climate, the Legal Responsibility to Adapt," (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2014) "Professional Liability and Climate Change," Ontario

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

Centre for Engineering and Public Policy and York University. (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2013) "Year of the Flood: Building Resiliency Through Legal Risk Management," Municipal Stormwater Management Discussion Group, Hosted by the City of Kitchener and Waterloo (Waterloo, Ontario)

Allan, T. (2013) "Innovative Funding Opportunities for Land Conservation (Credits and Ecosystem Services)," Ontario Land Trust Alliance 2013 Gathering (Orillia, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2013) "Key Issues in Negotiation of First Nations Ownership of Renewable Energy Projects," Panel on Green Energy, Hosted by the University of Toronto Faculty of Law (Toronto, Ontario).

Burda, C. and Allan, T. (2013) "Encouraging Location-Efficient Development in Ontario," GTA Clean Air Council (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2013) "Legal Considerations—Offsets and Market-Based Mechanisms," Conservation Ontario/CA Watershed Stewardship/Forestry and Restoration Meeting (Newmarket, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2013) "The Legal Climate—Climate Change Law in Canada," CAELS 2013 Environmental Law Conference (Ottawa, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2013) "Municipal Action and Collaboration in a Changing Climate" presentation to the Federation of Canadian Municipalities Sustainable Communities Conference (Windsor Essex, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2013) "The Legal Climate: Climate Change Law in Canada" presentation to the Canadian Association of Environmental Law Students inaugural national conference (Ottawa, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2012) "Carbon Credits: an Introduction." Project Neutral Neighbourhood Summit (Toronto, Ontario).

Zizzo, L. and Allan, T. (2012) "Municipal Responsibilities in a Changing Climate." City of Hamilton.

Allan, T. (2012) "Responsibilities and Risk Management in a Changing Climate" presentation at ICLEI's Livable Cities Forum (Hamilton, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2011) "International Climate Finance – Legal Implications" International Development Bank (Washington, D.C.).

+1.416.417.1195 TRAVIS@DEMARCOALLAN.COM

Allan, T. and Nasmith, K. (2011) "Hybrid Planning: Neighbourhood Groups and Climate Change." Canadian Institute of Planners Congress 2011 (St. Johns, Newfoundland).

Allan, T. (2011) "The Strategic Legal Advisor: Selected Professionalism Issues in a Hybrid Legal Practice." Canadian Bar Association Canadian Legal Conference & Expo 2011 (Halifax, Nova Scotia).

Zizzo, L. and Allan, T. (2010) "The Legal Climate for Engineering Students." Presentation to the University of Toronto, Faculty of Engineering (Toronto, Ontario).

Allan, T. (2009) "First Nations Consultation and Accommodation in Canada." Living and Learning in Retirement (Glendon College, York University).

Allan, T. & Baylis, K. (2005) "Sinks, Emissions Intensity Caps and Barriers to Emissions Trading." Presentation. Greenhouse Gas Management Canada Policy Forum (Victoria, B.C.).

MEDIA HIGHLIGHTS

Simi Sarah Show "China and US Sign Significant GHG Agreement...What Does This Mean for Canada?" CKNW, Vancouver, November 12, 2014.

Stern, Michelle. "Misfits are the Ones that Change the World – Appendix," The Canadian Business Journal, December 2013.

Mintz, Corey. "Feeding climate activists hungry for change," The Toronto Star, November 1, 2013.

Gross, Karen. "Advance on the Arctic," Nexus, Spring/ Summer 2013 issue.

Reilly, Emma. "The fees that shape Hamilton," The Hamilton Spectator, August 24, 2012.

Garrett, Jake Tobin. "Live, Work, Play," novae res urbis (Greater Toronto Area Edition), July 25, 2012.

Larry Sault

Larry Sault brings over 25 years of dynamic leadership of working with First Nations in Canada, Native American Tribes in the United States, Arctic Inuit, Maori of New Zealand and Aborigine of Australia. He has held key positions in political leadership, private sector corporations and non-profit organizations.

In 1985 Larry was appointed to a committee whose mandate was to negotiate and establish a drug and alcohol treatment center within his community of the Mississaugas of New Credit. Successful negotiations saw him elected to his First Nation Council in 1987.

In 1993, Larry was elected Chief. Throughout his four year tenure, together with his council colleagues, he accomplished numerous community development projects, including negotiating and settling a \$13 million land claim, construction of a new Elementary school, water and sewer, industrial building and commercial plaza, negotiated and situated the first fully automated CIBC branch bank and ATM on reserve. He worked closely with his administration to enhance programs and services conducive to their community needs. Simultaneously, he was appointed by the Federal Government and the Assembly of First Nations to Chairman of National Task Force on Access to Capital for First Nations.

In 1998 Larry received an appointment to Vice President, CESO Aboriginal Services with oversight of seven regional offices, budgets, staff and a mandate of assisting First Nations across Canada in developmental stages of economic growth and governance within their community.

In June of 1999 at the request of First Nation leaders in Southwestern Ontario, he put his name forward and was elected Grand Chief of the Association of Iroquois and Allied Indians. This position would find him intimately involved Chiefs of Ontario, Grand Council Treaty 3, Union of Ontario Indians, NAN, the Independent First Nations and the National Assembly of First Nations.

By 2002 he was recruited and appointed as Senior Vice President, Native American Division of First American Capital Management in Southern California where his role included Investment Advisory Services to Native American Gaming Industry.

After moving back to his home on the Mississaugas of New Credit First Nation in 2013 he was elected back onto Council until December of 2015 during which time his consumed much of his time on wealth creation and economic and business development.

Today, Larry Sault is President and CEO of Anwaatin Inc., an Indigenous business focused on territorial climate action, Indigenous community and business readiness for emerging Cap and Trade markets, strengthening biodiversity and resilience in the face of climate change, partnerships to create Indigenous carbon offsets to sell competitively on Cap and Trade markets, and low-carbon Indigenous energy generation and energy efficiency projects.

He is co-author of the book, "The Lie that Bind's" and co-founder of a non-profit organization dedicated to healing the wounds of sexual abuse and domestic violence.