

#### PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

October 1, 2018

PIAC FILE # 6685-09

VIA E-Mail 7 pages

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board Suite 2700 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: Board File No. EB-2017-0071 PUC Distribution Inc.

Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

On behalf of the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) we have attached their cost claim with respect to for their participation in the above noted proceeding. As per the Decision and Order we have also directed copies to PUC Distribution Inc. as well as their Counsel via email.

Thank you.

Donna Brady

Office Administrator

cc: PUC - Andrew Belsito - regulatory@ssmpuc.com

Counsel - John Vellone - jvellone@blg.com

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



#### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

				ormulas are embedded in exchange rate and countr		
Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	its Being Claime ly one "Summa im must be sup ch consultant/a	ed") is required for e ary of Fees and Disbu oported by a comple analyst must be atta	Being Claimed each lawyer, a ursements" co eted Affidavit ched unless p		ent of Fees Being Clasticling student/para party's cost claim shore of the party. The correction on the Correscribed on the Co	ould be provided.
File # EB-	2017-0071			Process: PUC 2018	Rates	
Party:	VECC			_ Affiant's Name	e: Donna Brady	5
HST Numbe	er: 13059	2405		_ нѕ	T Rate Ontario:	3.94%
		Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Quali	fying Non-Profit Tax Exempt	✓ □
1,		Donna Brady		Affidavit , of the City/Town o	f ·	Ottawa
	ince/State o		Ontario	_, or the city, rown o	, swear or affi	
2. I have example and Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemen Ontario Ener 4. This cost of	mined all of the d", "Statement led "Summary of its Being Claime gy Board proce laim does not i	e documentation in a c(s) of Fees Being Cla of Fees and Disburse ed" include only cos ess referred to above nclude any costs for and 6.09 of the Board	support of this nimed" and "St ements Being of ts incurred and e. work done, o	tatement(s) of Disbursem Claimed", "Statement(s) of d time spent directly for the or time spent, by a person rection on Cost Awards.	e attached "Summan ents Being Claimed of Fees Being Claime the purposes of the	ry of Fees and Disbursements ".
Signature	of Affiant					
Sworn or a		ore me at the Cit	ty/Town of Ontario	, on	Ottawa OC F. (date)	1-2a/8.
Commissio	oner for taki	ng Affidavits				

## **Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS**



### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2017-0071		Process:	PUC 2018 Rates
Party:	VECC			
B - 1975 - AL		Summary of Fed	es and Disburse	ments Being Claimed
Legal/con	sultant/other fees	\$	15,922.50	
Disbursen	nents	\$	, <del></del> -1	
HST		\$	627.35	
<b>Total Cost</b>	t Claim	\$	16,549.85	

Payment Information	
Public Interest Advocacy Centre	
1204-ONE Nicholas Street	
Ottawa, ON	
K1N 7B7	
	Public Interest Advocacy Centre  1204-ONE Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON

Send payment

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2017-0071		Process: P	UC 2018 Rates	
Party:	VECC		Service Pro	ovider Name: Mark Garner	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Practising/Years Experie	of Relevant
	Legal Counsel			30	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst	☐ ·		Hourly Rate:	\$330
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched ided within previous	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%

C4			os Poina			III.		410 1	
St.	atement o		urly Rate		Subtotal		HST	Tatal	
Pre-hearing Conference	nours	110	uriy Kate	_	เธาอานุยาย		пэт		Total
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$	
Technical Conference		7	550.00	7	(0)	٦		7	
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	_	\$	2	\$	34)
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-
Interrogatories		~	330.00	~		Υ		· ·	
Preparation	9.5	\$	330.00	\$	3,135.00	\$	123.52	\$	3,258.52
Responses	1.5	\$	330.00	\$	495.00	\$	19.50	\$	514.50
Issues Conference		-		7	.50.00	Ψ.	10.00	т.	02.100
Preparation	1.0	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$	13.00	\$	343.00
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	( <del>*</del> )	\$	-	\$	<u>.</u>
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	8.0	\$	330.00	\$	2,640.00	\$	104.02	\$	2,744.02
Attendance	8.0	\$	330.00	\$	2,640.00	\$	104.02	\$	2,744.02
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	+	\$	S# (
Argument									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	(B)
Oral Hearing									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	:#:	\$	¥	\$	(¥)
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	*	\$	· ·
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	77	\$	-	\$	9 <del>7</del> 6
Attendance	1	\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	ä	\$	-
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	121	\$	2	\$	S#7
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	9,240.00	\$	364.06	\$	9,604.06

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



## **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2017-0071		Process: P	UC 2018 Rates	
Party:	VECC		Service Pro	ovider Name: Bill Harper	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one )	Year Called to Bar	Completed Practising/Years Experie	of Relevant
	Legal Counsel			38	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$330
	Analyst For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%
		∠ CV provi	ided within previous	s 24 months	

St	atement o	of Fe	es Being	Cla	imed	TT.		
	Hours		urly Rate	_	Subtotal		HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	1 <del>5</del> (	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	2.5	\$ =
Technical Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	2	\$	=	\$ ×
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	5 <b>=</b> 6	\$ -
Interrogatories		/						
Preparation	4.25 4.8	\$	330.00	\$	1,402.50	\$	55.26	\$ 1,457.76
Responses		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$ 2
Issues Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	141	\$ *
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference								
Preparation	6.8	\$	330.00	\$	2,227.50	\$	87.76	\$ 2,315.26
Attendance	8.8	\$	330.00	\$	2,887.50	\$	113.77	\$ 3,001.27
Proposal Preparation	0.5	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	\$	6.50	\$ 171.50
Argument								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	<del>,</del> ,	\$	-	\$ •
Oral Hearing								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	=	\$	743	\$ 2
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	2	\$	040	\$ -
Other Conferences								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	= =	\$	-	\$ 5
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	8	\$		\$ Ä.
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	_	\$ 2
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	6,682.50	\$	263.29	\$ 6,945.79

#### Econalysis Consulting Services Inc.

34 King St East Suite 630 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

K1N 7B7

# Bill To Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 1 Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON

#### Statement of Costs

Date	File #
9/28/2018	2018046

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2017-0071

#### Project EB-2017-0071 PUC 2018 Rates Serviced Item Description Hours Rate Amount 7/3/2018 Interrogatories Preparation BH 330.00 330.00 7/4/2018 3.25 Interrogatories Preparation BH 330.00 1,072.50 7/17/2018 Interrogatories Preparation MG: Interrogatory prep/review 330.00 1,980.00 evidence/notes 7/18/2018 Interrogatories Preparation MG: Interrogatory prep/review 3.5 330.00 1,155.00 evidence/notes 8/13/2018 ADR Preparation BH 330.00 0.75 247.50 8/16/2018 ADR Preparation BH 4.5 330.00 1,485.00 8/16/2018 Issues Conference Preparation MG: Comment on Issues 330.00 1 330.00 Lists/coordinate VECC 8/17/2018 ADR Preparation BH 330.00 330.00 8/19/2018 MG: Review Interrogatory Interrogatories Responses 1.5 330.00 495.00 responses/develop follow-up. 8/20/2018 ADR Preparation MG: Review 8 330.00 2,640.00 evidence/IRRs/notes/develop ADR notes for VECC review. 8/21/2018 ADR Attendance 3.25 330.00 1,072.50 8/21/2018 ADR Attendance MG: Settlement Attendance with 330.00 1,320.00 BH 9:30-4:45. Split (1/2) time claimed in accordance with Board policy

HST #10160 6028

Total

#### Econalysis Consulting Services Inc.

34 King St East Suite 630 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

# **Statement of Costs**

Date	File#
9/28/2018	2018046

Bill To	
Public Interest Advocacy Centre	
Suite 1204	
1 Nicholas Street	
Ottawa, ON	
K1N 7B7	

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2017-0071

Project  EB-2017-0071 PUC 2018 Rates				
ADR Attendance  ADR Attendance  ADR Attendance  ADR Preparation  ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: Settlement Attendance with BH 9:30-5pm. Split (1/2) time claimed in accordance with Board policy BH BH BH Subtotal HST on Sales	3.5 2 0.5 0.5	330.00 330.00 330.00 330.00 330.00	1,320.00 1,155.00 660.00 165.00 15,922.50 2,069.93
			0 6028	\$2,069.93
	ADR Attendance  ADR Attendance  ADR Attendance  ADR Preparation	BB-2017-0071 PUC 2018 Rates    Item	Item Description Hours  ADR Attendance MG: Settlement Attendance with BH 9:30-5pm. Split (1/2) time claimed in accordance with Board policy  ADR Attendance BH 3.5  ADR Preparation BH 0.5  ADR Proposal Preparation BH 0.5  Subtotal HST on Sales	Item