

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			Instructions	
- All claims must be in Canadian - A separate "Detail of Fees and I Disbursements Being Claimed") i However, only one "Summary of - The cost claim must be support - A CV for each consultant/analy	Disbursements Be s required for each Fees and Disburs ed by a complete st must be attach	Rate Rate ing Claime th lawyer, a ements" co d Affidavit ed unless p	cormulas are embedded in the form to assist of exchange rate and country of initial currency of initial cu	aimed" and a "Statement of alegal. nould be provided. ost Award Tariff.
File # EB- 2017-0224			Process: EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Co	ompliance Plan
Party: Industrial Gas Us	ers Association		Affiant's Name: lan Mondrow (Gowling WLG)
HST Number: 89659 3323	3 RT0001		HST Rate Ontario:	13.00%
	II Registrant Inregistered Other		Qualifying Non-Profit Tax Exempt	
			Affidavit	
l, lar	Mondrow		, of the City/Town of	Thornhill
in the Province/State of	On	tario	, swear or affi	rm that:
2. I have examined all of the doc Disbursements Being Claimed", 3. The attached "Summary of Fe Disbursements Being Claimed" in Ontario Energy Board process re 4. This cost claim does not include described in sections 6.05 and 6	umentation in sup Statement(s) of F es and Disbursem Include only costs ferred to above. Ide any costs for w	oport of the ees Being ents Being incurred ar ork done, o	y") and as such have knowledge of the matter is cost claim, including the attached "Summa Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursement Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed time spent directly for the purposes of the or time spent, by a person that is an employed irection on Cost Awards.	ary of Fees and its Being Claimed". led" and "Statement(s) of the Party's participation in the
Signature of Affiant				
Sworn or affirmed before in the Province/State of	me at the City,		Toronto , on <u>Assembles</u> (date)	20, 2018.

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Page 1 of 2



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	2017-0224	Process: EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan	1

Party: Industrial Gas Users Association

Sun	nmary of Fe	es and Disbursem	ents Being Claimed
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	11,434.00	
Disbursements	\$	27.51	
HST	\$	1,490.00	
Total Cost Claim	\$	12,951.51	

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Industrial Gas Users Association

Send payment to this address: Dr. Shahrzad Rahbar, President

Industrial Gas Users Association 260 Centrum Boulevard, Suite 202

Orleans, Ontario K1E 3P4



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0224		Process: EGD 2018	Cap and Trade Comp	oliance Plan
Party:	Industrial Gas Users Association		Service Provider Na	me: lan Mondrow (C	Gowling WLG
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years P	
	Legal Counsel	~	1991	27	
	Articling Student/Paralegal				
	Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$330
	Analyst				
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	thed HST R	ate Charged (enter %):	13.0%
		CV prov	ided within previous 24 month	s	

Statement of Fees Being Claimed												
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	Subtotal		HST		Total				
Pre-hearing Conference												
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$	+			
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$				
Technical Conference												
Preparation	0.30	\$	330.00	\$	99.00	\$	12.87	\$	111.87			
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-			
Interrogatories												
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	*			
Responses		\$	330.00	\$		\$	4	\$				
Issues Conference												
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	4.1	\$	-	\$				
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-			
ADR - Settlement Conference												
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-			
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	14.			
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	7			
Argument												
Preparation	10.90	\$	330.00	\$	3,597.00	\$	467.61	\$	4,064.61			
Oral Hearing												
Preparation	6.80	\$	330.00	\$	2,244.00	\$	291.72	\$	2,535.72			
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-			
Other Conferences												
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$				
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	- 2	\$				
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	/♥\	\$	-			
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,940.00	\$	772.20	\$	6,712.20			



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2017-0224 Process: EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan

Party: Industrial Gas Users Association Service Provider Name: Ian Mondrow (Gowling WLG

	Net Cost	HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$	
Printing		\$	\$	-
Courier	\$ 25.76	\$ 3.35	\$	29.11
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$	-
Transcripts		\$ -	\$	1141
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$	
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$	-
Parking		\$ -	\$	-
Taxi		\$ -	\$	174
Accommodation		\$ -	\$	
Meals		\$ -	\$	1,200
Other:		\$	\$	-
Other:		\$ -	\$	-
Other:		\$ -	\$	-
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ 25.76	\$ 3.35	\$	29.11



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0224		Process: EGD 2018	Cap and Trade Comp	liance Plan		
Party:	Industrial Gas Users Association		Service Provider Na	me: Laura Van Soele	n (Gowling V		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years P	0.		
	Legal Counsel	~	2008	10			
	Articling Student/Paralegal				-		
	Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$230		
	Analyst						
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched HST Ra	te Charged (enter %):	13.0%		
		CV prov	ovided within previous 24 months				

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clai	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$		\$ -	\$
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ 100
Responses		\$	230.00	\$		\$ -	\$
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$		\$ 7	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ - 5
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Argument							
Preparation	5.00	\$	230.00	\$	1,150.00	\$ 149.50	\$ 1,299.50
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	8.50	\$	230.00	\$	1,955.00	\$ 254.15	\$ 2,209.15
Attendance	10.30	\$	230.00	\$	2,369.00	\$ 307.97	\$ 2,676.97
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$		\$ -	\$ · -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	- 13	\$	\$ -
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,474.00	\$ 711.62	\$ 6,185.62



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2017-0224 Process: EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan

Party: Industrial Gas Users Association Service Provider Name: Laura Van Soelen (Gowling V

Stat	tement of Disbursements	Being Claimed			
	Ne	t Cost	HST	1	otal
Scanning/Photocopy	\$	1.00	\$ 0.13	\$	1.13
Printing			\$ -	\$	-
Courier				\$	-
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$	-
Transcripts			\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Car			\$ -	\$	-
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$	-
Travel (Other):			\$ 1-	\$	1,17
Parking			\$ -	\$	-
Taxi			\$ -	\$	-
Accommodation			\$ -	\$	-
Meals			\$ -	\$	-
Other:			\$ -	\$	-
Other:			\$ (4)	\$	-
Other:			\$ -	\$	-
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	1.00	\$ 0.13	\$	1.13



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0224		Process: EGD 2018 (Cap and Trade Comp	liance Plan	
Party:	Industrial Gas Users Association		Service Provider Nar	ne: Cathy Galler (Go	owling WLG)	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Proof Relevant Ex		
	Legal Counsel			8		
	Articling Student/Paralegal	~				
	Consultant			Hourly Rate:	\$100	
	Analyst			_		
	For Consultant/Analyst:	□ CV atta	ched HST Rat	te Charged (enter %):	13.0%	
		□ CV prov	vided within previous 24 months			

Sta	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clair	ned					
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	Sı	Subtotal HST			Total		
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	- 4	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	4	\$	-	\$		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$		\$		\$	(0)	
Interrogatories										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	1-1	\$	-	\$	11 €	
Responses		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$		
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	1-	\$	-	\$		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	2	\$	~	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	4	\$	-	\$	1.5	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$		\$	-	\$		
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$	-	\$	-	
Argument										
Preparation	0.10	\$	100.00	\$	10.00	\$	1.30	\$	11.30	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation	0.10	\$	100.00	\$	10.00	\$	1.30	\$	11.30	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	+	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	1411	\$	141	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	(CF)	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	20.00	\$	2.60	\$	22.60	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2017-0224

Process:

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan

Party:

Industrial Gas Users Association

Service Provider Name:

Cathy Galler (Gowling WLG)

Stater	ment of Disbursements Being Claimed	1			
	Net Cost		HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy	\$ 0.75	\$	0.10	\$	0.85
Printing		\$	-	\$	-
Courier		\$	-	\$	-
Telephone/Fax		\$	-	\$	-
Transcripts		\$		\$	-
Travel: Air		\$	-	\$	1-1
Travel: Car		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Rail		\$	-	\$	-
Travel (Other):		\$	-	\$	-
Parking		\$	-	\$	-
Taxi		\$	-	\$	-
Accommodation		\$	-	\$	-
Meals		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ 0.75	\$	0.10	\$	0.85



December 31, 2017 INVOICE: 18842371

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
HP	21/12/2017	0.10	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing letter of intervention:
HP	21/12/2017	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Gather materials; review status of record and recent procedural/interim rate request determination; draft intervention notice;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Galler, Cathy		0.10
Mondrow, lan		0.30
	Total	0.40

DISBURSEMEN'	TS	
Taxable Costs		
21/12/2017	Scanning Service Scans=3 Time:1318 EquipmentID:2.16.147	\$0.75
21/12/2017	Courier BLIZZARD 1 Piece(s) 100 King St West> 2300 Yonge St	\$13.61
	Total Taxable Disbursements	\$14.36

SCANNING DISBURSEMENT DETAIL

Cost ID	Authorized By	Date	Cost Type	Tax Flag	<u>Cost Description</u>	Amount	Sum on Bill	Print on Bill	Phase/ Task
48257050	1760	21/12/17	1005	Y	Taxable: Scanning Service Scans=3 Time:1318 EquipmentID:2.16.147 Originator: GALLERC	\$0.75	Y	Ÿ	1441

		Blizzai	rd Courier Orders					
		Date Range: 201	7-12-17 to 2017-12-31 in	iclusive				
			Customer:					
		Gowling WLG	(Canada) LLP(Office)				
		1	100 King St West					
			Toronto					
			M5X 1G5					
		Created: Tuesday	2nd of January 2018 11:1	7:48 AM				
# Waybill	ST Order Time	Pick Up Address	Drop Off Address	Received By	Reference #	# Price	Fuel SC HST	Total
	17-12	Gowling WLG - (Canada) LLP	Ontario Energy Board	Pat Piron	t1013951			
14 <u>7683465</u>	ND 21 16:48	100 King St West	2300 Yonge St Toronto M4P 1E4	17-12-22 08:40	i mondrow 1760	13.6	1 0 1.7	77 15.:



February 6, 2018 INVOICE: 18861612

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
HP	02/01/2018	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review status and Procedural Order and diarize dates;
HP	04/01/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with S. Rahbar relating to applications and IGUA RNG position;
HP	10/01/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review Environmental Defence letter relating to proposed incremental DSM evidence;
HP	12/01/2018	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review pre-filed materials;
HP	13/01/2018	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review interrogatories filed regarding potential scope of RNG considerations; review EGD response to ED/GEC request to file evidence;
	24/01/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review EGD letter relating to DSM evidence;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.80
	Total	1.80



March 14, 2018 INVOICE: 18874734

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
HP	07/02/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order and Issues List;
HP	08/02/2018	0.30	lan Mondrow	Intervenor correspondence relating to RNG decision; review Federal Clean Fuel Standard information (re abatement investments);
HP	18/02/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review interrogatory response correspondence;
HP	21/02/2018	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review matter procedural status and GEC/ED evidence proposal;
HP	23/02/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review and consider further EGD response to GEC/ED evidence proposal;
HP	27/02/2018	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order No. 3 and revised schedule;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.90
	Total	0.90



April 16, 2018

INVOICE: 18893864

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
HP	2018-03-14	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Update briefing for IGUA;
HP	2018-03-20	0.10	lan Mondrow	IGUA Caucus update;
HP	2018-03-21	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review ED/GEC evidence;
HP	2018-03-22	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Conclude review of GEC evidence;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.80
	Total	0.80



May 24, 2018 INVOICE: 18918586

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
HP	2018-04-04	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review interrogatory responses;
TCP	2018-04-05	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review various correspondence relating to Technical Conference topics/time estimates;
TCP	2018-04-06	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review Technical Conference correspondence;
HP.	2018-04-18	0.40	lan Mondrow	Gather and review recent materials; discussions with L. Van Soelen relating to issues and approach; review procedural status; response to OEB Staff relating to cross-examination estimates;
HP	2018-04-18	2.50	Laura V. Van Soelen	Review application materials;
HP	2018-04-19	4.00	Laura V. Van Soelen	Continue review of EGD application; review EGD interrogatory responses;
HP	2018-04-20	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Discussions with L. Van Soelen and review notes/evidence relating to issues to consider;
HP	2018-04-23	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review recent filings; notes to L. Van Soelen with suggestions for examinations;
HP	2018-04-24	0.60	lan Mondrow	Review recent filings and L. Van Soelen update and examination transcript and provide comments on issues for further consideration;
HP	2018-04-25	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review L. Van Soelen update note; discussion with L. Van Soelen relating to hearing progress, issues and likely IGUA positions;
HP	2018-04-25	1.00	Laura V. Van Soelen	Prepare for cross-examination of EGD witness panel;
HP	2018-04-26	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review letters relating to California Carbon and ICF confidentiality claim; review proceeding status and schedule; update to S. Rahbar;
HA	2018-04-26	7.00	Laura V. Van Soelen	Attend EGD portion of cap and trade compliance hearing;
HP	2018-04-26	1.00	Laura V. Van Soelen	Prepare for cross-examination of Mr. Neme;
ARG	2018-04-27	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review hearing status and L. Van Soelen examination transcript; discussion with L. Van Soelen relating to issues and thoughts for IGUA positions; review ED letter relating to confidentiality claim by ICF and note to L. Van Soelen;
HA	2018-04-27	3.30	Laura V. Van Soelen	Attend EGD and GEC witness panels for cap and trade compliance plan hearing;



May 24, 2018

INVOICE: 18918586

Date

Hours

Timekeeper

Description

ARG

2018-04-29

0.20 Ian Mondrow

Review and comment on interim report to IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		3.90
Van Soelen, Laura V.		18.80
	Total	22.70



June 19, 2018 INVOICE: 18934516

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2018-05-01	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with S. Rahbar relating to ICF confidentiality issue and to confirm instructions on IGUA position;
ARG	2018-05-02	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review draft letter relating to ICF confidentiality and comment;
ARG	2018-05-07	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review ED note to intervenors relating to advocacy for incremental (carbon priced) DSM and consider;
ARG	2018-05-12	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review ED and related correspondence regarding utility DSM/abatement plans;
ARG	2018-05-13	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review additional letters and comments in support of ED request for additional process and note to L. Van Soelen for comment;
ARG	2018-05-14	0.70	Laura V. Van Soelen	Review and consider correspondence regarding ED alternate request for preliminary ruling in cap and trade proceeding; discussion with I. Mondrow regarding same;
ARG	2018-05-15	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Call with APPrO relating to ED and associated correspondence;
ARG	2018-05-17	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review additional ED-related (incremental carbon abatement DSM) correspondence;
ARG	2018-05-24	2.40	lan Mondrow	Review ED related correspondence relating to incremental DSM; review and consider filed utility arguments;
ARG	2018-05-25	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review L. Van Soelen comments on draft letter responding to ED correspondence relating to incremental DSM and review and revise for filing;
ARG	2018-05-25	0.30	Laura V. Van Soelen	Review and comment on draft letter to OEB regarding DSM mid-term review and cap and trade proceeding; e-mail correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding same;
ARG	2018-05-27	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review additional notes from L. Van Soelen and further consider position on incremental DSM; review draft letter relating to same to finalize;
ARG	2018-05-28	0.10	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing correspondence relating to incremental DSM;
ARG	2018-05-28	2.00	Laura V. Van Soelen	Review EGD submissions; prepare submissions regarding 2018 cap and trade compliance plan;
ARG	2018-05-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review outline of points from L. Van Soelen and provide comments for final submissions;
ARG	2018-05-31	1.50	Laura V. Van Soelen	Revise and finalize submissions for cap and trade proceeding;



June 19, 2018

INVOICE: 18934516

Total Fees for Professional Services

Total Taxable Disbursements

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name		Hours	
Galler, Cathy		0.10	
Mondrow, Ian		4.20	
Van Soelen, Laura V.		4.50	
	Total	8.80	
DISBURSEMENTS			
Taxable Costs			
2018-05-03	Copying Copies=2 Time:11:42 EquipmentID:TORPRINT Application:ACROBAT.EXE FileInfo:TOR_LAW-#9510190-v1- Letter_to_Kirsten_Walli_dated_May_32018.pd		\$0.50
2018-05-03	Copying Copies=2 Time:11:43 EquipmentID:TORPRINT Application:ACROBAT.EXE FileInfo:TOR_LAW-#9510190-v1- Letter_to_Kirsten_Walli_dated_May_32018.pd		\$0.50
2018-05-28	Courier BLIZZARD 1 Piece(s) 100 King St West> 2300 Yonge St		\$12.15

\$13.15

PHOTOCOPYING DISBURSEMENT DETAIL

Cost ID 48998864	Authorized By 1760	<u>Date</u> 03/05/18	Cost Type 1000	Tax Flag Y	Cost Description Taxable: Copying Copies=2 Time:11:42 EquipmentID:TORPRINT Application:ACROBAT.EXE FileInfo:TOR_LAW-#9510190-v1- Letter_to_Kirsten_Walli_dated_May_32018.pd Originator: VANSOELL	<u>Amount</u> \$0.50	Sum on Bill Y	Print on Bill Y	Phase/ Task
48998866	1760	03/05/18	1000	Υ	Taxable: Copying Copies=2 Time:11:43 EquipmentID:TORPRINT Application:ACROBAT.EXE FileInfo:TOR_LAW- #9510190-v1- Letter_to_Kirsten_Walli_dated_May_32018.pd Originator: VANSOELL	\$0.50	Υ	Y	

		Blizzard Couri	er Orders				
		Date Range: 2018-05-27 to	2018-05-31 inclusive				
		Custome	r:				
		Gowling WLG (C	Canada) LLP				
		100 King St West Tor	onto M5X 1G5				
		Created: Tuesday 5th of Jur	ne 2018 12:17:12 PM				
,	Waybill	ST Order Pick Up Address	Drop Off Address	Received Reference #	Price	HST	Total

1 7744687	2 2	28	Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 100 King St West Toronto M5X 1G5	ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD 2300 Yonge St Toronto M4P 1E4		t1013951 i.mondrow 1760	12.15	1.58	13.73
-----------	-----	----	---	--	--	--------------------------------	-------	------	-------



July 17, 2018

INVOICE: 18952878

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2018-06-01	1.00	Ian Mondrow	Review submissions;
ARG	2018-06-02	2.00	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of submissions and notes to IGUA and L. Van Soelen;
ARG	2018-06-03	0.50	Laura V. Van Soelen	Discussion with client regarding cap and trade submissions;
ARG	2018-06-04	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of submissions; review clarifications to IGUA submission and related correspondence and provide comments;
ARG	2018-06-05	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of submissions;
ARG	2018-06-06	0.80	Ian Mondrow	Review Staff submission and forward to IGUA with note relating to comments on ratepayer funded innovation propositions;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		4.70
Van Soelen, Laura V.		0.50
	Total	5.20



August 14, 2018

INVOICE: 18968365

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1013951

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-

0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2018-07-03	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review reply argument; report to IGUA Caucus;
ARG	2018-07-06	0.90	lan Mondrow	Conclude review of EGD argument;
ARG	2018-07-16	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review EGD compliance filing relating to cessation and further costs:

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.30
	Total	1.30

gowlinks

Friday, December 14, 2018 3:54:48 PM

As of Thursday, December 13, 2018 11:36:00 PM

Client Code

190123

Client Name

Industrial Gas Users Association

Nature of Client Business

Oil & Gas

Matter Code

T1013951

Matter Name

EGD 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan (EB-2017-0224) (IGUA18-ON-EGD-4)

Client Reference Code

Practice Area of Work Status

Energy (SA10)

Open Date

Open Open and Active Dec 19, 2017

Close Date

Billing Professional

Mondrow, Ian (1760)

Nature of Work

Providing advice to IGUA with respect to its' participation as an intervenor in Enbridge Gas Distribution Inc.'s

(EGD) 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan.

Tax Jurisdiction

Ontario HST (ONT)

WIP Fees Detail	All Timekeepers 🗸		
Date	Timekeeper	Remarks	Hours
Dec 10, 2018	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Review Procedural Order No. 7 and instructions relating to preparation of cost claim;	0.1
Total			0.1

http://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/wipdetail.asp?matteruno=1766328 | Cathy Galler