

Environment Indigenous Energy Law

Direct Dial: File: 416.862.4830 7249

By Electronic Mail & RESS Filing

December 20, 2018

Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Reply Submission for 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plans, EB-2017-0255 (Union Gas Limited)

Please find enclosed Ontario Sustainable Energy Association's ("OSEA") cost claim pursuant to the Board's Decision and Procedural Order No. 7 dated December 10, 2018 for the above-noted matter.

OSEA has claimed four (4) courier charges, along with photocopying charges. We have divided these disbursements between the cost claims for matters EB-2017-0224 and EB-2017-0255, which we are submitting under separate cover.

Yours truly,

Robert Woon

Enclosure Document #: 1468811



Country:

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB-	2017	-0255 (Union Gas)		Process: Cap and Trade Compliance	Plans
Party:	Onta	rio Sustainable Energy Boar	d	Affiant's Name: Robert Woon	
HST Numbe	er:	113627988RT0001		HST Rate Ontario:	13.00%
		Full Registrant		Qualifying Non-Profit	
		Unregistered		Tax Exempt	
		Other			

		Affidavit	
I, R	obert Woon	, of the City/Town of	Toronto
in the Province/State of	Ontario		, swear or affirm that:

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me a	t the City/Town of		Toronto	,
in the Province/State of	Ontario	, on	December 2/ , 2018	•
11.			(date)	

Page 1 of 3



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB- 2017-0255 (Union Gas)

Process: Cap and Trade Compliance Plans

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Board

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed					
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	12,624.50			
Disbursements	\$	86.24			
HST	\$	1,652.40			
Total Cost Claim	\$	14,363.14			

Payment Information					
Make cheque payable to:	Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP				
Send payment to this address:	1 Toronto Street				
	Suite 900				
	Toronto, ON M5C 2V6				



File # EB-	2017-0255 (Union Gas)			Process:	Ca	o and Trade	Con	npliance Pl	ans	
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Boar	d		Service P	rov	ider Name:	Rot	<mark>ert Woon</mark>		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Ye	ar Called to Bar	1		Ρ	Complet ractising/Yea Exper	ars of ience	Relevant
	Legal Counsel			2014				4	4	
	Articling Student/Paralegal									
	Consultant							Hourly Rate:		<mark>\$170</mark>
	Analyst									
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched			HST Rate Cl	narge	ed (enter %):		13.0%
		CV prov	ided	within previo	ous 2	4 months				
	ç.	tatement o	of F	ees Reing	Cla	imed				
		Hours		ourly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearin	g Conference	nours		any nate		Jubiotai		1151		Total
i i c-iicai iii	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$		\$	
	Attendance		ې \$	170.00	\$		ې \$		\$	
Technical (Conference		ې	170.00	ڊ ر	-	ې	-	Ļ	
Technical	Preparation	2 20	\$	170.00	ć	561.00	\$	72.93	\$	633.93
	Attendance	3.30 7.25	ې \$	170.00	\$ \$	1,232.50	ې \$	160.23	ې \$	1,392.73
Interrogate		7.25	Ş	170.00	Ş	1,252.50	Ş	100.25	ې	1,392.73
menogati	Preparation	7.40	\$	170.00	\$	1,258.00	\$	163.54	\$	1,421.54
	Responses	7.40	ې \$	170.00	\$ \$	1,258.00	ې \$	105.54	\$	1,421.34
Issues Con			Ş	170.00	Ş	-	Ş	-	ې ا	
issues con		0.90	\$	170.00	4	153.00	\$	19.89	\$	172.89
	Preparation Attendance	0.90		170.00	\$ \$	153.00	ې \$	19.89	ې \$	172.09
	lement Conference		\$	170.00	Ş	-	Ş	-	Ş	
ADR - Sett			ć	170.00	4		ć		\$	
	Preparation Attendance		\$ ¢	170.00	\$ ¢	-	\$ ¢	-	\$ \$	-
			\$ \$	170.00 170.00	\$ \$	-	\$ \$	-	\$ \$	
Argument	Proposal Preparation		Ş	170.00	Ş	-	Ş	-	Ş	
Argument	Preparation	4.40	ć	170.00	\$	748.00	\$	97.24	\$	845.24
Oral Heari		4.40	Ş	170.00	Ş	746.00	Ş	97.24	ې ا	845.24
	Preparation	6.65	ć	170.00	\$	1,130.50	\$	146.97	\$	1,277.47
	Attendance	5.25		170.00	\$	892.50	ې \$	116.03	\$	1,008.53
Other Con		J.25	ې	170.00	ڊ ا	092.30	ډ	110.03	ې	1,000.33
	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$	-	\$	
	Attendance		ې \$	170.00	ې \$	-	ې \$	-	ې \$	
Case Mana		0.25	Ş	170.00		42.50	ې \$	- 5.53	ې \$	48.03
	action	0.25		170.00	ڊ ا	42.30	Ş	3.33		40.05
TOTAL SER	VICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	6,018.00	\$	782.34	\$	6,800.34

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB- 2017-0255 (Union Gas)

Process:

Cap and Trade Compliance Plans

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Boar

Service Provider Name:

Robert Woon

Sta	tement of Disbursements	Being Claimed			
	Ne	et Cost	HST	-	Fotal
Scanning/Photocopy		\$	-	\$	-
Printing	\$	57.74 \$	7.51	\$	65.25
Courier	\$	28.50 \$	3.71	\$	32.21
Telephone/Fax		\$	-	\$	-
Transcripts		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Air		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Car		\$	-	\$	-
Travel: Rail		\$	-	\$	-
Travel (Other):		\$	-	\$	-
Parking		\$	-	\$	-
Тахі		\$	-	\$	-
Accommodation		\$	-	\$	-
Meals		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
Other:		\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	86.24 \$	11.21	\$	97.45

A&B Courier | Order Details



Order #6425660

Pickup Information -

WILLMS & SHIER 1 TORONTO STREET, Unit 900 Toronto, ON M5C2V6 CANADA RECEPTION P: (416)863-0711 F:

Delivery Information

ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD 2300 YONGE STREET 27TH FLOOR Toronto ON M4P1E4 CANADA Attn: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary P: F:

Order Information

Ready	12/21/2017 08:54	Ordered By	LIBA KOCIAN	Waiting Time	0 min.
Deliver By	12/21/2017 17:00	Dept.		Insurance	NO
Service	SAMEDAY	Reference	7249	Declared Value	\$0.00
Vehicle	CAR	Waybill #:	0	COD	\$0.00

Package Details

Tracking Information

1 LETTER(S)		0.5 lbs
Total Weight		1 Lbs
Charges	5	
Base Amount:		\$10.50
Fuel Surcharge:		\$1.16
Subtotal:		\$11.66
HST - 13% (13.00%)		\$1.52
Total:		\$13.18

Finalized	
12/21/2017 12:06	
12/21/2017 14:52	
Donna	
	12/21/2017 12:06 12/21/2017 14:52



Comments

Signature Required

Order Notes

12/21/2017 8:54:03 AM

12/21/2017 8:54:03 AM

ATTENTION* Due to extremely high volumes we are running behind on all Courier 4 Hour, Rush and Direct services. We apologize for the inconvenience.

12/21/2017 8:54:03 AM

Order #6447348

Pickup Information

WILLMS & SHIER 1 TORONTO STREET, Unit 900 Toronto , ON M5C2V6 CANADA RECEPTION P: (416)863-0711 F:

Delivery Information

ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto ON M4P1E4 CANADA No Contact Specified P: F:

Order Information

Ready	1/15/2018 09:15	Ordered By	LIBA KOCIAN	Waiting Time	0 min.
Deliver By	1/15/2018 13:15	Dept.		Insurance	NO
Service	4 HOUR	Reference	7249	Declared Value	\$0.00
Vehicle	CAR	Waybill #:	0	COD	\$0.00

Package Details

1 LETTER(S)	 0.5 lbs
Total Weight	1 Lbs
Charges	0
Base Amount:	\$15.75
Fuel Surcharge:	\$1.73
Subtotal:	\$17.48
HST - 13% (13.00%)	\$2.27
Total:	\$19.75

Tracking Information

Status	Finalized					
Picked Up	1/15/2018 12:12					
Delivered	1/15/2018 14:00					
POD	Fatima					



Comments

Signature Required

Order Notes

905.853.4444 905.881.9444

Order #6466449

Pickup Information

WILLMS & SHIER 1 TORONTO STREET, Unit 900 Toronto , ON M5C2V6 CANADA RECEPTION P: (416)863-0711 F:

Delivery Information

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto ON M4P1E4 CANADA Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary P: F:

Order Information

Ready	1/30/2018 08:28	Ordered By	LIBA KOCIAN	Waiting Time	0 min.
Deliver By	1/30/2018 12:28	Dept.	pt.		NO
Service	4 HOUR	Reference	7249	Declared Value	\$0.00
Vehicle CAR		Waybill #:	0	COD	\$0.00

Package Details

Tracking Information

1 LETTER(S)		0.5 lbs
Total Weight	18	1 Lbs
Charges		
Base Amount:		\$15.75
Fuel Surcharge:		\$1.73
Subtotal:		\$17.48
HST - 13% (13.00%)	11	\$2.27
Total:		\$19.75

Finalized				
1/30/2018 12:12				
1/30/2018 13:23				
Receiption				
	1/30/2018 12:12 1/30/2018 13:23			



Comments

Signature Required

Order Notes

905.853.4444 905.881.9444

Order #6623832

Pickup Information

WILLMS & SHIER 1 TORONTO STREET, Unit 900 TORONTO, ON M5C2V6 CANADA RECEPTION P: (416)863-0711 F:

Delivery Information

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto ON M4P1E4 CANADA Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary P: F:

Order Information

Ready	6/1/2018 11:30	Ordered By	ASHIFA	Waiting Time	0 min.	
Deliver By	6/1/2018 15:30	Dept.	Dept.		NO	
Service	4 HOUR	Reference	7249 / 7268	Declared Value	\$0.00	
Vehicle	CAR	Waybill #:	Waybill #: 0		\$0.00	
Package D	Details		Tracking in	formation		

1 LETTER(S)		0.5 lbs
Total Weight	11	1 Lbs
Charges		
Base Amount:	×	\$15.75
Fuel Surcharge:		\$2.05
Subtotal:		\$17.80
HST - 13% (13.00%)		\$2.31
Total:		\$20.11

Status	Finalized	
Picked Up	6/1/2018 13:25	
Delivered	6/1/2018 14:07	
POD	Falcon	



Comments

Signature Required

Order Notes

Geo code successfully inserted into ActiveOrder Geo Code. Delivery Latitude: 43.70721096779967 Delivery Longitude: -79.39846036808203 Provider:ESRI Score:99.38 Note: Geocode not available on AddressesPickup Latitude: 43.649887305586 Pickup Longitude: -79.3760407992962 Source: Address Book

6/1/2018 11:30:57 AM

Dec/18/2018

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Accounting Ledger

Page 1

		Nov/ 1/2017 To Dec/1	Disb	
Date	Received From/Pai Explanation	.d 'I'o	0120	
1341 Ontario Sustai 7249 Re:	nable Energy Association 2018 Cap and Trade Comp	on Diance Plans EB -		Resp Lawyer: JA
Dec/20/2017	Photocopies		2.00	
Dec/26/2017	A & B COURIER Deliveries	6425660.	11.66	
Jan/11/2018	Photocopies		7.25	
Jan/11/2018	Photocopies		2.00	
Jan/12/2018	Photocopies		1.00	
Jan/12/2018	Photocopies		1.00	
Jan/12/2018	Photocopies		1.50	
Jan/12/2018	Photocopies		1.50	
Jan/23/2018	A & B COURIER Deliveries	6447348	17.48	
Jan/24/2018	Photocopies		11.00	
Jan/29/2018	Photocopies		5.75	
Jan/29/2018	Photocopies		3.50	
Jan/29/2018	Photocopies		3.50	
Feb/ 6/2018	A & B COURIER Deliveries	6466449	17.48	
Mar/26/2018	Prints Photocopies		7.50 🗸	
Mar/28/2018	Scans Photocopies		7.50	
Mar/28/2018	Prints Photocopies		0.25	
Mar/28/2018	Prints Photocopies		0.25	
Mar/28/2018	Prints Photocopies		0.25	
Apr/16/2018	Prints Photocopies	2	1.50 🖌	
Apr/16/2018	Prints Photocopies		1.50	
Apr/16/2018	Prints Photocopies		6.00	

Dec/18/2018

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Accounting Ledger Nov/ 1/2017 To Dec/18/2018

	Nov/ 1/2017 To E	
Date	Received From/Paid To Explanation	Disb
Apr/19/2018	Scans Photocopies	0.25
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.50
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.00
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	0.25
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.50
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	3.75
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	0.75
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	17.00
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.00
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.75
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.00
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	0.50
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	1.00
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	0.50
Apr/22/2018	Prints Photocopies	0.50
May/29/2018	Prints Photocopies	7.75
May/29/2018	Prints Photocopies	9.25
May/31/2018	Prints Photocopies	8.00
May/31/2018	Prints Photocopies	8.50
Jun/ 5/2018	A & B COURIER Deliveries 00023832	17.80
	Totals for Report Period: Totals up to Ending Date:	194.92 194.92

*** Firm Totals ***

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing

		Client Fees Listing ALL DATES									
Date	Fee / Time	Working					į	Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing
Entry #	Explanation	Туре									
1341 7249	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association	na t									
Dec 18/2017	Re: 2018 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan Lawyer: 57 0.10 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	El	0.10	17.00		Unbilled
1891401	email J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser re	Time									
Dec 20/2017	draft intervenor request letter; Lawyer: 48 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	48	48	~ .	OANNA	VINCE		0.20	34.00		Unbilled
1892258	finalize intervenor letter;	Time	10		Q1111111	11101		0+20			UNDIFICU
	Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review procedural order no 1 and draft	57 Time	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	E)	0.40	68.00		Unbilled
1894617	issues list and email M. Fraser and J.	TTILE									
	Wilkinson re deadlines and comments for										
	draft issue list and interrogatories for issue 1.10.1										
Jan 4/2018	Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	E)	0.40	68.00		Unbilled
1895072	review draft issues list and consider whether comments required;	Time									
Jan 8/2018	Lawyer: 57 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	51	1.00	170.00		Unbilled
1895583	emails with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser	Time									
	re comments on draft issue list; initial review of utilities'										
	applications and consider										
Jan 8/2018	interrogatories for issue 1.10.1; Lawyer: 72 1.60 Hrs X 100.00	72	72	- F	AEYA J	ACKIW		1.60	160.00		Unbilled
1896772	prepare draft interrogatories;	Time									
Jan 9/2018 1896545	Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 review application and consider draft	57 Time	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	Ξ]	0.50	85.00		Unbilled
1050343	interrogatories for issue 1.10.1;	TTWE									
Jan 10/2018	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	El	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
1896714	review correspondence for ED and GEC re expert evidence for hearing and request	Time									
	for extension of settlement conference;										
Jan 11/2018 1897059	Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	48 Time	48	- 0	OANNA	VINCE		1.00	170.00		Unbilled
	Lawyer: 57 3.00 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	E]	3.00	510.00		Unbilled
1897069	review applications; prepare written	Time									
	interrogatories on issue 1.10.1; emails with M. Fraser re written										
	interrogatories;										
Jan 12/2018	Lawyer: 57 3.60 Hrs X 170.00 prepare draft interrogatories for	57 Time	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	3]	3.60	612.00		Unbilled
105/45/	renewable natural gas; emails and	TIME									
	telephone calls with J. Wilkinson and										
Jan 12/2018	M. Fraser re draft interrogatories; Lawyer: 48 1.20 Hrs X 170.00	48	48	- J	OANNA	VINCE		1.20	204.00		Unbilled
1898222	review and revise interrogatories re	Time									
Jan 15/2018	renewable natural gas; Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- 5	OBERT	WOON SE	71	0.30	51.00		Unbilled
1898426	review correspondence from Enbridge and	Time	51	1	ODLINI	10001 01		0.00	01100		UNDILIOU
	GEC re GEC/ED's request for evidence on abatement;										
Jan 17/2018		57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	21	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
1899308	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	Time									
	Environmental Defence and reply from Enbridge re admission of evidence for										
	conservation measures;								105.00		
Jan 22/2018 1900526	Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 discuss draft interrogatories; emails	57 Time	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	41	0.80	136.00		Unbilled
2900020	with M. Fraser re draft	1 1110									
Jan 23/2018	interrogatories; Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- 5	-	WOON SE	71	0.30	51.00		Unbilled
1900967		Time	51	- r	ODERI	WOON SE	20	0.30	51.00		OUDITIED
	interrogatories; prepare draft										
Jan 23/2018	interrogatories; Lawyer: 72 2.00 Hrs X 100.00	72	72	- F	AEYA J	JACKIW		2.00	200.00		Unbilled
1901442	Union - prepare interrogatories;	Time									
	Lawyer: 72 2.10 Hrs X 100.00 Union - prepare interrogatories;	72 Time	72	- F	AEYA C	JACKIW		2.10	210.00		Unbilled
	Lawyer: 57 3.00 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	Ξ)	3.00	510.00		Unbilled
1996245 Feb 7/2018	2	Time 57	57	_ E		WOON SE	21	0.50	85.00		Unbilled
1906580		Time	57	- 1	ODERI	WOON SE	1	0.30	05.00		UIDITIEd
	same to J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser;										
	emails with M. Fraser and J. Wilkinson re availability for technical										
	conference; telephone call with J.										
	Wilkinson're submissions for oral hearing;										
	Lawyer: 57 0,40 Hrs X 170,00	57	57	- F	OBERT	WOON SE	31	0.40	68.00		Unbilled
1911727		Time									
	hearing and issues to discuss at technical conference; review										
B-1 00/0010	procedural order no. 3;	67	57		ADED	MOON OF	21	0.20	24 00		Unbilled
	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review procedural order no 3; emails	57 Time	57	- 1	OBERT	WOON SE	21	0.20	34.00		OUDITIED
1912001	, proceeded state no of onarro										

Page: 1

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing ALL DATES

			ALL DA	TES					
Date	Fee / Time	Working				Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing
Entry #	Explanation	Туре			5.1				
	with M. Fraser and J. Wilkinson re revised timelines based on new procedural order;								
Mar 15/2018 1917969	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SE	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 receive GEC/ED evidence and email same to J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser and discuss potential interrogatories and timelines;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
Mar 20/2018 1918725	Lawyer: 57 1.50 Hrs X 170.00 review evidence submitted by GEC and ED;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	1.50	255.00		Unbilled
Mar 22/2018 1919098	Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 return voicemail to J. Wilkinson at OSEA;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
Mar 26/2018 1919856	Lawyer: 57 1.20 Hrs X 170.00	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	1.20	204.00		Unbilled
Mar 27/2018 1920089	Lawyer: 57 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 emails with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser re technical conference and	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	0.30	51.00		Unbilled
Mar 28/2018 1921610	identifying issues for clarification; Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 emails with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser re issues for technical conference;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
	Lawyer: 57 2.50 Hrs X 170.00 review interrogatory responses and prepare for technical conference; emails with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser re teleconference to discuss issues for technical conference; telephone call with M. Fraser re key issues for	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	2.50	425.00		Unbilled
Apr 8/2018 1924420	prepare questions for technical	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	2.50	425.00		Unbilled
Apr 9/2018 1924423	conference; Lawyer: 57 8.00 Hrs X 170.00 attend technical conference for Union;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	8.00	1360.00		Unbilled
, 그 한 번에서 이 모습이 있는 것을 것을 것을 했다.	Lawyer: 57 6.50 Hrs X 170.00 attend technical conference for Enbridge and GEC;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	6.50	1105.00		Unbilled
	Lawyer: 57 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 review transcripts and prepare for oral hearing;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SE	1.00	170.00		Unbilled
Apr 15/2018 1925980	transcripts; review interrogatories and utilities' evidence; consider areas of questioning for hearing in advance of meeting with J. Vince and	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JA	CKIW	4.60	460.00		Unbilled
Apr 16/2018 1925718	R. Woon; Lawyer: 57 1.70 Hrs X 170.00 prepare for hearing re questions for cross-examination;	57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	1.70	289.00		Unbilled
Apr 16/2018 1925740	Lawyer: 48 1.40 Hrs X 170.00	48 Time	48	- JOANNA V	INCE	1.40	238.00		Unbilled
Apr 16/2018 1925983	meet with R. Woon and J. Vince to discuss areas of questioning for 2018 cap and trade compliance plan hearing; read email from J. Vince re time allocation for questioning; discuss same with R. Woon; discuss possible alternative areas of questioning with R. Woon; review utilities' evidence and consider alternative areas of	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JA	CKIW	1.40	140.00		Unbilled
Apr 18/2018 1926078		57 Time	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	0.40	68.00		Unbilled
Apr 19/2018 1926211	Lawyer: 48 0.60 Hrs X 170.00	48 Time	48	- JOANNA V	INCE	0.60	102.00		Unbilled
Apr 19/2018		57	57	- ROBERT W	OON SEI	1.00	170.00		Unbilled

Υ.

Page: 2

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Dec/21/2018	Fee / Time	Clien Workin	Invironm t Fees I ALL DATH g Lawye :	IS	Hours	Amount Inv#	Page Billing
	Explanation prepare questions for oral hearing; telephone call with J. Wilkinson re	Type Time					
Apr 22/2018 1926599	questions for hearing; Lawyer: 57 5.60 Hrs X 170.00	57 Time	57 -	- ROBERT WOON SEI	5.60	952.00	Unbilled
	and transcripts from technical conference; revise draft questions for						
Apr 22/2018 1927196		48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	2.00	340.00	Unbilled
Apr 23/2018	hearing; Lawyer: 57 1.40 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- ROBERT WOON SEI	1.40	238.00	Unbilled
	Lawyer: 48 8.50 Hrs X 170.00 prepare for, travel to and attend OEB	Time 48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	8.50	1445.00	Unbilled
Apr 24/2018 1927212	travel to and attend OEB hearing; meet	48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	8.00	1360.00	Unbilled
Apr 25/2018 1927562	review Enbridge application, transcript from technical conference, and transcript from oral hearing to consider and prepare questions for	57 Time	57	- ROBERT WOON SEI	2.20	374.00	Unbilled
Apr 26/2018	Enbridge; Lawyer: 57 7.00 Hrs X 170.00	57	57	- ROBERT WOON SEI	7.00	1190.00	Unbilled
1928609 Apr 27/2018	attend Enbridge cross-examination; Lawyer: 57 3.50 Hrs X 170.00	Time 57	57	- ROBERT WOON SEI	3.50	595.00	Unbilled
1931272	attend hearing by teleconference/web;	Time 72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	2.00	200.00	Unbilled
May 21/2018 1938182		Time	12	MBIN UNCKIW	21.00	20000	
May 28/2018	Lawyer: 72 3.40 Hrs X 100.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	3.40	340.00	Unbilled
1939582 May 29/2018	draft written submissions; Lawyer: 57 3.00 Hrs X 170.00	Time 57	57	- ROBERT WOON SEI	3.00	510.00	Unbilled
1939444 May 29/2018 1939590	review Enbridge and Union arguments in Chief; review DSM Framework; review hearing transcripts; draft written	Time 72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	3.40	340.00	Unbilled
May 31/2018		48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	2.00	340.00	Unbilled
1941218 May 31/2018	review and revise final arguments; Lawyer: 57 5.80 Hrs X 170.00	Time 57	57	- ROBERT WOON SE	5.80	986.00	Unbilled
1941263		Time	2	и 1. и 1			
				Unbilled: Billed: Total: Percent Billed:	116.20 0.00 116.20 0.00	18319.00 0.00 18319.00 0.00	
	***	* Summary	by Work	ing Lawyer ***		5	
Working Lawy 48 - JOANN 57 - ROBEF 72 - RAEYA Firm Total	Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % NA VINC 24.90 21.43 0.00 100.00 RT WOON 70.80 60.93 0.00 100.00	Total 24.90 70.80 20.50 116.20	<pre>% Bld 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00</pre>	Unbilled Firm % 4233.00 23.11 12036.00 65.70 2050.00 11.19 18319.00 100.00	0.00 0.00 0.00	Firm % Total 100.00 4233.00 100.00 12036.00 100.00 2050.00 100.00 18319.00	0.00 0.00 0.00
	*** (Summary by	y Respon	sible Lawyer ***	-	1	
Responsible 31 - JULIE Firm Total	Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm %	Total 116.20 116.20	0.00	Unbilled Firm % 18319.00 100.00 18319.00 100.00	0.00	Firm % Total 100.00 18319.00 100.00 18319.00	0.00
REPORT SELEC Layout TempJ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Date Range Matters Clients	Arch Filter None Y Liba Frid	a (Secur: day, Decer 1 (14.1.20 DATES 9	ity Rest mber 21,	2018 at 02:54:05	РМ		

Page: 3



File # EB-	Process: Cap and Trade Compliance Plans											
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Boar	Service Provider Name: Joanna Vince										
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Ye	ar Called to Bar 2011	1		P	Complet ractising/Yea Exper	rs of	Relevant		
	Articling Student/Paralegal				l							
	Consultant							Hourly Rate:		\$170		
	Analyst							nouny nate.		J 1/0		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		hod			HST Rate C	araa	d (ontor %).		12.0%		
	For consultant/Analyst.	_	ched HST Rate Charged (<i>enter %</i>): 13.0% <i>v</i> ided within previous 24 months									
			lueu		JUS 2	4 11011(13						
Statement of Fees Being Claimed												
		Hours	Но	ourly Rate		Subtotal HST To			Total			
Pre-hearin	g Conference											
	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
	Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Technical C	Conference											
	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
	Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Interrogate	ories											
	Preparation	1.10	\$	170.00	\$	187.00	\$	24.31	\$	211.31		
	Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Issues Con	ference											
	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
	Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
ADR - Settl	ement Conference											
	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
	Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
	Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Argument												
	Preparation	1.00	\$	170.00	\$	170.00	\$	22.10	\$	192.10		
Oral Heari	ng											
	Preparation	2.00	\$	170.00	\$	340.00	\$	44.20	\$	384.20		
	Attendance	8.25	\$	170.00	\$	1,402.50	\$	182.33	\$	1,584.83		
Other Conf	ferences											
	Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
	Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Case Mana	gement	0.10		170.00	\$	17.00	\$	2.21	\$	19.21		
TOTAL SER	VICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	2,116.50	\$	275.15	\$	2,391.65		



File # EB- 2017-0255 (Union Gas)			Process: Cap and Trade Compliance Plans								
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Boar	Service Provider Name: Raeya Jackiw										
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar 2018				Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience			Relevant		
Articling Student/Paralegal											
Consultant						I	Hourly Rate:		\$100		
Analyst							d (antor (/))		12.00/		
For Consultant/Analyst:			within previo	nus 2		large	d (enter %):		13.0%		
Statement of Fees Being Claimed											
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST		Total			
Pre-hearing Conference		ć	100.00	ć		ć		\$	_		
Preparation Attendance		\$ \$	100.00	\$ \$	-	\$ \$	-	ې \$	-		
Technical Conference		Ş	100.00	Ş	-	Ş	-	ڔ			
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$	_	\$			
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$	-		
Interrogatories		Ŷ	100100	Ŷ		Ŷ		т			
Preparation	2.85	\$	100.00	\$	285.00	\$	37.05	\$	322.05		
Responses		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Issues Conference											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Argument	1.10	<u> </u>	100.00	~		~		ć	407.20		
Preparation Oral Hearing	4.40	Ş	100.00	\$	440.00	\$	57.20	\$	497.20		
Preparation	3.00	ć	100.00	\$	300.00	\$	39.00	\$	339.00		
Attendance	3.00	ہ \$	100.00	ې \$		ې \$	-	ې \$	-		
Other Conferences		7	100.00	Ŷ		Ŷ		Ŷ			
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
Case Management				\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	1,025.00	\$	133.25	Ś	1,158.25		



Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Board Service Provider Name: Marion Fraser Vear Called to SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel Vear Called to Bar Practising/Years of Relevant Experience Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst - 38 For Consultant/Analyst CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %): Tor Consultant/Analyst CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %): Pre-hearing Conference Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Preparation 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Technical Conference 5 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories 5 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ -	File # EB-		Process: Cap and Trade Compliance Plans												
Ver Called to Practising/Vears of Relevant Experience SERVICE PROVIDE TV Experience Legal Counsel Image: Consultant Consultant Tendrik (enter %): State Charged (enter %): Stat	Party:	arty: Ontario Sustainable Energy Board					Service Provider Name: Marion Fraser								
Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst Image: State of Fees Being Claimed For Consultant/Analyst: Image: CV attached within previous 24 months Statement of Fees Being Claimed Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Pre-hearing Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Pre-hearing Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Pre-hearing Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Pre-hearing Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Pre-hearing Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Pre-hearing Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Technical Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ 1315.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ \$ - \$ \$ - \$ Interrogatories Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Issues Conference Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Interrogatories Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Image: CV provided within previous 24 months Interrogatories Im		SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Ye		_		P	ractising/Yea	rs of	Relevant				
Consultant Analyst Hourly Rate: \$330 For Consultant/Analyst: CV attached CV provided within previous 24 months HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0% Statement of Fees Being Claimed Kubtotal HST Total Pre-hearing Conference Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total Preparation 9,50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - - Technical Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories S 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - </th <th></th> <th>Legal Counsel</th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th>3</th> <th>8</th> <th></th>		Legal Counsel							3	8					
Analyst Image: CV attached cv attached vitin previous 24 months HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0% CV attached vitin previous 24 months Statement of Fees Being Claimed Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total Pre-hearing Conference HOurs Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total Preparation 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ \$ - \$ - \$ - Technical Conference Image: Statement of Fees Being Claimed Image: Statement of Fees Statement of Fees Statement of Fees Statement of F		Articling Student/Paralegal				•									
For Consultant/Analyst: CV attached HST Rate Charged (enter %): 13.0% Statement of Fees Being Claimed Hours Hours 24 months Technical Conference Fees Being Claimed Preparation 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -1 \$ -1 Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ -2 \$ - \$ -1 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -5 \$ - \$ -1 Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ -1 Interrogatories Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ -1 Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ -1 Interrogatories C C C C Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - <th></th> <th>Consultant</th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th>I</th> <th>Hourly Rate:</th> <th></th> <th>\$330</th>		Consultant						I	Hourly Rate:		\$330				
CV provided within previous 24 months CV provided within previous 24 months Example Hours Houry Rate Subtotal HST Total Pre-hearing Conference 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - <		Analyst													
CV provided within previous 24 months CV provided within previous 24 months Hours Houry Rate Subtotal HST Total Pre-hearing Conference 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$		For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched			HST Rate Cl	narge	d (enter %):		13.0%				
Statement of Fees Being Claimed Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total Pre-hearing Conference 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Technical Conference 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Technical Conference 9 \$ 330.00 \$ - <					within previo	ous 2		•							
Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total Pre-hearing Conference Preparation 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ -															
Pre-hearing Conference Preparation 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ \$ - \$ <td< th=""><th></th><th>S</th><th></th><th></th><th>Ū</th><th></th><th></th><th>T</th><th></th><th>Ī</th><th></th></td<>		S			Ū			T		Ī					
Preparation 9.50 \$ 330.00 \$ 3,135.00 \$ 407.55 \$ 3,542.55 Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ -<			Hours	Нс	ourly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total				
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -	Pre-hearin	-													
Technical Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ -		-	9.50	_			3,135.00		407.55		3,542.55				
Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories - - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference - - - - - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Proposal Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 42.90 \$ 372.90 <tr< td=""><td></td><td></td><td></td><td>\$</td><td>330.00</td><td>\$</td><td>-</td><td>\$</td><td>-</td><td>\$</td><td></td></tr<>				\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$					
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Interrogatories - - - - - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference - - - - - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Proposal Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 42.90 \$ 372.90 \$ - Oral Hearing - - - - -	Technical (
Interrogatories Image: Second se		-					-		-		-				
Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference - - - - - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Argument - - - - - - Preparation 1.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 42.90 \$ 372.90 Oral Hearing - - - - - - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - - Other Conferences - \$ 330.00<		Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Responses \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Issues Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - ADR - Settlement Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$	Interrogat	ories													
Issues Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ -		Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-		-		-				
Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - <td></td> <td>Responses</td> <td></td> <td>\$</td> <td>330.00</td> <td>\$</td> <td>-</td> <td>\$</td> <td>-</td> <td>\$</td> <td>-</td>		Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ ADR - Settlement Conference Preparation \$ 330.00 \$	Issues Con	ference													
ADR - Settlement Conference Image: Settlement Conference Setl		Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Preparation \$ 330.00 \$		Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -	ADR - Sett	lement Conference													
Proposal Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - <t< td=""><td></td><td>Preparation</td><td></td><td>\$</td><td>330.00</td><td>\$</td><td>-</td><td>\$</td><td>-</td><td>\$</td><td>-</td></t<>		Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Argument Preparation 1.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 42.90 \$ 372.90 Oral Hearing Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ 42.90 \$ 372.90 Oral Hearing Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - Other Conferences \$ 330.00 \$ -		Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-		-				
Preparation 1.00 \$ 330.00 \$ 42.90 \$ 372.90 Oral Hearing Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$ \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ - \$ -		Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Oral Hearing Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - <td>Argument</td> <td></td>	Argument														
Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - <td></td> <td>Preparation</td> <td>1.00</td> <td>\$</td> <td>330.00</td> <td>\$</td> <td>330.00</td> <td>\$</td> <td>42.90</td> <td>\$</td> <td>372.90</td>		Preparation	1.00	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$	42.90	\$	372.90				
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -	Oral Heari	ng													
Other Conferences Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$		Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Other Conferences Preparation \$ 330.00 \$ - \$		Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -	Other Con	ferences													
Attendance \$ 330.00 \$ -		Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-				
Case Management \$ - \$ - \$ -		Attendance		_	330.00		-	\$	-		-				
	Case Mana	agement					-	-	-		-				
							2 165 00	¢	450.45	¢	2 01E /F				

Date 1/11/2018 1/24/2018 2/20/2018 22/5/18 various	EB-20 Board File Number
Explanation Review of Evidence Drafting Irs Review of IRRs Review of ED - GEC Evidence Review of Transcripts Drafting Argument	EB-2017-0255 Cap and Trade Compliance Plan Union
Consultant MEF MEF MEF	npliance Plan Ur
Preparation 2 0.5 2	nion
Attendance TC	я
Attendance SC	Party Name
Attendance OH	0
Argument	OSEA
	Explanation Consultant Preparation Attendance TC Attendance SC Attendance OH Argument 018 Drafting Irs MEF 3 3 3 3 3 3 018 Drafting Irs MEF 2 3 3 3 3 3 018 Review of IRRs MEF 2 3 3 3 3 3 018 Review of IRRs MEF 2 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 5/18 Review of ED - GEC Evidence MEF 0.5 3

Appendix B

DOCKET