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ACTIVITY 1

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1012235

September 21, 2017
INVOICE: 18758398

DSM Mid-Term Review (EB-2017-0127 and EB-2017-
0128) (IGUA17-ON-OEB-1)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper
88/68204+ 0.20 lan Mondrow
89/68/2604+ 0.40 lan Mondrow
46/68/204+ 0.10 lan Mondrow
8204+ 0.20 lan Mondrow
1HE8R204+F 4.70 lan Mondrow
18/08/2017 2.20 lan Mondrow
21/08/2017 1.30 lan Mondrow
22/08/2017 2.10 lan Mondrow
23/08/2017 4.50 2.4 lan Mondrow
24/68/264+ 0.70 lan Mondrow
29/68204+ 1.70 lan Mondrow
3He8204+  3.90 lan Mondrow

Description
Discussion with S. Rahbar relating to recent discussions

with-Union-relating-to-industrial BDSMplans;eat-to-M-
Kitehen;

Discussion with S. Rahbar relating to IGUA approach;
Follow-up note to M. Kitchen relating to discussion;
Discussion with M. Kitchen and update note to S. Rahbar;

Review Procedural Order and note to IGUA relating to
brmissions-review-historical it I o

approach to submissions; discussion with S. Rahbar relating

Continue review of materials and consideration of IGUA

approach; drafting IGUA submissions;

Continue review of material and work on IGUA position;

Continue review of materials and formulation of IGUA
submissions; call with IGUA member;

Continue review of materials and work on IGUA position;

Call with Union Gas relating to LVC DSM and mid-term
review; update note to S. Rahbar; discussion with S.
Reahber;

Continue drafting IGUA submissions;
Continue drafting IGUA submission;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name

Mondrow, lan

Hours
22060 8.0
Total 2200 80

Terms: due upon receipt

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice

Errors and omissions excluded
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ACTIVITY 2 September 13, 2018
INVOICE: 18987292

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1012235

DSM Mid-Term Review (EB-2017-0127 and EB-2017-
0128) (IGUA18-ON-OEB-2)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2018-08-15 0.10 lan Mondrow Review OEB letter relating to Stakeholder Conference;
2018-08-16 2.80 lan Mondrow Review additional correspondence relating to Stakeholder

meeting; review status and scope of proceeding per DSM
Framework-related documents and produce working
summary of issues within scope;

2018-08-21 0.10 lan Mondrow Review and consider Environmental Defence letter relating
to additional stakeholder conference time;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Hours
Mondrow, lan 3.00
Total 3.00

Terms: due upon receipt
Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice
Errors and omissions excluded
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ACTIVITY 2 and 3

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1012235

October 18, 2018
INVOICE: 19000606

DSM Mid-Term Review (EB-2017-0127 and EB-2017-
0128) (IGUA18-ON-OEB-2)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours
2018-09-02 1.00
2018-09-06 8.00
2018-09-07 2.50
2018-09-11 0.20

Timekeeper
lan Mondrow

lan Mondrow
lan Mondrow
lan Mondrow

Description

Review additional correspondence relating to scope;
complete review of utility presentations; sort/organize

materials;
Attend Stakeholder Meeting;
Attend EC/ED presentation and discussion;

Review SEC proposal and comment on suggested
submission process;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name
Mondrow, lan

DISBURSEMENTS
Taxable Costs

Hours
11.70

Total 11.70

2018-09-06 Parking & Tolls - Local Travel
VENDOR: Mondrow, lan INVOICE#: 2746233609111604
DATE: 09/11/2018 Mondrow, lan, Parking at Ontario Energy
Board for attendance at Stakeholder Meeting. 09/06/18

2018-09-07

Parking & Tolls - Local Travel

VENDOR: Mondrow, lan INVOICE#: 2746233609111604
DATE: 09/11/2018 Mondrow, lan, Parking at Ontario Energy
Board for attendance at Stakeholder Meeting. 09/07/18

Total Taxable Disbursements

Terms: due upon receipt

Interest at the rate of 1.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice

Errors and omissions excluded

$19.47

$19.47
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ACTIVITY 3

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1012235

DSM Mid-Term Review (EB-2017-0127 and EB-2017-
0128) (IGUA18-ON-OEB-2)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

November 13, 2018
INVOICE: 19023896

Date Hours Timekeeper Description

2018-10-01 0.40 lan Mondrow Review submissions;

2018-10-02 1.10 lan Mondrow Continue review of submissions; draft brief submission letter
for filing;

2018-10-03 1.00 lan Mondrow Conclude review of submissions;

2018-10-05 0.10 lan Mondrow Review EGD letter of clarification;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name
Mondrow, lan
Total

DISBURSEMENTS
Taxable Costs

2018-10-02 Courier
BLIZZARD 1 Piece(s) 100 King St West --> 2300 Yonge St

Total Taxable Disbursements

Terms: due upon receipt

Hours
2.60
2.60

Interest at the rate of 1.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice

Errors and omissions excluded
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December 31, 2018
ACTIVITY 3 INVOICE: 19080432

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1012235

DSM Mid-Term Review (EB-2017-0127 and EB-2017-
0128) (IGUA18-ON-OEB-2)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date Hours Timekeeper Description
2018-12-03 1.70 lan Mondrow Review OEB letter and report and report to IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name Hours
Mondrow, lan 1.70
Total 1.70

Terms: due upon receipt

Interest at the rate of 1.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice

Errors and omissions excluded
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