


































 

 

 OLTHUIS 
KLEER 
TOWNSHEND LLP 

Our Bill No.: 7/23555 

 

 
Bamkushwada Limited Partnership 

c/o Biigtigong Nishnaabeg 

Pic River  ON  P0T 1R0 
 

August 31, 2018 

 

RE: Nextbridge/HONI Leave to Construct apps 
Our File:  74168 

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf in connection with the 

above named matter for the period August 16, 2018 – August 31, 2018, which include: 

Aug 16, 2018 Open file; emails to and from K. Kempton regarding  

; 

CE .2 

Aug 22, 2018 Deal with preliminary matters arising from Procedural Order No 1; CE .6 

Aug 28, 2018 Review IRS from NB and internal IRS to instruct re drafting ours; NKK .8 

Aug 28, 2018 Emails to and from ; meetings with K. Kempton and J. 

Mercredi regarding interrogatories; 

CE .7 

Aug 29, 2018 Review list of IR questions and emails from  and 

discuss with C Evans; 

NKK .3 

Aug 29, 2018 Talk to Council and email to C Evans re strategy and next steps; NKK .3 

Aug 29, 2018 Meetings with K. Kempton and J. Mercredi regarding 

interrogatories; 

CE .2 

Aug 29, 2018 Draft Interrogatories JTM 1.0 

Aug 30, 2018 Review our interrogatories and claim others interrogatories; NKK 1.8 

Aug 30, 2018 Revisions to interrogatories; serve and file interrogatories; CE 2.7 

Aug 30, 2018 Complete draft of interrogatories JTM 1.4 
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT 

OLTHUIS, KLEER, TOWNSHEND LLP 

 

 

Per:  _________________________ 

N. Kate Kempton 

E.&O.E. 

Accounts are due when rendered.  Pursuant to the Solicitors' Act, interest will be charged on any unpaid balance of this account from one month 
after the date rendered, at the rate of  0% per annum until paid. 



 

 

Bamkushwada Limited Partnership 

c/o Biigtigong Nishnaabeg 

Pic River  ON  P0T 1R0 

 

OLTHUIS 
KLEER 
TOWNSHEND LLP 

Our Bill No.: 7/23862 

 

 

September 30, 2018 

 

RE: Nextbridge/HONI Leave to Construct apps 
Our File:  74168 

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf in connection with the 

above named matter for the period September 6, 2018 – September 30, 2018, which include: 

Sep 6, 2018 Emails regarding IESO interrogatories and submission on 

Nextbridge's development costs; 

CE .4 

Sep 11, 2018 Review material and prepare argument in favour of Aboriginal 

participation and consultation 

JTM 2.3 

Sep 14, 2018 Correspondence re filings required before OEB; confer with J 

Mercredi re same 

LZ 1.0 

Sep 14, 2018 Begin draft of Argument-in-Chief participation and consultation 

submission 

JTM .4 

Sep 17, 2018 Draft Argument-in-Chief supporting NextBridges consultation and 

economic participation costs regarding Indigenous and Metis 

communities and organizations. 

JTM 1.4 

Sep 18, 2018 Correspondence re submission on NB costs; review and revise 

same; confer with J Mercredi re same 

LZ 1.4 

Sep 18, 2018 Review and revise written submissions; NKK .5 

Sep 18, 2018 Final edits on Argument-In-Chief in favour of NextBridges 

prudent expenditures. 

JTM .4 

Sep 19, 2018 Serve and file submission on Nextbridge development costs; CE .8 

Sep 20, 2018 Review Procedural Order No. 5; calls with K. Kempton regarding 

next steps and call with ; 

CE .1 

Sep 21, 2018 Prepare for and attend meeting   and 

meeting with C Evans re next steps; 

NKK 1.5 
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Sep 21, 2018 Meeting with  

;  

CE 1.4 

Sep 25, 2018 Meeting with J Ledoux and C Evans re next steps; emails; NKK .8 

Sep 25, 2018 Prepare instructions for associate taking over file; meeting with K. 

Kempton and J. Ledoux regarding instructions for hearing 

preparation; emails to and from OEB and parties regarding hearing 

schedule; 

CE 3.1 

Sep 25, 2018 Communications with Kate Kempton and Christopher Evans re: 

background. Reviewing documentation and preparing memo re: 

relevant evidence for examination of HONI's witnesses. 

JL 2.7 

Sep 26, 2018 Emails re hearing and next steps; NKK .3 

Sep 26, 2018 Emails to and from K. Kempton and J. Ledoux; CE .7 

Sep 26, 2018 Review of documentation on file & preparation of questions for 

examination of HONI's witnesses. Communications with 

Christopher Evans with respect to the context of this hearing. 

JL 6.3 

Sep 27, 2018 Emails to and from K. Kempton and J. Ledoux regarding 

; 

CE .5 

Sep 27, 2018 Drafting correspondence to Ontario Energy Board re: (1) concerns 

with respect to Hydro One interrogatory responses, and (2) 

Declaration and Undertaking for access to confidential documents. 

Communications with Christopher Evans and Kate Kempton. 

Continuation of work re: documentation review and preparation of 

examination questions for the hearing. 

JL 5.2 

Sep 28, 2018 Prepare for and attend on call with ; 

discuss next steps with J Ledoux; review and edit letters to OEB; 

NKK 1.4 

Sep 28, 2018 Drafting correspondence to the Ontario Energy Board re: hearing 

schedule. Legal research and continuation of work on drafting 

examination questions for HONI. Communications with Kate 

Kempton and . 

JL 10.8 
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT 

OLTHUIS, KLEER, TOWNSHEND LLP 

 

 

Per:  _________________________ 

N. Kate Kempton 

E.&O.E. 

Accounts are due when rendered.  Pursuant to the Solicitors' Act, interest will be charged on any unpaid balance of this account from one month 
after the date rendered, at the rate of  0% per annum until paid. 



 

 

Bamkushwada Limited Partnership 

c/o Biigtigong Nishnaabeg 

Pic River  ON  P0T 1R0 

 

OLTHUIS 
KLEER 
TOWNSHEND LLP 

Our Bill No.: 7/24128 

 

 

October 31, 2018 

 

RE: Nextbridge/HONI Leave to Construct apps 
Our File:  74168 

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf in connection with the 

above named matter for the period August 15, 2018 – October 31, 2018, which include: 

Aug 15, 2018 Meeting with L. Zimmerman and emails to and from K. Kempton 

and L. Zimmerman regarding next steps for hearing preparation; 

create new file; 

CE .7 

Oct 1, 2018 Review and amend questions for hearing; review procedural 

orders; emails; 

NKK 2.9 

Oct 1, 2018 Meetings and emails preparing for cross-examination; CE 1.3 

Oct 1, 2018 Continuation of preparation for cross-examination of HONI panel. 

Communications with the OEB re: the hearing. Legal research re: 

cross-examinations. Communications with Liora Zimmerman, 

Christopher Evans, Kate Kempton  

. 

JL 4.2 

Oct 1, 2018 Correspondence re information for cross examination; call with  

, confer with J Ledoux re same 

LZ 1.1 

Oct 2, 2018 Emails re hearing procedures and next steps; NKK .6 

Oct 2, 2018 Reviewing confidential documentation from NextBridge and 

Hydro One. OEB Hearing - NextBridge's cross-examination of 

HONI. Preparation of a compendium for BLP's cross-examination. 

Updating BLP's cross-examination questions. Communications 

with the OEB. 

JL 7.2 

Oct 2, 2018 Correspondence re LTC cross examination information LZ .3 

Oct 3, 2018 Hearing - cross-examination of HONI witnesses re: environmental 

assessment. Finalization of cross-examination questions and 

review of documents on file. Review of new documents on file. 

JL 6.5 
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Oct 4, 2018 Review emails; meet with J Ledoux re next steps in hearing; NKK .4 

Oct 4, 2018 Meeting with J. Ledoux regarding cross-examination  

; 

CE .2 

Oct 4, 2018 Hearing - Cross-examination of HONI's witnesses. Finalization of 

cross-examination questions. Updating electronic file. 

JL 4.3 

Oct 4, 2018 Confer with J Ledoux re  LZ .4 

Oct 5, 2018  and meet with C Evans re next steps; NKK 1.2 

Oct 5, 2018  meeting with K. Kempton 

regarding  and preparation for cross-examination; call with L. 

Zimmerman and ; 

CE 4.0 

Oct 5, 2018 Review and communications re: . JL .4 

Oct 5, 2018 Confer with C Evans re  

 

LZ 1.1 

Oct 7, 2018 Reviewing transcripts. Communications with Kate Kempton and 

Christopher Evans regarding cross-examination and following 

steps. 

JL .9 

Oct 9, 2018 Meeting with J Ledoux and C Evans re follow ups and next steps; NKK .5 

Oct 9, 2018 Meeting with K. Kempton and J. Ledoux regarding next steps; 

meeting with L. Zimmerman and call and email to  

; 

CE 1.2 

Oct 9, 2018 Communications with Kate Kempton re: next steps forward. JL .3 

Oct 9, 2018 Confer with C Evans re  

 

LZ .3 

Oct 10, 2018 Emails re cross exams and evidence; NKK .2 

Oct 10, 2018 Draft cross-examination questions ; emails 

regarding same; 

CE 1.4 

Oct 10, 2018 Review of documents and updating the electronic file. JL .3 

Oct 12, 2018 Review of upcoming emails from OEB parties and updating the 

electronic file. 

JL .3 

Oct 17, 2018 Legal research with respect to . Legal research and draft 

memo re:  

. 

JL 2.6 

Oct 18, 2018 Continuation of work re: transcripts review and  

. 

JL 1.1 

Oct 22, 2018 ; emails with C 

Evans; 

NKK .3 

Oct 22, 2018 Research for final submission; CE 5.0 

Oct 22, 2018 Drafting memo re  

. 

JL 4.2 
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Oct 23, 2018 Emails re preparation of BLP submissions; NKK .2 

Oct 23, 2018 Research for final submission; CE 6.4 

Oct 23, 2018 Preparation of final submissions - Reviewing material from the 

hearing. 

JL 5.9 

Oct 23, 2018 Continuation of legal research re:  

. 

JL 3.7 

Oct 23, 2018 Confer with C Evans re argument  

 

LZ .3 

Oct 24, 2018 Research and draft final submission; CE 10.8 

Oct 24, 2018 Reviewing material from the hearing. Communications with Chris 

Evans with respect to evidence. 

JL 3.1 

Oct 25, 2018 Review and edit/comment on BLP written submissions; email; NKK 3.0 

Oct 25, 2018 Review K. Kempton's revisions to submission; emails regarding 

same; 

CE .3 

Oct 25, 2018 Reviewing draft written submissions. Reviewing material from 

transcripts. Communications with Chris Evans and Kate Kempton. 

JL 1.6 

Oct 26, 2018 Revisions to submission; CE .4 

Oct 26, 2018 Finishing review of the material from the hearing. JL 1.9 

Oct 29, 2018 Draft submission; discussion with K. Kempton and others 

regarding ; 

CE 7.2 

Oct 29, 2018 Continuation of work on BLP's written submissions. Reviewing 

. Communications with Chris 

Evans and Kate Kempton. 

JL 5.3 

Oct 29, 2018 Discussions and emails with CE re  

 

; 

MM 1.1 

Oct 30, 2018 Call from C Evans (yesterday) re  

; review MFN submissions and HONI letter; 

emails; edit final submissions; 

NKK 3.6 

Oct 30, 2018 Revisions to submission; CE 6.9 

Oct 30, 2018 Telephone conference with  

. Continuation of 

review of transcripts material and draft written submissions. 

JL 5.4 

Oct 31, 2018 Revisions to submission; file submission; CE 6.6 

Oct 31, 2018 Communications with Chris Evans re: finalizing written 

submissions. 

JL .5 
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT 

OLTHUIS, KLEER, TOWNSHEND LLP 

 

 

Per:  _________________________ 

N. Kate Kempton 

E.&O.E. 

Accounts are due when rendered.  Pursuant to the Solicitors' Act, interest will be charged on any unpaid balance of this account from one month 
after the date rendered, at the rate of  0% per annum until paid. 









Peter Collins  

Booking status: Confirmed  

Porter confirmation number: Q7RRTZ  

 

within 24 hours of departure  

 

Boarding closes 10 minutes prior to departure so we can all depart on 

time.  

 

 

 
Tue 2 Oct 2018 

 
Thunder Bay, CA (YQT) to Toronto, CA (YTZ) 
 

 
PD 247  4:05 PM 

Thunder Bay, CA (YQT)  

Arrive at airport by 3:05 PM  

6:05 PM 

Toronto, CA (YTZ)  
Duration: 2hr 0min  

 

Seats: 9B  

 
Wed 3 Oct 2018 

 
Toronto, CA (YTZ) to Thunder Bay, CA (YQT) 
 

 
PD 472  4:50 PM 

Toronto, CA (YTZ)  

Arrive at airport by 4:20 PM  

6:54 PM 

Thunder Bay, CA (YQT)  
Duration: 2hr 4min  

 

Seats: 9B  

 

 

Passenger 

 Peter Wayne Collins 
 VIPorter Priority 6390010006 
  

Baggage Policy  

 

 

Checked baggage policy  

 
1st bag 2nd bag Weight fee per bag 

above 23kg 

 
Pay in 

advance 
Pay at 

airport 
Pay in 

advance Pay at airport 
 

Thunder Bay - 

Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

$0  $0  $37.50 - $43.13  $47.50 - $54.63  $77.50 - $89.13 

Toronto - Thunder 

Bay 
Flexible fare class 

$0  $0  $37.50 - $43.13  $47.50 - $54.63  $77.50 - $89.13 

 

https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/web-check-in?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d


If you have prepaid for your checked baggage and are traveling with a partner airline, please be prepared to present 

your itinerary at the airline check-in counter. 

See full checked baggage rules 

   

 

Carry-on allowance 

Your carry-on allowance is based on the fare you’ve purchased.  

 

Standard carry-on article Personal item 

Size: 40 x 23 x 55 cm (16 x 9 x 22 in) 

Weight: 9 kg (20 lb) 
Size: 43 x 16 x 33 cm (17 x 6 x 13 in) 

Examples: purse or laptop bag 

Thunder Bay - 

Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

✓  ✓  

Toronto - Thunder 

Bay 
Flexible fare class 

✓  ✓  

 

If you exceed your carry-on allowance or if your carry-on is overweight or oversized, it will need to be checked in for 

a fee. 

See all carry-on baggage rules 

 

Summary of Purchases 

 
Flights  

Thunder Bay - Toronto (paid) 
Toronto - Thunder Bay (paid) 

   
Checked bags  

Thunder Bay - Toronto Bags not added Add a bag 

Toronto - Thunder Bay Bags not added Add a bag 

   

Seat selection  
Thunder Bay - Toronto 1 reserved seat Upgrade seats  
Toronto - Thunder Bay 1 reserved seat Upgrade seats  

   Enhance your travel experience  

 Hertz Car Rental 
(See details)    

 

Fare Information 

 Air transportation charges $546.00 CAD 

 Taxes, fees and charges $141.32 CAD 
 

Total Fare Price $687.32 CAD 

 

https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/travel-information/baggage/checked-allowance
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/travel-information/baggage/carry-on-allowance
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://offer.hertz.com/offers/index.jsp?targetPage=FlyPorter.jsp&id=33871
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/booking-details?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
https://offer.hertz.com/offers/index.jsp?targetPage=FlyPorter.jsp&id=33871


 

 

 

Change fees 

 

 
Same-day changes* Advance changes* 

Thunder Bay - 

Toronto 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary  

$50 +/- fare difference 

within 45 days of departure  

 

+/- fare difference 

outside 45 days of departure  

Toronto - Thunder 

Bay 
Flexible fare class 

Complimentary  

$50 +/- fare difference 

within 45 days of departure  

 

+/- fare difference 

outside 45 days of departure  
 

*Change fees are per passenger, per direction, subject to availability and applicable taxes.  

Learn more about our fares and fees and conditions of carriage 

 

Day of Travel 

 Identification requirements  

 All passengers travelling within Canada are required to present one piece of valid government issued photo 

identification.  
See more information 

 Please click here for departure airport information.  
 

We look forward to seeing you soon! flyporter.com 

 

Rated top small airline in the world by Conde  

 

https://www.flyporter.com/en-ca/book-travel/our-fares-and-fees
https://www.flyporter.com/en-ca/travel-terms-and-conditions
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/travel-information/travel-documents/id-requirements
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/book-flights/where-we-fly/Canada/Thunder-Bay
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA
https://www.flyporter.com/en-CA/manage-flights/my-bookings/receipt?token=IFBxjYjXWH9Hpflcnv6T2Yk8RylWYnSK9n0%2bcrKqIDcWARfH7rB40wHRztAKhVnZU7rvFIpN3QdL7w5vzPUOCGnITGgceIB2zK4AAiYpHow%3d
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