February 25, 2019
VIA RESS AND COURIER

Ontario Energy Board
2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Re: Costs Submissions of the Métis Nation of Ontario for Participation in
EWT-LSL Combined Hearing, EB-2017-0182, EB-2017-0194, EB-2017-0364

We are counsel to the intervenor Métis Nation of Ontario (“MNO”) in the above-noted
proceeding.

In the Ontario Energy Board’s (“OEB”) Procedural Order No. 1, issued on November 29, 2017,
the OEB confirmed that the MNO is “eligible to apply for an award of costs under the OEB’s
Practice Direction on Cost Awards.”

The Decision and Order for EB-2017-0182, EB-2017-0194, EB-2017-0364, issued on
February 11, 2019, set out a process for the MNO to file its costs claims, requiring that it do so
by February 25, 2019.

Section 5 of the OEB’s Practice Direction on Costs Awards (“OEB Practice Direction”) set out
several criteria that the OEB will consider in determining a costs award, including that the
intervenor:

€)) participated reasonably in the process;

(b) contributed to a better understanding by the Board of one or more of the issues in
the process;

(©) complied with the Board’s orders, rules, codes, guidelines, filing requirements
and section 3.03.1 of this Practice Direction with respect to frequent intervenors,
and any directions of the Board,;

(d) made reasonable efforts to combine its intervention with that of one or more
similarly interested parties, and to co-operate with all other parties;

(e) made reasonable efforts to ensure that its participation in the process, including its
evidence, interrogatories and cross-examination, was not unduly repetitive and
was focused on relevant and material issues;

() engaged in any conduct that tended to lengthen the process unnecessarily; or

(9) engaged in any conduct which the Board considers inappropriate or irresponsible.



Throughout this proceeding, the MNO participated responsibly, and in a manner that reflected
the importance of this process to the MNO. As the MNO’s legal counsel, we attended all
technical conferences and hearing dates.

The MNO’s submissions were directly relevant to Aboriginal consultation, specifically with
regards to the Métis. At all times, the MNO complied with the OEB’s timelines, including filing
written evidence, a provisional compendium of documents for cross-examination,
interrogatories, and final written submissions and adhering to the time limits set by the OEB for
its cross-examinations. The MNO did not cross-examine all parties, but only those with
information and/or expertise that the MNO deemed important and relevant to its participation
and final written submissions.

The MNO was not able to combine its participation with that of others, since the MNO is
uniquely situated. It could not, like some other Aboriginal communities, participate as part of a
coalition. Similarly, the MNQ’s perspective and submissions, while there were some common
elements with other Aboriginal intervenors, were unique and tailored to the circumstances of the
MNO, as a Métis government representing two regional rights-bearing Métis communities with
traditional territories that will be traversed by the East-West Tie Project, and were informed by
the MNO’s unique engagement and experience throughout the designation process, NextBridge’s
development of the East-West Tie Project, and Hydro One’s development of the LSL Project.

The MNO engaged in no conduct that would unnecessarily lengthen the proceedings, nor did it
engage in any inappropriate or irresponsible conduct.

Please note that we have included certain costs in the “Other Conferences” category that did not
fit elsewhere but were critical to the MNQ’s participation. These costs include preparation for
and attendance at the development costs hearing, reviewing correspondence received by the OEB
after the hearing, as well as reviewing the Decision and Order, and debriefing our client on the
Decision and Order. It is our opinion that costs are all necessary aspects of the MNO’s
participation in this proceeding.

Further, pursuant to section 7.03 of the OEB Practice Direction, an itemized receipt for
photocopying disbursements cannot be provided as this is maintained internally, and receipts are
not generated. For an itemized list of the photocopying charges, please see our internal ledger
included as Tab 2 to this letter.

As such, on behalf of our client, we respectfully request the attached costs be awarded to the
MNO by the OEB for its participation in the above-noted matter.

Yours sincerely,

Mol

Jason Madden



Cc: Joanne Meyer, Chief Operating Officer, Métis Nation of Ontario (via email)
Robert B. Warren, Weir Foulds LLP, counsel to Hydro One Networks Inc. (via email)
Krista Hughes, Legal Counsel, Enbridge Employee Services Canada Inc. (via email)



Ontario Energy Board w
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS ——

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the
Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.
Rate: Country:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed™ {comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements” covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a compieted Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File# EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364 Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing
Party: Metis Nation of Ontario Affiant's Name: Linda Norheim
HST Number: 139398374RT0001 HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%
Full Registrant Qualifying Non-Profit
Unregistered J Tax Exempt ]
Other O
Affidavit
], Linda Norheim , of the City/Town of ToenA2
in the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that:

1.1 am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. | have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of

Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the

Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4, This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as

described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

e, RO S i

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Toronto i

in the Province/State of Ontario ,on 2S % s ggﬁ '
(date)
z " _) "‘IL

Commissiifier for taking Affidavits
L3 ¥
C \l\“"’\"s Q‘“M Page 1 of 14




Ontario Energy Board Fﬁ

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS e
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File# EB- 2017-0182,2017-0194, 2017-0364 Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Legal/consultant/other fees S 38,965.00
Disbursements S 2,499.26
HST S 5,390.35
Total Cost Claim S 46,854.61

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Metis Nation of Ontario

Send payment to this address: 66 Slater Street
Suite 1100
Ottawa, ON K1P 5H1
Attention: Jennifer St. Germain

Page 2 of 14



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-

2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364

Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Party:

Metis Nation of Ontario

Service Provider Name: Jason Madden - PST LLP

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE

Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal
Consultant

Analyst

(check one)

L
[
L

Year Called to

Bar
2002

For Consultant/Analyst: L] CV attached
] CV provided within previous 24 months

Completed Years
Practising/Years of Relevant
Experience

16

Hourly Rate: $290

HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 29000 (S - |S - $ -
Attendance S  290.00|S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation 1.00{$ 290.00 | S 290.00 | S 37.70 | $ 327.70
Attendance $ 290.00 (S - S - S -
Interrogatories
Preparation 0.70| $ 290.00 | S 203.00 | S 26.39 | S 229.39
Responses S 290.00 (S - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation $ 290.00 | $ - S - $ -
Attendance $ 290.00 (S - S - $ -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 29000 (S - |S - $ -
Attendance S 290.00 (S - S - S -
Proposal Preparation S 290.00(S - S - S -
Argument
Preparation 0.60( $ 290.00 | S 174.00 | S 2262 |S 196.62
Oral Hearing
Preparation 8.00| $ 290.00 | $ 2,320.00 | S 301.60 | S 2,621.60
Attendance $ 290.00 S - S - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation 0.50[ S 290.00 (S 145.00 | S 18.85 | S 163.85
Attendance $ 290.00 (S - S - $ -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | $ 3,13200[$ 407.16]$ 3,539.16

30f14




File # EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-05

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Process:

Service Provider Name:

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Jason Madden - PST LLP

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

2,235.80

290.65

2,

526.45

Courier

105.49

13.71

119.20

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

wnmnnnunnnnninninininininim

RS RV N BN BV, VLN BV RV N EVLS RV VL% BV RV, % VAN RV EVLY EV,%

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

2,341.29 | $

30437 | $

2,645.66

4 0f 14




Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-

Party:

2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364

Metis Nation of Ontario

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE
Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal
Consultant

Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst: L] CV attached

(check one)

L
[
L

Year Called to

Bar
1998

Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Service Provider Name: Colin Salter - PST LLP

Completed Years

Experience

Practising/Years of Relevant

20

Hourly Rate: $330
HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

] CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 330.00(S - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00(S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation S 330.00(S - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00|S$ - S - $ -
Interrogatories
Preparation $ 330.00|S$ - S - S -
Responses S 330.00(S - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation S 330.00(S - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00(S$ - S - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 330.00(S$ - S - S -
Attendance S 33000(S - S - S -
Proposal Preparation S 33000 (S - S - $ -
Argument
Preparation 7.80| $ 330.00 | S 2,574.00 | S 33462 | S 2,908.62
Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 330.00(S$ - S - $ -
Attendance $ 330.00|(S - S - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation $ 330.00|S - S - S -
Attendance $ 330.00(S$ - S - $ -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | |$ 2574.00[$ 33462 2,908.62

5o0f 14




File # EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-05

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Process:

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

i

Service Provider Name:

Colin Salter - PST LLP

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

wnmnnnunnnnninninininininim

nnunnnnninnninnnininn

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

-

wn

6 of 14



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-

2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364

Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Service Provider Name: Megan Strachan - PST LLP

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE
Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal
Consultant

Analyst

(check one)

L
[
L

Year Called to

Bar
2015

For Consultant/Analyst: L] CV attached
] CV provided within previous 24 months

Completed Years
Practising/Years of Relevant
Experience

3 |

Hourly Rate: $170

HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 17000 (S - |S - $ -
Attendance S 170.00| S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation 9.60/$ 170.00|S$ 1,632.00|S 212.16]| S 1,844.16
Attendance 6.50| $ 170.00 [ $ 1,105.00 | S 143.65 | $ 1,248.65
Interrogatories
Preparation 4.50( S 170.00 | S 765.00 | S 99.45 | S 864.45
Responses $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 | $ - S - $ -
Attendance $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 17000 (S - |S - $ -
Attendance $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Proposal Preparation $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Argument
Preparation 56.40( S 170.00 | $ 9,588.00 | $ 1,246.44 | S 10,834.44
Oral Hearing
Preparation 34.80| $ 170.00 [ S 5,916.00 | S 769.08 | S 6,685.08
Attendance 31.00( S 170.00 | S 5,270.00 | S 685.10 | S 5,955.10
Other Conferences
Preparation 3.80|S 170.00| S 646.00 | S 83.98 | S 729.98
Attendance $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - 1S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | $ 24922.00]$ 3,239.86 ] $ 28,161.86

7 of 14




File # EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-05

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Process:

Service Provider Name:

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

i

Megan Strachan - PST LLP

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking

Taxi

60.41

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

wnmnnnunnnnninninininininim

]
wnlnnninnmnininlnininlnlnlnlnln

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

60.41 | $

7.85 | $

68.26

8 of 14



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-

2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364

Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Party:

Metis Nation of Ontario

Service Provider Name: Charles Vincent - PST LLP

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE

Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal
Consultant

Analyst

(check one)

L
[
L

Year Called to

Bar
2014

For Consultant/Analyst: L] CV attached
] CV provided within previous 24 months

Completed Years
Practising/Years of Relevant
Experience

4

Hourly Rate: $170

HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Attendance $ 170.00( S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation S 170.00 (S - S - S -
Attendance $ 170.00 (S - S - $ -
Interrogatories
Preparation $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Responses S 170.00 (S - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation S 170.00 (S - S - S -
Attendance $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Attendance S 170.00 (S - S - S -
Proposal Preparation S 170.00 | $ - S - $ -
Argument
Preparation $ 170.00 (S - S - S -
Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 170.00 (S - S - $ -
Attendance $ 170.00 | $ - S - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation 3.201| S 170.00 | S 544.00 | S 70.72 | S 614.72
Attendance 8.90 $ 170.00 [ S 1,513.00 (S 196.69 | $ 1,709.69
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | $ 2,057.00[$ 26741]$ 2,324.41

9 of 14




Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-05 Process:

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

i

Service Provider Name:

Charles Vincent - PST LLP

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Other:

Other:

wnmnnnunnnnninninininininim

nnunnnnninnninnnininn

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

-

wn

10 of 14



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-

2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364

Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Party:

Metis Nation of Ontario

Service Provider Name: Alissa Saieva - PST LLP

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE

Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant
Analyst

(check one)

L
[
L

Year Called to

Bar
2018

For Consultant/Analyst: L] CV attached

Completed Years
Practising/Years of Relevant
Experience

1

Hourly Rate: $150

HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

] CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Attendance $ 150.00( S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Attendance $ 150.00 | $ - S - $ -
Interrogatories
Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Responses $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation S 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Attendance $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Attendance S 150.00 (S - S - S -
Proposal Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - $ -
Argument
Preparation 19.40( S 150.00 [ S 2,910.00 | S 37830 | S 3,288.30
Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - $ -
Attendance $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation $ 150.00 | $ - S - S -
Attendance $ 150.00 | $ - S - $ -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | [$ 291000[$ 37830]$ 3,288.30

11 of 14




File # EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-05

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Process:

Service Provider Name:

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

i

Alissa Saieva - PST LLP

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Quicklaw

41.80

Other:

Other:

wnmnnnunnnnninninininininim

]
wnlnumninnininlnninlnlnlnlnln

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

41.80 [ $

543 ¢

12 of 14



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-

2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-0364

Party:

Metis Nation of Ontario

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE

Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant
Analyst

(check one)

L]
[
L

Process: EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

Service Provider Name: John Wilson - PST LLP

Year Called to
Bar

For Consultant/Analyst: L] CV attached

Completed Years
Practising/Years of Relevant
Experience

Hourly Rate: $100

HST Rate Charged (enter % ): 13.0%

] CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total
Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 100.00 | S - S - S -
Attendance S 100.00 (S - S - S -
Technical Conference
Preparation 0.10{ $ 100.00 | S 10.00 | S 130 | S 11.30
Attendance $ 100.00 | S - S - $ -
Interrogatories
Preparation $ 100.00 | S - S - S -
Responses $ 100.00 (S - S - S -
Issues Conference
Preparation $  100.00 | $ - S - S -
Attendance $ 100.00 | $ - S - S -
ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 100.00|$ - S - S -
Attendance $ 100.00 | $ - S - S -
Proposal Preparation $ 100.00 | $ - S - $ -
Argument
Preparation 17.20( S 100.00 [ S 1,720.00 | S 22360 | S 1,943.60
Oral Hearing
Preparation 15.40( S 100.00 [ S 1,540.00 | S 200.20 | S 1,740.20
Attendance $  100.00 - S - S -
Other Conferences
Preparation 1.00( S 100.00 | S 100.00 | S 13.00 | 113.00
Attendance $ 100.00|$ - S - S -
Case Management $ 170.00 | $ - S - S -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES S 3,370.00 | S 438.10 | S 3,808.10

13 of 14




File # EB- 2017-0182, 2017-0194, 2017-05

Party: Metis Nation of Ontario

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Process:

Service Provider Name:

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing

John Wilson - PST LLP

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

Net Cost

HST

Total

Scanning/Photocopy

Printing

Courier

Telephone/Fax

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel (Other): |

Parking

Taxi

Accommodation

Meals

Other:

Quicklaw

55.76

Other:

Other:

wnmnnnunnnnninninininininim

]
wnlnumninnininlnninlnlnlnlnln

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

55.76 | $

7.25 | $

14 of 14



Legal Counsel Dockets in Support of Metis Nation of Ontario Cost Claim

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing
EB-2017-0182, EB-2017-0194, EB-2017-0364

Date

Lawyer

Action

Time

6-Nov-17

CS

Call with J Madden re intervention on Leave to Construct; meet
with M. Strachan re same; call to E. Gatien re instructions to
intervene; call to C. Burgess re same

1.0

6-Nov-17

M

Call with C. Salter re intervention on leave to construct; email to
C. Vincent re application to intervene in leave to construct

0.5

6-Nov-17

cv

Email from J. Madden re application to intervene in leave to
construct, email to M. Strachan re same

0.2

6-Nov-17

MS

Meet with C. Salter re intervention on leave to construct; prepare
application to intervene in leave to construct hearing at OEB;
correspondence with MNO re same

3.3

6-Nov-17

W

Review OEB rules re filing and service and obtain precedent for
notice of motion; draft email to OEB re request for directions re
service and filing; obtain login information for e-filing service;
review procedure for e-filing

3.9

7-Nov-17

MS

Call with J. Wilson re filing request for leave to intervene; finalize
application for intervention in OEB leave to construct hearing for
EWT Project

0.3

7-Nov-17

W

Call with M. Strachan re filing request to intervene; prepare
request for intervention for filing; file and serve same; prepare
hard copies for delivery to OEB; draft cover letter re same

2.6

13-Nov-17

CS

Review materials regarding Hydro One intervention application
challenge; call with C. Burgess to review developments

1.9

29-Nov-17

M

Review OEB order; instructions to M. Strachan re follow up with
client

0.3

30-Nov-17

M

Review recent case law on duty to consult and OEB statement on
limited focus of approval; review previous OEB decision re same
and applicability post Chippewas of Thames decision; email to
client re same

0.8

6-Dec-17

CS

Preparation for and teleconference with Nextbridge and their legal
counsel and J. Madden re intervention; debrief call with J. Madden
re same

23

6-Dec-17

M

Call with C. Salter and NextBridge re OEB intervention issues;
follow up call with client re same; review previous OEB decision
re Crown duty to consult; debrief call with C. Salter re same

23

5-Feb-18

MS

Review IRs filed and responses

1.0




Legal Counsel Dockets in Support of Metis Nation of Ontario Cost Claim

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing
EB-2017-0182, EB-2017-0194, EB-2017-0364

Date Lawyer | Action Time

1-Mar-18 MS Review OEB Procedural Order 2; correspondence with J. Madden | 0.2
re same

1-Mar-18 IW Review OEB procedural order number 2; review procedural order | 0.1
number 1

2-Mar-18 CS Call with J. Madden re OEB procedural order 0.4

2-Mar-18 M Call with C. Salter re OEB procedural order 0.4

14-Mar-18 | IM Review NextBridge filings re confidential materials and project 0.8
costs; email to client re same; discussion with MNO re
intervention related issues

16-Mar-18 | IM Discussion with M. Strachan re hearing 0.2

16-Mar-18 | MS Discussion with J. Madden re hearing; discussion with J. Tidmarsh | 0.4
re same

18-Mar-18 | IM Call with M. Strachan re hearing; follow up re same 0.4

18-Mar-18 | MS Call with J. Madden re hearing; follow up re same 0.4

21-Mar-18 | MS Correspondence re OEB hearing; call with J. Tidmarsh re same 0.2

26-Mar-18 | MS Correspondence with L. Norheim re OEB process; review 0.2
correspondence from Ontario to MNO re same; call with J. Wilson
re notices of application from OEB

26-Mar-18 | JW Monitor OEB registry re NextBridge application; call with M. 0.3
Strachan re notices of application from OEB

4-Apr-18 MS Review OEB Practice Direction on confidential filings; 1.0
correspondence with J. Wilson re same

28-Apr-18 | IM Meeting with M. Froh and MNO representatives re update EWT 0.5
leave to construct matter

30-Apr-18 MS Review OEB decision re confidentiality of certain NextBridge 0.2
evidence

30-Apr-18 W Review OEB decision on confidentiality for EWT proceeding; 1.1
prepare confidentiality undertakings for J. Madden and M.
Strachan

3-May-18 M Discussion with M. Strachan and J. Wilson re preparation for 0.5
upcoming Technical Conference
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EWT-LSL Combined Hearing
EB-2017-0182, EB-2017-0194, EB-2017-0364

Date

Lawyer

Action

Time

3-May-18

MS

Discussion with J. Madden and J. Wilson re preparation for
upcoming Technical Conference; preparation for cross-
examinations at upcoming Technical Conference; preparation of
declaration and undertaking re confidential material; discussion
with C. Salter re same

1.7

3-May-18

IW

Review upcoming hearing steps; review OEB registry for notice of
hearing; discussion with J. Madden and M. Strachan re same;
prepare undertakings for C. Salter and M. Strachan; draft email to
Board Secretary and deliver to J. Madden for review; file
declarations for undertakings with OEB; prepare hard copies of
same for filing; discussion with M. Strachan re notice of hearing

2.2

4-May-18

MS

Preparation of cross-examinations for Technical Conference;
review of evidence for same

2.7

5-May-18

MS

Preparation of cross-examinations for Technical Conference;
review of evidence for same

2.5

7-May-18

MS

Attendance at and participation in Technical Conference

6.5

8-May-18

MS

Review transcripts from Technical Conference; draft note to file
and client re summary of Technical Conference; discussion with J.
Wilson re Technical Conference

2.2

8-May-18

IW

Discussion with M. Strachan re Technical Conference

0.1

10-May-18

M

Debrief with M. Strachan re Technical Conference; discussion re
preparation for hearing

1.0

10-May-18

MS

Debrief with J. Madden re Technical Conference; discussion re
preparation for hearing

1.0

15-Jun-18

M

Meeting with client re status of hearing and next steps re same

0.5

15-Jun-18

CvV

Email correspondence with J. Madden and C. Salter re OEB
direction for IESO to analyze delay of in-service date for EWT
project; consult with C. Salter re same

0.3

18-Jun-18

MS

Debrief with R2CC re OEB process re LSL and EWT

1.0

26-Jun-18

Cv

Instruction from J. Madden re attendance at OEB hearing on
Nextbridge project development costs; consult with M. Strachan re
same

0.3

26-Jun-18

MS

Review Procedural Order No. 5; correspondence with J. Madden
and C. Vincent re same

0.2




Legal Counsel Dockets in Support of Metis Nation of Ontario Cost Claim

EWT-LSL Combined Hearing
EB-2017-0182, EB-2017-0194, EB-2017-0364

Date Lawyer | Action Time
27-Jun-18 Cv Correspondence with M. Strachan re attendance at OEB hearing on | 0.3
NextBridge project costs on July 5th and 6th; review OEB
procedural order re late intervention request and scheduling review
of NextBridge's Development Costs
27-Jun-18 MS Correspondence with C. Vincent and J. Madden re Procedural 0.2
Order No. 5; correspondence with OEB re same
4-Jul-18 MS Review correspondence from NextBridge including responses to 0.4
undertakings from the technical conference
5-Jul-18 Cv Attendance at OEB hearing re NextBridge project development 7.5
costs; draft note to file and email J. Madden and C. Salter re same
5-Jul-18 MS Discussion with M. Froh, J. St. Germain and J. Meyer re upcoming | 0.3
hearing; correspondence with C. Vincent re same
31-Jul-18 MS Correspondence with L. Norheim re update on OEB proceeding 0.1
14-Aug-18 | MS Review OEB Procedural Order 1; correspondence with J. Madden | 0.3
and J. Wilson re same
15-Aug-18 | MS Draft, review and revise update memo to MNO re OEB Procedural | 1.2
Order 1 and next steps
24-Aug-18 | IM Review draft IRs; email to M. Strachan re same 0.3
24-Aug-18 | MS Prepare MNO IRs; correspondence with J. Madden re same 0.5
25-Aug-18 | IM Review MNO IRs and provide comments re same 0.4
25-Aug-18 | MS Prepare MNO IRs; correspondence with J. Madden re same 0.5
27-Aug-18 | MS Review correspondence from BZA re request to file 0.3
contemporaneous interrogatories to Hydro One and NextBridge;
review Procedural Order No 2
28-Aug-18 | MS Review NextBridge IRs to Hydro One; consider potential MNO Irs | 0.7
29-Aug-18 | MS Review IRs of other parties; draft MNO Irs 0.8
30-Aug-18 | MS Finalize MNO IRs; review IRs of other parties 0.7
3-Sep-18 MS Review OEB Procedural Order No 3 0.2
5-Sep-18 MS Review OEB Procedural Order No 3; correspondence with J. 0.2
Madden re same
6-Sep-18 CS Discussion with M. Strachan re options for MNO submissions re 0.5
NextBridge development costs
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Date Lawyer | Action Time

6-Sep-18 MS NextBridge development costs; discussion with C. Salter re MNO | 2.7
submissions re same

7-Sep-18 MS Draft, review and revise MNO submissions re NextBridge 3.1

8-Sep-18 MS Draft, review and revise MNO submissions re NextBridge 2.0
development costs

10-Sep-18 MS Review NextBridge's submissions re development costs; draft, 0.5
review and revise MNO submissions re same

17-Sep-18 MS Draft, review and revise MNO submissions re NextBridge 1.3
development costs; review information requests to IESO

18-Sep-18 MS Draft, review and revise MNO submissions re NextBridge 2.1
development costs

18-Sep-18 W Format and finalize submissions on NextBridge development costs | 1.0

19-Sep-18 CS Review submission re development costs; emails with M. Strachan | 1.5
re same

19-Sep-18 MS Draft, review and revise MNO submissions re NextBridge 24
development costs; review OEB Procedural Order No 5; review
submissions of Hydro One and other Indigenous intervenors re
NextBridge development costs

19-Sep-18 IW Prepare book of authorities in support of the MNO submissions re | 7.0
NextBridge development costs; finalize submissions and
authorities; file and serve same; update distribution list as per OEB
procedural order No. 5

20-Sep-18 MS Prepare update to MNO re proceeding 0.2

24-Sep-18 MS Review IRs to Hydro One 0.3

25-Sep-18 MS Review IRs to Hydro One and NextBridge; correspondence with 0.5
OEB re cross examination timeline

26-Sep-18 MS Review correspondence from Nextbridge re Hydro One's 24
responses to interrogatories; draft letter re MNO concerns re same

27-Sep-18 MS Review Hydro One and Nextbridge's responses to IRs; prepare 2.7
cross examination for Hydro One and NextBridge

27-Sep-18 W Review and finalize letter to OEB for filing 0.3

28-Sep-18 MS Review Hydro One and Nextbridge's responses to IRs; prepare 5.7
cross examination for Hydro One; review correspondence from
OEB and other parties re confidentiality issues; call with other
Indigenous intervenors to coordinate cross examination questions

5
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Date Lawyer | Action Time

29-Sep-18 MS Review Hydro One and Nextbridge's responses to IRs; prepare 1.5
cross examination for Hydro One and NextBridge

1-Oct-18 M Review OEB submissions; discussion with M. Strachan re same 04

1-Oct-18 AS Discussion with M. Strachan re research for closing submissions; | 0.2
review email from M. Strachan re same

1-Oct-18 MS Preparation for cross examination of Hydro One panel; review 2.2
OEB Procedural Order No 8; discussions with J. Madden and A.
Saieva re OEB submissions

1-Oct-18 W Prepare compendium of documents; deliver same to M. Strachan 3.0
for review; revise compendium of documents; prepare hard copies
of same

2-Oct-18 MS Preparation for and attendance at hearing; prepare cross- 9.3
examinations for Hydro One panel

2-Oct-18 JW Prepare provisional compendium of documents for filing 1.2

3-Oct-18 M Call with M. Strachan re debrief from hearing and cross- 0.6
examination issues; review relevant sections of OEB hearing
transcripts re EA and Indigenous consultation

3-Oct-18 MS Preparation for and attendance at combined hearing; call with J. 5.8
Madden re debrief from hearing and cross-examination issues

4-Oct-18 MS Preparation of cross-examination of Hydro One panel; attendance | 10.2
at OEB hearing

5-Oct-18 MS Review transcripts; prepare, review and revise final written 3.7
submission on the combined hearing

9-Oct-18 MS Preparation for and attendance at OEB Hearing (via 4.2
teleconference)

10-Oct-18 MS Preparation for and attendance at OEB hearing (via 39
teleconference); draft, review and revise MNO final submissions
in combined hearing

11-Oct-18 M Debrief with M. Strachan re progress of OEB proceedings; 0.4
discussion re MNO final submissions

11-Oct-18 MS Preparation for and attendance at OEB hearing (via 5.1
teleconference); prepare, review and revise MNO final written
submissions; debrief with J. Madden re progress of OEB
proceedings; discussion re MNO final written submissions
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Date Lawyer | Action Time

12-Oct-18 MS Preparation for and attendance at hearing (via teleconference); 34
transcript review; prepare, review and revise MNO final written
submissions

14-Oct-18 AS Research, review, and note up OEB Act re powers to consider 23
Aboriginal rights

15-Oct-18 AS Email exchange with M. Strachan re research on consultation for 7.2
OEB closing submissions; review caselaw re same

16-Oct-18 AS Review case law re OEB's authority to consider Aboriginal rights | 6.1
and consultation re OEB closing submissions; draft and revise
memo to M. Strachan re same

16-Oct-18 MS Review memo from A. Saieva; prepare, review and revise MNO 0.4
final written submissions

17-Oct-18 MS Review transcripts; prepare, review and revise MNO final written | 3.0
submissions

18-Oct-18 AS Email exchange with M. Strachan re OEB hearing transcripts; 2.2
review same re submissions on Yellow Falls [2009, OEB] and
Hydro One [2012, OEB]; draft memo to file re same; call with M.
Strachan re strategy on closing submissions

18-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions; email | 5.5
exchange with A. Saieva re OEB hearing transcripts

19-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions; review | 4.1
transcripts

22-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions; review | 2.7
Argument in Chief of Hydro One and NextBridge

23-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions 3.9

23-Oct-18 W Review and format final submissions 1.8

24-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions 2.8

24-Oct-18 W Review and format final argument 2.2

26-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions 0.7

29-Oct-18 AS Email exchange with M. Strachan re closing submissions 0.1

29-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions; email | 2.9
exchange with A. Saieva re closing submissions

30-Oct-18 AS Discussion with J. Wilson re closing submissions; email to M. 0.2
Strachan re same
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Date Lawyer | Action Time

30-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions; call 3.7
with J. Wilson re same

30-Oct-18 JW Review and revise final written submission; call with M. Strachan | 5.2
re finalizing submissions and supporting documents; finalize final
submissions and prepare supporting documents; deliver same to
M. Strachan for review

31-Oct-18 AS Discussion with J. Wilson re final written submissions; review and | 1.1
revise direct citations re same

31-Oct-18 MS Prepare, review and revise MNO final written submissions; review | 6.5
submissions of other intervenors

1-Nov-18 W File submissions received from parties 0.4

2-Nov-18 W Review forms re confirmation of motion; draft confirmation of 1.3
motion

6-Nov-18 MS Review correspondence from Hydro One to the OEB 0.3

9-Nov-18 MS Review reply submissions of NextBridge and Hydro One 0.6

19-Dec-18 | MS Correspondence with MNO re update on OEB process 0.2

20-Dec-18 MS Draft, review and revise memo for MNO re OEB leave to 2.0
construct decision; review OEB decision re development costs and
next steps; correspondence with MNO re same

21-Dec-18 | MS Review OEB decision re development costs and next steps 0.7

7-Jan-19 Cv Request from J. Madden re attendance at conference call with 0.1
Indigenous intervenors in OEB proceeding; email to J. Madden re
same

8-Jan-19 Cv Email from J. Wilson re copy of December 20, 2018 OEB Order; 1.0
review same in preparation for conference call with Indigenous
intervenors

11-Jan-19 Cv Attendance at conference call with Indigenous intervenors in OEB | 1.0
proceeding

14-Jan-19 Cv Review email from J. Tidmarsh re OEB Order requesting NTE 0.4
price; draft email to J. Madden, C. Salter, and M. Strachan re notes
from teleconference with Indigenous intervenors in OEB
proceedings

16-Jan-19 CS Instruction to C. Vincent re draft memo to client 0.2

16-Jan-19 Cv Instruction from C. Salter re draft memo to client 0.2
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Date Lawyer | Action Time
17-Jan-19 M Call with C. Vincent re memo to client 0.5
17-Jan-19 Cv Call with J. Madden re memo to client; email correspondence with | 0.8
L. Norheim re same
Total 230.4




MARCH 2018 Cost per page
Black & White $0.30

JOB MODE ID PGS MATTER Client name Matter Name Conditional | Amount Color $1.00

Print |Black & White 1142 5 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $1.50

Print |Color 1142 1 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $1.00 $2.50




OCT 2018

Cost per page

Black & Wh $0.30
JoB MODE ID PGS Matter code Client name Matter Name Conditional| Amount Color $1.00
Print |Black & White 1142| 1027 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $308.10
Print |Color 1142 424 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $424.00 $732.10




Nov 2018

Cost per page

Black & White $0.30
JoB MODE ID PGS Matter code Client name Matter Name Conditional| Amount Color $1.00
Copy |Black & White 1142| 1027 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $308.10
Copy |Color 1142 425 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $425.00 $733.10




Dec 2018

Cost per page

Black & White $0.30
JOB MODE ID PGS Matter code Client name Matter Name Conditional| Amount Color $1.00
Print |Black & White 1142 1037 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $311.10
Copy |Color 1142 457 MNO-163 Metis Nation of Ontario OEB Intervention in EWT Leave to Construct Applications 1 $457.00 $768.10




Date Range Report Date
01/09/2018 - 30/092018 15/02/2019

SUMMARY BY CLIENT/USER/USER ID/DATE

CONTRACT USE TRANSACTIONAL USE

TOTAL
TIVE TRANSACTIONAL | TRANSACTIONAL | TRANSACTIONAL | BEFORE TOTAL
KEEPERID DATE ANDLNT ADJUSTMENT AIVK.XNT GROSS AMOUNT | ADJUSTVENT NET AMOUNT TAX | TAX* |CHARGES




19/09/2018|  $80.00 $32.16)| $47.84 . . $0.00| $47.84| $6.24| $54.08

Sub-Total: $80.00 ($32.16)| $47.84 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00| $47.84| $6.24| $54.08




Date Range Report Date
01/10/2018 - 31/10/2018 15/02/2019

SUMMARY BY CLIENT/USER/USER ID/DATE

TRANSACTIONAL USE

TOTAL
TIVE TRANSACTIONAL | TRANSACTIONAL | TRANSACTIONAL | BEFORE
KEEPERID DATE ANDLNT ADJUSTMENT AIVK.XNT GROSS AMOUNT | ADJUSTMVENT NET AMOUNT TAX

TOTAL
TAX* |CHARGES




1411012018 $42000  ($381.90)

15/10/2018|  $45.00 ($41.04) $000 $396 $0.50
$9.12) $088 $000 $000 $088 $0.11

frﬁﬁﬁrf




Page 3 of 3

Invoice date Apr 13, 2018
Account number e
Your invoice details Invoice number 437713885
Package Order
Date identification placed Shipped Shipped # of Billed Total
shipped number through from to pieces weight Service charges

Apr 6, 2018

331374070919 Web Ship- Acct# PAPE SALTER TEILLET ONTARIO ENERGY BOAR 1 Exp Env9 4115
546 EUCLID AVE 2300 YONGE ST Discount 412

TORONTO ON TORONTO ON Net 37.03

M6G 2T2 M4P 1E4 Fuel Surcharge 4.81

HST 5.44

$47.28

Your ref: MNO-163




Page 3 of 3

Invoice date Aug 31, 2018
Account number -
Your invoice details Invoice number 439020624
Package Order
Date identification placed Shipped Shipped # of Total
shipped number through from to pieces Service charges
Aug 30, 2018 331526553945 Web Ship- Acct# PAPE SALTER TEILLET ONTARIO ENERGY BOAR 1 Exp Env 10:30 25.70
546 EUCLID AVE 2300 YONGE ST Discount 5.14
TORONTO ON TORONTO ON Net 5056
M6G 212 M4pP 1E4 Fuel Surcharge 2.98
HST 3.06
$26.60

Your ref: MNO-163
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