SCOTT POLLOCK T 613.787.3541 spollock@blg.com Borden Ladner Gervais LLP World Exchange Plaza 100 Queen St, Suite 1300 Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9 T 613.237.5160 F 613.230.8842 F 613.787.3558 (IP) bla.com



Our File # 339583-000228

#### By electronic filing

February 25, 2019

Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli

Re:

Regional Planning & Cost Responsibility Review

Board File #: EB-2016-0003

Pursuant to the Board's Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards dated February 14, 2019, we enclose a Cost Claim on behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME").

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded by email only to rate-regulated distributors and rate-regulated transmitters as instructed in the Notice.

Please contact us if you have any questions or require any additional information.

Yours very truly

**Borden Ladner Gervais LLP** 

Scott Pollock

Enclosure

c. Rate-regulated distributors Rate-regulated transmitters Alex Greco (CME)

OTT01: 9529839: v1

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary

#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

- Required d	ata input is indicated by yellow-sha	A TAKEN SHEWARD THE SECTION	structions rmulas are present in the do	cument to assist	with the calculation of
the cost clair			р. сести п. с. с.		, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,
- All claims n	nust be in Canadian dollars. If app	licable, state	exchange rate and country o	f initial currency	
		Rate	:	Country:	9 "
However on Being Claime - The cost cla - A CV for ea process with	"Statement of Disbursements Beir ly one "Statement of Fees Being Cled" covering the whole of the party aim must be supported by a complet ch consultant must be attached ur the last 24 months.	aimed" and or v's cost claim s eted Affidavit aless, for a give	ne "Summary of Fees and Dis hould be provided. signed by a representative o en consultant, a CV has been	bursements  f the party.  provided to the	Board in another
- Except as p	orovided in section 7.03 of the Pra	ctice Direction	Process: Regional Pla		
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Ex	cporters .	Affiant's Name:		
HST Numb	er: 10807 5482 RT0001		HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%		13.00%
	Full Registrant		Qualifyin	g Non-Profit	
	Unregistered		•	Tax Exempt	
	Other	V		The second secon	
l, ·	Scott Pollock		_, of the City/Town of		Ottawa
in the Prov	vince/State of		Ontario	, swear or affi	rm that:
2. I have exa Disbursemen 3. The attack Disbursemen the Ontario 4. This cost of	resentative of the above-noted parmined all of the documentation in the Being Claimed", "Statement of the d'Summary of Fees and Disburs the Being Claimed" include only continued Board process referred to a claim does not include any costs for in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board process.	support of the Fees Being Cla ements Being sts incurred ar above. r work done, o	is cost claim, including the arimed" and "Statement(s) of Claimed", "Statement of Feed and time spent directly for the or time spent, by a person the	ttached "Summa Disbursements E es Being Claimed e purposes of the	ry of Fees and Being Claimed". " and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in
Su	O Ville			*	
Signature	of Affiant				ŧ
Sworn or	affirmed before me at the Ci	ty/Town of	Ottawa		
in the Prov	vince/State of	Ontario	, on		o, 2019.
A	of Ana	*		(date)	

1 of 2

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS wit and Summary of Foos and Disbursoments



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2016-0003 Process: Regional Planning & Cost Responsibility Re				
Party: Canadian Manufacturers &	Exporters			
Summary	of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed			
Legal/consultant fees	\$5,293.00			
Disbursements \$0.00				
HST	\$688.09			
Total Cost Claim	\$5,981.09			
Make cheque payable to:	Payment Information  Borden Ladner Gervais LLP			
Send payment to this address:	Borden Ladner Gervais LLP			
	Attention: Emma Blanchard			
	100 Queen Street, Suite 1300			
•	Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9			
Detail of	f Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed			
	Statement of Fees Being Claimed			
Statement of Fees being claimed	for Eligible Activity is found on the second tab of this workbook.			
	en e			
	ent(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed			
Statement of Disbursemen	ts being claimed is found on the third tab of this workbook.			

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



#### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

#### **Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed**

Name: Vincent J. DeRose		
	Completed Years Year Called Practicing/Years of Relevant to Bar Experience	
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: 🗹 Analyst/Consultant: 🗆	2001 18	
CV attached: 🗆	CV not required: ☑	
Name: Emma Blanchard	Completed Years	
:	Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience	
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: <a href="#"></a>	2007 12	
CV attached: □	CV not required: ☑	
Name: Scott Pollock		,
	Completed Years Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience	
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: ☑  Analyst/Consultant: □	2016 3	
CV attached:	CV not required: 🗹	
Name:	Consulated Veges	
	Completed Years  Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience	
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:   Analyst/Consultant:		
CV attached: 🗆	CV not required:	
Name:		***************************************
	Completed Years  Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant  to Bar experience	
Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:   Analyst/Consultant:		
CV attached: □	CV not required:	

	۵	#	ED	
T1	ш	#	ED-	

2016-0003

**Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS** 

P	ro	CP	22

**Regional Planning & Cost Responsibility** 

**Statement of Fees Being Claimed** 

10.70

**Party** 

**Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters** 

**HST Rate:** 

Vince DeRose

Scott Pollock

Emma Blanchard

13%

**Individual Whose Fees** 

are Being Claimed

				{activity 4}			
		{activity 2}	{activity 3}	Written			
	{activity 1}	Written	Preparation for	comments on			
	Working Group	comments on	and attendance at	Revised			
	(Meeting time <sup>1</sup> &	Proposed Code	Stakeholder	Proposed Code			
	Preparation <sup>2</sup> x 3)	Amendments	Meeting	Amendments			
	Eligible	Eligible	Eligible	Eligible			
	Participant	Participant	Participant	Participant			
Hourly rate	Up to 24 hours	Up to 20 hours	Up to 10 hours	Up to 10 hours	Subtotal	HST	Total
\$290.00	5.40				\$1,566.00	\$203.58	\$1,769.58
\$230.00	0.20	1.00			\$276.00	\$35.88	\$311.88

4.10

Totals:

\$5,293.00 \$688.09

\$0.00

\$0.00

\$448.63

Total legal/consultant fees:

\$3,451.00

\$0.00

\$0.00

5.50

\$5,981.09

\$0.00

\$0.00

\$3,899.63

\$230.00

\$170.00

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> Meeting time for Working Group – Meeting #1 (3 hours), Meeting #2 (6 hours), Meeting #3 (6 hours).

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>2</sup> Preparation & Reporting for Working Group – Up to 3 hours.

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Detail of Fees being Claimed



File #:	EB-2016-0003				
Process:					
Party:					
Name:	Vince DeRose				
July 11-16	Reviewing Board Staff PowerPoint; reviewing previous submissions re: TSC and DSC	2.1			
July 12-16	Prepare for and attend Regional Planning & Cost Allocation Working Group	3.3			
	Total Hours for Vince DeRose:	5.4			
	x hourly rate:	\$290.00			
	Total Fees for Vince DeRose:	\$1,566.00			

OTT01: 8700674: v1

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Detail of Fees being Claimed



File #:	EB-2016-0003					
Process:	Regional Planning & Cost Responsibility Review					
Party:						
Name:	Emma Blanchard					
Jan 14-16	Review letter from the Board; prepare and finalize letter of intervention	0.2				
Oct 9-17	Reviewing Notice of Proposal to Amend Transmission System Code and Distribution System Code and prepare summary for CME	0.3				
Nov 2-17	Reviewing summary of issues to be circulated to CME membership	0.2				
Nov 6-17	Review and revise submission letter	0.5				
	Total Hours for Emma Blanchard:	1.2				
÷	x hourly rate:	\$230.00				
	Total Fees for Emma Blanchard:	\$276.00				

### Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Detail of Fees being Claimed



File #:	EB-2016-0003				
Process:	s: Regional Planning & Cost Responsibility Review				
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters				
Name:	Scott Pollock				
Oct 31-17	Reading the proposed TSC and DSC changes from the Board	2.0			
Nov 1-17	Participating in intervenor conference call re: issues that might warrant comment by CME	2.0			
Nov 2-17	Summarizing the Board's report into a digest for CME members so they can provide instructions on areas of commentary	2.1			
Nov 6-17	Drafting CME's comments re: Board's proposals	4.6			
Feb 5-18	Attending Stakeholder Conference	4.1			
Sept 13-18	Reviewing the Board's revisions to the Code amendments	0.9			
Sept 17-18	Reviewing the amended revisions to the TSC and DSC in preparation for consultation with client	2.2			
Sept 20-18	Drafting comments on TSC and DSC changes; telephone call with client	2.4			
	Total Hours for Scott Pollock:	20.3			
	x hourly rate:	\$170.00			
	Total Fees for Scott Pollock:	\$3,451.00			

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed



File # EB-	2016-0003	Process:	Regional Planning & Cost Responsibility Review
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters	<u>.</u>	
Name of in	dividual whose disbursements are being cl	aimed:	

	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone/Fax	·	\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel (Other):		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		\$0.00	\$0.00
Taxi		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation	·	\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other:		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00