

PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

July 23, 2019

Ms. Kirsten Walli Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge St. Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 VIA E-MAIL 18 pages

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re:

EB-2018-0028 - Energy + Inc.

Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

Please find enclosed the Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) with respect to the above-noted proceeding. We have also directed a copy to the applicant as well as their counsel via email.

Yours truly,

Counsel for VECC

Cc: Energy Plus Inc. Sarah Hughes <u>—shughes@energyplus.ca</u> Counsel — <u>jvellone@blg.com</u>



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

		ated by yellow-shade					
- All claims m	nust be in Canad	ian dollars. If applic	able, state e	xchange rat	e and country	y of initial currency.	
A	11D - 1- 11 - 11 - 11	Int I	Rate:			Country:	
							aimed" and a "Statement of
		d") is required for ea					
		y of Fees and Disburs					ould be provided.
		ported by a complete					3 4 22
- A CV for each	ch consultant/ar	nalyst must be attach	ed unless pr	ovided to th	ne Board as p	rescribed on the Co	st Award Tariff.
Ev	cont as provide	d in cooking 7 02 of 4	h = Dun =4!== !	N	C	the section of the sections	would be a second and
EX	cept as provide	d in section 7.03 of t	ne Practice i	Direction on	Cost Awards	s, itemized receipts	must be provided.
File # EB-	EB-2018-0028	3		Process:	Energy + Ir	nc	
Party:	VECC			Aff	iant's Name	: Donna Brady	
HST Numbe	er: 13059 2	2405			нѕ	T Rate Ontario:	3.94%
		Full Registrant			Qualit	fying Non-Profit	V
					Qualit		
		Unregistered				Tax Exempt	Ш
		Other					
				Affidavit			
l,		Donna Brady	*	, of the C	ity/Town o	******	Ottawa
in the Prov	ince/State of	<u>O</u>	ntario			_, swear or affi	rm that:
1. I am a rep	resentative of th	ne above-noted party	(the "Party	') and as suc	h have know	ledge of the matter	s attested to herein.
							ry of Fees and Disbursements
		s) of Fees Being Clair					
							ed" and "Statement(s) of
							Party's participation in the
		ss referred to above.					
	The state of the s		ork done, o	r time spent	, by a person	that is an employe	e or officer of the Party as
		nd 6.09 of the Board's				31 5	53
			1				
5	<u> </u>	-	_/.				
Signature	of Affiant		/		-		
Sworn or a	affirmed befo	ore me at the City	/Town of		C	Ottawa	,
in the Prov	ince/State of	f (Ontario		, on	Tuly	22,2019.
	1					(date)	
	1						
Commission	15	- A (C.)			-		
Commission	onewtor takir	ng Affidavits					



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Process: Energy + Inc

			Trocess. Energy i me	Process: Energy + Inc					
Party:	VECC								
		Summary of Fe	es and Disbursements Being Clair	med					
Legal/const	ultant/other fees	\$	70,707.00						
Disburseme	ents	\$	34.65						
HST		\$	2,780.83						
Total Cost	Claim	\$	73,522.48						

	Payment information	_
Make cheque payable to:	Public Interest Advocacy Centre	

Send payment to this address: 2-285 McLeod Street

File # FR- FR-2018-0028

Ottawa, ON K2P 1A1



File# EB-	EB-2018-0028		Process: Energy + Inc					
Party:	VECC		Service Pro					
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Practising/Years Experie	of Relevant			
	Legal Counsel	7	1992	25				
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate:	\$330			
	For Consultant/Analyst:		ched ided within previous	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%			

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clai	med			
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$	5	\$
Technical Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	2	\$ *:
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	90	\$	-	\$
Interrogatories								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$		\$ 2
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	+	\$	-	\$ 3 # 3
Issues Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	140	\$	2	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$:#3	\$		\$ +
ADR - Settlement Conference								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$		\$ 5#1
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	120	\$	2	\$ (s =)
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(=)	\$	-	\$ N=3
Argument								
Preparation	1.90	\$	330.00	\$	627.00	\$	24.70	\$ 651.70
Oral Hearing								
Preparation	1.00	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$	13.00	\$ 343.00
Attendance	1.000.00	\$	330.00	\$	(=)	\$	-	\$ 25
Other Conferences								
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	-	\$ 1920
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	<u> </u>	\$:#E
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	740	\$	2	\$ (e)
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	957.00	\$	37.71	\$ 994.71

Jul 22, 2019 11:27:49

Public Interest Advocacy Centre

Client Summary

Date of Report:

Sort by:

Include Transactions: Jan 01, 1980

Jul 22, 2019

Jul 22, 2019

Alphabetic

Report by:

For Lawyer(s):

Working Lawyer

John Lawford

6721

1

6721

Page:

User:

7

Client Range:

Area of Law Range:

to to 199

Non-billable Time Excluded

Client #	Mat Client Name		Matter Description	Resp				
	Code			Work in Progress			Billed	
Date	N/B Description		Hours	Fees	Disb.	Hours	Fees	Disb.
6721	OEB EB 2018-0028		OEB	JL				
07/30/18	Drafting of respons to confidentiality claim of applicant.	e JL	0.80	264.00				
02/25/19	Drafting of procedural letter (reply to OEB staff of 22 Feb 2019).	JL	1.00	330.00				
03/29/19	Review of submission.	JL	1.10	363.00				
Tot	al Client:		2.90	957.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Gra	and Total:		2.90	957.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

John Lawford
Barrister & Solicitor
c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre
2-285 McLeod Street
Ottawa, ON
K2P 1A1

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

July 22, 2019

TO: VULNERABLE ENERGY CONSUMERS COALITION

c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre 2-285 McLeod Street Ottawa, ON K2P 1A1

Re: EB – 2018-0028 Energy + Inc.

Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

Cost Claim

For Services Rendered as Counsel in the above-noted matter.

RATE: \$330.00 per hour

July 2018 - July 2019

To: Review

2.90 Hours @ 330.00 per hour

957.00

HST @ 13%

124.41

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND OWING:

\$ 1,081.41

John Lawford # 869339663



File # EB-	EB-2018-0028	Process: End	rgy + Inc	
Party:	VECC	Service Provider	lame: John Lawford	

		ment of Disbursements Being Claimed Net Cost			Гotal
Scanning/Photocopy	\$	34.65	HST	\$	34.65
Printing	· · · · · ·	34.03		\$	-
Courier				\$	-
Telephone/Fax				\$	(#)
Transcripts				\$	1941
Travel: Air				\$	-
Travel: Car				\$	-
Travel: Rail				\$	-
Travel (Other):				\$	5章
Parking				\$	(+)
Taxi				\$	
Accommodation				\$	0.75
Meals				\$	-
Other:				\$	12
Other:				\$	(e)
Other:		*		\$	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	34.65	\$ -	\$	34.65

10: ACCOUNTING JULY 22-2019 PLAC FILE # 6721-ENORGY+ Me: PHOTOCOPION SCANNOR PLOASE NOIG AS & TODAY'S DASG THORE ARE 231 copies REGISTOROS ON PHOREOPIET SERVER MACHING 10: PSAC FILE \$ 6721 - ENERGY + INC. 231 40.15 = 34.65 HANK YON.



File # EB-	EB-2018-0028		Process: E	nergy + Inc		
Party:	VECC		Service Provider Name: Chandler Buchanan			
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Complete Practising/Years Experie	s of Relevant	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate:	\$100	
	For Consultant/Analyst:		ched ided within previou	HST Rate Charged (enter %):		

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Clair	ned		
	Hours	Hou	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ (2)
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ Ψ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	20	\$ Ψ.	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$,=:	\$ -	\$ 74
Responses		\$	100.00	\$	17.0	\$ -	\$ **
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$:=:	\$ <u>~</u>	\$ (=
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$:=:	\$ -	\$
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$ -	\$ I M
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	*	\$ <u>=</u>	\$ 18
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$ 120	\$ -
Argument							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	2+	\$ J=0	\$ ÷
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	1.20	\$	100.00	\$	120.00	\$ -	\$ 120.00
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ (#2	\$ <u> </u>
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ J=0	\$ -
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ 2	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	120.00	\$ -	\$ 120.00

Jul 22, 2019 11:29:51

Include Transactions:

Public Interest Advocacy Centre

User:

Page:

7

Client Summary

Date of Report:

Jan 01, 1980

Jul 22, 2019

Report by: For Lawyer(s): Working Lawyer

Sort by:

Jul 22, 2019

Chandler Buchanan 6721

to 6721

Alphabetic

Client Range:

Area of Law Range: 1

to 199

Non-billable Time Excluded

Client #			Matter Description	Resp				
	Code			Work in Progress		**********	Billed	
Date	N/B Description		Hours	Fees	Disb.	Hours	Fees	Disb
6721	OEB EB 2018-0028		OEB	JL				
02/25/19	Research	CB	1.20	84.00				
Tot	al Client:		1.20	84.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
Gra	and Total:		1,20	84.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00



File # EB-	2018-0028		Process: Energy+ 2019	Rates	
Party:	VECC		Service Provider Name	: Mark Garner	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	
	Legal Counsel			31	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate: \$330	
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	thed HST Rate 0	Charged (enter %): 3.9%	
		✓ CV provi	ided within previous 24 months		

S	tatement o	f Fe	es Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ (*)	\$ 974
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$ -	\$ 14
Technical Conference							
Preparation	1.5	\$	330.00	\$	495.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 514.50
Attendance	1.5	\$	330.00	\$	495.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 514.50
Interrogatories							
Preparation	17.0	\$	330.00	\$	5,610.00	\$ 221.03	\$ 5,831.03
Responses	2.0	\$	330.00	\$	660.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 686.00
Issues Conference							
Preparation	0.5	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 171.50
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	5 14	\$ 140	\$
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation	12.5	\$	330.00	\$	4,125.00	\$ 162.53	\$ 4,287.53
Attendance	10.5	\$	330.00	\$	3,465.00	\$ 136.52	\$ 3,601.52
Proposal Preparation	9.0	\$	330.00	\$	2,970.00	\$ 117.02	\$ 3,087.02
Argument							
Preparation	19.8	\$	330.00	\$	6,517.50	\$ 256.79	\$ 6,774.29
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	8.0	\$	330.00	\$	2,640.00	\$ 104.02	\$ 2,744.02
Attendance	3.5	\$	330.00	\$	1,155.00	\$ 45.51	\$ 1,200.51
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$:=:	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$. 	\$
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$ -	\$
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES		I		İs	28,297.50	\$ 1,114.92	\$ 29,412.42



File # EB-	2018-0028		Process: Ene	rgy+ 2019 Rates	
Party:	VECC		Service Provi	der Name: Bill Harper	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Complete Practising/Year Experie	s of Relevant
	Legal Counsel			39	
	Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate:	\$330
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Charged (enter %):	3.9%
		✓ CV provi	ided within previous 2	4 months	

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours		urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	# 0	\$ -	\$
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	(#)	\$ -	\$
Technical Conference							
Preparation	17.0	\$	330.00	\$	5,610.00	\$ 221.03	\$ 5,831.03
Attendance	3.3	\$	330.00	\$	1,072.50	\$ 42.26	\$ 1,114.76
Interrogatories							
Preparation	23.0	\$	330.00	\$	7,590.00	\$ 299.05	\$ 7,889.05
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	(8)	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(2)	\$ 2	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ ü	\$
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation	16.8	\$	330.00	\$	5,527.50	\$ 217.78	\$ 5,745.28
Attendance	14.5	\$	330.00	\$	4,785.00	\$ 188.53	\$ 4,973.53
Proposal Preparation	1.5	\$	330.00	\$	495.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 514.50
Argument							
Preparation	23.5	\$	330.00	\$	7,755.00	\$ 305.55	\$ 8,060.55
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	16.5	\$	330.00	\$	5,445.00	\$ 214.53	\$ 5,659.53
Attendance	4.3	\$	330.00	\$	1,402.50	\$ 55.26	\$ 1,457.76
Other Conferences							
Preparation	5.0	\$	330.00	\$	1,650.00	\$ 65.01	\$ 1,715.01
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$ -	\$
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	- 5	\$	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	41,332.50	\$ 1,628.50	\$ 42,961.00

34 King St East Suite 600 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File#
7/16/2019	2019017

Public Interest Advocacy Centre
Suite 1204
1 Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
K1N 7B7

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2018-0028

Project

Energy + 2019 Rates

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
7/30/2018	Argument Preparation	MG: Confidentiality submissions/review with PIAC	2.5	330.00	825.00
8/13/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	BH:	1	330.00	330.00
8/14/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	BH:	6.5	330.00	2,145.00
8/17/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	BH:	0.5	330.00	165.00
8/17/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	MG: Interrogatories - review evidence/notes	2.5	330,00	825.00
8/18/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	MG: Interrogatories - review evidence/notes	5	330.00	1,650.00
8/20/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	MG: Interrogatories - review evidence/notes - finalize	5	330.00	1,650.00
10/9/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	BH: Re TMMC Evidence	2	330.00	660.00
10/10/2018	ADR Preparation	BH:	4	330.00	1,320.00
10/10/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	BH: re TMMC evidence	2	330.00	660.00
10/11/2018	Interrogatories Preparation	BH: re TMMC Evidence	6	330.00	1,980.00
10/19/2018	Issues Conference Preparation	MG: Review and provide comments on issues list	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/1/2018	ADR Preparation	BH:	3.25	330.00	1,072.50
11/2/2018	ADR Preparation	BH:	4	330.00	1,320.00
11/4/2018	ADR Preparation	MG: Review interrogatory responses/prep for ADR/notes	4	330.00	1,320.00
11/5/2018	ADR Preparation	MG: Review interrogatory responses/prep for ADR/notes	8	330.00	2,640.00

HST #10160 6028

34 King St East Suite 600 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #
7/16/2019	2019017

Public Interest Advocacy Centre	
Nicholas Street	
Ottawa, ON	
(1N 7B7	

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2018-0028

Project

Energy + 2019 Rates

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/7/2018	ADR Attendance	MG: ADR Attendance Day 1- 9:30-4:30 pm	6.5	330.00	2,145.00
11/8/2018	ADR Attendance	BH: Split attendance time with MG	4.25	330.00	1,402.50
11/8/2018	ADR Attendance	MG: ADR attendance Day 2 - 9am-5:30pm	4	330.00	1,320.00
11/9/2018	ADR Attendance	BH:	7	330.00	2,310.00
11/14/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: Telecoference with parties and Board staff on next steps for ADR	0.25	330.00	82.50
11/15/2018	ADR Preparation	BH: Intervnor Meeting	1	330.00	330.00
11/15/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: Meeting at SEC offices to discuss ADR proposal and negotiations - re TMMC	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/16/2018	ADR Preparation	BH: Review additional materials	2	330.00	660.00
11/18/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: Draft letter of outstanding ADR issues - for intervenors	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/19/2018	ADR Attendance	BH: Conference calls - split time with MG	1	330.00	330.00
11/19/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: 3 teleconference calls on settlement agreement	2	330.00	660.00
11/20/2018	ADR Preparation	BH: Review materials from TMMC	1	330.00	330.00
11/20/2018	ADR Attendance	BH: Conference calls	2.25	330.00	742.50

HST #10160 6028

34 King St East Suite 600 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #
7/16/2019	2019017

Bill To

Public Interest Advocacy Centre
Suite 1204
1 Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
K1N 7B7

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2018-0028

Project

Energy + 2019 Rates

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/20/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: OEB Staff conference calls on ADR - various 3 calls	2.25	330.00	742.50
11/21/2018	ADR Preparation	BH:	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/21/2018	ADR Preparation	MG: Emails and teleconference between parties & Board staff discussing settlement	0.5	330.00	165.00
11/22/2018	ADR Preparation	BH:	1	330.00	330.00
11/22/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: ADR Negotiations by teleconference with parties and Board staff 9am-10am/11 am - onward	2	330.00	660.00
12/4/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	BH: Review draft	0.5	330.00	165.00
12/6/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	BH:	0.5	330.00	165.00
12/6/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	MG: Comments on Draft Agreement	1.5	330.00	495.00
12/11/2018	ADR Proposal Preparation	BH:	0.5	330.00	165.00
1/2/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH:	4	330.00	1,320.00
1/3/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH:	1	330.00	330.00
1/4/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH:	1	330.00	330.00
1/8/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH:	1	330.00	330.00
1/9/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH:	2	330.00	660.00
1/11/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH: For TMMC Witness	3	330.00	990.00
1/12/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH: TMMC Witness	1.5	330.00	495.00
		1			

HST #10160 6028

34 King St East Suite 600 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #	
7/16/2019	2019017	

Bill To	
Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 1 Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7	

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2018-0028

Project

Energy + 2019 Rates

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
1/13/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	ВН	1	330.00	330.00
1/14/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH: TMMC Witness	0.5	330.00	165.00
1/16/2019	Interrogatories Preparation	MG: Review revised evidence and develop interrogatories (2nd set)	4.5	330.00	1,485.00
1/21/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	MG: Prepare for 2nd technical conference - review interrogatory responses	1.5	330.00	495.00
1/22/2019	Technical Conf. Preparation	BH: Review written responses to TC questions	2	330.00	660.00
1/23/2019	Technical Conf. Attendance	BH: Split with MG	3.25	330.00	1,072.50
1/23/2019	Technical Conf. Attendance	MG: Attend technical conference 9:30am - 3pm - partial attendance shared with BH	1.5	330.00	495.00
2/11/2019	Interrogatories Responses	MG: Review undertaking responses from 2nd technical conference - start hearing prep.	2	330.00	660.00
2/20/2019	Interrogatories Preparation	BH: TMMC revised evidence	5	330.00	1,650.00
2/23/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH: Response to Staff letter re scope	0.5	330.00	165.00
2/25/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH: Staff Letter & Cross Prep	3.5	330.00	1,155.00
2/26/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH:	2.5	330.00	825.00
3/2/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH: Review TMMC IR Responses/Hrg Prep	4	330.00	1,320.00

HST #10160 6028

34 King St East Suite 600 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #		
7/16/2019	2019017		

Bill To	
Public Interest Advocacy Centre Suite 1204 1 Nicholas Street Ottawa, ON K1N 7B7	

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2018-0028

D	ra	10	2
	10	ıe	GL

Energy + 2019 Rates

Serviced	Item	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
3/3/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH:	1	330.00	330.00
3/4/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH: Meet with Mark Rdiscuss cross	2.5	330.00	825.00
3/5/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH:	0.5	330.00	165.00
3/6/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	BH:	2	330.00	660.00
3/6/2019	Oral Hearing Preparation	MG: Prepare for hearing - cross examination notes - discuss with PIAC-VECC	8	330.00	2,640.00
3/7/2019	Oral Hearing Attendance	MG: Hearing attendance Day 1 9:30-4:30 and prepartion prior to start.	3.5	330.00	1,155.00
3/8/2019	Oral Hearing Attendance	BH:	4.25	330.00	1,402.50
3/18/2019	Argument Preparation	BH:	7	330.00	2,310.00
3/19/2019	Argument Preparation	BH:	5.5	330.00	1,815.00
3/20/2019	Argument Preparation	BH:	2	330.00	660.00
3/21/2019	Argument Preparation	BH:	2	330.00	660.00
3/26/2019	Argument Preparation	MG: Review transcripts and develop argument draft and outline for PIAC review	5	330.00	1,650.00
3/27/2019	Argument Preparation	MG: Review argument with PIAC-VECC/edit changes	1.5	330.00	495.00
3/28/2019	Argument Preparation	MG: Argument 2nd draft	6	330.00	1,980.00

HST #10160 6028

34 King St East Suite 600 Toronto, Ontario M5C 2X8

Statement of Costs

Date	File #	
7/16/2019	2019017	

Bill To

Public Interest Advocacy Centre
Suite 1204
1 Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
K1N 7B7

Terms	Docket No.
Net 30	EB-2018-0028

Project Energy + 2019 Rates Hours Rate Amount Serviced Description Item 1,567.50 330.00 4.75 3/29/2019 Argument Preparation MG: Finalize argument incorporate BH sections and file. 330.00 990.00 3/30/2019 BH: Review Parties Arguments 3 Argument Preparation 990.00 3 330.00 4/1/2019 Argument Preparation BH: Discuss Issues with Mark R./Draft Reply 330.00 330.00 4/3/2019 Argument Preparation BH: Draft Reply Other Conf. Preparation 1.5 330.00 495.00 6/30/2019 Review Draft Rate Order 990.00 7/1/2019 Other Conf. Preparation Reveiw Draft Rate Order 330.00 0.5 165.00 7/9/2019 Other Conf. Preparation Review DRO 330.00 9,051.90 13.00% HST on Sales HST #10160 6028 \$9,051.90 Total \$78,681.90