

Direct Dial: File: 416.862.4825 7188

Sent by Electronic Mail & RESS Filing

July 23, 2019

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Kirsten Walli, Board Secretary

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association - Cost Claim

Board File No. EB-2017-0049

Please find enclosed the Ontario Sustainable Energy Association's ("OSEA") late cost claim for its contribution in the above-noted proceedings. OSEA apologizes for the late filing of its cost claim and respectively requests that the Board consider OSEA's cost claim.

OSEA was granted intervenor status and cost award eligibility in this proceeding pursuant to the Board's decision dated November 2, 2017. OSEA was an active participant in this proceeding. OSEA filed interrogatories, attended at the oral hearing and asked questions of various panels, and filed written reply submissions.

In late May 2019, OSEA prepared its cost claim for filing. OSEA did not file its cost claim at that time as there was not yet a procedural order issued requiring intervenors to file their cost claims. OSEA was waiting for the procedural order to file its cost claim.

One of the two lawyers on record for OSEA in this proceeding has been on maternity leave this year (Joanna Vince). The other of the two lawyers on record (Robert Woon) left our firm. The lawyers that took over management of the file (Matt Gardner and Victoria Chai) were not on the distribution list and did not receive the interim rate order issued on June 11, 2019 inviting intervenors to file cost claims. Our legal assistant (Swaberene Baksh) spoke with the OEB in May 2019 to ask when the OEB anticipated issuing an order to submit cost claims in this proceeding and was told that the OEB had not yet issued an order. We reviewed our records and confirm that the interim rate order was sent to Robert Woon's former email address; however, inadvertently, the interim rate order was not then forwarded to Mr. Gardner or Ms. Chai.

Oltawa



For the reasons above, we respectively request that the Board consider OSEA's cost claim (enclosed).

Yours truly,

Matt Gardner

Encl.

cc:

Hydro One Networks Inc.

Marion Fraser, Fraser & Company

client

Mat F. Gil

Document #: 1572739



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

					nstructions		riff in					
- All claims m - A separate ' Disbursemen However, onl - The cost cla - A CV for each	Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations. All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency. Rate: Country: A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff. Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.											
File # EB-	2017	-0049			Process:	Distribution	Rates					
Party:	Ontai	rio Sustain	able Energy Bo	ard	Aff	iant's Name:	Matthew	Gardner				
HST Numbe	r:	11362798	8RT0001		:	HST	Rate Onta	ario: 13.00%	<u>√</u>			
		Fı	ull Registrant Unregistered Other				ing Non-P Tax Exe	rofit \Box				
					Affidavit	A TOTAL ST	r 15.00		<u> </u>			
l,			att Gardner		, of the Ci	ty/Town of		Burlingt				
in the Prov	ince/	State of	0	ntario			, swear c	or affirm that:	7 10 10			
2. I have example Being Claimer 3. The attach Disbursemen Ontario Energy 4. This cost cl	mined a d", "Sta ed "Su ts Bein gy Boa aim do section	all of the do atement(s) of mmary of Fe ig Claimed" in ord process re pes not incluses 6.05 and 6	of Fees Being Clai ees and Disburser	upport of this med" and "St ments Being (s incurred and work done, or	cost claim, atement(s) c Claimed", "St d time spent r time spent,	including the a of Disbursemer atement(s) of directly for the by a person th	ttached "Sints Being Cl Fees Being e purposes	ummary of Fees aimed". Claimed" and "S of the Party's pa	and Disbursements Statement(s) of articipation in the			
Sworn or a	ffirm	ed before	me at the City	//Town of		Tor	onto		.			
in the Prov				Ontario Ontario		, on	July	23, 2019 (date)	<u>.</u> .			



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Commissioner for taking Affidavits Coule Vargas, a Commissioner, etc.,
Province of Ontario, for

Willims & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP.

Expires March 1, 2022. 2017-0049 File # EB-

Process: Distribution Rates

Party:

Ontario Sustainable Energy Board

The second secon	Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed											
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	31,461.00										
Disbursements	\$	511.50										
HST	\$	4,156.43										
Total Cost Claim	\$	36,128.93										

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Send payment to this address: 1 Toronto Street

Suite 900

Toronto, ON M5C 2V6



File # EB-	2017-0049		Process: L	Process: Distribution Rates								
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Board		Service Pro	ovider Name:	Robert Woon							
				Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant						
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	ck one)	Bar		Experience						
	Legal Counsel		7	2014		4						
	Articling Student/Paralegal											
	Consultant					Hourly Rate: \$170						
	Analyst											
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV atta	ached	HST Rate Ch	narged (enter %): 13.0%						
			CV pro	vided within previou	s 24 months							

St.	atement o	of Fe	ees Being	Clai	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	2	\$ -	\$
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	2	\$ 747	\$:#%
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$ (⊕ (\$
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 100	\$ 2)
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	<u> </u>	\$ (4)	\$; <u>~</u> ;
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	2	\$ 72	\$:=:
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$ (€	\$
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ ie.	\$ *
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	2	\$ NΣi	\$ (a)
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	÷	\$ 22	\$ æ
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$: (#	\$ (#0)
Argument							
Preparation	3.10	\$	170.00	\$	527.00	\$ 68.51	\$ 595.51
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	6.90	\$	170.00	\$	1,173.00	\$ 152.49	\$ 1,325.49
Attendance	14.10	\$	170.00	\$	2,397.00	\$ 311.61	\$ 2,708.61
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	8	\$ 18:	\$ ~
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	5	\$ i.e.	\$ -
Case Management	4.60		170.00	\$	782.00	\$ 101.66	\$ 883.66
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	4,879.00	\$ 634.27	\$ 5,513.27



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2017-0049	Process:	Distribution Rates	
	0			

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Boai Service Provider Name: Robert Woon

	atement of Disburseme	Net Cost	HST	Total	
Scanning/Photocopy	\$	511.50	\$ 66.50	\$	578.00
Printing			\$ 	\$	*
Courier			\$ 2	\$	180
Telephone/Fax			\$ *	\$	
Transcripts			\$ =	\$	ė
Travel: Air			\$ 	\$	黨
Travel: Car			\$ 0	\$	141
Travel: Rail			\$ ×	\$	360
Travel (Other):			\$ *	\$	
Parking			\$ #:	\$	*
Taxi			\$ -	\$	-
Accommodation			\$ ш	\$	(#)
Meals			\$ ¥	\$	(*)
Other:			\$ ×	\$	
Other:			\$ 5	\$	•
Other:			\$	\$	**************************************
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	511.50	\$ 66.50	\$	578.00



File # EB-	2017-0049		Process: _L	Distribution Ra	tes			
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Board		Service Pro	ovider Name:	Joanna Vince	e		
				Year Called to		Completed \ Practising/Years of		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	eck one)	Bar		Experien	ce	
	Legal Counsel		V	2011	ĺ	7		
	Articling Student/Paralegal							
	Consultant					Hourly Rate:	\$170	
	Analyst					1,9		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV att	ached	HST Rate Ch	narged (enter %):	13.0%	
	Ţ		CV pro	ovided within previou	is 24 months			

St	atement o	f Fe	ees Being	Clai	med	3	
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 原	\$ 1 = 1
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	9	\$ Ħ	\$ (7 <u>5</u>)
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$ -	\$
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 5	\$ i a
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	91	\$ =	\$:
Responses	0.60	\$	170.00	\$	102.00	\$ 13.26	\$ 115.26
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	i#/	\$ 	\$ (<u>4</u>)
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(Z/)	\$ ä	\$ 3 2
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	s≆ē	\$ ¥	\$ 180
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	563.	\$ *	\$ 15
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 	\$
Argument							
Preparation	1.80	\$	170.00	\$	306.00	\$ 39.78	\$ 345.78
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	2.90	\$	170.00	\$	493.00	\$ 64.09	\$ 557.09
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(#)	\$ -	\$ =
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	270	\$ 	\$
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$ = =	\$ -
Case Management			170.00	\$	14	\$ 5	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	901.00	\$ 117.13	\$ 1,018.13



File # EB-	2017-0049		Process: 1	Process: Distribution Rates								
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Board	d	Service Pr	ovider Name:	Victoria Chai							
			Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant							
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	eck one) Bar		Experience							
	Legal Counsel		2017		2							
	Articling Student/Paralegal											
	Consultant				Hourly Rate: \$170							
	Analyst				*							
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attached	HST Rate Ch	harged (enter %): 13.0%							
			CV provided within previou	us 24 months								

St	atement o	f Fe	es Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ <u> </u>	\$ iæ:
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	#	\$ Ħ	\$ 3 5 2
Technical Conference							
Preparation	6.40	\$	170.00	\$	1,088.00	\$ 141.44	\$ 1,229.44
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 7	\$ (/ <u>A</u> s
Interrogatories							
Preparation	19.40	\$	170.00	\$	3,298.00	\$ 428.74	\$ 3,726.74
Responses	6.80	\$	170.00	\$	1,156.00	\$ 150.28	\$ 1,306.28
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	9.0	\$	\$ 髪
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(9)	\$ Ä	\$ V ₂₀
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	#¥d	\$ -	\$ (₩
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	(4)	\$ ×	\$ 18
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$		\$ 	\$ 1475
Argument							
Preparation	17.80	\$	170.00	\$	3,026.00	\$ 393.38	\$ 3,419.38
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	27.00	\$	170.00	\$	4,590.00	\$ 596.70	\$ 5,186.70
Attendance	3.50	\$	170.00	\$	595.00	\$ 77.35	\$ 672.35
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	770	\$ - 8	\$ ¥
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	*	\$ <u> </u>	\$ ÷.
Case Management	8.40	L	170.00	\$	1,428.00	\$ 185.64	\$ 1,613.64
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	15,181.00	\$ 1,973.53	\$ 17,154.53



File # EB-	2017-0049		Process: Distribution Ro	ates
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Boar	d	Service Provider Name:	Raeya Jackiw
			Year Called to	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	eck one) Bar	Experience
	Legal Counsel		2018	1
	Articling Student/Paralegal			
	Consultant			Hourly Rate: \$100
	Analyst			
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attached HST Rate C	harged (<i>enter</i> %): 13.0%
			CV provided within previous 24 months	16

St	atement o	of Fe	ees Being	Clai	med		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	S	ubtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	(2)	\$ 200	\$ 2
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	84	\$ ==:	\$ 181
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	75	\$ *	\$ The state of the s
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ 7=1	\$ ¥-
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	1724	\$ 121	\$ ⊞ 7
Responses	4.40	\$	100.00	\$	440.00	\$ 57.20	\$ 497.20
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$		\$ 	\$ 30
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$, e	\$ -	\$ 20
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	(2)	\$ i i i	\$ 3
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	- 22	\$ (=)	\$ 20
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	i e	\$ 	\$ 2 9
Argument							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ - 18	\$ 543
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$ (#)	\$ (#I)
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	26	\$ 2,45	\$ 273
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	2)	\$ 874	\$ 20
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	×	\$ E	\$ 140
Case Management	1.60		100.00	\$	160.00	\$ 20.80	\$ 180.80
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	600.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 678.00



File # EB-	2017-0049		Process: Distribution Rates						
Party:	Ontario Sustainable Energy Board			Service Provi	der Name:	Marion Fraser			
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	eck one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience				
	Legal Counsel					38			
	Articling Student/Paralegal								
	Consultant		V			Hourly Rate: \$330			
	Analyst								
	For Consultant/Analyst: 🔲 CV at		CV atta	ched	HST Rate Ch	narged (<i>enter</i> %): 13.0%			
			CV prov	vided within previous 24	4 months	<u></u>			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed											
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total		
Pre-hearing Conference											
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	#X	\$	3		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	*	\$	*	\$	2		
Technical Conference											
Preparation	11.00	\$	330.00	\$	3,630.00	\$	471.90	\$	4,101.90		
Attendance	19.00	\$	330.00	\$	6,270.00	\$	815.10	\$	7,085.10		
Interrogatories											
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	100	\$	970	\$	-		
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	F	\$	9	\$	ш.		
Issues Conference							1				
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(94)	\$	-	\$	×		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	> + :	\$		\$			
ADR - Settlement Conference											
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	151	\$	177	\$			
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	144	\$	220	\$	=		
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	S=1	\$		\$	-		
Argument											
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	794	\$	355	\$			
Oral Hearing					_						
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	(2)	\$	<u></u>	\$	ig.		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	543	\$	143	\$	#		
Other Conferences											
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$		\$	S#35	\$	ā		
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$		\$	37 3	\$	্য		
Case Management				\$		\$, + ,	\$	-		
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	9,900.00	\$	1,287.00	\$	11,187.00		

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing

To Dec/31/2018 Billing Amount Inv# Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Date Status Entry # Explanation Ontario Sustainable Energy Association 7188 Re: Hydro one No. EB 2017-0049 Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.20 34.00 Billed 4/2017 discuss hydro one application with R. Woon; 1857359 Billed 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.20 34.00 5/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 1857363 discuss drafting the intervenor letter with R. Woon; 1.20 204.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 74 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 - VICTORIA CHAI Jul] 6/2017 draft intervenor request letter for Hydro One Distribution Rates application and discuss with R. review not 2014291 1.20 204.00 Unbilled 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 12/2017 Lawyer: 74 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 download and review evidence from OEB regulatory documents database; read application by Hydro One; 1857374 Unbilled. Lawyer: 72 1.60 Hrs X 100.00 - RAEYA JACKIW 1.60 160.00 15/2017 72 Sep read Ontario Energy Board rules of procedure and determine procedure for reviewing a decision of the Board; read 1866222 - VICTORIA CHAI Billed 3.00 510.00 74 18/2017 Lawyer: 74 3.00 Hrs X 170.00 discuss preparation of a notice of motion to OEB with R. Woon; review hydro one application and discuss with R. W 1865972 57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW 2.00 340.00 Unbilled 18/2017 Lawyer: 57 2.00 Hrs X 170.00 Sep Fraser and J. Wilkinson re instruction review OEB decision on intervenor status; review OEB rules; emails with M. 1865979 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 3.00 510.00 Unbilled Sep 19/2017 Lawyer: 74 3.00 Hrs X 170.00 review hydro one application, tables, and appendices, research connection impact assessments and conservation and 1866168 306.00 Unbilled 57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW 1.80 Lawyer: 57 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 19/2017 Sep review and revise draft notice of motion letter; emails with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser; 1866215 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.20 Billed Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 2/2017 1877267 review OEB decision on intervenor status motions; Billed - VICTORIA CHAI 0.80 136.00 3/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 74 Nov confirm status of hydro one hearing and check for procedural orders to determine next steps; discuss next steps w 1877631 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW 0.40 68.00 Unbilled 57 Lawyer: 57 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 6/2017 review Board decision on OSEA's intervenor status and review status of proceeding; email J. Wilkinson and M. Fras 1877951 68.00 Billed 30/2017 Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.40 1 Nov review email from Board advising of date of Hydro One presentation, discuss attendance with R. Woon; review statu 1886154 34.00 Unbilled 57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW 0.20 1/2017 Lawyer: 57 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 email from H. Thiessen at Board re Hydro One presentation; emails with J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser re attendance 1886144 Unbilled Lawyer: 57 57 - ROBERT WOON SEK LAW 0.10 17.00 Dec 18/2017 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 email J. Wilkinson and M. Fraser re follow up about M. Fraser's attendance at presentation and interrogatories; 1891400 102.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.60 9/2018 consider interrogatories and review timelines; review Hydro One Presentation; 1896583 1.40 Unbilled Lawyer: 74 1.40 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 238.00 10/2018 Jan email M. Fraser regarding interrogatories; consider issues for interrogatories; review Procedural Order and timel 1896742 Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.40 68.00 1 Billed Jan 11/2018 instruct T. Sebastian regarding dates for proceeding; review correspondence from Board Sec; 1897076 1.60 272.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 12/2018 Jan consider and discuss final issues list; review application executive summary; review hydro one presentation; 1897551 0.40 68.00 1 Billed Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI Jan 15/2018 1898406 discuss and consider transmission evidence hearing; - VICTORIA CHAI 4.40 748.00 Jan 16/2018 Lawyer: 74 4.40 Hrs X 170.00 74 review OEB scorecard; revie list; review application Exhibit A and B; 1898762 review decision on interim rates and issues Unbilled Lawyer: 74 2.80 Hrs X 170.00 - VICTORIA CHAI 2.80 476.00 Jan 17/2018 74 draft interrogatories and review evidence and application exhibits; 1899327 306.00 Unbilled - VICTORIA CHAI Lawyer: 74 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 74 Jan 18/2018 review and discuss interrogatories; review evidence; 1899666 Lawyer: 74 2.40 Hrs X 170.00 2.40 408.00 Unbilled 74 - VICTORIA CHAI Jan 19/2018 prepare materials; research CDM programs; review forecasts; review evidence; revise interrogatories; review inter 1900077 1.60 Unbilled - VICTORIA CHAI 272.00 22/2018 Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 74 revise interrogatories; review oeb staff interrogatories; research dynamic pricing pilot; email M. Fraser; 1900601 20.00 Billed Jan 22/2018 Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 100.00 72 - RAEYA JACKIW 0.20 1 research re Ontario's Dynamic Pricing Pilot/Plan; 1901433 Unbilled - VICTORIA CHAI 306.00 74 Jan 23/2018 Lawyer: 74 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 finalize; email M. Fraser review and revise interrogatories; research for interrogatories; instruct assistant to 1901049 Unbilled Lawyer: 74 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 1.00 170.00 Jan 24/2018 finalize interrogatories; follow up with M. Fraser and J. Wilkinson; phone call with J. Wilkinson and receive ins 1901316 Unbilled - VICTORIA CHAI 0.20 34.00 Jan 25/2018 Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 74 email J. Wilkinson to report that interrogatories were filed to Board; 1902469 Unbilled 0.60 102.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 1/2018 Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 Feb consider need for expert evidence; draft, revise and send email to M. Fraser regarding expert evidence; 1904492 74 Unbilled - VICTORIA CHAI 0.60 102.00 2/2018 Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 review email from J. Wilkinson; discuss response with J. Vince; respond to J. Wilkinson; 1904643 0.60 102.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 12/2018 Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 Feb instruct R. Jackiw to compile interrogatory responses; consider IRRs receipt and review of email from Board Sec; 1908190 68.00 Billed 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.40 Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 14/2018 consider IRRs and timing for indicating intention to participate in tech conference; Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.60 1908764 102.00 Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 Feb 15/2018 draft email to M. Fraser about technical conference; discuss and revise draft; send email to M. Fraser and client 1909297 - VICTORIA CHAI Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 74 0.20 34.00 Unbilled 16/2018 expert evidence; review correspondence from Board staff re: 1909607 0.80 136.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI Lawyer: 74 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 Feb 20/2018 draft email to M. Fraser regarding technical conference; draft correspondence to Hydro One informing of intention 1909984 Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 74 - VICTORIA CHAI 0.60 102.00 Unbilled 21/2018 Feh send email to M. Fraser re technical conference; review reply; discuss areas for technical conference; 1910507 2.20 - VICTORIA CHAI 374.00 Unbilled 74 Lawyer: 74 2.20 Hrs X 170.00 26/2018 revise letter to Hydro One re technical conference; discuss and revise with J. Vince; review Interrogatory respon 1911683 Unbilled 72 - RAEYA JACKIW 3.40 340.00 Feb 26/2018 Lawyer: 72 3.40 Hrs X 100.00 pull and file Hydro One's responses to OSEA's interrogatories; organize responses in chart to send to V. Chai and 1911814 1.00 100.00 Unbilled Lawyer: 72 1.00 Hrs X 100.00 72 - RAEYA JACKIW 26/2018 pull additional Hydro One responses to OSEA interrogatories and add to chart; send chart to V. Chai and J. Vince 1911846 170.00 - VICTORIA CHAI 1.00 Lawyer: 74 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 74 Feb 27/2018 review email from Board re timing for questioning at technical conference; draft email to M. Fraser re timing nee 1912083

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing

CONTRACTOR OF SECURITY			ees Listing				
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation		c/31/2018 Lawyer	Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing Status
		74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.60	102.00		Unbilled
1912509 Mar 2/2018	draft email to board re time requirements: Lawyer: 74 1.20 Hrs X 170.00	for techn: 74 -	ical conference; review VICTORIA CHAI	corresponder		Board 1	re timing fo Unbilled
Mar 5/2018	review and consider Hydro One responses to Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	OSEA inte	errogatories; VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
Mar 8/2018	consider technical conference; Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 draft email to Marion Fraser; review respon		VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00		Unbilled
Mar 9/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 review Procedural Order; discuss next step:	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.60	102.00	1	Billed
Mar 15/2018 1918008	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 check for hydro one reasons if filed yet;		VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
Mar 16/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review and consider correspondence from Boo		VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
Mar 20/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review and consider Hydro One submissions	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI entiality;	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
Mar 21/2018	Lawyer: 74 1 40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	1.40	238.00	1	Billed
1918911	consider confidentiality request and submin	ssions; r	eview interrogatory resp VICTORIA CHAI	onses to de 0.20	termine 34.00	if need	Billed
1919396	review Board staff reasons regarding confidence	dential r		0.40	68.00	1	Billed
Mar 28/2018 1921598	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 summarize status of hearing for client;						
	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 discuss expert evidence;	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
Apr 9/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review procedural order;	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
Apr 12/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 read decision on confidentiality;	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
Apr 13/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 draft email to M. Fraser discussing interr	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI		68.00 from Bo	ard:	Unbilled
Apr 15/2018	Lawyer: 74 0 40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00		Unbilled
Apr 18/2018	revise email to M. Fraser discussing inter Lawyer: 74 2.00 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	2.00	340.00		Unbilled
1926137	review expert evidence from OEB Staff and Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00	Anwaatin;	draft interrogatories VICTORIA CHAI	for expert e	vidence; 102.00		Unbilled
1926182	discuss and consider interrogatories;		JOANNA VINCE	0.60	102.00		Unbilled
1927194	Lawyer: 48 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 review draft interrogatories and revise;			0.20	34.00		Unbilled
1926549	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 revise interrogatories for expert evidence	and emai	VICTORIA CHAI 1 M. Fraser re draft in	terrogatorie	s;		
1927057	emails with M. Fraser for draft interrogat	ory quest	VICTORIA CHAI ions; send draft to J.	Wilkinson; r	102.00 eview dr	aft;	Unbilled
2014292	Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 review enclosures letter; email client; re	view OEB	VICTORIA CHAI staff interrogatories;	0.60	102.00		Unbilled
May 8/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review additional evidence from Hydro One	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40 corresponde	68.00 nce from	SEC;	Billed
May 16/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 review answers to OSEA interrogatories on	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	136.00		Unbilled review answe
May 18/2018	Lawyer: 74 1 60 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	1.60	272.00		Unbilied
1936947	review new Procedural Order and timing for	hearing;	consider if OSEA needs JOANNA VINCE	to submit i	nterroga 136.00	tories	on new compe Unbilled
1937143	Lawyer: 48 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 review materials and identify issues for C	SEA for h	earing;			1	
May 22/2018	Lawyer: 72 1.00 Hrs X 100.00 meet with V. Chai and J. Vince to discuss	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW reparation: receive ins	1.00 tructions to		OEB dec	
May 22/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.80 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	136.00	1	Billed
May 28/2018	consider and discuss materials and questio Lawyer: 74 0.60 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.60	102.00		Billed
Marr 20/2019	consider and discuss pole attachment report Lawyer: 74 2.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	2.40	408.00		Unbilied
1939599 May 31/2018	review email from Board and letter of hear	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	4.40	748.00		Unbilied
1941452	review rate design evidence in support of	questions	about connection impac	t assessment	s; consi	der tim	ing for ques Unbilled
2014293	Lawyer: 74 3.00 Hrs X 170.00 draft cross examination questions; research	ch differe	VICTORIA CHAI ent types of conservation	3.00 n program fu	510.00 inding; 1	eview i	nterrogatory
Tun 4/2018	Lawyer: 74 4.60 Hrs X 170.00 review other intervenors time estimates;	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	4.60	182.00	1	Billed
Tun 4/2019	Lawyer: 48 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 review Hydro One evidence and prepare ques	48 -	JOANNA VINCE	1.80	306.00		unbilitea
Tun 5/2010	Tayyor: 72 1 20 Hrs X 100 00	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	1,20	120.00	1	BITTEU
T F /2010	locate Ontario Energy Board decision from Lawyer: 74 3.20 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	3.20	544.00		Unbilited
Tun 7/2018	review decision from previous Rate Applica Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	irrent p	Billed
1943113	review evidence in preparation for hearing	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.80	136.00		Unbilled
1943421	review material and draft questions and pr	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	5.40	918.00	1	Billed
1943430	[Consider Not Billing] prepare binder for	r R. Woon	for hearing; review evi	dence, consi	ider and 595.00	discuss	issues and Unbilled
19/3995	Lawyer: 74 3.50 Hrs X 170.00 travel to, attend and travel back from ora	al hearing	first day, attend ques	tioning of (R panel;	
1944333	Lawyer: 74 2.20 Hrs X 170.00 revise and update oral hearing material bi	inders for	R. Woon and J. Vince;	review summa	ary of he	earing s	second day fr
Tun 13/2019	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 continue to revise hearing binders, materi	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing

1101/	10/2013			Fees Listing				~
Date		Fee / Time Explanation		ec/31/2018 g Lawyer	Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing Status
Jun	14/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
Jun	1944526 14/2018	continue to prepare for oral hearing, considerable Lawyer: 57 1.60 Hrs X 170.00	der ques	tions for cross examinat ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	ion; 1.60	272.00		Unbilled
Jun	15/2018	prepare for oral hearing; Lawyer: 57 6.50 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	6.50	1105.00		Unbilled
Jun	16/2018	addition to discount the state of the state	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.80	136.00	1	Billed
Jun	18/2018	review all evidence and consider energy stor Lawyer: 48 0.30 Hrs X 170.00	48 -	JOANNA VINCE	0.30	51.00		Unbilled
Jun	18/2018	telephone call with D. Goldberger to discuss Lawyer: 74 1.80 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	1.80	306.00		Unbilled
	1945109	review oral hearing transcript from fourth (Lawyer: 74 5.80 Hrs X 170.00	day; rev	iew energy storage evide	ence; consi	der and d 986.00	iscuss	evidence and Unbilled
Jun	1946260	prepare questions and review evidence for pr	reparati	on for oral hearing asse	t manageme	nt panel;	review	
Jun	20/2018	Lawyer: 57 2.20 Hrs X 170.00 prepare for oral hearing - review application	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	2.20	374.00		Unbilled
Jun	21/2018	Lawyer: 57 1.50 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	1.50	255.00		Unbilled
Jun	21/2018	prepare for oral hearing - review cross-examination by the cross-examination for the cross-exami	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	2.00	340.00		
	1947721	consider evidence and revise cross examinat:	ion ques	tions for sixth witness	panel; rev	iew trans 306.00	cripts	and undertak Billed
Jun	22/2018	Lawyer: 74 1.80 Hrs X 170.00 finalize binder materials for oral hearing :	for conn	ection impact assessment	costs and			
Jun	23/2018		74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	1.20	204.00		Unbilled
		Lawyer: 57 5.00 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	5.00	850.00	2 1044	Unbilled
T		prepare for and attend oral hearing;		VICTORIA CHAI	1.00	170.00		Unbilled
	1948603	Lawyer: 74 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 consider evidence for connection impact asse	essment	questions; consider new	undertakin	gs and dr	aft new	questions k
Jun	26/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 discuss questions and answers to OSEA's ques	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI t examination of shared	0.20 services p			Billed
	26/2018	Lawyer: 57 0.60 Hrs X 170.00		ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.60	102.00		Unbilled
Jun		attend oral hearing to question panel 6; Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.80	136.00		Unbilled
	1949001	prepare for oral hearing - questions for par	nel 7;	WTOMODIA CHAT	2,60	442.00	1	Billed
	1949008	add materials to hearing binder for load for	recastin	VICTORIA CHAI g panel; review transcri				
Jun	28/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 consider and discuss answers from OSEA's cre	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
Jun	28/2018	Lawver: 57 2.00 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	2.00	340.00	1 CCMO	Unbilled
	1949521	attend oral hearing - questions for panel 7	48 -	JOANNA VINCE	1.00	170.00		Unbilled
	1950067	Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 discuss final arguments;		VICTORIA CHAI	1.60	272.00		Unbilled
	1950136	Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 review transcripts from day ten and eleven	oral hea	ring for OSEA portions;	consider a	nd discus	s ideas	for writter
Jul	3/2018 1950155	Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 consider and discuss outline for draft writ	ten subm	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW		136.00	1	
Jul	12/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40 with PWII:	68.00	1 iming f	Billed or submissic
Jul	1953913	Lawver: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
Tu 1	1954102	review new Procedural Order and decision on Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	Rogers	motion; report decision VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	e and R. 34.00	Woon;	Billed
	1955554	[Consider Not Billing] discuss Hydro One's	submissi	on with R. Woon;		17.00		Unbilled
Jul	24/2018	Lawyer: 57 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 email with D. Goldberger and M. Fraser re H	ONI's WI	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW ritten arguments and OSE	0.10 A's respond		ssion;	OUDITIED
Jul	25/2018	Lawyer: 74 2.20 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	2.20	374.00		Unbilled
Jul	1956257 26/2018	Lawyer: 74 2.20 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	2.20	374.00		Unbilled
	1956569	continue to draft reply submissions; consid	er evide	ence in application and : VICTORIA CHAI	from oral h	earing in 646.00	suppor	t of writter. Unbilled
	28/2018 1956603	continue to prepare draft written submissio	n; resea	arch benefits of distrib	uted genera	tion and	distrib	uted energy
Jul	30/2018	Lawyer: 74 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 continue to review and consider undertaking	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI oral hearing, review and	1.20 consider s	204.00 ettlement	propos	Unbilled al between A
Aug	1/2018	Lawyer: 48 0.80 Hrs X 170.00	48 -	JOANNA VINCE	0.80	136.00	-	Unbilled
Διισ	1/2018	revise and revise final submission; Lawyer: 74 2.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI		408.00		Unbilled
	1957725	review and consider draft submissions with	J. Vince	e; revise draft submissi	ons; resear	ch author	ities a	bout the ber Unbilled
-	1957830	Lawyer: 57 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 review draft written submission and provide		ROBERT WOON SEK LAW				
Aug	2/2018	Lawyer: 74 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 revise draft written submissions, modify se	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	1.60			Unbilled connection in
Aug	3/2018	Lawyer: 57 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	0.50	85,00		Unbilled
Αμσ	8/2018	review revised draft written submission; Lawyer: 57 1.80 Hrs X 170.00	57 -	ROBERT WOON SEK LAW	1.80	306.00		Unbilled
	1959894	revise draft written submission and send sa	me to D	. Golberger and M. Frase	r; 1.00	170.00		Unbilled
	1959915	Lawyer: 74' 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 discuss submissions with R. Woon, extract s	ections	of evidence on Connecti	on Impact A	ssessment	costs	for client;
Aug	9/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review emails from M. Fraser re comments on	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.20	34.00		Unbilled
Aug	10/2018	Lauver: 74 1 60 Hrs X 170 00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	1.60	272.00	000-1	Unbilled
Sen	28/2018	review emails from D. Goldberger and M. Fra Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74 -	VICTORIA CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
	1971834	review and consider new Procedural Order an	d report	t to J. Vince and R. Woo VICTORIA CHAI	n about OSE 0.20	EA's next 34.00	steps i	n relation t Billed
Oct	5/2018 1973865	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review letter from Hydro One about Rogers M	lotion a	nd consider if any next			_	

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing To Dec/31/2018

Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation		Dec/31/2018		Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing Status
Oct 11/2018	2017021 /1 1120 1120 11 21111		- VICTORIA	CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
	review Hydro One response letter to Proce				0.00	24 00	4	9411-4
Oct 14/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	74	- VICTORIA	CHAI	0.20	34.00	10	Billed
	read Procedural Order Ten;		**********	C*** T	0.40	CO 00		n/11ad
oct 17/2018			- VICTORIA	CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
1979222	review and consider Rogers Motion materia	ıls;				30 00		2111-1
Oct 29/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74	- VICTORIA	CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
	read and consider Procedural Order Eleven							
Nov 2/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00				0.20	34.00	1	Billed
	review Hydro One response letter to Proce							CALL BY MICHIGAN
	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00			CHAI	0.40	68.00	1.	Billed
1985937	review SEC interrogatories; review CME in	iterrogat	tories;					
	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	74	- VICTORIA	CHAI	0.20	34.00	1	Billed
	review Procedural Order Twelve;							
	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00				0.40	68.00	1	Billed
1989008	review new interrogatories, review corres	pondence	e from Board	;				
Dec 7/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	74	- VICTORIA	CHAI	0.40	68.00	1	Billed
2006446	review OEB staff submission on executive	compensa	ation issue;	review SEC s		review CM	E submis	sions;
Dec 8/2018	Lawyer: 74 0.20 Hrs X 170.00				0.20	34.00	1	Billed
1992583	review HONI reply submissions for executi	ve comp	ensation iss	ue; review re	vised HONI	reply subm	issions;	
				Unbilled:	129.30	21561.00		
				Billed:	37.60	6224.00		
				Total:	166.90	27785.00		
			Perc	ent Billed:	22.53	22.40		

Summary by Working Lawyer

Work	ing Lawyer	-	n n	— Hou	rs —					Fee:	₅ ———		
	,	Unbilled	Firm %	Billed	Firm %	Total	% Bld	Unbilled	Firm %	Billed	Firm %	Total	% Bld
48	- JOANNA VINC	5.30	4.10	0.00	0.00	5,30	0.00	901.00	4.18	0.00	0.00	901.00	0.00
57	- ROBERT WOON	28.70	22.20	0.80	2.13	29.50	2.71	4879.00	22.63	136.00	2.19	5015.00	2.71
72	- RAEYA JACKI	6.00	4.64	2.40	6.38	8.40	28.57	600.00	2.78	240.00	3.86	840.00	28.57
74	- VICTORIA CH	89.30	69.06	34.40	91.49	123.70	27.81	15181.00	70.41	5848.00	93.96	21029.00	27.81
Firm	Total	129.30	100.00	37.60	100.00	166.90	22.53	21561.00	100.00	6224.00	100.00	27785.00	22.40

*** Summary by Responsible Lawyer ***

Responsible Lawyer		Hours			1	Fees		
	Unbilled Firm %	Billed Firm %	Total	% Bld	Unbilled Firm %	Billed Firm	₹ Total	% Bld
31 - JULIE ABOUC						6224.00 100.0		
Firm Total	129.30 100.00	37.60 100.00	166.90	22.53	21561.00 100.00	6224.00 100.0	27785.00	22.40

REPORT SELECTIONS - Client Fees Listing	
Layout Template	Default
Advanced Search Filter	None
Requested by	Grace Lu
Finished	Monday, March 18, 2019 at 10:22:38 AM
Ver	14.1 (14.1.20150324)
Date Range	To Dec/31/2018
Matters	7188
Clients	All
Major Clients	All
Client Intro Lawyer	All
Matter Intro Lawyer	All
Responsible Lawyer	All
Assigned Lawyer	All
Type of Law	All
Select From	Active, Inactive, Archived Matters
Matters Sort by	Default
New Page for Each Lawyer	No
Firm Totals Only	No
Client balances only	No
Matter balances only	No
Entries Shown - Billed Only	Yes
Entries Shown - Unbilled	Yes
Entries Shown - Billable Tasks	Yes
Entries Shown - Write Up/Down Tasks	Yes
Entries Shown - No Charge Tasks	Yes
Entries Shown - Non Billable Tasks	Yes
Working Lawyer	All

-				0/15/2019	
Date Entry #	Received From/Paid To Explanation	Chq# Rec#	Rcpts	Disbs	Bld Trust Activity Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance
-		1/40#	Ropes	DIADA	EEES INVI ACC ACPES BISDS BATANCE
1341 Ontar: 7188	io Sustainable Energy Association Re: Eydro one No. EB 2017-0049				Resp Lawyer: JA
Sep 18/2017					mosp analysis on
1866545	Photocopies			5.00	
Sep 18/2017 1866546	Photocopies			0.25	
Sep 18/2017	Thorocopies			0.23	
1866547	Photocopies			0.25	
Sep 18/2017	Photogonias			0.50	
1866548 Sep 18/2017	Photocopies			0.50	
1866558	Photocopies			1.50	
Jan 12/2018				2 76	
1898179 Jan 12/2018	Photocopies			3.75	
1898180	Photocopies			2.00	3
Jan 12/2018					
1898191 Jan 12/2018	Photocopies			0.25	
1898182	Photocopies			1.25	
Jan 16/2018				9 59	
18 99154 Jan 16/2018	Photocopies			2.00	
1899157	Photocopies			2.50	₽
Jan 16/2018	L ₂				
1899169	Photocopies			0.75	
Jan 16/2018 1899170	Photocopies			0.25	
Jan 16/2018	7			0.20	
1899176	Photocopies			2.00	* Lines
Jan 16/2018 1899182	Photogopies			1.50	
Jan 16/2018	Photocopies			1.30	
1899183	Photocopies			0.75	
Jan 17/2018	71-4			1 50	
1899749 Jan 18/2018	Photocopies			1.50	
1899916	Photocopies			9.00	
Jan 19/2018	-1				
1901530 Jan 19/2018	Photocopies			0.25	A CONTRACT TO SERVICE AND A SE
1901556	Photocopies			0.25	
Jan 19/2018	Souther for a				
1901557	Photocopies			2.75	Section of the second of the second
Jan 19/2018 1901560	Photocopies			0.75	
Jan 19/2018				*	
1901561	Photocopies			4.50	THE SHOPPON A PARAMETER COMPANY TO BE SHOWN IN THE PARAMETER OF THE PARAME
Jan 19/2018 1901569	Photocopies.			0.25	
Jan 22/2018					
1901876	Photocopies			0.50	The state of the second st
Jan 22/2018 1901877	Photocopies			0.50	A A STATE OF THE S
Jan 22/2018	21100000\$200			0100	
1901878	Photocopies			0.25	The state of the s
Jan 24/2018 1902163	Photocopies			2.25	A THE RESERVE OF THE PROPERTY
Feb 26/2018	пососоргоз			2.23	
1912234	Photocopies			0.25	
Feb 26/2018 1912251	Photocopies			0.25	
Apr 18/2018	Prints			0.23	and dispersion of the second off-
1930200	Photocopies			16.75	
Apr 18/2018	Prints de la				100 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00
1930201 Apr 19/2018	Photocopies Prints			8.50	A CONTRACT STREET, SALES AND A CONTRACT OF THE SALES OF T
1929966	Photocopies			16.00	
Apr 19/2018	Prints Eller				
1929971 Apr 19/2018	Prints		- 1	16.75	
1929973	Photocopies			8.50	
Apr 19/2018	Prints				The state of the s
1930034	Prints			1.00	
Apr 25/2018 1930693	Photocopies			1.00	8
May 1/2018	A & B COURTER				The state of the s
1939635	Deliveries			17.48	
May 22/2018 1940113	Prints Photocopies			1.00	
May 22/2018	Prints				
1940114	Photocopies			1.50	
May 22/2018 1940115	Prints Photocopies			1.75	
May 22/2018	RELATE LOS LOS LA LA LA CARRACTE DE LA LOS ANTON		o Same on the		
1940116	Photocopies			1.75	
May 22/2018	Scans			0.75	
1940117 May 22/2018	Photocopies Scans			0.75	
1940118	Photocopies			0.75	

Entry #

lay 22/2018

lay 22/2018

lay 30/2018

1ay 30/2018

1ay 31/2018

fay 31/2018

1ay 31/2018

Jun 1/2018

1940469

1940472

1941782

1941784

1941920

1941921

1941927

1943805 Jun 1/2018

1943806 Jun 1/2018 1943807

1/2018

1943808

1943701

1943812

1943813

1943814

1943815

1943816

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018 1943820 Jun 4/2018 1943832

Jun 4/2018

Jun

Jun

Jun

Jun

1943896

1943897

1943898

1943899

1943900

1943901

1943902

1943903 Jun 4/2018 1943904 Jun 4/2018 1943905 4/2018

1943906

1943909

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018

Jun 4/2018 1943923

Jun 5/2018 1945507 Jun 5/2018 1945516

Jun 8/2018 1945645

Jun 8/2018 1945646

Jun 8/2018

Jun 8/2018

Jun 8/2018

Jun 8/2018

Jun

1945647

1945654

1945656

1945658

8/2018

1945659

1943910

4/2018

4/2018

4/2018

1943920

1943915

1943918

4/2018

Jun

Photocopies

Photocopies

Photocopies

Photocopies

Prints

Prints

Prints

Prints

ate

	Willms	& Shier Envi	ronmental Lav	vvers LLP				Page: 2
	WIIIMO	Clien	t Ledger b/15/2019	,				
Received From/Paid To	Chq# Rec#	Gene:		Fees	Bld Inv# Acc	Trust Repts	Activity Disbs	Balance
Explanation Scans	Rech	ксрсв	DISDS	1003	211711 2100			
Photocopies			0.50					
Prints Photocopies			1.00					
Prints Photocopies			0.50					
Prints								
Photocopies Prints			14.50					
Photocopies	5.		1.50					
Prints Photocopies			3.75					
Prints Photocopies			2.25					
Prints			0.75					
Photocopies Prints			0.75					
Photocopies			0.50					
Prints Photocopies			0.25					
Prints Photocopies			2.00					
Prints	1 9 B		0.05					
Prints			2.25					
Photocopies			1.50					
Prints Photocopies			0.50					
Prints Photocopies			2.00					
Prints			0.75					
Photocopies Prints	11 - 200 10 11 12 2 24	The second						N 19 3 10 0
Photocopies Prints			2.00					
Photocopies			0.75				reographism	The state
Prints Photocopies			2.00					
Prints Photocopies			0.25					10028301
Prints	TOWN CHARLES AND BOOK MAKES	SCHOOL SECTION						
Photocopies Prints	15 1400 Birdings (64	emilio Sec	0.25				-5	Carlot III
Prints		Michigan S.	0.25					
Photocopies			0.25					
Prints Photocopies		(50.1)	0.25				MERCHANIST !	Alexandr.
Prints	ALTER ANTIBESCHOOL STOCK	2011 AND AUTHORITIES & 75014	0.25					
Photocopies Prints	an complete the con-	in the new party						
Prints	and the state of the state of the	e and strong out of	0.25					
Photocopies			0.25					
Prints Photocopies	arm a sychead garden	are at 1964	0.25				- Estimation	
Prints Photocopies			0.75					
Prints		Valleya az dayı					VERSON THE	1053 kg
Prints	their of the last on their	arrain disersal	1.50		de			
Photocopies	the Table State of the	dalam Die Die	1.50					1.17
Prints Photocopies		(400) (10 to 10 to	0.50				107-001-01-0	The state of the s
Prints Photocopies			0.75					
Prints			MEDITOR NO.				secquipments	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Photocopies Prints		PORTAL PROPERTY.	0.75	newmark, ma	ATTENTO	THE PARTY OF THE P		TOTAL ST
Photocopies	/g x 1, U1 h 3u vc =	es yan an a	0.75					. erasta ek
Prints Photocopies	West Control of	未得福。	0.50				PERMIT	129,35
Prints Photocopies			0.25					
Prints			1.00				April 18 the	
Photocopies Prints	Maria Park to the of							
Photocopies Prints	06		5.50					
Photocopies			1.50					
Prints Photocopies			8.00					

4.25

0.25

0.50

5.50

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Mai/13/201		Client Ledger	Page: 3
Date	Received From/Paid To	To Feb/15/2019 Chq# General Bld Trust Activity	
Entry #	Explanation	Rec# Rcpts Disbs Fees Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs	Balance
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
1945660 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	1.50	
1945771	Photocopies	11.25	
Jun 8/2018 1945791	Prints Photocopies	0.25	41
Jun 8/2018	Prints	0.23	
1945792 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	0.50	
1945793	Photocopies	0.50	
Jun 8/2018 1945983	Prints Photocopies	8.00	
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
1945984 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	12.75	
1945985	Photocopies	4.50	
Jun 8/2018 1945987	Prints Photocopies	0.75	
Jun 8/2018 1945992	Prints Photocopies	23.75	
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
1945993 Jun 8/2018	Prints	2.00	
1945994	Photocopies	0.50	
Jun 8/2018 1945995	Prints Photocopies	1.50	
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
1945996 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	1.25	
1945998 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	1.50	
1946000	Photocopies	0.25	
Jun 8/2018 1946001	Prints Photocopies	0.75	
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	0.25	
1946003	Photocopies	0.50	
Jun 8/2018 1946004	Prints Photocopies	2.00	
Jun 8/2018	Prints	The state of the s	
1946005 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	0.75	
1946006 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	2.50	
1946007	Photocopies	0.25	
Jun 8/2018 1946008	Prints Photocopies	1.00	
Jun 8/2018	Prints	The state of the s	
1946009 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	3,75	
1946010 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	1.50	
1946011	Photocopies	0.50	
Jun 8/2018 1946012	Prints Photocopies	1.50	
Jun 8/2018	Prints	The common common that the common that the common c	
1946013 Jun 8/2018	Prints	0.50	
1946014	Photocopies		
Jun 8/2018 1946015	Prints Photocopies	4.25	
Jun 8/2018 1946018	Prints Photocopies	2,25	
Jun 8/2018	Prints	The state of the s	
1946020 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints		
1946032	Photocopies Prints		
Jun 8/2018 1946033	Prints Photocopies	0.25	Wiell Jerson
Jun 8/2018 1946034	Prints	0.25	
Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	5.00	
1946035 Jun 8/2018	Prints *	5.00	
1946036	Photocopies		
Jun 8/2018 1946037	Prints Photocopies	2.25	
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
1946040 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	0.25	
1946042	Photocopies	1.50	
Jun 8/2018 1946051	Prints Photocopies	0.25	
Jun 8/2018 1946052	Prints Photocopies		Standard Charles
Jun 8/2018	Prints		
1946056 Jun 8/2018	Photocopies Prints	2.00	
1946080	Photocopies	2.00	

• Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Ledger

			T	Client Ledg o Feb/15/2	2019			years		- Î
ate Entry #	Received From/Paid To Explanation	Chq# Rec#	Ropts	General Dis		Fees	Bld Inv# Acc	Trust Ropts	: Activity Disbs	Balance
un 8/2018	Prints	2.2011	2.0000					•		
1946081	Photocopies	(9)		2.	75					
un 8/2018 1946084	Prints Photocopies			0.	50					
un 8/2018 1946085	Prints Photocopies			2	.00					
un 8/2018	Prints									
1946086 un 11/2018	Photocopies Prints			0.	.50					
1945807	Photocopies			0.	.50					
run 11/2018 1945809	Prints Photocopies			0.	.25					
un 11/2018	Prints			0	.50					
1945812 fun 11/2018	Photocopies Prints									
1945813 Jun 11/2018	Phótocopies Prints	6		0.	.25					
1945814	Photocopies			8.	.00					
Jun 12/2018 1946729	Prints Photocopies			0	.50					
Jun 13/2018 1946778	Prints Photocopies			3	. 50					
Jun 13/2018	Copies									
1946781 Jun 13/2018	Photocopies Copies			0.	.25			NAME OF THE		
1946782	Photocopies			0	.50					
Jun 14/2018 1946320	Prints Photocopies			3	,50					
Jun 14/2018	Prints			2	.75					
1946321 Jun 14/2018	Photocopies Prints	=1							MA HOTE	
1946354 Jun 18/2018	Photocopies Prints			2	.50			and the Beet I con-	WALES	
1946692	Photocopies			4	.50					
Jun 20/2018 1947177	Prints Photocopies			3	.00			100	William A	
Jun 20/2018	Prints Photocopies			1	.50					
1947178 Jun 20/2018	Prints							8-1-1-1	Carlo Carlo	Frankler i
1947180 Jun 20/2018	Prints			3	,00		TOTAL PLANTAGE VOICE	CVCH AND BUILDING	Van 194 (RDP) SALLES SALAS I	
1947364	Photocopies			0	.25				U.DAIDEAN	
Jun 20/2018 1947365	Prints Photocopies	*		0	.75	A Little			in a law to the	04/2001
Jun 20/2018 1947366	Prints			2	.50			i i		
Jun 20/2018	Photocopies Prints							100	PAYSON DOWN	
1947367 Jun 20/2018	Prints			1	.25		CONTRACTOR OF STREET	AND THE MICH. SCHOOL	na-your linear	
1947370	Photocopies			0	.75					
Jun 20/2018 1947379	Prints Photocopies			1	.00			, www.		
Jun 20/2018 1947380	Prints			0	.75					
Jun 20/2018	Prints							A supplied to	tellation to 7.1	d goleren
Jun 20/2018	Prints					P TO LOCATE OF	VALCOS PERSON	contract a contract	St. Jan. Cal. Cal.	A. C. C.
1947403 Jun 20/2018	Photocopies			0	.25				V PRIVEY	5953.
. 1947420	Photocopies was a series of	- y .		1	.25	75001202	Winds Street	Mississina ve m	de appropriation	A VE
Jun 20/2018 1947429	Prints Photocopies			1	.00					
Jun 20/2018	Prints						13.0	120	A810240-20-10	Espain
1947430 Jun 20/2018	Prints	1. T.								
1947431 Jun 20/2018	Photocopies			0	.25		the Salar		2000	
1947434	Photocopies despes	*2		1	.25	A CONTRACTOR	Wan keening	Chief of the	1204 A M	
Jun 20/2018 1947435	Prints				25					
Jun 21/2018	Prints				.25				Merchanten artis	plant's
1948207 Jun 22/2018	Prints	A 8							and the second second	
1949157 Jun 22/2018	Photocopies			8	.75				" Designation of the last of t	
1949159	Photocopies			1	.00				Aug Cild	
Jun 22/2018 1949187				0	.50					
Jun 22/2018	Prints				.25					
1949188 Jun 25/2018										
1949115 Jun 25/2018	Photocopies			1	.00					
1949346	Photocopies	345		0	.50					
Jul 3/2018 1953272				1	.25					
Jul 3/2018	Prints				25					
1953273 Jul 30/2018										
1961948				3	3.75					

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Mar/13/2017		,	WIIIMS & S	hier Enviro					Page: 5
Date	Received From/Paid To	Ch	q# I	To Feb/			Bld	Trust Activ	ity
Entry #	Explanation			epts	Disbs	Fees	Inv# Acc		isbs Balance
Jul 30/2018 1961964	Prints Photocopies				1.00				
Aug 1/2018	Prints								
1962193 Aug 1/2018	Photocopies Prints				1.50				
1962194	Photocopies				79.50				
Aug 1/2018 1962195	Prints Photocopies				1.50				
Aug 8/2018 1962235	Prints Photocopies				0.25	12			
Aug 8/2018	Prints								
1962236 Aug 8/2018	Photocopies Prints				0.25				
1962238	Photocopies				0.75				
Aug 8/2018 1962240	Prints Photocopies				1.00				
Aug 8/2018	Prints				1.00				
1962242 Aug 8/2018	Photocopies Prints				1.00				
1962244 Aug 8/2018	Photocopies Prints				1.25				
1962245	Photocopies				0.75				
Aug 8/2018 1962246	Prints Photocopies				0.75				
Aug 8/2018	Prints								
1962247 Aug 8/2018	Photocopies Prints				3.75				
1962248	Photocopies				4.50				
Aug 8/2018 1962249	Prints Photocopies				1,50				
Aug 8/2018	Scans								
1962335 Aug 10/2018	Photocopies Prints				16.00				
1963443	Photocopies				1.75				
Aug 14/2018 1963416	Prints Photocopies				1.00				
Jan 2/2019	Prints				0.25				
2000224 Jan 3/2019	Photocopies Prints	12			0.25				
2000232	Photocopies				0.50				The state of the s
Jan 3/2019 2000233	Prints Photocopies				0.50				
Jan 4/2019 2002202	Prints Photocopies				0.25				
2002202			V A						
TOTALS	CHE + RECOV		TOTAL	DISBS	+ FEES		- RECEIPTS	BALANCE = A/R	TRUST
PERIOD	17.48 511.50		313.98 313.98	0.00	0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
END DATE			,13,90	0.00				41 0 H0450	
FIRM TOTAL	CHE + RECOV		TOTAL	DISBS	+ FEES	+ TAX	- RECEIPTS	= A/R	TRUST
PERIOD	17.48 511.50		313.98	0.00	0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
END DATE	17 40 511 50	27705 00 203						n nn	
	17.48 511.50	27785.00 283	513.90	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
REPORT SELEC		27785.00 283	513.90			0.00	0.00	0.00	
Layout Templ	TIONS - Client Ledger ate	27785.00 283	Default			0.00	0.00	0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter	27785.00 283	Default None	ecurity Res	_		0.00	0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday	ecurity Res	trictions)			0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday	ecurity Res	trictions)			0.00	*
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188	ecurity Res	trictions)			0.00	*
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All	ecurity Res	trictions)			0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All	ecurity Res	trictions)			0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All	ecurity Res	trictions)			0.00	**
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for No Activity	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All No Default No No Dec/31/21	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	*
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All No No	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Billed Only	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Entries Show	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Matter Intro Matter Intro Mesponsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for Now Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Billed Only n - Disbursements n - Receipts n - Time or Fees	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Incl. Matter	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Billed Only n - Disbursements n - Receipts n - Time or Fees n - Trust s with Retainer Bal	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:)	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Sort New Page for New Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Incl. Matter Incl. Matter	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Billed Only n - Disbursements n - Receipts n - Time or Fees n - Trust s with Retainer Bal s with Neg Unbld Disb	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All Active, I Default No No Dec/31/21 No	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Matter Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Incl. Matter Trust Accoun Working Lawy	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Billed Only n - Disbursements n - Receipts n - Time or Fees n - Trust s with Retainer Bal s with Neg Unbld Disb ter	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All Active, Default No	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for Now Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Incl. Matter Trust Accoun Working Lawy Include Corr	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter S Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Billed Only n - Disbursements n - Receipts n - Time or Fees n - Trust s with Retainer Bal s with Neg Unbld Disb t	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesda) 14.1 (14 7188 All All All All All All All Active, Default No	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:	54:11 PM		0.00	
Layout Templ Advanced Sea Requested by Finished Ver Matters Clients Major Client Client Intro Responsible Assigned Law Type of Law Select From Matters Sort New Page for Now Page for No Activity Firm Totals Totals Only Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Entries Show Incl. Matter Trust Accoun Working Lawy Include Corr	TIONS - Client Ledger ate rch Filter s Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer Lawyer yer by Each Lawyer Each Matter Date Only n - Disbursements n - Receipts n - Time or Fees n - Trust s with Retainer Bal s with Neg Unbld Disb t er ected Entries # on Paid Payables Address	27785.00 283	Default None Liba (Se Wednesday 14.1 (14.7 7188 All All All All All All All All All A	ecurity Res y, March 13 .1.20150324	trictions) , 2019 at 12:	54:11 PM		0.00	

1ar/13/2019

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Client Ledger
To Feb/15/2019
Chq# |----- General -----|

Disbs

Fees

Page: 6

Inv# Acc

Bld |-----|

Disbs

Rcpts

Chq#

Rcpts Entry # Explanation Rec# Show Trust Summary by Account Show Irust Summary by Account
Show Interest
Interest Up To
Show Invoices that Payments Were Applied to
Display Entries in No Mar/13/2019 No Date Order

Received From/Paid To

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB-2017-0049 Hydro One Distribution Board File Number	è				OSEA Party Name	<u> </u>
Legal Counsel Name		Year of Call			Law Firm	
Marion Fraser Consultant Name		37 s Relevant Experier um vitae must be atta		M	arion Fraser Enterprises Consultant Firm	Inc.
	Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub-	Total	HST	Total
Preparation	11	\$330.00	\$3,63	30.00	\$471.90	\$4,101.90
Attendance - Technical Conference	19	\$330.00	\$6,2	70.00	\$815.10	\$7,085.10
Attendance- Settlement Conference						
Attendance - Oral Hearing						
Argument - Prep						
Research support						
TOTALS	30		\$9,90	00.00	\$1,287.00	\$11,187.00
Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If a	ipplicable, state	e exchange rate , a	nd country	of initial cu	urrency:	

Appendix B

DOCKET

Board Fil	e Number	EB-2017-0049	Ontario Sustainable Enengy Association Party Name				n			
		Marion Fraser Enterprises Inc.								
	Date	Explanation	Consultant	Preparation	Attendance TC	Attendance SC	Attendance OH	Argument		Total
	18/01/2018	Review of Evidence	MEF	4						
	21/01/2018	Draft Interrogatories	MEF	3						
	13/02/2018	Review of IRRs	MEF	4						
	01/03/2018	Technical Conference	MEF		7					
	02/03/2018	Technical Conference Phone	MEF		6					
	05/03/2018	Technical Conference Phone	MEF		6					
Total				11	19	(0		0	3