File No.:

EB-2007-050

THE ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD

IN THE MATTER OF the Ontario Energy Board Act, 1998, S.O. 1998, c.15 (Sched. B);

AND IN THE MATTER OF an Application by Hydro One Networks Inc., pursuant to section 92 of the Act, for an Interim Order or Orders granting leave to construct a transmission reinforcement project between the Bruce Power Facility and the Milton Switching Station, all in the Province of Ontario.

COST SUBMISSIONS OF POWERLINE CONNECTIONS

BACKGROUND:

- Powerline Connections comprises a group of approximately 200 property owners directly affected by the Applicant's proposal. Powerline Connections has Intervenor standing in this matter.
- 2. On the basis of the foregoing, and pursuant the *Ontario Energy Board Practice Direction on Cost Awards*, July 4, 2007 Decision and Order, Letter dated May 23, 2008 from the OEB setting the schedule for the Staged Cost Award Process and Procedural Order No. 11 dated June 17, 2008, it is respectfully submitted that Powerline Connections is eligible for an award of costs in respect of section 92 (1.1) proceedings (the "Leave to Construct Proceedings").

PRINCIPLES IN AWARDING COSTS:

- 3. Powerline Connections respectfully submits that its participation in the Leave to Construct Proceedings was reasonable.
- 4. Through intensive discussions with the Applicant prior to the commencement of the hearing, Powerline Connections:
 - a. narrowed the issues for the hearing;
 - b. saved time, costs and Board resources;
 - c. limited the need for its own involvement at the hearing, thereby maximizing the efficiency of the Board's process, avoiding duplication of effort, scoping cross-examinations, and ensuring timely completion of the hearing;
 - d. avoided the time and expense of preparing for the hearing; and,
 - achieved a high degree of success in resolving its owners' concerns in a cost effective and efficient manner.
- 5. Powerline Connections submits that its contribution to the Leave to Construct Proceedings conclusively supports the costs claimed herein as reasonable and justifiable in the circumstances.

REIMBURSEMENT FOR COSTS CLAIMED:

- 6. Powerline Connections seeks reimbursement for Counsel Fees as outlined on the Board Approved form entitled: Summary Statement of Hours-Consultants and Legal Counsel, submitted for each timekeeper, attached hereto as Appendix "B" Form 1, together with detailed time dockets.
- 7. Powerline Connections also seeks reimbursement for disbursements as set on the Board approved form entitled: *Summary of Disbursements*, attached hereto as Appendix "B" Form 2.

GOODS AND SERVICE TAX:

8. Powerline Connections relies on the Board approved form entitled: *Affidavit in Support of Cost Claim*, attached hereto as Appendix "B" – Form 3, which summarizes the cost claim of Powerline Connections and includes a claim for reimbursement of GST.

::ODMA\PCDOCS\TOR01\3845003\1

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number	_		Powerline Con	nections	
Sarah Schmidt Legal Counsel Name	<u>N/A – La</u> Year	aw Clerk of Call	Borden Ladner	Gervais LLP Law Firm	
Consultant Name	Years (Curri	s of Relevant Experience culum vitae must be atta	eached)	Consultant Firm	<u> </u>
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation (to Nov. 15, 2007)	112.9	\$80.00	\$9,032.00	\$451.60	\$9,483.60 🗸
Preparation (from Nov. 16, 2007)	<i>→</i> 73.5	\$100.00	\$7,350.00	\$367.50	\$7,717.50
Attendance – Technical Conference					
Attendance – Settlement Hearing					
Attendance – Oral Hearing					
Argument					
Case Management					
			,		
TOTALS:	186.40 ¬		\$16,382.00	\$819.10	\$17,201.10
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars.	If applicable, state	e exchange rate	, and country of	initial currency	

^{* \$80/}hr up to Nov 15, 2007; \$100/hr from Nov 16/07 forward

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number Stephen F. Waque Legal Counsel Name		1979 ar of Call	P <u>Borde</u>	cline Connections Carty Name n Ladner Gervais aw Firm	LLP
Consultant Name	Yea (curric	rs of Relevant Experie	ence	Consultant Fi	rm
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation (to Nov. 15/07)		\$210.00	\$3,129.00	\$156.45	\$3,285.45 <i>U</i>
Preparation (from Nov. 16/07)	13.1	\$330.00	\$4,323.00	\$216.15	\$4,539.15 V
Attendance – Technical Conference					<u>, </u>
Attendance - Settlement Hearing					
Attendance – Oral Hearing					
Argument					
Case Management					
TOTALS:	28.0 \		\$7,452.00	\$372.60	\$7,824.60
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If ap			and country of initial cur	rency	

^{* \$210/}hr up to Nov. 15, 2007; \$330/hr from Nov. 16, 2007 forward

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number				ne Connections rty Name		
Sean L. Gosnell Legal Counsel Name	1982 Year of Call			Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm		
Consultant Name	Yea (curric	rs of Relevant Experi culum vitae must be attack	ience hed)	Consultant Fir	m	
·	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total	
Preparation (from Nov. 16/07)	2.5	\$330.00	\$825.00	\$41.25	\$866.25	
Attendance – Technical Conference						
Attendance – Settlement Hearing						
Attendance – Oral Hearing						
Argument						
Case Management		·	·			
TOTALS:	2.5 🔾	\$330.00	\$825.00	\$41.25	\$866.25	
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If app	licable, state excha	ange rate	, and country of initial curre	ency		

^{* \$210/}hr up to Nov. 15, 2007; \$330/hr from Nov. 16, 2007 forward

APPENDIX "B" FORM 1 SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

Frank J. Sperduti Legal Counsel Name	Board File Number 1998 Year of Call		Powerline Connections Party Name Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm		
Years of Rele	evant Experience	Consultant Fir	m	sultant Name	
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	(Curriculum vitae mus Sub-Total	t be attached) GST	Total
Preparation (to Nov. 15, 2007)	56.40	\$165.00	\$9,306.00	\$465.30	Total \$9771.30
Preparation (from Nov. 16, 2007)	24.60	\$230.00	\$5,658.00	\$284.25	\$5,969.25
Attendances (to Nov. 15, 2007): Technical Conference on Oct 15 & 16 - 21.6 hrs	21.6	\$165.00	\$3,564.00	\$178.20	\$3,742.20
Attendance – Settlement Hearing					
Attendance – Oral Hearing (to Nov. 15/07) Issues Conference on Sept 10 & 11 - 14 hrs; Issues Day on Sept 17 - 10.7 hrs	24.7	\$165.00	\$4,075.50	\$203.78	\$4,279.28
Attendance – Oral Hearing (from Nov. 16/07) Issues Day/Motion Day on Feb. 21 – 8.9 hrs, Leave to Construct on May 1, 2, 5, 7, 8, 9 & 13 – 41.2 hrs	50.1	\$230.00	\$11,523.00	\$576.15	\$12,099.15
Argument		·			
Case Management					
		·			
TOTALS:	177.40		\$34,126.50	\$1,706.33	\$35,832.83
Note: All claims	must be in Canadian	n Dollars. If applicable, s	tate exchange rate	, and countr	y of initial currency

^{* 165/}hr up to Nov. 15, 2007; \$230/hr from Nov. 16, 2007 forward

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number		Powerline Connections Party Name				
Andrew Brown Legal Counsel Name	N/A – Law Clerk Year of Call			Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm		
Consultant Name	Year (curric	rs of Relevant Experulum vitae must be attac	ience hed)	Consultant F	irm ·	
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total	
Preparation (from Nov. 16, 2007)	2.8	\$100.00	\$280.00	\$14.00	\$294.00	
Attendance – Technical Conference						
Attendance – Settlement Hearing						
Attendance - Oral Hearing						
Argument						
Case Management						
		,				
TOTALS:	2.8 🔻 .	\$100.00	\$280.00	\$14.00	\$294.00	
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If app	olicable, state excha	ange rate	, and country of initial cu	rrency		

^{* \$80/}hr up to Nov 15, 2007; \$100/hr from Nov 16/07 forward

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number	_		Power Party Nar	line Connections		
Janice Francis Legal Counsel Name	N/A – Law Clerk Year of Call		Border	Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm		
Consultant Name	Year (curric	Years of Relevant Experience Consultant Financial Consultant Financia Consultant Financia Consultant Financia Consultant Financia Consu			rm	
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total	
Preparation (from Nov. 16, 2007)	0.4	\$100.00	\$40.00	\$2.00	\$42.00	
Attendance – Technical Conference						
Attendance – Settlement Hearing						
Attendance – Oral Hearing						
Argument			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
Case Management						
TOTALS:	0.4 7	\$100.00	\$40.00	\$2.00	\$42.00	
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If ap		nge rate	, and country of initial cur	rency		

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number	_		Powerli Party Nam	ne Connections	
	Student at Law Year of Call		Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm		
Consultant Name	Year (curric	rs of Relevant Exper- ulum vitae must be attac	ience hed)	Consultant Fi	rm
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation (to Nov. 15, 2007)	1.2	\$80.00	\$96.00	\$4.80	\$100.80
Attendance – Technical Conference					
Attendance – Settlement Hearing					
Attendance – Oral Hearing					
Argument					
Case Management					
TOTALS:	1.2	\$80.00	\$96.00	\$4.80	\$100.80
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If ap		nge rate	_, and country of initial curre	ency	•

^{* \$80/}hr up to Nov 15, 2007; \$100/hr from Nov 16/07 forward

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number	_		Powerlir Party Name	e Connection	1S
F. Wong La Legal Counsel Name	w Librarian Year of (Call	Borden Ladner Gervais LLP Law Firm		
Consultant Name	Year (currie	rs of Relevant Exper	ience hed)	Consultant	Firm
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation (to Nov. 15, 2007)	1.5	\$80.00	\$120.00	\$6.00	\$126.00
Attendance – Technical Conference					
Attendance – Settlement Hearing					
Attendance – Oral Hearing					
Argument					
Case Management					
TOTALS:	1.5 🔾	\$80.00	\$120.00	\$6.00	\$126.00
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If ap	plicable, state excha	ange rate	, and country of initial currer	icy	

^{* \$80/}hr up to Nov 15, 2007; \$100/hr from Nov 16/07 forward

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS – CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number		-	Powerline Conr Party Name	nections	
Richard Manias Legal Counsel Name	S <u>tudent at law</u> Year of Call		Borden Ladner Ger Law Firm	vais LLP	
Consultant Name	Yea (curric	rs of Relevant Experience	nce ed)	Consultant Fi	rm
	Hours	Hourly Rate *	Sub-Total	GST	Total
Preparation (to Nov. 15, 2007)	45.9	\$80.00	\$3,672.00	\$183.60	\$3,855.60
Attendance – Technical Conference					
Attendance – Settlement Hearing					
Attendance – Oral Hearing (to Nov. 15/07) Issues Day on Sept 10 & 17 – 17.2 hrs	17.2	\$80.00	\$1,376.00	\$68.80	\$1,444.80
Argument					
Case Management					
TOTALS:	63.1 \	\$80.00	\$5,048.00	\$252.40	\$5,300.40 \/
Note: All claims must be in Canadian Dollars. If a	pplicable, state excha	ange rate,	and country of initial curre	ncy	•

::ODMA\PCDOCS\TOR01\3842484\4

^{* 80/}hr up to Nov. 15, 2007; \$100/hr from Nov. 16, 2007 forward

FORM 2

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number			ne Connections y Name
		LP for Powerline Connecti made the Disbursement	ons
	Net Cost	GST @ 5%	Sub-Total
Photocopies	\$875.00	\$43.75	
Printing			
Fax	\$14.75	\$0.74	
Courier	\$12.90	\$0.65	
Telephone			
Postage			
Transcripts	·	•	
Travel: Air			
Travel: Car	\$100.90	\$5.05	
Travel: Rail			
Travel: Other			
Taxi or Airport Limo	\$119.99	\$6.00	
Accommodation			
Meals	\$153.57	\$7.68	
Other: binding	\$75.94	\$3.80	
	<u></u>		Grand Total
Sub-totals	\$1,353.05	\$67.67	\$1,420.70
Notes: 1. All claims for disb	oursements must include re	eceipts where practicable	
			nd country of initial currency

FORM 3

AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

2007-EB-0050 Board File Number		Powerline Connections Party Name
Items Claimed excluding GST		
Legal / Counsel Fees	Disbursements	Net Sub-Total
\$64,369.50	\$1,353.05	\$65,722.55
Goods and Services Tax		
Full Registrant Unregistrant (GST @ 5%) Other GST @ 5%		Qualifying Non-Profit (GST @ 3%) Tax Exempt (no GST)
Total Cost Claim		
Net Sub-Total +	Total GST Claimed	Total Cost Claim
\$65,722.55	\$3,286.15	\$69,008.78
I, <u>Frank Sperduti</u> , of the Regional I MAKE OATH AND SAY:	Municipality of City of Vaughan	in the Regional Municipality of York,
1. I am a representative of the aborattested to herein	ve noted party (the "party") and	as such have knowledge of the matters
2. I have examined the above Cost	Claim and all of the documentat	tion in support of it
3. The above Cost Claim represent its intervention in the Ontario Energ	s only costs incurred directly and gy Board Process (the file number	d necessarily by the party for the purpose of er of which is set out above)
SWORN (OR AFFIRMED) BEFOR	RE ME	
AT THE City of Toronto on 5th At	agust, 2008	
Commissioner for to	aking Affidavits	Signature of Deponent

Date	Name	Hours	OEB Rate	Claim	Narrative
	Brown - Law Clerk				
Time	from Nov. 16/07		-		
03/12/2007	Brown, Andrew	2.8	\$100/hr	\$280.00	Empiles E Consulction A LEI
			V.O.	\$200.00	Email to F. Sperduti re: Appeal file status, review and revise client spread sheet.
Janice	Francis - Law Clerk				
Time	from Nov. 16/07		 		
30/11/2007	Francis, Janice L.	0.4	\$100/hr	*40.00	
		0.4	\$100/11	\$40.00	Determined the status of an action at the Divisional Court.
Sean	Gosnell - Partner				
	from Nov. 16/07				
08/05/2008	Gosnell, Sean L.	2.5	\$330/hr	\$825.00	Work re hearing monitoring.
	anias - Student-at-Law				
	ne to Nov. 15/07				
07/09/2007	Manias, Richard	2.3	\$80/hr		Prep re issues conference for Sept 10, 2007
10/09/2007	Manias, Richard	9.9	\$80/hr		Issues Conference at OEB
11/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.2	\$80/hr		Review of correspondence re issues conference
12/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.2	\$80/hr		Meeting with F. Sperduti re research for Issues Day
12/09/2007	Manias, Richard	4.8	\$80/hr		Research for Issues Day (Sept 17, 2007)
12/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.3	\$80/hr		Phone conversation with Rob Barlow re Issues Conference and Issues Day
13/09/2007 13/09/2007	Manias, Richard	8.8	\$80/hr		Research for Issues Day re case law and legislation
13/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.3	\$80/hr		Briefed F. Wong on file re international case law and secondary sources
13/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.2	\$80/hr		Email and phone correspondence with F. Wong re EMF and rate increase research
14/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.9	\$80/hr		Meeting with F. Sperduti re research for Issues Day
14/09/2007	Manias, Richard Manias, Richard	0.4	\$80/hr		Phone and email correspondence with F. Wong re UK and Aust case law research
14/09/2007	Manias, Richard	3.4	\$80/hr		Reaseach re Issues Day; reviewing US case law
16/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.4	\$80/hr		Emails to F. Sperduti re new US cases found for issues day
16/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.2	\$80/hr		Email correspondence from F. Sperduti re EMF standards
16/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.1	\$80/hr	·	Read email from Powerline (Lightning Rod)
16/09/2007	Manias, Richard	7	\$80/hr \$80/hr		Federal standards research on EMFs
17/09/2007	Manias, Richard	7.3	\$80/hr		Meeting with F. Sperduti re compiling information for Issues Day; prepared issue day materials
18/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.1	\$80/hr		Attended Issues Day Hearing at OEB with F. Sperduti
21/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.1	\$80/hr		Emailed provincial policy statement to Basil Alexander
		0.1	Φ00/111		Email correspondence with S. Schmidt re Lazar case
26/09/2007	Manias, Richard	0.4	\$80/hr		Meeting with S. Schmidt re HONI meeting on Sept. 25/07 and technical conference at OEB on Oct 15/07; ema
26/09/2007.	Manias, Richard	0.5	\$80/hr		re southwest decision Review of southwest decision
26/09/2007	Manias, Richard	1	\$80/hr		Researching OEB technical conference requirements
		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			Email/rayiou of polluticis and all first
• •		i			Email/review of pollution probe's further submissions on the proposed ToR; reviewed OEB's decision on Issue
28/09/2007	Manias, Richard	1.2	\$80/hr	•	Day hearing; S. Schmidt email re OEB order reinforcement project in City of Brampton; meeting and email with F. Sperduti re decision

01/10/2007	Manias, Richard	11.8	\$80/hr		Phone message and conversations with F. Sperduti re drafting technical conference questions; email exchange with F. Sperduti; discussion with S. Schmidt re technical questions; drafting questions for technical conference; faxed draft question to F. Sperduti; meeting with S. Schmidt; email from A. Brown; meeting with F. Sperduti; emailed OEB and all intervenors with Powerline's questions for technical conference
04/10/2007	Manias, Richard	0.2	\$80/hr		Email from R. Barlow; discussion with S. Schmidt
04/10/2007	Manias, Richard	0.3	\$80/hr		Printed out lead use self-use for County
		63.1	400///	\$5,048.00	Printed out land use policy for F. Sperduti
	Schmidt - Law Clerk	-			
1in	ne to Nov. 15/07				
02/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	3.7	\$80/hr		Receive and review 18 emails and their attachments and links from Chris Aristedes Pappas to Messrs Waque and Cooke and work on brief of documents; conduct additional online searching re links provided.
03/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	3.9	\$80/hr		Continue work on brief of documents re Bruce to Milton from Pappas.
08/08/2007 09/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah Schmidt, Sarah	1.3	\$80/hr \$80/hr		Receive additional emails forwarded by C. Manulak from Mr. Johnston and review and organize for 3rd binder. Work on 3rd binder of emails received from Richard Johnson.
14/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	1	\$80/hr		Finalize Bill of Costs re access and forward to Stephen Waque
20/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.8	\$80/hr		Receive and review further emails for binders from Stephen; emails from and to Stephen and student (Richard Manias) re meeting to discuss research; receive and distribute to conference call group the OEB decision
21/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	5	\$80/hr		Draft chronology to include relevant dates and upcoming deadlines; review August 20 2007 OEB Order and not deadlines in chronology; update index and binder of Richard Johnson's emails with 2 additional documents;
23/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	3	\$80/hr	-	Meet with Stephen Waque and receive instructions re point person to receive calls re access; email to Rob Barlow to ask he provide my email address;
29/08/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	1	\$80/hr		Scan September 2007 article by Jennifer McPhee which is critical of regulation exempting IPSP from rigorous EA and forward article to Stephen Waque, Richard Manias and Chris Bancroft-Wilson;
07/09/2007 08/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah Schmidt, Sarah	3 0.1	\$80/hr		Receive instructions re preparation for Issues Conference; review August re Issues Conference; confer with assistant to type draft Issues List; email to Stephen Waque and Frank Sperduti re preparation; email to Bill Allison and Chris Bancroft-Wilson for their comments re issues list.
	Committi, Caran	0.1	\$80/hr		Receive and respond to email from Chris Bancroft-Wilson.
11/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	6.5	\$80/hr		Meet with Stephen Waque and Frank Sperduti; receive telephone call from Rob Barlow, Pat Crouse re access issues; create binder for Access Issues; meeting with Stephen Waque re access issues;
12/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	5.7	\$80/hr		Receive and respond to emails and telephone calls re access; meet with Stephen Waque and discuss access issues.file organization.
13/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	5.6	\$80/hr		Receive and respond to email from Rob Barlow; receive email re Ms. Messerschmitt and return her call re access issues; receive telephone call from Helen Andonian re access issues; email to Stephen Waque and Frank Sperduti re need for instructions reaccess and need to contact Hydro One as it appears they are operating outside of the early access order; meeting with Frank Sperduti to discuss access; receive message from Helen Andonian indicating access letter from Hydro received re week of September 17; draft email to Frank re access issues.
14/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	8.6	\$80/hr		Receiving and reponding to questions from landowners re access; telephone calls and email to Stephen Waque re access issues; telephone call to Mike Sheehan; email to Powerline members to report call with Hydro has taken place and further call to occur today; conference call with Mike Sheehan, Gail Brearley and Stephen Waque; assist in preparation of report to clients; send report to clients via email, fax and mail; receive telephon call from Chris Bancroft-Wilson and call from Bill Allsion; email Issues List to Bill; telephone call to Bill Allsion.

			T I	
17/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	6.1	\$80/hr	Receive telephone call from Gwen Charlton re access; receive telephone call from Frank Sperduti re email Rob Barlow was to send re Issues Day; telephone call/email to Jim Magwood - message left; telephone call to Rob Barlow; receive 4 faxes from RobBarlow and have 2 sets of copies delivered to Frank Sperduti at Issues Day held at OEB; receive telephone call from Mary Kowaltschuk re rumour of transmission line to to south, not north; telephone call to Gail Brearley re access issues; discussion with Andy Brown re Margaret Stacey inquiry; telephone calls to Gail Charlton and Mary Kowaltschuk in evening to report on information from Gail Brearley.
				Telephone call to Mr. Waque for instructions; receive numerous emails and telephone calls from landowners including Bill Allison, Ms. Frook, Mr. Hachman, Wayne Church, Rob Barlow, and Steven Joyce relating to pre-
21/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	7.6	\$80/hr	payment and access issues; email to Stephen Waque and Frank Sperduti; email to Gail Brearley re access issues.
22/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	1.9	\$80/hr	Email to Mr. Waque and Mr. Sperduti re questions from clients re prepayment; telephone call with Mr. Waque to
	January January	1.0	Ψ00/11	discuss further; receive and respond to email from Mr. Barlow re access issues. Draft email to Ms. Frook responding to 2 questions re access and refer other 2 issues to Mr. Waque; review Mr.
23/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.8	\$80/hr	Waque's responding email.
				Email to Gail Brearley re various access and pre-payment issues; lengthy telephone call with Gail Brearley to
24/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.9	\$80/hr	discuss access and pre-payment issues; receive and review email from Gail Brearley.
26/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.6	\$80/hr	Review email from Bill Allison reporting re September 25 meeting; receive email from Michelle D'Auraia re access; telephone call to Michelle; file organization.
28/09/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	6.2	\$80/hr	Receive email from Janna Imrie; receive voicemail from Gail Brearley; email list of additional clients to Gail; receive instructions from Stephen Waque re reporting letter to client; revise letter in accordance with his instructions and send by email and post to clients; telephone call with Rob Barlow; receive and respond to email from Gwen Charlton.
01/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	3.7	\$80/hr	Receive and review email from Stephen Waque re technical conference; review OEB rules re Technical Conference;
02/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	2	\$80/hr	Meet with Frank Sperduti re file organization; create binder for Technical Conference; forward Powerline Technical Questions to community representatives
11/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	2.3	\$80/hr	Receive and respond to email from Frank Sperduti re EMF article author and Chris Bancroft-Wiilson; telephone call from Dick Christaens; work on updating client binder; receive request from Frank Sperduti re Technical Submissions of other intervenors, and respond to same.
12/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	1.2	\$80/hr	Receive voicemail message from Jim Magwood re response to Technical Questions from Hydro and forward letter and voicemail to Stephen Waque and Frank Sperduit; receive telephone call from Cathy McCartney; receive voicemail message from Janna Imrie and email Hydro and speak to Hydro in response.
15/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	4.4	\$80/hr	Update client binder; receive emails from Gail Brearley re Janna Imrie; telephone call to Janna Imrie; review chart of contact info for Heather Frook; telephone call to Alex Burnett; respond to email from Cathy McCartney.
16/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	2	\$80/hr	Receive message from Gwen Charlton and return her call; email to Hydro re Ms. Charlton; email from Gail Brearley re Mr. Barber and telephone call to him; request search be updated re Mr. Barber; received request from Frank Sperduti to forward our TOR submission to Ross firm and did so; recevie email from Gail Brearley re Janna Imrie and forward to Janna; receive telephone call from Robert McClure re appraisal and email Stephen Waque and Frank Sperduti in regard to his request.
				Receive voicemail message from Helen Andonian; telephone call to Gail Brearley to discuss various access issues and requests; telephone call to Mr. Allen's daughter; telephone call to Christina Manulak re question from Hydro agent; telephone call with Helen Andonian; receive and respond to email from Frank re contact information; email Gwen Charlton re access issues; receive notice re access re Mr. Allen; have October 15 and 16th transcripts re technical conference copied and bound for file. receive request from Hydro to confirm
18/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	5.8	\$80/hr	Liedtkes are clients and provide.

20//0/202					Receive and review client list from Hydro and compare to our client list and email Gail Brearley in response; telephone call with Gail Brearley to discuss access issues, including hunting season; email to and from Leslee Einmann; receive instructions from Stephen Waque; request and receive from Hydro list of Powerline clients who have not applied for \$2500 access payment from Hydro and provide to Mr. Waque; telephone call and email to John Eppenberger (voicemal left); telephone call and email to Dr. Charlton re EMF expert; review research
22/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	6.1	\$80/hr		binders.
23/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	3.5	\$80/hr		Receive voicemail message from John Eppenberger; reveiw email from Frank Sperduti re report on Technical Conference and forward to Community representatives; receive instructions from Stephen Waque; lengthy telephone call with Bill Allison to discuss EMF expert, November 7 meeting with politicians; compensation meetings held to date; continue review of research binders; receive email from Dr. Chalton re EMF expert.
24/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	5.5	\$80/hr		Review transcripts from Technical Conference; email to Gord Nettleton to request powerpoint presenation shown at Technical Conference; email to 2 arborists and to Dr Havas, EMF expert; ; telephone callwith Cathy McCartney.
25/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	2.3	\$80/hr		Receive email from Frank and Stephen reporting on Hydro's position re request for adjournment and strategy going forward and provide to community representatives; update chronology and reporting letter binders;
26/10/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.2 112.9	\$80/hr	* 0.000.00	Telephone call to Trevor Wilson - line busy send email re documents he is requesting referred to in transcripts from Technical Conference;
		112.3		\$9,032.00	
Time	from Nov 16/07				
27/11/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.5	\$100/hr		Email to F Sperduti to request update re Fallis application; review and consider OEB file re OPA's application fo Approval of IPSP;
29/11/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.4	\$100/hr		email with F Sperduti re status of Fallis application; email to OEB requesting confirmation re deadlines;
04/12/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.1	\$100/hr		brief discussion with S Waque re OEB October 24 letter and email to mayors;
10/12/2007	Schmidt, Sarah	0.3	\$100/hr		Make cursory review of materials filed by HONI November 30 with OEB but delivered to us today - updating application;
YEAR 08			 		
12/02/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	2.7	\$100/hr		File organization; review new OEB procedural order and diarize dates; review Nettleton Feb 7 letter; update binders.
14/02/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.6	\$100/hr		3 emails from Frank Sperduti; organize and provide OEB documents to F Sperduti; update orders binder.
15/02/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.3	\$100/hr		Email to/from Tom Murtagh re land agent; consulted by Sean re list of Intervenors and provide recent order including list and Issues list.
19/02/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	2.8	\$100/b	•	Telephone call with James Thoman; update client binder, review email from Jim Magwood and update chart;
25/02/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	. 2.3	\$100/hr \$100/hr		review correspondence from OEB re issues day.
29/02/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	1 2.3	\$100/hr \$100/hr	<u> </u>	Meeting with S Waque
03/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	3.6	\$100/hr \$100/hr	······································	work on Written Interrogatories - brief of those received to date.
04/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.5	\$100/hr	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Begin review of Technical Conference Transcript for background to drafting Written Interrogatories.
05/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	7	\$100/hr		Work on Written Interrogatories.
		<u> </u>	\$1007111		Work on Written Interrogatories; telephone call to S Waque to discuss written interrogatores.
06/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	8.2	\$100/hr	·	Work on Written Interrogatories; prepare for meeting with S Waque - meeting aborted; continue work on writter interrogatories.
	•				Continue work on Written Interrogatories; meeting with S Waque re Written Interrogatories; consult with N Bernst and D Gendron re work on written interrogatories; work on binder of Written Interrogatores; work on interrogatories in the contract of the Co
07/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	9:8	\$100/hr	••	interrogatories from Oct 16 transcript; provide reference materials to S Waque re written Interrogatories; emails to S Waque re status of Written Interrogatories.
09/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	1.8	\$100/hr	•	Review and revise draft Written Interrogatories; email draft to S Waque; telepone call to S Waque to discuss; 2 emails from S Waque.

		T			
10/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	4.6	\$100/hr		File organization; receive and review Written Interrogatories from numerous Intervenors and organize binder; review procedural orders 5 and 6; briefly meet with S Waque re Written Interrogatories; proof revised Draft Interrogatories and further review; arrange for Written Interrogatories to be delivered to OEB and also email
11/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.5	\$100/hr		OEB, Applicant and all Intervenors with our questions.
		- 0.0	\$100/11		Receive and organize Written Interrogatories from multiple Intervenors;
12/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.8	\$100/hr		Receipt of emails containing HONI's responses to IR's and updating of brief; consult N Bernst re updating of Intervenor list.
					Receive and review further emails from Pappas re Written Interrogatories; receive, review and forward to S
14/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.5	0400#		Waque a letter from HONI re their response to Powerline Interrogatories as well as further email from Ross
17/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.5	\$100/hr		Group re possible motion to compel HONI's responses; update IR binder and chronology.
18/03/2008	Schmidt, Sarah		\$100/hr		Further emails from C Pappas and updating binder with same
29/04/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.1	\$100/hr		Email from OEB re list of Intervenors
05/05/2008		4.7	\$100/hr		Telephone call with Bill Allison and email to him re letter; work on letter; file organization.
07/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	1.3	\$100/hr		Monitor Ontario Energy Board Hearing.
08/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.6	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB Hearing; email to S Waque and F Sperduti.
09/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	1.9	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB Hearing.
12/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	2.8	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB Hearing.
13/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	2	\$100/hr		Monitor Hearing.
14/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.6	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB hearing.
	Schmidt, Sarah	2.6	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB Hearing.
15/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	1.6	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB hearing; meet briefly with S Waque and F Sperduti re hearing.
20/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	1.6	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB Hearing - review website; telephone call and email to OEB re status of hearing, status of website status of transcripts - not updated since May 13, calendar being out of date, no updated orders provided; telephone call with G Brearley re hearing dates; telephone call with OEB re hearing dates; email to F Sperduti and S Waque re 3 more hearing days in May and June.
21/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	4.5	\$100/hr		Receive email from OEB providing May 15 and 16 transcripts; telephone call from F Sperduti re status of OEB hearing; review transcripts and draft summary.
22/05/2008	Schmidt, Sarah	0.7	\$100/hr		Monitor OEB Hearing.
		73.5		\$7,350.00	The first of the f
Frank	Sperduti - Partner				
	e to Nov. 15/07				
13/07/2007		 			
13/07/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr		Email from S. Waque; discuss dates for meetings with C. Manulak.
16/07/2007	Sperdufi, Frank J.	1.5	\$165/hr		Review Procedural Order; discuss written interrogatories with S. Waque; instruct E. Cooke; reviewing list of written interrogatories and revise; consulted by C. Manulak.
17/07/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr		Discussion with C. Manulak; exchange emails with C. Manulak; emails from D. Klacko.
			·		Voice message from Mr. Miler at OEB; four telephone attendances with G. Nettleton; preparations for attendance on Monday; telephone attendance with Mr. Bancroft Wilson; telephone attendance with B. Allison final instructions re: settlement; telephone call to E. Lennox and receive return message; instructing C. Manula
26/07/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	3.1	\$165/hr		re: required documents; reviewing updated settlement proposal.
31/07/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	6	\$165/hr		Half time charge for travel to Orangeville for hearing; hearing sitting through lunch; half time charge for return travel.
02/08/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr		Received telephone call from B. Allison; briefing D. Klacko.
03/08/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr		Exchange emails with P. Wilson.
07/08/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.5	\$165/hr		Email from Mr. Engelberg; brief Stephen F. Waque re: progress over last two weeks.
08/08/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.4	\$165/hr		Review reply argument of HONI re: Fallis' submission; instruct Evan Cooke; emails to Stephen Waque.

09/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.8	\$165/hr	E-mails (x3) from R. Barlow; e-mail from C. Bancoft-Wilson re: issues list and review; e-mail from R. Marnias re updated issues list and review in preparation for meeting at OEB; e-mail exchange with S. Waqué; e-mail from B. Alliston re: same.
10/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	11	\$165/hr	Early morning preparation for issues conference; reviewing e-mails from Messrs. Barlow, Alliston and Bancroft-Wilson; revise draft issues list substantially; attend at OEB for issues conference all day from 9:30 a.m. until 6:00 p.m. working through lunch with Mr. Ross; briefing S. Waqué upon return to office and receive e-mail from OEB staff; receive numerous e-mails from S. Schmidt.
11/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	3	\$165/hr	Discuss draft issues list with S. Waque; attend at OEB Offices for continuation of issues conference from 10:30 a.m. to 1:00 p.m.; return to office; debriefing S. Waque and meeting S. Schmidt; discuss strategy of issues day with S. Waque; email from OEB Staff lawyer;
12/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.8	\$165/hr	Five emails from R. Barlow; emails from S. Schmidt; receive email from OEB Staff and respond; instruct R. Manias re: research of 6 issues for Monday's hearing; exchange emails with OEB Staff lawyers.
13/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	3.9	\$165/hr	Discussion with R. Manias; consulted by S. Schmidt; emails from R. Barlow and respond; lengthy discussion wit S. Schmidt; exchange emails with OEB re: issues list and Board Staff position; exchange emails with S. Waque lengthy telephone attendanceOEB Staff; email to R. Manias; meeting with R. Manias; email from M. Sheehan; review email from S. Schmidt and comment; discussion with S. Waque.
14/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.3	\$165/hr	Various emails from S. Schmidt; exchanging emails with Mr. Manias; telephone call to Q. Ross re: preparation for Monday; email from Mr. Alliston; email from S. Waque.
15/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.5	\$165/hr	Telephone attendance with Quinn Ross; email from R. Barlow; email from Mr. Ross.
16/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	7.4	\$165/hr	Discussion with R. Mancuso; preparing for contested issues day; discussion with S. Waque.
				Various omile for the Pedra it with Co. L. Wague.
17/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	10.7	\$165/hr	Various emails from Mr. Barlow; emails with S. Schmidt; early morning preparation of argument; attend issues day to argue numerous contested issues; working through lunch to prepare for EMF submissions; returning to office at 6:00 p.m.; receiving 8 emails from Mr. Barlow and review; email to S. Waque re: early access appeal b Fallis; two emails from B. Alliston.
18/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.4	\$165/hr	Instruct S. Schmidt; various emails from R. Barlow; email to S. Schmidt; briefing S. Waque and discuss Fallis
21/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr	appeal of early access ruling; email from Pollution Probe and instruct R. Manias.
22/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr	Emails from S. Schmidt; four emails from R. Barlow. Exchanging emails with S. Schmidt and S. Waque.
23/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr	Emails from S. Schmidt and S. Waque.
27/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.6	\$165/hr	Email from S. Waque re: decision of OEB on issues and respond.
28/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	1.7	\$165/hr	Draft outline of result in issues decision from S. Waque; telephone attendance with Murray Klippenstein re: technical issues interrogatories; email from Mr. Klippenstein; emails from S. Schmidt.
30/09/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	2.3	\$165/hr	Working on technical interrogatories.
01/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	3	\$165/hr	Drafting technical interrogatories; receive and review interrogatories of others; instructing R. Manias; emails from S. Waque and S. Schmidt.
02/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$165/hr	Consulted by S. Schmidt; email from OEB; email from SFW.
04/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	1	\$165/hr	Emails from S. Schmidt and R. Barlow; email from OEB re: submissions: email from OEB
05/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	. \$165/hr	Email from C. Manulak; emails to SFW.
11/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.7	\$165/hr	Emails from S. Schmidt re: upcoming technical conference; email from C. Manulak re: same; email from OEB re conference; emails from B. Alliston; letter from G. Nettleton re: procedure at technical conference; two emails from SFW; emails from P. Fallis.
	·		,	Review procedure proposed by HONI fro technical conference; exchange emails with SFW and other parties to the conference; discussion with C. Manulak; emails from S. Schmidt; voice message from M. Miller of the OEB;
12/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	1.6	\$165/hr	emails from Basil Alexander of Pollution Probe.
14/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	5.8	\$165/hr	Preparing for technical conference; various emails from clients.
15/10/2027	Consider #			Email exchange with Q. Ross; receive various emails from Mr. Barlow; attend technical conference; discussion with S. Waque re: same; working through lunch with Pollution Probe's expert; adjourn hearing at 6:15 p.m.; uno
15/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	13.2	\$165/hr	return to office, prepare for following day's questions.

16/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	8.4	\$165/hr		Early morning emails from R. Barlow; attend technical conference day 2; again working through lunch with Pete Lanzalotta; complete conference at 4:45 p.m.; receiving various emails from R. Barlow throughout the day; post conference meeting with G. Nettleton to review issue of adjournment; briefing S. Waque afterward.
18/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	1.3	\$165/hr		Draft letter to OEB to seek a request for an adjournment of the date for written interrogatories; email to Mr. Nettleton; draft cost submission re: access; exchange emails with Mr. Nettleton.
19/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	1	\$165/hr		Continue working on cost submissions.
					Draft written interregate in the second submissions.
22/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	4.7	\$165/hr		Draft written interrogatories; email from G. Nettleton; exchange emails with S. Waque; emails from S. Schmidt; instruct S. Schmidt re: search for experts; draft costs submissions; review Pollution Probe's request for adjournment.
23/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	2.1	\$165/hr		Exchange emails with Mr. Nettleton re: adjournment of next steps; exchange emails with S. Waque; letter from P. Fallis; letter form Power Worker's Union; receive lengthy HONI submissions responding to the request for adjournment and draft reportin email.
24/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.8	\$165/hr		Telephone call from R. Barlow; email from OEB; instruct S. Malcher re: completing cost submissions; various emails from parties re: timing of next steps; reporting to clients.
25/10/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.3	\$165/hr		Emails from S. Schmidt and Powerline members.
06/11/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	1	\$165/hr		Developing cost submissions; consulted by S. Schmidt; consult S. Waque.
07/11/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.6	\$165/hr		Instruct S. Malcher re: cost breakdown; email from Q. Ross and review; email to S. Waque re: access matter and Fallis appeal; receive voice message from Q. Ross; review letter for S. Waque; exchange emails with S. Schmidt.
		102.7		\$16,945.50	
Time	from Nov 16/07		 		
27/11/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.1	\$230/hr		Fred for 0.01 in
28/11/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.1	\$230/hr		Email from S. Schmidt; email to Q. Ross for update on Superior Court Applications.
		 _	Ψ230/III		Email from Q. Ross and forward to S. Waque.
29/11/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.5	\$230/hr		Exchange emails with S. Schmidt; telephone attendance with M. Engleberg; telephone attendance with S.
30/11/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.1	\$230/hr		Waque; email to S. Schmidt.
18/12/2007	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.5	\$230/hr		Receive message from M. Engelberg; report to S. Waque.
-			V200711		Discussion with S. Schmidt; email from B. Alexander; email from Q. Ross; brief S. Waque.
YEAR 08					
11/01/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.1	\$230/hr		Talacharani
31/01/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Telephone call from Mr. Engelberg at the OEB; instruct S. Schmidt.
			Ψ230/18		Email from CEB re: costs and email to S. Waque;
07/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.8	\$230/hr		Email from J. Magwood; email from OMB enclosing new procedural order; telephone call from G. Nettleton re: same.
13/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.3	\$230/hr		Email to S. Schmidt and respond; review Pollution Probe correspondence.
15/02/2008	Consider Family 1		·		Drafting letter to OEB re: issues day submissions; receive and review various letters from other counsel
13/02/2006	Sperduti, Frank J.	3.2	\$230/hr		including HONI.
19/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.3	\$230/hr	•	Receive and review Pollution Probe's submissions re: timelines; letter from OMB re: attendance on Thursday.
20/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Emails from various clients and Board intervenors.
21/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	8.9	\$230/hr		Attend OEB issues day/motion day
25/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Instruct S. Schmidt re: written interrogatories.
27/02/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	. 0.2	\$230/hr		. Various emails re: OEB process; instructing S. Schmidt; email from G. Nettleton and respond.
28/03/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Emails from OEB.
18/04/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.7	\$230/hr		Review exit letter re: OEB process and review with S. Waqué
25/04/2222					Various discussions with S. Waque throughout the day re: his communications with clients; receive and review documents from Mr. Nettleton re: settlement; revise our letter to OEB; prepare for meeting with HONI at Osler;
25/04/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	6.4	\$230/hr	·	attend same; brief S. Waqué afterward.
	•				

29/04/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	3.4	\$230/hr		Exchange emails with G. Nettleton; receive HONI's proposal fro resolution of costs; discussion with S. Waqué; responding to various client inquiries; exchange emails with Q. Ross; receive various emails from Intervenors; further exchange of emails with S. Waqué.
30/04/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	3.6	\$230/hr		Preparing for commencement of hearing; various exchanges of emails and docs with Mr. Nettleton; email to Mr. Threndyle and discuss with S. Waqué; revise said email; draft letter to Mr. Nettleton.
01/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	7.7	\$230/hr		Travel to Orangeville for commencement of hearing on leave to construct; register appearance before Board an monitor balance of hearing day; various discussions with Powerline clients throughout day; various discussions and email exchanges with S. Waqué throughout the day; various exchange of emails with S. Schmidt; lengthy telephone attendance with J. Magwood.
02/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	9.6	\$230/hr		Early morning telephone attendance with S. Waqué to brief him re: status of OEB hearing; attend hearings to monitor progress; various discussions with Powerline members throughout the day; various discussions with B. Allison re: letter to Mr. Gregg.
05/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	3.2	\$230/hr		Monitoring hearing before OEB.
06/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	1	\$230/hr		Email to clients re: progress of hearing; email from Mr. Nettleton re: hearing progress.
07/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	6.5	\$230/hr		Attend hearing at OEB offices to monitor the proceedings;
08/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	5.7	\$230/hr		Exchange emails with various parties; monitoring OEB hearing all day.
09/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	2	\$230/hr		Monitor hearing before OEB.
13/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	6.5	\$230/hr		Various discussions with community leaders; attend OEB proceeding to monitor hearing; exchange emails with S. Waqué; email from Mr. Sheehan and instruct S. Schmidt.
14/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Telephone call from B. Allison.
15/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	1.2	\$230/hr		Meeting with S. Waqué to review status of matter and next steps.
16/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Exchange emails with Q. Ross.
19/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.1	\$230/hr		Email to G. Nettleton.
20/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.3	\$230/hr		
21/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.3	\$230/hr		Exchange emails with Mr. Nettleton and S. Schmidt.
23/05/2008	Sperduti, Frank J.	0.2	\$230/hr		Emails from S. Schmidt re: approvals process; email from G. Nettleton.
		74.7	Ψ230/11I	\$17,181.00	Receive emails from OEB; instruct S. Schmidt.
					
Jessica S	tern - Student-at-Law				
17/09/2007	Stern, Jessica	1.2	\$80/hr	\$96.00	Received documents from the assistant and delivered them the Ontario Energy Board.
		 			
Stephe	n Waque - Partner				
	ne to Nov. 15/07				
12/07/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	1.2	\$210/hr		Market
16/07/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.4	\$210/hr		Meet to interview Chris Bancroft-Wilson as potential witness in Section 92 application.
17/07/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$210/hr		Conference call with Frank Sperduti outlining interogatories to be made.
		1	Ψ210/III ·		Review interogatories; draft agenda for meeting with clients; respecting non-expropriation items.
19/07/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.6	\$210/ba		Email Gregg re: evidence; telephone attendance Board council re: need to call evidence; dictate amended letter to Board to notify with respect to additional witnesses; email exchanges with Chris Bancroft-Wilson, confirm him
20/08/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$210/hr	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	as a witness and amend advice to Board
		0.3	\$210/hr		Review OEB decision on access and report
21/08/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.2	\$210/hr		Meet Richard Manias re: request to adjourn date for comments and meet R. Manias to outline argument.
28/08/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.2	\$210/hr		Telephone attendance F. Sperduti re: September 7th attendance;
					Review draft document with respect to \$2500 payment; meet S. Schmidt re: preparation for submissions to be made on issues day and developing response on terms of reference if required; amend disclosure letter to Mr.
29/08/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.4	. \$210/hr		Nettleton;
	* 4				
00/00/000=	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.1	\$210/hr		Meet Frank Sperduti re: preparation for issues day; instruct re: follow up to \$2500 payments; deliver bill for \$75,000.00 pursuant to Hydro One undertaking as companion to owner payments likely to exceed \$250,000.00;
06/09/2007	tradac, Ctephen 1.	V-1 .	9210/111		970,000.00 pursuant to Hydro One undertaking as companion to owner payments libely to accept and an

					same; email to Mike Sheehan re: complaints with respect to exercise of access; , review OEB access order and e mails from owners re: access protocol; email from Jim O'Mara, instruct S. Schmidt, re addressing owners
		İ			concerns; review progress to date on \$2500.00 payment policy and letter email to seek instructions; tolophone
11/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.		221211		attendance bill Allison re: negotiation instructions on draft letter and \$2500.00 navment; discuss tenants at OE4
11/09/2007	Waque, Stephen F.	2	\$210/hr		meeting, after amendment, clear letters for release by Hydro:
16/09/2007	Waque, Stephen F.	0.4	\$210/hr		Review progress to date on a \$2500.00 payment policy.
21/09/2007	Waque, Stephen F.	1.4	\$210/hr		Review newsletter, meet Frank Sperduti re: augmenting contested issues list; draft several issues
21/03/2007	Waque, Stephen F.	0.1	\$210/hr		l elephone attendance Rob Barlow.
22/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.5	\$210/hr		Address six emails from Sarah Schmidt re: owner's questions, telephone attendance Sarah re: responding to owner's questions, email Robert Barlow, email Frank Sperduti.
23/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.5	\$210/hr		Emails to respond in detail to owner's questions concerning access issues and next steps, respond to questions re Hydro pre payment.
27/09/2007	14//				Email from two owners and respond re: advance payment, review OMB decision on issues day and instructions
27/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.6	\$210/hr		to Frank Sperduti and Sarah Schmidt re: developing technical questions.
27/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.4	\$210/hr		Telephone attendance owner re: foster care program and negotiations with MacDonald, view draft email from Bi Allison, telephone attendance Allison.
				-	Review eight emails and develop twenty additional questions to be submitted to Ontario Hydro in anticipation of
30/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.8	\$210/hr		technical conference.
02/00/2007					
03/09/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.4	\$210/hr		Review materials on amended proposals for Bruce Nuclear; review 6 emails re: EMF information and sources.
					Consulted by Frank Sperduti; telephone attendance Rob Barlow; telephone attendance Jim O'Mara re: his new
04/40/0007	*** * * * * **				appointment; telephone attendance Bill Allison; review email from Chris Bancroff-Wilson; email Chris Bancroff-
01/10/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	1	\$210/hr		wilson re: budget; email title-searchers; further assist Frank Sperduti re: technical submissions.
					Review cost submissions; seek EMF expert; leave messages for a professor at Trent University, email re-
00/40/2027	W 1 0				adjournment strategy; email James O'Mara and respond; telephone attendance William Allen, respond to
09/10/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.4	\$210/hr		questions.
11/10/2007	1W 04				Letter to Gord Nettleton; email re: technical conference; telephone attendance Frank Sperduti re: fall-out from
11/10/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$210/hr		technical conference.
15/10/2007	Magué Ctanhan F				
19/10/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$210/hr		Telephone attendance Frank Sperduti re: preparation for technical conference; review seven emails.
13/10/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.2	\$210/hr		Email and respond re: arborist (?).
22/10/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.7	6040#		Telephone attendance Bill Allison; email Frank Sperduti; telephone attendance George Macdonald; email Len
02/11/2007	Waque, Stephen F.	0.7	\$210/hr		magan; email to owners re: prepayment; email exchange with Frank Sperduti re: interrogatory process
06/11/2007	Waque, Stephen F.	0.2	\$210/hr \$210/hr		Review Quinn Ross email and order: instruct Sarah Schmidt: review motion for interim relief
	rraque, otephen i.	14.9	\$21U/NF	£2.400.00	Review Fallis factum, review OEB letter; draft letter to report to Powerline owners;
	•	14.5	 	\$3,129.00	
Time	from Nov. 16/07			•	
		<u></u>	 		
04/12/2007	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.6	\$330/hr		Email from Board; email from Energy Probe; instructions to Sarah Schmidt; email exchanges re: draft Lightning
		0.0	\$330/11		Rod issue and report to clients.
YEAR 08			 		
14/02/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0,1	\$330/hr		Receive letter from Dates Callie
25/02/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$330/hr		Receive letter from Peter Fallis and review
05/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.2	\$330/hr		Provide direction to Sarah Schmidt re: drafting interrogatories;
			4000/111		Review first draft of written interrogatories and provide direction.
			1.		Further review of draft questions and draft approximately 30 new questions; scan interrogatories filed by four

			T		
07/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	2.1	\$330/hr		Further review of source materials including terms of reference submissions, property owner file notes and brief of reporting letters and meeting summaries; continuing to develop questions for interrogatories; conference call with Sarah Schmidt re: ongoing work to developing finalized interrogatories.
09/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	1.1	\$330/hr		Conference call with Sarah Schmidt; review draft of questions as prepared at end of day Friday by Sarah Schmidt and continue to re-write.
10/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	1.2	\$330/hr		Complete amendments and supplements to questions and background work to prepare same; review new procedural order; instructions to Sarah Schmidt re: reporting to community leaders.
12/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$330/hr	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Scan six sets of interrogatories
19/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	2	\$330/hr		Dictate separate lengthy letter re: withdrawal from OEB proceedings based on implementation of compensation policy.
25/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	1	\$330/hr		Receive 150 answers to interrogatories and briefly review email update report to community leaders.
28/03/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.2	\$330/hr		Review OEB procedural order.
13/04/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.8	\$330/hr		Review numerous emails re: interrogatories;
20/04/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.7	\$330/hr		Review Fallis documents, review Pappas documents, review pollution probe submissions; review Saugeen First Nations submissions;
28/04/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.3	\$330/hr		Email to Ted Arnott to insure that he is briefed on withdrawal from OEB hearing and status of negotiations.
30/04/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.4	\$330/hr		Review emails; review draft letter from Bill Allison; telephone attendance Frank Sperduti.
01/05/2008	Waqué, Stephen F.	0.6 13.1	\$330/hr	\$4,323.00	Telephone attendance Frank Sperduti, telephone attendance Jim Magwood; email Jim Magwood to respond to his questions concerning settlement; telephone attendance Frank Sperduti re: further attendance at OEB.
Frances V	Vong - Law Librarian			4 4,020.00	
	e to Nov. 15/07				
13/09/2007	Wong, Frances	1	\$80/hr		Florida de la constanta de la
14/09/2007	Wong, Frances	0.5	\$80/hr		literature searches on EMFs for Richard Manias
		1.5	ΨΟΟ/ΤΗ	\$120.00	literature search on power lines etc. for Richard Manias
	······································				
-					
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
			-		
	doc 3846203 v 2				
		<u> </u>	!		