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EB-2007-0050

ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD

IN THE MATTER OF the Ontario Energy Board Act,
1998, S.0.1998, c. 15, Schedule B;

AND IN THE MATTER OF an Application by Hydro
One Networks Inc. pursuant to section 92 of the Act, for an
Order or Orders granting leave to construct a transmission
reinforcement Project between the Bruce Power Facility
and Milton Switching Station, all in the Province of Ontario
(the "Leave to Construct Application™).
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The Ross Firm Professional Corporation
138 Courthouse Square

Goderich, ON

N7A 1M9

Attention: Quinn M. Ross

Ph: 519.524.5532 x.211
Fx:519.524.8438



BACKGROUND:

1.

On July 11, 2007 a letter was sent to the Board Secretary requesting intervenor
status on behalf of a group of affected landowners in the above-noted proceeding.
On July 18, 2007 a letter was sent to the Ross Firm PC confirming intervention,
subject to the Applicant’s right of objection, within 10 days of receipt of the
intervention request pursuant to Rule 23.07 of the Ontario Energy Board Rules of

Practice and Procedure. No objection was filed by the Applicant.

On May 2, 2008 at the commencement of the section 92 hearing, additional
individuals were added as a part of the Ross Firm Group, namely; Orlando
Magwood, Gloria Magwood, 1063755 Ontario Limited, James Magwood in trust,
and Andrew Magwood in trust This addition can be found at page 7 line 2-5 of
the May 2, 2008 transcript of proceedings.

Based on the foregoing the Ross Firm Group has standing as intervenors in
accordance with to Rule 23.09 of the Ontario Energy Board Rules of Practice and

Procedure.

COST ELIGIBILITY:

4. The Ross Firm Group relies on Section 30 of the Ontario Energy Board Act, its

letter of intervention, dated, July 11, 2007 and Rule 41 of the Ontario Energy
Board Rules of Practice and Procedure. Further The Ross Firm Group relies Rule
3.03(c) and 8.01 of the Ontario Energy Board — Practice Direction on Cost

Awards in claiming eligibility for a cost award.




PRINCIPLES IN AWARDING COSTS:

5. It is the submission of the Ross Firm Group that throughout this highly technical

and rapid proceeding, the group participated responsibly. This is evidenced by

their strict adherence to the Rules, timelines where possible and communication

with the Board, Board staff as well as counsel for the Applicant.

6. During the Technical Conference, Interrogatories, Motion and Hearing process,

The Ross Firm Group raised important questions on interrogatories; made

necessary submissions on motions and conducted valuable cross-examination of

the panels of witnesses put forward by the Applicant at the Hearing. This

included but was not limited to:

Within the Technical Conference Process heard on October 15 & 16, 2007:

a.

The forms of technology currently in use in the Province of Ontario and the

acceptability of using those technologies going forward.!
The rationale for using 100% MCR for transmission capacity needs.

The real possibility that the OPA assumptions of generation increase in the

Bruce was only one potential scenario.’

The reality that the use of the words ‘existing corridor’ was in fact a
misnomer, and that the proposed line would require the addition of new lands

along an existing corridor, and not the use of existing corridor lands.*

! Transcript of the Technical Conference, October 15, 2007, Page 156 line 10 to Page 159 Line 25.
? Transcript of the Technical Conference, October 15, 2007, Page 159 Line 26 to Page 161 Line 23.
3 Transcript of the Technical Conference, October 15, 2007, Page 162 Line 6 to Page 164 Line 7.

* Transcript of the Technical Conference, October 16, 2007, Page 116 Line 16 to Page 117 Line 19.




e. That the proposed route would be going through at least two environmentally

sensitive areas, namely; Camp Creek and the Niagara Escarpment.5

Within the Interrogatory Process:

f.  Of most significant note is that the Ross Firm Group requested information
from the IESO, OPA, OPG and Bruce. Although the latter two declined to
answer, the former (IESO and OPA) provided pertinent information that was

deemed relevant to the proceedings in the subsequent April 2008 Motions.

g. The Ross Firm Group requested information about the change to the bulk
power system resulting in a decrease in the transmission capacity from the

6
Bruce Area.

h. The costs of the London route with series compensation, and the documentary

evidence to substantiate those cost estimates.

i. The due diligence done with respect to series compensation as an alternative
in South Western Ontario. It was as a result of this line of questioning that the
ABB and Woodford study were released.® These documents proved to be
very important as the issue of series compensation was dealt with at the

Hearing.

j. Attempted to resolve the discrepancy between the IESO 10 year outlook

which stated that no new line was required with the current position that one

-9
1S.

3 Transcript of the Technical Conference, October 16, 2007, Page 117 Line 20 to Page 118 Line 6.
® Exhibit C Tab 9 Schedule 1 Page 1 of 4.

" Exhibit C Tab 9 Schedule 5 Page 1 of 1

8 Exhibit C Tab 9 Schedule 6 Page 1 of 2

® Exhibit C Tab 10 Schedule 10 Page 1 of 2




k. Sought and obtained an acknowledgment from the OPA that but for the OPA
interpretation of the Provincial Policy Statement other transmission

alternatives discounted by the OPA could be an appropriate solution. '’

Within the Motion process heard on April 3, 2008:

1. The Ross Firm Group brought a motion for further production in response to
refusals to answer interrogatories put to the Applicant. After a day of
argument, the Ross Firm Group was in large part successful in obtaining the
disclosure of the requested documents. Further, the Ross Firm Group made
submissions which were helpful to Pollution Probe despite their withdraw
from the Motion proceeding. The materials requested by the Pollution Probe

was also largely granted at the motion.

It is of note that several intervenors made submissions on behalf of the
Applicant and were not successful in persuading the Board from the position

posited by the Ross Firm Group.'!

Within the hearing process commencing on May 2, 2008:

m. The Ross Firm Group caused evidence to be put before the Board about the
current technical limits of the conductors used in the Bruce transmission grid,
the power factor leading to line loss and the ways this could be dealt with in a

manner other than the new line proposed by the Applicant.12

n. Brought to light that the use of ACCR or other HTLS conductor technology

was summarily dismissed and only after it was formally raised with materials

10 Exhibit C Tab 11 Schedule 18 Page 1 of 1
"' Decision and Order on Motion, April 7, 2008, Pages 5-6.
12 Transcript, Vol. 2, May 5, 2008, Page 41 Line 13 to Page 42 Line 7.




served to aid in cross examination was a one page ‘worksheet’ put together to

substantiate the dismissal.’?

o. Brought to light that the OPA did not look at any other international standards
of transmission capacity required for wind generation when creating their own

14
forecasts for need.

p. Through cross-examination clarified the driving factors of the Application and
assisted in the Board’s understanding of the project as discretionary or non-

discretionary. This is important from a filing requirement perspec’(ive.15

q. Through cross-examination elicited an acknowledgment that line security was
an issue with the new planned facilities, but that the [ESO was in the business
of planning a solution not prevention. This is very relevant when one

considers the two alternative route options presented by HONL'

r. The Ross Firm sought to have introduced the Compensation Principles created
by HONI dealing with land acquisitions. The Ross Firm Group was
successful in having this document admitted. The addition of this document

and cross-examination on it allowed for a better understanding of the overall

potential costs of the proj ect.”’

s. The evidence elicited in cross-examination where the IESO conceded that 30-
40% series compensation with a modified BSPS would be sufficient to

transmit 8 units at Bruce together with 925 MW of wind.'®

13 Transcript, Vol. 2, May 5, 2008, Page 48 Line 20 to Page 52 Line 3.

' Transcript, Vol. 2, May 5, 2008, Page 65 Line 22 to Page 68 Line 17.
15 Transcript, Vol. 2, May 5, 2008, Page 89 Line 4 to Page 92 Line 8.

' Transcript, Vol. 2, May 5, 2008, Page 109 Line 7 to Page 111 Line 17.
' Transcript, Vol. 6, May 8, 2008, Page 59 Line 14 to Page 63 Line 20.
'® Transcript, Vol. 12, May 28, 2008, Page 4 Line 27 to Page 7 Line 24.




¢ The evidence elicited in cross-examination wherein the IESO acknowledged
that even with the addition of the new 500 kV line, a more robust and complex

BSPS would be required.19

7 1t is submitted that a review of the interrogatories, April 3, 2008 Motion and the
leave to construct Hearing transcripts will show that information requested and
clicited was novel. It is further submitted that the information requested and
elicited was required in order to provide a fulsome view of the proposed

Application.

8. The Ross Firm Group did not repeat or overlap any evidence entered by any party

to the proceeding.

9. The Ross Firm Group worked with Board Staff as well as several other
Intervenors in order to reduce the duplication of evidence and questions on cross-

examination.

10. Specifically, the Ross Firm Group consulted with Mr. Fallis, SON, Mr. Pappas
and Pollution Probe regarding lines of questioning, argument and evidence to be
submitted. The Ross Firm Group also communicated openly and in a transparent
manner its position with counsel for other Intervenors about its position in the

hopes of combining argument and saving the Board time.

11. Through thorough cross-examination and thoughtful and compelling submissions,
the Ross Firm Group clearly contributed to a better understanding by the Board of

the issues raised in the Application.

12. Throughout the process, The Ross Firm Group has complied with any and all

Board directions with regard to the pre-filing of written evidence.

19 Transcript, Vol. 12, May 28, 2008, Page 11 Line 16 to 28.




13. At no time did counsel for the Ross Firm Group address issues that were not
relevant to the issues determined by the Board in the process. Despite numerous
objections raising relevance as an issue. This is noted by counsel for HONI when

he indicated during one such objection that he “hasn’t won one of these yet”.

14. During the examination and cross-examination of witnesses, counsel for The Ross
Firm Group confined itself to the three issues articulated by the Board at the
commencement of proceedings. This is evidenced by the relative lack of
objections by counsel for the Applicant or the necessity of direction by the Board

itself.

15. As this was the first use of Section 92 of the Ontario Energy Board Act in a
project of this magnitude, it was of the utmost importance to address all of the
issues raised in the closing argument. The arguments of counsel for the Ross

Firm Group were made in a cogent and concise manner.

16. The Ross Firm Group did nothing to lengthen unnecessarily the duration of the
process, nor did it or its counsel engage in any conduct which the Board would

find inappropriate or irresponsible.

REINBURSEMENT FOR COSTS CLAIMED:

17. The Ross Firm Group seeks reimbursement for disbursements as set on the Board
approved Form 2 — Summary of Disbursements. Attached hereto and marked as

Schedule ‘A’ is the above-mentioned form.

18. Included with the Summary of Disbursements are all available receipts and
statements pertaining to the disbursements. Attached hereto and marked as

Schedule ‘B’ are the above-mentioned receipts and statements.




19.

20.

21.

22

23.

As can be seen from the above-noted summary, the largest single cost was
accommodation during the hearing phase of the Application. It should be noted
that counsel for the Ross Firm Group sought accommodation with a colleague for
an entire week, thus decreasing the overall expense in the process. Further, that
they used a discount online hotel service to secure the most affordable room

available.

The other substantial disbursement was printing costs relating to the materials in
aid of cross dealing with ACCR. These materials were necessary as no
admissions with regard to the specifics of this technology were forthcoming after
serving the materials electronically on the Applicant. The ACCR documents were
further put to Mr. Brill during his examination in chief and explained in some

detail there.

The Ross Firm Group seeks reimbursement for Counsel and Consultant fees as set
out on the Board approved Form 1 — Summary Statement of Hours — Consultants
and Legal Counsel. Attached hereto and marked as Schedule ‘C’ is the above-

mentioned form.

With regard to the Consultant Mr. Edward Brill, he was retained in order to
review the highly technical evidence and provide an opinion in report form as to
the strength of the Application. The Ross Firm Group requested this opinion in
order to ascertain the need for counsel to attend at the Oral Hearing process. This
report was pivotal in allowing counsel for the Ross Firm Group to competently
advise their clients on the merits of the Application, so that the clients in turn
could provide informed instructions. It is submitted that the opinion contained in
the report dealt squarely with the issues in the Application and was not in any way

duplicative of other expert material.

Included with the Summary Statement of Hours — Consultants and Legal Counsel

is The Ross Firm Group Client ledger showing all fees incurred up to and
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including the dates of the Oral Hearing and further a break down of fees accrued
before and after the Costs tariff change. Attached hereto and marked as Schedule

‘D’ is the above-mentioned ledger and spreadsheet.

GOODS AND SERVICE TAX:

24. The Ross Firm relies on the Board approved Form 3 — Affidavit in Support of
Cost Claim, with regards to reimbursement for GST and total fees and
disbursements sought. Attached hereto and marked as Schedule ‘E’ is the above-

mentioned Affidavit.

CONCLUSION:

25. The Ross Firm Group respectfully submits that all costs incurred as a result of
participation in the Application are fair and reasonable and should be awarded to

the Ross Firm Group in the sum of $113,885.94 as submitted.

ALL OF WHICH IS RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED THIS 7™ day of July, 2008.

// :

Quinn M. Ross

Counsel for the Intervenors The Ross Firm Group.
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APPENDIX “B”
FORM 2

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

Board File Number Party Name
EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group

Party or Group that made the disbursement
Edward R. Brill — SEA Ltd.

Net Cost GST

Photocopies

Printing

Fax

Courier

Telephone $10.12

Postage $7.42

Transcripts

Travel: Air

Travel: Car

Travel: Rail

Travel; Other( )

Taxi or Airport Limo

Accommodation

Meals

Other(Report $145.25
Processing) Grand Total

Sub-totals $162.79 $162.79

Notes 1. All claims for disbursements must include receipts where practicable
2. All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable state exchange rate 1.0375 and country of initial currency USD.

) \'}é ..
" ',n'?,';f\,‘n"k
%\\} H At O &‘i




FORM 2

SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
- The Ross Firm
Party or Group that made the disbursement
Net Cost GST
Photocopies 733.40 ||/ 36.67
Printing 1,020.34 |/ 51.02
Fax 26.60 |/ 1.33
Courier 34745 . 17.37
Telephone 5791 |/ 2.90
Postage 108.03 | V 5.40
Transcripts
Travel: Air "
Travel: Car 1,941.20 {\/ 97.06
Travel: Rail
Travel; Other( Parking) 22029 |V 11.01
Taxi or Airport Limo 232.02 \/ X 11.60
Accommodation 3,017.17 | 2430 |- *'150.86
Meals 1,809.32 | /5740 9047
{ 7
33;;;8&5;”““3) 491.00 13.80
Other (FOI Appl. Fee) 15.00 0.00 Grand Total
Sub-totals $10,019.73 489.49 $10,509.22
Notes 1. All claims for disbursements must include receipts where practicable
5" All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable state exchangerate ______ and country of initial currency.
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INVOICE

R. R. # 4 Goderich, Ont. N7A 3Y1 519-524-9651
FREELANCE TITLE SEARCHING

MURRAY D. KEITH, B.A. P

GST # 86219 4552 RTO0O1
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MlcroAg

GST #R115221186

: puse Souare
cderich, O

N7A 13

SURCHASEORDERNO. |SHIPVIA . | SALESPERSON | ORDERDATE TERMS
i3 NET 30 DAYS
m UNIT - |SHIP| B/O | ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION RETAIL |  NET. | AMOUNT
_»Fl BC-3211@ -3 CRE1Z3-18B FostFax Printed Tab Index Di i.48 i, 48 16,268
oo BE=39@01 f_'-“lZiiZ! (213-08/1 PostFax Plain Tab Dividers 5 81 .79 134, 30
B~ *"HZI_;b gy Basics Frinted Mh Indexes A- .15 .58 27 S
CBS-CORYFULL-LT Full Bervice B&W Copying — Letter Size . B B4 537.92
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i@ RBC
% Royal Bank
RBC}
RBC Rewards Visa Classic

STATEMENT FROM MAR 15 TO APR 15, 2008
10

PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCE
ERIN ROSS - 4510 1400 0143 1211

F3

$804.74

MAR13 ~ PAYPAL *CMCGEAR 4029357733 ON
MAR14 THE DOCKS BAYFIELD ON
MAR1S ™ FAMOUS PLAYERS 7422 LONDONON
MAR 15 ESS0 9 MAIN STREET 'BAYFIELD ON
MAR19 " RUTH’ 'S cums STEAKHOUSE TORONTOON
MAR20 ~ HILTON
MARZ22 _ iy §2
Foreign Currency-USD 2700 Exchangerate1052222
WAR'ZE ™ FUTURE SHOP 614 CRATHAMON .. S
MAR 33 RUBY TUESDAY #7075 FORT GRATIOT MI $29.
___ fForeign Currency-USD 27.91 (Exchange rate-1.052311
MARZ2  WALGREENS #6053 Q03 PORT HURON M $6.
- Fore{gn Currency- USD 6.34 Exchange rate-1 052050._‘___‘_%._” )
MAR 22 WALGREENS #6053 G03 PORT HURON MI $5.
Forelgn Currency-USD 4.95 Exchange rate-1.052525
AR 35 PAYLESSSHOESOUG0033985 FORT GRATIOT Mi $37.
_7____“_Fore|gn Currency -UsSD 36.02 Exchange ratﬂ 052193“..\..................
MAR23  CANADIAN PSYCHOLOGCL _ASSAC_C_PACA‘ON ...............
T e
MAR 29 WCIBC TORONTO
APROT  VIARAIL INTERNET #50000 MONTREAL QC -§168.00
APRO3  PAZZO RISTORANTE BAR STRATFORDON )
APRO3  VIA RAIL CANADA INC STRATFORD ON Com

Treat yourself. You've earne

From now until May 31, 2008, ti

a loved one with pampering, es

adventures. Simply redeem you!

points online at www.rbcrewar
your 10% discount on Experien
Rewards certificates.

2 uwomm mromxnon
EWARDS POINT

| Previous Points balance

" Points earned this statement

| Newpointsbalance.

Customer Service / Lost & Stolen.

- collect Qutside North Amerita
©....7. RBCRewards Travel Redemption
. Merchandise. Redemption
" 'Web site: CWwW
PAYMENT lN TIO
‘Mininmuim payment -
Payment due date
Credit limit
Available credit

Annual interest rate

Pravious Statement Balance
Payments & credits -4
Purchases & debits i
Cash advances
interest
Fees

NEW BALANCE

MINIMUM PAYMENT -
$14.00

APRO4  WINNERS #339 TORONTOON
APR 04" DAYSREAK TORONTO ON e
APR 05 Iy ETHIOPlAN Hous TORONTO ON h A e s e ——. A es A AR e
APROS  BRIGHT PEARL SEAFOQD R TORONTO ON 8
APR 05 THE ROYAL ONTARIO MUSETORONTO ON 57
(:-; REC ROYAL BANK NEW BALANCE
NG| e . 25241
RBLC . TORONTO. ONTARIO MSW 2E6

p_mnem DUE DATE
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- Telephone banking 1-800-769-2¢
- Ontine banking www.rbcroyaltya
- RBC Royal Bank ATM
- RBC Royal Bank 8ranch
* By mail
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Bill To

The Ross Firm

138 Court House Square
GODERICH, ON

N7A IM2

CORY

i NV O I CE

Date Invoice #

25/09/2007 13277

P.O. No.
Michelle
Description Qty Amount
Copy Job (no tabs -copy tab sheets on paper), black ink 1 24.27
GST Payable 1.46
PST Payable 1.94
=
CelEST. e B AR
Balance Due $27.67

Please remit one copy with your payment. : GST #R102130382

413 Huron Road | Goderich, Ontario | N7A 3A6
Telephone: 519.524.7862 | Fax: 519.524.8616
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PAUL ROSS Printed:  7/7/2008 9:58

EXPENSE SUMMARY | OEB HEARING |

DATE PAID TO TOTAL GST PARKING GAS MEALS HOTEL OTHER PHONE/INT CAB TOTAL

10-Jun-08 Red Papaya 36.12 1.60 @ 3452 36.12
27-May-08 Over East 30.46 1.35 @D , 291 1\/ 30.46
0.00
0.00
0.00

66.58 2.95 63.63 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 66.58
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Guelph Ontario
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Pad Thai (2 @0,
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PST - Food Tax

GST Tax

Total
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.51 4
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‘)

D6/10/2008
G:071 PM
10028

7.98

R
73.98

31.98




4*#*****&****#**$t*******x*****m%*i**
CHECK # 179618 DATE 10/13/07

YBLE # 307 TIHE  §:32PH
-~ DINING ROOM : RONALD -

ITEMS ORDERED AMOUNT

| D-FRESH OYSTERS 15,95

2 NY & LOBSTER 99.90

1 GON CHEESE 4.00

1 Pepper Sauce 3.85

1 D-PRAWN COCKTAIL 17.95

4 N/C GARLIC BREAD /), 0.00

1 BOURBON CAKE ’ 8.95

1 DBL ESPRESSO 4.50

1 CAPPUCINO 4.25

2 SAN PELLIGRI 15.90

1 1/2 PINOT NOIR 32.007)

ERSSPETIS SIS ELRISSES L ERS SRS EES SRR

SUBTOTAL 20735
6% GST  C12.40Y

8% PST T4.04

0% LIQ PS ;3.%?3

IUTAL DUE 237.05

HY’S STEAKHOUSE
TENDER STEAKS AND STIFF DRINKS
101-120 ADELAIDE STREET WEST
TEL# (416) 364-6600
FAX# (416) 364-2732
G.S.T. #866112477

Of ‘é T'CQ/L\ ni Q‘l

{ finfiend®
Pﬂ?ﬁ‘]ﬁ zoo 2 o o (=] o
1 e = =
545 5 NGE STREE] 55597 2 2 & =
TURONTG, ON Eem m i > % % Ny
HAY 145 228 T E
416) 94997735 aZ£3 E
1416) 3 ggé} gkﬁ‘ E ~—
ceze I
10 Marchand: +143bb2 T | >3 Z |5 0 R
[ ver o A9l4su62 1 wil B =
[T ss @ |(© \\s
on L s N
g5 9 RS
Preautor gy 2
. . 5% g S\\
i [EUEETITINE I o m —r
; 2= )
Ve e ; zs Q.
- s m
Mort: $ 14.99 5z
Z 3
; BN 22 =3
Por rboire$ ¢ £2 § =
m m
. — =]
31:CAD% ¥ HIx
» 2¢ 2l
o oy
@ APPROUW - ’2
. %‘b:'«ﬂ ;
Lotie Client -
THANK YOUt k

H

} L

FARE #: DATE ﬁﬂ"\n 17
CAB NO.: ﬁ}‘/ ¥ . AMOUNT §:
DRNERSNAME

FROM:;

Sue Lﬂh
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7D
&!pf/ﬁ

/,} s “ :’,r / -
K A 5D




QUINN ROSS

COPY

Printed 71712008 9:57
EXPENSE SUMMARY [ OEB HEARING |
DATE PAID TO TOTAL GST PARKING GAS MEALS HOTEL OTHER PHONE/NT CAB TOTAL
| 16-Aug-07 Co-op Cabs * 16.00 16.00 16.00/
L 17-Aug-07 Co-op Cabs * 16.00 , 16.00 16.00 Vv
7 21-Feb-08 Lee 88.14 3.90 84.24 88.14
i, 30-Apr-08 South 88 9.61 0.43 9.18 9.61(~
< 1-May-08 Boston Pizza 45.74 1.80 43.94 4574 -
€ 1-May-08 Il Corso 54.54 2.15 52.39 54.54 L~
7 2-May-08 Best Western 378.18 17.10 359.08 2.00 378.18V
q 4-May-08 Esso 75.00 3.57 71.43 7500/
o, 4-May-08 Ruth Chris Steak 174.41 6.83 167.58 174.41
(p 5-May-08 Car Park 16.00 0.71 15.29 16.00 “~
v 5-May-08 Pickle Barrel 29.95 1.15 28.80 2995
v 5-May-08 Imperial Parking 24.00 1.14 22 .86 2400
gﬂ76-May—O8 Crown Taxi 20.00 20.00 20.00 v~
\t, 6-May-08 Diamond Cab 20.00 20.00 20.00
\¢, 6-May-08 Lee 71.41 2.80 68.61 7141V
\ ¢ 7-May-08 Pure Spirits 171.39 6.83 164.56 171.39 -
1% 7-May-08- Independent Cab 20.00 20.00 20.00 .7
\y 8-May-08 City Taxi 22.25 22.25 22.257
1%, 8-May-08 Toronto Hilton 24 .46 1.09 - 23.37 24 .46 /
> 9-May-08 Toronto Hilton 1,421.39 64.75 <2537 1,321.15 10.12 1,421.39
Al 12-May-08 Jack Astors 30.66 1.18 29.48 3066
97 12-May-08 Burger King 7.22 7.22 722V
%% 13-May-08 Pickle Barrel 31.08 1.20 29.88 31.08:
41, 14-May-08 Accents 34.04 1.31 32.73 3404h 960 L7
"¢, 14-May-08 Wendy's 9.70 0.43 9.27 9.70 /
« . 15-May-08 Pickle Barrel 4562 1.80 43.82 4562 [~ =
&% 15-May-08 Co-op Cabs 15.00 15.00 15.00 L7 6
8 415-May-08 Beaconsfield Lounge 97.23 97.23~ e o 0723177 &
. 16-May-08 PetroCanada 38.38 1.97 33.18 3.23 o 38.38 v~
? 16-May-08 Diamond Cab 16.00 16.00 16.000”
+ - 16-May-08 Mexican Restaurant 26.06 1.15 24.91 26.06
‘. 26-May-08 Intercontinental (PL) 305.37 W J 305.37 L—
J 28-May-08 Intercontinental 189.12 0.71 60.00 84.76 15.00 18912 L~




-

QUINN ROSS “3 Printed 7/7/12008 9:57
EXPENSE SUMMARY | OEB HEARING Y |
DATE PAID TO TOTAL GST PARKING GAS MEALS HOTEL O;RHER\ PHONE/INT CAB TOTAL
24 28-May-08 Intercontinental 189.12 8.85 57.14 10.76 7012 \27.96)  14.29 18912~
25 3-Jun-08 Diamond Cab 16.00 16.00 16.00 L7 ¢
Y 3-Jun-08 Grazie 75.82 75.82 75.82 (5700 ;& €
9% 3-Jun-08 Crowne Plaza 16.00 16.00 16.00 v
f};ﬁ 3-Jun-08 Crowne Plaza 16.00 16.00 16.00v
ga  3-Jun-08 Crowne Plaza (PL) 385.50 385.50 385.50 v
7.# 10-Jun-08 Sutton Place (PL) 305.16 305.16 305.16
L.t 10-Jun-08 Sutton Place 33.00 33.00 33.00 V7
1 10-Jun-08 Sutton Place 16.50 16.50 1650V
L% 11-Jun-08 Grazie 44.14 4414 441415107,
ié&%ﬂ—\}un‘OS Pickle Barrel 37.60 37.60 37600/
467879 13285  220.29 1,198.89 2,746.38 56.61 57.91 161.25 4,678.79

.. charge forkm
. previously reimbursed
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. D):
Flights | Hotels grg;ﬁi’ fye

& Your Hotel Receipt

Check-In Date:
Check-Out Date:

Priceline Hotel Request Number:

Priceline Customer Service Number:

Hotel Name:

Confirmation Numbers:

Summary of Charges
Billing Name:
Billing Address:

Billing Date:

Last 4 digits of Credit Card:
Your Offer Price:

Number of Rooms:

Number of Nights:
Subtotal:

Taxes and Service Fees:

Total Charges:

uruzsns f Tours & Attractions | Pr:caBreakers !
Sign-ln | My Profile | My Trips | Check Your Request | First Time Users |

Tuesday, June 10, 2008
Wednesday, June 11, 2008
532-383-131-01
1-800-657-9168

The Sutton Place Hotel-Toronto
955 Bay Street
Toronto, Ontario M5S 2A2

417 024.0227

Roor: 1 - 112465Y037543
Room 2 - 11246SY037544

Quinn M Ross

76582 Jowett's Grove Road
Ss 1 Unit 19
Bayfield, ON NOM 1GO

June 9, 2008

0202

$130.00 (US dollars)

2 AR
L Lo

1 R

$260.00 (US dollars)
$45.16 (US dollars)
$305.16 (US dollars)

Al material hereimn €& 1998

-2008 priceline.cont ncorporated, all rights reserved.

PRICELINE, PRICELINE.COM and NAME YOUR OWN PRICE are
registered service marks of priceline.com incorporatéed.
U5 Patents 5,794,207 5,897,620, 6,085,169 6,510,418 and 6,553,3496.

(CST 2040530-50)

ws-94

https://www priceline.com/hotels/Lang/en-us/status/ accept receipt.asp?session key=5C0...

10/06/20¢




OF &
PETRO-CANADA
1656 SNYDERS RD

- PETERSBURG
Ontario NOB 2HO

GST: 816528749 8519) 634-5596
2008-06-03  PC0841939:0061501 16:22
TERMINAL: 050061501 OPER: A

PRODUCT QTY PRICE  AMOUNT
GST/PST Grocery 1 2.99 2.994
GST/PST Grocery 1 2.99 2.99%
Non Tax 1 1.28 1.29
Large Cigarettes. 1 - 9.h2 9.524
GST?PST rocery 5.99 5,904

NON-FUEL GST 1.07

NON-FUEL PST 0.96 -

Total Owed 24.81
TOTAL PATD

CREDLT CARD 24 .81
MASTERCARD wkkkkrpkkrF0202

TNVOICE 147454 ~ AUTH 025268

Earn_100 bonus
PETRO—-POINTS! And

a chance to WIN FREE

GAS for one vear!
Did you see a Service Hero today?
k¥

Full details and a short survey
to be completed at

www _petro—
canada .ca/hero

or
1-866-826-7779

N
1

2a°
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RISTORANTE

2373 YONGE STREET
Tel: 416 488 0822

Date: Jun03'08 09:05PM
Card Type: M/C
Acct & KAXXKXXXXAKKXO202

Exp Date: IAWAR
Auth Code: 005555

Check: 4441
Table: 56/1
Server: 38 Alessand

MR. QUINN ROSS
Subtotal: 65 .82

~ 00
TAips Nlﬂgp_mmﬂ,wkm~
S

Grand Total: m__"__IICS _________ gé_,_

Signature:__tffffji_____n_m_____

I agree to pay above total
according to my card issuer
agreement (merchant agreement
credit voucher)

¥ % % % Merchant Copy * * % %

coPY

GRAZIE

RISTORANTE

2373 YONGE STREET
Tel: 416 488 0822

Date: Jun11'08 06:28PM
Card Type: W/C
Acct #: XXXXKRXXXXKK0202

Exp Date: 01/11
Auth Code: 025986

Check: 6205
Table: 21/1
Server: 2010 Jamyie H

MR. QUINN ROSS
Subtotal: 38 .14
Tips: (5 H/

.7

Grand Total: 3”\/ -
Signature:

I agree to pay above total
according to my card issuer
agreenent (merunant agreement if
credit voucher)

% % % % Customer Copy * * % %

P.B. Yonge/Eglinton
2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON
Tel: 4164851244
Check: 1188637

Strvei s dgshua Date: 06/11/2008
Tahle: 7% Time: 13:30
MSIRCRD

RO R R R EE-0200
ROSS/MR. QUINNM

AUTH 035067 ONLINE
MERCHANT ~ 9999
SUBIOTAL $ 31 .60
ec’/O
TIi % o _é;, e
3y 60

**k CUSTOMER COPY %=

P1pk1e Bar;e1 Yonge & Eg11nt0n
~ now offers DELIVERY
Please cail (416)485 1244

COME AND ENJOY OUR
BREAKFAST SPECIAL FOR
ONLY $5.99 (8AM-1030AM)
—m=====-T DAYS A WEEK--—----



rricelne.com ~ notel, noOtEl reservdllon, Cliedp noLel, 1ds Vegds NOLCL, DUsLLil nuiel, 1O ...

& Your Hotel Receipt

Check-In Date:

Check-Out Date:

Priceline Hotel Request Number:
Priceline Customer Service Number:

Hotel Name:

Confirmation Number:

Summary of Charges

Fage L L L

ED.

Fiights | Hotels | Cars | Packages | Cruises | Tours & Attractions | PriceBreakers |

Sign-In | My Profile | My Trips | Check Your Request | First Time Users |

Monday, May 26, 2008
Wednesday, May 28, 2008
631-256-691-02
1-800-657-9168

Intercontinental Toronto Yorkville
220 Bloor Street West

Toronto, Ontario M5S 178
416-960-5200

Room 1 - 66231695

Billing Name: Quinn M Ross
Billing Address: 76582 Jowett's Grove Road
gz)/]ﬁglrd",tOTI\? NOM 1GO @/’7
Rilling Date: May 25, 2008 N
Last 4 digits of Credit Card: 0202
Your Offer Price: $130.00 (US dollars)
Number of Rooms: 1
Number of Nights: 2
Subtotal: $260.00 (US dollars)
Taxes and Service Fees: $45.37 (US dollars)
Total Charges: $£305.37 (US dollars)
i: ,: ”’“5’“’ ‘
Al material herein € 1998-2008 priceline.com Incorporated, all rights reserved.
PRICELINE, PRICELINE.COM and NAME YOUR OWN PRICE are
reqistered service marks of priceline.com Incorporated.
(.S Patents 5,794,207 5,897,620, 6,085,163 6,510.418 and 6.553,346.
(CST 2040520-507
ws-103
26/05/2008

https://www.priceline.com/hotels/Lang/en-us/status/ accept_receipt.asp?session_key=420...




> c@PY
INTERCONTINENTAL. - '

TORONTO YORKVILLE

05-28-08
Mr Quinn Ross Folio No. Room No. : 641
138 Courthouse Sq A/R Number Arrival :© 05-26-08
Goderich, ON N7A 1M9 Group Code Departure : 05-28-08
CA Company . Pricelinecom Conf. No. : 66231695
Membership No.: Rate Code : IDINR
Invoice No. : PageNo. © tof2
Cashier No. . 322
User ID - ORAMIREZ GSTH# . 855206975
Date Description Charges Credits
05-26-08 High Speed Internet #742 : 30 Minutes Intern 4.00
05-26-08 Movie #742 : VIDEO MOVIE 4584
05-26-08  Parking 30.00
05-27-08 High Speed Internet #641 : 1 Day (24 Hours) 11.00-
05-27-08  In Room Bar 2 sodas 11,36
05-27-08  Movie . #641 :VIDEO MOVIE 4355
05-27-08  Room Service #641 : CHECK #1318 7346 -
05-27-08  Parking 30.00
(33
SN

InterContinental Toronto Yorkville
220 Bloor Street West
Toronto, Ontario, Canada M58 1T8
Telephone: (416) 960-5200 Fax: (416) 960-8269




A

\
INTERCONTINENTAL.

TORONTO YORKVILLE

05-28-08
l Mr Quinn Ross Folio No. Room No. 641
138 CQUFthOUSE Sq A/R Number Arrival 05-26-08
Goderich, ON N7A 1M9 Group Code Departure : 05-28-08
CA Company : Pricelinecom Conf. No. 66231695
Membership No.: Rate Code : IDINR
Invoice No. Page No. 2 of 2
‘ Cashier No. o322
User ID - ORAMIREZ GST# 855206975
Date Description Charges Credits
Total 189.12 0.00
Balance 189.12 CAD
0.00 CAD
0.00 caAb
Approval Code 050806 GST 5% on Others 83(1) gﬁg
Approval Amount 241.82 0:00 CAD
0.00 CAD
0.00 CAD
0.00 CAD

If you have any questions, please contact the accounting department at (416) 324-5869 or fax (416) 324-5895

Guest Signature:

| have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. | agree that my liablity for this bill is not waived and agree to be held
personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or associate fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If

a credit card charge, | further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

InterContinental Toronto Yorkville
220 Bloor Street West
Toronto, Ontario, Canada M5S 1T8
Telephone: (416) 960-5200 Fax: (416) 960-8269




UER

CROWNE PLAZA

TORONTO DON VALLEY

Quinn Ross A/R Number
Norwalk
06854 Group Code
us Folio/invoice No. 996655
Reference #
Room No. 524 Page No. 1 of 1 an
Arrival 06-03-08 Cashier No. 108 (=27
Departure 06-04-08 User ID THAO —
www.CPTDV.com
Date Description Charges Credits
06-03-08 Parking 4 16.00
Total 16.00 0.00
Balance 16.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Guest Signature:

| have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. | agree thet my liability for this bill is not waived
event that the indicated person, company, or association fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. if a credit card charge, | f

the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

CROWNE PLAZA TORONTO DON VALL
1250 Eglinton Avenue East
Toronto, Ontario M3C-1J3

Telephone: (416) 449-4111 Fax: (416) 385-6700

GST#870011962 www.CPTDV.com

EY

and agree to be held personally liable in the
urther agree to perform
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C@y

| Cars | Packages | Cruises | Tours & Attra«,t:c»:\s | f PrlcePrsakerq }

& Your Hotel Receipt

Check-In Date:
Check-Out Date:

Priceline Hotel Request Number:

Priceline Customer Service Number:

Hotel Name:

Confirmation Number:

Summary of Charges
Billing Name:
Billing Address:

Billing Date:

Last 4 digits of Credit Card:
Your Offer Price:

Number of Rooms:

Number of Nights:

Subtotal:

Taxes and Service Fees:

Total Charges:

Flights | Hotels

ED-

1a5\.1UJA.

Sign-In | My Profile | My Trips | Check Your Request | First Time Users |

Monday, May 26, 2008
Wednesday, May 28, 2008
631-256-691-02
1-800-657-9168

Intercontinental Toronto Yorkville
220 Bloor Street West

Toronto, Ontario M55 178
416-960-5200

Room 1 - 66231695

Quinn M Ross

76582 Jowett's Grove Road

Ss 1 Unit 19

Bayfield, ON NOM 1GO
May 25, 2008

0202

$130.00 (US dollars)
1

2

$260.00 (US dollars)
$45.37 (US dollars)
$305.37 (US dollars)

Al material herein & 1398-2008 priceline.com Incorporated, all rights reserved.
PRICELINE. PRICELINE.COM and NAME YOUR OWN PRICE are
registered service marks of priceline.com incorporated.

{15 Patents 5,794,207, 5,897,

https://www.priceline.com/hotels/Lang/en-us/status/accept_receipt.asp?session_key=420...

620 6,085,169 6,510.418 and 6,.553,346.
(CST 2040530-50)

ws-103

26/05/2008




CROWNE PLAZA

TORONTO DON VALLEY

Quinn Ross A/R Number
Norwalk
06854 Group Code
us Folio/Invoice No. 996656
Reference #
Room No. 522 Page No. 10f1
Arrival 06-03-08 Cashier No. 108
Departure 06-04-08 User ID THAO
www.CPTDV.com
~ Date , _ Description ~ Charges  Credits
06-03-08 Parking 4 16.00
Total 16.00 0.00
Balance 16.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Guest Signature:

| have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. | agree that my liability for this bill is not waived and agree to be held personally liable in the
event that the indicated person, company, or association fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. if a credit card charge, | further agree to perform

the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

CROWNE PLAZA TORONTO DON VALLEY
1250 Eglinton Avenue East
Toronto, Ontario M3C-1J3

Telephone: (416) 449-4111 Fax: (416) 385-6700

GST#870011962 www.CPTDV.com




Printer Friendly Receipt Page 1 of ]

COPY

¥ Print Receipt % Back to Previous Page

priceline.com Your Trip Receipt

Hotel Details

Crowne Plaza Toronto Don Valley

1250 Eglinton Avenue East Check-in: Tue, Jun 3, 2008 - 03:00 PM
Toronto, ON M3C 1J3 Check-Out: Wed, Jun 4, 2008 - 12:00 PM
Canada Number of Nights: 1

416-449-4111
Trip Number: 11512228357

‘ Room 1: Quinn Ross Hotel Confirmation Number: 62084668
: Room 2: Quinn Ross Hotel Confirmation Number: 62084669

' Room Type: 1 King Business Class Nonsmoking

Summary of Charges

Billing Name:

Quinn M Ross Billing Address:

76582 JOWETT'S GROVE ROAD SS 1 UNIT 19

Credit Card: Bayfield, CA NOM 1G0
Mastercard (ending in 0202)

Room Subtotal: Us$340.24
Taxes and Fees: US$45.26
Total Charges:: US$385.50

Priceline Customer Service Number: 1-800-657-9168
Priceline Trip Number: 11512229357

If you have any questions or require further assistance, please visit our Customer Help Area.
You may also contact our Customer Service Department by phone at 1-800-657-9168.
Please have your Priceline Request number [1 1512229357] and the phone number you
provided when you placed your request [5195245532] ready when you call.

3¢ Print Receipt _b¢ Back to Previous Page

hitns-/ftravela nriceline. com/hotel/nrintltinerarv.do?offer num=115122293 57&isk=2003... 02/06/2008
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L { @Q/‘! The Sutton Duace Hoel e @ (‘ﬂ b) \j

A2

e st

Quinn Ross Room Number : 1621
138 Courthouse 5q. Arrival Date : 06-10-08
Goderich N7A 1M9 Departure Date 06-11-08
Page : 1 of 1
Folio Number
INFORMATION INVOICE Confirmation : 13342709
Cashier
Company Name . Priceline - low GST No. : R135760569 06-11-08
Date Description : v s : Charges Credits
06-10-08 Daily Parking Valet 33.00
Total 33.00 0.00
Balance 33.00 CAD
Room GST 0.00
F&B GST 0.00
Misc GST 1.46
Total 1.46

1 agree that | am personally liable for the final disposition and payment of any services rendered or goods supplied by The Sutton Place Hotel and further
authorize the use of my credit card to facilitate full payment. Taccept responsibility in the event the indicated third-party, company or association fails to render
full payment of this account, and also for any loss or damage to the premises or its contents.

Guest Signature:

A MEMBER OF THE SUTTON PLACE GRANDE HOTELS GROUP - CHICAGO, EDMONTON, TORONTO, VANCOUVER

955 Bay Street Toronto, Ontario, Canada M5872A2 Tel: 416-924-9221 Fax: 416-924-1778
email: info_toronto@suttonplace.com website: www.toronto.suttonplace.com




i L ES -
{(ﬁ@)}’ The Sutton Place Hotel LEY ({D‘ @

o

Quinn Ross Room Number 1623
138 Courthouse Sq. Arrival Date 06-10-08
Goderich N7A 1M9 Departure Date 06-11-08
Page 1 of 1
Folio Number
INFORMATION INVOICE Confirmation 13342710
Cashier
Company Name . Priceline - low GST No. : R135760569 06-11-08
Date - Description Y ; S Charges Credits
06-10-08 High Speed Internet #1623 16.50
Total 16.50 0.00
Balance 16.50 CAD
Room GST 0.00
F&B GST 0.00
Misc GST 0.73
Total 0.73

I agree that | am personally liable for the final disposition and payment of any services rendered or goods supplied by The Sutton Place Hotel and further
authorize the use of my credit card to facilitate full payment. Iaccept responsibility in the event the indicated third-party, company or association fails to render

full payment of this account, and also for any loss or damage to the premises or its contents.

Guest Signature:

A MEMBER OF THE SUTTON PLACE GRANDE HOTELS GROUP - CHICAGO, EDMONTON, TORONTO, VANCOUVER

955 Bay Street Toronto, Ontario, Canada M5S 2A2 Tel: 416-924-9221 Fax: 416-824-1778
email: info_toronto@suttonplace.com website: www.toronto.suttonplace.com




Quinn/Erin Ross

-

BEST WESTERN ORANGEVILLE INN & SUITES

7 Buena Vista Dr.

Arrival Date; Wednesday, April 30, 2008
Jeparture Date: Friday, May 02, 2008

Orangeville, On LOW 0A2

Phone: (519)941-3311

Fax: (519)941

Account #: 16979
Room Number: 427

Rate: $170.99

May 02, 2008
12:04 pm

-3211 @ @ @37

Each Best Western hotel is independently owned and operated.

Pay Method: XXXXXXXXXXXX1211 VI

‘Vlember #:
Date Department Reference Voucher Room Debit Credit
04/30/08 |Long Distance 5195385551 0001 0019 427 $2.00
' 04/30/08 [Room postings Auto Posted 427 $170.99
04/30/08 [Room PST Auto Posted 427 $8.55
04/30/08 |Room GST Auto Posted 427 $8.55
05/01/08 |Room postings Auto Posted 427 $170.99
1 05/01/08 |Room PST Auto Posted 427 $8.55
05/01/08 [Room GST Auto Posted 427 $8.55
_ 05/02/08 |Visa CHECKED-OQUT 427 $378.18

| agree that my liability for all charges is not waived in the event that the person, company or
association to whom this bill is to be charged refuses to pay. GST#852488832RT0001

Thank you for staying with us, we appreciate your business.

Signature

Balance: $0.00




<)

Hilton

145 Richmond Street West
Toronto, Ontario M5H 21.2
Phone (416) 869-3456 + Fax (416) 869-3187
Rescrvations

-
Name & Address / Nom el Adresse . www.hilton.gam or_L.800 HILTONS
J Toronto o o LY r[;\ e
ROSS. HEATHER Room/Chambre 2804/K1E @ @) L;—J \
BOX 65, 12 HOWARD STREET WEST Arrival Date/ Date d'arrivée  05/04/08 5:37PM
Departure Date/ Date de départ  05/09/08
%‘;YF'ELD’ ON NOM 1GO AdulUChild/ Adulte/Enfant  2/0
Room Rate/ Tarif 245.00
LAW SOCIETY OF UPPER CANADA
RATE PLAN L-K2

HH# 613749825 DIAMOND
AL: NW #782526942

BONUS AL: CAR:
CONFIRMATION NUMBER : 3310299106
05/09/08 PAGE 1

DATE DESCRIPTION 1D REF.NO CHARGES CREDITS BALANCE
05/04/08 | GUEST ROOM LINDA 935914 $245.00

05/04/08 | DMF LINDA 935914 $64/9__\8\

05/04/08 | DMF - GST LINDA 935914 $0.38 |

05/04/08 | GST 5% - RM LINDA 935914 @/

05/04/08 | PST 5% -RM LINDA 935914 $12.25

05/05/08 | GUEST ROOM LINDA 937640 $245.00

05/05/08 | DMF LINDA 937640 $6.98

T

05/05/08 | DMF - GST LINDA 937640 ( $0.38°

05/05/08 | GST 5% - RM LINDA 937640 @E/

05/05/08 | PST 5% - RM LINDA 937640 $12.25

05/06/08 | GUEST ROOM RHARDI 939612 $245.00

05/06/08 | DMF RHARDI 939612 $6.98

05/06/08 | DMF - GST. RHARDI 939612 $0.38_1

05/06/08 | GST 5% - RM RHARDI 939612 $12.25 |

05/06/08 | PST 5% - RM_ RHARDI 939612 $12.25

05/07/08 | EXT-#2804 5195242193 0004 LINTR 940313 $10.12

11:25 '

05/07/08 | GST 5% , LINTR 940313 $0.51 >

05/07/08 | GUEST ROOM RHARDI 941610 $245.00

05/07/08 | DMF RHARD! 941610 $6.98

et

05/07/08 | DMF - GST RHARDI 941610 @3&—,

05/07/08 | GST 5% - RM RHARDI 941610 T$12.25 T

05/07/08 | PST 5% - RM RHARDI 941610 . L
05/08/08 | ROOM SERVICE LUNCH LINTR 942836 8511 C@»T v

vy A
AN
D¢ i Char Check Numéro de foli
ZIP-OUT CHECK-OUT / DEPART EXPRES. DargrCh | Co e Mmoo

Good Morning ! We hope you enjoyed your stay. With Zip-Out Check-Out ®, there is no

need to stop at the Front[besk to check out. )

Please review this statement. It1s a record of your charges as of late last evening,.

For any charges after your account was prepared, you may: Authorization / Autorisation Inuuals
+ pay at the time of purchase. niaes
+ charge purchases fo your account, then stop by the Front Desk for an

update statement. . L . Purchases & Services / Achats & Services
+ or request an updated statement be mailed to you within two business days.

Simply call the Front Desk from your room and tell us when I};_ou are ready to depart. your

account will be automatically checked out and you may use this statement as your receipt. P

Feel free to leave your keys‘sg in the room. i ) axes

Please call the Front Desk if you wish to extend your stay or if you have any questions

about your account.

Bonjour! Nous espérons que votre séjour avec nous a été agréable. Avec Départ Express il Tips & Misc. / Pourboires & Divers

n’'est pas nécessaire de vous présenter a la Réception. ‘ ) )

La facture ci-jointe est votre recu et refléte les éléments facturés & votre compte jusqu'a hier soir,

Vous pouvez acquitter les frais additionnels soit a la Réception au départ, ou encore, ils seront
ortés a votre carte de crédit. . , PG A NS

gur demande, nous vous posterons un relevé de compte 4 jour, dans les deux jours. Pour ‘

compléter votre Départ Express: .
+ Communiquez avec la Réception, de votre chambre, pour les informer de votre départ.
+ Vous pouvez laisser la carte clé dans la chambre. i
SVP contucter la Réception si vous désirer prolonger volre séjour ou si vous avez des questions au

sujet de votre facture.

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT
PAIEMENT DU A LA RECEPTION

GST No. 847569365 RT0001




(@)

Hilton

145 Richmond Street West
Toronto, Ontario MSH 2L.2
Phone (416) 869-

3456 = Fax (416) 869-3187
Reservations

—
Name & Address / Nom et Adresse ! Toronto www.hilton.com or 1 800 HILTONS
ROSS, HEATHER Room/ Chambre 2804/K1E
BOX 65, 12 HOWARD STREET WEST Arrival Date/ Date d'arrivée  05/04/08 5:37PM

Departure Date/ Date de départ  05/09/08
BAYFIELD, ONINOM 160 AdullChild/ Adulte/Enfant  2/0
Room Rate/ Tarif 245.00
LAW SOCIETY OF UPPER CANADA
RATE PLAN L-K2
e
HH# 613749825 DIAMOND N
AL: NW #782526942 v
BONUS AL: CAR: \ S
CONFIRMATION NUMBER : 3310299106 —
05/09/08 PAGE 2
DATE DESCRIPTION D REF. NO CHARGES CREDITS BALANCE
05/08/08 | GST F&B LINTR 942836 $1.09 |, .
05/08/08 | PST FOOD LINTR 942836 $1.52/
05/08/08 | GUEST ROOM RHARDI 943763 $245.00
. 05/08/08 | DMF RHARD! 943763 $6.98
05/08/08 | DMF - GST RHARD! 943763 %9%% >
) 05/08/08 | GST 5% - RM RHARDI 943763 $12.25 |
l 05/08/08 | PST 5% - RM RHARDI 943763 $12.25
WILL BE SETTLED TO MC *0202 $1,421.39
' EFFECTIVE BALANCE OF $0.00
! EXPENSE REPORT SUMMARY
05/04/08 05/05/08 05/06/08 05/07/08
ROOM & TAX $276.86 $276.86 $276.86 $276.86 ’ \j [
TELEPHONE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.12
FOOD & BEVERAGE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
OTHER $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.51 I ;
DAILY TOTAL $276.86 $276.86 $276.86 $287.49
05/08/08 STAY TOTAL
ROOM & TAX $276.86 $1.384.30
f Cha < No. / Numéro de f
ZIP-OUT CHECK-OUT / DEPART EXPRESS e, | o No R o s

Good Morning ! We hope you enjoyed your stay. With Zip-Out Check-Out ®, there is no

need to stop af the Front Desk to check out. .

Please review this statement. It is a record of your charges as of late last evening.

For any charges after your account was prepared, you may: Authorization / Autonisation pnials
+ pay at the time of purchase. mitiales
+ charge purchases {o your account, then stop by the Front Desk for an

Update statement. . A . Purchases & Services / Achats & Services
+ or request an updated statement be mailed to you within two business days.

Simply cal} the Front Desk from your room and tell us when you are ready to depart. your

account will be automatically checked out and you may use this statement as your receipt. 5

Feel free to leave your key(s) 1n the room. i ) axes

Please call the Front Désk if you wish to extend your stay or if you have any questions

about your account.

Bonjour! Nous espérons que votre séjour avec nous a été agréable. Avec Départ Express il Tips & Misc. [ Pourboires & Divers

n est pas nécessaire de vous présenter a la Réception. ) ) )

La facture ci-jomte est votre regu et refléte les éléments facturés a votre compte jusqu’a hier soir.

Vous pouvez acquitter les frais additionnels soit & la Réception au départ, ou encore, 1ils seront -

gonés a votre carie de crédit. i _ ;%m%%’gg?h
ur demande, nous vous posterons un relevé de compte a jour, dans les deux jours. Pour

compléter votre Départ Express: )
+ Communiquez avec la Réception, de votre chambre, pour les informer de votre départ.
+ Vous pouvez laisser la carte clé dans la chambre. .
SVP contactez la Réception si vous désirez prolonger votre séjour ou si vous avet des questions au

sujet de votre facture.

PAYMENT DUE, UPON RECEIPT
PAIEMENT DU A LA RECEPTION

GST No. 847569365 RT06001




<: d ) 145 Richmond Street West
Toronto, Ontario MSH 2L2

H - li Phone (416) 869-3456 + Fax (416) 869-3187
l On Reservations

www hilton.com or 1 800 HILTONS

Hilton HHonors(R) stays po%t to your acedunt within 12 hours of checkout, To
i check your earnings for this| stay or any other stay at any of more than 3,000
Hitton Family hotels worldwide visit HiltonkiH

Thank you for choosing Hilton! Please visg us at hiftoh.com to view our bgst
i available Net Direct rates, pfan a special acation gefaway or select a
convenient location for yourinext business trip.

r
N
Name & Address / Nom et Adresse Toronto
ROSS, HEATHER Room/Chambre 2804/K1E
BOX 65, 12 HOWARD STREET WEST Arrival Date/ Date d'arrivée  05/04/08 5:37PM
Departure Date/ Date de départ  05/09/08
EL NOM 1
EQYF' D, ON NOM 1GO AdulUChild/ Adulte/Enfant  2/0
Room Rate/ Tarif 245.00
LAW SOCIETY OF UPPER CANADA
RATE PLAN L-K2 TN
HH# 613749825 DIAMOND m/[u
AL: NW #782526942
BONUS AL: CAR: ;
CONFIRMATION NUMBER : 3310299106 .
05/09/08 PAGE 3
DATE DESCRIPTION iD REF.NO CHARGES CREDITS BALANCE
I TELEPHONE $0.00 $10.12
FOOD & BEVERAGE $23.85 $23.85
i OTHER $2.61 $3.12 H
DAILY TPTAL $303.32 $1.421.39
05/20/08
| ROOM & TAX $0.00
' TELEPHONE $0.00
DAILY TRTAL $0.00 N

Date of Charge Check No. / Numéro de folio

ZIP-OUT CHECK-OUT / DEPART EXPRESS A L

Good Morning ! We hope you enjoyed your stay. With Zip-Out Check-Out ®, there is no
need to stop af the Front Desk to CI!ICCk out.
Please review this statement. It is a record of your charges as of late last evening.
For any charges after your account was prepared, you may:

+ pay at the time oitpurchase.

+ chargecrurchascs o your account, then stop by the Front Desk for an

updated statement. ] )

+ or request an updaled statement be mailed to you within two business days.
Simply call the Front Desk from your room and tell us when you are ready to depart. your
account will be automatically checked out and you may use {Kis statement as your receipt.
Feel free to leave your keys‘s‘ n the room. )
Please call the Front Desk if you wish to extend your stay or if you have any questions
about your account.
Bonjour! Nous espérons que votre séjour avec nous a été agréable. Avec Départ Express il
n'est pas nécessaire de vous présenter 2 la Réception. ) ) )
La facture ci-jointe est votre regu et refléte les éléments facturés & votre compte jusqu'a hier soir.
Vous pouvez acquitter les frais additionnels soit 4 la Réception au départ, ou encore, ils seront

ortés a votre carte de crédit. ) ) %%%AT]KQ’%A%)S#IL

ur demande, nous vous posterons un relevé de compte a jour, dans les deux jours. Pour

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

compléter votre Départ Express: ) )
+ Communiquez avec la Réception, de votre chambre, pour les informer de votre départ. PAIEMENT DU A LA RECEPTION

+ Vous pouvez laisser la carte clé dans la chambre. ) . .
SVP contacter la Réception si vous désireg prolonger votre séjour ou si vous avez des questions au GST No. 847569365 RT0001

sujet de votre facture.

Authorization / Aulorisation lnstals
Initiales

Purchases & Services / Achats & Services

Taxes

Tips & Misc. / Pourboires & Divers
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‘‘‘‘‘‘ 4
******************#*************#*******
DATE 5/12/08 TIME  7:31PM
MID 45024155654 30202622074

Jack Astor's Bar & Grill
10 Dundas Street Easst
Toronto, ON
M5B 216
416-263-9800

MASTOH XXXXXXXXXXXX0202 S
AUTH 025812 TBL 215  CHECK 4896

PRE-AUTH COCKTAIL Lauren R,
AMOUNT 23.59
DALTON FOOD TAX 1.89
HARPR TAX 1.18
SUBTOTAL $ 26 .66
7L v OO

TIP $..... . .
6 b-

CUSTOMER COPY
R S S e Pt S s e

FRkkR R kb kR k R kR kbR okkkok k£

CHECK # 4896 DATE 5/12/08
TABLE # 215 TIME  7:28PM

-- COCKTAIL : Lauren R. --

SEAT# ITEMS ORDERED AMOUNT
1 POP., COKE 2.68
ADD PAN W/CHS, 0.50 1.95

ADD CAESAR 2.29
D.CHICK .RIGATONI 13.97

POP., COKE 2.69
SUBTOTAL 23.59

23.58

TOTAL 23.59

RRkRRRR ROk kR kR Rk Rk Rk ko Rk kK

SUBTOTAL 23.59
DALTON FOO 1.89
HARPR TAX 1.18
" TOTAL DUE 26 .66

Check out our Jaw Dropping 2000 Square
Foot Patio overlooking the Square!

Join us every Wednesday at 9pm for our

"Tear it up Wednesday" party in our bar:
Live DJ's, Flair Shows, and sampling!

GST 868715756RT0031




P.B. Yonge/Eglinton
2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON
Tel: 416-485-1244
Check #: 1169074

Server: Irene Date: 05/13/2008

Table: 46 Time: 13:44
Client: 2

1 Colombian Coffee 1.99
1 POP 1.99
2 Reuben Sandwich 19.98
SUB-TOTAL: 23.96
Gst (B69149484): 1.20
Food Tax: 1.92
TOTAL 27 .08

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER

Pickle Barrel Yonge & Eglinton
now offers DELIVERY

Please call (416)485-1244

COME AND ENJOY OUR
BREAKFAST SPECIAL FOR
ONLY $5.99 (9AM-1030AM)

P.B. Yonge/EFglinton
2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON
Tel: 4164851244
Check: 1169074

Server: Irene Date: 05/13/2008

5

Table: 46 Tima: 13:47
MSTRCRD
skkkkkRk Ak %207
ROSS/ERIN
AUTH 045602  ONLINE
MERCHANT# 9999
SUBTOTAL $ 27 .08
N OO
TIP $ WL
) ‘o
TOTAL $ 5|

** CUSTOMER COPY *xx

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER
Pickle Barrel Yonge & Eglinton
now offers DELIVERY
Please call (416)485-1244

COME AND ENJOY OUR
BREAKFAST SPECIAL FOR
ONLY $5.99 (94M-10304M)
e TS T ——




Accents
The Sutton Place Hotel
955 Bay Street
Toronto, Ontario MBS 2A2
(416) 324-5633

GST#R135760569
Date: May14°C8 11:15PM
Card Type: Mastercard
Acct #: XXXHAXXAXXKX0202
Exp Date: 01/17
Auth Code: 005123
Check: 4233
Table: 33/1
Server: 1010 George
ERIN ROSS
Subtotal: 30.04
3/ Qo
GRATUITY $ 7°
¢« [ 0"
TOTAL $ 33 ?/
SIGNATURE:

I agree to pay above total
according to my card issuer
agreement .

Accents
The Sutton Place Hotel
955 Bay Street
Toronto, Ontario M5S 242
(416) 324-5833
GST#R 135760569

1010 George

Tb1 33/1  Chk 4233 Gst 0
May14°08 10:28PM

wmzuHavaﬂa~lw¥#a—@M6 ZéwLZJﬂleM

2 BLUE @ 4.50 ~9.00
2 PEPSI @ 2.35 4.70
Subtotal 26.20
GST Tax 1.31
PST Tax 0.38
He-Tx 215

11:11 AMT DUE

30. ()tl
,-[g 4
*****#***********4********* /yéi

GRATUITY NOT INCLUDED
GRATUITY $

TOTAL $

ROOM NUMBER:

PRINT NAME:

SIGNATURE:

www.diamondtaxi.ca

416-366-6868

CAB#

as "notional” or applied to the driver's GST registered number, not Diamond Taxi Ltd.

AT $ L&
DRIVER'S NAME 7/ GST#
/ k’/)ﬁ;;glNCLUDESGST
The driver is #n l?e%ﬂ[)ontracmr any GST input credit may be claimed

THANK YOU




P.B.
2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON
Tel: 416~ 48E 1244

5.
29.

Yonge/Egi 1nton

97
97

35,94

1.80

2.88

Check #: 1170172
Server: Jenny Date: 05/15/2008
Table: 1 Time: 13:08
Client: 3
3 POP
3 Reuhen SdﬂuWIth
o B (OTAL
t (8b9 49484)
Food Tax:
_ TOTAL 40.

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER

L

Plckle Barre] Yonge & Eg] nton
now offers DELIVERY
Please cal] (4]6)48J 1244

COME AND ENJOY OLR
BREAKFAST SPECIAL FOR
ONLY $5.99 (9AM-1030AM)
comemeT DAYS A WEEK-----—-

s llIf s ) o,

P.B. Yonge/Eglinton
2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON
Tel: 4164851244

Check: 1170172
Server: Jenny Date: 05/15/2008
Table: 113 Time: 13:16
MSTRCRD
FrkRR KRR AR ~()2(7
ROSS/ERIN
AUTH 015631 ONLINE
MERCHANT# 8999
SUBTOTAL $ 40 .62
rT—- o
TIP $ _ 5

TOTAL $

** CUSTOMER COPY **

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER
Pickle Barrel Yonge & Eglinton
now offers DELIVERY
Please call (416)485-1244
COME AND ENJOY OUR
BREAKFAST SPECIAL FOR
ONLY $5.99 (94M-10304HM)
~~~~~~~~~ 7 DAYS & WEEK-~~=rnmm




OEb

Pure Spirits
Oyster House & Grill
55 Mill Street
Toronto, Ontario
416 381 5859
GST # 85318 5437 RTC0O0
Date: May07'08 09:11PM
Card Type: M/C
Acct #: XXXAXKXXNXKX0202
Exp Date:  XX/XX
Auth Code: 005910

Check: £399
Table: 304/1
Server: 30034 Rahaman
ERIN ROSS
Subtotal: 154 .39
Tip: f
[ 7] 27
Signature

1 agree to pay above totai
according to my card issuer
agreement .

¥ % % % Merchant Copy * * * %

OE®

Pure Spirits
Oyster House & Grill
55 Mi11 Street
Toronto, Ontario
416 361 5859
GST # 85318 5437 RT0O001

30034 Rahaman

304/1 Chk 6399 fst 7
May07 08 07:29PM
SANPELL WATER 5.95
Caraquette € 2.95 11.80
kumomoto @ 3.75 7.50
Rasberry PT @ 2.50 10.00
Rocky Bay @ 2.84 5.68
Beau Soliel @ 2.15 4,30
Fanny Bay @ 2.75 5.50
Island Creek @ 3.20 6.40
Clam Gratin 12.00
Mussels & Frites 15.00
Sweetbreads 14.00
Mixed Greens 9.00
Spur cherry 8.00
Brulee 9.00
Esoresso Doie 3.50
short
Espressc Db'a 3.50
short
Espresso Dbie 3.50
short
Subtotal 136.63
136.63 6ST 6.83
136.83 PST 10.93
Total 154 .39

Thank vou for dining with us.




Lunchy ety Peler £
HBBosion Pizza

BOSTON PIZZA
ORANGEVILLE #524

0022 Table 66 fParty 3

ALANA M SvrCk: 5 12:h0 v -01/0g
COFFEE .45
N.S. POP 2.69
WATER ' .00
CAESR W/ENTR & 0.00
JCHS PENNE, 3chs dhed .95
=X 11.64
9.29
Sub Total: 36.06
GST: 1.80
PST: 2.88
40.74

1 BOSTON PIZZA

PAY SER

N $1000.00 in a WEEKLY DRAW!!!
d/nr $10,000 in a YEARLY DRAWI!!
To enter complete our
GUEST SATIFACTION SURVEY.

Receive TEN CHAY':, of wine 1 by

visting www.bo . Zasur om

receive one Ciank ul #Wiaing by
calling 1-888-649-08%y

Please respond within 3 DAYS /

0l receiving this invitation.

Keep this receipt tor reference
while answering the survey.

FaN Holes & Regulatoowe, can be found at

W s e i vey.c

0022
Server: ALANA M
05/01/08 13:18, Swiped

BP #524 Orangeville

5 Buena Vista Drive
Orangeville, ON, L9W 1J5
(519) -

MERCHANT #:

Transaction Record

Tran #: 2671
Visa PreAuth and Hold
XXXXXXXXXXXX1211 §

Amount:  $40.74
Do
Tip:____f;.
1

Total: _ X 3. _
APPROVED 045749
00-001 045749
BP052404/BP524C01
024001001025
2008/05/01-13:17:52

Cardholder Signature

Rec: 11

Terminal:

4




IL CORSO

RISTORANTE GST83040614BRTO0Y
ORANGEVILLE ONTARIO

(519) 941-10089

FOR ALL YOUR CATERING NEEDS
RESERVE 4 YOUR XMAS PARTY

REG 2008-05-01 06:52 PM
ABBIE 8 MC #01 000084
CHECK No. 17
1 MINERAL BTL $5.85
1 ANTIPASTO MISTO $8.00

1 PAPRDELLE CORSO $15.00
1 GNOCCH! TRATTORIA  $13.00

SUBTOTAL $42.95
GST TAX _ $2.15
PST TAX $3. 44

SRVC TL $a48. 54

o

(2

IL CORSO RISTORANTE
20 DAWSON ROAD
ORANGEVILLE ON

CARD NUMBER
CARD TYPE
DATE/TIME
RECEIPT NUMBER
AUTHORIZATION
AMOUNT

TIP

TOTAL AMOUNT

01 APPROVED-027
THANK YOU

e 1123 2.0V AN!
VISR 0430
2008/05/01 19:58:15
547164224-172-012

AUTH, # 044147

CARDHOLDER COPY

eniner

i
¥
FE




CHECK : 1273
TABLE : 5671
SERVER : 1020 Lawrence
DATE : 04MAY ’08  9:04PM
CARD TYPE: Master Card ]
ACCT #: XXX AKK 0202
EXP DATE: XX/ XX
AUTH CODE: 055749
RESEARCH: 000000000000

ERIN ROSS
SUBTOQTAL : 154 .41

2>

Gratuity 7&? . Vf
Total_ |7¢
Signature /////ijf/’i

WL RUTHSCHRIS . CA

THANK YOU

Ruth’s Chris Steak House
Toronto, Ontario
GSTH#&89541 9968 RC
1020 Lawrence

=671 CHK 1273 GST =
04MAY 08 8:01PM
1 AHI TUNA 16.95
1 *Ribeye 45 95
2@e7.95
San Pellegrino 15.90
1 *Petit Filet 39.95
1 xAsparagus/Holla 9.95
1 x%Potato au Grat 7.95
Subtotal 136 .65
G.S.TAX 6.83
P .S .TAX 10.93

Amount Due 154 .41

TRY OUR SIZZLING PRIME TIME MENU
3 COURSES FOR $54 .00

4.30 - 6:30 / 7 DAYS A WEEK

ASK YOUR SERVER FOR DETAILS

416-955-1455
VISIT US ON LINE @

WWW . RUTHSCHRIS .CA




KOO R AR KRR AR

* SOUTH 88 K

* ORANGEVILLE X

¥ (G197 942-8805 X

KK AR RERREAREE R R CRERR
0440 2008 MC #: 0000

et x8.50TR

¥(. 4371

¥(0.6372
107AL ¥9.61
{CASH ¥9.61
PM /-26 0000
HAVE A NICE DAY

PLEASE CUME AGALN
THAaNK, YOu

IR IS RN MM)KXMZHX%*
X SOUTH 88 X
% URANGEVILLE X
X 5101 5428805 X
SEE R R AR ROCOOOOORCRE KKK
ud-30-7008  MC #:0000
CPT %8.50TK
X0.43T1
%0.6812
TOT AL %9.61
LASH %9.01

PM 7-26 0000
HAVE A NICE DAY
PLEASE CUME AGAIN
THAaNKE YOoU




P.B. Yonge/Eglinton
2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON
Tel: 4164851244
Check: 1183884

Server: Kareen Date: 05/05/7008

Table: 32 Time: 13:03
MSTRCRD
Rk RRk k- (207
ROSS/ERIN
AUTH 005375 ONLINE
MERCHANT# 9999
SUBTOTAL 25 .95
'OO
ft
TIP % \‘;

TOTAL $ ;Z7hq3

** CUSTOMER COPY =%

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER
P1ckle Barre] Yonge & Eg]1nton
now offers DELIVERY
P]ease call (4 16)485~1244

COME AND ENJOY OUR
BREAKFAST SPECTAL FOR
ONLY $5.99 (9AM-10304M)
~emmme=T DAYS A WEEK--—--—

P.B. Yonge/Eglinton
2300 Yonge Street Toronio, ON
Tel: 416-485-1244
Check #: 1163884

Server: Kareen Date: (5/05/2008

Table: 32 Time: 13:02
Client: 2

1 Colombian Coffee 1.99

1 POP 1.99

1 Reuben Sandwich 9.99

1 Fru1t Plate 8.99

SUB~ TOTAL 72.96

Gst (869149484): 1.15

Food Tax: 1.84

roTAL : 25 95

PLEASE PAY YOUR SERVER

Plukle Barre] Yonge & Egl1nton
now offers DELIVERY
Pledse cal] (416)485—1244

COHE AND ENJOY OUR
BREAKFAST SPECIAL FOR
ONLY $5.93 (9AM-10308M)
——————————— 7 DAYS A HEEK---—---




LEE
503 King St. W. Toronto, ON
Tel: 416-504-7867
Check: 64101

Server: Dax Date: 05/06/2008
Table: 54 Time: 19:30
MSTRCRD
Rk Rk Rk-(202
ROSS/ERIN
AUTH 035358  ONLINE
MERCHANT# 9999
SUBTOTAL $ 6583 .41
gn()o
TIP $
TOTAL $ V7/

** CUSTOMER COPY *%*

GST 85593 0806 RTOOO1

April 22 - May 31
Best of Susur
Six Course Tasting Menu
$140 Per Person

At Susur Restaurant
416,803.2205
WiW , susUr .com

4
LEE

603 King St. W. Toronto, ON
Tel: 416-504-7867
Check #: 64107

Server: Dax Date: 05/0B/2008
Table: 54 Time: 19:27
Client: 5

2 Sparkling Water 10.00

1 Slaw 18.00

1 Black Cod 18.00

1 Four Satay 17.00

1 Braised Beef 18.00

1 Duck Confit 18.00
1 6oz Hollick 13,000

SUB-TOTAL: 112.00

Gst: 5.60

Food Tax: 7.92

Liguor Tax: 1.30

TOTAL : 126.82

GST 85593 0806 RT0001

dpril 22 - May 31
Best of Susur
Six Course Tasting Menu
$140 Per Person

At Susur Restaurant
416.603.2205
WiW . SUSUT . com
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S WENDY 'S REG 2
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§2008~05—14 L1712 06:16PM
§ 60106683 2 89 2166
475 YONGE STREET
=] TORONTO, ON
= M4Y 1X7
A
o
E  BACONATOR CMB 6.99 &
<
= JR BCN CHEESE 1.59 &
:E:-' ICED TEA -g‘
5 PST 8% 0.69 =
& Federal GST 0,43 &
*#¥% TO GO #x%x 9.70
8 g
S DEBIT CARD 970 e
3 CHANGE DUE 0.00 E
s Vat No.: GST R105619688 s
= -
o How was your visit? =
2 Call us at (416) 921-9045 E
E Total Jtems 4 [}
SO —
=3 (=]
AH19028443 % xxx %% Purchase $9.70§
ﬁgbit Swired Cheauinsig
fthorization Number 008724&
10013700 21722 66078379%
= 05/14/08 18:16:059
d§/001 APPROVED ~ THANK YOU w
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TRANSACTION RECORD

BURGER KING #13614
10 EGLINTON AVE E. M4P{as

TORONTO o

20673020
o PURCRASE H
05-12-2008 12:18:37
Acot #  4519020443470409 S

Account Chequing

120673020002
Auth # 005064 RRN 001753011

Total i1.01
00 APPROVED-THARK YOU

Retain this copy for your
records
Customer copy

200014926851 1vE #

i
{

S

(. 7
N

13IA43S WOOY
NOLTIH O.LNCHOL

\




%ﬁ Customer Dopy #2X
Boaconstield oumg:s
Tehz &5
Carlos F.  3/15/2008 10:0i:446 PH
Transaction 225348

Hzoteorilsrd

Ssmonim® ki s M R
WO
[0
TP =2
2
TOITHE = ﬂ7 3

ESS0 EXPRESS PAY

MOSSCO ESSO
HWY 481 EASTBOUND
WOUDSTOCK, ON

Site $#: 88861871

CLHHE 85784 i4:15
oS TERCARD
vz T 8156426 -F
Ly # NGE98415
Crredit B
Punpf#Bt REGU%
lLitres 61. 72

@ %1.215/LTR
Fuel £7?5.
TL/NoTax £75.

Total $£75.
GS5T In Fuel £3.

Cardholder will
pray card issuexr
amount pursuant
to Cardholder
greement.

5T #R121461187

31 TES88801871

TRANSACTION RECORD//“M”‘
/oy

PETRO-CANADA ¢
1656 SNYDERS RD
PETERSBURG

Ontario NOB 2HO

GST: 816528749

9) 634-5536

51
2008-05-16 P00829332:ooé1501 16:27
TERMINAL: 050061501 OPER: A
FUEL (L) ($/L) ($)
Pump 3
Regular 28,360 1.234 35.00%
~ PRODUCT GTY PRICE  AMOUNT

- Snacks 2.99  2.99%

NON~ FUEL GST 0.15
NON-FUEL PST 0.24

Total Owed 38.38

- TOTAL PAILD

. DEBIT CARD 38.38
- #TAXES INCL.  #TAXES EXCL.
GST TOTAL § 1.82
FhkkRRRRRRRk4478

DEBIT
REF 139845

. AUTHORIZATION 162703
. TERMINAL 37696554
| FROM CHEQUING

00 APPROVED - THANK YOU

100 bonus
F’EE'FF?(J POINTS! And

;a chance to WIN FREE

GAS for one vyear!
Did you see a Seriice Hero today?

Full details and a short survey
1o be completed at

wWww .petro—
canada. ca/hero

1~866~828~7779




PARKING DLURATION: 000 06,59
CHARGED DURATION: 00 623N

DO NOT WRITE ABOVE THIS LINE - NRE RIEN ECRIRE AU-DESSU DE CETTE LIGNE

Yonge & Eglinton Ctr
Paystation 3
05/05/08 05:46P

{152m3
05/05/08 08:46A
05/25/08 051 46P

City Taxi

AUTHORIZATON/NG D AUTORISATION
AMOUNT-MONTANT

e 416-740-2222
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$1.84
$16.00
05/05/08 051 46P
Rk 98225 Pk
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' CARDHOLDER'S SIGNATURE - SIGNATURE DU TITULAIRE
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IMPERIAL PARKING
CANADA CORPORATION

TAX 13% INCLUDED

pPs 02
car park ADELAIDE PLACE
parking zone:
shorttermp.: 03054
fronm 04.05.08 17:28:00
to 05.05.08 08:16:00
amount 24,00 CAD
Credit card receipt :
date : 05.05.08 08:16:53
cashier : 549188202527 XXXX
amount 24 .00 CAD

Transaction N° :389522

GST # BB7315638RT0004
Thank you for
your patronage
HAVE A NICE DAY !

PREUVE DE VOTRE TRANSACTION
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ARDHOLDER WILL PAY TO THE ISSUER OF THE CHARGE CARD PRESENTED HEREWITHTHE
(fEMOUNT STATED HEREIN IN ACCORDANGE WITH THE JSSUER'S AGREEMENT WITH THE

CARDHOLDER ) . .
CE DETENTEUR DE LA CARTE CHHAUTE MENTIONNE PNERAA LEMETTEUR LA CARTE LE
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MONTANT CI-INDIGUE CONFORMEMENT AUX CONDITIONS OF LA CONVENTION ENTRE
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DIAMOND TAXICHE As

> CAB Assoc
251 QUEERN 2D JCIAT
Eon GUEEN STREET Easy

TYPE: PURCHHSE

Am : ~
AcCT: ount: § 8. 88

CREDIT $ Z

CARD MUMBER:

XXXXXXX'X)-(}'{XXBZBZ
DATE : 2zges.gs
858
TIME ‘8842 35 ©

REF. ~TRNE: BEBBZzSoq

77363324 s
AUTH. #: (B453p9)

TRANSACTION
[=]=]%] APPROVED Bl
THANK vQu '
Cardholder w

srdh 111 pay o
lssuer the above amo»:u'i:;d
Pursuant tg car-dhmldar.

agreement .

*axw CUSTOMER=«COPY

-




FARE # DATE: t"ﬁ AV Ry} ] E
/ [ 7 7 ECAE o 1230 maounT s 1Xr0® W
-/ 4 L7 L
.................. // / DRIVER'S NAME__ ™ AN
CROMN TAXT — ) ‘.
416-240-0000 ComoM__ O, - bo'“ffm{
WWW .CROWNTAXT .COM o h\\ﬁﬂﬁkt et N
CUSTOMER NOTE: AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE INCLUDES G.S.T.
TRANSACTION RECORD et a5 “NOTIONAL o ot o DRER'S Reginon |
Number, not CO-OP CABS. —
<PURCHASE >
TRANSACTION #: 2
TERMINAL ID: 89Q10150 —
MERCH 1D: 99Q001 '
BATCH #: 000006 [ /HF
CARD TYPE: MASTERCARD
(R ssmsmoooo0202 S INDEPENDENT CAB OWNERS'
EXP . DATE: 0114 CO-OPERATIVE INCORPORATED
??;E 2008 23/ gg Toronto, Ontgrlo
Bse Amt:  $20 .00 %/4/&% F %/7\
Tip Amt: sO .00 , Date . ae: GST NCLUDED
________ . ,
TOTAL $20.00 o
AUTH & 005415 oo
TRACE #: 000009 Cab# Driver:
APPROVED - THANK YOU LET US SERVE YOU BETTER
K
ROSS ERIN

I AGREE TO PAY ABOUE
TOTAL AMOUNT ACCORDING
TO CARD ISSUER AGREEMENT
TORONTOS FINEST
TAXI SERUICE
THANK YOU

CABH1800




SCHEDULE “C”




APPENDIX “B”

FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

AUGUST 1, 2007 - NOVEMBER 15, 2007

EB2007-050 THE ROSS FIRM GROUP
Board File Number Party Name
Quinn M. Ross 2005 The Ross Firm PC
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
Preparation 98.60 130.00 $12,818.00 $640.90 $13,458.90
Attendance — Technical Conference 14.00 130.00 $1,820.00 $91.00 $1,911.00
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 112.60 130.00 $14,638.00 $731.90 $15,369.90

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. 1f applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




APPENDIX “B”
FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL
NOVEMBER 16, 2007 - JULY 7, 2008

EB2007-050 THE ROSS FIRM GROUP
Board File Number Party Name
Quinn M. Ross 2005 The Ross Firm PC
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Consultant Name Years of Relevant Experience Consultant Firm
Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
Preparation 163.75 $170.00 $27,837.50 | $1,391.88 $29.229 38
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing 108.15 $170.00 $18,385.50 $919.28 $19,304.78
Argument 53.8 $170.00 $9,486.00 $474.30 $9,960.30
Case Management
TOTALS 327.1 $170.00 $55,709.00 |  $2,785.46 $58,494.46 | |
PRE NOVEMBER $14,638.00 $731.90 $15,369.90
GRAND TOTAL: TOTAL $70,347.00 | $3,517.36 $73,864.36

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate , and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Heather J. Ross 1984 The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Consultant Name Years of Relevant Experience Consultant Firm
Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total

Preparation 6.6 $210.00 $1,386.00 $69.30 $1,455.30
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 6.6 $210.00 $1,386.00 $69.30 $1,455.30

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

AUGUST 1, 2007 - NOVEMBER 15, 2007

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Paul Ross 1967 The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Consultant Name Years of Relevant Experience Consultant Firm
Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
| Preparation 6.35 $210.00 $1,333.50 $66.68 $1,400.18
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 6.35 $210.00 $1,333.50 $66.68 $1,400.18

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

NOVEMBER 16, 2007 - JULY 7, 2008

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Paul Ross 1967 The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

\\/'

Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total

Preparation 94 $330.00 $3,102.00 $155.10 $3.257.10
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing 24.25 $330.00 $8,002.50 $400.13 $8,402.63
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 33.65 $330.00 $11,104.50 $555.23 $11,659.73

PRE NOVEMBER $1,333.50 66.68 $1,400.18
GRAND TOTAL 40.00 TOTAL $12,438.50 $621.91 $13,059.91

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

AUGUST 1, 2007 - NOVEMBER 15, 2007

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Elli M. Cohen 2005 The Ross Firm PC
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

Hours

Hourly Rate

Sub-total

GST

Total

Preparation

7.00

$130

$910.00

$45.50

$955.50

Attendance — Technical Conference

Attendance — Settlement Conference

Attendance — Oral Hearing

Argument

Case Management

TOTALS

7.00

$130.00

$910.00

$45.50

$955.50

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

NOVEMBER 16, 2007 — JULY 7, 2008

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group -
Board File Number Party Name
Elli M. Cohen 2005 The Ross Firm PC
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total

Preparation 1.50 170.00 $255.00 $12.75 $267.75
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 1.50 170.00 $255.00 $12.75 $267.75

PRE NOVEMBER $910.00 $45.50 $955.50
GRAND TOTAL 8.50 TOTAL $1,165.00 $58.25 $1,223.35

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency

—




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

AUGUST 1, 2007 - NOVEMBER 15, 2007

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Michelle Dekens Paralegal The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Consultant Name Years of Relevant Experience Consultant Firm
Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
Preparation 6.20 $80.00 $496.00 $24.80 $520.80

Attendance — Technical Conference

Attendance — Settlement Conference

Attendance — Oral Hearing

Argument

Case Management

TOTALS 6.20 $80.00 $496.00 $24.80 $520.80

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate , and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

NOVEMBER 16, 2007 - JULY 7, 2008

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Michelle Dekens Paralegal The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
Preparation 9.95 $100.00 $995.00 $49.75 $1,044.75
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 9.95 $100.00 $995.00 $49.75 $1,044.75
16.15 PRE NOVEMBER $496.00 $24.80 $520.80
GRAND TOTAL: TOTAL $1,491.00 $74.55 $1,565.55

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Jamill Cook Paralegal The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
Preparation 5 $£80.00 $400.00 $20.00 $420.00
Attendance — Technical Conference
Attendance — Settlement Conference
Attendance — Oral Hearing
Argument
Case Management
TOTALS 5 $80.00 $400.00 $20.00 $420.00

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

, and country of initial currency




FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS — CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

NOVEMBER 16, 2007 - JULY 7, 2008

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name
Carole Weber Paralegal The Ross Firm
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm

Consultant Name

Years of Relevant Experience

Consultant Firm

Hours

Hourly Rate

Sub-total

GST

Total

Preparation

8

$100.00

$800.00

$40.00

$840.00

Attendance — Technical Conference

Attendance — Settlement Conference

Attendance — Oral Hearing

Argument

Case Management

TOTALS

$100.00

$800.00

$40.00

$840.00

=i

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate

» and country of initial currency




APPENDIX “B”
FORM 1

SUMMARY STATEMENT OF HOURS - CONSULTANTS AND LEGAL COUNSEL

A separate form is required for each consultant or legal counsel

EB2007-0050 The Ross Firm Group PC
Board File Number Party Name
Legal Counsel Name Year of Call Law Firm
Edward R. Brill 25 SEA Ltd.
Consultant Name Years of Relevant Experience Consultant Firm
Hours Hourly Rate Sub-total GST Total
Preparation & Report 49.50 $217.88%* $10,785.06 N/A $10,785.06

Attendance — Technical Conference

Attendance — Settlement Conference

Argument

Case Management

** $210.00 USD = $217.88 CDN , /
TOTALS $10,785.06 |

Note: All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate 1.0375 and country of initial currency USD.
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PROFESSIGNAL RESUME OF RDWARD R BRUL. PE.CEE.L

January 2008

General Information

Project Engineer

SEA, Lud,

3340 N.W._ 53" Street, Suite 402
Ft Lauderdale, Flerida 33309
(954)777-4790

ebri}]) @sealimited.com

Education

Bachelor of Science
Electrical Engineenng
Florida Atlantic University
Boca Raton, Florida

April 1987

Bachclor of Science
Business Administration
Bryan College

Dayton, Tenncssee

May 1083

United States Naval Academy

Annapolis. Maryland
1979-1981

Professional Summary

December 2003 to Present
Project Engineer

SEA, Ltd,

Fort Lauderdale, Florida

Investigate electrical accidents and determine causation in hability, property, and
personal injury claims. Specialized in the following areas: structural and marine fin
ar:alysis; electric shock and electrocution; lightuing damage analysis and validity;
illumination (lighting) studies, including slip/trip-and-fall evaluations; identify product
failures and deficiencies, including household appliunces, commercial equipment, and
tadustrisl machinery; evaluate product adherence (o mandatory standards and indusuy
guidelines: proper handling of evidence and chain-of -cusiody preservation; field and
teboratory testing, including nondestructive techniques and product relability.




Professional Resume
rdward R. Briil, P.E., C.F.E.L ' Page 2

1983 t0 2003
Flonda Power & Light
Juno Beach, Florida

1998 to 2003
Senior Power Quality Business Mamager~

Responsible for deveioping prodncts and services for commercial and industrial
customers that met their needs for improved power quality and reliability to their

operations and facilities. Developed a power monitoring service, with 2 budget of over
$4 million.

Developed power quality related services 1o help customers solve power quality problems-
through mitigation equipment, as well as tools and techniques to desensitize elecronic
equipment from power quality disturbances.

Supported 6 Power Quality Engineers around the state for equipment, training, and
consulting needs with power quality issues affecting customers.

Coordinated and taught FPL’s Power Quality Seminar 1o Professional Engincers,
Electrical Contractors, and Electricians around the state and obtained Professional
Engineering Continuation Education approval through the Florida Board of Professional
Engincers.

1988 to 1998
Power Quality Engineer

Responsible far developing, planning, and coordinatng FPL’s Power Quality Program.
Performed analysis at over 1,000 residential/commercial/industrial customers’ facilities

10 solve power quality problems affecting customers” equiprment and operations by
responding to complaints and coordinating remedics. Analysis included site Inspection of
wiring and grounding installagons, monitoring and data znalysis, and written reports
presenting recommendations to improve performance of systems. ‘

Analyzed, inspected, and monitored high- and low-voltage electrical pOWwer equipment
(e.g., switchgear, transfer switches, power iines, transformers) to determine the cause of
farlures or malfunctions in the operation.

Analyzed facilitics and equipment for damage due to lightning, Determined path of entry
and made recommendations for protection to minimize exposure to future events.

Investigazed grounding and wiring for fuults and malfunctions tat caused electrical
shock or electrocution.

Testified as expert witness for Regulatory Affairs before the Florida Public Service
Commission,

Nationally recognized expert in the power quality fieid and have pubhshed and presenied
DUMErous papers.




Professional Resume
Edward K. Bnili, PE., CF.E.L Page 3

Y1

1983 1o 1687
Customer Service/Engineering Training

Worked in the Custonmier Service Group and rotated into vanious En gineering Groups
while anaining an elecrrical engineering degree.

Seminars and Additional Bducation

1989 — EPRI Power Quality Analysis Course, St. Louis, Missouri

1991 - Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International
Conference on Power Quality, San Francisco, California

1992 ~ Electric Power Research Institute. Power Quality Applications, Internationai
Conference on Power Quality, Atlanta, Georgia

1993 — Electric 93 Conference, Adanta, Georgia

1994 ~ Electric 94 Coaference, New York City, New Yok

1995 - National Conference on Harmonics and Power Quality, Philadelphia,
Pennsylvania

1995 ~ Electic 95 Conference, Adanta, Georgia

1995 — Certified Energy Manager, Association of Energy Engineers, Juno Beach, Flonda

1998 — Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International
Conference on Power Quality, Charlotte, North Carolina

1999 — Certified Power Quality Professional, Association of Energy Engineers. Juno
Beach, Florida

2000 — AMRA (Automated Meter Reading Association) Conference, Tamipa, Florida

2001 —~ Project Success Mcthod Course, Juno Beach, Caiifornia

2001 - Metering Americas Conference, Miemi, Florida

2001 — Elecuric Power Research Institute (EPRI) Power Quality Applications
International Conference on Power Quality, Piushburgh, Pennsylvania

2002 - Utility Finance & Accounting Seminar, Juno Beach, California

2004 ~ LAAT Investigation of Electrical Appliance-Related Fires, Savannah, Georgia

2004 — SEA, Ltd. Live Burn, Seminar Class, Columbus, Ohio

2005 ~ ABYC Electrical Certification Course, Tampa, Florida

2005 — National Fire, Arson & Explosion Investigation Training, Sarasota, Florida

Centifications

Certified Fire and Explosions Investigator (C.F.E.L)
Arverican Boat & Yacht Council, Certification No. EC'217251205

State of Flonda, Repistration No. 45819




Pmofessional Resume
Edward R. Bnli, PE., CFE.L Page 4

VIL

Courses Taught/Presentatians

1992 - Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International
Conference on Power Quality, Presented Paper on Energy Conservation
Equipment Creating Power Quality Problems, Atlanta, Georgia

1993 ~ Electric 93 Conference, Presented Paper on Lightning and Surge Suppression
Protection, Atlanta, Georgia

1994 — National Conference on Harmonics and Power Quality, Presented Paper on
Hannonic Distortion Issues for Utilities and Costomers, Chicago, Tliinois

1994 — Electric 94 Conference, Presented Paper on Power Quality Wiring and Grounding
Issues, New York City, New York

1995 — National Conference on Harmonics and Power Quality, Presented Paper on
Harmonic Distortion Issues on Electrical Systems, Phiiadeiphia, Pennsylvania

1995 - Electric 95 Conference, Presented Paper on Power Quality Issues for Sensitive
Electronics, Atlanta, Georgia

1996 ~ 4-day Power Training Seminar to Philadelphia Electric Company (PECO),
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania

1992-1997 - Helped develop and teach the following seminars to Engineers, Facility
Managers, Electricians, and Building Owners at malriple locations in Florida:

FPL Power Quality Seminar

FPL Surge and Lightning Protection Seminar
FPL Wiring and Grounding Seminar

FPL Motor Protection Seminar

FPL Harmonic Distortion Seminar

1997-1999 — Power Quality Analysis Course for Electrical Contractors and Electricians
Continuing Education Credits, Sarasota, Ft. Lauderdale, Melbourne, Junc Beach,
and Miami, Floridg

1998 — Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International
Conference on Power Quality, Presented Paper on Power Quality Business Issues,
Charlote, North Carolina .

2000 - AMRA (Automated Meter Reading Association) Conference, Presented Paper on
FPL’s Power Quality Metering Project, Tampa, Florida

2002-2003 - FPL Power Quality Analysis Course for Florida Professional Engineers
Continuing Edacation Credits, Juno Beach, Florida

. 2004 — Presenter at South Florida Claims Seminar for the Association of Properry

and Casualty Claim Professionals on Origin and Cause Investigations

2005 - Presenter at Northeast Fiorida Property and Casualty Claims Seminar, Fire
and Electrical Investigation, Subrogation and Evidence Collection,
Jacksonville, Florida

2005 ~ Presenter at Insurance Network Services Seminar on Fire and Electca)
Investigation — Subrogation and Evidence Collection

2005 ~ Presenter a1 Property Casualty Claims Professional Seminar — Forensic
Investigation of Lightning Damage Claims, Davie, Florida

2006 ~ Presenter at Property Casualty Claims Professional Seminar — Forensic
Electrical Failure Analysis — The Shocking Truth, Fort Lauderdale, Florida




Professional Resume
tdward R. Ball, PE.,, CEEL Page 5

2005 — Presenter 2t the Inwrnaticnel Assceiation of Arsor Investigators Confercnce —
Investigations of Electrical and Apphiance-Related Fires, West Palm Beach,
rFlorida

2007 — Presenter at US Law ~ Asscmbling the Rapid Response Team: Farly Invest-
gation Strategies for Preparing a Successful Defensc, Tucson, Arizona,

2007 — Preseater at the Southeastern Electrical Exchange — Claims Section Meeung —
Investigations of Electrica) Fires — Origin and Cause, Charleston, South Carolina

2007 — Presenter at York Claims Service, Inc_, for Property and Casualty Claims
Professionals Seminar ~ Fire and Electrical Investigation — Subrogation and
Evidence Collection, Fort Lauderdale, Flogda

2007 - Presenter at South Florida Claims Summer Conference for the Association of
Property and Casualry Claims Professionals on Origin and Cause Imresﬂgatxons
Fort Lauderdale, Florida

VIIl, Professional Affiliations

Insttute of Electrical and Electronic Engineers (IEEE)
National Fire Protection Association (NFPA)
International Association of Arson Investigators (IAATL)
National Associatior: of Fire Investigators (NAFT)
International Association of Marine Investigators (JAMI)




Corporate Information Please Remit Payment To:
7348 Worthington-Galena Road SEA, Ltd.

Columbus, Ohio 43085 P.C. Box 71-4671
614.888.4160 * 800.782.6851 Columbus, Ohio 43271-4671
& www,SEAlimited.com ¥ Terms Net 30 ™**

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Date: June 30, 2008
Quinn M Ross Esquire SEA Invoice No. 7210629
138 Courthouse Square ‘ SEA ProjectNo. 703674
Goderich Ontario N7A Im9 Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

RE: File Review Proposed Construction -
Transmission Line
The Ross Firm Group
Proposed Line From Bruce Nuclear Plant Near
Kincardine Ontario To Milton Ontario

Charges posted through April 28, 2008
Please reference SEA Invoice No. 7210629

| Professional:Services: -~ 5.0 3 Ciiw T o Hours St i Aanount: |
Ed Brill, P.E.
02/13/08 Review Documents 2.50 525.00
02/14/08 Client Contact 0.50 105.00
02/14/08 Review Documents 3.00 630.00
02/15/08 Review Documents 1.50 315.00
02/21/08 Review Documents 1.75 367.50
02/22/08 Review Documents 2.25 472.50
02/28/08 Review Client File 2.50 525.00
02/29/08 Research & Investigation 1.75 367.50
03/04/08 Review Documents 1.50 315.00
03/06/08 Review Documents 2,75 577.50
04/01/08 Client Contact 1.25 262.50
04/07/08 Review Documents - IAEA Review 2.50 525.00
04/11/08 Review Standards/References 2.75 577.50
04/15/08 Review Documents 1.50 315.00
04/16/08 Client Contact 0.50 105.00
04/16/08 Review Documents 1.25 262.50
04/17/08 Review Documents 2.50 525.00
04/18/08 Review Documents 3.50 735.00
04/18/08 Research & Investigation 2.50 525.00
04/21/08 Review Documents 3.50 735.00

Page 1 of 3

ATLANTA * BALTIMORE/WASHINGTON » CHICAGO * CLEVELAND « COLUMBUS « FOAT LAUDERDALE ¢« HOUSTON « JACKSONVILLE * ST, LOUIS » TAMPA




The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Date:

June 30, 2008
SEA Invoice No. 7210629
SEA Project No. 703674

04/21/08 Client Contact 0.50 105.00
04/23/08 Review Documents 2.50 525.00
04/25/08 Report Preparation 3.50 735.00
04/25/08 Report Processing - Finalize Report 2.25 472.50
Total 50.50 $ 10,605.00

Richard Shearer, P.E.
04/28/08 Report Preparation 0.30 90.00
Total 0.30 $ 90.00
04/28/08 Report Processing 4.00 140.00
Total 4.00 § 14000
Total Professional Services 54.80 § 10,835.00

Other Expenses

Postage 7.15
Phone Charges 9.75
Total $ 16.90
Total Expenses h 16.90
Page 2 of 3

Please reference SEA Invoice No. 7210629 on your remittance




The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Date: June 30, 2008
SEA Invoice No. 7210629

SEA Project No. 703674

[Total Amount Due This Period: =~ - 0 . - = =0~ et Amount |
Total Professional Services $ 10,835.00

Total Expenses 16.90

Total Amount Due This Period 10,851.90

Less: Previous Payments (6,200.00)

Please Pay This Amount $§ 4,651.90

Page 3 of 3

Please reference SEA Invoice No. 7210629 on your remittance
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Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008

ate

Entryf

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R BRal.
Explanation Current Trust Bal

“lient:
atter:
ug -

19

19

19

“ g

1/2007.
161148

1/2007

161185

1/2007

161186

172007

161978

1/2007

170102

Aug

Aug:

Aug

=g

Aug

Aug"

aug

161155

272007
i 161156

'3/2007

161157
3/2007
161158

3/2007
161159

3/2007
169818

3/2007

169820

©.3/2007
| 169822

7/2007

161163

7:/2007 .
’1161164g= ol

e Clark rey individual propertyhconcerns;?“v
7/2007

161979

- 8/2007.
169824

161166

gv14/2007

161681

g 14/2007

lel684

1732
2007-1977 EXPROPRIATION OF LAND - HYDRO ONE ] 0.00

“To.receiving copy of fax from P
_Fallis to Michael Miller.:

“To telephone conversation with Py
S Fallis res Further submissions on
i Alberta Surface Rights Act:

‘Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 :
To'correspondence ‘to P, Fallis: re‘,'* i
“start of further submissions:

“To correspondence. from James H.'
~“Smellie responding to the supplemen oy
- response - ‘submissions by ‘certain:::

sV Pallis & MeMillan.
13/2007

16 review of ‘the Partlclpant's list
©‘for:.the Section 98 applicationi

OEB Litigation Group 874.35

Lawyer: QMR 3,00 Hrs X 130:00 : : : R i 7117390000
To meeting with P. Fallis, Robert . .. .- L G ~ : L :
Thompson, ‘George: MacDonald etc re:

negotiations : : U L . : : : : . :
Lawyer: HJR 1.00 Hrs X 210.00 ’ ' 210.00
To meeting with P. Fallis in advance

of meeting with Hydro One

representatives.

Lawyer: QMR 1.00 Hrs X 130,00 - ' T e 130400
To.meeting with P. Fallis ‘in advance : ST e T

-of ‘meeting with Hydro One
. representatives.

Expense Recovery ‘ 02944 - 81.60

Travel: Goderich - Durham - Goderich

204 @ $0.40

Lawyer: HJR 3,00 Hrs X 210,00 0 w0 ET ARt e ST 8300000

" To meeting with P. Fallis, Robert

Thompson; George MacDonald etc re:

e negotiations:
2/2007

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
To receiving fax from P. Fallis re:

Hydro One Letter to Mr. and Mrs.

Visser.

Lawyer: QMR - 0.10 Hrs X 130: 00. v13¢993

Lawyer: QMR 4.25 Hrs X 130.00 ' ' 552,50

To preparation of Submissions on

Alberta Surface Rights Act - To review

of Alberta Hansards, to review of

Interpretation Act R.S.0., to review of

Rizzi v. Rizzi Shoes SCC. ) ‘
Lawyer: QMR- 0,30 Hrs ¥ 130200 i b : S oaa D 39000 i

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
To correspondence to Mr. Fanyeck re:

contact with our clients to be made

through this office.

CLawyer: QMR 0010 Hrs X 130000 . o hodni b 13000

To correspondence ~ from Mr. Fanyeck re:

- contact ‘with our: cllents

Lawgor: QMR 010 Hre X 130 o S C R e oo
To correspondence from Natasha

Sookmangal re: OEB letter to P. Fallis.
e L3R

Lawyer: PR 0.55 Hrs X 210.00 115.50
To meeting with Tom and Anne Fritz re:
individual property concerns.

Lawyer: PR 0,70 Hrs X 210.00
To:meéeting with Jack and Hildreth

Expense Recovery 02944 62.50
Travel: Goderich - Paisley - Goderich

156.24 @ $0.40

Lawyer: QNR . 0.10 Hrs X 130,00

1ntervenors represented by Fallls,

Lawyer: HJR 0.10 Hrs X 210 00 21.00
To correspondence from Michael

Engelberg re: Hydro One contacting our

clients.

Lawyer: QMR- 0.40 Hrs X 130.00

Lawyer: QMR 0.90 Hrs X 130.00 S ‘ 117000
To providing reporting letter to




Work-in-Progress

To Jul 8/2008 3
ste Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal
Litigation Group.
ug-14/2007 - Lawyer: QMR. 0.50 Hrs X 130.00 65,00
161685 To review of reply submissions on
: Alberta Surface Rights Act as ‘drafted
- by Peter Fallis: Sl
ug 14/2007 Lawyer: PR 0. 30 Hrs X 210. OO 63.00
161689 To telephone conversation with Peter
Fallis re: Submissions regarding
Alberta Surface Rights Act and response
to information pertaining to
compensation for Powerline Connections
Property Owners.
Aug 14/2007.: Lawyer: QMR °'0.30 Hrs'X:130.00 39.00:
- 169829 To telephone conversation with Peter. S
o Fallis rer Submissions regarding .
 Alberta Surface Rights Act -and responSe
~to: information. pertaining to L :
. compensatlon for Powerllne Connectlons
s v Property Owners.. 3 . el
ug 15/2007 Lawyer: HJR 0.10 Hrs X 210.00 21.00
161167 To correspondence to Michael Engelberg
re: up-to-date client list and
correspondence with Hydro One's
Counsel.
AugT15/2007 Lawyer: HJRT 0.10 'Hrs ¥ 210.00° 2100
1161168~ To correspondence from Michael . &
. ::,fki~Engelberg rer Hydro One! s Counsel T
ig 15/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
161169 To correspondence from Amani Ballan
re: current list of access to land
clients.
19°15/2007 " Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hre X 130,00 13,0000
'161170.. To correspondence :to OEB.re:. L
Lohoiroup-tosdatenclient Tigbtiooo s e
ryg 15/2007  Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130. OO 13.00
161171 To correspondence to Michael Engelberg
re: up-to-date client list.
Aug 15/2007 - Expense ReCovery i 02963 060
162969  Photocopies @ $0.20 -3 e 8
ig 15/2007 Expense Recovery 02963 0.20
162970 Fax @ $0.20 -1
Aug’16/2007u Lawyer:: JCX. 5,00 Hre X80 00 T ; 400.09.’
161172 To editing, photocopylng and preparlng B
Ha ~rine client packages con31st1ng of i
S ”;reportlng Tetter, excerpted transcrlpts
o : of ‘the OBB proceedings on-July 30th and
.- i31st, 2007, and other documents. | . Lo
19 16/2007 Lawyer QMR 1.75 Hrs X 130.00 227.50
161709 To meeting with Jim & Katherine Maus
to discuss individual property issues. ‘ v -
Bug 1672007 Lawyer: QMR I.75.Hrs X 130,000 0 00 200 Si20705000
161710 To meeting with Glenn & Sandrs Sawyerm‘f S
el el Gisenss individual | property issues. SaEE e
ig 16/2007 Lawyer: PR 1.75 Hrs X 210.00 367.50
161712 To meeting with Glenn & Sandra Sawyer
to discuss individual property 1ssues.
ig 16/2007  Expense Re¢overy = Co02044 (62,50
= 161980”_Trave1 Goderich -vPa1sley* e i
i S156,24 @ $0.40 L . v
Aug 16/2007 Lawyer: PR 1. 75 Hrs X 210 OO 367.50
162453 To meeting with Jim & Katherine Maus
to discuss 1nd1v1dua1 property 1ssues.
»ug 16/2007 Expense Recovery , o Lo 02063 Colat
162971 Fax @°80,20. -7 S
"9 16/2007 Expense Recovery 02963 88.20
162972 Photocopies @ $0.20 -441 (for letters
enclosing transcript excerpts)
Aug 17/2007 Layyer: QMR .0.10 ‘Hrs X-130.00
161173 To rece1v1ng fax from Peter Fallls re:
Siiiniicase lawi o Gt £
g 17/2007 Lawyer: HIR 0.10 Hrs X 210.00 21.00
162723 To receiving correspondence from
Michael Millar re: cost subm1551ons
9-17/2007 Expenss: Recovery ; LT 02968 0.60
162973 Fax @ $0,20 T




ite

Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008

Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time
Explanation

Current A/R Bal.

Current

Trust Bal

g

Aug

Aug

162072

Aug

Aug-

}\ng

Aug
Aug
j-\ug

B g

B

Auq

20/2007
160931
2072007
160947
20/2007
162657

20/2007

170021

120/2007

170092

2172087

161056

21/2007
161687

.21/2007
161693

21/2007
162071

21/2007

21/2007
162073

£21/2007
162153

21/2007

162154

21/2007

162974
22/2007

162074

23/20075
161682
S cdonfliet testiand ! p0351ble ‘appeal..

23/2007 Lawyer: PR 0.10 Hrs X 210.00 v . ' o © 21.00

161686

23/2007.
161691

23/2007

161694

2372007 %
Y Fax.@ $0.20 =2

2162975 it Ly S L
Lawyer: HJR 0. 10 Hrs X 210 OO 21.00

24/2007
161679

2642007

161767

‘OEB!s decision and order and setting up .
. 'a meeting for Thursday, August 30th. . S e e T T e
Lawyer HGR 0.50 Hrs X 210.00 105.00

Expense Recovery 02926 1.20

Fax @ $0.20 - 6 pages

Murray D. Keith, B:A. : B 491700

Searches; report & dellvery 49 ' , e

properties). ;. : . :

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
To receiving correspondence from Peter

0'Dell enclosing the OEB's Decision and

Order on the Interim Access

Application.

Lawyers HJR 0,10 Hrs X 210,00 . = oo g e . 21.00
To receiving email from M: Engelberg (SRR | R (n »

iregarding updated client list. = LA . e G Sl B
Lawyer: HJR 0.10 Hrs X 210. 00 21.00

To correspondence to M. Engelberg

enclosing July 24th and July 30th

letters.

Lawyer: PR 1.00 Hrs X 210,00 .0 oo f Rt S i . i 210.00

‘Review of . decision of OEB. To write -
Uto'Ri Rosenblatt concerning decision.

Lawyer: QMR 0.75 Hrs X 130.00 ' 97.50
To reviewing transcripts and isolating

questions with regards to agreements

with landowners for interim access.

Lawyer: OMR 0,10 Hrs X 130.00 BT e e e D e 3 0
To correspondence to P, Fallls re: BT S i i S W e v "

- transcript ‘excerpts.

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80. OO , 8.00
To telephone call to Daniel Schwartz

re: University of Toronto journal

article.

Lawyer: HIR - 0310 Hrs X 210,00 % S SR e ey 21,00
‘To‘recelving correspondénce ‘from 5 N S
-'Daniel Schwartz re: University of
Toronto. journal article; :

Lawyer: HJR 0.10 Hrs X 210.00 ' 21.00
To correspondence to Daniel Schwartz

requesting University of Toronto

journal article.

Lawyers QMR 1,00 Hrs X 130,007 0 i e s g 00
‘To:review of OEB Order on Interlm R L e
CRCCess; :

Lawyer: HJR 1.00 Hrs X 210.00 210.00
To review of OEB Order on Interim

Access.

Expense Recovery S 02963 R s N

Fax @:$0:20 -3 - : A R e R o
Lawyer: HJR 0. 10 Hrs X 210. OO 21.00
To receiving correspondence from

Daniel Schwartz attaching University of

Toronto journal article.

Lawyer: BRY 0L 107HEE XO2T0000 i i e e s s B e

To correspondence to David Waites re:

To correspondence to Mr. Carter re:
telephone conversation and requesting
fee estimate

cLawyer: PR0:10 Hrs X 210,00 ‘>1*Qe-;'Iﬂzti. L a__}_: e o :}g21{0Qfa,““.f”

To correspondence to Mr. Sawyer re: o

To conversation with Mr. Carter re:

possible appeal on the OEB's August

20th Decision and Order. ]

Expense Recovery .. .“.§ L 02983 i

To receiving correspondence from M.
Engelberg re: Hydro One contacting
affected landowners.

Lawyer QMR- 1,500 Hrs X 130,00 1 e L 195,00 -
To meeting with Mr. & Mts) DeBllek re‘ e s S . e B
- Individual ‘property.dssues. o




Werk-in-Progress

To Jul

8

/2008

ate

Paid To/Fee/Time

Entry# Explanation

Che/Inv

Retainer

Disbursement

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

Fee/Time

ug

Aug.

ug

ug’

Aug

*ug

nug

Aug .

Aug

Aug

Aug

Aug

162066

AUg

«dg
00162068

19

19

19

7\\19

“ 161981

28/2007

29/2007

3072007

26/2007
161768

Lawyer: EMC 1.50 Hrs X 130.00

To meeting with Mr. & Mrs. DeBliek re:

Individual property issues.

Lawyer: QMR 1,50 Hrs X 130.00:

To meeting with Greg & Lloyd:Hutton

re: Individual property issues.

Lawyer: EMC 1.50 Hrs X 130.00

To meeting with Greg & Lloyd Hutton

re: Individual property issues.

Expenise ‘Recovery: :

Travel: Goderich --Palsley - Goderlch

156,24 @ $0.40 ;

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To correspondence to Peter Fallis

sending University of Toronto journal

article pertaining to the Bruce to

Milton line.

28/2007 " Lawyer: MLD 0:10 Hrs X.80.00::

162060 . To telephone: call to . Mrs. Sawyer re:
B cancelllng meeting scheduled for '

Thirsday, August 30. : e

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00

To telephone call to Mrs. DeBliek re:

cancelling meeting scheduled for

Thursday, August 30.

28/2007 'Lawyer MLD . 0.10 Hrs.X 80.00:

162062

i ft'f-cancelllng meetlng scheduled for .

26/2007
161968

26/2007
161969

3712007

27/2007
162076

162061

Thursday, August 30 :
Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80 00
To leaving message for Mr. & Mrs.
Mills re: cancelling meeting scheduled
for Thursday, August 30.
Lawyer: MLD ..0.10 Hrs X 80.00
“To leaving message for Mri & Mrs.{”
.Barrett re: cancelllng meetlng :
vscheduled for Thursday, August 30.
Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00
To leaving message for Mr. & Mrs.
Clark re: cancelling meeting scheduled
for Thursday, August 30.
“Lawyer: MLD:5.0.10: Hrs: X 80,00 - :
To léaving: message for: Mr Frltz re:
.cancelling meeting scheduled for o
“Thursday, ‘August.30. . :
Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80 00
To leaving message for Mr. & Mrs. Maus
re: cancelling meeting scheduled for
Thursday, August 30.
Lawyer: MLP:. 0.10 Hrs X-80.00
. To! leav1ng message for Mr. & Mrs.
“Woelfle re: cancelling meeting.

28/2007
162063

28/2007
162064

28/2007
162065

28/2007:

28/2007
162067

2820607

28/2007
162069

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00

To correspondence to Matt Fanyeck

requesting ortho maps for the DeBlieks.

28/2007  Lawyer: MLD '0.10 Hrs X 80.00.

162070g_

" Fanyeck re: ortho. maps for the

“DeBlieks. - ' ;
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To receiving correspondence from Enza
Cancilla of Hydro One regarding
contacting our clients.

‘Lawyer: OMR 0,10 Hrg X.130.00

76 rece1v1ng telephone message. from

162653

| for interim access.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 OO

To returning telephone message and
leaving message for Dave Barrett re:
interim access and allowances of access
onto the widened corridor.

30/2007  Lawyer: QMR- 01207 Hrs X:130,00

162962 »To telephone call to Dave Barrett re:

30/2007
162961

To telephone call to  Greg. Hutton re:

scheduled for Thursday, August 30.

T10. rece1v1ng correspondence Erom Matt Vi

‘Dave Barrett re: attendance at propertyf5“

02944

195.00

195,00

195.00

1 62.50

13.00

8.00 "

800

13.00

13.000

1300

26.00




Work-in-Progress
] To Jul 8/2008
ate Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bail.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal

interim access to property, allowable
access. to the widened corridor, and
steps going forward with regards to
: section 98.(2) damages. : T , : EINE iy
tug 30/2007 Lawyer: QMR 1.00 Hrs X 130. 00 ' 130.00
162964 To review of Pollution Probe's
Submission on the EA Proposed Terms of
Reference.
Aug:30/2007: Lawyer: QMR 3.25 Hrsg X"130:00 : e : - : d 422,50
162965 To preparation of submissions on Hydro ’ e S A =
: One's Efivironmental Assessment Draft
Sh  Terms of Reference) i R Y e S o :
Aug 30/2007 Lawyer: QMR (.10 Hrs X 130 00 ' 13.00
162966 To telephone call to Jack Clark re:
Hydro's attendance at his property.
aUg 30/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X :130.00: 7 U s T R s e T 1 300
163489 To correspondence " from Basil Alexander == oo T
: attachlng Pollutlon Probe's subm1351ons
Lt MOBL . v e , L , :
ug 30/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
170094 To receiving ortho maps for the
DeBliek property.
ug:-31/2007 7 Lawyer: HOR L 0:10 Hrs X 210500 000w o i L S e B e 9100
162634 To receiving correspondence from Gail. el D L
Fer Brearley énclosing: photo-based: maps for
e . the entire Bruce-Milton Line. = in. S oy R O NS
ag 31/2007 Lawyer MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00 8.00
162635 To telephone call to Mike DeBliek
regarding contact with Matt Fanyeck.
Aug 31720077 Lawyer: MLD 0. 10 HFS X.80,000 1w il an o N L Cgl00
162636 To receiving. telephone message fromi .o ioh Lol i e n e o e ’
w i Greg-Hutton regardlng contact from Gy
e Hydro One, oo : i n e S RNt :
Aug 31/2007 Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00 8.00
162637 To telephone call to Greg Hutton
regarding contact with Matt Fanyeck.
1g731/2007 Lawyer: QMR 010 Hrg X 130000 70 ook N R kL
162654 To corresporidence’. via email to: Mg e )
e . Walli enclosing: cost subm1551ons SO o G Ry L B N
ig 31/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
163560 To correspondence to other intervenors
attaching the Ross Firm Group MOE

submissions.
19 *31/2007 . Expense Recovery i SR e 0083 S g8
163565  Photocopies @ $0.20  -44 S ) : [ e :
sep 4/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 00 13.00

163483 To correspondence from Peter Fallis
attaching cost submissions and letter
to Ministry of Environment.

2P 47/2007 . Lawyer: OMR 0,10 Hrs X 130.00:
£1 163484 To correspondence from Peter Fallls
. attaching submissions to the Mlnlstry
JeEiE of Erivironment: : L S S
)p  5/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 130 OO 13.00

162993 To receiving correspondence from Dave
Barrett re: access to Barrett Farm and
next group meeting.

572007 “iLawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrg X 130,00
. 162994 'To correspondence to Dave Barrett re:
Lot accpds to Barrett Farm and upcomlng

1300000

S meeting:. & e e e e R S
)p 6/2007 Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80 00 8.
163485 To telephone call to Patricia Woelfle
re: letters from Hydro One.
p "6/2007 Lawyer: MLD' 1.00 Hrs X 80.00 -
163488 To preparing ‘and photocopylng :
it ;documents for client package 1nclud1ng
. the reporting letter,  MOE.siibmissions
.‘by. the Ross Firm, by'Fallls,.Fallls and
ey Machllan,,and by Pollution Probe. _' T e T Tk
P 6/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
166819 To placing telephone call to Matt
Fanyeck regarding access to the widened
| corridor; o | -
P8 /2007  Lawyer:iQMR: 0010 Hre X 130,00 e E R e Sl s 300 e




Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008

Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time
Explanation

Che/Inv Retainer

Disbursement Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal,
Current Trust Bal

Sep

Sep

Sep

~€p

Sep

163548
S0 pooking individual elisnt’ meeting and
séi o italking about access to her property.
7/2007

Sep

166820

6/2007

166821

7/2007

163490
~updating on Hydro-Oné's contact and
“requesting direction.

772007
163491

712607
‘163541

7/2007

163547

72007

163556

7/2007

163557

7/2007
163558

742007

. 163559

e )

To leaving-telephone, message with Rob
Thompson regarding -access to-widened
corridor and understanding-of use of

“existing easementifor access;

Lawyer: QMR 1.00 Hrs X 130.00

To preparing letter for clients with
regards to current land access issues
and Section 98 of the OEB Act analysis;
Lawyer: OMR-.-0.10 Hrs X 130,00

To' correspondence . from: Dave Barrett

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00
To correspondence to Dave Barrett re:
contact with Hydro One.

~Expense’ Recovery
" Photocopies @ $0.200 = 540 for coples

of reporting letter; Rods’ Firm

“Submissions to MOE, Fallis, Fallis &
‘McMillan Submissions to MOE, and:
-Pollution Probe:submissions to MOEy

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00

To telephone call to Sandra Sawyer
booking appointment for farm kitchen
meeting on September 20.

Lawyer: MLD- 0,10 Hrs X 80.00

TO telephone call to" Betty Millsh

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To correspondence from Rob Thomson
regarding voice mail left by QMR
Lawyer: OMR..-0.10-Hrs X '130.00

“To correspondence from Rob Thomson
“‘regarding adcess to land by surveyors

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To correspondence to Rob Thomson
regarding position on access and
compensation.

Lawyer: MLD -1.00:Hts X 80,00

“To preparlng and photocopying : o
- documénts for d¢lient: package 1nclud1ng :

"‘the reporting letter, MOE . submissions

7/2007
163563

-7/2007
163929

MacMillan, ‘and by Pollution Probe.
Expense Recovery

Postage

Lawyer: 'QVR. 0,30 -Hrs X 130,00 -
To telephone. conversatlon w1th Betty:

L MIlle owith regards torthe appralsers

163930

L 712007
163938

7/2007
164448

L TA2007
® leaus

7/2007

164450

. 9/2007.
164467
Wi of Tesues Conference:

9/2007

164472

: "enterlng on:her property as well: as
oo gection 98 damages: :
7/2007

Lawyer: QMR 6.00 Hrs X 130 00

To preparation for issues day,
including to review of pre-filed
evidence, and filing requirements for
electricity transmission projects under
section 92 of the OEB Act.

Expense Recovery

| Photocopies @ $0720 ©-127

Purolator Courier Ltd.
BOL320394976882 - OEB, K. Walli - Aug
31

Purolator ‘Courier Ltd.

Purolator Courler Ltd

B0OL320394988630 - Osler Hoskin &
Harcourt LLP - Aug 31

Lawyer QMR - 1,75 Hrs ‘X 130,00
To.review of materials 1n antlclpatlon

Expense Recovery
Travel from Goderich to Issues
Conference in Toronto (222km x .40/km)

029787

by the Ross Firm, by Fallis; Fallis and (i

02982

b2983

03005

130.00
13.00

13.00

108,00

13.00

13,00

13.00

80,00

22.50

39000

780.00

25,407

13.78

378

16.54

88.80

22750




.te

Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008

]

Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time
Explanation

Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

Fee/Tima

“p

Sep

éop

Sep

Sep

wep

21642310

Sep

sep

Sep

Sep.

rn
()

1072007
164229

10/2007

164468
10/2007
164469

11/2007
164470
11/2007

164471

11/2007
164473

1272007

1164001

12/2007
164002

12/2007.
| 164003

12/2007
164478

12/2007;
164485

1372007
164230
13/2007

13/2007
164493

14/2007.

164411 ,

ey ;:{'grantlng ledve to construct: prlor to EA

i approval.

’ preparatlon of arguments on contested~

cobeo i issdes ddsty :
15/2007

164519

0 15/2007.
164520

164521

(1572007

164662
o0 O BLG re; EMFs:

16/2007

165185

.16/2007
170085

16/2007
170090

“Photocopies @80, 20 -60

Lawyer: "MLD 0.50 ‘Hrs X 80.00

=To typing up Individual-Client

Property Forms with information:

‘gathered:

Lawyer: QMR 9.00 Hrs X 130.00

To attending at Issues Conference;
Lawyer: QMR 1,50 Hrs X 130.00.

To: review. of Black Line draft issues

Alistys

Lawyer: QMR 2. OO Hrs X 130.00
To attending at Issues Conference;

Lawyer: QMR - 1.00 Hrs X 130.00

To review of materials after

completion of ‘Issueg Conference;

Expense Recovery
Travel from Issues Conference in
Toronto to Goderich (222km x .40/km)

-Lawyer: QMR .'0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To- correspondence from Nabih Mlkhall
re: bodrd. staff making subm1591ons w1th

vregard to:the Issues List.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To correspondence from Frank J.
Sperduti re: board staff submissions
only to contested issues.

Lawyer: QMR.::0.10 Hrg X 130.00.:

To - eorrespondence. from Kristi Seba13

03005 88.80

conflrmlng that.board staff submlss1on ;ﬂtws

ware only on contested igsues.

Lawyer: QMR 0.20 Hrs X 130. 00

To review of final issues list both
contested and non-contested;

Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 130.00

To reviewing and rev191ng client. .
property 1nformatlon,forms,

Lawyer: MLD 0.20 Hrs X 80.00

To photocopying transfers, mortgages
and other client information for the
Maus properties.

Expengse Recovery..

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130. OO

To receiving correspondence from Basil
Alexander re: additional Pollution
Probe intervenors.

Lawyer: QMR 3,00 Hre X 130.00

To review of case law regardlng

T commencing initial’

Lawyer: QMR 4. OO Hrs X 130 00
To preparaticn of
arguments/submissions for Issues
Conference;

“Lawyer: OMR 0,20 Hrs X 130.00 <
TG telephone conversation with Frank o
. Sperduti of BLG with regards.to’ .
£ arguments,for,Issues,Conference,.nl
15/2007

Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 130.00

To telephone conversation with P.
Fallis re Appeal and OEB Issues
Conference;

Lawyer OMR 0100 Hrs X.130500 .

T0 correspondence to Frank Sperdutl at

Lawyer: QMR 0.60 Hrs X 130 00

To telephone conversation with P.
Fallis re: Issues day submissions. To
ensuring no overlap of submissions take
place.

QEXpensenRecovery
~Papaya:: Meal

Expense Recovery
Co-op Cabs : Taxi Fare

03001 ¢

03120

03120

L 131000

65,00

: ;-26;90;

2059

15.10

40,00

1170.00

- 195.00

260.00

130360

T13.00

10

" 26.00

16.00

13.00

396.00

1520.00

65.00

,v13m09 e e

.78;00, e S




Work-in-Progress
To

ate

Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv

Explanation

Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

“ap

Sep

1772007
165184

17/2007

170089
18/2007

165186

P

Sep.

Sep

18/2007
165187

1872007
165230,
.y Ls Michael Engelberg re: appralsal on:
: . Barrett!s property. : :
18/2007

165533

“19/2007

1165231

20/2007
165973

2172007
165495

21/2007
165496

2172007

165530

Sep

125/2007
165939

21/2007

165531

2172007

165532

165534

' To receiving correspondence from Susan
. Frank-of Hydro, one- regardlng commentsvi.
- on: cost: award claims’ S

~iBarrett regardlng w1nd farm
FL compensation.
24/2007

Lawyer: QMR .7,50.Hrs X:130.00
To ‘attending at Issues Day To maklng
submissions. T¢ reviewing EMF

‘materials over lunch. To continuing

attendance at Tssues Day.

Expense Recovery 03120
Co-op Cabs: Taxi Fare

Lawyer: QMR .3.50 Hrs-X 130:00

To review of EMF matériali To: i

regearch on Provindial Land Use POlle

re: ,Transm1531on linesg.: To research on
exigting Iine capability and geperation: '

©capacity out of Bruce area.

Lawyer: QMR 3.60 Hrs X 130.00

To review of Auditor General's Review
of Bruce Project. To review of Summary
of Discounted Cash Flow Calculations.
To telephone conversation with P.
Fallis re: need for project. To review
of Reasons in 1974 line construction.
To review of initial IPSP. To
preparation of letter to B. Chant.
Lawyer: OMR. .0.10 Hrs"X 130,00

To receiving: correspondence ‘from:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 OO

To receiving correspondence from P.
Fallis copying his correspondence to
Robert Chant regarding the proposed 500
KV transmission line.

Lawyer: QMR .0.10 Hrs X.130.00

To receiving correspondence from

“Michael Engelberg re: compensatlon for
actession cllents property for

appraisals.

Lawyer: EMC 4.00 Hrs X 130 OO

To meeting with clients re: case,
discussing next steps; to reporting to
clients on recent events; to providing
clients information regarding
reimbursement to be forthcoming; to
speaking with clients individually in
group setting; to meeting with the
Mills and discussing matters; to
reviewing property w1th Mllls

Quinn M. Rosgs i g : 4690, ';k:»f ook e
© Cab Fare: R e

Quinn M. Ross o o e >4690
Meals
Lawyer QMR 0,10 Hrs X 130200

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 OO

To correspondence to OEB submitting

reply cost submissions.

Lawyer: "OMR. 0410 Hrs X.130.00: AR ) N
To receiving correspondence from D. Lo

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00
To receiving correspondence from Greg
and Lloyd Hutton regarding the $2500

prepayment. ;
" Lawyer: MLD (0,10 Hrs X 80.00.

o] rece1v1ng message from Dav1da

’]'Wbelfle regardlng 1etter from Hydro One
L ore: 142500 prepayment and names on tltle
' to their property. G

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80. OO

To telephone call to Pat Woelfle
regarding letter from Hydro One re:
$2500 prepayment and re: title to their
property.

©975.00

15.10

455,00 -

468.00

1300000

13.00

213,00

520.00

40,57

"79.92

13.00

134005

12.00

5.00
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Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement

Explanation

Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

“ep

.ep

ep

ep

ep

ep

Sep

sep

1166270

2572007
174560
26/2007
165997

2672007
166029

26/2007
166030

2672007

166071 -

26/2007
166072

26/2007:
166284

26/2007
166289

26/2007
166290

27/2007
166183
27/2007

127/2007

166271

27/2007°

166272

27/2007
166273

$27/2007

166274

166275

2772007
166332

'27/2007'

166668

2772007

166669

Rep

2772007

166670

e‘Hydro One re: ev1dence blnders for
clients. e

“To dorrespondence with Mr.. Barnett

27/2007

'Lawyer QMR 0,10 Hrs X 130,00
To correspondence from Dave Barrett

Goderich Print:Shop

Copy of Documentation:- DeBliek
Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To correspondence from Natasha
Sockmangal re: Leave to Construct -
Issues Day - Decision and Order .
Lawyer: QMR- 0:10-Hrs X.130,00

To receiving correspondence from

2621

;. 8andra Sawyer Te: new member for OEB

litigation group.

Lawyer: QMR 0.20 Hrs X 130 OO

To preparing email to Dr. Tarlochan at
UWO, to adding Application and brief
summary of same.

Lawyer:iMLD - 0.10 Hrs X 80.00
To:'correspondence ko Ms. Walli te:
additionali Rogs Firm cllent and request
for intervenor status.. :
Lawyer MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80 00

To correspondence to Matt Fanyeck re:
additional Ross Firm client and request
for aerial maps.

‘Lawyer:: QMR .1.00 Hrs X '130.00.
~To ‘'review of: Issues Conference: order
-~ and final igsues listy :

Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 130.00
To review of the transcripts of Issues
Conference;

. Lawyer: QMR 0:20 Hrs X 130.00.
“To leaving telephone message. w1th the:
- Chair. of the electrical engineering

faculty of UWO's clerk requesting

consultation on technical aspectsiof -
- Hydro One's pre-filéed evidence; /-

12.70

Quinn M. Ross ) 4716
Relmbursement OEB Aug 27/07 - Meal

‘Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 130.00
~To correspondence to Ms. Walli re:

extension for filing questlons for the
technical conference. . .

Lawyer MLD ©0.10 Hrs X 80.00

To correspondence from Glen MacDonald

of Hydro One re: evidence binder for

the Hodgkinsons.

Lawyer: MLD::0:10 Hrs: X 8000 : : .
To telephone call ‘to Glen ‘MacDonald of S

Lawyer: QMR 0. lO Hrs X 130 00

To telephone call to Glen MacDonald of
Hydro One re: evidence binders for
clients.

Lawyer:; OMR™ 0:10 Hrs X 130.00°

regarding technical consultatlon on.

“Hydro-One. Transmxss;on Lines:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130, OO

To correspondence with Carman and
Evelyn Hodgkinson regarding retaining
our firm and information regarding the
status of the OEB applications.

Te: appraisers; :
Lawyer OMR 0. 50 Hrs X 130 OO

To telephone conversation with Peter
Fallis re: questions for technical
conference, technical consultation,
wind generation power to grid

Lawyer: QMR ©0.20 Hrs X 130.00°
“To telephone conversatlon with Bob
Barnett of‘Byrne‘EnglneerFConeult;ng o

Lawyer: QMR 0.20 Hrs X 130.00
To drafting email to B. Barnett re:
scope of opinion and assistance

13.

13

26.

7130

65.

2.

13

13

13

00

00
00

.qo":
00

L0000

00

00, -

00
00
00

.00

.00

65

26

.00

00




Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008

Current A/R Bal.

ate Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal
required.
ep 2872007 Lawyer: QMR : 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13,00
166335 To correspondence from Basil Alexandet
w0 res Pollution Probe’s further
submigsions on the propesed termg:of
reference for the envmronmental
: agsessment. S
Oct 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 130.00 65.00
166858 To preparation of reporting letter to
all clients.
ot "1/2007: Expense Recovery : 03053 RO T 12060
11166865/ Photocopies @ $0.,20 63 G e
Oct 1/2007 Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 80.00 8.00
166869 To receiving orthomap from Matt
Fanyeck for the Hodgkinson property.
Cts 1/2007 - Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130400 2135007
166870 " To receiving correspondence from Glen' :
: MacDonald en¢ldéging the paper copy of
Cwlel - HONI's Application and Evidence. S
st 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
166871 To correspondence to Mr. Barnett
requesting reply re: Hydro-One Opinion
Request.
oti “1/2007 - Lawyer: OMR - 0.10 Hrg X.130500: G130 00
~+166872--To recelving correspondence: from: o B
‘ .-:Joanna Rosengarten rey: Bruce Power:
question to!HONI in’ advance of
0 uootechnical conference: SO
uct  1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 00 13.00
166873 To receiving correspondence from
Natasha Sookmangal re: OEB's answer to
request for extension on the deadline
to submit questions for the technical
conference.
~at 1/2007» Lawyer OMR.:70.10- Hrs X 130100 513,00
. 166874 To receiving gorrespondenice, from. Ba511'= Pos
: .. "Alexarder attachlng Pollution: Probe! 8
Cwritten questions in advance of the
g : technical conference. = g o
st 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130. OO 13.00
166876 To receiving correspondence from Basil
Alexander attaching Part 2 of Pollution
Probe's written questions in advance of
technical conference,
st 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs: X:130.00" 13,00
166881 .To: correspondence from Peter Fallis™ e
LU red Yechnital ‘questions posed.to HONT.: L
st 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
166882 To correspondence from BLG re:
Powerline Connections written questions
to HONI regarding the Technical
Conference.
£ 1/2007  Expense Recovery o 03054 v e el DLe0
166883 Photocopies @ $0.207 ~13 % e g s
Oct 1/2007 Expense Recovery 03054 5.80
166884 Photocopies @ $0.20 -29
't 1/2007 ’Lawyer OMR: 0,50 Hrs X .130. 00 can 6500000
167051 To review of pollution probes: .. D
. i questions for technical conferencé; . R
Oct 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 130.00 52.00
167054 To review of part 2 of pollution
probes questions for technical
conference;
Oct  1/2007 Lawyer: QMR ' 0:40 Hrs X 130.00 - 52500
. 167056 ' To review of powerline connectlons
o viritten, questlons for technlcal
G conferenceit e o)
Oct 1/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 130.00 65.00
169023 To review of questions for technical
conference prepared by Peter Fallls
JE 242007 Expense’ Recovery ; ’ 03086 .90
166887 ‘Postage f ; j.{[: | P o S
Oct  2/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
166999 To receiving correspondence from M.

Engelberg re: HONI agents contacts with




]

Work-in-
To Jul
ate Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal
our clients.
ot 272007 Lawyer: QMR.0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
~21167000 - To correspondence to M. Engelberg re:
- . position of HONI regarding interim
access compensation and contact between
... "+ 'HONI agents and our clients. o
ct 3/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
167099 To receiving correspondence from M.
Engelberg regarding HONI's position on
interim access contact with clients,
and interim access agreements.
Oct 2372007 Lawyer: QMR- 0410+Hrs X 130.00 . - 13.000 ¢
- 167537 To correspondence to M. Engelberg . : :
- regarding ‘interim access and.
Lo compensation, e :
oct  4/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.20 Hrs X 130.00 26.00
167333 To telephone conversation with Larry
Galajda of Stantech Engineers with
regards to opinion for technical
conference and referral to John
Sinclair, Engineer in Cambridge,
Ontario;
ct - 75/2007 Lawyer: QMR ©0:10 Hre X 130.00: 13,00
167313 :.To receiving correspondence from BLG - E
Srihréncloging the Submissions: of Powerline
: conbiedeConnections ires Terms of Reference - e T
ct 5/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
167538 To receiving correspondence from M,
Engelberg regarding interim access
activities and contact with landowners.
ot :5/2007 - Lawyer: QMR (.75 Hrs X 130.00 A 97.50
© 1167860 To reviewing BLG subm1851ons on Hydro : o
S0 i Orie BA- terms.of veference; Gl
Oct 5/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 130.00 52.00
167862 (QR - date not dictated?) To review of
further submissions on EA terms of
reference from pocllution probe;
Oct: 572007 . Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrg X 130.00 " 13100
-~ 169022 To receiving correspondence from Basil
U0 Alexander res Pollution Probe’s further .
: ,'~Isubm1SS1ons on alternate routes., e R
Oct 9/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
167536 To correspondence to Mr. Sinclair
requesting opinion for Hydro One
Technical Conference.
uct 11/2007. Lawyert QMR 210 Hrs X 130.00 273,00
167866 To preparation for Technlcal e
= Conference; ; et
ot 11/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
167873 (QR - date not dictated?) To telephone
conversation with M. Miller, returning
his call;
3£ 11/2007 7 Lawyer: OMR = 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 . 713200
167874 (QR- date not dictated?)i .To e
SOl receliving telephone messdge re
St attendance at Technical Conference; o
ot 11/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
168337 To correspondence from Natasha
Sookmangal attaching OEB letter to
Hydro One re: updatlng ev1dence
2t 13/2007  Expense.Recovery.. . o L031200 25459
201260 Hy's Toronto: Meal - QMR - Cheque 4825 o e
uct 14/2007 Lawyer: QMR 3.00 Hrs X 130 00 390.00
169021 To preparation for Technical
Conference.
3t 15/2007  Lawyers QMR 0,10 Hrs X/ 130000 ' .
168350 To receiving fax from P Fallls re“f
.. technical conference. - G
"ot 15/2007  Lawyer: QMR 1.00 Hrs X 130 OO 130.00
169019 To review of transcript from day 1 -
Technical Conference.

Oct 1572007 Lawyer OMRU8.00 Hre X 1360000 . 411040.00
. 169020 To'attendance at Technical Conference.: S
:t 16/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00

168336 To correspondence to Kristi Walli re:




Work—in—Progress
To Jul 8/2008

Paid To/Fee/Time
Explanation

Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement

Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

Ont

<t

Oct

168469 ;
St Hodgkinson-attaching prior
.obrrespondence to all clients.:

16/2007
169018
17/2007
168468

17/2007

169017

18/2007

168467
1872007

18/2007
168551

18/2007
168552

168886

22/2007
168887

22/2007
168888

22/2007
© 169014

22/2007
169347

-22/2007
169350

22/2007

173706

22/2007
173709

23/2007

169004

2372007
| 169015

£ 23/2007

169016

2372007
169214

23/2007

]:Mlller re postponlng 1nterrogatory _
:phase.:

request for an adjourmment of the
upcoming interrogatory process and
request for further technical
conference.

Lawyer: QMR - 6.00 Hrs X 130.00

To-attendance at Technical -Conference, :

Expense Recovery
Photocopies @ $0.20
for master file)
Lawyer: QMR- 1.00 Hrs:'X 130.00

To: review of transcript: from day 2.~
Technical Conference:

Expense Recovery

Photocopies @ $0.20 -135

-93 {transcripts

-Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 Hrs X;130.00

To cotrespondence to Mr. and Mrs:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00
To receiving correspondence from Frank
Sperdutti re: request to OEB for

adjournment of written interrogatories.

Lawyer: MLD °1.00 Hrs X 80.00°":
To preparing document” package for Mr

<& Mrs; Hodgkinson: updating them om all
i previous correspondence sent to group :

L menbers.)

22/2007

Lawyer: QMR 0. lO Hrs X 130.00

To receiving correspondence from
Natasha Sockmangal re: October 16
letter.

Lawyer: QMR- 0,10 Hrs: X 130.00
To, dorrespondence. to: Natasha

‘Sookmangal attachlng October 16th
“letter. .

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00

To correspondence to Mr. MacIntosh
attaching Oct. 16th correspondence to
OEB.

Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 130,00

7O Feceiving correspondence from Basil
~Alexander attaching Pollutlon Probe’s
- Request to Postpone Interrogatorles;

Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 130.00

To telephone call with P. Fallis re:
outcome of technical conference and
Camp Creek Appeal of Interim Access
Order.

Lawyer: QMR 0,20 Hrg X 130,00

To: telephone call with P, Fallls rers S
affidavit in support of motlon to stay';'ﬁ L
. interim order. ~ £

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 OO

To correspondence from D. MacIntosh
re: letter from Energy Probe Research
Foundation to OEB.

Lawyer: QMR 0,10  Hrs X:.130.00

To correspondence from:D. MacIntosh

. re: missing correspondence and rulesi:. ...
for filing information and e
»correspondence .

Expense Recovery
Photocopies @ $0.20
Lawyer: OMR 0,10 Hrs X-130.00

To rece1v1ng correSpondence from'Peterf

Lawyer: QMR 0 10 Hrs X 130 OO

To correspondence to Mr. Sinclair re:
requesting technical opinion.

Lawyer: QMR .-0375 Hrs X 130,00

To drafting detailed reporting 1etter o
Jon technical conference. :

Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 130. OO

03090 o " 18.60

03090 27.00

03108 o 480

© 780.00

130400

113,00

13.00

$080500

13.00

SU13.00

13.00

13,00

52.00

26,0000

1300

L3

Aidzeg

13.00

97,50

52.00




Work-in-Progress
) To Jul 8/2008
Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal

w
oty
]

169353 To review of Pollution Probe's
submission's re: adjournment of IR
process as a result of refusal to
answer at technical conference.
Gt 23/2007. Lawyer: QMR 0.20 ‘Hrs X 130.00 . : : : e : 26300 -
169373 To review of letter of P. Fallis in: : ' ' (R L :
" supportiof request for adjournment of

e - IR process. i B : T B At
Cct 23/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 ' 13.00
171981 To correspondence from G. Nettleton
re: letter to OEB regarding application
amendments.
Oct 24/2007 Lawyer: OMR.-0.10 Hrs X.130.00: % . SR S g T 13000

169187 To correspondence . from Carman & Evelyn
’ "Hodgklnson attaching property S
©information: forms T SR T AT DI
24/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130. OO 13.00
169217 To correspondence to Ms. Heinz et al.
attaching correspondence sent to OEB on
October 16.
Got - 24/2007: Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 00
169218 - To correspondence from. John Rattray of :
L Y IES0 attaching letter to OEB re‘, : o
i vechrical conference,: raeg i e e D N e S
Oct 24/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 00 13.00
169221 To correspondence from Natasha
Soockmangal attaching Board Letter re:
postponement of interrogatory phase.
vet’ 24/2007 - Lawyer: :QMR -70.10: Hrs X, 130000 v 0 00 Dl Sl s L1300
42169222 - To correspondence . from Chris Pappas L I » e
.l responding. toMr. Stevensom, i ; e E Gl e
t 24/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
169225 To correspondence to intervenors
attaching Ross Firm Group's October 16
correspondence to the OEB. ] )
£°24/2007° Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130:00 . I T N 1300
169226 To correspondence to Mr. Stephemson oo ST e
S requesting correspondence sent toMry

Q
[N
JEOER

13,00 7

S Pappas. : : S i IR P A R S
t 24/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
169229 To correspondence from Cisca McInnis
of the Ministry of Energy requesting to
be copied on correspondence.
24/2007" Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00.
169230 To. correspondence to Cisca McImnis:
e attachlng Qctober 16 correspondence_k S ERE R e e A s e N
Cct 24/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.20 Hrs X 130.00 26.00
169377 To review of IESO correspondence re:
request for postponed interrogatories.
(T 24/2007  Lawyér: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130,00 /00 i miin i s s 3 0
169421 To correspondence from Mr. Pappas o e STl
g attaching correspondence sent. by Mr
e Stephenson on’ October 23,2007 LI e BOR e R
¢t 24/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
169424 To correspondence to Richard
Stephenson requesting to be included in
future correspondence with regards to
EB-2007-0050.
Oct?24/2007 Lawyer: OMR  0.10 Hrs X 130.00 :
169425 1 T0 correspondence from Hydro One re
: rf'tcorrespondence recelved from Mr. .

13500

ot

1300

o Fallis. o R R
Gut 29/2007 Expense Recovery 03121 88.80
170130 Travel Goderich to Toronto: 222km @
$0.40

{ 3030/2007  Expense Regovery: 0 ioi ol iabion i agrogin s o BB B0

© 1170131 Travel To Goderich trom Toronto' 222km Lnia i
ST e @ S0 A0 e S sl R i : &
Ort 31/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 00 13.00

170160 To correspondence from E. Sinclair re:
consulting work. ;
Oct 31/2007  bawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00" e Sl e e 3000
©.: 170161 To correspondence to E. slnclalr TeLo o s
Lo referrals for consultingl Sl TE S et i
. 31/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130. OO 13.00

o>




Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008 _
ate Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry#f Explanation Current Trust Bal

170162 To correspondence from E. Sinclair re:
referrals for consulting.

ot 31/2007 - Expense Recovery : L 03128 S s S 6liel
170546 Photocopies @ $0.20.-308 : e R L . : EE S
Nct 31/2007 Lawyer: QMR 1.00 Hrs X 130.00 130.00

171756 To preparing and sending detailed
reporting letter to clients (.1 x 10
letters) re: reporting on Technical
conference and order obtained on
Oct.30th.
ov.-1/2007~ Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 Hrs X 1303 00 ' ; TN e : S013,00 B
171983 . To.correspondence’ to intervenors re: % L TR S S :
: oo order:stayed: pending .appeal: L e S G g :
ov 5/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
170926 To correspondence from C. A. Pappas
re: series compensation.
Nov - 5/2007 - Lawyer: QMR - 0.10 Hrs X 130000 - = - Bl e L e e L e L1 3
- 1170927 ' To correspondence from G. MacDonald ol e G
Lo attaching letter’ filed with OEB re:
“‘technical conference transcrlpt :
CLENE TR orrections . ' BRI S SR S S i R R
Nov 5/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
170928 To correspondence from C. A. Pappas
re: history of series compensation and
Charles Concordia.

Nov; 9/2007  ‘Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs. X:130.00 I e e e e R 0000 T
...201345 -To ‘correspondence - from C. Pappas re: G Lt s LR B L A e
St article ins Owen: Sound Sun: Times," LR . : o i o

nov  9/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00

201347 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
correction re OMERS.
ovi-:8/2007 -Lawyer: QMR- 0,10 Hrs X-130500 R e & s sl e 1000
201354 To corréspondence . from-C. Pappas Te e T T e T S
P - Transcript excerpt regarding Darllngton' o
Sl “i-and-Pickering.vs: Bruce buildsy e i ST : e
v 9/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130. OO 13.00
201355 To correspondence from E. Cancilla re:
notice of public information centre and
resident letter.

v 11/2007 “Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X'130,00 - 7 00 1300
201357 To reviewing: flle and brlnglng flle L T T s
s oo forwarde : g e S S e R 5
Nov 12/2007 Lawyer: QMR O 10 Hrs X l30 00 13.00

201356 To drafting reporting letter to
clients re: status of Camp Creek
Appeal .

Nov. 14/2007 . Expense Recovery. el ‘ 03160+
171758 Postage =10 v e pae e e e i EiET e
v 14/2007 Expense Recovery 03160 16.00

171759 Photocopies @ $0.20 - 80 S ) )
Nov 14/2007: Lawyer: QMR':/0.10 Hrs X 130.00 T L B Bl
1:.2013441 To! correspondence from €, Pappag.rer o ool el e e
’5'-;.,, article’ about Briice: Power enterlng next,.e S
S phase of \long-term gite planning.: SR 2 L : Sl
Nov 14/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130.00 13.00
201346 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
article in Technically Speaking
W 14/2007'~Lawyer QMR :0.10 Hrs X:130,00.
201348 . To correspondence Afrom. g; Pappas re:h
“ s Notice of Commencement of Constructlonr:
e e Lv- Of New Nukes : .Z & s TR Bt T s . S
v 14/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 130 00 13.00
201351 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
Physics Today, February 2006.
“ov 1472007 Lawyer: OMR. 1,00 Hrs X 130,00
", 201359 . To preparing ‘and sending detalled
G reportlng letter to cllents ( 1x 10
Yoy 16/2007 Lawyer QMR O 10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192324 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
access to studies and reports from OPA
and IESO.
Nov 1642007 Lawyer: QMR :0.10 Hrs X.170.00
201311 To correspondence from B. Alexander;
" Tequesting being added to contact llst

011,00

L1300

- 130.00

,17500.
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: for intervenors, v , ; e
ov 18/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

192325 To reviewing file and bringing file
forward.
Moy 21/2007 -Lawyer: QMR -0.10 Hre X 170000+ v o : L 17.00

192132 To correspondence - from.C.. Pappas re:
v' "A-Submission to the Ontarlo Power
Authority (OPA}..." by F.R. Greening,
. S PRD r S L e : SoE
ov 22/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192133 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
request for OPA to enter into
Application as Intervenor.
ov . 26/2007 - Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 -Hrs X 170.00  wi : e = FENE : . 17.:00
..192134 To correspondence  from-G. MacDonald : o SR, e SRR
i re: letter to Mr. C, Pappas. (e T . L T
Nov 28/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192135 To correspondence from B. McCormick
re: Environmental Assessment Proposed
Terms of Reference.

Nov.28/2007 Lawyer: :MLD ‘0010 Hrs X 100,000 "7 1 il iin i i s ' o 10.00
L 9201235 T correspondence from J. Wlechel re: T aeR e
v 30/2007 Lawyer QMR 0 10 HIS X 170 OO 17.00

192136 To correspondence from G. Macdonald
re: updated exhibit A-1-1. »
)v330/2007“;Lawyer MLD: 0,10 Hes X.T000007 00 0 i s D SR R10700
201213*1To telephone ‘call with E;Brill of SEA ;3; s SRR A SR i o T
Timited re: transmission line . S
consultatlon and scheduling’ of
E - telephone meeting with QMR: : i TR PR T R
sc 2/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
192137 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
- OEB application timeline.
~ag 3/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 S S SR e T
192138 To correspondenice  from D. MacIntosh e s e
L re: ¢orrespondence from Mri Pappas. : i NI R T AR
Dec 4/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 68.00
192139 To telephone conversation with Ed
Brill re consulting work on technical
end of file;
Dec  4/2007 Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 Hrs X'170.00 7 e D i e g 0]
-/ 192140°: To correspondence from D. Barrett ré e s Y A
-Hanover doctor leaving area if: hydro
L line goes. through his - farm. S ! : : SR Sl L
vec 6/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
192141 To correspondence from J. Fitzsimmons
re: C.V. and Fee Schedule of Ed Brill.
1 6/2007 . Lawyer: OMR - 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 SO AL e e e e g 9 0
©192142...To cotrrespondence from Gi MacDonald : L L IR e e
: “in io-rey updated'section 98 application: ocatai bl B s
mac 10/2007 Expense Recovery 03226 64.00

176444 Travel Goderich-Paisley-Goderich 160
km @ $.40

Dec: 1072007 < Lawyer: QMR :0.10 Hrs X 170.00 .
192143 To correspondence from S, Frank re::
sl upddtied ‘and new: exhibits: LT Sl g
¢ 10/2007 Lawyer: QMR 1.50 Hrs X 170.00 255.00
192144 To meeting with C and E Hodgkinson re:
property issues and status of matter
currently and in the near future.

e 1072007 Lawyer’ QMR 0,40 Hrs X:170:00 +-0
192145  To review of HONI. responses to Pl
e submissions on EACTOR: i Geeihmiinoe el i :
i 11/2007 Lawyer OMR 2.30 Hrs X 170 00 391.00

192147 To review of updated HONI Application
~ material.
Dec 1472007 Lawyer: OMR :0.10 Hrs.X 170.00: :
201308 . To correspondence From OEB ré: letter
- toC. Pappas respondlng to hlB letter
of Nov. 22,08 ;

SR1T00

6800

Dec 17/2007 Expense Recovery 03216 i 0.40
175152 Photocopies @ $0.20

¢17/2007  ‘Experise Recovery el e 32T 20.52.
=.175153 Postage : el E e R Eonilan s o
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~ec 17/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192148 To correspondence to Mr. and Mrs.
Hodgkinson re: meeting of December 10,
2007,
Nec 18/2007 - Expense- Recovery 03222 ¢ S : 0.40
175880 " Fax € .50.20 ° . : R S [ E »
ec 18/2007 Lawyer: QMR (.75 Hrs X 170.00 127.50
192149 To review of further submissions
regarding the moetor of pollution
probe;
2C18/2007 . Lawyer: QMR 0.30 Hrs X 170.00. - SRR RL SO Gl P s ST 08
192150 . To. drafting further:submissions ST Lo E S o
e regarding the'moetor: ‘ , it : S S
ec 18/2007 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192151 To correspondence to C. McLennon re:
further submissions on the EA Terms of
Reference.

"ee-18/2007. Lawyer: QMR - 0V10 Hrs X 170.00. 7 PR e T , Sl CLTL000
192152 To  copying correspondence to ¢} AT S S
o MeLennon tolall Intervenors: and HONI : B L o ; o S

Jan 2/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

192311 To correspondence from D. MacIntosh
re: counsel for Energy Probe Research

Foundation. )

Jan ' 9/2008 . Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170,00 G T , L 17.00
70192153 To reviewing and brlnglng flle e i R P

’ forward. - S S R , 2R : Ef i

an 28/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00

192154 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
IESO Previous Reports Library

2000-2006.
i 31/2008  Lawyer: QMR 1,20 Hrs X 170.00 L G i SRR B 00k 00
1192155 . To review of ‘SIAR Report and commentg: i 0o lol ot il = EG
Jan 31/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

192156 To correspondence from N. Sookmangal
of OEB re: Partial Decision and Cost

Order.
Febh * 5/2008 : Lawyet: QMR 0.10"Hrg X 170.00 . o L B v SR B
192157 | To correspoudence to E Brlll re, i I S N e e
St Consultation. , S Ln B S R Sl e
b 5/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 00 17.00

201317 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: copies of Pollution Probe's
submissions on EA ToR. » ‘ »
b 6/2008" Tawyer: OMR 0.10'Hrs X.170.00 . SR TN e e 217,000
192158 To correspondence from B. Alexander ool mnil s L
e L rei Pollution Probels subm1531ons on
“Revision:2:of: Hiydro Oné's amended
S i proposed: termg of reference. e B i S G
.¢b 6/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 170. 00 85.00
192159 To review of Pollution Probe
submissions re: Revised Amended EA TOR
b 6/2008 Tawyer: QMR iS50 Hrs X 1700000 i
192160 Toldetailed review of Amended Notlce
S Uof Application o E Co e S B L
Feb 7/2008 Lawyer QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192161 To correspondence from N. Sookmangal
re: Leave to Construct Procedural Order

8500

‘ Number 4. ) ]
Feb ! '8/2008 Tawyer: OMR '1.00 Hes X1170.00° 7 10 iinoanmisa il i g g T
192162 To review 6F Procedural Order Now 4o ih 0 il i

b 8/2008 Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

201321 To corregpondence from P. Fallis re:
Procedural Order No. 4. )
“ob 1272008  Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X .170.00 . oo 0 s S ke 17000
192163 'To correspondente to Py Fallls re. x e Pohmamiaaa
P additions to Issues List. oo RSt TR s Al 0
Feb 12/2008 Lawyer: QMR 1.20 Hrs X 170 00 204.00
192164 To drafting suggested additions to
September 26, 2007 issues list.
0:12/2008  Lawyer:: QMR 010 Hrs X: 170500
192165  To corréspondence to E.Brill re'
.U donsultation and retainer. S s s S e i
b 12/2008 Lawyer: MLD 0.20 Hrs X 100.00 20.00
201214 To telephone call to E. Brill at SEA

1700
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Ltd. re: consultation.
:b 13/2008- Lawyery QMR . 0:30 Hrs X 170,00 : E ] : S s BT 00
192166 To prepatring and sending letter to E. S o T R D
sonBrill resconsultation and llnks to
.- relevant websites:. ; : : i :
:b 13/2008 Lawyer: QMR (.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192167 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:

Feb 13/2008 .
192168

Feb 13/2008

192169

reb 13/2008

192170

b 13/2008
201329

'b'14/2008
163180

Feb 14/2008
192171

b 1472008

1921731

Febv14/2008
192174

b 1472008

192175

b 14/2008

192176

b.14/2008
1201215 -

' - Joannie-at SEA Ltd. re: work agreement. : : R e S MR T

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00 10.00

b 14/2008
201216

=~b:14/2008

Se201217

Feb’14/2008
201218

b 14/2008"
- 201219

b 14/2008
201320

b 15/2008

=~b 15/2008

192178

Feb 15/2008

2182179

“advance ‘of téchnical” conference. . [ : i e
Lawyer: QMR 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 51.00

tLawyer MLD 0230 Hrs X-100.:00;

to-beserit to E."Brill.at SEA Ltd.

S Ton rece1v1ng voiceé mail and returnlng j"
. ‘same to.Joannie at.SEA Ltd. re: ,
conference.call w1th.deBrlll.

192177

expert consultation.

Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170,00 = , S . s e Smh 17:00
To cotrespondence from B.:Mac¢Intosh : i e : s iy o
re: Energy Probe Research Foundation

“redquest-to add consultant..

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 S 00
To correspondence to E. Brill re:
Series Capacitors.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 = . - ek

To correspondence from B Alexander

..réi Pollution -Probe's request to -
“ glightly revisit 'the timetable, . : el o ; B
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:

letter to board requesting procedural

orders day.

Expense Recovery e z,ﬂ jt U 03325 Sl e A0

Lawyer: QMR 5.50 Hrs X 170.00 R B ' 935,00

To commencing review of IESO materials
located at
http://www.ieso.ca/imoweb/monthsYears/pr
evious.asp.

‘Lawyer: QMR :0.10 Hrs X 170,00 0 ’.*'f'*',“ o I Bamwai o 17.00:

To:correspondence’  to P Fallls re:

Expert: Consultation: : o St . : : e Tt 2 2
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
To correspondence from C. Pappas re:

articles in Orangeville Citizen.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00. . s S e L e 7000
‘T corresponderice to J. Roeengarten S R O s 3

re: ‘follow up to questlon asked. in

To telephone conversation with E.
Brill re: documents to review as well
as retainer issues.

Lawyer: MLD “0.10 Hrs X 100500° 70 innme e ©010.00

To telephone conversatlons with-

To forwarding copies of written
questions in advance of technical
conference to E.Brill.

To: preparatlon of blnder of documents

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00 10.00
To correspondence from J. Fitzsimmons
re: Retainer Request from SEA Ltd.
Lawyer: -MLD .:0.:10 Hrs X 100,00

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
To correspondence from D. MacIntosh

re: Energy Probe's letter regarding

Issues List.

‘Lawyer:; QMR 0075 -Hrg X 1700000 o iis e i e T 12750
To drafting cover letter and ratiomale ~ . .o o 0 o ShoEl e
. for additions to issues list. S

Lawyer: QMR 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 ' ' B 51.00
To telephone conversation with P.

Fallis re: Merging groups with respect

to retaining expert.

Lawyer: OMR . .0,10 Hrs X 170.00 T R B

To correspondence £o K. Walli

re:Issues List Submlssxons and comments'

Loadiee
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o “on timeline. . ST
‘eb 15/2008 Lawyer: QMR (.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192180 To correspondence from HONI re:
responding to correspondence from
Pollution Probe.
'eb 15/2008. Lawyer:: QMR . 0.10 -Hrs X 170.00 Ll S (NS 17.00
192181 To correspondence ~from BLG re: : . G R
S Powerline Connections submissions on
“noew the'Issues/List and timeline; ’ e : G : :
eb 15/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192182 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
OEB Transmission System Code.
Feb 15/2008- Lawyer: QMR 70.10: Hrs X 1706.00° BT NE Ll e e e 1700
..192183 ' T6' correspondence’: . from. C. Pappas rer L S o " L
Lophibin i Issues: List Submission. a i TS R T e
.eb 15/2008 Lawyer: QMR 3.20 Hrs X 170. OO 544.00
192184 To continued review of IESO reports,
specifically: Ontario Transmission
System, Resource Adequacy Assessment,
Ontario Demand Forecast and 10-Year
Outlook Highlights.
Feb 19/2008 . Expense Recovery .. . .. " '._ AL 03327 Sh ‘ S b 80200
183573:; Photocopies @ $0.20 " sl T R A B i
eb 19/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192185 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's reply to HONI's
submissions on Pollution Probe's
Request to slightly revisit the
timetable.
Feb 1972008 " Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170700 fow v il el o i B0 e e 17000
-192186.. To correspondence to: B. Alexander re: LIS S i s
il ’ expert reports. S £ R s BARRIEE SR S
.2b 19/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192187 To correspondence to XK. Walli re: ten
paper copies of Ross Firm Group
submissions.
3b 1972008 Lawyer: QMR 2,00 Hrs X 1705005 % S o e 340.00. ;
. -192188 To preparing detailed 18 page = L e T e T -
L reporting letter to clients. g . SET e : e Lo
sb 19/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 ’ 17.00
192189 To correspondence from J. Rosengarten
re: question regarding due diligence
study. ) ]
5.19/2008 " Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170,00 i ,'_‘, (R P 0 217400
192190 To' correspondence from:C. Pappae re: : e : o
f Appllcanthv1dence and.Tlmellne : L AN B : R A
Feb 19/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192191 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
supplementary- to submission regarding
evidence and the timeline. - ) )
Feb 19/2008  Lawyer: OMR: 0:10 Hrs X 170,00 n-7 i o v viin oo L G 7,00 e
+192192° To correspondence to P 'Fallls re OPG L e R e
Lo BN yebaite rei Darlington. R
b 19/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192193 To correspondence from OEB re: Issues
Day Hearing.
b-19/2008 Lawyer MLD 0,10 :Hrs-X 100,00
201220 . To correspondence to K. Walli re:
L conflrmlng Ross Firm Group submlsSLOns
Coieiies diosent viacourieri o i ; . i : : T e
b 20/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192194 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: experts and timeline.
Feb 2072008 Lawyer: QMR- 1,50 Hrs X 170:00
2192195 . To preparation for Tssues.Day and.
e discigsion of Timeline establzshed in
© Procedural Order 4.

b,‘2555°0"

Feb 21/2008 Expense Recovery 03342 46.00
184302 Photocopies @ $0.20 -230 for reporting
letter . :

b 2172008 Expense: Recovery

184303 Postage:

Feb 21/2008 Lawyer: QMR 7.00 Hrs'x'17o.oo ' ' ’ B S 1190.00
192196 To attending at Issues Day and
discussion of Timeline established in
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Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement
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Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Ba

Feb

reb

o (
192206

Feb

Peb

2172008

192197

22/2008
185454

22/2008

192198

22/2008
192199

2272008

192200

22/2008
192201

22/2008

192202

22/2008
192203

24/2008

192204

24/2008
192205

2472008

25/2008

192207

125/2008
192211

192212

' 25/2008"
192213

125/2008

192214

25/2008
192215
sl Phyristor Controlled Series Capacitors..
25/2008

192216

26/2008

192217
b 'Pollutlcn Probe, Energy: Probe, Fallls~
r'jGroup, ‘Chris Pappas, Board Staff; :
. CALLDRON GAS BARS LTD. To review of
" procedural Order No. 5. To review of -
S regponse: from HONI ito Interrogatorles;f‘
26/2008

182218

' 26/2008
192219

'26/2008

192220

+To correspondence “from"C. Pappas re:
L emall toMr. Nettleton dated November
165200700

_To'correspondence from P Fallis re: -
Fallis Group Interrogatories,

Procedural Order 4.

Lawyet: QMR 0.10 -Hrs X 170.00

To .correspondence . from Richard R.
Basom of SEA Ltd: re: retainer: request.

Purolator Courier Ltd. ' 13.05

BOL329010526559 - OEB - Feb 19
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 )
To . ¢correspondence from C. Pappas re:
Requests for documents: from HONI.
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence to Mr. and Ms.
DeBliek returning documents.

Lawyer: QMR -0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence . to Mr. and Ms: Mllls"
‘returning documents. :

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. OO

To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's Interrogatories
Part 1.

Lawyet: QMR. .0.10 Hrs 'X.170.00

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO

To correspondence from B. Ware re:
Calldron Gas Bars Ltd, Black Creek Golf
Course and proposed Halton Hills
switchover.

Tawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence . from C.. Pappas re:

His Written Interrogatories. Part 1.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
His Written Interrogatories Part 2.
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170600

To correspondence from P *Fallis re:

“draft intervenor counsel letter.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
resend of Written Interrogatories.
Lawyer:: OMR 0,10 Hrs X 17000 :
To correspondence from Ci Pappas resii

revisionsito Parts 1l and 2 of-hisg
Py - Interrogatories,
25/2008

Lawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170 00

To correspondence from OEB re: Board
Sstaff Interrogatories.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X, 170.00

To' correspondence from OEB re:
Procedural Qrder -No. 5; :
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
MOE inquires and EA review process.
Lawyer: QMR:.0.10 Hfs:X 170.00

To correspondence. from:C. Pappas re:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
Transmission System Code.

Lawyer: QMR- 4:00 Hrs X 170.00.

To review of interrogatories of:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from D. MacIntosh
re: Energy Probe Research Foundation
Interrogatories.

Liawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170500

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00
To correspondence from A. Monem re:

17.00

17,00

17.00

100

17.00

17.00.

"17.00

17500

"17.00

017:000

17.00

17000

17.00

17.00

1700+
"17.00"

680,00

17.00

v.yl ‘17'001 o

17.00
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Saugeen Ojibway Nations'
Interrogatories.
ek 26/2008  Lawyer: QMR ~-0.10 Hrs X 170.00 - . : T o 17,000
192221 .To correspondence " from G. Nettleton E S L
: re: Interrogatories; HONI: canrot  respond
to. IO : 3 :
eb 26/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 - ' 17.00
192222 To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
Letter to Intervenor Counsel and Memo
re: EA Review Process.

eb 27/2008: Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 = [0 U o SR S 170000
192223 T¢ corregpondence ~to E. Brill re: ’ e Gl i o : i Bl
; o interrogatories. .. o ) A v
b 27/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

192224 To correspondence from G. Nettleton
re: responding to C. Pappas' procedural
question,
"2b 27/2008  Lawyer: OMR. 0.0 Hrs-X.170.00 .0 A b s L 17,000
201299 To"correspondence from C. Pappas re:: SRR R e D e e
Loolw e Tetter from Michael Chong MPL G e ; R e : SR e
Feb 27/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201305 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
procedural gquestion.
b 28/2008 = Lawyer: QMR - 0:10 Hrs: X 170.00 N S e T e 1700
: 192225  To correspondence: ‘from:C. Pappas-rei ' Lt B e
G article. in Orangeville ‘Citizens oo il il s Bi e i e S
:b 28/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192226 To correspondence from HONI re:
further interrogatories they cannot
answer,
*b.28/2008" Lawyexr: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170.00 oo i n R S i i 17:00::
. 192227 .To correspondence. from.P. Fallis re: o : S e
o7 Interrogatories;toother Drivers: gk ¥ , R G , :
Feb 29/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 68.00
192228 To telephone conversation with P.
Fallis re: avoiding overlap with
Interrogatories. To discussion re:
Contacting Philip Dubac CNSC. To
conversation re: interrogatories to OPA
and IESO and Ministry of Energy.
b 29/20087 Lawyer: QMR 0410 Hrg X 170L00 0 - e il Gl e SRR Dl R g g
- 192229 To correspondence -from P. Fallis re: . e N1 e
et Letteroto Canadlan Nuclear Safety

i Commission. T T e . Chhm i
b 29/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 00 17.00
192230 To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
Contact Info and information re: OPG.
Tb.29/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X.170.00 S S i L e g0
192231 To correspondence. from Pi Falligire: . o Tl b
: : '¢JQCorrespondence to C Pappas re: letter

: S tol CNSC, L . : e
®~p 29/2008 Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00 10.00
201221 To telephone conversation with M.
DeBliek re: status of matter.
Feb 29/2008  Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170000 70 0 00 r i or i i L [ VR
201363 To correspondence’ ‘from HONI Te: =~ 0= 0 oo e F e
i interrogatoriés that can't be answered. i Sl .
r 2/2008 Lawyer: QMR 3.20 Hrs X 170.00 544.00
192232 To commencing preparation of
Interrogatories.
T 3/2008 TLawyef: QMR 0:10 Hrs X 170.000 .
(/192233 To correspondence from G. Nettleton
w7 Ui iires Service of IR Respomses: i . il o doas SR Gl
Mar 3/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
192234 To correspondence to G. Nettleton re:
) accepting service of IR Responses. ) ) B o
o :3/2008  Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170,00 -~ = = o Ll
+ = 192235 To correspondence from . .Fallls reri o G .
. guestions for OPG.: g e SRR
I r 3/2008 Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X lOO 00 10.00
201222 To correspondence to G. Nettleton re:
updated Ross Firm Group Intervenor
List.
I r 372008 Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hre X 170007 b cvivanr 0 coam i 0 S el 507500
201306 To correspondence from B. Alexander . ..o 0 Sy Sl e

17.00




Work-in-Progress

To Jul 8/2008
te Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal

re: Pollution Probe's interrogatories

y part 2. : L
mar 3/2008 Carole Weber - Petty Cash 5253 20.36
201315 Canada Post - XPost - Feb 22
r '3/2008 Lawyer: QMR.-0.10 Hrs X 170,00 : : . i i s 17,00

201367. To correspondence - from C.-Pappas: re:
o written interrogatories. Part 3. R R : L
Mar 4/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201301 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
correspondence between C. Pappas and
ABB.
Mar: 4/2008 . Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X-170.00-.- : i SRR Bk w1000 :
201302 ¢ To correspondence from-C. Pappas xe: B SAS e Cmop e
& Thyristor Controlled-Series Capacitors
and/or Thyristor Protected Serles
: . ’Capac:LtorS T bt E ERE RO : : DL ERERSEH RN B SR
Mar 4/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201369 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
History of Series Capacitor
installation.
Mar 572008 Ontario Power Gemeration =~ i C 52660 S i
7 185733 ~Application Fee: Freedom of.- S ‘ S S
G cInformation & Protectlon of Privacy’ Act Sl SR e e e R
...r 5/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201332 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
nondisclosure agreement and practice
direction on confidential filing.
¥ 6/2008 "Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs.X.170.00
1192236710 correspondence from: G.. Vegh-re:
Lniaw o response to. PurFallistiletter of i
. February 29,2008 regardlng Bruce Power
oo dnterrogatory requests. R : : RS FE SR
Mar 6/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192237 To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
questions for MOE. ‘ i ‘
v 6/2008. Lawyer: QMR 010 Hrs X 170.00 S , R SR L A g0
1201334 To.correspondénce ' from M. Helnz re: - T e
: ©.OPA's -letter to the Board in response
toiMr. Nettleton's.letter of February
729th regardlng Pollutlon Probe IRs 9,
GRS 10 and AL o T :
Mar 6/2008 Lawyer: QMR O.lO Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201349 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
Mr. Rattray's Request.
r16/2008 TLawyer: QMR 0.10. Hrs X 170.00. , S a1 17000
1201353 To. correspondence from B. Alexander G B L R
o ores historical documents.i T SR e : 3 e
L r 6/2008 Lawyer QMR (.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201358 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
Environmental Assessment - Bruce to
Milton - Interrogatory Request.
T 672008 Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170,00
301362 P correspondence; from gL Nettleton
s dER e redtinterrogatories HONI can't answer.:
Mar 6/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00
201365 To correspondence from J. Roszell re:
PWU interrogatories.
L 7/2008  Lawyer: OMR: 2,30 Hrs X 170.00-
v 1'192238v To review of Procedural Order- No.6:
.  To review of questions to MOE of Mr.
- Pappag:dated March 6, 2008 To- rev1ew .
. of letter of G. Nettleton dated March.
16,2008, To review 'of ‘Polltuions ¢
_Probe s Part 3 Interrogatories.  To . L
_review of Pollution Probe's. ‘response to‘: £
“HONI Feb 26 2008 letter.\ To rev1ew of il
March 6, 2008 letter from Bruce Power.
- counsel co ‘Falligy  To review of March
62008 1nterrogator1es of - PWU and.
. accompanying letter.. To review of -
- Pappas March 6,7 2008 letterixe: =~ .°
- confidential® filings. To review of OEB’i
~direction re: Confidential fllmgs Ta.
review of OPA letter of March 6, 2008
re: Confidential filings.. :




Work-in-Progress
To Jul 8/2008
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Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time
Explanation

Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

ar 7/2008
192239

Mar: 7/2008
192240

.ar 8/2008
192241

Mar- §/2008
192242

Mar 10/2008

186696

ar 10/2008

1186698
3r 10/2008
186705

Max: 1072008

Mar 10/2008

192244

Mar 10/2008
192245
s : Connectlons re: Interrogatories.

ar 10/2008
192246

*3x 10/2008

5192247

Mar 10/2008
192248

i 10/2008
192249
s ver request for 1nformatlon

wr 10/2008
192250

1 10/2008

192251

192252

Mar 10/2008

192253

192254

ix 1072008
1192285
oo revBallution Probets request for:

i historical 1nformatlon prio¥ to 2002:

o 10/2008
192256

r 10/2008

1192257

*ar 10/2008

‘Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170,00 = ..
To correspondence from B. Alexanderl'
.vre; Part 4 of Pollutlon Probe's. wrrttenﬂ;
.. - interrogatories.’ :
Mar 10/2008

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from OEB re:
Procedural Order No. 6.

Lawyer: QMR ::0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from C. Pappas-re:
Confidentiality Agreements.: '.
Lawyer: QMR 2.40 Hrs X 170.00

To final preparation of questions to
HONI, Minister of Energy and OPG. To
final preparation of cover letters
thereto.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 :
To -correspondence’ from D::MacIntosh

_re: Energy Probe's Interrogatories (Set

2y R

Ministry of Energy

Application Fee: Freedom of

Information & Protection of Privacy Act

Independent Electricity System Operator :
~Bpplication Fee: Freedom of+ = i
“Information & Protéction of Prlvacy Act

Ontarioc Power Authority
Application Fee: Freedom of
Information & Protection of Privacy Act

) ”Lawyer QMR-+ 2,50  Hrg X 170,00
192043
Lt Upreparation of 1nterrogator1es to OPA
“‘and: submitting same. B

To reyiew of . OPA: materrals and

Lawyer: QMR 2.50 Hrs X 170. OO

To review of IESO materials and
preparation of interrogatories to IESO
and submitting same.

Lawyer: QMR '0.10 Hrs$ X'170.00:

To: correspondence “from Powerllnes

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from Pollution Probe
re: Set 3 of Interrogatories.

Lawyer: QMR. 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

7T correspondence to R, Watson at OPG .

res request for information.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence to J. Rattray at
IESO re: request for information.
Lawyer: QMR0.10, Hrg X .170.00:

To. correspondence to M. Heinz: at OPA

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00

To correspondence to K. Walli re: Ross
Firm Group's interrogatories to HONI,
MOE, and OPG.

“Lawyer: OMR . 0.10 Hrs X 17000

To correspondence 0 K Wallis rer Ross b
- Firm Group's 1nterrogatorles to OPA and i
IESO.. g e
Lawyer: QMR O.lO Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence to MOE re: request
for information.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00
To correspondence from OEB re: Board
Staff Interrogatories Set 2.

Lawyers QMR- 0010 Hrs:X. 170: 00,

To correspondence “from G, Nettleton f

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from B. Alexander

re: Part 5 of Pollution Probe's written
interrogatories.

Lawyeri OMR 0,10 Hrs X:170.000 i
‘Poicorrespondence  from P: Falllis re:

17.00
17200

408.00

17,00

“5280 ' ’ 500

5284 e s g

e S LR T 'SLGO

425.00

70000

17.00

17.00

17.00
17007

17.00

17.00

g

17.00

17.00

S 17.00. 0

425,00

Caniee

SRy




Work-in-Progress

To Jul

8/2008
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Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time
Explanation

Che/Inv

Retainer

Disbursement

Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

10/2008
192258

10/2008

192259

10/2008
192260

10/2008

0192261

Mar

Mar

Mar

Mar

10/2008

192262

11/2008

192263

11/2008

192264

11/2008

11/2008

Mar

192266

12/2008

192267

12/2008
192268

12/2008
192269

12/2008
192270

12/2008
192271

12/2008
192272

13/2008:
$192273 =

192274

14/2008
C188161:

14/2008
188163

14/2008

t lB8l64

© 14/2008

188165

‘ cLawyer: QMR:: 0,10 Hrs X 170 00
192265 .
: ore: Energy Probe s Interrogatorles (set

2 TO: correspondence from J. Meyers: at

Lawyers QMR 0,10 Hrs X-170.00-

wind Power' Notes.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
HONI's response to his interrogatories.
Lawyer: QMR . '0.10 Hrs:X:170.00
To:correspondence. from G.. MacDonald

“ye: HONI's response. to Pollution:

Probe's Interrogatories Listi1.
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
Interrogatories to MOE.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10-Hrs X 170 00
To:correspondence  from G. MacDonald: -
re: HONL's response to-OEB

‘Interrogatorles List::d.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 00

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
Interrogatories to OFG.

Lawyer: QMR . 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence . Erom A. ‘Monem. re:
receipt of HONI's response to SO0N's
interrogatories.

Lawyer: QMR (.10 Hrs X 170 00

To correspondence from G. MacDonald
re: HONI's reply to SON's
interrogatories.

To correspondence  from B MacIntosh

4)

Lawyer OMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170. OO

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
Interrogatories to CNSC.

Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs.X 170.00

[T correspondence - from-G::MacDonald *

re: HONI's reply to EP-list 1 and =

. Fallis List 1 interrogatories; ..

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from J. Meyers at
0PG re: denial of request for
information.

Lawyer:: QMR " 0.10 Hrs:X-170.00

OPG re: response to: Fallls Group s
1nterrogator1es k

Lawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170 00

To correspondence to J. Meyers at OPG
re: Freedom of Information request.
Lawyer: OMR ©0:10.Hrs X.170.00

To correspondence to Ko Walli re: S
vcorrespondence from J: Meyers and Ross.
. Filrm-Group's resporse to same’,; e

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. OO

To correspondence from J. Meyers at
OPG re: contact from Freedom of
Information Manager.

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:

explanation and request for exten51on :

for-filing dinterrogatories and :

Celi cmupplementary emails. o
13/2008

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from R. Watson re:
requesting rewording of FIPPA
questions.

ZPurolator: Courier Ltd, .o
fBOL329012459429 o OEB i Mar lO

Purolator Courier Ltd.
BOL329012589357 - IESO - Mar 11
Purolator Courler Ltdios i
BOL329012589977 <:Ontario Power ;

“Generation - Mar 11

Purolator Courier Ltd.
BOL329012591239 - Ontario Power
Authority - Mar 11

2862

13.02

13.02

S1302

17.00

17.00

17.00

1700

17.00

1700

1700

17.00

1700

17.00

17:00 ¢

17.00

17,00

17.00

17000,




Work-in-Progress

To Jul 8/2008
‘te Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal

(r 14/2008 % Purolator . Courier Ltd. . - g 13.02
188166 ‘BOL329012592393 -~ Mlnlstry of Energy = : :
- Mar-il
Mar 14/2008 Purolator Courier Ltd 13.02
188167 BOL329012593201 - OEB - Mar 11
w 17/2008 : Ontario. Power Authority 5285, .. =500

187540 "Application Fee: Freedom of
“Information’ & Protection of Privacy Act
S0 U ysid < Not Requived : v o o ,
v 17/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192275 To correspondence from OPA re:
returning cheque and responding to
request for information.
£ 17/2008 Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 Hrs X 17000 [ R ; i . D700
1©.192276 To correspondence - from C. Pappas re: S . N T e
L further lnterrogatorles and :
: : -attachments. iE : T S o
« 18/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192277 To correspondence from G. Nettleton
re: responding to C. Pappas' late
filing of interrogatories.
i 19/2008  Lawyer: QMR. 0.10 Hrs'X:170.00 ST e TR T 100
192278 ' To correspondence fom J. Meyers of . OPG : g ey e i
Bt evrerrequest for information.. i i it SN s . i L
Mar 20/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192310 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's Motion.
04 /2008 Lawyers QMR 0,10 Hrs X/ 170:00 e S SRS T 1700
192279 To correspondence - from Basil Alexander - . S e
: re-:Motion for Full and Adequate Int,
& *vResponses L S AT it o : : e G
r 25/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0. lO Hrs X 170 00 17.00
192280 To correspondence from MOE re: request
for information.
r 25/2008" Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 Hrs X 170:00: " L e TR £117.00
17192281 . To correspondence: from G. MaeDonald e SRR SO S E N
: re; HONI!s response ‘to Ross List 1l to
. HONT, List L to OPA, List 1 to IESO. ST e e ,
*ar 25/2008 Lawyer QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192282 To correspondence from G. MacDonald
re: HONI's response to Pollution Probe
Lists 4 and 5. ) i
Mar 25/2008. Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs'¥ 170007 .~ o0 et D i e e 17,00
192283 T correspondence from G. MacDonald = . e R e I
: ire: HONI's: response: to Powerllne
cEle :Connectlons List 1t e e BE : : . S iy
Mar 25/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192284 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's regquest to OPG
and Bruce Power re: providing
historical information.

7 26/2008 Lawyer: QMR 5.00 Hrs X 170,00 . . D G 850000
192285 To review. of. 1nterrogatory responses‘- S T e D e
o8 received: s S E s s
Mar 26/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00

192286 To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
resending his March 19, 2008 letter.
r:29/2008 SLawyer s QMR - 6,50 Hrs. X 170000 075 S U . Sl e e 1105100
192287 To preparation of Motiom and AffldaVLt' S e SR
© o “in support of further disclosure. S . L Sl
«r 31/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192288 To correspondence to J. Rattray at
IESO re: IESO information. ‘
Mar 3172008 ‘Lawyer: QMR 5.20 Hrs X 170,00 i ot ns e SR s e s 884000
192289 To completlon of Notice of Motion, == Bl St
B Motion Record and Affidavit. To . =
“gollection and preparation of eXhlbltS»"
< :To ‘tollaboration with P Fallis on'all
s documénts,  To: telephone conversatlons
_: regarding additions, deletions and oo
amendments. 1o meetlng with P, Rosg
S ;re affidavit. L g Sl S
mr 31/2008 Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192292 To correspondence from and to clerk
re: request for information and re:




Work-in-Progress
To Jul

ite
Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv

Explanation

Disbursement Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.

Current

Trust Bal

r 31/2008-

192293

31/2008
201223

R

Mar 31/2008
201224

Mar 31/2008
201225

o 1/2008

189607

T 1/2008
189608

Apr1/2008:

-+ 189609
r 1/2008
192294

*=r. 1/2008"
192295

Apr 1/2008
192296

Apr 1/2008

192297.

ApT  1/2008
192298

T 1/2008

1192299
r 1/2008
201226

r2/2008

189587

Apr 2/2008
192300

¥ 2/2008

- 192301

r 2/2008

201183

L ri2/2008

r 2/2008
201186

Tl 272008
201227

i v 3/2008
195238

retainer.
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X.170.00
To correspondence ‘to P.:Fallis

- enclosing: Motion Record, Notlce of

Motion and’Affidavit.

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00

To correspondence to E. Brill re:
request for information.

Lawyer: MLD: 1,50 Hrs X 100.00

To preparation of Exhibit Book:and.

“.Motion Record for binding,

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00

To telephone call to Ed Brill at SEA

Ltd re: request for informationm.

Expense Recovery. : : = _ 03429
Photocopies @ $0.20 =616 (11 Exhibit :

:'Books @ 56 pages)
Expense Recovery 03420

Photocopies @ $0.20 -291 ({11 Motion
Records @27 pages)

Expense Recovery . ¢ P 034200

Fax @ $0.20 ~~102 pages to HONT.
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence to E. Brill re:
request for information.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10:Hrs. X 170:00

To correspondence from. E. Brlll rer
“timeline for letter:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. OO

To correspondence from E. Brill re:
Letter of Request for Historical
information.

Lawyer:-OMR 0,10 Hrg X 170,00

T6 correspondence from G. Nettletoh

‘ra: HONI's response tol Pollutlon

Probe"s Motion.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
April 3, 2008 Motion's Day.

Lawyer: QMR 7:0.20: Hrg X170, 00"

' To correspondence - to K. Walli at OFB,
“HONI and intérvenors Te: Motlon Record

and- Exhibit Book.

Lawyer: MLD 4.50 Hrs X 100 00

To binding 10 copies of Exhibit Book
and Motion Record for April 3rd Motion;
to preparing package for courier.

CSER; Ltds : L B34
‘Rétaginer, = " SEA Progect No 703674 &

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00
To correspondence to E. Brill re:
retainer monies.

SLawyer: OMR 0+ 10 Hrs" X 170. 00

“To correspondence ‘from'M, Helnz re
‘OPA'g attendance at Aprll 3 2008
Motion Day.:

Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. OO

To correspondence from G. MacDonald
re: complete set of HONI's response to
interrogatories.

',Lawyer OMR::0.10/ Hrs X:170:00
201185
7 fer requesting whether hard. copy: of-
- iMotion Record and. Exhlblt Book w111

To: correspondence from N: -Sookmangal:

follow.:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence to N. Sookmangal
confirming hard copies of Motion Record
and Exhibit Book have been courlered
Lawyer: MED . 0.50 Hrs X 100.00:

o binding of Exhibit Book and Motlon S
“Record Copies for flle to prepar1ng

Motiong Day binder.. S B :
Expense Recovery 03497
Travel: Goderich - Toronto - Goderich

17.

10.
150

10.

123.20
59.40

20440

17.

17:

17

‘117

17.

31,

450.

©1200.00

17.

17

17.

250

178.40

17.

00

00

00

00

00
007 :

00

00

00

00, =

00

00

00
00

00

00

00




te

Apr:

Apr

Apr

4/2008

1581590

4/2008

192302

4/2008

201290

7/2008
201285

7/2008

201286

APT

8/2008

201190

o To Jul 8/2008
Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.

_Explanation Current Trust Bal
- 446 km @ $0.40/km*

Purolator Courier Ltd. 17.17

BOL27938080457 -K. Walll - Apr 1
{collect) ,
Lawyer: QMR 8.00 Hrs X 170.00 1360.00
To preparation for and attendance at
Motion Day.

Lawyer: QMR-.0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17,00
To correspondence " from “C.. Pappas re: i
Orangeville Citizen article about i

“pollution Probe's Motion for more data

“‘on’ transmission 1line. S
Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
To correspondence from P. Fallis re:

IAEA documents.

Lawyer: OMR 0710 Hrs X 170400+ 17.00

‘To correspondence from P Fallis ’
“-copying correspondence to Benito:

‘Gonzalez Téi TAER, -y i S
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
To correspondence from L. Ing re:

Procedural Order 8 and Decision and

Order on Motion.

L 8/2008

1201228

Apr

sl

201278

Apr

11/2008

8/2008
201229

8/2008

201230

9/2008
192303

9/2008
192304 -
G S Mot ion

10/2008
201267

10/2008
201269

10/2008
201271

10/2008.
201278

10/2008

201275

10/2008

11/2008

192308

“11/2008
S193076
Lrode T e letter from Pollution Probe (LN
L regardlng the OPA's Confldentlallty o
‘tequest. ‘ ik

201191

Entry#

Work-in-Progress

‘Lawyer: MLD (.10 Hrs X 100,00

To correspondence . to Anne- Marle’Rellly G

i at HONI re: sendlng binder sets to Ed
‘Brill,

Lawyer MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00

To correspondence from Anne-Marie
Reilly at HONI re: confirmation that
binders were couriered.

‘Lawyer: MLD::0./10 Hrs X.100.00 -
To ¢orrespondence: "to E, Brill re:

conflrmlng lnterrogatory blnders sent
by cottrier. g
Lawyer: QMR 0.40 Hrs X 170 OO

To review of Motion Order and
Procedural Order.

Lawyer: QMR -1.00 Hrs X-170.00

To repcrtlng to Cllents re‘ outcome of

Lawyer: QMR 0 10 Hrs X 170 OO

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
Smart Grid technology.

Lawyer: QMR- 0:10; Hrs X 170.00

To’ correspondence from P. Fallls re
‘Daniel’ Ripchensky.

Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
dates lines went operational;
opportunity for additional
interrogatories, historical
information.

Lawyer: QMR'©0.10 Hrs X 170.00

o correspondence ‘from. ¢ Pappas te:
. various articles “in ‘Sun. Times.

Lawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from P, Fallis re:
C. Pappas' offer to assist with
providing evidence.

‘Lawyer: OMR. .0 10 Hrs X 170.00 ot
To correspondence from €. Pappas re"»»
‘aSSlStlng with providing evidence,

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00

To correspondence from M. Heinz at OPA
re: confidential information sent re:
pollution Probe's interrogatories
19(a), 19{(d), 38 and 47(c).

;Lawyer COMR 0710 Hrs X 170,007

To correspondence from B Alexander

Lawyer: QMR 0 10 Hrs X 170 00
To correspondence to G. Nettleton re:

10:00°

10.00

110,00 ¢

68.00

170,000
17.00

01750070

17.00

17,00

17.00

17.00

T17.00

1720000




__ Entryk

fateae

Fap

Apr

Apr

Apr

192378
U Woelfle ve:rsettlement offer;

5
Y

~
3

Apr
©191833

Apr

s
[l

11/2008

201192

12/2008
201231

c 13/2008
193078
: .I”rev1ew1ng documents by downloadlng pdf

- 14/2008

191285

1472008
2192307
Lo gtatus of matter and potentlal steps
“ ‘going forward.

14/2008
192309

14/2008;
193070
ioin rer paper: copy of updated response to

14/2008

201196

14/2008

201197

14/2008

201232

16/2008

£7193080

- 17/2008

191837

17/2008

- 17/2008

192379

17/2008

192380

201200

18/2008
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Che/Inv

Retainer

Disbursement

Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

requesting information regarding their
client's position.

Lawyer: QMR ~0.710 Hrs X-170.00 :

To correspondence - from G.. Nettleton
re:.land acqulsltlon and compensatlon

. practices.

Lawyer: MLD 0.10 Hrs X 100.00

To correspondence to E. Brill re:
access to pdf version of Interrogatory
Responses.

Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X.170.00
To-correspondence © from-E. Brill: re:

files.

Expense Recovery

Travel: Goderich - Paisley - Goderich
-156.24 @ 0.40

Lawyer: QMR /1,15 Hrs ¥-+170:00 :
To meeting with clients and discussing

Lawyer: QMR 1.30 Hrs X 170. 00
To preparation for Group meeting.

,Lawyer OMR 7010 Hrg X 170.00

To: correspondence “from G MacDonald

Rogs Firm.Group. and Pollutlon Probe s

. 1nterrogator1es. .

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 00

To correspondence from C. Pappas re:
discrepancies between HONI and IAEA
records.

Lawyer: QMR: 0 ,10°Hrs X:170.00%

= To correspondence to Ci Pappas. and B.

Fallis ve: filing of evidence;
Lawyer: MLD 1.15 Hrs X 100.00

To meeting with clients and discussing
status of matter and potential steps
going forward.

«.Lawyer:: QMR- 010 Hrs X 170.00.
To correspondence from:.Dy Barett re:
" HONIts:offer:to settle : :

Lawyer: QMR 4.80 Hrs X 170. 00

To continuing review of evidentiary
material for filing.

Lawyer: QMR- 0.10 Hrs X 170,00 ..
To telephone conversation with DL

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00
To telephone conversation with D.
DeBliek re: settlement offer.

' Lawyer: OMR 0.50 Hrs'X 170.00
“To: telephone conversatlon with E.

Brill and p. Fallls re: preparatlon of

SR reporE,
- 17/2008

Lawyer: QMR 0. lO Hrs X 170. 00
To correspondence to M. Lyons at 3M
re: De51gn Plan.

‘Lawyer: QMR ©7.80 Hrs X 170.00

= To_ telephone. conversatlon w1th E.

'Brlll & P, Fallig. To contlnued Teview
- of “ACCR taterial: To contlnued review.

voof series capaCLtors To preparatlon

18/2008
193061

18/2008
193065

193462

18/2008
201233

“and dlstrlbutlon of Ross Flrm
. Evidentiary Package 1:5. :

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's Expert Evidence.
Tawyers QMR 70.10 Hrs X 170,00 .

To correspondence ~ from A. Monem re:
LoE e dONTS expert ‘eviderice.
18/2008

Purolator Courier Ltd.

BOL 9060251631 - SEA, Ltd. - Apr 16
Lawyer: QMR 0520 Hrs X:170.00

To correspondence  totand. from clerk

03446

"62.50

35,03

1700

10.00

17200

/195,50

221.00

17,00

17.00

17.00

115.00

17,000

816.00

17,00 -

117.00

17.00

1326.000

17.00

L 17.00

31000

8500
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te Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.

__Entry#f Explanation Current Trust Bal

re: ‘telephone. call from C. Pappas. . . o e :
r 19/2008 Lawyer: QMR 5.00 Hrs X 170.00 850.00
191834 To completing preparation of template
of hard copies of Evidentiary Packages.
v 21/2008 Lawyer: QMR- 2.60 Hrs X 170.00: -~ gy ' 442.00
191842 - To telephone conversation with D , , : : B Chelimie il
Barrett re: settlement; to telephone
conversation with P Fallis ré: expert
report.  To review of expert report of
: Pollution probe. * To drafting extension
letter to board for our expert oplnlon :
letter; S B R sl e
Anr 21/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 ' 17.00
193073 To correspondence from G. MacDonald
re: paper copies of appendices A, B,
and C of interrogatory responses.
Apr- 21/2008 7 Lawyer; QMR- 0,10 ‘Hrs ¥ 170,007 &0 ¢ ; A S| S 17000
/201201 To correspondence from P, Fallls re: : e e S e
“ L Bxpert Report . : ST : EE : R :
apr 21/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
201204 To correspondence to P. Fallis re:
letter to board regarding extension.
i £21/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0:10 Hee X7170000 0 SR s Bl
201236 o correspondence from N, Sookmangal ' R e B e e B
sl re s hards coples of documents submitted. ' ‘s : L
Any 21/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201237 To correspondence to N. Soockmangal
confirming hard copies will be sent by

courier.
RApri21 /2008 :Lawyery: QMR- 0,10 Hrs: X:170.00 : Pl ; SR L T00:
;201241 To correspondence from E Brlll re* e R IR e
e extension iR Lo : S Ceiae
Bpr 22/2008 Carole Weber - Petty Cash 5405 12.15
192065 Canada Post - XPost - Apr 3 - SEA Ltd. )
+ ©22/2008  Lawyer: QMR- 0.10.Hrs X 170.00 v e 17,000

192115 To: correspondence to OEB re: sending.
e coples of evidence binders.: Sl Aes (81
Bpr 22/2008 MicroAge Basics 994.13
192331 Production of Evidence Binders (22
binders, 13,448 copies)
£ 22/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170.00 T R e T e B T T
201205 To dotrespondence:  to: N. MacDonald rerio el R R e T
L emdil 2 °of ‘package 4 : At L e SR
1 ¢ 23/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00 17.00
193074 To correspondence from N. Sookmangal
re: documents necessary for hearing.
Bpr23/2008 Lawyer: QMR.:0.10-Hrs X 170:00 Q'»»'» S A e L L TR0 e
201208 To correspondence to E. Brill re: " i S TR e e s
' requesting | how much OTe - tlme is: needed,
L e SR repipt sdn S Lol : o . GERCELS R
Apr 24/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192857 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's Motion for
Specific Key Info re:
Cost-Effectiveness Part 1.
I 2 24/2008 0 Lawyer: QMR ;0.10 Hrs X.170:00 LS e L ey 17200
19286070 corréspondernce from B. Alexander S e 3
0 resPollution Probels Motlon for o
: Spec1f1c Key Info rer .o
. Cost-Bffectiveness Part 2. e Rl e s i R
© 25/2008 Lawyer: OMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
192861 To correspondence to G. Nettleton re:
ACCR Evidence Scope.
Apr 25/2008  Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00: S L P T R i
192864 To correspondence to K Wa111 re o B e e Sl e e
S pdpert Report S = s S SRy
Apr 25/2008 Lawyer: QMR O. 10 Hrs X 170 OO 17.00
192865 To correspondence to G. Nettleton re: )
ACCR evidence and technical summary and
field trials. »
Rys 25/2008  Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170000 Sl e e e 1700
el 193064,'To _correspondence from G. Nettleton Sl el e L e
+re: HONIs response to Pollutlon Probe g
(k5 i Aprll 24 Motiot, : i : . A St . :
I_ 25/2008 Purolator Courier Ltd. 119.38

e
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paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

Explanation

o

Apr

Apr

Bpr:

Apr

Apr

Apr

apl

hi g

Apr

May

mdy

199121
25/2008
201261

25/2008

201262

27/2008
193131

27/2008
193132

27/2008
201182
28/2008
193364
2872008

193448.

28/2008

201243

. 28/2008
L. 201453 ¢ :
s \frespondlng to correspondence’ of: Mr.

‘vFallls and Mr. Pappas dated Aprll 25
A 2008 .
29/2008

193369

2972008

193370
29/2008
193386

29/2008;
= 193441

29/2008
193444

12972008,
193445

29/2008
193455

29/2008

201467

30/2008

193475

30/2008"
193476

30/2008
194101

30/2008 -
201245

30/2008

201266

1/2008
194102
. Oral Hearing:

1/2008
201498

2/2008
1941030

Hilton Toronto - Mar- 20

Tawyer: QMR 0. 10 Hrs-X: 170.00

BOL 329017284780 - OEB - Apr 22
Lawyer: QMR .0.10 Hrs X 170.00: . : e 217400
To correspondence. -from D. Barrett s R : :

“requesting copies of 1nterrogator1es

and- responses. i R o
Lawyer: QMR ©.10 Hrs X 170.00 ©17.00
To correspondence to clerk reguesting

clerk to forward cds to D. Barrett.

Lawyer: QMR ~0.10 Hrs X 170.00 L i ] N L 1700

‘To correspondence to 1ntervenors re:

evidentiary process. - i : : L
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 HErs X 170. 00 ' ' 17.00
To correspondence from M. Klippenstein

re: evidentiary process.

. Expense-Recovery : L : 03572 [ 40000

Photocopies @ $0. 20 =200 : : : 35 R S e
Lawyer: QMR 5.50 Hrs X 170. OO 935.00
To preparation for Oral hearing.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X170.00 e e SRS T L1700

To correspondence from SEA re: draft
expert report,

Lawyer: OMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 T T 1700

To correspondence from B. Alexander

re: responding to HONI's letter.

Lawyeri QMR 0:10 Hrs X 17000 . ° e N T R
To:corregpondence . from HONI xe: . L S T I e

Lawyer: QMR 2 00 Hrs X 170.00 340.00
To telephone conference with P.

Fallis, A. Monem, M. Klippenstein, B.

Alexander and A. Pape.

Lawyers OMR 3,00 Hrs X 170.00- e LRI S 510400
‘To.preparation for Oral hearing. . o : gy T g :

Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 ' ' ' o 85.00
To telephone conversation with R.
Barlow re: Oral Hearing Attendance.

‘Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs. X 170.00. 3 e Co e 17,000

T0 correspondence to K Walll re
Evidence Index.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 o 17.00

To correspondence to K. Walli re:
Expert Report of E. Brill.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 5 fie Sl e 100

To: correspondence to-E. Brill re

review of expert report i (e i : fnr L T S
Lawyer: QMR 0.50 Hrs X 170.00 85.00

To review of Land Acquisition
Compensatlon Principles. )
Lawyer: QMR 0.20 Hrs X 170.00. = o o i L 34.00

o) correspondence to.and from G,
3 Nettleton re: Land Acquizition Pollcy

Quinn M. Ross '5426" S 169,00
Ruth's Chris Steakhouse - Mar 19 v
Quini M. Rosg . ke i 5a26 e : v 1270479

Lawyer: QMR 5.00 Hrs X 170.00 R ' ' © 850.00
To completing preparation of Cross

Examination.
17,00

To correspondence from B Alexander
rei interrogatory responses.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 ’ R ’ T 1700

To correspondence to D. Barrett

enclosing copies of interrogatories and
responses. ‘
Lawyer: OMR 800 Hes X 0170,000 -0 e e iy : e S 1360400
To preparatlon before and attendlng at f e e e aaE e Sl

Expense Recovefy ' J N T >03497v o » 160.00
Travel: Goderich - Orangeville - 150
km @ $0.40/km

Lawyer: QMR 8.00 Hrs X 170.00 e TR e S 1360.00

To preparatlon before-and attendlng at:
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Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement

Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

ay

iy

May

May

iy

1y

Mavy R

Oral Hearing.

2/2008 Expense Recovery

201499 Travel: Orangeville - Goderich
km @ $0.40/km

4/2008  Lawyer:-QMR - 3.50 Hrs X.170.00

034397 ' 60.00
- 150

194106. - To-review of ‘day 1 and 2 transcript in
: preparatlon for contlnuatlon of Oral:

; ~Hearing. . :
4/2008 Expense Recovery

T 03497 ' 89.20

201500 Travel: Goderich - Toronto - 223 km @

$0.40/km
572008 ‘Lawyer: QMR 8.00 Hrs. X 170.00

194177 - To preparation for and attendlng at

: ~Oral-Hearing
5/2008 Lawyer: QMR (.10 Hrs X 170 00

201292 To correspondence to clerk requesting
a copy of the Auditor General's Report

and memo.
5/2008 Lawyer: QMR. 0.10 Hrs X170 00
201293 1T correspondence - from-clerk: :

forwarding Audltor General k| Report and

LR memo.
6/2008 Lawyer QMR 8 OO Hrs X 170 OO

194289 To preparation for and attending at

Oral Hearing.
6/2008 " Lawyer: PR (0,10 Hrs X 330:00;

201247 To correspondence to E. Brill
: S requesting ac phone call and 1nformatlon

May
May

iy

vy

May.

May

May
May

Y

el snfor Hearing.,
7/2008 Lawyer: QMR 7.50 Hrs X 170.00

194554 To preparation for and attending at

Oral Hearing.

7/2008 . Lawyer: QMR 7230 Hrs X 170.00
194555 To,preparation for cross- examlnatlon

: ~of Mr. Wotdward, i
7/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 00

201296 To correspondence from E. Brill re:
forwarding documents as requested and
advising of availability for hearing.

“8/2008. . Lawyer; QMR 6,00 Hrs X 170,00

195001 :To preparatlon for and attendlng EHt

n Oral Hearing.n
9/2008 Expense Recovery

03497 T 920

201501 Travel: Toronto - Goderich - 223 km @

$0.40/km
11/2008»’Lawyer QMR+ 2.:70 Hrs X-170.00

©. 195002 - To review of Transcript. from technlcal i

-conference. -(May '9; 2008} "

11/2008 Expense Recovery

03497 g9

201502 Travel: Goderich - Toronto - 223 km @

$0.40/km

12/2008  Lawyer: QMR 7.20 Hrs X 170:00
195006 To préparation’ for. and attendlng at

= -Oral Hearing.

13/2008 Lawyer: QMR 7.20 Hrs X 170.00

195426 To preparing for and attending
Hearing.
14/2008:  Lawyer: QMR ‘5,60 Hrs X 170.00:

195429  To reviewing HONI materials in

cross. . To:review of ‘questions
in'chief of Brill by Fallis:
fjmeetlng w1th E. Br111 prlor to
“:testimony.

at Oral

aid of
for exam 3
To . .

15/2008 Lawyer: QMR 8.00 Hrs X 170.00’

195430 To meeting with E. Brill before

hearing. To attending at hearing. To
meeting over lunch re: SPS proposal

16/2008  Expense Recovery:
1201503 ‘Travel: Toronto - Goderlch - 223 km @

ST sen a0 ke
22/2008 Lawyer: QMR 2.60 Hrs X 170.00

196162 To review of BSPS disclosure and
commencing preparation of questions for

Cross-Examination.

23/2008  Lawyer: QMR 1510 Hrs X 170.00 -

03897 e e 89,20

595.00

71360.00

17.00

Ce 1700

" 1360.00

A3

127500

o 391400 v

17.00

1020.00

459,00

122400

1224.00

952,00

1360.00

C442.00

+187.00




Work-in-Progress

To Jul 8/2008
te Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry$ Explanation Current Trust Bal
196273 To meeting with J. & 0. Magwood and
: discussing property specific ¢oncerns
oo and matter generally. e
May 26/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201209 To correspondence to and from J.
Magwood re: publicity.
..y 2772008 Lawyer: QMR 72,70 Hrs X 170.00. 459,00
196704 To review of transcript of exam in -
. chief of 8PS panel and preparatlon of"
crosg-examination, : o :
y 27/2008 Expense Recovery 03575 29.11
201393 Over East Restaurant - Meal
May 27/2008 . Expense Recovery 03578 89.20.
201492 Travel: Goderich - Toronto -223 km @ ' :
Lo o 80040 ks : A L
May 28/2008 Lawyer: QMR 8.00 Hrs X 170 00 1360.00
196705 To preparation for and attending at
Oral Hearing.
y-28/2008" Lawyer:: PR:.10.00 Hrs X'330.00 3300500
196706 To review of materials relating to i
S IR 8PS To! réview ofs tratiscriptexam . in
" chief of -SPS panel,;,To attending at .
{0 . Oral Hearing. : ' 3 e i e
...y 28/2008 Expense Recovery 03578 89.20
201493 Travel: Toronto -Goderich -223 km @
$0.40/km ,
ni 272008 Lawyer: QMR . 0.10 Hrs X 170:00 , SUATH00
2012127 To correspondence from B. Alexander : : e
LTS yey spreadsheets used by Pollution
“Probe’s experts and confldentlallty L
e Cigsues: it i : :
n 3/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201248 To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: evidence book for C. Pappas for
examination of Mr. Lanzalotta and Mr.
Fagan.
uurl’ 372008 Expense Recovery: 03578 - 89.20 7
.-201494  Travel: Goderich - Toronto 223 kim @ i i U
$0.40/km o 0o , Sl
n 4/2008 Lawyer: QMR 8.00 Hrs X 170 00 1360.00
197588 To preparation for and attendance at
Oral Hearing.
T4 /2008 Expense Recovery : S 03578 CRYUZ0 L e
201495 . Travel: Toronto’ -Goderlch ~223 km @ S S L
U 80.40/km : B
Jun 9/2008 Lawyer: QMR 1.30 Hrs X 170.00 221.00
198057 To review of 14 emails containing
technical data sent between June 8 and
9 from C. Pappas.
Jun - 97/2008 Lawyer. OMR -0 .10 Hrg X 1704 00 S 00
15198070+ To correspondence “to clients re: s S
o updating cllents as to status of - e
S proceedingl . v o g L
ounl  9/2008 Expense Recovery 03542 2.00
198072 Photocopies @ $0. 20
“n:9/2008  Expense Recovery . 03542 5,200
222198073 . Pogtage” e : : . o i £
..n 10/2008 Lawyer: QMR 3.20 Hrs X 170. 00 544 .00
198150 To review of SON material. To review
of SON expert report and preparation of
Cross Exam. To review of transcript
from June 4, 2008
Jun 10/2008° Tawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrg X 170.00 : L7000
71201250 176 correspondence to P, Fallls re: R
L fina) reportiof E. Brilll v S
n 10/2008 Expense Recovery 03575 40.52
201392 Red Papaya - Meal
Jun 10/2008. Expense Recovery == = : : 03578 189.20
- 201496 Travel: Goderich - Toronto 223 km e S s
L 80040 /km Sl
vunt 11/2008 Lawyer: QMR 14. 25 Hrs X 170. OO 2422.50
198805 To preparation for and attending at
Oral Hearing
n 1172008 Lawyer: PR:-14,25 Hrg X 330,00 470250
198806 To preparation for and attendlng at. TGy




Work-in-Progress
) To Jul 8/2008
te Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.

__Entrv# Explanation Current Trust Bal

Oral Hearing.
n 11/2008 Quinn M. Ross 220.29
201280 OEB - ARug 1, 2007 - Jun 11, 2008 -
Expense Report - Parking
n 11/2008 Quinn“M. Ross . : s , Loy 1198.89
201281+ OEB < Aug 1,.2007:~ Jun. 11, 2008 : i i
i Expense Report - Meals ° N : ‘ :
Jun 11/2008 Quinn M. Ross 2746.38
201282 OEB - Aug 1, 2007 - Jun 11, 2008 -
Expense Report - Hotel
m: 1172008 Quinn:M. Ross i ot Poe 57491
201283 -OEB = Aug 1, 2007 -.Jun 11, 12008~ - B B : . »
i1 Expense Report - Telephone/Internet <
Hotel : : : : e . : : .
m 11/2008 Quinn M. Ross 161.25
201284 OEB - Aug 1, 2007 - Jun 11, 2008 -
Expense Report - Cab Fare

n:11/2008. Experise Recovery .. g i 03578 R : 89,20, 7"
201497 . Travel: Toronto —Goderlch —223 km'@. » P SRR
f $0..40/km i : _ : i
Jun 17/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. OO ' 17.00

201252 To correspondence from and to G.
Nettleton re: property agents' contact
with land owners.

Jun 20/2008 Lawyer: QMR- 0,10 Hrs X 170.00° [ ° . oo oo i B S e 17000
. 201254 - To. correspondence from J. Magwood re: i S S
: '“,transcrlpts and questlons as to statiis

Shiro o of hedring, , e i : S S .
Jun 23/2008 Lawyer: QMR l 20 Hrs X 170 00 204.00
199645 To commencing review of HONI Argument
in Chief.
M 2372008 ‘Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X 170,00 - T e e T e e s 00

201256 To. corresponderice from M. Engelberg
R Cres-legal representatlon of Magwood
: famlly : .v : F e » N SR
mn 23/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201259 To correspondence to J. Magwood
requesting clarification as to nature
of retainer.
n- 2372008 - Lawyer: QMR . 4.20 ‘Hrs X:170.00 SR e R e FOE AR 71400
2013917 Mo “commnencing review of materialg for L i P L h
o preparation: of argument . To ‘review of
; transcrlpts, to review of relevant
_documents “ Mo review of undertaking-
-,_responses with regard to Locked in
. Enerqgy:costs: o

Jun 24/2008 Lawyer: QMR 3.00 Hrs X 170 00 510.00
199647 To continuing review of HONI Argument
in Chief
Jun’ 2572008 Lawyer: QMR 2.80 Hrg % 170.00.% BN Bl il S : ~‘Q,1‘476,00‘~,

201394 To: cont1nu1ng preparatlon of outllne e
: ST argument. To contlnued review of:
R dbcﬁments'and ‘Applicant's’ submigsions. . : = G o i 5
Jun 26/2008 Lawyer: QMR 3.10 Hrs X 170.00 527.00
201395 To completing review of Appllcant'
submissions and making notes. To
continuing outline of argument.

0 27/2008° Lawyer: QMR 1,70 Hrs X 170.000. © o oo n o SRR e 1080 00
201396 - To commencing preparation of Argument. o T G
T 28/2008 Lawyer: QMR 9.20 Hrs X 170. 00 1564.00

201404 To continuing preparation of Argument
including further review of documentary
and transcrlpt evidence.
Jun:30/2608° Lawyer: QMR '5.00 Hrs X 170: 00 e B e s Shice e 85000
11201397, To.‘¢ontinuing preparation iof Brgument oo 0o Do e e S g
& -;1nclud1ng further review of. documentary"
i and transcript-evidence. = S S o Eatee S
Jul 1/2008 Lawyer: QMR 2.40 Hrs X 170. 00 408.00
201398 To continuing preparation of Argument
including further review of documentary
and transcript evidence.
Jul ,2/2008f“Lawyer..QMR 7.50  HES X 1705000 'f. T g LR 0YE B0
£ 7201399 To.continuing: preparation of Argument: T o mnnomi D S
+ioo i including further review. of documentaryg3”
and transcript ‘evidence.. . 2
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Entry#

Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer

Explanaticn

Disbursement Fee/Time

Current A/R Bal.
Current Trust Bal

2/2008
201419

2/2008
201422

2/2008
201485

3/2008

201400

3/2008
201401
3/2008

201409

201426

Jul

Jul

gnl

Jul

dud

Jul

3/2008
201423

3/2008

3/2008
201427

3/2008

'4/2008

201052
4/2008

207402

4/2008

201403

4/2008

201411 -
< PWU' S submissions.

4/2008
201429

4/2008
201431

4/2008
201434

4/2008
201435

" 4/2008

201438

af2008
201439
: i Fallis Group of Intervenors = further
S filing in support-of-argument.: :

42008
201442

4/2008
201443

"4/2008

201446

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: Pollution Probe's draft overview.
Lawyer: QMR :-0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To torrespondence from A. Pape re:
response to-Pollution Probe's overview.
Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence to P. Fallis re:
argument draft.

Lawyer: QMR - 8.30 Hrs X:170.00

To completing first draft of. Argument.
Lawyer: PR 3.20 Hrs X 330.00

To review of first draft of Argument.
Lawyer:-QMR:-::0.10 Hrs X 170.00
To.correspondence  from N.' Sookmangal
re:- Appendix A to-the Board Staff
Submigsion of July 2,-2008.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
draft overview and post hearing facts
added.

Lawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs X:170.00

‘Tocorrespondence from A. “Moneni-re:

Nanticoke and June 16 comment from

.Minigter.:

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00
To correspondence from M. Klippenstein
re: Pollution Probe's final overview.

'vLawyer SOMR:-0.10-Hrs " X.:170.00
201486>

To correspondence from: B. Fallis re
argument. draft.

Lawyer: EMC 1.50 Hrs X 170. OO

To reviewing and editing submissions
Lawyer: PR 6:10 Hrs X 330.00

‘T review and edit first draft’ To

completing final draft. :

Lawyer: QMR 7. 40 Hrs X 170.00

To review and edit first draft. To
completing final draft.

Lawyer: OMR. = 0.10-Hrs X:170.00:

To correspondence from. J. Rcszell re:

Lawyer QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 OO

To correspondence from J. Rosengarten
re: Bruce Power Submissions - Bruce to
Milton Project

Tawyer: QMR 0,10 Hrs.X 17000 .
‘To: correspondence “from J. Madden re:

. submigsiong of the Metls ‘Nation of

- Ontario.. : i

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00
To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
Fallis Group submissions.

CLawyer: OMR 10,10 Hrs X 170200 -
“To' correspondence from R Hornung re:

CanWEA‘s Subm1551on

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170 00

To correspondence from R. King re:
submissions of the Association of Power
Producers of Ontario.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00; ;
TO. correspondence from 2. Fallls res

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00

To correspondence from J. Rattray re:
submissions filed on behalf of the
TESO.

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X.170.00

To correspondence from G - Zacher re~“v

;wrltten subm1551ons of the OPK::

Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170. 00

To correspondence from B. Alexander
re: written argument on behalf of
Pollution Probe.

17.00

17.00

17.00

1411.00
1056.00

1700

17.00

017,00

17.00

1700

" 255.00

2013:00

1258.00

17,00

17.00

17,00

17.00

17;00

17.00

S17.0000

17.00

L1700

©17.00




Work-in-Progress

To Jul §/2008
ite Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Bal
i1 4/2008  Lawyer: QMR . 0.10 Hrs X 170:00 17.00
2014477 To .corréspondence . from A.:Monem re: :
- written submissions filed on behalf of
: :Saugeen 0jibway Nations.
"1l 4/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201450 To correspondence from D. MacIntosh
re: Argument of Energy Probe Research
Foundation.
Tl 6/2008 " Lawyer: QMR *°3.60 Hrs X 170.00 612,00
201405 To review of “intervenors’ submissions. g
11 6/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201451 To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
argument and cost submissions.
11 6/2008 . Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X :170.00:. 17:00
- 201469. To correspondence’ -from:D.. MacIntosh - '
. Trer-correct: verszon of Erergy Probe s
. submissions. o ik
11 6/2008 Lawyer: QMR 0.10 Hrs X 170.00 17.00
201482 To correspondence from P. Fallis re:
accounts of E. Brill.
Jul=7/2008 Lawyer: MLD 0:30 Hrs X 100.00 30L000 e
201490 To preparatlon of subm1351ons for e
L courier.io i S el
11 7/2008 Expense Recovery 03578 62.20
201491 Photocopies @ $0.20 -311 (submissions
and covering letter)
137 /2008  Lawyer s QMR- 5:80: Hrs X 170,00 986,00
201504 To preparation of Cost Siubmissions. i
Jul 7/2008 Lawyer: CLW 8.00 Hrs X 100.00 800.00
201509 To reconciliation and preparation of
disbursement cost submission. To
review and reconcililation of fee
submission .
Jul8/2008° Lawyer: QMR 0.10-Hrs X 170.00." A v, 17000
201489 To correspondence to OEB Ye: 10 hard - -
e ‘copies of submissions.. : S .
sul 8/2008 Expense Recovery 03579 25.00
201510 Courier Charge - Cost Submission
Unbilled Current 31-60 Days 61-90 Days  91-120 Days >=121 Days Total
st Entry Jul 8/2008 Hours 120.30 63.40 99.20 42.80 198.85 524.55
st Bld Jun 30/2008 + Fees 23638.00 12378.00 16792.50 6786.00 28432.50 88027.00
+ Disbs 4698.04 653.51 1912.18 1702.29 2253.71 11219.73
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 28336.04 13031.51 18704.68 8488.29 30686.21 99246.73
*#%% Work In Progress - Summary by Working Lawyer ***
Unbilled Current 31-60 Days 61-90 Days  91-120 Days >120 Days Total Percent
R - Heather J. Ross
mber of Matters 1 Hours 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 6.60 6.60 1.26
+ Fees 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 1.57
+ Disbs 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 1.40
PR - Paul Ross
“mber of Matters 1 Hours 23.55 10.00 0.10 0.00 6.35 40.00 7.63
+ Fees 7771.50 3300.00 33.00 0.00 1333.50 12438.00 14.13
+ Disbs 0.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 7771.50 3300.00 33.00 0.00 1333.50 12438.00 12.53
MW - Carole Weber
Number of Matters 1 Hours 8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 8.00 1.53
+ Fees 800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 .00 800.00 0.91
+ Disbs 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 800.00 0.81
iC - El1li M. Cohen
mber of Matters 1 Hours 1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.00 8.50 1.62
+ Fees 255.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 1165.00 1.32
+ Disbs 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 255.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 1165.00 1.17




Work-in-Progress

To Jul 8/2008

e Paid To/Fee/Time Che/Inv Retainer Disbursement Fee/Time Current A/R Bal.
Entry# Explanation Current Trust Ral

@

MR - Quinn Ross
umber of Matters 1 Hours 86.95 53.490 97.85 35.80 166.30 440.30 83.94
+ Fees 14781.50 9078.00 16634.50 6086.00 23767.00 70347.00 79.92
+ Disbs 4698.04 653.51 1912.1 1702.29 2253.71 11219.73 100.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 19479.54 9731.51 18546.68 T 788,29 26020.71 81566.73 82.19
MLD ~ Michelle Dekens
rumber of Matters 1 Hours 0.30 0.00 1.25 7.00 7.60 16.15 3.08
+ Fees 30.00 0.00 125.00 700.00 636.00 1491.00 1.69
+ Disbs 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 30.00 0.00 125.00 700.00 636.00 1491.00 1.50
CX - Jamill Cook
Number of Matters 1 Hours 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 0.95
+ Fees 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 0.45
+ Disbs 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 0.40
*** Work In Progress - Firm Summary ***
Unbilled Current 31-60 Days 61-90 Days  91-120 Days >120 Days Total
Hours 120.30 63.40 99.20 42.80 198.85 524.55
+ Fees 23638.00 12378.00 16792.50 6786.00 28432.50 88027.00
+ Disbs 4698.04 653.51 1912.18 1702.29 2253.71 11219.73
- Retainers 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total: 28336.04 13031.51 18704.68 8488.29 30686.21 99246.73
REPORT SELECTIONS
Report: Work-in-Progress
ayout Template: All
aquested by: QUINN
rinished: Tuesday, July 08, 2008 at 02:25:44 PM
Date Range: To Jul 8/2008
ztters: 2007-1977
lients: All
~elect From: Active, Inactive Matters
Major Clients: All Totals Only: No
"=gsponsible Lawyer: All Matter balances only: No
lient Intro Lawyer: All Incl. Time/Fee Entries: Yes
atter Intro Lawyer: All
Essigned Lawyer: All Incl. Retainers Entries: Yes
Working Lawyer: All Incl. Matters with Neg Unbld Disb: No
pe of Law: All Ignore matter if Fees less than: 0.00
itters Sort By:: Default Ignore matter if Disbs less than: 0.00
New Page for Each Lawyer: No Ignore matter if Chrgs less than: 0.00
New Page for Each Matter: No Incl. only Entries older than: 0
lient balances only: No BAge From: 7/8/2008
immarize by Working Lawyer: Yes Summarize by Resp. Lawyer: No
summarize by Client Intr. Lawyer: No Summarize by Matter Intr. Lawyer: No

Ver: 7.62b




LWYR
HJR
PR
CLw
EMC
QMR
MLD
JCX

OEB COST SUBMISSION - RATE VERIFICATION

]

| TOJUL7 | AUG 1 TO NOV 15 | NOV 16 - JUL 7
| HRS $ RATE | | HRS $ RATE | | HRS $ RATE
6.60 1,386.00 210.00 6.60 1,386.00  210.00 0.00 0.00 n/a
40.00 12,438.00 310.95 6.35 1,333.50  210.00 3365 11,104.50 330.00
8.00  800.00 100.00 8.00 800.00 100.00
8.50 1,165.00 137.06 7.00 91000  130.00 1.50 255.00 170.00
440.30 70,347.00 159.77 112.60 14,638.00  130.00 327.70  55,709.00 170.00
16.15 1,491.00  92.32 6.20  496.00 80.00 9.95 995.00 100.00
500  400.00  80.00 5.00  400.00 80.00 0.00 0.00 n/a

524.55 88,027.00 143.75 19,163.50 380.80  68,863.50

TO BE SUBMITTED




Work-in-Progress Summary by Responsible Lawyer

ALL DATES
ient Name Current  A/R
matter Description Disbs Current Trust
Wkg Lwyr  Hours Current  31-60 Days  61-90 Days 91-120 Days  >=121 Days Total % Last Time Entry
...sponsible Lawyer : Quinn Ross
Mient: 1732 OEB Litigation Group 874.35
I tter: 2007-1977 EXPROPRIATION OF LAND - HYDRO ONE 11219.73 0.00
"R 6.60 =0..00. 0,000 000 0700 . 1386.00. © 1386.00  1.57  Bug 31/2007 :
PR 40.00 7771.50 3300.00 33.00 0.00 1333.50 12438.00 14.13 Jul 4/2008
CLW: 8.00 800:00 0,00 S 0000 0.-00: 0,00 800.00.- 0,91 " Jul » 7/2008
. C 8.50 255.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 1165.00 1.32 Jul 4/2008
PR 440,30 14781.50 10098:09 1563150 6069.00 23767.00 70347.00:79.92 7 Jul 8/2008.
MLD 16.15 30.00 0.00 155.00 670.00 636.00 1491.00 1.69 Jul 7/2008
hjo S 5.00 0.00° 0.00. 000 0000 1400400 740000045 . Aug 116/2007 .
¢ zal 23638.00 13398.00 15819.50 6739.00 28432.50 88027.00
rirm Total 23638.00 13398.00 15819.50 6739.00 28432.50 88027.00 11219.73 ff'/&
...sponsible Lawyer : Quinn Ross *+% Sub-Totals by Working Lawyer ***
HIR 6.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 1.57 Aug 31/2007
40.00 7771.50 3300.00 33.00 0.00 1333.50 12438.00 14.13 Jul 4/2008
W 8.00 800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 800.00 0.91 Jul 7/2008
EMC 8.50 255.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 1165.00 1.32 Jul 4/2008
OMR 440.30 14781.50 10098.00 15631.50 6069.00 23767.00 70347.00 79.92 Jul 8/2008
{1 D 16.15 30.00 0.00 155.00 670.00 636.00 1491.00 1.69 Jul 7/2008
X 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 0.45 Aug 16/2007
Total 23638.00 13398.00 15819.50 6739.00 28432.50 88027.00
**+ Work In Progress - Summary by Working Lawyer ***
LaWyer Hours Current 31-60 Days  61-90 Days 91-120 Days >=121 Days Total % Disb
TR 6.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 1.57 0.00
! 40.00 7771.50 3300.00 33.00 0.00 1333.50 12438.00 14.13 0.00
W 8.00 800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 800.00 0.91 0.00
EMC 8.50 255.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 1165.00 1.32 0.00
OMR 440.30 14781.50 10098.00 15631.50 6069.00 23767.00 70347.00 79.92 11219.73
1D 16.15 30.00 0.00 155.00 670.00 636.00 1491.00 1.69 0.00
v X 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 0.45 0.00
Total 524.55 23638.00 13398.00 15819.50 6739.00 28432.50 88027.00 11219.73
**% Work In Progress - Summary by Responsible Lawyer ***
Lawyer Current 31-60 Days  61-90 Days 91-120 Days  »>=121 Days Total % Disb
QMR 23638.00 13398.00 15819.50 6739.00 28432.50 88027.00 100.00 11219.73
' otal 23638.00 13398.00 15819.50 6739.00 28432.50 88027.00 11219.73
LoPORT SELECTIONS
Report : Work-in-Progress Summary by Responsible Lawyer
i yout Template: All
I juested by: CAROLE
1 aished: Monday, July 07, 2008 at 04:49:20 PM
Date Range: ALL DATES
Matters: 2007-1977
( ients: All
b jor Clients: All Matter Intro Lawyer: All
Responsible Lawyer: All Totals Only: No
Client Intro Lawyer: All Client balances only: No
i signed Lawyer: All Matter balances only: No
v cking Lawyer: All Incl. Matters with Neg Unbld Disb: No
Type of Law: All Incl. Time/Fee Entries: Yes
Age From: 7/7/2008 Incl. Disbursment Entries: Yes
¢ lect From: Active, Inactive Matters
¢ ct by Resp Lawyer: Yes Ignore matter if Disbs less than: 0.00
New Page for Each Lawyer: No Ignore matter if Chrgs less than: 0.00
New Page for Each Matter: No Incl. only Entries older than: 0
¢ ymarize by Working Lawyer: Yes Ignore matter if Fees less than: 0.00
Yes Include Contingency Matters: Yes

¢ omarize by Resp. Lawyer:

X

7.62b




Jul  7/2008 The Ross Firm Page 1
Work-in-Progress Summary Dy Responsible Lawyer
o To Nov  15/2007

Jlient Name T Current A/ﬁ
Matter Description Disbs Current Trust
kg Lwyr  Hours Current 31-60 Days 61-90 Days 91-120 Days >=121 Days Total % Last Time Entry
Responsible Lawyer : Quinn Ross

‘lient: 1732 OEB Litigation Group 874.35
jatter: 2007-1977 EXPROPRIATION OF LAND - HYDRO ONE 10527.70 0.00
HJIR 6.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 7.23 Aug 31/2007

PR 6.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1333.50 1333.50 6.96 Aug 23/2007

'MC 7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 910.00 4.75 Sep- 20/2007

MR 112.60 0.00 0.00 .00 0.00 14638.00 14638.00 76.38 Nov 14/2007

MLD 6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 496.00 496 .00 2.59 Oct 18/2007

JCX 5.00 0.00 ¢.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 2.09 Aug 16/2007
otal 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19163.50 19163.50

rirm Total 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19163.50 19163.50 2067.98
_esponsible Lawyer : Quinn Ross **x Sub-Totals by Working Lawyer ***

wIR 6.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 7.23 Aug 31/2007

R 6.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1333.50 1333.50 6.96 Aug 23/2007

MC 7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 10.00 4.75 Sep 20/2007

QMR 112.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 14638.00 14638.00 76.38 Nov 14/2007
MLD 6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 496.00 496.00 2.59 Oct 18/2007

CX 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 2.09 Aug 16/2007
otal 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19163.50 19163.50
**+ Work In Progress - Summary by Working Lawyer ***

awyer Hours Current 31-60 Days 61-90 Days 91-120 Days  »>=121 Days Total % Disb

HJIR 6.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1386.00 1386.00 7.23 0.00

"R 6.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1333.50 1333.50 6.96 0.00

MC 7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 910.00 910.00 4.75 0.00

MR 112.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 14638.00 14638.00 76.38 2067.98
MLD 6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 496.00 496.00 2.59 0.00

JCX 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 400.00 2.09 0.00

otal 143.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19163.50 19163.50 2067.98

**x Work In Progress - Summary by Responsible Lawyer ***

awyer Current 31-60 Days 61-90 Days 91-120 Days >=121 Days Total % Disb

MR 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19163.50 19163.50 100.00 2067.98

rotal 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 19163.50 19163.50 2067.98
£PORT SELECTIONS

2port: Work-in-Progress Summary by Responsible Lawyer
Layout Template: All
Requested by: CAROLE

cinished: Monday, July 07, 2008 at 11:40:41 AM

ite Range: To Nov 15/2007

itters: 2007-1977
Clients: All
Major Clients: All Matter Intro Lawyer: All

2sponsible Lawyer: All Totals Only: No

Lient Intro Lawyer: All Client balances only: No
Assigned Lawyer: All Matter balances only: No
Working Lawyer: All Incl. Matters with Neg Unbld Disb: No

spe of Law: All Incl. Time/Fee Entries: Yes

je From: 7/7/2008 Incl. Disbursment Entries: Yes
select From: Active, Inactive Matters
Sort by Resp Lawyer: Yes Ignore matter if Disbs less than: 0.00

:w Page for Each Lawyer: No Ignore matter if Chrgs less than: 0.00

:w Page for Each Matter: No Incl. only Entries older than: 0
.ammarize by Working Lawyer: Yes Ignore matter if Fees less than: 0.00
Summarize by Resp. Lawyer: Yes Include Contingency Matters: Yes
Ter: 7.62b




SCHEDULE “E”




APPENDIX “B”
FORM 3

AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF COST CLAIM

EB2007-050 The Ross Firm Group
Board File Number Party Name

Items Claimed excluding GST
Legal/Consultant Fee + Disbursements = Net Sub-Total

$98.812.56 $10.182.52 $108,995.08

Goods and Services Tax

/ ’ £ o
i

.v.. Full Registrant ... Qualifying Non-Profit (GST @ 3%)
.. Unregistered (GST @ 6%) ... Tax Exempt (not GST)
.. Other GST at %

Total Cost Claim

Net Sub-Total +  Total GST Claimed = Total Cost Claim
$108,995.08 $4,890.86 X $1/,885 .94
I o \ | ”/ / j) Jj’/!\'l\,

L Carole Weber of the Townshlp of Ashfield-Colborne- Wawanosh in the County of Huron, MAKE
OATH AND SAY:

1. I am a representative of the above noted party (the “party”) and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein
2. I have examined the above Cost Claim and all of the documentation in support of it.
3. The above Cost Claim represents only costs incurred directly and necessarily by the party for the purpose of its intervention

in the Ontario Energy Board process (the file number of which is set out above)

SWORN (OR AFFIRMED) BEFORE ME at the Town of Goderich, in the County of Huron on
July 8, 2008.

COMMISSIONER for taking Affidavits Signature of Deponent






