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Reply to the Attention of:  Mike Richmond 
Direct Line: 416.865.7832 

   Email Address: mike.richmond@mcmillan.ca 
Our File No.: 267730 

Date: February 12, 2020 

BY RESS AND EMAIL 

Christine Long 
Registrar & Board Secretary 
Ontario Energy Board 
2300 Yonge Street 
26th Floor, Box 2319 
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 

Dear Ms. Long, 

Re: EB-2019-0018 - MANA M-Factor Cost Claim 
 

We are counsel to the intervenors Max Aicher (North America) Ltd. and Max Aicher (North 
America) Bloom Mill (“MANA”) in the above noted proceeding. We write further to the OEB’s 
Partial Decision and Order dated January 30, 2020. Please find enclosed MANA’s cost claim 
in the Board’s prescribed form, with detailed dockets attached, filed pursuant to the Ontario 
Energy Board’s Practice Direction on Cost Awards (the “Practice Direction”). 

The following are: (i) reasons as to why MANA is eligible for an award of costs pursuant to 
Rule 4.01 of the Practice Direction; and (ii) considerations in determining the amount of 
costs awarded to MANA pursuant to rule 5.01 of the Practice Direction: 

• Procedural Order #1 issued by the OEB states that MANA is eligible to apply for cost 
awards under the OEB’s Practice Direction on Costs Awards. 

• MANA contributed to the Board’s and parties’ understanding of the M-Factor 
application by posing over 100 specific and detailed interrogatories seeking clarity on 
ambiguous elements of the evidentiary record.  

• MANA participated responsibly in the process and took great care to limit its 
participation and costs to only what was absolutely necessary. For example, MANA 
elected to rely on transcripts of the Technical Conference rather than having counsel 
attend in person, having determined that Alectra’s responses to MANA’s detailed 
interrogatories provided sufficient information to be able to make submissions 
without having to attend the Technical Conference. 
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• MANA’s intervenor submission took into account the evidence before the OEB, 
including the Applicant’s responses to MANA’s written interrogatories and the steps 
of the proceeding which MANA did not attend. 

• The OEB issued its Partial Decision and Order, which, among other things, relied 
upon MANA’s arguments (pages 24-25) respecting the Applicant’s customer 
consultation. 

• The Partial Decision and Order rejected the Applicant’s proposed M-Factor as 
requested by MANA and others. 

• MANA did not engage in any inappropriate or irresponsible conduct or any conduct 
which tended to lengthen the process unnecessarily.  

• The OEB’s tariff rates are a relatively low percentage of MANA’s legal costs incurred.  
While MANA’s submissions were focused on its direct interests, its position benefitted 
many other ratepayers who were not participating in the proceeding. 

• The attached request for costs excludes all time spent on the capitalization and IRM 
portions of the application (which was minimal as MANA decided early on to focus 
only on the M-Factor). 

• The attached request for costs also excludes any claim for time spent on MANA’s 
intervener request or responding to the Applicant’s objections to the intervenor 
request. 

Yours truly, 
 

 

Mike Richmond 

 
 



Ontario Energy Board 
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS 

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements
This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost 
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other 
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the 
Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.___________________________________________________________________

r

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate:_________ Country:________________________
- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of 
Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.
Flowever, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File# EB- 2019-0018 Process: Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Party: Max Aicher (North America) Affiant's Name: Mike Richmond

HST Number: HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%

Full Registrant □ Qualifying Non-Profit □
Unregistered □ Tax Exempt □

Other □

Affidavit

1, Mike Richmond , of the City/Town of Toronto
in the Province/State of Ontario_______________________ , swear or affirm that:

1.1 am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2.1 have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements 
Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of 
Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the 
Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of ________________ Toronto______________
in the Province/State of ____________ Ontario____________, on February 10, 2020

(date)

c.
Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Page 1 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

 

3,799.98$                   

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
29,112.00$                 

118.65$                       

Max Aicher (North America)

Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application2019-0018

Attention: Mike Richmond

Legal/consultant/other fees

Payment Information

Total Cost Claim
HST

33,030.63$                 

Disbursements

Send payment to this address:  

Make cheque payable to:  McMillan LLP, in trust

181 Bay Street, 44th Floor
Toronto, Ontario
M5J 2T3
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one )
Year Called to 

Bar

Legal Counsel 2009
Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly Rate:  $290 
Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst:            CV attached 13.0%
           CV provided within previous 24 months

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST

0.10 290.00$       29.00$           3.77$            
290.00$       -$               -$              

3.40 290.00$       986.00$         128.18$       
290.00$       -$               -$              

14.70 290.00$       4,263.00$     554.19$       
290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              
290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              
Attendance 290.00$       -$               -$              

Proposal Preparation 290.00$       -$               -$              

30.50 290.00$       8,845.00$     1,149.85$    

290.00$       -$               -$              
290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              
290.00$       -$               -$              

-$               -$              

14,123.00$   1,835.99$    

Service Provider Name: Adam Chisholm

-$                             

-$                             

-$                             

Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation

ADR - Settlement Conference

Oral Hearing
9,994.85$                   

Case Management

Preparation
Attendance

Responses
Issues Conference

2019-0018 Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Max Aicher (North America)

15,958.99$                 TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES

Preparation
Attendance

Preparation -$                             
-$                             

-$                             

Argument

Other Conferences

Preparation

Preparation
Attendance -$                             

-$                             

11

Completed Years 
Practising/Years of Relevant 

Experience

-$                             

Technical Conference
Preparation
Attendance

1,114.18$                   
-$                             

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Total

32.77$                         
-$                             Attendance

4,817.19$                   
-$                             

Interrogatories
Preparation

-$                             

1 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

HST
1.30$            

-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              

Travel (Other): -$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              

1.30$            

TRUE FALSE FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE

-$                             
Other: -$                             

Service Provider Name: Adam Chisholm

Scanning/Photocopy

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed

-$                             

Transcripts

Travel: Rail
Travel: Car
Travel: Air

-$                             

TotalNet Cost
10.00$                                     

-$                             
11.30$                         

Parking

-$                             
-$                             

11.30$                         

Meals

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:

Other:

10.00$                                     

-$                             
-$                             

Printing
Courier
Telephone/Fax

2019-0018 Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Other:

Max Aicher (North America)

-$                             
-$                             
-$                             

-$                             

Taxi
Accommodation

-$                             
-$                             

2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one )
Year Called to 

Bar

Legal Counsel 2000
Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly Rate:  $330 
Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst:            CV attached 13.0%
           CV provided within previous 24 months

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST

0.20 330.00$       66.00$           8.58$            
2.60 330.00$       858.00$         111.54$       

1.40 330.00$       462.00$         60.06$          
330.00$       -$               -$              

15.60 330.00$       5,148.00$     669.24$       
0.80 330.00$       264.00$         34.32$          

330.00$       -$               -$              
330.00$       -$               -$              

330.00$       -$               -$              
Attendance 330.00$       -$               -$              

Proposal Preparation 330.00$       -$               -$              

21.70 330.00$       7,161.00$     930.93$       

330.00$       -$               -$              
330.00$       -$               -$              

330.00$       -$               -$              
330.00$       -$               -$              

-$               -$              

13,959.00$   1,814.67$    

2019-0018 Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Max Aicher (North America) Service Provider Name: Mike Richmond

Completed Years 
Practising/Years of Relevant 

Experience

Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation 74.58$                         
Attendance 969.54$                       

20

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Total

Interrogatories
Preparation 5,817.24$                   

Responses 298.32$                       

Technical Conference
Preparation 522.06$                       
Attendance -$                             

ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation -$                             

-$                             
-$                             

Issues Conference
Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

Other Conferences

Argument
Preparation 8,091.93$                   

Oral Hearing

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES 15,773.67$                 

Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

Case Management -$                             

1 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

HST
-$              
-$              

11.57$          
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              

Travel (Other): -$              
2.55$            

-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              

14.12$          

TRUE FALSE FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE

2019-0018 Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Scanning/Photocopy -$                             
Printing -$                             

Max Aicher (North America) Service Provider Name: Mike Richmond

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost Total

Transcripts -$                             
Travel: Air -$                             

Courier 89.00$                                     100.57$                       
Telephone/Fax -$                             

-$                             
Parking 19.65$                                     22.20$                         

Travel: Car -$                             
Travel: Rail -$                             

Meals -$                             
Other: -$                             

Taxi -$                             
Accommodation -$                             

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: 108.65$                                  122.77$                      

Other: -$                             
Other: -$                             

2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one )
Year Called to 

Bar

Legal Counsel
Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly Rate:  $100 
Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst:            CV attached 13.0%
           CV provided within previous 24 months

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST

100.00$       -$               -$              
100.00$       -$               -$              

100.00$       -$               -$              
100.00$       -$               -$              

100.00$       -$               -$              
100.00$       -$               -$              

100.00$       -$               -$              
100.00$       -$               -$              

100.00$       -$               -$              
Attendance 100.00$       -$               -$              

Proposal Preparation 100.00$       -$               -$              

10.30 100.00$       1,030.00$     133.90$       

100.00$       -$               -$              
100.00$       -$               -$              

100.00$       -$               -$              
100.00$       -$               -$              

-$               -$              

1,030.00$     133.90$       

2019-0018 Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Max Aicher (North America) Service Provider Name: Joseph Osborne

Completed Years 
Practising/Years of Relevant 

Experience

Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Total

Interrogatories
Preparation -$                             

Responses -$                             

Technical Conference
Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation -$                             

-$                             
-$                             

Issues Conference
Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

Other Conferences

Argument
Preparation 1,163.90$                   

Oral Hearing

TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES 1,163.90$                   

Preparation -$                             
Attendance -$                             

Case Management -$                             

1 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

HST
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              

Travel (Other): -$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              
-$              

-$              

FALSE TRUE FALSE FALSE TRUE FALSE

2019-0018 Alectra Utilities, M-Factor Rate Application

Scanning/Photocopy -$                             
Printing -$                             

Max Aicher (North America) Service Provider Name: Joseph Osborne

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost Total

Transcripts -$                             
Travel: Air -$                             

Courier -$                             
Telephone/Fax -$                             

-$                             
Parking -$                             

Travel: Car -$                             
Travel: Rail -$                             

Meals -$                             
Other: -$                             

Taxi -$                             
Accommodation -$                             

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: -$                                         -$                             

Other: -$                             
Other: -$                             

2 of 2



Work Date Timekeeper Name Work Hours Category Description
2019-09-18 Chisholm, Adam 1.00 ARG Discussions re evidence and submissions.
2019-09-19 Chisholm, Adam 0.50 ARG Discussions re evidence and submissions.
2019-09-20 Chisholm, Adam 1.00 ARG Calls re evidence and submissions.
2019-09-21 Chisholm, Adam 1.70 ARG Review of interrogatory responses and drafting submissions.
2019-09-23 Chisholm, Adam 3.60 ARG Discussions and drafting.
2019-09-24 Chisholm, Adam 1.10 ARG Discussions and drafting.
2019-09-26 Chisholm, Adam 0.10 ARG Correspondence re submissions.
2019-10-01 Chisholm, Adam 0.80 ARG Review and discuss filed evidence.
2019-10-02 Chisholm, Adam 1.30 ARG Discuss submissions
2019-10-04 Chisholm, Adam 0.80 ARG Discuss submissions
2019-11-08 Chisholm, Adam 3.10 ARG Review materials. Drafting submissions
2019-11-09 Chisholm, Adam 4.50 ARG Legal research. Drafting submissions.
2019-11-10 Chisholm, Adam 2.90 ARG Review materials. Drafting submissions
2019-11-11 Chisholm, Adam 3.30 ARG Drafting submissions.
2019-11-12 Chisholm, Adam 3.50 ARG Revisions to submissions
2019-11-14 Chisholm, Adam 1.30 ARG Revisions to submissions

30.50
2019-07-17 Chisholm, Adam 0.30 INTP Discuss approach.
2019-07-18 Chisholm, Adam 2.20 INTP Review application in preparation for development of interrogatories.
2019-07-20 Chisholm, Adam 1.50 INTP Review application and draft interrogatories.
2019-07-22 Chisholm, Adam 0.20 INTP Calls re submissions
2019-07-26 Chisholm, Adam 1.00 INTP Drafting interrogatories
2019-07-27 Chisholm, Adam 0.60 INTP Drafting interrogatories
2019-07-28 Chisholm, Adam 2.50 INTP Drafting interrogatories
2019-07-29 Chisholm, Adam 1.30 INTP Draft, review, and discuss Interrogatories.
2019-08-12 Chisholm, Adam 2.40 INTP Drafing further interrogatories
2019-08-15 Chisholm, Adam 0.50 INTP Discuss further interrogatories
2019-08-16 Chisholm, Adam 0.50 INTP Correspondence re interrogatories
2019-08-19 Chisholm, Adam 0.80 INTP Calls re interrogatories
2019-08-20 Chisholm, Adam 0.70 INTP Calls re interrogatories
2019-08-21 Chisholm, Adam 0.20 INTP Correspondence re interrogatories

14.70
2019-08-27 Chisholm, Adam 0.10 No Claim Correspondence re IRM materials.

0.10
2019-08-08 Chisholm, Adam 0.10 PHCP Correspondence re M-Factor Presentation Day.

0.10



2019-09-25 Chisholm, Adam 1.80 TECP Discuss participation in M-Factor Technical Conference
2019-09-27 Chisholm, Adam 1.60 TECP Discuss participation in M-Factor Technical Conference

3.40



Work Date Timekeeper Name Work Hours Category Description
2019-09-18 Richmond, Mike 1.90 ARG Discussions re evidence. Drafting submissions.
2019-09-19 Richmond, Mike 1.40 ARG Drafting submissions. Review materials on confidentiality of M-Factor documents.
2019-09-20 Richmond, Mike 1.50 ARG Call re submissions. Review materials.
2019-09-23 Richmond, Mike 0.90 ARG Review materials. Drafting. Conference call.
2019-09-24 Richmond, Mike 0.90 ARG Drafting submission. 
2019-09-25 Richmond, Mike 0.80 ARG Discussions re contents of evidence and submissions.
2019-09-26 Richmond, Mike 0.30 ARG Correspondence with OEB.
2019-10-01 Richmond, Mike 1.30 ARG Review and discuss filed evidence.
2019-10-02 Richmond, Mike 2.60 ARG Review and discuss filed evidence re M-Factor bill impacts.
2019-10-04 Richmond, Mike 1.70 ARG Review M-Factor bill impacts.
2019-11-04 Richmond, Mike 1.30 ARG Discussions re M-Factor bill impacts.
2019-11-06 Richmond, Mike 1.00 ARG Review and discussions re filed M-Factor evidence.
2019-11-07 Richmond, Mike 0.20 ARG Discussions re filed evidence.
2019-11-08 Richmond, Mike 2.10 ARG Discussions re submissions. Review evidence.
2019-11-11 Richmond, Mike 1.60 ARG Review and revise final argument submissions.
2019-11-12 Richmond, Mike 0.30 ARG Review research materials.
2019-11-13 Richmond, Mike 0.40 ARG Review updated final written argument draft.
2019-11-14 Richmond, Mike 1.30 ARG Correspondence and conference call to discuss final Intervenor Submissions.
2019-11-15 Richmond, Mike 0.20 ARG Reviewed intervenor submissions.

21.70
2019-07-05 Richmond, Mike 0.50 INTP Discuss M-Factor bill impact.
2019-07-09 Richmond, Mike 1.00 INTP Discuss approach.
2019-07-10 Richmond, Mike 2.10 INTP Review M-Factor application materials.
2019-07-12 Richmond, Mike 0.40 INTP Review M-Factor application materials.
2019-07-15 Richmond, Mike 0.30 INTP Discuss approach.
2019-07-17 Richmond, Mike 0.20 INTP Discuss approach.
2019-07-18 Richmond, Mike 0.10 INTP Discuss review of M-Factor application materials.
2019-07-22 Richmond, Mike 1.40 INTP Calls re submissions
2019-07-23 Richmond, Mike 0.10 INTP Review evidence.
2019-07-25 Richmond, Mike 0.20 INTP Correspondence re evidence.
2019-07-26 Richmond, Mike 0.10 INTP Correspondence re evidence.
2019-07-29 Richmond, Mike 5.00 INTP Draft, review, discuss and submit Interrogatories.
2019-08-12 Richmond, Mike 0.60 INTP Discuss further M-Factor Interrogatories
2019-08-14 Richmond, Mike 0.50 INTP Review and revise further M Factor interrogatories.
2019-08-15 Richmond, Mike 2.50 INTP Review and revise further M Factor interrogatories.
2019-08-16 Richmond, Mike 0.60 INTP Submit further M-Factor Interrogatories



15.60
2019-09-13 Richmond, Mike 0.80 INTR Receipt and initial review of M Factor interrogatory responses.

0.80
2019-06-28 Richmond, Mike 1.20 No Claim Intervenor Application.
2019-07-03 Richmond, Mike 2.50 No Claim Intervenor Application.
2019-07-04 Richmond, Mike 0.10 No Claim Respond to Alectra challenge to Intervenor Application
2019-08-09 Richmond, Mike 0.10 No Claim Review capitalization policy materials.
2019-08-26 Richmond, Mike 0.50 No Claim Review IRM materials.
2019-08-27 Richmond, Mike 1.70 No Claim Review IRM materials.
2019-08-29 Richmond, Mike 0.20 No Claim Discuss IRM materials.
2019-09-05 Richmond, Mike 0.10 No Claim Review IRM materials.

6.40
2019-08-07 Richmond, Mike 2.60 PHCA Attended Alectra’s M-Factor Presentation Day.

2.60
2019-08-08 Richmond, Mike 0.20 PHCP Correspondence re M-Factor Presentation Day.

0.20
2019-09-27 Richmond, Mike 1.30 TECP Discuss participation in M-Factor Technical Conference
2019-10-03 Richmond, Mike 0.10 TECP Discussion re technical conference emails.

1.40



Work Date Timekeeper Name Work Hours Category Description
2019-11-11 Osborne, Joseph 5.60 ARG Research and review.
2019-11-12 Osborne, Joseph 1.50 ARG Research and review.
2019-11-13 Osborne, Joseph 1.40 ARG Research and review.
2019-11-14 Osborne, Joseph 1.80 ARG Research and review.

10.30



Cost Index Work Date Cost Type Quantity Rate Amount Matter Name Narrative
36396129 2019-07-06 Courier 1.00 13.00 13.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7901267/""/2300 yonge street
36396119 2019-07-06 Courier 1.00 13.00 13.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7900083/""/2300 Yonge Street
36407707 2019-07-31 Courier 1.00 13.00 13.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7907253/""/2300 Yonge St
36407668 2019-07-31 Courier 1.00 8.00 8.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7909616/""/2300 Yonge St
36415213 2019-08-17 Courier 1.00 8.00 8.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7915962/""/2300 Yonge St
36416831 2019-08-24 Courier 1.00 13.00 13.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7917173/""/2300 Yonge St
36445291 2019-09-23 Courier 1.00 13.00 13.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7928449/""/2300 Yonge St
36512024 2019-11-16 Courier 1.00 8.00 8.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Blizzard Courier Service Ltd. - #7947719/""/2300 Yonge St



 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Original Cost Card Description Timekeeper Name Work Date Work Amount Tax Code Narrative Invoice Number Index
36416693 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018 Richmond, Mike 2019-08-07 19.65 HST Mike Richmond - /47719/Parking charges re Alectra OEB Hearing 1209977 313091



  

 

 

 

 



Cost Index Work Date Cost Type Quantity Rate Amount Matter Name Narrative
36482313 2019-11-15 Photocopy 36.00 0.25 9.00 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018  Photocopying:36 Pages. Shiaheen Rana
36482312 2019-11-15 Photocopy 2.00 0.25 0.50 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018  Photocopying:2 Pages. Shiaheen Rana
36482255 2019-11-15 Photocopy 2.00 0.25 0.50 Alectra 2019 Rate Application EB-2019-0018  Photocopying:2 Pages. Shiaheen Rana




