

March 5, 2020

Ms. Christine Long Registrar & Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Re: Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited 2020-2024 Custom Price Cap Index (PCI) Application AMPCO Cost Claim Board File No. EB-2018-0165

Dear Ms. Walli:

Attached please find AMPCO's cost claim in the above proceeding.

AMPCO's intervention was focused primarily on key cost drivers in the application including THESL's proposed \$2.83 billion capital plan, the most significant driver of the proposed rate increases. AMPCO also focused on other areas of interest to AMPCO's members including reliability, power quality and customer engagement. AMPCO worked with other parties on the issues and focused its analysis on areas not covered by others in order to minimize duplication.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions or require further information.

Best Regards,

(Original Signed By)

Colin Anderson President Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario

Copy to: Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate: Country: - A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

| File # EB- | - 2018-0165 | | | Process: Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited | | | | |
|------------|-------------|--|--|--|---|--------------------|--|--|
| Party: | AMP | со | | Affiant's Name: | | | | |
| HST Numbe | r: | R137667424 Full Registrant Unregistered Other | | | Rate Ontario: _ ing Non-Profit Tax Exempt | <u>13.00%</u> ✓ | | |

Affidavit

| Ι, | | , of the City/Town of | |
|-------------|---------------|-----------------------|-------------------------|
| in the Prov | ince/State of | | , swear or affirm that: |

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of

in the Province/State of

on

(date)

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2018-0165

Process: Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited

Party: AMPCO

| Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed | | | | | | |
|---|----|---|--|--|--|--|
| Legal/consultant/other fees | \$ | - | | | | |
| Disbursements | \$ | - | | | | |
| HST | \$ | - | | | | |
| Total Cost Claim | \$ | - | | | | |

| Payment Information | | | | | | | |
|-------------------------------|---|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Make cheque payable to: | Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario | | | | | | |
| Send payment to this address: | 65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510 Toronto, Ontario M5H 2M5 | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | |

AMPCO Summary of Disbursements Being Claimed

| Legal/Consultant/Other Fees - Part 1 Disbursements | \$16,312.50 |
|---|--------------|
| HST | \$2,120.63 |
| | \$18,433.13 |
| Legal/Consultant/Other Fees - Part 2 Disbursements | \$84,727.50 |
| HST | \$11,014.58 |
| | \$95,742.08 |
| Total Cost Claim | \$114,175.20 |



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File # EB- 2018-0165 Proce | | | Process: Toronto Hydro-Electric System Limited | | | | | | |
|------------------------------|--------------|--------|---|-------|------------|------|-------------------------------|-------|-----------|
| Party: AMPCO | | | Service P | rov | ider Name: | She | elley Grice, | P. Er | ıg. |
| | | | | | | | Complet | ed Ye | ars |
| SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE | (check one) | Yea | r Called to Bar | | | F | Practising/Yea | | |
| Legal Counsel | | | Dai | 1 | | | Exper | 9 | |
| - | | | | ļ | | | L | 9 | |
| Articling Student/Paralegal | | | | | | | Llaumh - Data | | \$290 |
| Consultant | | | | | | | Hourly Rate: | | \$290 |
| Analyst | | | | | | | | | 12.00/ |
| For Consultant/Analyst: | | | | - | | harg | ed (<i>enter %</i>): | - | 13.0% |
| | | ided \ | within previo | ous 2 | 4 months | | | | |
| S | tatement o | of Fe | es Being | Cla | imed | _ | | | |
| | Hours | Но | urly Rate | | Subtotal | | HST | | Total |
| Pre-hearing Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Technical Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Interrogatories | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 53.75 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 15,587.50 | \$ | 2,026.38 | \$ | 17,613.88 |
| Responses | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Issues Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| ADR - Settlement Conference | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Proposal Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Argument | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Oral Hearing | | | | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Other Conferences | | | | l | | | | | |
| Preparation | 2.50 | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | 725.00 | \$ | 94.25 | \$ | 819.25 |
| Attendance | | \$ | 290.00 | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| Case Management | | | | \$ | - | \$ | - | \$ | - |
| TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | | 16 212 50 | \$ | 2 120 62 | | 10 400 40 |
| I UTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | | Ş | 16,312.50 | ļ | 2,120.63 | \$ | 18,433.13 |

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5 416-694-3917, shelley.grice@rogers.com

INVOICE #A20-03

March 1, 2020

AMPCO Thomson Building 65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510 Toronto, Ontario M5H 2M5

Attention: Mr. Colin Anderson, President

Re: Toronto Hydro-Electric Systems Limited EB-2018-0165

| Description | Charge Type | Hours | Rate | Amount |
|--------------------------|------------------|-------|----------|-------------|
| Professional Services of | | | | |
| Shelley Grice | Preparation | 2.50 | \$290.00 | \$725.00 |
| | Attendance - SC | | \$290.00 | \$0.00 |
| | Attendance - OH | | \$290.00 | \$0.00 |
| | Preparation - IR | 53.75 | \$290.00 | \$15,587.50 |
| | | | | |
| Sub-Total | | | | \$16,312.50 |
| HST on Services | | | | \$2,120.63 |
| | | | | |
| Disbursements | | | | |
| HST on Disbursements | | | | |
| | | | | |
| GST # 817042757RT0001 | | 56.25 | TOTAL | \$18,433.13 |
| | | | | |

Details are included in the attached time sheet. Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Shellygrice

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

| Shelley Grice | | | | | | | |
|--------------------|--|----------------------------------|---------|--|--|--|--|
| PROJECT TIME | SHEET | DATE | INVOICE | | | | |
| EB-2018-0165 | | 2019-12-31 | #A2003 | | | | |
| Foronto Hydro-Ele | ctric System Limited | | | | | | |
| PROJECT TIME SHEET | | | | | | | |
| DATE | TASK DESCRIPTION | CHARGE TYPE | Hours | | | | |
| 2018-09-28 | Preparation; Review scope of Application; Review updates; Prepare Letter of Intervention; Discuss w/client | Preparation | 0.75 | | | | |
| 2018-10-29 | Review PO#1; Review correspondence | Preparation | 0.25 | | | | |
| 2018-11-14 | Review confidentiality requests & parties' submissions | Preparation | 0.25 | | | | |
| 2018-11-28 | Review Decision on Confidentiality & PO#2; Review correspondence | Preparation | 0.25 | | | | |
| 2018-12-05 | Review Large User 5-year rate impacts & email AMPCO members | Preparation | 0.75 | | | | |
| 2018-12-06 | Review & consider evidence; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 4.25 | | | | |
| 2018-12-10 | Review & consider evidence; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 3.75 | | | | |
| 2018-12-11 | Review & consider evidence; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 4.75 | | | | |
| 2018-12-12 | Review & consider evidence; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 5.00 | | | | |
| 2018-12-15 | Review & consider evidence; Research previous THESL cases/decisions; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 8.75 | | | | |
| 2018-12-16 | Review & consider evidence; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 8.00 | | | | |
| 2018-12-17 | Review & consider evidence; Research ACA approaches in other cases; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 9.75 | | | | |
| 2018-12-18 | Review & consider evidence; Prepare interrogatories | Interrogatories - Preparation | 9.50 | | | | |
| 2018-12-19 | Review OEB Decision Confidentiality; Review correspondence; Review OEB Staff Community Report | Preparation | 0.25 | | | | |
| | TOTAL | | 56.25 | | | | |

Г



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

| File # EB- 2018-0165 Process: Tot | | | | -Electric Syster | n Limited | |
|---|--------------|---|---------------|--------------------|-----------------|--|
| | | | | | | |
| Party: <u>AMPCO</u> | | Service Provider Name: Shelley Grice, P. Eng. | | | | |
| | | | | • | ed Years | |
| | | Year Called to | | - | ars of Relevant | |
| SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE | (check one) | Bar | 1 | | rience | |
| Legal Counsel | | | 1 | 2 | 0 | |
| Articling Student/Paralegal | | | | | | |
| Consultant | | | | Hourly Rate: | \$330 | |
| Analyst | | | | | | |
| For Consultant/Analyst: | CV attac | | | narged (enter %): | 13.0% | |
| | CV prov | ided within previ | ous 24 months | | | |
| S | tatement o | of Fees Being | Claimed | | | |
| | Hours | Hourly Rate | Subtotal | HST | Total | |
| Pre-hearing Conference | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ 330.00 | \$- | \$- | \$- | |
| Attendance | | \$ 330.00 | \$- | \$- | \$- | |
| Technical Conference | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 19.75 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 6,517.50 | \$ 847.28 | \$ 7,364.78 | |
| Attendance | 31.50 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 10,395.00 | \$ 1,351.35 | \$ 11,746.35 | |
| Interrogatories | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 6.00 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 1,980.00 | \$ 257.40 | \$ 2,237.40 | |
| Responses | 23.50 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 7,755.00 | \$ 1,008.15 | \$ 8,763.15 | |
| Issues Conference | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 0.50 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 165.00 | \$ 21.45 | \$ 186.45 | |
| Attendance | 4.00 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 1,320.00 | \$ 171.60 | \$ 1,491.60 | |
| ADR - Settlement Conference | | | | | | |
| Preparation | | \$ 330.00 | \$- | \$- | \$- | |
| Attendance | | \$ 330.00 | \$- | \$- | \$- | |
| Proposal Preparation | | \$ 330.00 | \$- | \$- | \$- | |
| Argument | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 60.25 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 19,882.50 | \$ 2,584.73 | \$ 22,467.23 | |
| Oral Hearing | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 46.25 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 15,262.50 | \$ 1,984.13 | \$ 17,246.63 | |
| Attendance | 61.25 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 20,212.50 | \$ 2,627.63 | \$ 22,840.13 | |
| Other Conferences | | | | | | |
| Preparation | 1.75 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 577.50 | \$ 75.08 | \$ 652.58 | |
| Attendance | 2.00 | \$ 330.00 | \$ 660.00 | \$ 85.80 | \$ 745.80 | |
| Case Management | | | \$ - | \$- | \$- | |
| TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES | | | \$ 84,727.50 | \$ 11,014.58 | \$ 95,742.08 | |

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5 416-694-3917, shelley.grice@rogers.com

INVOICE #A20-04

March 1, 2020

AMPCO Thomson Building 65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510 Toronto, Ontario M5H 2M5

Attention: Mr. Colin Anderson, President

| Re: | Toronto Hydro-Electric Systems Limited - 5 Year CIR |
|-----|---|
| | EB-2018-0165 |

| Description | Charge Type | Hours | Rate | Amount |
|--------------------------|------------------|--------|----------|----------------------|
| Professional Services of | | | | |
| Shelley Grice | Preparation | 8.25 | \$330.00 | \$2,722.50 |
| | Preparation - TC | 19.75 | \$330.00 | \$6,517.50 |
| | Attendance - TC | 31.50 | \$330.00 | \$10,395.00 |
| | Preparation - OH | 46.25 | \$330.00 | \$15,262.50 |
| | Attendance - OH | 61.25 | \$330.00 | \$20,212.50 |
| | Preparation - IR | 29.50 | \$330.00 | \$9,735.00 |
| | Argument | 60.25 | \$330.00 | \$19 <i>,</i> 882.50 |
| Sub-Total | | | | \$84,727.50 |
| HST on Services | | | | \$11,014.58 |
| Disbursements | | | | |
| HST on Disbursements | | | | |
| GST # 817042757RT0001 | | 256.75 | TOTAL | \$95,742.08 |

Details are included in the attached time sheet. Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Shellyguice

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

| Shelley Grice | | | | |
|-------------------|--|--|---------|--|
| PROJECT TIME | SHEET | DATE | INVOICE | |
| EB-2018-0165 | | 2020-03-01 | #A2004 | |
| Toronto Hydro-Ele | ectric System Limited - 5 Year CIR | | | |
| PROJECT TIME SHE | ET | | | |
| DATE | TASK DESCRIPTION | CHARGE TYPE | Hours | |
| 2019-01-22 | Review correspondence; Review scope of evidence update; Review & consider Draft Issues List; Prepare comments | Issues Conference - Preparation | 0.50 | |
| 2019-01-24 | Review & consider interrogatory responses | Interrogatories - Responses | 3.00 | |
| 2019-01-25 | Attend Issues Conference (dial in); Discussion w/parties | Issues Conference - Attendance | 4.00 | |
| 2019-01-31 | Review & consider interrogatory responses; Review scope & details of update | Interrogatories - Responses | 3.00 | |
| 2019-02-04 | Review & consider interrogatory responses; Review updates | Interrogatories - Responses | 2.75 | |
| 2019-02-05 | Review & consider interrogatory responses: Review PO#3; Review Approved Issues List | Interrogatories - Responses | 3.25 | |
| 2019-02-09 | Review & consider interrogatory responses | Interrogatories - Responses | 3.00 | |
| 2019-02-11 | Review & consider interrogatory responses; Call w/Mr. Rubenstein | Interrogatories - Responses | 5.75 | |
| 2019-02-12 | Review & consider interrogatory responses | Interrogatories - Responses | 2.75 | |
| 2019-02-13 | Review THESL correspondence re: confidentiality; Prepare AMPCO letter re: Technical Conference Topic Areas; Prepare for Technical Conference | Technical Conference - Preparation | 1.25 | |
| 2019-02-14 | Prepare for Technical Conference; Meeting w/M. Rubesnstein re: issues | Technical Conference - Preparation | 1.25 | |
| 2019-02-15 | Prepare for Technical Conference; Review witness panels | Technical Conference - Preparation | 1.50 | |
| 2019-02-17 | Prepare for Technical Conference | Technical Conference - Preparation | 2.25 | |
| 2019-02-18 | Prepare for Technical Conference; discussion w/intervenors | Technical Conference - Preparation | 8.00 | |
| 2019-02-19 | Preparation; Attend Technical Conference Day #1; Discussion w/parties | Technical Conference - Attendance | 8.00 | |

| Prepare for Technical Conference Day #2 | Technical | 1.50 |
|---|--|---|
| | Conference - | |
| | Preparation | |
| Preparation; Attend Technical Conference Day #2; | Technical | 8.00 |
| discussion w/parties | Conference - | |
| | Attendance | |
| Attend Technical Conference Day #3; emails | Technical | 8.00 |
| | Conference - | |
| | Attendance | |
| Prepare for Technical Conference Day #4 | Technical | 3.00 |
| | Conference - | |
| | Preparation | |
| Attend Technical Conference Day #4 | | 7.50 |
| Attend reenned concrete buy hy | | 7.50 |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | 1.00 |
| letter | | |
| | Preparation | |
| Review PO#4; Consider update & oral hearing dates | Preparation | 0.25 |
| Prepare slides on THESL proceeding and impact on | Preparation | 0.50 |
| Large Users for AMPCO AGM on May 9 | | |
| Attend THESL Presentation; Discuss issues w/parties | Preparation | 2.00 |
| Review & consider evidence update | Interrogatories - | 2.00 |
| | | |
| | - | 1.00 |
| | 1 | |
| Prepare interrogatories on THESL Update | - | 3.00 |
| | Preparation | |
| Review evidence; Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing | 1.50 |
| | Preparation | |
| Prepare for Oral Hearing; Research prior THESL | Oral Hearing | 2.50 |
| | - | |
| | | 3.00 |
| - | - | 5.00 |
| | | |
| | - | 1.50 |
| | Preparation | |
| Review evidence; Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing | 2.00 |
| | Preparation | |
| Review evidence; Prepare for Oral Hearing; Meet | Oral Hearing | 2.00 |
| w/M. Rubenstein | Preparation | |
| | | |
| Review evidence; Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing | 1.00 |
| | Preparation; Attend Technical Conference Day #2; discussion w/parties Attend Technical Conference Day #3; emails Prepare for Technical Conference Day #4 Attend Technical Conference Day #4 Attend Technical Conference Day #4 Finalize questions on UMS Report; Prepare AMPCO letter Review PO#4; Consider update & oral hearing dates Prepare slides on THESL proceeding and impact on Large Users for AMPCO AGM on May 9 Attend THESL Presentation; Discuss issues w/parties Review & consider evidence update Review THESL & consider THESL Update and prepare interrogatories Prepare interrogatories on THESL Update Review evidence; Prepare for Oral Hearing Prepare for Oral Hearing; Research prior THESL applications Prepare for Oral Hearing; Call w/M. Rubenstein; who does what Calls, emails with THESL, discussion w/client re: U-AMPCO-124; Call w/M. Rubenstein | Conference - PreparationPreparation; Attend Technical Conference Day #2; discussion w/partiesTechnical Conference - AttendanceAttend Technical Conference Day #3; emailsTechnical Conference - AttendancePrepare for Technical Conference Day #4Technical Conference - PreparationAttend Technical Conference Day #4Technical Conference - AttendancePrepare for Technical Conference Day #4Technical Conference - PreparationAttend Technical Conference Day #4Technical Conference - AttendanceFinalize questions on UMS Report; Prepare AMPCO letterTechnical Conference - PreparationReview PO#4; Consider update & oral hearing datesPreparationPrepare slides on THESL proceeding and impact on Large Users for AMPCO AGM on May 9PreparationAttend THESL Presentation; Discuss issues w/partiesPreparationReview & consider evidence update Interrogatories on THESL Update and prepare Interrogatories on THESL Update PreparationInterrogatories - PreparationPrepare for Oral Hearing; Research prior THESL applicationsOral Hearing PreparationPrepare for Oral Hearing; Call w/M. Rubenstein; who Oral Hearing PreparationOral Hearing PreparationPrepare for Oral Hearing; Call w/M. Rubenstein; who Oral Hearing PreparationOral Hearing PreparationReview evidence; Prepare for Oral Hearing PreparationOral Hearing PreparationPrepare for Oral Hearing; Call w/M. Rubenstein; who Oral Hearing PreparationOral Hearing PreparationPrepare for Oral Hearing; Call w/M. Rubenstei |

| 2019-06-19 | Prepare for Oral Hearing; Meeting with Board Staff | Oral Hearing | 1.00 |
|------------|--|------------------------------|------|
| | and M. Rubenstein to discuss Oral Hearing scope | Preparation | |
| 2019-06-24 | Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing Preparation | 5.00 |
| 2019-06-25 | Prepare for Oral Hearing; Prepare compendium | Oral Hearing Preparation | 4.00 |
| 2019-06-26 | Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing Preparation | 2.00 |
| 2019-06-27 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; discuss w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 8.00 |
| 2019-06-28 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 7.00 |
| 2019-07-01 | Prepare for Oral Hearing; emails; Call w/M. Rubenstein | Oral Hearing Preparation | 0.75 |
| 2019-07-02 | Prepare for Oral Hearing; Prepare compendium | Oral Hearing Preparation | 6.00 |
| 2019-07-03 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 8.00 |
| 2019-07-04 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 8.00 |
| 2019-07-04 | Prepare for Oral Hearing; Prepare compendium | Oral Hearing Preparation | 2.00 |
| 2019-07-05 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 7.25 |
| 2019-07-07 | Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing Preparation | 4.00 |
| 2019-07-08 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 6.50 |
| 2019-07-09 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 7.00 |
| 2019-07-10 | Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing Preparation | 5.00 |
| 2019-07-11 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 8.00 |
| 2019-07-11 | Prepare for Oral Hearing | Oral Hearing Preparation | 3.00 |
| 2019-07-12 | Preparation: Attend Oral Hearing; meet w/parties | Oral Hearing - Attendance | 1.50 |
| 2019-07-30 | Prepare argument outline; Call w/M. Rubenstein | Argument - Preparation | 1.50 |
| 2019-08-06 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final submissions | Argument - Preparation | 3.00 |
| 2019-08-07 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final submissions | Argument - Preparation | 2.75 |
| 2019-08-08 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final submissions; Review undertakings | Argument - Preparation | 7.50 |

| 2019-08-10 | Review & analyze evidence; Review THESL Argument- | Argument - | 5.50 |
|------------|---|-------------|--------|
| | in-Chief; Prepare final submissions; Call w/M. | Preparation | |
| | Rubenstein | | |
| 2019-08-11 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final | Argument - | 2.00 |
| | submissions; Discuss THESL Argument w/client | Preparation | |
| 2019-08-15 | Review & analyze evidence; Review & compare past | Argument - | 3.75 |
| | evidence: Prepare final submissions | Preparation | |
| 2019-08-20 | Review & analyze evidence; Review & compare past | Argument - | 3.50 |
| | evidence: Prepare final submissions | Preparation | |
| 2019-08-25 | Review & analyze evidence; Review Board Staff | Argument - | 4.00 |
| | Submission; Review transcripts: Prepare final | Preparation | |
| | submissions | | |
| 2019-08-26 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final | Argument - | 9.75 |
| | submissions; Call w/J. Girvan | Preparation | |
| 2019-08-27 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final | Argument - | 6.00 |
| | submissions | Preparation | |
| 2019-08-28 | Review & analyze evidence; Prepare final | Argument - | 11.00 |
| | submissions | Preparation | |
| 2020-01-10 | Prepare Briefing Note on Application/Decision for | Preparation | 1.00 |
| | AMPCO Board | | |
| | TOTAL | | 256.75 |