Scott Pollock T 613.787.3541 spollock@blg.com Borden Ladner Gervais LLP World Exchange Plaza 100 Queen St, Suite 1300 Ottawa, ON, Canada K1P 1J9 T 613.237.5160 F 613.230.8842 F 613.787.3558 (IP) blg.com



Our File # 339583-000260

#### By electronic filing

May 14, 2020

Christine E. Long Registrar and Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, Suite 2701 Toronto ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Long,

Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. ("EGI")
Open Bill Access Services

**Board File #:** EB-2018-0319

Pursuant to the Board's *Decision and Order* dated April 16, 2020 in the above-noted proceeding, we enclose a Cost Claim on behalf of our client, Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters ("CME").

I respectfully ask that the Board accept the Cost Claim late, and please accept my sincere apology for the delay in submitting the Cost Claim. The oversight was a result of staffing changes brought on by Covid-19 and resulted in, unfortunately, missing the deadline to submit a cost claim as noted in the Board's *Decision and Order*. I apologize for the inconvenience this has caused.

A copy of this Cost Claim has been forwarded to EGI.

All

Please contact the me if you have any questions or require any additional information.

Yours very truly,

Scott Pollock

Enclosure

c. Lorraine Chiasson (EGI)

111831618:v1



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions						
- Required data	a input is indicated by yellow-shaded f	ields. Formulas a	are embedded in the form to	assist with calculat	ions.	
- All claims mu	st be in Canadian dollars. If applicabl	e, state exchange	e rate and country of initial c	urrency.		
		Rate:		Country:		
- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal. However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.  - The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.  - A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.  Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.						
File # EB-	2018-0319	Process:	Enbridge Gas Inc Ope	en Bill Access Se	ervices	
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Ex	porters	Affiant's Name:	Scott Pollock		
HST Numbe	r: 10807 5482 RT0001		нѕт	Rate Ontario:	13.00%	
	Full Registrant		Qualify	ing Non-Profit		
	Unregistered		,	Tax Exempt		
	Other	<b>V</b>				
			A CC			
Affidavit						
l,	Scott Pollock		, of the City of	Ottawa		
in the Prov	ince of	Ontario		, swear or affi	rm that:	
1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.  2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".  3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.						
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.						
Signature of Affiant						
SWORN BEFORE ME over video conference this 14th day of May 2020. The Affiant was located in Ottawa, Ontario;						
the Commissione, Emma Blanchard, was located in Ottawa, Ontario.						

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB- 2018-0319 Process: Enbridge Gas Inc. - Open Bill Access Services

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed				
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$5,457.00			
Disbursements	\$0.00			
HST	\$709.41			
Total Cost Claim	\$6,166.41			

#### **Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

Send payment to this address: Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

**Attention: Emma Blanchard** 

**World Exchange Plaza** 

100 Queen Street, Suite 1300

Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	2018-0319	Process:	: Enbridge Gas Inc Open Bill Access Services				
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & E	xporters	Service Provider Name: Scott Pollock				
	Service Provider Type	(check one)	•	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Prac Years of Relevant Exp	•
	Legal Counsel	<b>J</b>		2016		3	
	<b>Articling Student/Paralegal</b>						
	Consultant				H	lourly Rate: \$17	0.00
	Analyst						
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attached		HST Rate Charg	ged (enter %) 1	3%
			CV provided	within previous	24 months		
	S	tatement o	f Fees Bei	ng Claimed			
		Hours	Hourly rate	Subtotal	HST	Total	
Pre-Hearing	Conference						
	Preparation		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
	Attendance		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
Technical C	Conference						
	Preparation		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
	Attendance		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
Interrogato	•	5.70	\$170.00	\$969.00	\$125.97	\$1,	094.97
	Responses		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
Issues Conf			4470.00	40.00	40.00		¢0.00
	Preparation		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
	Attendance		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
ADD Cottle	ment Conference						
ADK - Settle		5.00	\$170.00	\$850.00	\$110.50	ć	960.50
	Preparation Attendance	21.40	\$170.00	\$3,638.00	\$472.94		110.94
	Proposal Preparation	21.40	\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	74,	\$0.00
	rroposarrreparation		7170.00	70.00	70.00		70.00
Argument	Preparation		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
7			7 - 7 - 0.00	70.00	φσ.σσ		7
Oral Hearing	Preparation		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
	Attendance		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
					-		
Other Confe	rences						
	Preparation		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
	Attendance		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
Case Mana	gement		\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00
TOTAL SER	VICE PROVIDER FEES			\$5,457.00	\$709.41	\$6,	166.41

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS Detail of Fees being Claimed

File #: EB-2018-0319 **Process:** Enbridge Gas Inc. – Open Bill Access Services Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Name: Scott Pollock Jan 18-19 1.2 Interrogatory Prep Reviewing application 3.3 Interrogatory Prep Jan 28-19 Reviewing application and drafting interrogatories Settlement Conf Prep Feb 8-19 Reviewing interrogatory responses 1.4 Mar 6-19 Preparing for settlement conference 0.5 Settlement Conf Prep Settlement Conf Attend Mar 6-19 Attending settlement conference 4.4 Interrogatory Prep May 10-19 Reviewing additional interrogatories; drafting letter to OEB 1.2 Settlement Conf Attend June 12-19 Attending the facilitated meeting 5.3 Settlement Conf Prep June 26-19 Telephone call with client; drafting position statement re: 8.0 settlement terms Settlement Conf Prep July 24-19 Reviewing party settlement summary circulated by A. Pride 0.4 Settlement Conf Prep July 26-19 Preparing for settlement conference 0.5 Attending settlement conference Settlement Conf Attend July 26-19 5.7 0.2 Settlement Conf Prep July 31-19 Telephone call with client re: settlement outcomes Sep 3-19 Reviewing Enbridge updated positions 0.5 Settlement Conf Prep Settlement Conf Prep Sep 4-19 Telephone call to client; preparing for settlement conference 0.5 Settlement Conf Attend Sep 4-19 Attending settlement conference 6.0 Settlement Conf Prep Sep 19-19 0.1 Reviewing of settlement proposal language Reviewing continued settlement discussions Settlement Conf Prep Sep 25-19 0.1 **Total Hours for Scott Pollock:** 32.1 **Hours** <u>Fees</u> Interrogatory Prep 5.7 x \$170.00/hr =\$969.00 x \$170.00/hr =Settlement Conf. Prep 5.0 \$850.00

Settlement Conf. Attend

21.4

32.1

x \$170.00/hr =

**Total Fees for Scott Pollock:** 

\$3,638.00

\$5,457.00



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB- 2018-0319 Process: Enbridge Gas Inc. - Open Bill Access Services

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters Service Provider Name: Scott Pollock

Statement of D	isbursements Being Clai	med	
	Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopying		\$0.00	\$0.00
Printing		\$0.00	\$0.00
Courier		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone/Fax		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone Conference Calls		\$0.00	\$0.00
Telephone Long Distance (from hotel bill)		\$0.00	\$0.00
Transcripts		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Air		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Car		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Rail		\$0.00	\$0.00
Travel: Other		\$0.00	\$0.00
Parking		\$0.00	\$0.00
Тахі		\$0.00	\$0.00
Accommodation		\$0.00	\$0.00
Meals		\$0.00	\$0.00
Other		\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00



#### Upload your documents here

Click on the "Choose file" button to select a file from your computer, and then on the "Upload" button. To add a second or third file repeat the same steps after the selected file has finished uploading. An error message will be displayed if you try to upload a file with the same name twice.

If you want to preview a file prior to loading it please DO NOT click "Open" or double-click on the highlighted file from the "Choose File" window. A single right-click of the mouse will bring forward an extra window with various options and properties. Selecting "Open" from the properties window menu will allow you to preview the file.

Please try to limit the length of the file names selected for upload to no more than 70 characters.

Important - Please do not use special characters in the file name or extension ( i.e. ' ~ # \$ % ^ & \* [ ] { } | \ ). That includes single quotes. Example: Manager's, John's, etc.

Support Incident Code: 40617 Supporting Document Submission for Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters, Case Number EB-2018-0319

Choose File No file chosen

Upload

The selected file 'EB-2018-0319 - CME Cost Claim.pdf' was added successfully. Thank you. To upload another file for the same incident click the 'Choose file' button again and then the UPLOAD button.

Please select Submit to finish the process.

Current file: File name: EB-2018-0319 - CME Cost Claim.pdf File size: 395.09KB File type: application/pdf

List of uploaded files: EB-2018-0319 - CME Cost Claim.pdf|

Submit