

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

File #: EB-2019-0082

Process: Hydro One Networks Inc. ("HONI") 2020-2022 Transmission ("Tx") Rates

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Name: Emma Blanchard

July 2-19	Conference with S. Pollock re: interrogatories	0.3	Interrogatory Prep
Aug 21-19	Receipt and review of Procedural Order #3 setting hearing dates	0.1	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 29-19	Working with S. Pollock to prepare questions for panel #4	0.3	Oral Hearing Prep
Dec 12-19	Reviewing positions for inclusion in written submissions with S. Pollock	0.2	Argument Prep

Total Hours for Emma Blanchard: 0.9

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Fees</u>
Pre-hearing Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Pre-hearing Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Technical Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Technical Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Interrogatory Prep	0.3	x \$290.00/hr =	87.00
Interrogatory Responses	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Issues Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Issues Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Settlement Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Settlement Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Settle. Conf. Proposal Prep	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Argument Prep	0.2	x \$290.00/hr =	58.00
Oral Hearing Prep	0.4	x \$290.00/hr =	116.00
Oral Hearing Attend	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Other Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
Other Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$290.00/hr =	0.00
	<hr/> 0.9	Total Fees for Emma Blanchard:	<hr/> \$ 261.00

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

File #:	EB-2019-0082		
Process:	Hydro One Networks Inc. ("HONI") 2020-2022 Transmission ("Tx") Rates		
Party:	Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters		
Name:	Erin Durant		
Sept 25-19	Reviewing customer satisfaction evidence for hearing	1.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 9-19	Reviewing evidence in preparation for hearing	2.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 13-19	Reviewing evidence for hearing	4.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 14-19	Continue review of evidence for hearing	1.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 14-19	Reviewing transcript of technical conference and reviewing answers to undertakings	2.0	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 15-19	Reviewing and considering time estimates for cross-examination at request of Board	0.2	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 19-19	Preparing for hearing and strategy regarding panel #1 and #3	0.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 23-19	Preparing for hearing	4.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 24-19	Preparing for hearing	3.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 25-19	Preparing for hearing	2.0	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 25-19	Listening to hearing remotely	3.0	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 26-19	Preparing for hearing	6.7	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 27-19	Preparing for hearing	8.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 28-19	Preparing for hearing	4.0	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 28-19	Attending hearing	7.5	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 29-19	Preparing for hearing the morning of hearing	1.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 29-19	Attending hearing	7.6	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 29-19	Preparing for hearing	1.5	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 31-19	Reviewing customer engagement transcript from hearing from day 7	1.0	Oral Hearing Prep
Nov 19-19	Reviewing hearing notes to prepare closing submissions	0.5	Argument Prep
Nov 22-19	Receipt of submissions from HONI and initial review of same	0.3	Argument Prep
Nov 25-19	Drafting submissions	2.3	Argument Prep
Nov 30-19	Reviewing transcripts and evidence to draft final submissions; considering submissions of HONI	3.5	Argument Prep
Dec 1-19	Drafting final submissions	2.8	Argument Prep
Dec 2-19	Reviewing evidentiary record and drafting submissions	8.5	Argument Prep
Dec 9-19	Discussing submissions with S. Pollock	0.2	Argument Prep
Dec 11-19	Reading staff submissions and considering revisions to CME submissions	1.0	Argument Prep

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

Dec 12-19	Revising submissions after receipt of staff submissions	0.5	Argument Prep
Apr 23-20	Reviewing and considering decision	1.5	Argument Prep

Total Hours for Erin Durant: 85.1

	<u>Hours</u>		<u>Fees</u>
Pre-hearing Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Pre-hearing Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Technical Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Technical Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Interrogatory Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Interrogatory Responses	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Issues Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Issues Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Settlement Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Settlement Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Settle. Conf. Proposal Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Argument Prep	21.1	x \$230.00/hr =	4,853.00
Oral Hearing Prep	45.9	x \$230.00/hr =	10,557.00
Oral Hearing Attend	18.1	x \$230.00/hr =	4,163.00
Other Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
Other Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$230.00/hr =	0.00
	<hr/> 85.1	Total Fees for Erin Durant:	<hr/> \$19,573.00

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

File #: EB-2019-0082

Process: Hydro One Networks Inc. ("HONI") 2020-2022 Transmission ("Tx") Rates

Party: Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters

Name: Scott Pollock

May 10-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	3.7	Pre-hearing Conf. Prep
May 14-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	3.8	Pre-hearing Conf. Prep
May 15-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	6.1	Pre-hearing Conf. Prep
May 16-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	4.3	Interrogatory Prep
May 17-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	6.8	Interrogatory Prep
May 21-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	6.1	Interrogatory Prep
May 22-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	5.3	Interrogatory Prep
May 24-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	5.9	Interrogatory Prep
May 23-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	6.6	Interrogatory Prep
May 27-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	6.4	Interrogatory Prep
May 28-19	Reviewing HONI Tx application	7.0	Interrogatory Prep
May 30-19	Reviewing application	3.7	Interrogatory Prep
May 29-19	Reviewing application	5.8	Interrogatory Prep
May 31-19	Reviewing application	3.6	Interrogatory Prep
June 3-19	Reviewing application	3.1	Interrogatory Prep
June 4-19	Reviewing application and drafting interrogatories	2.0	Interrogatory Prep
June 5-19	Reviewing application and drafting interrogatories	7.7	Interrogatory Prep
June 6-19	Drafting interrogatories	7.5	Interrogatory Prep
June 7-19	Drafting interrogatories	5.0	Interrogatory Prep
June 10-19	Reviewing application and drafting interrogatories	2.3	Interrogatory Prep
June 11-19	Drafting interrogatories	4.1	Interrogatory Prep
June 13-19	Drafting interrogatories	0.6	Interrogatory Prep
June 14-19	Drafting interrogatories	2.4	Interrogatory Prep
June 17-19	Drafting interrogatories	0.8	Interrogatory Prep
July 2-19	Reviewing interrogatories relating to Power Systems Engineering pursuant to the Board's adoption of evidence; editing interrogatories	5.4	Interrogatory Prep
July 3-19	Revising interrogatories	1.3	Interrogatory Prep
July 29-19	Reviewing record material and material from HOSSM proceeding for technical conference	4.2	Technical Conf. Prep
July 30-19	Reviewing areas for questioning at the technical conference	2.1	Technical Conf. Prep

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

Aug 5-19	Reviewing interrogatory responses	3.0	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 6-19	Reviewing interrogatory responses	5.9	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 7-19	Reviewing interrogatory responses, letter indicating technical conference areas of questioning	1.3	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 8-19	Reviewing interrogatory responses	3.1	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 11-19	Preparing for technical conference	3.0	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 12-19	Preparing for technical conference	1.0	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 12-19	Attending technical conference	7.4	Technical Conf. Attend
Aug 13-19	Preparing for technical conference	0.9	Technical Conf. Prep
Aug 13-19	Attending technical conference	7.0	Technical Conf. Attend
Aug 20-19	Attending issues list call	0.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Aug 22-19	Reviewing interrogatory responses	2.1	Oral Hearing Prep
Aug 23-19	Reviewing interrogatory responses and developing cross-examination	2.6	Oral Hearing Prep
Aug 26-19	Reviewing material and preparing cross-examinations	1.6	Oral Hearing Prep
Aug 28-19	Developing cross-examination	0.9	Oral Hearing Prep
Sept 3-19	Reviewing record and preparing cross examination	2.2	Oral Hearing Prep
Sept 9-19	Reviewing PEG expert report	2.1	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 2-19	Reviewing evidence and preparing cross-examination	3.9	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 9-19	Reviewing the record and preparing cross-examination	2.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 16-19	Preparing cross-examinations for hearing	2.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 17-19	Preparing cross-examinations	6.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 18-19	Preparing cross-examination	3.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 19-19	Preparing cross-examination and compendium	6.9	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 20-19	Preparing cross-examination and compendium	3.8	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 21-19	Preparing for cross-examination	2.7	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 21-19	Attend oral hearing	5.0	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 22-19	Preparing for cross-examination	2.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 22-19	Attend oral hearing	5.0	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 23-19	Reviewing material and preparing cross-examination	4.6	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 24-19	Listening to panel #1 webcast	3.8	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 25-19	Listening to the conclusion of panel #1 by webcast	3.1	Oral Hearing Attend
Oct 28-19	Reviewing material for panel #4	3.1	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 29-19	Preparing cross-examination	1.3	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 30-19	Preparing cross-examination material	6.3	Oral Hearing Prep
Oct 31-19	Attending hearing	7.5	Oral Hearing Attend

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

Oct 31-19	Preparing cross-examination	0.4	Oral Hearing Prep
Nov 1-19	Attending hearing	7.0	Oral Hearing Attend
Nov 1-19	Preparing cross-examination	1.1	Oral Hearing Prep
Nov 4-19	Listening to cross-examinations of panel #4 and panel #5	3.0	Oral Hearing Prep
Nov 5-19	Reviewing transcripts of cross-examination of panel #5	2.1	Argument Prep
Nov 6-19	Reviewing undertaking responses; outlining submissions	3.3	Argument Prep
Nov 7-19	Reviewing record and drafting submissions	6.7	Argument Prep
Nov 8-19	Reviewing record and drafting submissions	1.4	Argument Prep
Nov 11-19	Drafting submissions	1.2	Argument Prep
Nov 12-19	Reviewing undertaking responses	0.6	Argument Prep
Nov 14-19	Drafting submissions	0.9	Argument Prep
Nov 15-19	Drafting submissions	5.2	Argument Prep
Nov 18-19	Drafting submissions	6.8	Argument Prep
Nov 18-19	Call with client	0.1	Argument Prep
Nov 19-19	Drafting submissions	1.5	Argument Prep
Nov 21-19	Drafting submissions	0.8	Argument Prep
Nov 23-19	Reviewing Argument-in-Chief	2.8	Argument Prep
Nov 25-19	Drafting submissions	2.8	Argument Prep
Nov 26-19	Drafting submissions	3.9	Argument Prep
Nov 29-19	Drafting submissions	1.1	Argument Prep
Nov 30-19	Drafting submissions	4.0	Argument Prep
Dec 2-19	Discussion with E. Durant re submissions; revising submissions	2.1	Argument Prep
Dec 5-19	Revising submissions	3.1	Argument Prep
Dec 6-19	Revising submissions	2.3	Argument Prep
Dec 7-19	Revising submissions	3.8	Argument Prep
Dec 9-19	Revising final submissions; drafting summary email to client	7.2	Argument Prep
Dec 10-19	Revising submissions	4.3	Argument Prep
Dec 11-19	Revising submissions	4.2	Argument Prep
Dec 12-19	Reviewing board staff submissions ; call with client re final submissions; revising final submissions	5.1	Argument Prep
Dec 15-19	Revising submissions; email to client	3.6	Argument Prep
Dec 16-19	Revising submissions; email with client	2.2	Argument Prep
Jan 20-20	Reviewing Hydro One's Reply Argument	1.0	Argument Prep
Apr 24-20	Reviewing decision; drafting report to client	3.1	Argument Prep

Total Hours for Scott Pollock: 340.8

Hours

Fees

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees being Claimed

Pre-hearing Conf. Prep	13.6	x \$170.00/hr =	2,312.00
Pre-hearing Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Technical Conf. Prep	24.5	x \$170.00/hr =	4,165.00
Technical Conf. Attend	14.4	x \$170.00/hr =	2,448.00
Interrogatory Prep	103.7	x \$170.00/hr =	17,629.00
Interrogatory Responses	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Issues Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Issues Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Settlement Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Settlement Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Settle. Conf. Proposal Prep	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Argument Prep	87.2	x \$170.00/hr =	14,824.00
Oral Hearing Prep	66.0	x \$170.00/hr =	11,220.00
Oral Hearing Attend	31.4	x \$170.00/hr =	5,338.00
Other Conf. Prep	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
Other Conf. Attend	0.0	x \$170.00/hr =	0.00
	340.8	Total Fees for Scott Pollock:	\$57,936.00