
150 Ferrand Drive, Suite 208 
Toronto, Ontario M3C 3E5 

T 416.926.1907 F 416.926.1601 
www.pollutionprobe.org 

 

Ms. Christine Long 
Registrar & Board Secretary  
Ontario Energy Board  
P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor  
2300 Yonge Street  
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4  
 
October 6, 2020  
 
Re:  EB-2018-0287/0288 Utility Remuneration and Responding to DERs 
Pollution Probe Cost Claim 
 
Please find attached Pollution Probe’s cost claim for the above-noted consultations. 
 
Respectfully submitted on behalf of Pollution Probe.   

 

  
 
Michael Brophy, P.Eng., M.Eng., MBA  
Michael Brophy Consulting Inc. 
Consultant to Pollution Probe  
Phone: 647-330-1217  
Email: Michael.brophy@rogers.com 
 

cc:  Rate-regulated licensed electricity distributor (via email) 
Rate-regulated licensed transmitter (via email) 
Richard Carlson, Pollution Probe (via email)  

mailto:Michael.brophy@rogers.com




Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

Make cheque payable to:  

Send payment to this address:  c/o Richard Carlson
150 Ferrand Drive, Suite 208
Tornto, Ontario
M3C 3E5

Payment Information

Pollution Probe

$0.00
HST

2018-0287/0288 Utility Remuneration and Responding to DERs

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/consultant fees $19,800.00
Disbursements

Pollution Probe

Statement of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activity is found on the second tab of this workbook. 

$2,574.00

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the third tab of this workbook.

Total Cost Claim $22,374.00

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

2 of 2 Affidavit and Summary



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Name:

Year Called 
to Bar

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:
Analyst/Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Name:

Year Called 
to Bar

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:
Analyst/Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Name:

Year Called 
to Bar

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:
Analyst/Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Name:

Year Called 
to Bar

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:
Analyst/Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

Name:

Year Called 
to Bar

Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:
Analyst/Consultant:

CV attached: CV not required:

 
Completed Years 

Practicing/Years of relevant 
experience

 
Completed Years 

Practicing/Years of relevant 
experience

 
Completed Years 

Practicing/Years of relevant 
experience

Completed Years 
Practicing/Years of relevant 

experience

Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed

Michael Brophy
Completed Years 

Practicing/Years of Relevant 
Experience

26

 

1 of 1



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS
Statement of Fees Being Claimed

File # EB- 2018-0287/0288

Process

Party

HST Rate: 13%

Preparation for, 
attendance at and 
reporting on the 
September 2019 

stakeholder 
meeting             

Preparation of 
presentation at 

September 2019 
stakeholder 

meeting

Written comments 
summarizing views 
for each initiative

Preparation for, 
attendance at and 
reporting on the 
Feburary 2020 

stakeholder 
meeting

Written comments 
on staff proposals

Eligible 
Participant

Eligible 
Participant 

Eligible 
Participant 

Eligible 
Participant

Eligible 
Participant

Hourly rate
Up to meeting 
time + 4 hours Up to 6 hours Up to 10 hours

Up to meeting 
time + 4 hours Up to 10 hours Subtotal HST Total

$330.00 25.00 6.00 10.00 9.00 10.00 $19,800.00 $2,574.00 $22,374.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Totals: $19,800.00 $2,574.00
Total legal/consultant fees: $22,374.00

  
 

Utility Remuneration and Responding to DERs

Pollution Probe

Individual Whose Fees are Being 
Claimed

Michael Brophy

1 of 1 Statement of Fees



Michael Brophy Consulting Inc. INVOICE

28 MacNaughton Road DATE: October 6, 2020
Toronto, Ontario, M4G 3H4 INVOICE # OEB-11-2020
Phone 647-330-1217   email: michael.brophy@rogers.com FOR: EB-2018-0287/0288

Utility Remuneration and
Respindiong to DERs

Bill To:
Richard Carlson
Director Energy Policy
Polution Probe
150 Ferrand Drive
Toronto, Ontario
M3C 3E5

AMOUNT

$19,800.00

Utility Remuneration and Responding to DERs

Detailed timesheet for Michael Brophy attached

60 hours @ $330 per hour

$2,574.00

TOTAL  $22,374.00

Make all cheques payable to Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.
If you have any questions concerning this invoice, contact:
Michael Brophy, President, Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.
Phone: 647-330-1217, email: michael.brophy@rogers.com
Business Number: 75225 9333

HST (HST #: 75225 9333 RT0001)

DESCRIPTION

Consulting Services - OEB EB-2018-0287/0288

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!



Utility Remuneration & Responding to DERs
EB-2018-0287 & EB-2018-0288
M. Brophy

Date Hours Eligible Activity Summary

9/2/2019 2.00
Preparation of presentation for 

September 2019 stakeholder meeting Stakeholder deck development and evidence review (include consultant reports and DER research). 
9/5/2019 2.00 Preparation of presentation for 

September 2019 stakeholder meeting
Develop draft and coordination with R. Carlson on DER presentation. Feedback and coordination with K. 
Elson (Environmental Defence)

9/6/2019 2.00 Preparation of presentation for 
September 2019 stakeholder meeting

Coordination with R. Carlson on DER presentation. Issue coordination email to Jay Sheppard (SEC). 
Clarification email to OEB staff.

9/16/2019 2.00 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the September 2019 
stakeholder meeting (for eligible 

participants and/or their consultants)

Prep for Stakeholder meeting, key message coordination & deck review

9/17/2019 8.00 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the September 2019 
stakeholder meeting (for eligible 

participants and/or their consultants)

Preparation and Attend Stakeholder session - in person (AM) / online (PM) and deck review

9/18/2019 7.50 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the September 2019 
stakeholder meeting (for eligible 

participants and/or their consultants)

Preparation and Attend Stakeholder session - in person (AM) / online (PM) and deck review

9/19/2019 7.50 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the September 2019 
stakeholder meeting (for eligible 

participants and/or their consultants)

Preparation and Attend Stakeholder session - in person

10/16/2019 3.00 Written comments summarizing views on 
objectives, issues and guiding principles 

for each initiative

Development of written comments summarizing views on objectives, issues and guiding principles for 
each initiative

10/17/2019 3.00 Written comments summarizing views on 
objectives, issues and guiding principles 

for each initiative

Development of written comments summarizing views on objectives, issues and guiding principles for 
each initiative. Communications with R. Carlson (Pollution Probe) and B.Purcell (TAF) on submission.

10/18/2019 4.00 Written comments summarizing views on 
objectives, issues and guiding principles 

for each initiative

Finalise written comments summarizing views on objectives, issues and guiding principles for each 
initiative. Communications with R. Carlson (Pollution Probe) on submission.

2/14/2020 3.00 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the February 2020 

stakeholder meeting (for eligible 
participants and/or their consultants)

Preparation, review material and submissions prior to Feb 20 Stakeholder meeting

2/20/2020 1.00 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the February 2020 

stakeholder meeting (for eligible 
participants and/or their consultants)

Preparation for Stakeholder meeting and review of materials

2/20/2020 5.00 Preparation for, attendance at, and 
reporting on the February 2020 

stakeholder meeting (for eligible 
participants and/or their consultants)

Stakeholder meeting & Board Staff Presentation

3/11/2020 4.00 Written comments on staff’s proposals Review deck, transcript and submissions. Initiative draft submission.
3/15/2020 4.00 Written comments on staff’s proposals Review and preparation of comments on Staff proposal. Correspondence with R. Carlson (Pollution 

Probe) and M. Fletcher (City of Ottawa) and G. Kalapos (Clean Air Alliance)
3/25/2020 2.00 Written comments on staff’s proposals Include final material from CAC and R. Carlson (Pollution Probe). Finalise submission and file.

total 60.00
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