

February 25, 2021

VIA RESS

Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street, 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 Attention: Registrar

Dear Ms. Long:

Re: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. (OPUCN)
2021 Cost of Service Rates Application

Board File No.: EB-2020-0048

We are counsel to the Distributed Resource Coalition (**DRC**) in the above-noted proceeding (the **Proceeding**). Further to the Board's Decision and Order dated February 18, 2021, please find enclosed DRC's cost claim in respect of the Proceeding. DRC notes that it has included two completed 'Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed' forms for Daniel Vollmer in this cost claim at two different hourly rates. By way of context, DRC notes that Dr. Vollmer was called to the bar on November 27, 2020.

DRC respectfully requests an award of 100% of its eligible costs, given its strategic and principled participation in the Proceeding, reflecting the unique interests of otherwise unrepresented OPUCN customers. DRC submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (a) DRC participated effectively in the Proceeding, taking a surgical, principled, and coordinated approach to matters related to the integration of distributed energy resources (DERs) and assisted in contributing to the Board's better understanding of such matters;
- (b) DRC ensured that its participation in the Proceeding was focused on material issues and consistent with the scope of its intervention, as set out in its Notice of Intervention;
- (c) DRC has ensured that it has not requested recovery of costs associated with the attendance of more than one representative at the settlement conference; and
- (d) DRC participated responsibly and undertook coordination with other intervenors and Board Staff to avoid overlap, maximize efficiency, and ensure that its participation was not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues.

We trust that this approach maximizes the efficient use of resources and the right of otherwise unrepresented and important OPUCN customers to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's mandate and statutory objectives.

DRC respectfully requests a full award of eligible costs.

Sincerely,

Jonathan McGillivray

 John A.D. Vellone, Counsel, Borden Ladner Gervais LLP David Savage, Oshawa PUC Networks Inc.
 Margaret Boland, Oshawa PUC Networks Inc.
 Cara Clairman, Plug'n Drive
 Wilf Steimle, Electric Vehicle Society

Encl.



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed

affirmed.							
		Inst	ructions				
- All claims mu - A separate " Disbursement However, only - The cost claim	a input is indicated by yellow-shaded fiest be in Canadian dollars. If applicable Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being is Being Claimed") is required for each law one "Summary of Fees and Disbursem must be supported by a completed Ain consultant/analyst must be attached to Except as provided in section 7.03 or	, state exchange r Rate: Claimed" (compr wyer, analyst/cor ents" covering th ifidavit signed by inless provided to	rate and consisting a "Stansultant an e whole of a represent the Board	untry of initial of tement of Fee d articling stud the party's cos tative of the pa as prescribed of	Currency. Country: See Being Claimed" a ent/paralegal. St claim should be p arty. The Cost Award	nd a "Stateme rovided. Fariff.	
File # EB-	EB-2020-0048	P	Process:	Oshawa PUC	Networks Inc. ED	OR Application	n
Party:	Distributed Resource Coalition		Affi	ant's Name:	Jonathan McGil	livray	
HST Number	794713495 RT0001			HS.	T Rate Ontario:	13.00%	
	Full Registrant Unregistered Other	√ □		Qualify	ying Non-Profit Tax Exempt		
		A	ffidavit				
I,	Jonathan McGillivray	, 0	of the City	//Town of		Toronto	
in the Provi	nce/State of O	ntario		,	, swear or affi	rm that:	
2. I have example of the standard of the standard to all the stand	esentative of the above-noted party (the nined all of the documentation in support tement(s) of Fees Reing Claimed" and led "Summary of Fees and Disbursement" include only costs incurred and time spain does not include any costs for work and The fire the Board's Practice Direction of the Board's Practice Direct	rt of this cost clain 'Statement(s) of I ts Being Claimed" pent directly for the	n, including Dishursema , "Stateme ne purpose: nt, by a per	the attached " ents Reing Clair nt(s) of Fees Be s of the Party's	'Summary of Fees med" eing Claimed" and participation in the	and Disbursen "Statement(s) Ontario Energ	of Disbursements y Board process
Signature o	f Affiant						
Sworn or a	ffirmed before me at the City/To	own of		Tor	ronto	,	
in the Provi	nce/State of (Ontario		on	25/02/2	021 .	
1 m. L	re me in accordance with O. Reg. 431/ ner for taking Affidavits	20: Administerin	G Oath or I	eclaration Re	motely (date)		

Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application

File # EB-

EB-2020-0048



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Party: Distributed Resource Coalition

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed							
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	7,653.00					
Disbursements	\$	-					
HST	\$	994.89					
Total Cost Claim	\$	8,647.89					

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Resilient LLP

Send payment to this address: Bay Adelaide Centre

333 Bay Street, Suite 625

Toronto, ON M5R 2R2



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2020-0048		Process: Oshawa PUC No	etworks Inc. EDR Application	
Party:	Distributed Resource Coalition		Service Provider Name:	Lisa DeMarco	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	
	Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant		1997	Hourly Rate: \$330	
	Analyst For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ned HST Rate (Charged (enter %): 13.0%	
		√ CV provid	ded within previous 24 months		

	Statement of	of Fe	ees Being	Clai	med		
	Hours	_	ourly Rate	_	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference			-				
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	=	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	=	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Responses		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation	0.30	\$	330.00	\$	99.00	\$ 12.87	\$ 111.87
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation	1.60	\$	330.00	\$	528.00	\$ 68.64	\$ 596.64
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ =
Proposal Preparation	0.50	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	\$ 21.45	\$ 186.45
Argument							
Preparation	2.20	\$	330.00	\$	726.00	\$ 94.38	\$ 820.38
Oral Hearing							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ =
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ =
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management				\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	1,518.00	\$ 197.34	\$ 1,715.34

File # EB- EB-2020-0048 Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

arty:	Distributed Resource Coalition	Service Provider Name:	Lisa DeMarco	

	Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed								
		Net Cost	HST	Total					
Scanning/Photocopy	1		\$ -	\$ -					
Printing			\$ -	\$ -					
Courier			\$ -	\$ -					
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$ -					
Transcripts			\$ -	\$ -					
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$ -					
Travel: Car			\$ -	\$ -					
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$ -					
Travel (Other):			\$ -	\$ -					
Parking			\$ -	\$ -					
Taxi			\$ -	\$ -					
Accommodation			\$ -	\$ -					
Meals			\$ -	\$ -					
Other:			\$ -	\$ -					
Other:			\$ -	\$ -					
Other:			\$ -	\$ -					
TOTAL DISBURSEMEN	NTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -					



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	# EB -2020-0048			Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application							
Party:	Distributed Resource Coalition		Service F	Provider Name:	Jonathan McGillivray						
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	1					
	Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal	<mark> </mark>	2017		4						
	Consultant Analyst				Hourly Rate: \$170						
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ed led within previous		Charged (<i>enter</i> %): 13.0%						

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
	Hours		ourly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference			•							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	=	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	=	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	2.40	\$	170.00	\$	408.00	\$	53.04	\$	461.04	
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	=	\$	-	
Issues Conference										
Preparation	0.70	\$	170.00	\$	119.00	\$	15.47	\$	134.47	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	=	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation	5.60	\$	170.00	\$	952.00	\$	123.76	\$	1,075.76	
Attendance	18.10	\$	170.00	\$	3,077.00	\$	400.01	\$	3,477.01	
Proposal Preparation	4.10	\$	170.00	\$	697.00	\$	90.61	\$	787.61	
Argument										
Preparation	0.40	\$	170.00	\$	68.00	\$	8.84	\$	76.84	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	=	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Case Management	0.40	\$	170.00	\$	68.00	\$	8.84	\$	76.84	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	5,389.00	\$	700.57	\$	6,089.57	

File # EB- EB-2020-0048 Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party: <u>Distributed Resource Coalition</u> Service Provider Name: <u>Jonathan McGillivray</u>

	Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed								
	Net Cost	HST	Total						
Scanning/Photocopy		\$ -	\$ -						
Printing		\$ -	\$ -						
Courier		\$ -	\$ -						
Telephone/Fax		\$ -	\$ -						
Transcripts		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Air		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Car		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Rail		\$ -	\$ -						
Travel (Other):		\$ -	\$ -						
Parking		\$ -	\$ -						
Тахі		\$ -	\$ -						
Accommodation		\$ -	\$ -						
Meals		\$ -	\$ -						
Other:		\$ -	\$ -						
Other:		\$ -	\$ -						
Other:		\$ -	\$ -						
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -						



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2020-0048		Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application							
Party:	Distributed Resource Coalition		Service Provider Name:	Daniel Vollmer						
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience						
	Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal			1						
	Consultant Analyst			Hourly Rate: \$100						
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ed HST Rate of the ded within previous 24 months	Charged (<i>enter</i> %): 13.0%						

	CV provid		•							
9	Statement of									
Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total										
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	2.50	\$	100.00	\$	250.00	\$	32.50	\$	282.50	
Responses	0.90	\$	100.00	\$	90.00	\$	11.70	\$	101.70	
Issues Conference										
Preparation	0.30	\$	100.00	\$	30.00	\$	3.90	\$	33.90	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Argument										
Preparation	1.30	\$	100.00	\$	130.00	\$	16.90	\$	146.90	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences		•								
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Case Management	1.10	\$	100.00	\$	110.00	\$	14.30	\$	124.30	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	610.00	\$	79.30	\$	689.30	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- EB-2020-0048 Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application

Party: Distributed Resource Coalition Service Provider Name: Daniel Vollmer

	Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed									
		Net Cost	HST	Total						
Scanning/Photocopy	/		\$ -	\$ -						
Printing			\$ -	\$ -						
Courier		\$ -	- \$ -	\$ -						
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$ -						
Transcripts			\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Car			\$ -	\$ -						
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$ -						
Travel (Other):			\$ -	\$ -						
Parking			\$ -	\$ -						
Taxi			\$ -	\$ -						
Accommodation			\$ -	\$ -						
Meals			\$ -	\$ -						
Other:			\$ -	\$ -						
Other:			\$ -	\$ -						
Other:			\$ -	\$ -						
TOTAL DISBURSEME	NTS:	\$ -	- \$ -	\$ -						



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2020-0048		Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application				
Party:	Distributed Resource Coalition		Service Provider Name: Daniel Vollmer				
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar	Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience			
	Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant		2020	Hourly Rate: \$170			
	Analyst For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attach	ned HST Rate (ded within previous 24 months	Charged (<i>enter</i> %): 13.0%			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed								
	Hours	_	urly Rate	_	ubtotal		HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference			•					
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$ -
Technical Conference								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Interrogatories								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$ -
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$ -
Issues Conference								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Argument								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Oral Hearing								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	=	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Other Conferences								
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$ -
Case Management	0.80	\$	170.00	\$	136.00	\$	17.68	\$ 153.68
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	136.00	\$	17.68	\$ 153.68

File # EB- EB-2020-0048 Process: Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Party:	Distributed Resource Coalition	Service Provider Name:	Daniel Vollmer	

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed						
		Net Cost	HST	Total		
Scanning/Photocopy	1		\$ -	\$ -		
Printing			\$ -	\$ -		
Courier			\$ -	\$ -		
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$ -		
Transcripts			\$ -	\$ -		
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$ -		
Travel: Car			\$ -	\$ -		
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$ -		
Travel (Other):			\$ -	\$ -		
Parking			\$ -	\$ -		
Taxi			\$ -	\$ -		
Accommodation			\$ -	\$ -		
Meals			\$ -	\$ -		
Other:			\$ -	\$ -		
Other:			\$ -	\$ -		
Other:			\$ -	\$ -		
TOTAL DISBURSEMEN	NTS:	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -		

INVOICE



Invoice # 20176 Date: 12/31/2020 Due On: 02/18/2021

333 Bay Street, Suite 625 Toronto, ON M5H 2R2 Canada Email: monika@resilientllp.com www.resilientllp.com

Distributed Resource Coalition

20-00683-Distributed Resource Coalition-EB-2020-0048 Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
09/04/2020	DV	APR - Review 2021 electricity distribution rates application re EB-2020-0048	1.30	\$100.00	\$130.00
09/23/2020	LD	APR - Meeting with J. McGillivray and D. Vollmer re approach to proceeding; performance incentive; key focus area; Communications with client;	2.10	\$330.00	\$693.00
09/25/2020	DV	IRP - Draft IRs per instructions from J. McGillivray;	0.80	\$100.00	\$80.00
09/28/2020	DV	IRP - Draft IRs per instructions from J. McGillivray;	1.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
09/29/2020	JM	IRP - Review and revise draft interrogatories;	1.70	\$170.00	\$289.00
09/30/2020	DV	CMT - Draft cover letter per J. McGillivray;	0.10	\$100.00	\$10.00
09/30/2020	DV	IRP - Research re phase-out of ICE vehicles per J. McGillivray;	0.50	\$100.00	\$50.00
09/30/2020	DV	IRP - Review draft IRs per J. McGillivray;	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
09/30/2020	DV	CMT - File IRs per J. McGillivray;	0.30	\$100.00	\$30.00
09/30/2020	JM	IRP - Review and revise draft interrogatories per instructions from L. DeMarco;	0.70	\$170.00	\$119.00
10/19/2020	LD	APR - Communications with David Savage;	0.10	\$330.00	\$33.00
11/18/2020	DV	ICP - Review draft issues list per J. McGillivray;	0.30	\$100.00	\$30.00
11/19/2020	JM	ICP - Review Board Staff's draft Issues List and prepare comments on same;	0.40	\$170.00	\$68.00
11/19/2020	DV	IRR - Review IRRs per J. McGillivray;	0.90	\$100.00	\$90.00

11/23/2020	JM	ICP - Review and respond to email correspondence from applicant's counsel and other parties re proposed additions to draft Issues List;	0.30	\$170.00	\$51.00
11/23/2020	LD	ICP - Instructions to J. McGillivray re proposed additions to draft Issues List; Call with J. Vellone;	0.30	\$330.00	\$99.00
11/23/2020	JM	CMT - Review Decision on Confidentiality and PO3 and instructions to D. Vollmer re same;	0.20	\$170.00	\$34.00
11/23/2020	DV	CMT - Draft declaration and undertakings per J. McGillivray;	0.50	\$100.00	\$50.00
11/24/2020	DV	CMT - File declaration and undertakings re LD, JM, DV per J.McGillivray;	0.20	\$100.00	\$20.00
12/02/2020	DV	CMT - Review and file submissions re confidentiality per J. McGillivray;	0.30	\$170.00	\$51.00
12/02/2020	DV	CMT - review evidence for file per J. McGillivray;	0.40	\$170.00	\$68.00
12/02/2020	JM	APR - Prepare brief submissions on confidentiality and instructions to D. Vollmer re filing of same;	0.40	\$170.00	\$68.00
12/04/2020	DV	CMT - upload application and evidence documents and prepare file per J. McGillivray;	0.10	\$170.00	\$17.00
12/15/2020	JM	SCP - Prepare for settlement conference;	0.40	\$170.00	\$68.00
12/15/2020	LD	SCP - Instructions to J. McGillivray re settlement conference; Cooperation with SEC and PP; how to proceed to maximize effectiveness;	0.50	\$330.00	\$165.00

Quantity Subtotal 14.0

Time Keeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Lisa DeMarco	3.0	\$330.00	\$990.00
Jonathan McGillivray	4.1	\$170.00	\$697.00
Daniel Vollmer	0.8	\$170.00	\$136.00
Daniel Vollmer	6.1	\$100.00	\$610.00
		Quantity Total	14.0
		Subtotal	\$2,433.00
		HST (ON) (13.0%)	\$316.29
		Total	\$2,749.29

Please make all amounts payable to: Resilient LLP HST #79471 3495 RT0001

If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently \$17.50.

Please pay within 49 days.

INVOICE



Invoice # 21120 Date: 02/22/2021 Due On: 03/23/2021

333 Bay Street, Suite 625 Toronto, ON M5H 2R2 Canada Email: monika@resilientllp.com www.resilientllp.com

Distributed Resource Coalition

20-00683-Distributed Resource Coalition-EB-2020-0048 Oshawa PUC Networks Inc. EDR Application

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
01/04/2021	JM	SCP - Prepare for settlement conference; Attend on settlement conference test session;	1.80	\$170.00	\$306.00
01/04/2021	LD	SCP - Instructions to J.McGillivray re settlement conference;	0.50	\$330.00	\$165.00
01/05/2021	JM	SCP - Prepare for settlement conference as per L. DeMarco instructions;	3.40	\$170.00	\$578.00
01/06/2021	JM	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 1); Revisions to draft settlement language; Communications with L. DeMarco on draft language;	7.40	\$170.00	\$1,258.00
01/07/2021	JM	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 2); Revisions to draft settlement language;	4.20	\$170.00	\$714.00
01/07/2021	LD	SCP - Revisions to draft wording; Instructions to J. McGillivray;	0.60	\$330.00	\$198.00
01/08/2021	JM	SCA - Attend on settlement conference (Day 3); Review and revise draft settlement language;	6.50	\$170.00	\$1,105.00
01/22/2021	JM	SPP - Review and revise draft Settlement Proposal; Email correspondence with intervenor group and Board Staff;	1.30	\$170.00	\$221.00
01/27/2021	JM	SPP - Attend on OPUCN meeting to discuss measures and targets and follow-up intervenor-only meeting concerning same;	1.10	\$170.00	\$187.00
01/29/2021	JM	SPP - Initial review of updated draft of Settlement Proposal and draft notes on same; Review Board staff	0.70	\$170.00	\$119.00

	comments on models; Review draft letter requesting extension on filing of Settlement Proposal and email correspondence concerning same;			
01/29/2021 LD	SPP - Review settlement proposal and mark up instructions to J. McGillivray;	0.30	\$330.00	\$99.00
01/31/2021 JM	SPP - Review and revise updated draft Settlement Proposal; Email correspondence with intervenor group and Board Staff;	0.50	\$170.00	\$85.00
02/02/2021 JM	CMT - Review Procedural Order No. 4;	0.20	\$170.00	\$34.00
02/02/2021 LD	SPP - Communications with client group;	0.20	\$330.00	\$66.00
02/03/2021 JM	SPP - Review updated draft Settlement Proposal and related email correspondence confirming DRC sign-off;	0.50	\$170.00	\$85.00

Quantity Subtotal 29.2

Time Keeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Lisa DeMarco	1.6	\$330.00	\$528.00
Jonathan McGillivray	27.6	\$170.00	\$4,692.00
		Quantity Total	29.2
		Subtotal	\$5,220.00
		HST (ON) (13.0%)	\$678.60
		Total	\$5,898.60

Please make all amounts payable to: Resilient LLP HST #79471 3495 RT0001

If sending a wire, please ensure that you include sufficient funds to cover both sending and receiving wire fees charged by financial institutions. Receiving wire fees for our bank are currently \$17.50.

Please pay within 29 days.