

Elson Advocacy

March 24, 2021

BY RESS AND EMAIL

Ms. Kirsten Walli

Board Secretary

Ontario Energy Board

2300 Yonge Street, Suite 2700, P.O. Box 2319

Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Walli:

Re: EB-2019-0207 - Distributed Energy Resources Connections Review Initiative

I am writing further to the request from OEB Staff for an hourly time docket in support of the cost claim in the above matter. The requested information is attached

Yours truly,



Kent Elson

Encl.

Time Dockets re EB-2019-0207 Cost Claim for Kent Elson

Date	Hours	Explanation
25/3/2020	5.00	Prepare for and attend working group meeting
14/4/2020	1.40	Review various meeting materials and correspondence; prepare comments re tranche two items
21/4/2020	0.10	Various correspondence
22/4/2020	0.10	Various correspondence
27/4/2020	0.10	Review materials and prepare for meeting tomorrow
28/4/2020	1.00	Attend sub-group meeting
11/5/2020	0.10	Review meeting notes
13/5/2020	0.50	Attend working subgroup meeting
26/5/2020	3.80	Review materials in preparation for meeting today; attend meeting
29/5/2020	0.80	Review materials; various correspondence
2/6/2020	1.00	Various correspondence re planning for upcoming meetings
3/6/2020	0.60	Draft correspondence to various stakeholder proposing a pre-meeting
4/6/2020	0.70	Various calls and correspondence re intervenor coordination in advance of Tranche 2 meetings
5/6/2020	1.00	Coordination with stakeholders in preparation for tranche 2 meetings; review materials from OEB staff
9/6/2020	0.30	Various correspondence in preparation for upcoming meetings
10/6/2020	1.50	Draft comments on the Tranche 2 mandate and tracking tool; draft correspondence
11/6/2020	1.00	Conference call re DER priorities
12/6/2020	1.00	Review correspondence and materials from Board Staff re Tranche 2; draft comments re Tranche 2 mandate
15/6/2020	4.00	Review dispute resolution processes in Ontario and other jurisdictions; draft initial proposal re dispute resolution process;

Date	Hours	Explanation
		various correspondence; call re stakeholder coordination; call with R. Holder
16/6/2020	4.50	Attend technical subgroup meeting; attend process subgroup meeting; prepare various follow-up correspondence
17/6/2020	0.20	Various correspondence
18/6/2020	0.10	Various correspondence
8/7/2020	7.00	Various correspondence in preparation for meetings today; attend technical subgroup meeting; draft dispute resolution process discussion paper; attend process subgroup
9/7/2020	1.70	Various calls and correspondence
10/7/2020	2.00	Further revisions to potential dispute resolution process; calls and correspondence
17/7/2020	0.50	Revise dispute resolution draft based on comments; various correspondence
21/7/2020	0.10	Various correspondence
22/7/2020	0.50	Various correspondence in preparation for upcoming meeting
29/7/2020	0.50	Various correspondence in preparation for meetings
6/8/2020	1.00	Attend meeting today
8/8/2020	0.20	Various correspondence and meeting follow-up
11/8/2020	0.20	Various correspondence
18/8/2020	1.50	Various follow-up re process subgroup issues; various follow-up re technical subgroup issues
24/8/2020	0.70	Call in preparation for upcoming meetings
26/8/2020	1.70	Correspondence and conference call re dispute resolution
3/9/2020	1.00	Attend subgroup meeting
14/9/2020	0.30	Various correspondence

Date	Hours	Explanation
22/9/2020	1.20	Meeting re dispute resolution in preparation for next subgroup meeting; various correspondence
25/9/2020	3.00	Attend process subgroup meeting
1/10/2020	1.40	Meeting re dispute resolution in preparation for next subgroup meeting
6/10/2020	1.60	Revise proposed dispute resolution per comments from the previous small group meeting in preparation for the next subgroup meeting; review proposal regarding capacity tools; various correspondence regarding process and technical subgroup issues
9/10/2020	1.00	Preparation for upcoming meetings
13/10/2020	1.80	Prepare for upcoming meetings tomorrow
14/10/2020	2.00	Attend technical subgroup meeting; attend process subgroup meeting
16/10/2020	0.10	Various correspondence
21/10/2020	2.20	Various correspondence, review, and drafting to follow up on previous meetings and prepare for upcoming meetings
4/11/2020	1.50	Prepare for meetings tomorrow
5/11/2020	3.00	Attend subgroup meeting
15/11/2020	0.10	Draft correspondence re dispute resolution issue
16/11/2020	0.60	Preparation for meeting tomorrow
17/11/2020	5.00	Attend process subgroup meeting (3 hrs); attend technical subgroup meeting (2 hrs)
24/11/2020	0.30	Review various correspondence and materials
27/11/2020	0.30	Review materials for upcoming meetings
8/12/2020	3.00	Attend working group meeting
10/12/2020	4.50	Attend technical subgroup meeting (2.5 hrs); attend process subgroup meeting (2 hrs)

Date	Hours	Explanation
8/1/2021	1.20	Review draft report and recommendations presentation; prepare comments
14/1/2021	3.00	Attend technical subgroup meeting; attend process subgroup meeting
26/1/2021	2.50	Attend joint small group meeting
15/2/2021	0.20	Review materials re upcoming comments
16/2/2021	3.20	Attend working group meeting
2/3/2021	0.30	Review correspondence from R. Holder re follow up on previous meeting; draft response
Totals		
Hours	90.7	
Hours Claimed	79.60	
Hours Unclaimed	11.1	