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May 26, 2021 

 

Christine E. Long  

Registrar 

Ontario Energy Board  

2300 Yonge Street, P.O. Box 2319 

Toronto ON  

M4P 1E4 

 

Dear Ms. Long 

 

RE:  EB-2020-0134 Enbridge Gas Disposition of 2019 Earnings Sharing and 

Deferral and Variance Accounts Disposition Proceeding 

Energy Probe Cost Claim 

 

Attached is the cost claim Energy Probe Research Foundation (Energy Probe) for the EB-2020-

0134 proceeding, the application by Enbridge Gas Inc. to the Ontario Energy Board for the 

approval of its proposed disposition of 2019 Earnings Sharing and the balances in 2019 Deferral 

and Variance Accounts. 

 

Respectfully submitted on behalf of Energy Probe. 

  

        

 

Tom Ladanyi 

TL Energy Regulatory Consultants Inc. 

Consultant representing Energy Probe  

 

cc.  Anton Kacicnik (Enbridge Gas Inc.) 

Roger Higgin (Sustainable Planning Associates Inc.)  

 



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

lnsvuctions

H
s form should be used by a partyto a hearing beforethe Board to identifythe fees and disbu rsements that fo rm the panyt cost

claim. Pape. and electronic copies ofthis form and itemDed rec€ipts rnust be filed with the Board and setued on one or moreoth€r
parties as directed bythe Board in the applicable Board order. Please €nsure allrequired (ye low shaded)fields are fiLled in and the
Affidavit poarion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Required data input is indicated byyelow-shaded fields. Formulas af€ embedded ln the form to asslst with cak!latlons.
Allc aims must be in Canadian do lars. lfapplkab e, state exchange rate and country of initialcutrency.

-a separate 'Detailof Fees and DtsbLrsem€nts B€ins claimedn[-ii[iEiig a "statement of rees aeins Cliifr6in-ii--5iiEfrE
D sbursem€nts Being Claimed")is required for each awyer, ana yst/consultant and.rticlingstudent/paralegal.
However, only one "sLrmmary of Fees and DGbursements" covering the whole of the party! cost c aim sholrld be provided.

- The cost claim must b€ support€d by a completed affidavit signed by a representative oithe party.

-A cV for each consultant/analyn mun be attached unless provided to th€ Eoafd as prescribed on the costAward Tarlff.

Exceptas provided in section 7.03 ofthe Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts murt be provided.

File # EB- EB-2020-0134 Process: Enbridge 2019 Earnings Sharing and DVA Disposition

Party: Energy Probe Research Foundation Affiant's Name: Thomas J. Ladanyi

HST Numberi 10730 5146 RT0001 HsT Rate ontarioi 6.50%

Full Registfant tr
Unregistered tr

Other n

Qualifying Non Profit tr
Tax Exempt D

Affldavit

t,

rn tne
Thomas J. Ladanyi , of the City/Town of Toronto

Province/State of , swear or affirm that:Ontario

1. lam a representative of th e above-noted party (the Pady )and as such have knowledge ofthe matters attested to herein.
2.lhave examined al ofthe doc!mentation in support ofthis cost claim, including th€ attached "Summary of F€es and
0lsbursements Being C aimed , 'Statement(s)of Fees Being Claimed" and 'Statem€nt(s)of Disbursements Being C alnred .

3. Ihe attached Summary of Fees and Disbursem€nts Being C ainred", "Statement(s)of Fees Being Claimed and Statement(s)of
D sburem€nts Eeing Claimed" inc ude only costs lncurred and tirn€ spent directlyforthe purposes of the Party's partkipation in the
Ontario Energy Eoard process referred to above-
4. This costclaim does not lncl!d€ anycosts for work done, or time spent, by a person that ls an employee or offic€rofthe Party as

Signature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me at the Citv/Town of
in the Province/State of May 25,2027

commissioner foi takinl

Ontario
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Toronto



File # €B-

Party:

Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Processr Enbridge 2019 Earnings Sharing and DVA Disposltion

Energy Probe Research Foundatlon

EB-2020-0134

Summary of Fees and Disbursements
Legal/consultant/other f ees

Disbursements

HST

s
5

s

t3,t22.5O

8s2.96
Totalcost claim L3,975,46

Payment Information

Make cheque payable tor Energy Probe Research Foundation

send pavment to this address: 225 Brunswick Avenue
Toronto, Ontario
MsS 2M6
Attention: Frank Cianflone

Page 2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

ffi
File # EB- EB-2020-0134 Processt Enbidge 2019 Earnings Shoring ond DvA Dispositio

Party: Energy Probe Reseorch Foundotion Service Provider Name: Tom Ladanyi

YearCalledto

SERVICI PROVIDER WPE tcheckone) sar
Completed Years Pra.tisin&/Y€ars

of Relevant Experience

LegalCounsel -
Articlingstudent/Paralegal !

4-1

Consultant E

Analyst o
ForConsultant/Analysti tr cvattached

Ho,avn",",1---FjI6--l

HsT Rate charsed (€nre.4,I fi-s% I
tr Cv provided withln previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total

Pre-hearing Conferenae

Preparation s 330.00 5 5 s
Attendance 5 330.00 s 5

Technical Conference

Preparation s 330.00 s s s
Attendance 5 330.00 s s 5

Interrogatories
Preparation 2.00 5 330.00 s 660.00 5 42.90 s 702.90

Responses 5 330.00 s 5 5
lssues Conference

Preparation s 330.00 5 5 s
Attendance s 330.00 5 s s

ADR - Settlement conferenae
Preparation 1.50 5 330.00 S 49s.oo S 32.18 5 s27.18
Attendance 3.00 s 330.00 S 99o.oo 5 64.3s s 1,054.3s

Proposal PreDaration o.7 5 5 130.00 5 247.sO S 16.09 5 263.s9
Argument

Preparataon 5 33o.oo s s 5

OralHearing
Preparation s 330.00 s 5 I
Attendance s 330.00 5 5 s

Other Conterences

Preparation s 330.00 s 5 5

Attendance 5 330.00 s 5 s
Case Management 1.00 5 17o.oo S 17o.oo 5 11.0s 5 181.0s

TOTAL SIRVICE PROVIDER FEES S 166.s6 5 2,729.06

lot2



Ontario Energy Board

COST CTAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

ffi
File # Ea- EB-2020-0134 Processt Enbridge 2079 Eonings Shoring ond DVA Dispositi

Party: Eneqy Prcbe Reseorch Foundotion Service Provider Name: Ro8er Higgin

YearCalledto

SERVICE PROVIDER ryPE (.he.k o,€ ) B.r
Completed Years Practlslng/Years

of Relevant Experience

t-egalcounsel ! [--l
ArticlingStudent/Paralegal I

Consultant tr

AnalYst !
ForConsultant/Analyst: tr cvattached

nouavn"t.,f@

Hsr Rate charyed (enter % ),1-- 6.5%--1
E cv provided withln previous 24 months

40

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Rate subtotal HST Total

Pre-hearing conference
Preparation s 330.00 s s 5

Attendance s 330.00 s s s
Technicalconference

Preparation 5 330.00 5 s 5
Attendance 5 33o.oo 5 s 5

lnterrogatories
Preparation 9.00 5 33o.oo s 2,970.00 s 193.05 5 3,163.05

Responses S 33o.oo s s 5
lssues Conference

Preparation 5 330 00 5 5 s
Attendance 5 33o.oo s s 5

ADR - Settlement Conterence
Preparation 3.00 S 33o.oo s 990.00 5 64.3s S 1,054.3s

Attendance 10.00 5 330.00 5 3,300.00 S 214.s0 5 3,514.50

Proposal Preparation 2.OO s 330.00 s 660.00 S 42.90 5 7O2.9O

Argument
Preparation 8.00 5 330.00 s 2,640.00 5 17r.60 s 2,811.60

OralHearing
Preparation s 330.00 5 s 5

Attendance 5 l3o.oo 5 s 5

Other Conferences

Preparation 5 330.00 5 s s
Attendance s 330.00 5 5 s

Case Management 5 17o.oo 5 5 I
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES s 10,s60.00 5 686.40 5 11,246.40
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TL Energy Regulatory Consultants Inc.

Date: May 20, 2021 Invoice No: EPRF 2021-15

To: From:

Frank Cianflone Tom Ladanyi

Energy Probe Research Foundation TL Energy Regulatory Consultants Inc.

225 Brunswick Ave. 41 Divadale Drive

Toronto, ON Toronto, ON

M5S 2M6 M4G 2N7

Phone: 416-423-3685

E-Mail: tom.ladanyi@rogers.com

OEB Docket: EB-2020-0134 Enbridge Earnings Sharing

Date Description of Work Hours Rate Amount

04-Nov-20 Interrogatories 2.00 330.00$            660.00$                    

29-Nov-20 ADR Preparation 1.50 330.00$            495.00$                    

03-Dec-20 Settlement Conference 2.00 330.00$            660.00$                    

07-Dec-20 Settlement Conference 1.00 330.00$            330.00$                    

19-May-21 DRO Review 0.50 330.00$            165.00$                    

20-May-21 DRO Review 0.25 330.00$            82.50$                      

Case Management 1.00 170.00$            170.00$                    

Subtotal: 2,562.50$                 

GST/HST No:  77848 0921 RT0001    HST 13%: 333.13$                    

Cheque payable to: TL Energy Regulatory Consultants Inc. Total 2,895.63$                 



Invoice No. 2021-EP-08

Name Energy Probe Research Foundation Date 2021-05-23

Address 225 Brunswick Avenue Project No Enbridge Gas Inc

City Toronto Province Ont P.C. M5S 2M6 Title 2019 ESMDA 

Attn Frank Cianflone EB-2020-0134

Hours Unit Price TOTAL

3.00 2020-10-20 Review Prefiled Evidence make notes $330.00 $990.00

3.00 2020-10-25 Prepare Draft IRs send to client $330.00 $990.00

3.00 2020-12-02 Review IRRs make  notes for Settlement Conference $330.00 $990.00

4.00 2020-12-03 Attend Settlement Conference $330.00 $1,320.00

4.00 2020-12-04 Attend Settlement Conference $330.00 $1,320.00

2.00 2020-12-07 Attend Settlement Conference $330.00 $660.00

1.00 2020-12-15 Review Settlement Proposal Draft 1 $330.00 $330.00

1.00 2020-12-19 Review Settlement Proposal  Draft 2 $330.00 $330.00

1.00 2021-02-08 Review EGI Supplementary Evidence  Intervenor Zoom $330.00 $330.00

2.00 2021-02-10 Prepare and File Interrogatories on Supplementary Evidence$330.00 $660.00

2.00 2021-02-15 Review IRR on Supplementary Evidence TVDA $330.00 $660.00

2.00 2021-03-05 Review EGI Argument in Chief on Unsettled Issue $330.00 $660.00

4.00 2021-03-08 Prepare and File Energy Probe Arg on Unsettled Issue $330.00 $1,320.00

32.0 Total $10,560.00

SubTotal  $10,560.00

$0.00

  Cash Taxes  HST $1,372.80

  Cheque PST

Other TOTAL  $11,932.80

Name     

Date

HST NUMBER 88413 6714 RT0001

Thank you for your Business

Description Of Services

CHEQUES PAYABLE TO SPA

SPA 
15 Malabar Place
Don Mills, Toronto, Ontario  M3B 1A4
(416) 391-0738 fax (416) 391-0738

INVOICE

Payment Details

Customer
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