

BY EMAIL and RESS

Jay Shepherd jay@shepherdrubenstein.com Direct: 416-804-2767

June 14, 2021 Our File No. 20150245

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Attn: Christine Long, Registrar

Dear Ms. Long;

Re: EB-2015-0245 - DSM Framework - SEC Cost Claim

We are counsel for the School Energy Coalition. We enclose the cost claim of the School Energy Coalition for the period October 15, 2019 to May 27, 2021, on the Board's form and enclosing docket details.

SEC counsel Jay Shepherd attended all but three of the EAC meetings. For the three he missed, we have included only prep time, as his views were expressed by email in each case. SEC has not claimed 31.2 hours of Mr. Shepherd's time that exceeded the Board's limits for this work.

All of which is respectfully submitted.

Yours very truly,

SHEPHERD RUBENSTEIN PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION

Jay Shepherd

cc: Wayne McNally, SEC (email)

Interested Parties

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

the Amadvit portion is signed	and sworm or ar	minica.				
		Instru	uctions			
- Required data input is indicatine cost claim.	ated by yellow-sh	naded fields. Formu	ılas are present in the docu	ument to assist v	vith the calc	ulation of
- All claims must be in Canadi	an dollars. If ap	plicable, state exch	ange rate and country of i	nitial currency.		
		Rate:		Country:		
 A separate "Statement of Di However only one "Statemen Being Claimed" covering the vertical The cost claim must be supper A CV for each consultant must within the last 24 months. Except as provided in section 	t of Fees Being C whole of the part ported by a comp ast be attached u	Claimed" and one "S ty's cost claim shou Dleted Affidavit sign Inless, for a given co	Summary of Fees and Disbuild be provided. The death of t	ursements the party. rovided to the B	oard in anot	-
File # EB- 2015-0245			Process: Evaluation A	dvisory Comm	nittee	
Party: School Energy (Coalition		Affiant's Name:	Mark Rubenst	ein	
HST Number: <u>83673-54</u>	64-RT0001		HST	Rate Ontario:	13.0%	
F	ull Registrant	V	Qualifvin	ng Non-Profit		
	Inregistered		,	Tax Exempt		
	Other					
		Affi	davit			
I, N	lark Rubenste	ein	, of the City/Town of	7	Toronto	
in the Province/State of				, swear or aff	irm that:	
1. I am a representative of the 2. I have examined all of the consistence of the construction of the construction of the construction of the construction of the contact of	documentation in I", "Statement of Fees and Disbur I" include only co ocess referred to	n support of this co f Fees Being Claime rsements Being Clai osts incurred and tin above.	ost claim, including the atta d" and "Statement(s) of Di med", "Statement of Fees me spent directly for the p	sched "Summary sbursements Be Being Claimed" a surposes of the P	of Fees and ing Claimed' and "Statem arty's partic	l ". eent(s) of cipation in
4. This cost claim does not incas described in sections 6.05				is an employee	or officer of	the Party
as described iii sections 6.05 (anu o.os or the E	ovalu S ridelice Diff	ection on cost Awards.			
Signature of Affiant						
Sworn or affirmed before	r e me at the C	City/Town of	Toronto		,	
in the Province/State of		Ontario	, on	June 14,	2021	

(date)

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements



Commissioner for taking Affidavits

File # EB- 2015-0245 Process: Evaluation Advisory Committee

Party: School Energy Coalition

Summary of Fees and Disburs

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed Legal/consultant fees \$25,245.00 Disbursements \$0.00 HST \$3,281.85 Total Cost Claim \$28,526.85

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Shepherd Rubenstein Professional Corporation in trust

Send payment to this address: 2200 Yonge Street

Suite 1302

Toronto, Ontario

M4S2C6

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activity is found on the third tab of this workbook.

Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the fourth tab of this workbook.

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed

Name:	Jay Shepherd		Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practicing/Years of Relevant Experience
Counse	//Articling Student/Paralegal:	✓	1980		41
				•	
	Analyst/Consultant:				
	CV attached:		CV not required:	V	
Name:					
			Year Called to Bar	-	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
Counse	//Articling Student/Paralegal:				
	Analyst/Consultant:		<u> </u>		
	CV attached:		CV not required:	_	
Name:					
			Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
Counse	I/Articling Student/Paralegal:				
	Analyst/Consultant:				
	CV attached:		CV not required:		
Name:					
Counse	l/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant:		Year Called to Bar	į	Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
	CV attached:		CV not required:		
Name:					
Counse	I/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached:		Year Called to Bar CV not required:		Completed Years Practicing/Years of relevant experience
	cv attached:	_	ev not required:		

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS

File # EB- 2015-0245

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Process Evaluation Advisory Committee

Party School Energy Coalition

HST Rate: 13%

Individual Whose Fees are Being Claimed

Hourly Rate

‡	Activity	Date	Maximum Hours
	1 EAC Call - 2018 AV: Draft Results - non-custom savings metrics	October 16, 2019	4.0
	2 2017/18 CPSV/FR - Baseline and NTG Prep	October 18, 2019	3.0
	3 EAC Call - CPSV Baseline Discussion	October 23, 2019	3.0
	4 2019 CPSV Scope of Work - comment	November 8, 2019	1.0
	5 2019 - Additional Evaluation Activities - comment	November 13, 2019	1.0
	6 EAC Call - AV - Non-Savings Metrics (2018)	November 13, 2019	3.0
	7 2018 Draft TRM Updates - comments	December 1, 2019	1.0
	8 EAC Call - AV - DSMSI & LRAM Calculators (2018)	December 4, 2019	1.5
	9 2017-2018 Draft CPSV Report - comment	January 16, 2020	4.0
	10 2018 Draft Free Ridership Report - comment	January 16, 2020	4.0
	11 Procurement Process - 2019 Custom Program Savings Verification - (Kesik-only)	January 20, 2020	4.0
	12 EAC In-person Meeting - 2017 & 2018 Results and Reporting Discussion (including prep)	January 28, 2020	13.0
	13 2017 & 2018 Annual Verification Report - comment	February 20, 2020	2.0
	14 2017-2017 Custom Evaluation Executive Summary - comment	February 28, 2020	1.0
	15 2017-2018 Final CPSV Report and 2018 Final Free Ridership Report - comment	February 28, 2020	3.0
-	16 EAC Call - Final 2017/2018 AV Reports Review & Discussion	March 4, 2020	4.5
	17 EAC Call - 2019 Evaluation Options Discussion & Potential COVID-19 Impacts	April 9, 2020	2.0
	18 EAC Call - 2017/2018 Evaluation Post-Mortem	April 22, 2020	2.5

Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS

21 2019 DSM Evaluation - CPSV Adjustments - comment July 27, 2020 0.5 22 2019 TRM Workplan - comment August 10, 2020 0.5 23 Evaluation Calculator - DSMSI, LRAMVA, Cost Effectiveness - comment August 31, 2020 2.6 24 EAC Call - eTools Walkthrough September 1, 2020 3.6 25 2019 Draft TRM Updates - comment September 30, 2020 1.6 26 2020-2021 EM&V Plan Update - comments October 12, 2020 2.5 27 2019 Annual Verification Report - comments November 6, 2020 3.6 28 eTools Study Launch - comments November 10, 2020 2.6 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 3.6 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 2.5 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment January 11, 2021 1.6 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work February 5, 2021 2.6 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 2.6 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments March 11, 2021 1.5 35 <	19	EAC Call - 2020-21 EMV Activities Discussion	July 7, 2020	2.0
22 2019 TRM Workplan - comment August 10, 2020 0.5 23 Evaluation Calculator - DSMSI, LRAMVA, Cost Effectiveness - comment August 31, 2020 2.6 2.7 2.8 EAC Call - eTools Walkthrough September 1, 2020 2.7 2.9 EAC Call - eTools Walkthrough Cotober 12, 2020 2.9 2.9 Eac Call - 2020 EM&V Plan Update - comments November 6, 2020 2.9 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 10, 2020 2.9 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 3.0 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 3.1 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment January 11, 2021 3.2 eTools Study - Scope of Work Ebruary 5, 2021 3.3 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 3.4 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments March 11, 2021 3.5 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 3.6 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 3.6 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion May 7, 2021 3.6 May 7, 2021 3.7 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.6 May 7, 2021 3.7 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.6 May 7, 2021 3.6 May 7, 2021 3.7 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.6 May 7, 2021 3.7 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.8 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference May 7, 2021 3.8 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference May 7, 2021 3.9 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference May 7, 2021 3.0 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion May 7, 2021 3.0 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion May 7, 2021 3.0 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion	20	2019 AV Scope of Work - comment	July 7, 2020	1.5
23 Evaluation Calculator - DSMSI, LRAMVA, Cost Effectiveness - comment 24 EAC Call - eTools Walkthrough 25 2019 Draft TRM Updates - comment 26 2020-2021 EM&V Plan Update - comments 27 2019 Annual Verification Report - comments 28 eTools Study Launch - comments 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 10, 2020 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comment 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comment 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work 45 Eebruary 5, 2021 36 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion 56 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference 46 April 12, 2021 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 38 EAC Call - ETools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 38 EAC Call - ETOOLS Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 39 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 30 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 31 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 31 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 31 EAC Neeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion	21	2019 DSM Evaluation - CPSV Adjustments - comment	July 27, 2020	0.5
24 EAC Call - eTools Walkthrough September 1, 2020 3.0 25 2019 Draft TRM Updates - comment September 30, 2020 1.0 26 2020-2021 EM&V Plan Update - comments October 12, 2020 2.3 27 2019 Annual Verification Report - comments November 6, 2020 3.0 28 eTools Study Launch - comments November 10, 2020 2.0 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 3.0 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 2.5 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment January 11, 2021 1.0 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work February 5, 2021 2.0 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 2.0 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments March 11, 2021 1.5 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 2.0 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 2.0 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.0	22	2019 TRM Workplan - comment	August 10, 2020	0.5
25 2019 Draft TRM Updates - comment September 30, 2020 1.0	23	Evaluation Calculator - DSMSI, LRAMVA, Cost Effectiveness - comment	August 31, 2020	2.0
26 2020-2021 EM&V Plan Update - comments October 12, 2020 2.5 27 2019 Annual Verification Report - comments November 6, 2020 3.6 28 eTools Study Launch - comments November 10, 2020 2.6 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 3.6 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 2.5 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment January 11, 2021 1.6 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work February 5, 2021 2.6 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 2.6 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments March 11, 2021 1.5 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 2.6 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 2.6 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.6	24	EAC Call - eTools Walkthrough	September 1, 2020	3.0
27 2019 Annual Verification Report - comments 28 eTools Study Launch - comments November 10, 2020 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment January 11, 2021 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work February 5, 2021 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 April 15, 2021 20 April 15, 2021 30 April 20	25	2019 Draft TRM Updates - comment	September 30, 2020	1.0
28 eTools Study Launch - comments 29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 10, 2020 30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work February 5, 2021 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments March 11, 2021 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 36 April 15, 2021 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 36.	26	2020-2021 EM&V Plan Update - comments	October 12, 2020	2.5
29 EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments November 16, 2020 3.0 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments December 16, 2020 2.5 January 11, 2021 3.6 EAC Call - eTools Study - Scope of Work Below Endows Study - Scope of Work Eebruary 5, 2021 3.6 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 3.7 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.6 May 7, 2021 3.7 Section Study - Scope of Work - comment November 16, 2020 2.5 January 11, 2021 1.6 January 11, 2021 1.7 January 11, 2021 2.6 March 11, 2021 2.7 January 11, 2021 2.8 January 12, 2021 2.9 January 13, 2021 2.0 January 14, 2021 3.0 January 15, 2021 3.0 January 17, 2021 3.0 January	27	2019 Annual Verification Report - comments	November 6, 2020	3.0
30 IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments 31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 2.0 3.1 3.2 3.3 3.4 3.5 3.5 3.6 3.7 3.7 3.7 3.7 3.7 3.8 3.9 3.9 3.9 3.9 3.9 3.9 3.9	28	eTools Study Launch - comments	November 10, 2020	2.0
31 2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment 32 eTools Study - Scope of Work 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment 31 January 11, 2021 20 EED Tanuary 5, 2021 20 April 12, 2021 20 April 12, 2021 20 April 15, 2021 20 April 15, 2021 31 April 15, 2021 32 April 15, 2021 33 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment	29	EAC Call - 2019 AV Results - Comments	November 16, 2020	3.0
32 eTools Study - Scope of Work 33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment 38 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference 39 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 30 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 30 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 31 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 32 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 39 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 40 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 40 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 40 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion	30	IESO EM&V Protocols Update - comments	December 16, 2020	2.5
33 EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion February 24, 2021 2.0 34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments March 11, 2021 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 2.0 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.0	31	2019 AV Post Mortem Questionnaire - comment	January 11, 2021	1.0
34 eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments 35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment April 15, 2021 May 7, 2021 3.0	32	eTools Study - Scope of Work	February 5, 2021	2.0
35 EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference April 12, 2021 2.0 36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 2.0 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.0	33	EAC Call - eTools Study Scope of Work Discussion	February 24, 2021	2.0
36 EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion April 15, 2021 2.0 37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.0	34	eTools Scope of Work Updates - comments	March 11, 2021	1.5
37 2020 AV Scope of Work - comment May 7, 2021 3.0	35	EAC Call - EAC Terms of Reference	April 12, 2021	2.0
37 2020 AV Scope of Work Comment	36	EAC Meeting - eTools Billing Analysis Discussion	April 15, 2021	2.0
38 FAC Meeting - eTools Calculator Discussion May 27, 2021 4.0	37	2020 AV Scope of Work - comment	May 7, 2021	3.0
So Exermised Cross edicates biseassion	38	EAC Meeting - eTools Calculator Discussion	May 27, 2021	4.0

Subtotal HST Total

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed



Jay Shepherd	
\$	330.00

Hours Claimed	
-	
3.	0
3.	0
1.	0
1.	0
1.	2
1.	0
-	
4.	0
4.	0
-	
13.	0.
2.	0
1.	0
3.	0
-	
2.	0
2.	5

3 of 17 Statement of Fees





2.0
1.5
0.5
0.5
2.0
2.3
1.0
2.5
3.0
2.0
3.0
2.5
0.2
1.3
1.5
-
2.0
-
3.0
4.0
\$25,245.00
\$3,281.85
\$28,526.85

4 of 17 Statement of Fees

Date	Explanation	Lwyr	Hours
20191015	Many emails, Research re NTG vs. baseline	JCS	1.0
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
20191017	Many emails	JCS	0.1
20191018	Many emails	JCS	0.1
20191019	Outline of Memo re baseline vs. NTG	JCS	1.0
20191023	Review slides, Many emails, Report on research, Attend at meeting	JCS	3.5
20191024	Many lengthy emails re baseline vs. NTG	JCS	1.2
20191029	Many emails and scheduling	JCS	0.1
20191103	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20191104	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20191105	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20191107	Various emails	JCS	0.2
20191112	Prep for meeting	JCS	0.6
20191113	EAC Meeting	JCS	1.2
20191115	Many emails, Review SEM materials	JCS	0.3
20191118	Many emails	JCS	0.1
20191119	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20191129	Review Enbridge comments	JCS	0.1
	Review new materials	JCS	0.2
20191203	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20191204	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Many emails, Review various evaluation ideas	JCS	0.4
	Many emails	JCS	0.2
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	First review of CPSV report	JCS	0.3
	First review of FR report, Various emails	JCS	0.4
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Review CPSV and FR Reports, Notes and analysis	JCS	1.0
	Review CPSV and FR Reports, Notes and analysis	JCS	4.5
	Report/comments on CPSV and FR Reports	JCS	4.1
	Many emails, Scheduling	JCS	0.2
	Various emails	JCS	0.6
	Various emails, Review Ted's comments	JCS	0.6
	Many emails, Review reports	JCS	0.2
	Review comments of others	JCS	0.4
	Review comments of others	JCS	0.7
	Review reports	JCS	1.5
	Review reports	JCS	1.5
	Many emails, Review reports and draft comments, Review EMV priorities, Reivew	JCS	2.0
_0200124	comments of others		2.0
20200125	Complete review and provide comments on reports	JCS	3.3
	Prep for meeting	JCS	1.6
	Prep, Attend meeting (in person), Many emails	JCS	7.0
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Review comment matrix and revised reports	JCS	1.7

20200220	Many emails	JCS	0.4
	·	JCS	ł
	Many emails, Review single project impacts Various emails		0.8
		JCS	0.1
	Many emails	JCS JCS	0.3
	Review annual verification reports, Many emails		2.0
	Comments on annual verification reports, Many emails	JCS	4.6
	Review summary, Review comments of others, Many emails	JCS	1.1
	Many emails, Review revisions	JCS	1.0
	Many emails	JCS	0.3
	Many emails	JCS	0.3
	Many emails	JCS	0.2
	Many emails	JCS	0.3
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Many emails	JCS	0.3
	Many emails	JCS	0.4
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	Various emails	JCS	0.2
	Many emails, Review questionnaire, Review material provided	JCS	1.1
	Prep for meeting, Meeting re Rolling Study and COVID-19, Many emails	JCS	2.5
	Many emails	JCS	0.2
	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20200415	Review comments from Chris and Ted, Many emails, Respond to post-mortem	JCS	1.6
	questionnaire		
	Review Enbridge comments	JCS	0.3
	Various emails	JCS	0.2
20200421	Prep for meeting	JCS	1.3
	Post mortem meeting and prep	JCS	1.1
	Email request to Sustainable Schools	JCS	0.4
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20200504	Various emails	JCS	0.2
	Various emails	JCS	0.2
20200620	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20200622	Review work plan and comments of others, Draft and file comments, Many emails	JCS	2.3
20200626	Review EGI comments, Many emails and scheduling	JCS	0.6
20200707	Conference call re 2019/20 plan, Many emails	JCS	1.0
20200708	Provide further comments, Many emails	JCS	0.6
20200720	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20200721	Review status and timelines	JCS	0.1
20200722	Review draft TRM workplan	JCS	0.4
20200725	Review Ted's comments	JCS	0.2
20200727	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20200731	Review EC materials, Review comments of others, Many emails	JCS	1.0
	Review EC responses, Various emails	JCS	0.2
	Review final workplan and responses, Various emails	JCS	0.6
	Many eamils, Review etools materials	JCS	0.3
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Prep for meeting	JCS	0.8

20200901	Meeting re boiler tools, Many emails	JCS	1.5
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	Review new material	JCS	1.5
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Review updates, Review spreadsheets, Various emails	JCS	0.6
	Many emails, Review comments of others	JCS	0.4
	Review additional materials, Many emails	JCS	0.4
	Review 2020 workplan	JCS	1.3
	Many emails, Review Neme comments	JCS	0.3
	Review Bob's comments, Comments on evaluation plan and general issue, Many emails	JCS	0.3
	Various emails	JCS	
		JCS	0.1
	Review draft 2019 report		0.4
	Review draft 2019 report, Many emails	JCS	3.7
	Review new Enbridge material	JCS	0.3
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	Draft comments on draft report, Various emails	JCS	0.4
	Review report	JCS	1.7
	Complete analysis and provide comments, Many emails	JCS	1.5
	Review Staff and EGI comments	JCS	0.4
	Review Chris' comments	JCS	0.3
	Review materials on boiler study, Analysis and comments, Many emails	JCS	1.1
	Review TRM material, and various emails	JCS	0.3
	Prep for meeting	JCS	0.8
20201116		JCS	1.5
	Many emails	JCS	0.2
	Various emails, Review comments table	JCS	0.3
20201202	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20201203	Check final report	JCS	0.2
20201204	Various emails, Review IESO EM&V protocols (initial look)	JCS	0.4
	Review Bob's comments	JCS	0.1
20201213	Review IESO protocols	JCS	1.0
20201216	Review IESO protocols, Review EGI comments, Finalize and circulate IESO comments	JCS	2.1
20201218	Review Ted's comments, Various emails	JCS	0.1
20210111	Review questionnaire	JCS	0.1
20210116	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20210119	Various emails	JCS	0.1
20210206	Review boiler tools scope of work and provide comments	JCS	1.1
20210220	Review EGI and Neme comments	JCS	0.3
20210224	Review slides, Attend at meeting, Many emails	JCS	1.2
20210316	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20210326	Various emails and scheduling	JCS	0.1
	Many emails, Scheduling, Review Enbridge draft of ToR	JCS	0.7
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
	Various emails	JCS	0.1
	Prep for meeting	JCS	0.7
	Attend at meeting, Many emails	JCS	1.1
	Many emails	JCS	0.1
,	i - ,		J
	Review 2020 scope of work	JCS	0.5

20210512	Many emails	JCS	0.1
20210514	Many emails	JCS	0.2
20210517	Many emails, Scheduling	JCS	0.1
20210526	Review emails, Review memo and graphs, Prep for meeting	JCS	0.0
20210527	Attentd at e-Tools meeting	JCS	2.0
			108.1