



Ms. Christine Long Board Registrar Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

August 13, 2021

Re: EB-2020-0091 Enbridge Gas Integrated Resource Planning Pollution Probe Cost Claim

Dear Ms. Long:

In accordance with the OEB Decision and Order dated July 22, 2021 for the above-noted proceeding, please find attached Pollution Probe's Costs Claim. Please note that the Presentation Day that the OEB held is recorded as "Other Conferences". Please reach the undersigned should you have any questions.

Respectfully submitted on behalf of Pollution Probe.

Michael Brophy, P.Eng., M.Eng., MBA

Michael Brophy Consulting Inc. Consultant to Pollution Probe

Phone: 647-330-1217

Email: Michael.brophy@rogers.com

cc: Enbridge (via EGIRegulatoryProceedings@enbridge.com)

Richard Carlson, Pollution Probe (via email)

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			lı	nstructions		
- All claims m - A separate Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	nust be in Canadiar "Detail of Fees and its Being Claimed") ly one "Summary of im must be suppo ch consultant/anal	Disbursements Being is required for each last fees and Disbursem rted by a completed A yst must be attached in	e, state ex Rate: Claimed awyer, ar ents" cov ffidavit s unless pr	rmulas are embedded in the xchange rate and country of the comprising a "Statement analyst/consultant and articlivering the whole of the partigned by a representative of the Board as presented to the Board as presented in the	of initial currency Country: of Fees Being Cl ing student/para ty's cost claim sh of the party. scribed on the Co	laimed" and a "Statement of alegal. nould be provided. ost Award Tariff.
File # EB-	2020-0091			Process: Enbridge Gas	s IRP	
Party:	rty: Pollution Probe			Affiant's Name:	Michael Broph	у
HST Numbe	er: <u>10809270</u>	1 RT0001		HST I	Rate Ontario:	13.00%
		ull Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit Tax Exempt	CI CI
				Affidavit		A Alberta de la Caractería de la Caracte
1,	Mi	chael Brophy		, of the City/Town of		Toronto
in the Prov	vince/State of	Ontai			, swear or affi	rm that:
 I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed". The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. 						
11	Ul X		>			
Signature of Affiant						
	- / -	me at the City/To	michigan and a second	Toro	onto	,
in the Prov	rince/State of	Onta	ario	, on	July 3 (date)	0,2021

NICKY N.F. HOR

Page 1 of 2

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2020-0091			Process: Enbridge Gas IRP					
Party:	Pollution Probe			Service P	rovider Name:	Michael Brophy			
				Year Called to		Completed Years	Practising/Years		
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check	one)	Bar		of Relevant Experience			
	Legal Counsel					2	7		
	Articling Student/Paralegal					_			
	Consultant		V			Hourly Rate:	\$330		
	Analyst					_	_		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		/ attac	ched	HST Rate Cl	narged (enter %):	13.0%		
		V	/ prov	ided within previo	us 24 months				

Statement of Fees Being Claimed									
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation	8.50	\$	330.00	\$	2,805.00	\$	364.65	\$	3,169.65
Attendance	18.00	\$	330.00	\$	5,940.00	\$	772.20	\$	6,712.20
Interrogatories									
Preparation	31.25	\$	330.00	\$	10,312.50	\$	1,340.63	\$	11,653.13
Responses	17.00	\$	330.00	\$	5,610.00	\$	729.30	\$	6,339.30
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument									
Preparation	24.00	\$	330.00	\$	7,920.00	\$	1,029.60	\$	8,949.60
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	68.00	\$	330.00	\$	22,440.00	\$	2,917.20	\$	25,357.20
Attendance	24.50	\$	330.00	\$	8,085.00	\$	1,051.05	\$	9,136.05
Other Conferences	_								
Preparation	13.50	\$	330.00	\$	4,455.00	\$	579.15	\$	5,034.15
Attendance	6.50	\$	330.00	\$	2,145.00	\$	278.85	\$	2,423.85
Case Management				\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	69,712.50	\$	9,062.63	\$	78,775.13

Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.



28 MacNaughton Road DATE: July 28, 2021
Toronto, Ontario, M4G 3H4 INVOICE # OEB-15-2021
Phone 647-330-1217 email: michael.brophy@rogers.com FOR: EB-2020-0091
EGI Gas IRP

Bill To:

Richard Carlson Director Energy Policy Polution Probe 150 Ferrand Drive Toronto, Ontario M3C 3E5

DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
Consulting - OEB EB-2020-0091 Enbridge Gas IRP Proceeding	69,712.50
Detailed timesheet for Michael Brophy attached	
Total: 211.25 hours @ \$330 per hour	
HST (HST #: 75225 9333 RT0001)	9,062.63
TOTAL	\$ 78,775.13

Make all cheques payable to Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.

If you have any questions concerning this invoice, contact: Michael Brophy, President, Michael Brophy Consulting Inc. Phone: 647-330-1217, email: michael.brophy@rogers.com

Business Number: 75225 9333

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!

Date	hours	description
5/29/2020	1.50	Review draft issues list, evidence and correspondence with R. Carlson (Pollution Probe), Clean Air Partnership and Clean Air Alliance.
6/4/2020	4.00	Review EB-2019-0159 evidence, update draft submission and circulate for comments to R. Carlson
6/1/2020		(Pollution Probe), Clean Air Partnership and Clean Air Alliance, ED, GEC.
6/3/2020 6/10/2020		Finalise and file submission on draft issues list Review submissions on draft issues list and prepare draft response.
6/11/2020		Finalise repsonse and file
6/12/2020		•
8/3/2020		Review ICF Report
8/4/2020		Review IRP evidence against OEB Staff and Enbridge evidence outline. Prepare and file letter.
11/1/2020		Review Enbridge supplementary evidence
11/5/2020		Review Enbridge supplemental evidence, correspondence with R. Carlson, related stakeholders and
		draft letter to OEB
11/9/2020	0.50	Complete OEB letter of comment and file
11/13/2020	0.75	IRP best practices discussion with IESO
11/19/2020	1.00	IESO correspondence and review of IRP best practice documentation
11/20/2020		Pollution Probe feedback from Enbridge on OEB letter
11/29/2020	5.00	Review OEB Staff evidecne. Review GEC evidence. Correspondence with Enbridge. Correspondence with
		Pollution Probe. Draft clarification letter.
		Issues and Reply Evidence discussion between Enbridge and Pollution Probe
12/18/2020		Review evidence filed and best practices to file
12/28/2020		Review evidence and draft Irs
12/30/2020		Correspondence with Pollution Probe. Prepare and file letter of comment
12/30/2020 1/2/2021		Review evidence, draft presentation outline, draft comment letter and file with OEB Research and collect best practice materials
1/4/2021		Research and collect best practice materials
1/5/2021		Consolidate best practice materials for IR reference
1/9/2021		Review Evidence and prepare draft Enbridge IRs
1/10/2021		Review Evidence and prepare draft OEB and GEC-ED IRs
1/11/2021		Review Evidence and draft IRs. Correspondence with R. Carlson
1/12/2021		Finalise IRs and file
1/31/2021		Draft presentation outline, link to evidence and key issues, correspondence with R. Carlson
2/5/2021		Attend Test Run for Technical Conference
2/5/2021	6.00	Review IR responses
2/6/2021	5.00	Review IR responses
2/7/2021	6.00	Review IR responses
2/8/2021		Complete Technical Conference list and submit
2/10/2021		Technical Conference Day 1
2/10/2021		Review transcript and prep for day 2
2/11/2021		Technical Conference Day 2
2/11/2021		Draft Presentation and correspondence
		Review transcript and prep for day 3
2/12/2021 2/14/2021		Technical Conference Day 3 Review transcripts
		Presentation development and preparation
2/18/2021		Complete presentation and file
2/19/2021		Preparation for presentation
2/19/2021		Attend OEB presentation day and present
2/20/2021	3.50	Review transcript and materials for oral hearing
2/26/2021	4.50	Review materials and prep for oral heaing
2/27/2021	6.00	Review materials and prep for oral heaing
2/28/2021	5.00	Review materials and prep for oral heaing
3/1/2021	6.50	Oral Hearing - Day 1
3/1/2021		review transcript and prep for day 2
3/2/2021		Oral Hearing - Day 2
3/3/2021		review transcript and prep for day 3
3/3/2021		Oral Hearing - Day 3
3/3/2021		review transcript and prep for day 4
3/4/2021		Oral Hearing - Day 4
3/5/2021 3/26/2021		review transcript
3/26/2021 3/27/2021		Review Enbridge argument, undertakings and prep argument outline Review evidence and draft argument
3/28/2021		Draft Argument and correspondence with stakeholders.
3/31/2021		Finalise Argument, correspondence with R. Carlson, municipalities/CAP and file
, - ,		e de la companya de l