

Environment Indigenous Energy Law

Direct Dial: File: 416.862.4827 7978

Sent by Email and RESS Filing

August 26, 2021

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27th Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Christine Long, Board Registrar

Dear Ms. Long:

Re: Board File No. EB-2020-0091 – Enbridge Gas Inc.'s IRP Proposal Ontario Sustainable Energy Association's ("OSEA") Cost Claim

Please find enclosed the Ontario Sustainable Energy Association's cost claim pursuant to Ontario Energy Board's Decision and Order dated July 22, 2021, in the above-noted matter.

Yours truly,

Raeya Jadi

Raeya Jackiw

cc: Dan Goldberger, OSEA Travis Lusney, Power Advisory LLC

Document #: 2007059

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP - Toronto – willmsshier.com

Toronto Yellowknife Calgary Ottawa

1 Toronto Street, Suite 900, Toronto, ON, Canada M5C 2V6 | Tel: 416.863.0711 | Fax: 416.863.1938



Country:

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.

- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate:

- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.

However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.

- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.

- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

File # EB-	2020-0091		Process: EGI Integrated Resource Planning Pro	posal
	Ontario Sustainable Energy Ass	ociation	Affiant's Name: Joanna Vince	
HST Numb	er: 113627988RT0001		HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%	
	Full Registrant		Qualifying Non-Profit	
	Unregistered		Tax Exempt	
	Other			

Affidavit

l,	Joanna Vince	, of the City/Town of	Oakville
in the Province/State o	f Ontario		, swear or affirm that:

1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.

2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".

3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontarlo Energy Board process referred to above.

4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

gnature of Affiant

Sworn or affirmed before me a	t the City/Town of	Oakville (virtually sworn)	,
in the Province/State of	Ontario	, on	August 26, 2021	
			(date)	Constants of

Commissioner for taking Affidavits Joseph King Yue Ng, a Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario, for Willms & Shler Environmental Lawyers LLP Expires October 29, 2022

Page 1 of 10



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2020-0091

Process: EGI Integrated Resource Planning Proposal

Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Party:

	Summary of Fee	s and Disbursem	ents Being Claimed
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	29,090.00	
Disbursements	\$	-	
HST	\$	3,781.70	
Total Cost Claim	\$	32,871.70	

	Payment Information	
Make cheque payable to:	Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP	
Send payment to this address:	1 Toronto Street, Suite 900 Toronto, ON M5C 2V6	

Г



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2020-0091			Process:	EGI	Integrated	Res	source Plan	ning	Proposal
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciation		Service P	rovi	ider Name:	Ra	eya Jackiw		
				-			Complet	ed Ve	
		Yea	r Called to			F	Practising/Yea		
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)		Bar				Exper		
Legal Counsel	\checkmark		2018				3	3	
Articling Student/Paralegal									
Consultant							Hourly Rate:		<mark>\$170</mark>
Analyst									
For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	hed			HST Rate Ch	narg	ed (<i>enter %</i>):		<mark>13.0%</mark>
	CV prov	ided	within previo	us 2	4 months				
S	tatement c	of Fe	es Being	Cla	imed				
	Hours		urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference			-						
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation	1.40	\$	170.00	\$	238.00	\$	30.94	\$	268.94
Attendance	1.60	\$	170.00	\$	272.00	\$	35.36	\$	307.36
Interrogatories									
Preparation	14.70	\$	170.00	\$	2,499.00	\$	324.87	\$	2,823.87
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument									
Preparation	9.30	\$	170.00	\$	1,581.00	\$	205.53	\$	1,786.53
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	11.90		170.00	\$	2,023.00	\$	262.99	\$	2,285.99
Attendance	25.10	\$	170.00	\$	4,267.00	\$	554.71	\$	4,821.71
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management	2.20		170.00	\$	374.00	\$	48.62	\$	422.62
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	11,254.00	\$	1,463.02	\$	12,717.02



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2020-0091			Process:	EGI	Integrated	Res	ource Plan	ning	Proposal
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciation		Service P	rovi	ider Name:	Joa	nna Vince		
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel Articling Student/Paralegal Consultant	(check one)	Yea	ar Called to Bar 2011			P	Complet ractising/Yea Exper	irs of I ience <mark>0</mark>	
Analyst For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac		within provid			narge	ed (enter %):	1	L3.0%
			within previo						
	tatement o Hours		urly Rate		imed Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference	nours		any nate		Justotal				lotai
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference								-	
Preparation	1.30	\$	230.00	\$	299.00	\$	38.87	\$	337.87
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation	3.70	\$	230.00	\$	851.00	\$	110.63	\$	961.63
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument									
Preparation	0.60	\$	230.00	\$	138.00	\$	17.94	\$	155.94
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	2.60		230.00	\$	598.00	\$	77.74	\$	675.74
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Other Conferences		4	222.25	~				<i>.</i>	
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management			170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	1,886.00	\$	245.18	\$	2,131.18

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing To Jul/22/2021

Page: 1

Aug/ 0/2021	WIIIII a	Client	Fees	Listing				Idge. I
Date	Fee / Time	To Working	/	2/2021 er	Hours	Amount	Inv# Billin	na
	Explanation	Туре	-	-			-	
1341 7978	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association							
	Re: EB-2020-0091 Enbridge Gas Inc. IR Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbille	ed
2139917	review K. Lakatos-Hayward's comments on draft issues list;	Time						
Jun 1/2020	Lawyer: 72 0.80 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.80	136.00	Unbille	ed
2140809	review D. Goldberger's comments on OSEA's submissions on draft issues	Time						
	list, and reply to D. Goldberger and							
	K. Lakatos-Hayward; review and revise comments on draft issues list;							
	Lawyer: 72 1.80 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.80	306.00	Unbille	ed
2140821	review Enbridge's IRP proposal and issues list, and consider additional	Time						
	comments; review and revise OSEA							
	submissions on draft issues list; review email exchange between D.							
	Goldberger and K. Lakatos-Hayward re							
	issues to raise in IRP interrogatories; review comments on							
	draft issues list with J. Vince; finalize comments on draft issues list							
	and send to D. Goldberger and K.							
Jun 2/2020	Lakatos-Hayward for review; Lawyer: 48 0.40 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.40	92.00	Unbille	ed
	discuss additional issues to propose	Time						
Jun 3/2020	for inclusion in issues list; Lawyer: 72 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.50	85.00	Unbille	ed
2141422	review K. Lakatos-Hayward's comments on revised submissions, and further revise	Time						
	submissions; send revised submissions							
	to client seeking instructions to file; review emails between D.							
	Goldberger and K. Lakatos-Hayward re							
Jun 4/2020	AMI; Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbille	ed
2141755	follow up with client re instructions	Time						
	to send submissions on draft issues list; instruct I. Mansfield to							
	finalize submissions and cover letter and file on RESS; circulate							
	submissions to OEB counsel, Enbridge,							
Jun 8/2020	and intervenors; Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbille	ed
	reminder to client re deadline to	Time						
	comment on other intervenors' submissions on draft issues list;							
	Lawyer: 72 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 follow up with D. Goldberger re OSEA's	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.60	102.00	Unbille	ed
2110000	submissions on Enbridge's 2021 DSM	11						
	Plans; receive instructions from D. Goldberger to proceed with filing;							
	final review and revision of							
	submissions; instruct I. Mansfield to finalize submissions and file on RESS;							
Jul 16/2020	Lawyer: 72 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 review OEB Procedural Order 2 and	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.60	102.00	Unbille	ed
2149010	consider OSEA's next steps; instruct	1 Ille						
	I. Mansfield to diarize deadlines; prepare and send reporting email to							
	client, recommending that OSEA not							
	file evidence, and explaining how OEB addressed OSEA's points on the draft							
Tul 27/2020	issues list; Lawyer: 72 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.50	85.00	Unbille	-d
	review email chain from K.	Time	12	KABIA UACKIW	0.50	05.00	UIDIII	Lu
	Lakatos-Hayward re discussions with GEC, ED, and Pollution Probe about							
	filing of evidence; high-level review							
	of Enbridge IRP Study, and send IRP Study to D. Goldberger and K.							
Aug 4/2020	Lakatos-Hayward; Lawyer: 48 0.40 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.40	92.00	Unbille	ed
2151291	telephone call with K. Lakatos-Hayward	Time						
	to discuss filing evidence and approach to interrogatories, including							
	key issues for OSEA to highlight in IRP proceeding;							
	Lawyer: 72 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.50	85.00	Unbille	ed
2151338	review Procedural Order 3, and update client; call with K. Lakatos-Hayward	Time						
0-1 15/0000	and J. Vince re intervenor evidence;	70	7.0		0.00	24.00	- 1	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review and send Enbridge's additional	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbille	ea

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Page: 2

Aug/ 6/2021	Willms &			nmental Lawyers LLP 5 Listing			Pag	ge: 2
		То	Jul/2	2/2021				
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	Working Type	g Lawy	ver	Hours	Amount]	Inv# Billing	
Eliciy #	evidence to D. Goldberger and K.	туре						
	Lakatos-Hayward, seeking K.							
	Lakatos-Hayward's comments on same;	70	70		0 40	60.00	**	
	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review procedural orders to confirm	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	
	deadlines; review and respond to K.							
	Lakatos-Hayward's question re timing for submission of intervenor							
	interrogatories;							
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	
21//543	<pre>review Procedural Order 9 and consider next steps;</pre>	Time						
	Lawyer: 72 0.30 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.30	51.00	Unbilled	
21//9/4	draft and send reporting email to client re Procedural Order 7;	Time						
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	
2180539	follow up with client re OSEA representative for IRP proceeding, and	Time						
	with K. Lakatos-Hayward re comments on							
Jan 5/2021	Enbridge evidence; Lawyer: 48 0.50 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.50	115.00	Unbilled	
	emails and telephone calls re preparing	Time	10	UCANNA VINCE	0.50	115.00	onbrited	
	interrogatories, retaining PowerAdvisory and confirming							
	availability and deadlines;							
	Lawyer: 72 0.90 Hrs X 170.00	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.90	153.00	Unbilled	
2182973	draft email to T. Lusney setting out instructions for review of evidence	Time						
	and preparation of interrogatories;							
	review T. Lusney's CV and draft letter to OEB advising of OSEA's change of							
	technical representative; send letter							
Jan 6/2021	and draft email to J. Vince; Lawyer: 72 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.50	85.00	Unbilled	
	finalize letter to OEB re change of	Time	. –					
	OSEA's technical advisor, attaching T. Lusney's CV, and send to Board							
	Secretary; report to client;							
	Lawyer: 48 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 emails with T. Lusney about evidence	48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.20	46.00	Unbilled	
2103014	from Enbridge and OEB Staff and	TTILE						
T	potential IRs;	70			0 40	60.00	**.1.111.1	
	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review Procedural Orders and Enbridge	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	
	evidence in preparation for call with							
Jan 8/2021	T. Lusney; Lawyer: 48 1.00 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	1.00	230.00	Unbilled	
	telephone call with T. Lusney and R.	Time						
	Jackiw to discuss IR questions and issues for OSEA to focus on;							
	Lawyer: 72 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.00	170.00	Unbilled	
2184154	call with J. Vince to prepare for call with T. Lusney; call with T. Lusney to	Time						
	discuss OSEA IRs;							
	Lawyer: 72 4.20 Hrs X 170.00 review and revise T. Lusney's draft	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	4.20	714.00	Unbilled	
2104301	IRs; review Enbridge application,	TTILE						
	additional evidence, reply evidence,							
	and ICF study and draft additional IRs;							
	Lawyer: 48 1.20 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	1.20	276.00	Unbilled	
2184672	review, revise and discuss IRs; finalize IRs;	Time						
	Lawyer: 72 1.20 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.20	204.00	Unbilled	
2184690	send comments and questions on IRs to T. Lusney; review T. Lusney's	Time						
	responses to questions, further IRs,							
	and revisions; revise and finalize IRs; email from D. Goldberger							
	providing instructions to file IRs;							
	instruct S. Baksh to submit IRs on							
	RESS; circulate IRs to EB-2020-0091 distribution list; update D.							
Tan 06/0001	Goldberger;	70	70		0.00	24 00	Tabilled	
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review OEB update email re technical	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	
	conference and presentation day and							
Jan 27/2021	respond to T. Lusney's email re same; Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	
2187199	emails with T. Lusney (Power Advisory)	Time						
	re next steps in preparation of technical conference;							
	Lawyer: 48 0.60 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.60	138.00	Unbilled	
2188644	discuss presentation day and whether	Time						

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing To Jul/22/2021

			: Fees Jul/22	Listing 2/2021			
Date	Fee / Time	Working			Hours	Amount In	w# Billing
Entry #	Explanation	Туре					
	OSEA should provide a presentation; respond to C. Walter;						
	Lawyer: 48 0.70 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.70	161.00	Unbilled
2189383	determine potential questions for technical conference; inform Board of	Time					
- 1 0 (0000	questions for technical conference;	= 0	= 0			=1 00	
Feb 8/2021 2190620	Lawyer: 72 0.30 Hrs X 170.00 emails with T. Lusney confirming panels	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.30	51.00	Unbilled
	and timing for questioning at technical						
Feb 9/2021	conference; update OEB re same; Lawyer: 72 1.00 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.00	170.00	Unbilled
	review Enbridge's responses to OSEA's	Time					
	interrogatories; review OEB's instructions re technical conference						
	and draft schedule; correspond with T.						
Feb 10/2021	Lusney (Power Advisory) re same; Lawyer: 72 6.00 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	6.00	0.00	Unbilled
	[NO CHARGE T. Lusney attending	Time	72	idibili oficiti	0.00	0.00	ondrifed
	technical Conference]; attend OEB Technical Conference (Day 1) re						
	Enbridge's IRP Proposal;						
	Lawyer: 72 4.50 Hrs X 170.00 [NO CHARGE T. Lusney attending	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	4.50	0.00	Unbilled
2220304	technical conference]; attend OEB	TTING					
	Technical Conference (Day 2) re Enbridge's IRP Proposal;						
Feb 12/2021	Lawyer: 72 1.60 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.60	272.00	Unbilled
2191403	attend OEB Technical Conference (Day 3), ICF examination;	Time					
Feb 16/2021	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled
2191833	emails with T. Lusney and J. Vince re	Time					
	presentation day and preparation for oral hearing;						
	Lawyer: 72 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.50	85.00	Unbilled
2192232	call with T. Lusney and J. Vince to discuss strategy for hearing, and	Time					
	goals for OSEA's submissions and						
Feb 18/2021	questions; Lawyer: 48 0.40 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.40	92.00	Unbilled
2192309	discuss questions for hearing, position	Time					
Feb 23/2021	for OSEA and arguments; Lawyer: 72 2.20 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	2.20	374.00	Unbilled
	review email from OEB re public	Time					
	hearing, and review email from T. Lusney re subjects for questions at						
	hearing; review Transcripts from						
	Technical Conference, and Enbridge's responses to undertakings, and begin						
	drafting questions for hearing;						
	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 discuss questions and strategy for oral	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled
	hearing with J. Vince; update OEB on						
Feb 24/2021	estimates for questioning; Lawyer: 48 0.80 Hrs X 230.00	48	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.80	184.00	Unbilled
	review summary of points and issues	Time					
	from T. Lusney; discuss potential questions and time required for						
	questing at hearing;						
	Lawyer: 72 5.80 Hrs X 170.00 read full Presentation Day transcript;	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	5.80	986.00	Unbilled
2195171	review IRs, and Enbridge's most recent	TTINC					
	responses to undertakings from technical conferences; outline						
	evidence associated with key issues						
	for OSEA, and draft questions for hearing; send questions to T. Lusney						
	and J. Vince for comment;						
	Lawyer: 48 1.40 Hrs X 230.00 review draft questions; discuss draft	48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	1.40	322.00	Unbilled
2193770	questions for hearing and revise;	TTIME					
	Lawyer: 72 1.40 Hrs X 170.00 review J. Vince's comments on questions	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.40	238.00	Unbilled
2124035	for hearing; call with T. Lusney and J.	TTUC					
	Vince to review questions and prepare for hearing;						
Mar 1/2021	Lawyer: 72 7.80 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	7.80	1326.00	Unbilled
2194336	attend Day 1 of OEB Oral Hearing, and	Time					
	adjust questions for Witness Panel 2 based on discussion at hearing;						
	prepare speaking notes for						
Mar 2/2021	cross-examination; Lawyer: 72 5.90 Hrs X 170.00	72	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	5.90	1003.00	Unbilled
	attend Day 2 of Oral Hearing, and	Time					
	update examinations questions based on						

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing To Jul/22/2021

ate Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation		Fees Li Jul/22/2 Lawyer		Hours	Amount	Inv# Billing	J
• ···	discussion;	<u></u>						
	Lawyer: 72 5.60 Hrs X 170.00 attend Day 3 of Oral Hearing and cross-examine Enbridge Witness Panel 2; emails with D. Quinn from FRPO re OSEA's position;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	5.60	952.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 5.80 Hrs X 170.00 attend Day 4 of Oral Hearing; send update to T. Lusney;	72 Time	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	5.80	986.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review OEBPO 9, and update D. Goldberger and T. Lusney re same; instruct S. Baksh to diarize deadlines;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	1
2196382	Lawyer: 72 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 call with T. Lusney to discuss response to intervenors re OSEA's position; draft response and send to J. Vince;	72 Time		RAEYA JACKIW	0.80	136.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 send draft response to intervenor questions to T. Lusney;	72 Time	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review Energy Futures Group and Guidehouse responses to undertakings from hearing;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review T. Lusney's response, and send response to intervenor questions; review Enbridge's argument outline;	72 Time	72 – 1	RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 prepare outline of final submission;	72 Time	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	ł
lar 26/2021	Lawyer: 72 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 review Enbridge's Argument in Chief and begin drafting OSEA's submission;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	1.20	204.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 2.60 Hrs X 170.00 continue drafting final submission, including submissions re DR summary report and deployment of AMI;	72 Time	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	2.60	442.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 continue drafting final submission on IRP framework, including submission re consideration of interruptible rates as part of IRP Framework and impact of applying inflation to IRPA assets over pipeline lifetimes;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	1.60	272.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 48 0.60 Hrs X 230.00 review draft arguments;	48 Time	48 -	JOANNA VINCE	0.60	138.00	Unbilled	ł
	Lawyer: 72 1.40 Hrs X 170.00 finish drafting OSEA's final IRP submission, and inflation arguments; review and revise submission and send to J. Vince for review and comment; send draft submission to T. Lusney for review and comment;	72 Time	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	1.40	238.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 1.50 Hrs X 170.00 review T. Lusney's comments on submission, and further revise; send revised submission and questions to T. Lusney; further revise submission based on T. Lusney's comments, and send final draft to D. Goldberger for review; review D. Goldberger for review; review D. Goldberger's comments on submission, and email exchange with T. Lusney and D. Goldberger re same;	72 Time	72 - 3	RAEYA JACKIW	1.50	255.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 final review of IRP submission; instruct S. Baksh to file submission on RESS;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	1
	Lawyer: 72 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review Enbridge reply;	72 Time	72 -	RAEYA JACKIW	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	ł
ul 22/2021	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review OEB decision and costs order, and instruct S. Baksh to diarize deadlines and commence cost claim;	72 Time	72 - 1	RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	1
			Ре	Unbilled: Billed: Total: rcent Billed:	84.90 0.00 84.90 0.00	13140.00 0.00 13140.00 0.00		
	*** 5	Summary by	y Workin	g Lawyer ***				

Aug/ 6/2021

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Client Fees Listing To Jul/22/2021

						Jul/2						
Date Fee / 1						ng Lawy	er		Hours	Amou	int Inv#	Billing
Entry # Explana	ation				Туре							
48 - JOANNA VINC	8.20	9.66	0.00	100.00	8.20	0.00	1886.00	14.35	0.00	100.00	1886.00	0.00
72 - RAEYA JACKI	76.70	90.34	0.00	100.00	76.70	0.00	11254.00	85.65	0.00	100.00	11254.00	0.00
Firm Total	84.90	100.00	0.00	100.00	84.90	0.00	13140.00	100.00	0.00	100.00	13140.00	0.00
				*** 0	Summary b	y Respo	nsible Law	yer ***				
Responsible Lawyer	·			rs —		— I			Fees			
	nbilled		Billed		Total	% Bld	Unbilled		Billed		Total	% Bld
48 - JOANNA VINC		100.00		100.00	84.90	0.00	13140.00			100.00		0.00
Firm Total	84.90	100.00	0.00	100.00	84.90	0.00	13140.00	100.00	0.00	100.00	13140.00	0.00
REPORT SELECTIONS -	Client	Fees Lis	sting									
Layout Template			<u>-</u>	Def	ault(1)							
Advanced Search Filt	ter			Non								
Requested by				Lib	a (Secur	rity Res	trictions)					
Finished				Fri	day, Augi	ıst 06,	2021 at 09	:00:21 AM				
Ver				14.	1 (14.1.2	20150324	.)					
Date Range				То	Jul/22/2	2021						
Matters				797	8							
Clients				All								
Major Clients				All								
Client Intro Lawyer				All								
Matter Intro Lawyer				All								
Responsible Lawyer				All								
Assigned Lawyer				All								
Type of Law				All								
Select From						ctive, A	rchived Ma	tters				
Matters Sort by					ault							
New Page for Each La	awyer			No								
Firm Totals Only				No								
Client balances only	4			No								
Matter balances only		_		No								
Entries Shown - Bill Entries Shown - Unb	-			No								
Entries Shown - Ond. Entries Shown - Bill		alra		Yes								
Entries Shown - Writ				Yes								
			ò	Yes								
Entries Shown - No Charge Tasks Entries Shown - Non Billable Tasks			Yes									
Working Lawyer	DIIIADI	Le lasks		Yes All								
working nawyer				ALL								

_



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2020-0091			Process:	EGI	Integrated	Res	source Plan	ning	Proposal
Partu: Optario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciation		Sonvico D	rovi	ider Name:	Tra	wis Luspov		
Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Asso	ciution		Service P	rovi	der Name:		IVIS LUSITEY		
							Complet		
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year	r Called to Bar			F	Practising/Yea		
			Dai	1			Exper	ience	
Legal Counsel									
Articling Student/Paralegal	~						Llaurek - Datas		¢200
Consultant							Hourly Rate:		\$290
Analyst									12.00/
For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac					arg	ed (<i>enter %</i>):		<mark>13.0%</mark>
		ided w	vithin previc	us 2	4 months				
Si	tatement o					1		[
	Hours	Ηοι	urly Rate		Subtotal		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation	4.50	\$	290.00	\$	1,305.00	\$	169.65	\$	1,474.65
Attendance	14.00	\$	290.00	\$	4,060.00	\$	527.80	\$	4,587.80
Interrogatories									
Preparation	20.25	\$	290.00	\$	5,872.50	\$	763.43	\$	6,635.93
Responses	1.25	\$	290.00	\$	362.50	\$	47.13	\$	409.63
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument									
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Oral Hearing									
Preparation	15.00	\$	290.00	\$	4,350.00	\$	565.50	\$	4,915.50
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management			170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	15,950.00	\$	2,073.50	\$	18,023.50

Power Advisory LLC 55 University Avenue, Suite 605, PO Box 32 Toronto, ON M5J 2H7



Ontario Sustainability Energy Association Dan Goldberger

720 Bathurst St, 3rd FL Toronto, Ontario M5S 2R4

Invoice 210386

Date	Apr 06, 2021				
Terms	N/A				
Service Thru	Mar 31, 2021				

In Reference To: OEB Regulatory Support (Labor)

Provide regulatory consulting support for Ontario Energy Board proceedings in 2021

Date	Ву	Services	Hours	Rates	Amount
01/07/2021	TL	Review EGI IRP submissions	2.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 725.00
01/08/2021	TL	Review EGI submissions for IRP. Call with Joanne and Raeya	3.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 870.00
01/09/2021	TL	Review EGI submissions for IRP.	6.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,885.00
01/11/2021	TL	Reviewing evidence and drafting IRs	3.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 870.00
01/12/2021	TL	Review IRs, edit and add	1.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
02/03/2021	TL	Review EB-2020-0091 IR responses	1.25	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 362.50
02/05/2021	TL	Identification of questions by panel for IRs. Attend test session	3.75	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,087.50
02/09/2021	TL	Review IRs/Evidence/Materials to prepare questions for technical conference	4.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,305.00
02/10/2021	TL	Attend technical conference Day 1	7.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 2,030.00
02/11/2021	TL	Attend EN-2020-0091 technical conference for Panel #2	7.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 2,030.00
02/18/2021	TL	Review transcript, call with Williams Shirer on oral hearing preparation	1.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
02/19/2021	TL	Review transcripts, attend ENB & OEB staff presentations	1.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
02/23/2021	TL	Review transcript and drafting questions for Oral Hearing	2.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 725.00
02/26/2021	TL	Review of questions for oral hearing	1.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
03/02/2021	TL	Review transcript of oral hearings	1.25	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 362.50

03/04/2021	TL	Review transcript of oral hearing	1.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
03/26/2021	TL	ENB Annual Supply Plan: Review supply plan and draft questions	3.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,015.00
03/29/2021	TL	Review final submission for ENB IRP, provide comments and suggested edits	1.75	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 507.50
				Total Hours	55.00 hrs
				Labor	\$ 15,950.00
		Labor	HST 81338	8691 RT001	\$ 2,073.50
				Total Labor	\$ 18,023.50
			Total Invo	ice Amount	\$ 18,023.50
			Previo	us Balance	\$ 0.00
			Balance (A	mount Due)	\$ 18,023.50

Notes:

Power Advisory LLC remittance address indicated above. Electronic payment instructions available upon request.

For invoice and payment questions contact: Julie Glover (jglover@poweradvisoryllc.com)

User Hours Summary

Billing Period: 01/07/2021 - 03/31/2021

User Hour Totals

User	Hours Billed	Rate/Hour	Amount Billed
Travis Lusney	55.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 15,950.00