

lan A. Mondrow
Direct: 416-369-4670
ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com

Assistant: Cathy Galler Direct: 416-369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

August 26, 2021

VIA RESS

Ms. Christine E. Long Registrar ONTARIO ENERGY BOARD P.O. Box 2319, 27th Floor 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Long:

Re: EB-2020-0091 - Enbridge Gas Inc. (EGI) Integrated Resource Planning (IRP)

Proposal.

Industrial Gas Users Association (IGUA) Statement of Costs.

Further to the Decision and Order dated July 22, 2021 for the captioned proceeding, enclosed, on behalf of IGUA, please find a Statement of Costs.

In respect of the *Details of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed* form for the writer provided in support of IGUA's cost claim, please note that time allocated to the "Argument" category (in the absence of additional activity categories on the forms), in addition to time spent formulating and drafting IGUA's submissions on the matter, includes time spent on;

- 1. retrieval and review of materials filed, reporting to and briefing IGUA on the general status of the proceeding, and obtaining/confirming ongoing general instructions (please see dockets for April 28 & 29, 2020; May 13, 14 and 21, 2020; November 11-27, 2020; December 2, 2020 and January 1 & 12, 2021; totalling 3.6 hours);
- 2. reviewing filings, briefing IGUA and obtaining instructions regarding issues list and hearing scope matters (please see dockets from June 4 through July 16, 2020, totalling 6.1 hours);
- 3. reviewing filings, briefing IGUA and obtaining instructions related to additional proposed evidence (please see dockets for July 22 & 30, 2020; August 1-27, 2020; and September 4-17, 2020; totalling 3.1 hours);
- 4. reviewing comprehensive arguments filed by other parties, including EGI, in order to brief IGUA on issues articulated and positions taken related to IGUA interests and thus properly inform understanding of the OEB's determinations on the various and diverse positions



articulated by the parties (please see dockets from April 2 through 22, 2021, totalling 20 hours); and

5. reviewing the OEB's comprehensive decision and briefing IGUA on the decision and its implications for future EGI planning and spending activities (please see dockets for July 23-28, 2021, totalling 6 hours).

In aggregate, these hours allocated to the "Argument" category on the OEB's form total 38.8 hours, comprising ~68% of the total of 57.1 hours allocated to this activity category, and reflecting a range of activities in support of IGUA's responsible and informed participation in the proceeding, all as detailed in the various docket entries.

The balance of the allocations made should be self-explanatory.

Yours truly,

Ian A. Mondrow

IAM:cag Encl.

cc: Dr. S. Rahbar (IGUA)

G. Carrière/L. Gervais (IGUA)

an monotrou

A. Stiers (EGI)

M. Parkes (OEB Staff)

M. Millar (OEB Staff)

ACTIVE_CA\ 47042872\1



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Affidavit por	tion is	signed and sworn or affirmed.				
				Instructions		
- All claims n - A separate Disbursemer However, on - The cost cla - A CV for ea	"Detail nts Beir nly one aim mu	in Canadian dollars. If applicable in Canadian dollars. If applicable of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each "Summary of Fees and Disbursers be supported by a completed sultant/analyst must be attached	lle, state Rate ng Claime Iawyer, ments" c Affidavit d unless p	exchange rate and country of e: ed" (comprising a "Statement analyst/consultant and article covering the whole of the part signed by a representative of provided to the Board as pre	Country:	
File # EB-	2020	-0091		EGI Integrate	ed Resource Planning Proposal	
Party:	Indu	strial Gas Users Association		Affiant's Name:	lan Mondrow (Gowling WLG)	
HST Numbe	er:	89659 3323 RT0001		HST	Rate Ontario: 13.00%	
		Full Registrant	2	Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit	
		Unregistered Other			Tax Exempt	
				Affidavit		
l,		lan Mondrow		, of the City/Town of	Thornhill	
in the Prov	vince/	State of Ont	ario		, swear or affirm that:	
1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant						
			is 26th (day of August, 2021. The A	Affiant was located in Thornhill, Ontario,	

SWORN BEFORE ME over video conference this 26th day of August, 2021. The Affiant was located in Thornhill, Ontario, while the Commissioner, Laura Van Soelen, was located in Kitchener, Ontario.

Laus Van



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2020-0091 Process: EGI Integrated Resource Planning Proposal

Party: Industrial Gas Users Association

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed									
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	41,601.00							
Disbursements	\$	-							
HST	\$	5,408.13							
Total Cost Claim	\$	47,009.13							

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Industrial Gas Users Association

Send payment to this address: Dr. Shahrzad Rahbar, President

Industrial Gas Users Association 260 Centrum Boulevard, Suite 202

Orleans, Ontario K1E 3P4



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2020-0091				Process: EG	I Integrated	Resource Plann	ing Proposal	
Party:	Industrial Gas Users Association				Service Prov	rider Name:	lan Mondrow (Gowling WLG	
					Year Called to		Completed Years I	Practising/Years	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	ck on	e)	Bar		of Relevant E	Experience	
	Legal Counsel		J		1991		30)	
	Articling Student/Paralegal			ľ					
	Consultant						Hourly Rate:	\$330	
	Analyst						_		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV a	attac	ched	HST Rate Ch	narged (enter %):	13.0%	
			CV į	orov	vided within previous 2	24 months			

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
	Hours		ourly Rate	_	Subtotal		HST	Total		
Pre-hearing Conference	7.2-2.2		,							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation	1.70	\$	330.00	\$	561.00	\$	72.93	\$	633.93	
Attendance	15.10	\$	330.00	\$	4,983.00	\$	647.79	\$	5,630.79	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	0.90	\$	330.00	\$	297.00	\$	38.61	\$	335.61	
Responses	1.00	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$	42.90	\$	372.90	
Issues Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Argument										
Preparation	57.10	\$	330.00	\$	18,843.00	\$	2,449.59	\$	21,292.59	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation	17.40	\$	330.00	\$	5,742.00	\$	746.46	\$	6,488.46	
Attendance	24.40	\$	330.00	\$	8,052.00	\$	1,046.76	\$	9,098.76	
Other Conferences										
Preparation	0.80	\$	330.00	\$	264.00	\$	34.32	\$	298.32	
Attendance	7.30	\$	330.00	\$	2,409.00	\$	313.17	\$	2,722.17	
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	41,481.00	\$	5,392.53	\$	46,873.53	



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2020-0091				Process: _	EGI Integrated	Resource Planr	ning Proposal	
Party:	Industrial Gas Users Association				Service Pr	ovider Name:	Cathy Galler (G	Sowling WLG)	
					Year Called to		Completed Years	Practising/Years	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	ck on	e)	Bar		of Relevant	Experience	
	Legal Counsel						1:	1	
	Articling Student/Paralegal		7			'			
	Consultant						Hourly Rate:	\$100	
	Analyst						•		
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV a	attac	hed	HST Rate Ch	harged (enter %):	13.0%	
			CV p	rovi	ided within previοι	us 24 months			

C		£ F.	D	Cl-:	d				
Statement of Fees Being Claimed Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total									
	Hours	но	uriy Kate		uptotai		HST		Total
Pre-hearing Conference									
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Responses		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Issues Conference									
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Proposal Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Argument				<u> </u>		Ė			
Preparation	1.20	\$	100.00	\$	120.00	\$	15.60	\$	135.60
Oral Hearing						Ė			
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Other Conferences				Ė		Ė			
Preparation		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	100.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	120.00	\$	15.60	\$	135.60



May 25, 2020

INVOICE: 19399830

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2020-04-28	0.50	lan Mondrow	Review OEB notice of proceeding and brief update to IGUA;
ARG	2020-04-29	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review and revise draft intervention request letter;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.90
	Total	0.90



June 12, 2020

INVOICE: 19409182

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2020-05-13	0.20	lan Mondrow	Confirming filing of IGUA intervention request; review other intervention requests regarding suggested scope of proceeding in order to update IGUA Board;
ARG	2020-05-14	0.20	Ian Mondrow	IGUA Board update;
ARG	2020-05-21	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order No. 1 and draft issues list:

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.60
	Total	0.60



July 15, 2020

INVOICE: 19426706

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	⊤imekeeper	Description
	2020-06-04	2.60	Ian Mondrow	Review issues list and issues submissions; update note to IGUA;
l	2020-06-05	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review additional issues list submissions received;
l	2020-06-08	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Update discussion with S. Rahbar;
	2020-06-11	0.20	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing comments on Draft Issues List submissions;
	2020-06-11	1.50	lan Mondrow	Review recent issues list responding submissions and draft IGUA response;
١	2020-06-14	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review issues list Round 2 submissions;
١	2020-06-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review EPCOR (late) submission on draft issues list/scope;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Galler, Cathy		0.20
Mondrow, lan		4.60
	Total	4.80



August 11, 2020 INVOICE: 19441089

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2020-07-07	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review SEC issues reply submission;
2020-07-16	1.20	lan Mondrow	Review issues decision and Procedural Order and comprehensive update and interim recommendations note to IGUA;
2020-07-22	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI ICF IRP Study filing covering letter and status of proceeding;
2020-07-30	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB and EGI filings regarding intended evidence

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		2.00
	Total	2.00





September 24, 2020 INVOICE: 19463598

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2020-08-01	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding evidence notification and filing modifications;
2020-08-04	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review Pollution Probe letter regarding evidence filing;
2020-08-13	0.60	lan Mondrow	Review submissions regarding additional evidence;
2020-08-21	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order No. 4 regarding evidence filing and procedure related thereto;
2020-08-26	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Update note to IGUA on Procedural Order regarding additional evidence and next steps;
2020-08-27	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review additional letters regarding evidence related to supply side alternatives;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		1.70
	Total	1.70



October 22, 2020

INVOICE: 19481032

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2020-09-04	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review and consider FRPO response regarding focus of proposed evidence;
ARG	2020-09-15	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding FRPO evidence and supply side issues;
ARG	2020-09-17	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Update to IGUA Board;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.70
	Total	0.70



November 9, 2020 INVOICE: 19493127

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
IRP	2020-10-20	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review recent filings and GEC letter regarding interrogatories;
IRP	2020-10-22	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI responding letter regarding GEC/ED request for pre-evidence filing interrogatories;
IRP	2020-10-26	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review GEC reply regarding interrogatory requests to inform GEC/ED evidence and scope of issues sought to be canvassed;
IRP	2020-10-27	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB letter regarding GEC/ED request for additional discoveries;
IRP	2020-10-28	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Further correspondence with IGUA regarding IRP build vs. non-pipes alternatives and regulatory parameters;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.70
	Total	0.70



December 17, 2020 INVOICE: 19517517

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2020-11-11	0.50	lan Mondrow	Review Pollution Probe letter regarding scope of record and review; update to IGUA with questions for guidance on IGUA position on scope;
ARG	2020-11-11	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review comments from J. Shepherd on appropriate scope for review/inquiry and provide comments in response;
ARG	2020-11-13	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with S. Rahbar regarding general and jurisdictional issues raised;
ARG	2020-11-27	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review EGI letter regarding additional evidence intended and responding to Pollution Probe regarding scope and process for proceeding;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		1.70
	Total	1.70



December 31, 2020 INVOICE: 19541717

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2020-12-02	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order No. 7 and update note to S. Rahbar regarding work timing;
IRR	2020-12-22	1.00	lan Mondrow	Review IRs filed; correspondence with J. Shepherd regarding scope of IRs vs. directed process; update note to IGUA:

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		1.20
	Total	1.20



February 19, 2021 INVOICE: 19562145

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2021-01-01	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review Pollution Probe process/completeness of record letter;
ARG	2021-01-12	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Update to IGUA Caucus;
IRP	2021-01-12	0.20	lan Mondrow	Initial review of interrogatories filed and letter to Board regarding non-filing of additional interrogatories on behalf of IGUA;
TCP	2021-01-26	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review e-mail from OEB staff regarding upcoming Technical Conference;
TCP	2021-01-27	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding confirming attendance for Technical Conference and test session and respond on behalf of IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		0.70
	Total	0.70



March 11, 2021 INVOICE: 19573177

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
TCP	2021-02-01	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review FRPO response regarding EGI submission on scope of Technical Conference;
OCP	2021-02-02	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review OEB Staff correspondence regarding scheduled presentation day and relevant Procedural Order and provide initial response for IGUA regarding presentation request; review SEC and other responses; retrieve IRRs for review;
TCP	2021-02-06	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review parties' correspondence regarding upcoming Technical Conference;
TCP	2021-02-07	0.50	lan Mondrow	Review EGI filed materials;
TCP	2021-02-08	0.70	lan Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding Technical Conference questions from various parties; continue review of filed materials;
OCP	2021-02-12	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review status of proceeding and Procedural Order No. 8; review updated IRR regarding interruptible service;
OCP	2021-02-18	0.20	lan Mondrow	Gather and review Presentation Day materials;
OCA	2021-02-19	6.30	lan Mondrow	Attend Presentation Day;
OCA	2021-02-20	1.00	lan Mondrow	Review Presentation Day transcript and update/summary note to IGUA for feedback/direction;
OHP	2021-02-24	1.10	lan Mondrow	Review examination time estimates and panels and provide IGUA estimates; call with S. Rahbar to discuss and get initial direction on issues; continue review of filed materials;
OHP	2021-02-25	1.20	lan Mondrow	Continue review of materials filed and hearing preparation;
OHP	2021-02-26	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
OHP	2021-02-27	5.00	lan Mondrow	Continue review of materials filed and preparation for hearing;
OHP	2021-02-28	5.70	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		22.80
	Total	22.80



April 13, 2021

INVOICE: 19590828

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
OHA	2021-03-01	6.50	lan Mondrow	Attend (virtual) hearing;
OHP	2021-03-01	0.60	lan Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
OHA	2021-03-02	6.50	lan Mondrow	Attend hearing;
OHP	2021-03-02	0.60	lan Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
OHP	2021-03-02	1.70	lan Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
OHA	2021-03-03	5.50	Ian Mondrow	Attend hearing;
OHP	2021-03-03	1.20	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of materials and hearing preparation;
OHA	2021-03-04	5.90	Ian Mondrow	Attend hearing;
ARG	2021-03-05	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review Procedural Order No. 9; diarize additional work for preparation of argument;
ARG	2021-03-10	0.30	lan Mondrow	Update for IGUA members;
ARG	2021-03-11	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review undertaking responses filed;
ARG	2021-03-16	1.00	Ian Mondrow	Review undertaking responses;
TCA	2021-03-16	0.60	lan Mondrow	Review Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);
TCA	2021-03-17	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);
TCA	2021-03-18	2.00	lan Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);
TCA	2021-03-20	2.00	lan Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);
TCA	2021-03-21	1.30	lan Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);
TCA	2021-03-22	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcript in lieu of attendance;
ARG	2021-03-24	0.50	lan Mondrow	Considerations for argument: reviewing intervenor correspondence regarding issues; summary/update for IGUA members on issues under consideration;
TCA	2021-03-24	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts in lieu of attendance;
TCA	2021-03-25	1.90	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);
TCA	2021-03-26	2.70	lan Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcripts (in lieu of attendance);



April 13, 2021

INVOICE: 19590828

ARG	2021-03-26	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Further intervenor correspondence regarding issues and positions;
ARG	2021-03-28	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Review additional intervenor correspondence regarding issues/argument positions and rationale;
TCA	2021-03-28	2.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of Technical Conference transcript in lieu of attendance;
ARG	2021-03-29	5.50	Ian Mondrow	Additional exchanges among intervenors regarding issues and positions; work on argument;
ARG	2021-03-30	3.80	lan Mondrow	Continue work on argument; meeting with IGUA Ontario Caucus to validate argument positions and take feedback;
ARG	2021-03-31	1.00	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing argument;
ARG	2021-03-31	5.50	Ian Mondrow	Continue work on argument;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Galler, Cathy		1.00
Mondrow, lan		61.80
	Total	62.80



May 18, 2021 INVOICE: 19612470

Industrial Gas Users Association

Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2021-04-02	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Review arguments filed;
2021-04-02	0.70	lan Mondrow	Briefing to S. Rahbar regarding arguments reviewed to date and issues raised;
2021-04-03	1.10	lan Mondrow	Review arguments filed;
2021-04-05	2.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of arguments filed;
2021-04-07	3.20	Ian Mondrow	Review arguments filed and notes for IGUA briefing;
2021-04-12	0.60	lan Mondrow	Continue review of arguments filed and notes for IGUA briefing;
2021-04-14	1.30	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of arguments filed and notes for IGUA briefing;
2021-04-15	2.80	lan Mondrow	Complete review of arguments filed and briefing note for IGUA;
2021-04-16	3.00	lan Mondrow	Complete review of arguments filed and IGUA briefing;
2021-04-17	0.70	lan Mondrow	Conclude briefing note for IGUA on arguments filed/scope of positions taken;
2021-04-21	2.10	lan Mondrow	Review EGI reply argument;
2021-04-22	1.30	Ian Mondrow	Conclude review of EGI reply argument and update note to IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		20.00
	Total	20.00

ARG ≼



June 8, 2021

INVOICE: 19626247

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	⊤imekeeper	Description
ARG	2021-05-31	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Update briefing to IGUA Caucus;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		0.30
	Total	0.30



August 12, 2021 INVOICE: 19663448

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1022476

EGI IRP Proposal (EB-2020-0091) (IGUA20-ON-

EGI-9)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
ARG	2021-07-23	1.10	lan Mondrow	Commence review of decision;
ARG	2021-07-24	1.20	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of OEB Decision and notes for IGUA briefing;
ARG	2021-07-28	3.70	lan Mondrow	Continue review of IRP decision and notes for report to IGUA;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		6.00
	Total	6.00