

Environment Indigenous Energy Law

Direct Dial: File:

416.862.4835 7974

Sent by RESS Filing

August 26, 2021

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street 27<sup>th</sup> Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Attention: Christine E. Long, Registrar

Dear Ms. Long:

Re: Low Income Energy Network ("LIEN") – Cost Claim

**Integrated Resource Planning Proposal by Enbridge Gas Inc.** 

Board File No. EB-2020-0091

Please find attached LIEN's cost claim pursuant to Ontario Energy Board's Decision and Order dated July 22, 2021 in the above-noted matter.

Yours truly,

Madiha Vallani

cc: LIEN Legal Subcommittee

Matt Gardner

Document #: 2007282

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



#### Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

			lı	nstructions						
- All claims m - A separate ' Disbursemen However, onl - The cost cla - A CV for each	ust be in Canadian "Detail of Fees and lats Being Claimed") if ly one "Summary of lim must be support ch consultant/analy	dollars. If applicable, Disbursements Being (sometimes of second law Fees and Disbursemented by a completed Affect must be attached upon the second law attached	state ex Rate: Claimed <sup>1</sup> wyer, and ents" cov fidavit si nless pro	"(comprising a "Statement allyst/consultant and articlivering the whole of the partigned by a representative opvided to the Board as presentation on Cost Awards, in	f initial currency.  Country:  of Fees Being Claim ing student/paraleg ty's cost claim shou if the party. scribed on the Cost	ned" and a "Statement of al. Id be provided. Award Tariff.				
File# EB-	EB-2020-091			Process: EGI IRP Prop	osal					
Party:	Low Income Ene	rgy Network		Affiant's Name:	Matt Gardner					
HST Numbe				-		13.00%				
		ıll Registrant Jnregistered		Qualifyi	ng Non-Profit Tax Exempt	H				
		Other			,					
				Affidavit						
l,	M	att Gardner		, of the City/Town of	Ві	urlington				
in the Prov	vince/State of	Ontar			, swear or affirm	n that:				
2. I have example Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemer Ontario Ener 4. This cost of	In the Province/State of Contario Conta									
Signature	of Affiant									
Sworn or a	affirmed before	me at the City/To	wn of	Branotin, (sworn	virtually)	,				
in the Prov	vince/State of	Onta	ario	, on	August 16,2	021 .				
					(date)					

Commissioner for taking Affidavits
Joseph King Yue Ng, a Commissioner, etc.,
Province of Ontario, for
Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Expires October 29, 2022

## Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



#### **Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements**

File # EB-	EB-2020-091	Process:	EGI IRP Proposal	

Party: Low Income Energy Network

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed								
Legal/consultant/other fees	\$	14,661.00						
Disbursements	\$	-						
HST	\$	1,905.93						
Total Cost Claim	\$	16,566.93						

#### **Payment Information**

Make cheque payable to: Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Send payment to this address: 1 Toronto Street, Suite 900

Toronto, ON M5C 2V6

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	EB-2020-091			Process: EGI IRP Propo	osal	
Party:	Low Income Energy Network			Service Provider Name	e: Madiha Vall	ani
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(che	eck one )	Year Called to Bar	Practising/Y	leted Years Years of Relevant perience
	Legal Counsel		<b>✓</b>	2019		2
	Articling Student/Paralegal					<u></u>
	Consultant				Hourly Rat	e: \$170
	Analyst					
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV attac	ched <b>HST Rate</b> ided within previous 24 months	Charged (enter %	13.0%

Si	tatement o	of Fe	es Reing	Cla	imed		
3	Hours		urly Rate	_	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation	6.60	\$	170.00	\$	1,122.00	\$ 145.86	\$ 1,267.86
Attendance	12.40	\$	170.00	\$	2,108.00	\$ 274.04	\$ 2,382.04
Interrogatories							
Preparation	11.20	\$	170.00	\$	1,904.00	\$ 247.52	\$ 2,151.52
Responses		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Argument							
Preparation	18.40	\$	170.00	\$	3,128.00	\$ 406.64	\$ 3,534.64
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	8.40	\$	170.00	\$	1,428.00	\$ 185.64	\$ 1,613.64
Attendance	6.00	\$	170.00	\$	1,020.00	\$ 132.60	\$ 1,152.60
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management	2.00	\$	170.00	\$	340.00	\$ 44.20	\$ 384.20
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	11,050.00	\$ 1,436.50	\$ 12,486.50

# Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



### **Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed**

File # EB-	EB-2020-091			Process: E	GI IRP Propos	al	
Party:	Low Income Energy Network			Service Pro	vider Name:	Matt Gardner	
				Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant	
	<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b>	(che	ck one )	Bar		Experience	
	Legal Counsel			2010		11	
	<b>Articling Student/Paralegal</b>						-
	Consultant					Hourly Rate: \$230	
	Analyst						_
	For Consultant/Analyst:		CV atta	ched	HST Rate Ch	narged (enter % ): 13.0%	
			CV prov	vided within previous	24 months		-

S	tatement o	of Fe	ees Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	,	Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$	\$ -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation	2.00	\$	230.00	\$	460.00	\$ 59.80	\$ 519.80
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Interrogatories							
Preparation	11.30	\$	230.00	\$	2,599.00	\$ 337.87	\$ 2,936.87
Responses		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Issues Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Argument							
Preparation	2.00	\$	230.00	\$	460.00	\$ 59.80	\$ 519.80
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	0.40	\$	230.00	\$	92.00	\$ 11.96	\$ 103.96
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Other Conferences							
Preparation		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	230.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Case Management		\$	170.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	3,611.00	\$ 469.43	\$ 4,080.43

mrer i	rii.	ATLOU	mentar	Lawyers	шшР	
Clien	ıt	Fees	Listin	g		
	7\ T	T D79	ידיכ			

Page: 1

Aug/25/2021	WIIII			onmental Lawyers L s Listing ATES	UDE			Page: 1
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	Working Type			Hours	Amount	Inv# Billing	
	Low Income Energy Network Re: EB-2020-0091 EGI IRP Proposal							
Jan 20/2020 2138421	Lawyer: 77 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 open file; review back and forth emails between client and M. Gardner; work with support staff to file intervenor request letter;	77 Time		MADIHA VALLANI	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	
2136349	Lawyer: 77 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 review OEB procedural order dated January 30, 2020 and consider in relation to Lien's intervenor request letter; draft email to M. Gardner refiling submissions on behalf of LIEN;	77 Time		MADIHA VALLANI	1.00	170.00	Unbilled	
Feb 10/2020 2150267	Lawyer: 53 0.60 Hrs X 230.00 review Procedural Order 1 and prepare letter to OEB confirming LIEN's position to remain intervenor in this proceeding for monitoring purposes with interest in participating fully in separate IRP Proposal proceeding to be initiated by the OEB; send same in draft to J. Simon for comments;	53 Time	53 -	MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.60	138.00	Unbilled	
2150268	Lawyer: 53 0.80 Hrs X 230.00 review OEB's IRP letter and prepare intervention request letter for LIEN and proposal for LIEN; send same to LIEN legal subcommittee for comments and approval;	53 Time		MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.80	184.00	Unbilled	
2150269	Lawyer: 53 0.30 Hrs X 230.00 receipt of instructions from Z. Bhanji, K. Hale and T. McClenaghan for LIEN to intervene in and file intervention request letter to OEB re Enbridge's IRP proposal proceeding and instruct filing of same; send LIEN legal subcommittee intervention request letter filed with OEB;	53 Time		MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.30	69.00	Unbilled	
2150270	Lawyer: 53 0.60 Hrs X 230.00 review OEB's Procedural Order #1 and send to LIEN legal subcommittee with summary including next procedural steps re draft issues list and deadlines and Enbridge's IRP proposal and background documents; instruct diarizing deadlines re comments on draft Issues List;	53 Time	53 -	MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.60	138.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 53 1.20 Hrs X 230.00 review background documents and OEB's draft issues list, Pollution Probe's submissions, and prepare comments to J. Simon for consideration;	53 Time	53 -	MATTHEW GARDNEI	1.20	276.00	Unbilled	
2150272	Lawyer: 53 1.00 Hrs X 230.00 review J. Simon's suggested additional item to include in proposed additions to draft Issues List and prepare letter to OEB with LIEN's additional items and send to J. Simon for any final comments; instruct T. Sebastien to finalize and file letter with OEB; email parties LIEN's letter; forward to LIEN legal subcommittee and J. Simon by email;	53 Time	53 -	MATTHEW GARDNEI	1.00	230.00	Unbilled	
Jun 11/2020 2150273 Jul 15/2020	Lawyer: 53 0.80 Hrs X 230.00 review Board Staff, IGUA, SEC, FRPO and Enbridge's reply submissions re Draft Issues List; Lawyer: 53 0.40 Hrs X 230.00	53 Time		MATTHEW GARDNEI  MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.80	184.00 92.00	Unbilled Unbilled	
2150274	review Procedural Order 2 and email J. Simon re next steps and deadlines;	Time						
2150943	Lawyer: 53 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 review Procedural Order #3;	53 Time		MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.20	46.00	Unbilled	
Nov 27/2020	Lawyer: 53 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 review Enbridge letter dated November 27, 2020 responding to Pollution Probe's letter of comment;	53 Time	53 -	MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.20	46.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 77 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 begin reviewing evidence filed to date;	77 Time	77 –	MADIHA VALLANI	0.60	102.00	Unbilled	
Dec 11/2020 2179713	Lawyer: 77 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 review and mark-up Enbridge's reply evidence re the Integrated Resource Planning Proposal; consider missing information of potential interest to LIEN; draft email update to M. Gardner;	77 Time	77 -	MADIHA VALLANI	1.20	204.00	Unbilled	
Dec 14/2020	Lawyer: 77 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 review Procedural Order #2 and issues described in the Issues List, and note the issues most relevant to LIEN; prepare for and attend meeting with M.	77 Time	77 -	MADIHA VALLANI	1.20	204.00	Unbilled	

nier Environmental Lawyers LLE	,
Client Fees Listing	
ALL DATES	

Entry # Explana   Gardner   Objecti	,,,,		ent Fe	ronmental Lawyers Ll ees Listing DATES	шr				Page: 2
Dec   14/2020	ee / Time xplanation	Working Type			Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing	
Dec 14/2020 Lawyer:	ardner to discuss and clarify LIEN's		_						
Dec 17/2020 Lawyer:	bjectives for the hearing; awyer: 53 0.40 Hrs X 230.00 onsider areas from evidence for LIEN's nterrogatories;	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.40	92.00		Unbilled	
Dec 18/2020 Lawyer:	awyer: 77 4.00 Hrs X 170.00 eview Enbridge's additional evidence Exhibit B), consider questions elevant to LIEN; draft nterrogatories;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	4.00	680.00		Unbilled	
Jan 8/2021 Lawyer:	awyer: 77 1.80 Hrs X 170.00  omplete reviewing evidence; continue  rafting interrogatories and send  raft to M. Gardner for review;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	1.80	306.00		Unbilled	
Jan 11/2021 Lawyer:	anyer: 77 2.00 Hrs X 170.00  eview email from M. Gardner re next  teps to finalize interrogatories;  eview Green Energy Coalition and  nvironmental Defence's expert  vidence and consider interrogatories  IEN may wish to submit about same;  eview evidence sent in relation to  nbridge Gas' 2021 Dawn Parkway  xpansion Project and consider  nterrogatories LIEN may wish to  ubmit about same; revise draft  nterrogatories and draft reporting  mails to M. Gardner;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	2.00	340.00		Unbilled	
Jan 12/2021 Lawyer:	malls to M. Gardner; awyer: 53 3.20 Hrs X 230.00 eview Enbridge and GEC/ED's evidence nd add to LIEN's interrogatories;	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	3.20	736.00		Unbilled	
2184719 continuinterror Enbridg Bhanji, Simon w proceed Jan 26/2021 Lawyer: 2186995 review steps in deadlin details confere Jan 27/2021 Lawyer: 2187154 email Confere Jan 27/2021 Lawyer: 2188592 review Present Proposa save painterror Jan 27/2021 Lawyer: 2188828 discuss includion OEB Intwee expension of the dead of the confere Jan 2012 Lawyer: 2189004 continuinterror guestic Technic Feb 4/2021 Lawyer: 2189004 continuito interestic ask at Feb 5/2021 Lawyer: 2189169 review from OE	awyer: 77 1.40 Hrs X 170.00  nstruct S. Baksh to draft letter from e to the OEB, which will precede IEN's interrogatories and review amme; review and finalize nterrogatories and work with S. Baksh o file same with the OEB;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	1.40	238.00		Unbilled	
Jan 26/2021 Lawyer:	awyer: 53 1.60 Hrs X 230.00 ontinue to prepare and finalize LIEN's nterrogatories for Enbridge re nbridge's IRP proposal; forward to Z. hanji, K. Hale, T. McClenaghan, and J. imon with summary of status of roceeding and next procedural steps;	53 Time		- MATTHEW GARDNEI	1.60	368.00		Unbilled	
Jan 27/2021 Lawyer:	awyer: 53 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 eview email from M. Parkes re next teps for technical conference and eadline to provide OEB staff with etails for questions for technical onference and diarize same;	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.20	46.00		Unbilled	
Feb 2/2021 Lawyer:	awyer: 53 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 mail C. Walter re attendance at echnical conference;	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.20	46.00		Unbilled	
2188828 discuss includi OEB Int we expe begin interroquestic Technic Technic Continu to inte additionask at Feb 5/2021 Lawyer: 2189169 review from OE	awyer: 77 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 eview email from C. Walter re resentation Day for Enbridge Gas' IRP roposal (EB-2020-0091); collect and ave parties' responses to nterrogatories;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	0.40	68.00		Unbilled	
Feb 4/2021 Lawyer:	awyer: 77 1.20 Hrs X 170.00 iscuss next steps with M. Gardner, ncluding deadline to provide to the EB Interrogatory responses for which ee expect to have follow-up questions; egin reviewing Enbridge's responses to nterrogatories and consider additional uestions LIEN may wish to ask at the echnical Conference;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	1.20	204.00		Unbilled	
Feb 5/2021 Lawyer: 2189169 review from OE	awyer: 77 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 ontinue reviewing Enbridge's response o interrogatories and consider dditional questions LIEN may wish to sk at the technical conference;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	1.60	272.00		Unbilled	
follow- and dis attend Technic re inte LIEN ex questic	awyer: 77 3.20 Hrs X 170.00  eview responses to interrogatories  rom OEB and GEC-ED; draft reporting  mail to M. Gardner enclosing LIEN's  ollow-up questions for consideration  nd discuss same with M. Gardner;  ttend test session for Enbridge's  echnical Conference; respond to OEB  e interrogatory responses for which  IEN expects to have follow-up  uestions about and time estimates for  uestioning each witness panel;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	3.20	544.00		Unbilled	
eb 5/2021 Lawyer:	uestioning each witness panel; awyer: 53 0.60 Hrs X 230.00 eview Enbridge's interrogatory	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.60	138.00		Unbilled	

Mar 23/2021

2201246

2201123

Mar 29/2021

Mar 29/2021

2201108

submissions; Mar 25/2021 Lawyer: 77 4.80 Hrs X 170.00

deadlines from the procedural order into my and M. Gardner's calendars;

Integrated Resource Planning Proposal Argument-in-Chief dated March 21, 2021; begin drafting LIEN's

continue drafting and complete first

draft of LIEN's submissions for the Enbridge IRP Proposal proceeding;

77

53

77

Time

77

Time

53

77

Time

- MADIHA VALLANI

- MATTHEW GARDNEI

- MADIHA VALLANI

77 - MADIHA VALLANI

3.40

4.80

0.40

4.40

578.00

816.00

92.00

748.00

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Unbilled

Lawyer: 77 3.40 Hrs X 170.00

Lawyer: 53 0.40 Hrs X 230.00

2200804 review LIEN's draft written submission and consider additional evidence and

Lawyer: 77 4.40 Hrs X 170.00

Gardner to review LIEN's draft submissions and obtain instructions for revisions; review correspondence from other intervening parties and consider arguments therein that are applicable to LIEN; revise submissions to include additional details about

attend teleconference call with M.

submissions to include;

review and mark-up Enbridge Gas'

Aug/25/2021	Willm		ent Fe	ronmental Lawyers L es Listing DATES	LP			Page: 3
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	Working Type			Hours	Amount	Inv# Billing	r
	responses and consider relevance to low-income consumers;							
	Lawyer: 77 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 review emails from parties about timing and interrogatory responses for the technical conference; follow-up with M. Gardner about status of technical conference schedule and our follow-up questions for LIEN;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	L
2190890	Lawyer: 53 1.20 Hrs X 230.00 review Enbridge's interrogatory responses and revise and add to questions for Enbridge Panel #2 during tomorrow's technical conference;	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	1.20	276.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 77 6.80 Hrs X 170.00 prepare for, attend, and participate in Enbridge's Technical Conference; draft email update to M. Gardner about the Technical Conference;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	6.80	1156.00	Unbilled	I
	Lawyer: 77 5.60 Hrs X 170.00 attend OEB's Virtual Presentation Day;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	5.60	952.00	Unbilled	L
Feb 22/2021	Lawyer: 77 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 consider with M. Gardner next steps to prepare for hearing, including drafting additional follow-up questions to ask at the hearing;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	0.40	68.00	Unbilled	L
Feb 23/2021 2193057	Lawyer: 77 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 consider time estimates LIEN will require for the oral hearing and send same to C. Walter and all parties;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 77 4.80 Hrs X 170.00 review transcripts from Enbridge's Technical Conference and Presentation Day, and additional evidence submitted by the parties to the hearing; consider and draft LIEN's follow-up questions for the oral hearing; draft reporting email to M. Gardner and enclose LIEN's draft questions for his review; review emails from the OEB and parties re logistics for the oral hearing, and review the schedule for the oral hearing;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	4.80	816.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 77 1.60 Hrs X 170.00 review LIEN's questions for the oral hearing with M. Gardner and revise same; review transcripts from Oral Hearing day 1 and day 2;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	1.60	272.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 53 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 review and comment on draft cross examination questions for Enbridge Panel 2 tomorrow;	53 Time	53	- MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.20	46.00	Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 77 6.00 Hrs X 170.00 prepare for and attend the OEB's Oral Hearing pertaining to Enbridge's IRP Proposal; ask Enbridge Witness Panel #2 questions about pilot projects and monitoring and reporting for IRP Planning; draft reporting email to M. Gardner;	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	6.00	1020.00	Unbilled	
Mar 9/2021 2232499	Lawyer: 77 0.20 Hrs X 170.00	77 Time	77	- MADIHA VALLANI	0.20	34.00	Unbilled	L

Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP
Client Fees Listing
ALL DATES

			ALL DATES			
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	Working Type	Lawyer	Hours Am	nount Inv#	Billing
	Enbridge's proposed stakeholdering process and pilot projects; draft reporting email to M. Gardner enclosing LTEN's revised submissions and evidence referenced in the submissions;					
Mar 30/2021 2201008	Lawyer: 77 1.40 Hrs X 170.00 correspond with M. Gardner re updates to LIEN's submissions; draft reporting email for M. Gardner to send to Z. Bhanji, K. Hale, and T. McClenaghan; review J. Simons' revisions to LIEN's submissions and revise same; review emails from other intervenors;	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI	1.40 23	38.00	Unbilled
	Lawyer: 53 1.00 Hrs X 230.00 review LIEN's draft revised written submission with additional evidence and submissions incorporated and revise; send to Z. Bhanji, T. McClenaghan and J. Wilson for comments and instructions to file tomorrow;	53 Time	53 - MATTHEW GARDNEI	1.00 23	30.00	Unbilled
	Lawyer: 77 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 correspond with M. Gardner re finalizing LIEN's submission and filing same with the OEB; review comments from T. McClenaghan and Z. Bhanji; instruct S. Baksh to draft a covering letter to attach to LIEN's submission and file same;	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI	0.60 10	02.00	Unbilled
Mar 31/2021 2201549	Lawyer: 53 0.60 Hrs X 230.00 obtain comments from Z. Bhanji and T. McClenaghan re LIEN's submission and revise cost effectiveness portion of submission and instruct filing with OEB; send filed and final version to Z. Bhanji, T. McClenaghan, J. Wilson and D. Kwan;	53 Time	53 - MATTHEW GARDNEI	0.60 13	38.00	Unbilled
Apr 21/2021 2206736	Lawyer: 77 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 review Enbridge Gas's reply argument and save documents to file;	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI	0.60 10	02.00	Unbilled
	Lawyer: 77 2.60 Hrs X 170.00 review the OEB's Decision and Order pertaining to Enbridge's IRP Proposal Application; prepare a draft summary email to clients summarizing the OEB's decision and how it corresponds to LIEN's written submissions; send draft email summary and reporting email to M. Gardner for review;	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI	2.60 44	42.00	Unbilled
	Lawyer: 77 0.20 Hrs X 170.00 revise my email summary of the OEB's decision and order pertaining to Enbridge's IRP proposal (EB-2020-0091) OEB, and send same to M. Gardner for review;	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI	0.20	34.00	Unbilled
Aug 17/2021 2231609	Lawyer: 77 0.80 Hrs X 170.00 review M. Gardner's revisions to and comments on my summary of the Board's decision pertaining to Enbridge's Integrated Resource Planning Proposal, and further revise same; email summary and decision to Z. Bhanji, T. McClenaghan, D. Kwan, and J. Wilson; instruct S. Baksh to prepare a cost claim for the proceeding;	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI	0.80 13	36.00	Unbilled
Aug 18/2021 2232083	Lawyer: 77 0.40 Hrs X 170.00	77 Time	77 - MADIHA VALLANI Unbilled:	80.70 1466	51.00	Unbilled
			Billed: Total: Percent Billed:	0.00 80.70 1466 0.00	0.00 51.00 0.00	
	*	** Summary	y by Working Lawyer ***			
Working Lawyo 53 - MATTH 77 - MADIH Firm Total	Ünbilled Firm % Billed Firm % EW GAR 15.70 19.45 0.00 100.00	Total % 15.70 65.00 80.70	Bld Unbilled Firm % 0.00 3611.00 24.63 0.00 11050.00 75.37 0.00 14661.00 100.00	Fees Billed Firm 0.00 100.0 0.00 100.0 0.00 100.0	0 3611.00 0 11050.00	% Bld 0.00 0.00 0.00

\*\*\* Summary by Responsible Lawyer \*\*\*

Responsible Lawyer							Fees				
		Unbilled	Firm %	Billed Firm %	Total	% Bld	Unbilled Firm %	Billed Firm %	Total	% Bld	
53	- MATTHEW GAR	80.70	100.00	0.00 100.00	80.70	0.00	14661.00 100.00	0.00 100.00	14661.00	0.00	
Firm	Total	80.70	100.00	0.00 100.00	80.70	0.00	14661.00 100.00	0.00 100.00	14661.00	0.00	

Aug/25/2021 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page: 5

Client Fees Listing ALL DATES

Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Amount Inv# Billing Entry # Explanation Type

REPORT SELECTIONS - Client Fees Listing Layout Template Advanced Search Filter Default(1) None Requested by Josie Gonzalez Wednesday, August 25, 2021 at 11:21:18 AM 14.1 (14.1.20150324) Finished Ver Date Range Matters ALL DATES 7974 Clients All Major Clients All Client Intro Lawyer All Matter Intro Lawyer All Responsible Lawyer All Assigned Lawyer All Type of Law All Select From Active, Inactive, Archived Matters Matters Sort by Default New Page for Each Lawyer No Firm Totals Only No Client balances only No Matter balances only No Entries Shown - Billed Only No Entries Shown - Unbilled Entries Shown - Billable Tasks Yes Yes Entries Shown - Write Up/Down Tasks Entries Shown - No Charge Tasks Yes

Entries Shown - Non Billable Tasks

Working Lawyer

Yes

Yes

All