

PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

August 31, 2021

VIA E-MAIL 7 pages PIAC File # 6883

Ms. Christiane E. Long Registrar Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Long:

Re:

EB-2020-0091 - Enbridge Gas Inc.

Cost Claim of Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

On behalf of the Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC) we have enclosed their cost claim with respect to the above-noted proceeding.

We have also directed a copy to the Applicant as well as their Counsel via email.

Thank you.

cc:

Donna Brady Office Administrator

office Administrator

EGI – Adam Stiers – egiregulatoryproceedings@enbridge.com

Counsel - David Stevens - dstevens@airdberlis.com

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Party: VECC Affiant's Name: Donna Brady HST Number: 13059 2405 RT 0001 Full Registrant					nstructions			
However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided. The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party. A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff. Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided. File # EB-	- All claims m	nust be in C	anadian dollars. If applic	able, state e Rate:	xchange rate and country	of initial currency. Country:		f
Party: VECC Affiant's Name: Donna Brady HST Number: 13059 2405 RT 0001 Full Registrant	Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	nts Being Cl Ily one "Sur aim must be ch consulta	aimed") is required for ear mmary of Fees and Disburs e supported by a complete int/analyst must be attach	ch lawyer, ar sements" coved Affidavit s red unless pr	nalyst/consultant and artic vering the whole of the particle igned by a representative ovided to the Board as pre	ling student/paral rty's cost claim sho of the party. escribed on the Co	legal. ould be provided. ost Award Tariff.	
HST Number: 13059 2405 RT 0001	File # EB-	EB-2020-	-0091		Process: EGI Integrat	ed Resource Pla	anning Proposal	
Affidavit Affidavit	Party:	VECC			Affiant's Name:	Donna Brady		
Affidavit I, Donna Brady , of the City/Town of Ottawa , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Ees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Pees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Pees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Ottawa in the Province/State of Ontario , on Again 3. 2021.	HST Numbe	er: <u>130</u>	059 2405 RT 0001		HST	Rate Ontario:	3.94%	
In the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Ottawa Ontario , on Aggregation (date)			Unregistered		Qualify		✓ □	
In the Province/State of Ontario , swear or affirm that: 1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Ottawa in the Province/State of Ontario , on Afficact 31 - 2021 (date)	2.				Affidavit			
1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein. 2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Ottawa in the Province/State of Ontario , on Ontario , on Ontario (date)	l,	•	Donna Brady		, of the City/Town of		Ottawa	
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed". 3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the Ontario Energy Board process referred to above. 4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in sections 6.05 and 6.09 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards. Signature of Affiant Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of Ottawa In the Province/State of Ontario, on Ottawa Ontario (date)	in the Prov	/ince/Stat	te of <u>Or</u>	ntario		, swear or affir	rm that:	
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of	2. I have example Being Claime 3. The attach Disbursemen Ontario Energy 4. This cost of	mined all o ed", "Staten ned "Summ nts Being Cl gy Board p laim does r	f the documentation in sunent(s) of Fees Being Claimary of Fees and Disbursemaimed" include only costs rocess referred to above.	pport of this ned" and "Statents Being C incurred and rork done, or	cost claim, including the a atement(s) of Disbursemer claimed", "Statement(s) of I time spent directly for the time spent, by a person the	ttached "Summar nts Being Claimed' Fees Being Claime e purposes of the	ry of Fees and Disbursemer ". ed" and "Statement(s) of Party's participation in the	
Sworn or affirmed before me at the City/Town of			-	1.				
in the Province/State of Ontario , on August 3/- 200/, (date)	Signature	of Affiant	t /					
	Sworn or a	affirmed l	before me at the City,	/Town of	Ot	tawa		,
	in the Prov	vince/Stat	te of	ntario	, on	Hu ga 8 (date)	731-2001	•
Commissioner for taking Affidavits	Commissio	pper for t	aking Affidavits					

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	EB-2020-0091		Process: EGI Integrated Resource Planning Proposal	
Party:	VECC			
	Summ	ary of Fe	ees and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/con:	sultant/other fees	\$	31,597.50	
Disbursem	nents	\$	-	
HST		\$	1,244.94	
Total Cost	Claim	\$	32,842.44	
			Payment Information	
	Make cheque payable to	: Public	ic Interest Advocay Centre	
S	end payment to this address	s: <u>2-285</u>	5 McLead Street	
		Ottaw	va, Ontario	
		K2P 1	1A1	

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2020-0091		Process: EGI Integrated Resource Planning Proposal			
Party:	VECC		Service Prov	ider Name: _	Shelley Grice, P.Eng.	_
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Year Called to Bar		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant Experience	
= 11 =	Legal Counsel				22	
	Articling Student/Paralegal			_		_
3 ° 1	Consultant Analyst				Hourly Rate: \$330	
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched ided within previous 2		arged (enter %): 3.9%	

St	atement o	of Fe	ees Being	Cla	imed		
	Hours	Но	urly Rate		Subtotal	HST	Total
Pre-hearing Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Technical Conference							
Preparation	4.25	\$	330.00	\$	1,402.50	\$ 55.26	\$ 1,457.76
Attendance	18.50	\$	330.00	\$	6,105.00	\$ 240.54	\$ 6,345.54
Interrogatories							
Preparation	13.75	\$	330.00	\$	4,537.50	\$ 178.78	\$ 4,716.28
Responses	9.00	\$	330.00	\$	2,970.00	\$ 117.02	\$ 3,087.02
Issues Conference							
Preparation	4.50	\$	330.00	\$	1,485.00	\$ 58.51	\$ 1,543.51
Åttendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
ADR - Settlement Conference							
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Proposal Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$ -	\$ -
Argument							
Preparation	16.25	\$	330.00	\$	5,362.50	\$ 211.28	\$ 5,573.78
Oral Hearing							
Preparation	3.75	\$	330.00	\$	1,237.50	\$ 48.76	\$ 1,286.26
Attendance	18.75	\$	330.00	\$	6,187.50	\$ 243.79	\$ 6,431.29
Other Conferences							
Preparation	0.50	\$	330.00	\$	165.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 171.50
Attendance	6.50	\$	330.00	\$	2,145.00	\$ 84.51	\$ 2,229.51
Case Management				\$	_	\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	31,597.50	\$ 1,244.94	\$ 32,842.44

Shelley Grice			
PROJECT TIME	SHEET	DATE	INVOICE
EB-2020-009	1	2021-08-26	#V21-
PROJECT TIME SHI	rce Planning Proposal ET		
	rce Planning Proposal	CHARGE TYPE	Hours
PROJECT TIME SHI	rce Planning Proposal ET	CHARGE TYPE Preparation	Hours 0.50

DATE	TASK DESCRIPTION	CHARGE TYPE	Hours
2020-05-13	Review application; emails; Prepare LOI	Preparation	0.50
2020-06-02	Review & consider application & Draft Issues List	Issues	1.75
2020-06-04	Review & consider application & draft issues list; prepare submissions on Draft Issues List	Issues	1.25
2020-06-05	Review parties' submissions on Draft Issues List	Issues	1.00
2020-07-16	Review & consider Decision on Draft Issues List	Issues	0.50
2020-11-26	Review & consider GEC/ED Evidence; notes	Interrogatories- Preparation	2.00
2020-11-03	Review & consider OEB Staff Evidence; notes	Interrogatories- Preparation	2.75
2021-01-10	Review & consider EGI evidence & Reply Evidence	Interrogatories- Preparation	3.00
2021-01-11	Review & consider EGI evidence & Prepare Interrogatories	Interrogatories- Preparation	4.00
2021-01-12	Review & consider EGI evidence & Finalize Interrogatories	Interrogatories- Preparation	2.00
2021-02-06	Review interrogatory responses	Interrogatories- Responses	1.75
2021-02-07	Review interrogatory responses	Interrogatories- Responses	4.75
2021-02-08	Review interrogatory responses	Interrogatories- Responses	2.50
2021-02-08	Prepare for Technical Conference	Tech Conf - Preparation	1.25
2021-02-09	Prepare for Technical Conference	Tech Conf - Preparation	3.00
2021-02-10	Attend Technical Conference Day #1	Tech Conf - Attendance	6.75
2021-02-11	Attend Technical Conference Day #2	Tech Conf - Attendance	6.75
2021-02-12	Attend Technical Conference Day #3	Tech Conf - Attendance	5.00
2021-02-19	Attend Presentation Day	Other Conf - Attendance	6.50
2021-02-27	Preparation Oral Hearing; Review TC Undertakings	Oral Hearing - Preparation	3.75
2021-03-01	Attend Oral Hearing	Oral Hearing- Attendance	6.75
2021-03-02	Attend Oral Hearing	Oral Hearing- Attendance	6.50
2021-03-03	Attend Oral Hearing	Oral Hearing- Attendance	5.50

		Total	95.75
2021-03-31	Prepare Final Submissions	Argument - Preparation	3.75
2021-03-30	Prepare Final Submissions	Argument - Preparation	4.00
2021-03-27	Review evidence & Prepare final submissions	Argument - Preparation	5.50
2021-03-26	Review EGI Argument-In-Chief & Undertaking Reponses	Argument - Preparation	3.00

From:

Shelley Grice

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT Invoice # V21-

August 30, 2021

TO: VULNERABLE ENERGY CONSUMERS COALITION

c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre 2- 285 McLeod Street Ottawa, ON K2P 1A1

Ra.

EB 2020-0091 - EGI

Vulnerable Energy Consumers Coalition (VECC)

Cost Claim

For Services Rendered in the above-noted matter.

RATE: \$330.00 per hour

To receipt, review, preparation, attending, filing on behalf of VECC in the above-noted proceeding.

TO: Hours

95.75 Hours @ \$330.00 per hour

31,597.50

HST @ 13%

<u>4,107.67</u>

35,705.17

TOTAL

Shelley Grice HST # 817042757 RT0001