

Environment Indigenous Energy Law

Direct Dial: File:

416-862-4827 10164

Sent by Electronic Mail and RESS Filing

September 2, 2021

Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street Suite 2700 Toronto, Ontario M4P 1E4

Attention: Christine Long, Board Registrar

Dear Ms. Long:

Re: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association's ("OSEA") Cost Claim

Consultation on Enbridge Gas Inc.'s Annual Update to Five Year Gas Supply Plan

Board File No. EB-2021-0004

Please find enclosed OSEA's cost claim in the above-noted matter, pursuant to the Board's Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards dated August 18, 2021.

Yours truly,

Raeya Jackiw

Raeya Jadi

cc: Dan Goldberger, OSEA

Travis Lusney, Power Advisory LLC

Document #: 2010387

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party (defined in the Practice Direction on Cost Awards as including a participant in a consultation process) in a consultation before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board Notice of Hearing for Cost Awards. Please ensure all required fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

Instructions - Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are present in the document to assist with the calculation of

All claims must	ho in Canadian dellars If anni			
All claims must	be in Canadian dollars. If appli	cable, state exc Rate:		Country:
However only on Being Claimed" c - The cost claim r - A CV for each co process within th	e "Statement of Fees Being Clai overing the whole of the party's must be supported by a complet	Claimed" is required and one " s cost claim sho ted Affidavit sig ess, for a given of	uired for each consultant or Summary of Fees and Disbuuld be provided. ned by a representative of the Consultant, a CV has been pr	lawyer/articling student/paralegal. rsements ne party. ovided to the Board in another
File # EB- 202	1-0004		Process: Consultation	Review Annual Update to GSP
Party: Ont	ario Sustainable Energy Asso	ociation	Affiant's Name: F	Raeya Jackiw
HST Number:	113627988RT0001		HST R	Rate Ontario: 13.0%
	Full Registrant Unregistered Other			g Non-Profit Tax Exempt
	are and the same of the	Af	fidavit	
l,	Raeya Jackiw		, of the City/Town of	Toronto (Virtually Sworn)
in the Province	ce/State of		Ontario	, swear or affirm that:
2. I have examin Disbursements E 3. The attached Disbursements E the Ontario Ene 4. This cost clair	ed all of the documentation in a Being Claimed", "Statement of F "Summary of Fees and Disburse Being Claimed" include only cos argy Board process referred to a	support of this of ees Being Claim ements Being Cl ts incurred and bove. r work done, or	cost claim, including the atta ned" and "Statement(s) of Di aimed", "Statement of Fees time spent directly for the p time spent, by a person that	e of the matters attested to herein. sched "Summary of Fees and sbursements Being Claimed". Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of ourposes of the Party's participation in t is an employee or officer of the Party
y and				
Signature of	Affiant			
Sworn or aff	Affiant irmed before me at the Cince/State of	ity/Town of Ontario	Toronto (Virtuali	y Sworn), September 2, 2021

Joseph King Yue Ng, a Commissioner, etc., Province of Ontario, for Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP 1 of 9

Expires October 29, 2022

Affidavit and Summary

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS it and Summary of Foos and Disbursement



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2021-0004 Process: Consultation/Review Annual Update to GSP

Party: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed							
Legal/consultant fees	\$8,028.00						
Disbursements	\$0.00						
HST	\$1,043.64						
Total Cost Claim	\$9,071.64						

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

Send payment to this address: 1 Toronto Street, Suite 900

Toronto, ON M5C 2V6

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Fees Being Claimed

Statement of Fees being claimed for Eligible Activity is found on the third tab of this workbook.

Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed

Statement of Disbursements being claimed is found on the fourth tab of this workbook.

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

Individual Whose Costs are Being Claimed Name: Raeya Jackiw **Completed Years** Year Called **Practicing/Years of Relevant** to Bar Experience **Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:** 2018 3 Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required: Name: Joanna Vince **Completed Years Year Called** Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience **Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:** 2011 10 **Analyst/Consultant:** CV attached: CV not required: Name: **Travis Lusney Completed Years Year Called** Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal: Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required: Name: **Completed Years Year Called** Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience **Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:** Analyst/Consultant: CV attached: CV not required: Name: **Completed Years** Year Called Practicing/Years of relevant to Bar experience **Counsel/Articling Student/Paralegal:** Analyst/Consultant: CV not required: CV attached:

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR CONSULTATIONS Statement of Fees Being Claimed



File # EB- 2021-0004

Process Consultation/Review Annual Update to GSF

Party Ontario Sustainable Energy Association

HST Rate: 13%

	Activity		Preparation for the Stakeholder Conference	Attendance at Stakeholder Conference	Written comments on gas supply plan			
	Hours	Up to a Maximum of 10 hours	Up to a Maximum of 2 hours	Actual Attendance Time	Up to a Maximum of 12 hours			
Individual Whose Fees are Being Claimed	Hourly rate					Subtotal	HST	Total
Raeya Jackiw	\$170.00	2.10	0.40		2.70	\$884.00	\$114.92	\$998.92
Joanna Vince	\$230.00	0.20			0.60	\$184.00	\$23.92	\$207.92
Travis Lusney	\$290.00	7.00	1.50	7.50	8.00	\$6,960.00	\$904.80	\$7,864.80
						\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
						\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
•						\$8,028.00	\$1,043.64	
	-					Total legal/o	onsultant fees:	\$9,071.64

4 of 9 Statement of Fees

Client Fees Listing

		Clie		ees Listing DATES					
Date Entry #	Fee / Time Explanation	Working Type			Hours	Amount	Inv#	Billing	
1341 10164 Mar 26/2021 2200435	Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Re: EB-2021-0004 - Consultation on En Lawyer: 72 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 emails with T. Lusney re deadline for IRs for consultation; review and revise T. Lusney's draft IRs; draft cover letter for IRs;	bric 72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.60	102.00		Unbilled	
Mar 29/2021	Lawyer: 48 0.20 Hrs X 230.00 review draft IRs and send comments;	48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.20	46.00		Unbilled	
Mar 29/2021 2200820	Lawyer: 72 1.50 Hrs X 170.00	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.50	255.00		Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 72 0.40 Hrs X 170.00 review EGI's stakeholder submission, and send email to T. Lusney re upcoming deadline and next steps;	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.40	68.00		Unbilled	
Apr 29/2021 2207996	Lawyer: 72 0.50 Hrs X 170.00	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.50	85.00		Unbilled	
May 5/2021 2209858	Lawyer: 72 0.60 Hrs X 170.00 continue to revise and draft comments on annual update to GSP;	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.60	102.00		Unbilled	
	Lawyer: 72 1.00 Hrs X 170.00 finalize draft comments	72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	1.00	170.00		Unbilled	
May 7/2021 2210697	Lawyer: 48 0.60 Hrs X 230.00 review draft stakeholder comments; provide revisions and comments;	48 Time	48	- JOANNA VINCE	0.60	138.00		Unbilled	
May 10/2021 2211145		72 Time	72	- RAEYA JACKIW	0.60	102.00		Unbilled	
				Unbilled: Billed: Total: Percent Billed:	6.00 0.00 6.00 0.00	1068.00 0.00 1068.00 0.00			
	**	** Summary	y by W	Jorking Lawyer ***					
Working Lawy 48 - JOANN 72 - RAEYA Firm Total	Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % A VINC 0.80 13.33 0.00 100.00	Total 8 0.80 5.20 6.00	Bld 0.00 0.00 0.00	Unbilled Firm % 184.00 17.23 884.00 82.77 1068.00	0.00	Firm % 100.00 100.00	Total 184.00 884.00	% Bld 0.00 0.00 0.00	

*** Summary by Responsible Lawyer ***

Respo	onsible Lawyer			— Hours —				Fees		
		Unbilled	Firm %	Billed Firm %	Total	% Bld	Unbilled Firm %	Billed Firm %	Total	% Bld
48	- JOANNA VINC	6.00	100.00	0.00 100.00	6.00	0.00	1068.00 100.00	0.00 100.00	1068.00	0.00
Firm	Total	6.00	100.00	0.00 100.00	6.00	0.00	1068.00 100.00	0.00 100.00	1068.00	0.00

REPORT SELECTIONS - Client Fees Listing Layout Template Advanced Search Filter Default(1) None Josie Gonzalez Requested by Tuesday, August 31, 2021 at 03:06:40 PM Finished 14.1 (14.1.20150324) ALL DATES Ver Date Range Matters Clients 10164 All Major Clients All Client Intro Lawyer Matter Intro Lawyer All All Responsible Lawyer All Assigned Lawyer All Type of Law All Select From Active, Inactive, Archived Matters Matters Sort by Default New Page for Each Lawyer No Firm Totals Only No Client balances only No Matter balances only No

Aug/31/2021 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page: 2

Client Fees Listing ALL DATES

Type

Working Lawyer Fee / Time Amount Inv# Billing Date Hours Entry # Explanation Entries Shown - Billed Only No Yes

Entries Shown - Billed Only Entries Shown - Unbilled Entries Shown - Billable Tasks Entries Shown - Write Up/Down Tasks Entries Shown - No Charge Tasks Entries Shown - Non Billable Tasks Yes Yes Yes Working Lawyer All

Power Advisory LLC

55 University Avenue, Suite 700, PO Box 32 Toronto, ON M5J 2H7



Ontario Sustainability Energy Association

720 Bathurst St, 3rd FL Toronto, Ontario M5S 2R4

Invoice 210870

Date	Aug 24, 2021
Terms	
Service Thru	Aug 24, 2021

In Reference To: Enbridge Annual Supply Plan EB-2021-0004 (Labor)

Technical consulting support for OSEA participation in ENB Annual Supply Plan

Date	Ву	Services	Hours	Rates	Amount
03/26/2021	TL	Review ENB Annual Gas Supply Plan and draft written questions/IRs	5.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,450.00
03/29/2021	TL	Review comments on draft IRs with Raeya. Make edits and additions to IRs	2.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 580.00
04/22/2021	TL	Attend Test conference. Review materials for technical conference and prepare questions.	1.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 435.00
04/26/2021	TL	Attend ENG Annual Gas Supply Plan Technical Conference	4.00	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,160.00
04/27/2021	TL	Attend ENB Annual Gas Supply Plan technical conference	3.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,015.00
04/29/2021	TL	Call with Raeya to discuss written comments. Draft written comments	3.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,015.00
04/30/2021	TL	Draft and finalize written comments	4.50	\$ 290.00/hr	\$ 1,305.00

Balance (Amount Due)	\$ 7,864.80
Previous Balance	\$ 0.00
Total Invoice Amount	\$ 7,864.80
Total Labor	\$ 7,864.80
Labor HST 81338 8691 RT001	\$ 904.80
Labor	\$ 6,960.00
Total Hours	24.00 hrs

Notes:

Power Advisory LLC remittance address indicated above. Electronic payment instructions available upon request.

For invoice and payment questions contact: Julie Glover (jglover@poweradvisoryllc.com)

User Hours Summary

Billing Period: 03/26/2021 - 08/24/2021

User Hour Totals

User	Hours Billed	Rate/Hour	Amount Billed
Travis Lusney	24.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 6,960.00