

November 24, 2021

Ms. Christine Long Registrar and Board Secretary Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street P.O. Box 2319 Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Re: Independent Electricity System Operator (IESO) 2020-2021 Expenditure and Revenue Requirements

AMPCO Cost Claim

Board File No. EB-2020-0230

Dear Ms. Long:

Attached please find AMPCO's cost claim in the above proceeding.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions or require further information.

Best Regards,

Colin Anderson President

Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario

Copy to: IESO



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

					Instructions				
- All claims m - A separate Disbursemen However, on - The cost cla - A CV for each	"Detail of "Detail of nts Being only one "So nim must on consul	Canadian Fees and Claimed") ummary or be supportant/analy	dollars. If apposite of the control	olicable, state e Rate: s Being Claimed each lawyer, a bursements" co leted Affidavit s ached unless pi	exchange rate I (comprisin nalyst/consu- vering the wisigned by a re- rovided to the	and country g a "Statemen Itant and artic nole of the pa epresentative e Board as pre	ne form to assist wof initial currency Country: It of Fees Being Claing student/pararty's cost claim shof the party. Escribed on the Coliteria	aimed" and a " llegal. ould be provid	Statement of led.
File # EB-	2020-02	230			Process:	IESO 2020 8	2021 Revenue	Requirement	:
Party:	AMPCC)			- Affi	ant's Name:	Fareeda Heera	lal	
, HST Numbe		13766742	24		-		Rate Ontario:	13.00%	
		Fı	ıll Registrant Jnregistered Other				ring Non-Profit Tax Exempt	[/ []	
					Affidavit				
l,			eda Heeral	al		ty/Town of		Maple	
in the Prov	/ince/St	ate of		Ontario			, swear or affi	rm that:	
2. I have example and the standard of the stan	mined all ed", "State ned "Sumi nts Being (gy Board claim does	of the doo ement(s) o mary of Fe Claimed" i process re s not include	umentation in f Fees Being C es and Disburs nclude only co ferred to abou de any costs fo	a support of this laimed" and "St sements Being (sts incurred and	s cost claim, i tatement(s) c Claimed", "St d time spent r time spent,	ncluding the a of Disburseme atement(s) of directly for th by a person t	edge of the matter attached "Summa nts Being Claimed Fees Being Claime e purposes of the hat is an employe	ry of Fees and I". ed" and "State Party's partici	Disbursements ment(s) of pation in the
Signature	of Affia	nt							
Sworn or a	affirmed	l before	me at the C	ity/Town of		To	ronto	,	
in the Prov				• •		, on	(date)		

Commissioner for taking Affidavits



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2020-0230 F		Process:	: IESO 2020 &2021 Revenue Requirement			
Party:	AMPCO					
	S	ummary of Fees	and Disbursei	ments Being Claimed		
Legal/consultant/other fees		\$	14,602.50			
Disbursements		\$	-			
HST		\$	1,898.33			
Total Cost	Claim	\$	16,500.83			

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Association of Major Power Consumers in Ontario

Send payment to this address: 65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510

Toronto, Ontario

M5H 2M5



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2020-0230		Process: IESO 2020 &2021 Revenue Requirement				
Party:	АМРСО			Service Pro	vider Name:	Shelley Grice, P. Eng.	
				Year Called to		Completed Years Practising/Years of Relevant	
	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check	one)	Bar		Experience	
	Legal Counsel					22	
	Articling Student/Paralegal						→
	Consultant		✓			Hourly Rate: \$330	Ī
	Analyst						=
	For Consultant/Analyst:		V attac	hed	HST Rate Ch	narged (enter %): 13.0%	
		✓ c	CV provi	ided within previous	24 months	-	-

Statement of Fees Being Claimed									
	Hours	Но	urly Rate	Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference			-						
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Technical Conference									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Interrogatories									
Preparation	16.25	\$	330.00	\$	5,362.50	\$	697.13	\$	6,059.63
Responses	6.00	\$	330.00	\$	1,980.00	\$	257.40	\$	2,237.40
Issues Conference									
Preparation	0.75	\$	330.00	\$	247.50	\$	32.18	\$	279.68
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
ADR - Settlement Conference									
Preparation	5.75	\$	330.00	\$	1,897.50	\$	246.68	\$	2,144.18
Attendance	14.50	\$	330.00	\$	4,785.00	\$	622.05	\$	5,407.05
Proposal Preparation	1.00	\$	330.00	\$	330.00	\$	42.90	\$	372.90
Argument									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Oral Hearing									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Other Conferences									
Preparation		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Attendance		\$	330.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
Case Management				\$	-	\$	-	\$	-
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	14,602.50	\$	1,898.33	\$	16,500.83



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	2020-0230	Process: IESC	SO 2020 &2021 Revenue Requirement				
Darty	AMPCO	Service Provider N	ama: Shelley Grice D Eng				

	Statement of Dis	bursements Being Claim	ied	
		Net Cost	HST	Total
Scanning/Photocopy			\$ -	\$ -
Printing			\$ -	\$ -
Courier			\$ -	\$ -
Telephone/Fax			\$ -	\$ -
Transcripts			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Air			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Car			\$ -	\$ -
Travel: Rail			\$ -	\$ -
Travel (Other):			\$ -	\$ -
Parking			\$ -	\$ -
Taxi			\$ -	\$ -
Accommodation			\$ -	\$ -
Meals			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
Other:			\$ -	\$ -
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	5:	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

46 Scarborough Road, Toronto ON M4E 3M5

INVOICE # A2111

November 24, 2021

AMPCO
Thomson Building
65 Queen Street West, Suite 1510
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2M5

Attention: Mr. Colin Anderson, President

Re: IESO 2020 & 2021 Revenue Requirement

EB-2020-0230

Charge Type	Hours	Rate	Amount
f			
Issues	0.75	\$330.00	\$247.50
Preparation - IRs	16.25	\$330.00	\$5,362.50
Responses - IRs	6.00	\$330.00	\$1,980.00
ADR - Preparation	5.75	\$330.00	\$1,897.50
ADR - Attendance	14.50	\$330.00	\$4,785.00
Proposal Preparation	1.00	\$330.00	\$330.00
			\$14,602.50
			\$1,898.33
3			
001	44.25	TOTAL	\$16,500.83
	f Issues Preparation - IRs Responses - IRs ADR - Preparation ADR - Attendance Proposal Preparation	f Issues 0.75 Preparation - IRs 16.25 Responses - IRs 6.00 ADR - Preparation 5.75 ADR - Attendance 14.50 Proposal Preparation 1.00	f Issues 0.75 \$330.00 Preparation - IRs 16.25 \$330.00 Responses - IRs 6.00 \$330.00 ADR - Preparation 5.75 \$330.00 ADR - Attendance 14.50 \$330.00 Proposal Preparation 1.00 \$330.00

Details are included in the attached time sheet. Please make cheque payable to Shelley Grice.

Sincerely,

Shelley Grice, P. Eng.

Shelley Grice							
PROJECT TIME	SHEET	DATE	INVOICE				
EB-2021-0230)	2021-11-21	#A21-11				
IESO 2020 & 2021	Revenue Requirement		•				
PROJECT TIME SHEET							
DATE	TASK DESCRIPTION	CHARGE TYPE	Hours				
2021-06-23	Review & consider application; emails w/cleint;	Interrogatories -	0.50				
	prepare LOI	Preparation					
2021-07-23	Review & consider Draft Issues List; File letter;	Issues Conference -	0.75				
	Review submissions; emails	Preparation					
2021-08-17	Review Decision on Draft Issues List; Review &	Interrogatories -	4.25				
	consider application	Preparation					
2021-08-18	Review & consider application; Prepare	Interrogatories -	6.50				
	interrogatories	Preparation					
2021-08-19	Review & consider application; Prepare	Interrogatories -	5.00				
	interrogatories	Preparation					
2021-09-12	Review & consider interrogatory responses	Interrogatories -	2.75				
		Responses					
2021-09-13	Review & consider interrogatory responses	Interrogatories -	3.25				
		Responses					
2021-09-14	Prepare for Settlement Conference; Review	Settlement Conference -	4.75				
	corrected IRs; Call w/M. Rubenstein; Call w. client re	Preparation					
	ADR; Review PO#3; emails re ADR						
2021-09-15	Attend Settlement Conference	Settlement Conference -	5.50				
2022 00 20		Attendance	0.00				
2021-09-16	Research info; Call w/M. Rubenstein; edit intervenor	Settlement Conference -	1.00				
	notes	Preparation					
2021-09-17	Attend Settlement Conference	Settlement Conference -	3.50				
		Attendance					
2021-09-20	Attend Settlement Conference	Settlement Conference -	5.50				
		Attendance					
2021-09-28	Review & edit Draft Settlement Proposal	Proposal Preparation	0.75				
2021-10-08	Review & edit Draft Settlement Proposal	Proposal Preparation	0.25				
		Total	44.25				