

Toronto ON M5K 1E6 Canada Tel: 416-362-1812

Fax: 416-868-0673

McCarthy Tétrault LLP PO Box 48, Suite 5300 Toronto-Dominion Bank Tower

Reena Goyal

Direct Line: (416) 601-4308 Email: rgoyal@mccarthy.ca

Assistant: Jennifer Kasper Direct Line: (416) 601-8200 x542233 Email: jkasper@mccarthy.ca

November 25, 2021

VIA RESS & EMAIL

Christine Long **Board Secretary** Ontario Energy Board 2300 Yonge Street, Suite 2700 Toronto, ON M4P 1E4

Dear Ms. Long:

Re: EB-2020-0230: Independent Electricity System Operator 2020-2021 Application **Cost Claim of The Association of Power Producers of Ontario**

Pursuant to the Ontario Energy Board (the "OEB")'s Procedural Order No. 1 dated July 15, 2021 and Decision and Order dated November 18, 2021, please find enclosed the cost claim of The Association of Power Producers of Ontario ("APPrO") for this proceeding.

Please note that time spent on considering and responding to all procedural orders and decisions issued by the OEB in this proceeding, including those aspects relating to the proposed draft and final issues lists, have been included in the 'Issues Conference -Preparation' line item of the enclosed form.

APPrO submits that it should be awarded costs as permitted by the OEB's *Practice Direction on* Cost Awards (the "Practice Direction") because its participation played a significant role in achieving a final settlement agreement among the parties and OEB staff, that was ultimately approved by the OEB.

Moreover, in accordance with subsections 5.01(a), (c), (d) and (e) of the Practice Direction, APPrO participated responsibly in the process and complied with the OEB's direction in Procedural Order No. 1 to coordinate its participation with the Ontario Sustainable Energy Association on common issues and avoid duplication. APPrO also coordinated with Hydro Québec Energy Marketing in the preparation of written interrogatories and attendance at the settlement conference. APPrO did not take a position with respect to Issue 3.1 (procurement registration fee structure).



APPrO thanks the OEB for its time and consideration in this proceeding.

Yours truly,

McCarthy Tétrault LLP

Per:

Reena Goyal Counsel

RG/jk

Enclosure

cc. Mr. David Butters, President & CEO, APPrO

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the Affidavit portion is signed and sworn or affirmed.

医肾 医原皮管		li de la companya de	nstructions	
- All claims m - A separate ' Disbursemen However, onl - The cost cla - A CV for each	ts Being Claimed") is required for ly one "Summary of Fees and Disb im must be supported by a compl ch consultant/analyst must be atta	olicable, state ex Rate: S Being Claimed each lawyer, an oursements" cov eted Affidavit si ached unless pro	(change rate and country of (comprising a "Statement of alyst/consultant and articling the whole of the party gned by a representative of covided to the Board as presented.)	initial currency. Country: of Fees Being Claimed" and a "Statement of ng student/paralegal. y's cost claim should be provided. the party.
File # EB-	EB-2020-0230		Process: IESO 2020-202	21 Revenue Requirement
Party:	Associaton of Power Produce	ers of Ontario	Affiant's Name: R	Reena Goyal
HST Numbe	r: 12598802 RT0001		HST R	ate Ontario:13.00%
	Full Registrant Unregistered Other		Qualifyin	ng Non-Profit Tax Exempt
			Affidavit	Vands
in the Prov	Reena Goyal vince/State of	Ontario	, of the City/Town of _	York swear or affirm that:
2. I have example and the state of the state	mined all of the documentation in Id", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Co Ided "Summary of Fees and Disburs Its Being Claimed" include only co Igy Board process referred to abour	a support of this laimed" and "Sta sements Being C sts incurred and Ve. or work done, or	cost claim, including the att atement(s) of Disbursement Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fo It time spent directly for the r time spent, by a person tha	ge of the matters attested to herein. tached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements is Being Claimed". ees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of purposes of the Party's participation in the at is an employee or officer of the Party as
Signature	of Affian			
	affirmed before me at the Covince/State of	ity/Town of Ontario	Toronto, on 25	November , 2021 . (date)

Page 1 of 4

Commissioner for taking Affidavits

Sharanya Tharakumaran LS #778415

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB-	EB-2020-0230		Process: IESO 2020-2021 Revenue Require	ement
Party:	Associaton of Power Pi	oducers of Ont	rio	
	Sur	nmary of Fees	and Disbursements Being Claimed	
Legal/con	sultant/other fees	\$	17,806.00	
Disbursen	nents	\$	-	
LICT		ċ	2 21/1 79	

20,120.78

\$

Total Cost Claim

Payment Information								
Make cheque payable to:	Association of Power Producers of Ontario							
Send payment to this address:	McCarthy Tetrault LLP							
	66 Wellington Street West, Box 48							
	Toronto, ON M5K 1E6							
	Attention: Reena Goyal							

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB-	EB-2020-0230		Process: IESO 2020-2021 Revenue Requirement						
Party:	Associaton of Power Producers o	f Ontario	Service Pro	vider Name: Reen	a Goyal, McC	Carthy Tetr			
			Year Called to	Pra	Completed Y				
1	SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE	(check one)	Bar		Experienc	e			
	Legal Counsel	V	2005		16				
	Articling Student/Paralegal								
	Consultant			Ho	ourly Rate:	\$290			
	Analyst								
	For Consultant/Analyst:	CV attac	ched	HST Rate Charged	(enter %):	13.0%			
		CV prov	ided within previous	s 24 months					

Statement of Fees Being Claimed										
	Hours	Hourly Rate			Subtotal		HST		Total	
Pre-hearing Conference										
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Technical Conference										
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Interrogatories										
Preparation	20.10	\$	290.00	\$	5,829.00	\$	757.77	\$	6,586.77	
Responses	13.00	\$	290.00	\$	3,770.00	\$	490.10	\$	4,260.10	
Issues Conference										
Preparation	7.30	\$	290.00	\$	2,117.00	\$	275.21	\$	2,392.21	
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
ADR - Settlement Conference										
Preparation	0.30	\$	290.00	\$	87.00	\$	11.31	\$	98.31	
Attendance	15.80	\$	290.00	\$	4,582.00	\$	595.66	\$	5,177.66	
Proposal Preparation	4.90	\$	290.00	\$	1,421.00	\$	184.73	\$	1,605.73	
Argument										
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Oral Hearing										
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	<u>-</u>	
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Other Conferences										
Preparation		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	_	\$		
Attendance		\$	290.00	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	
Case Management				\$	-	\$	-	\$		
TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES				\$	17,806.00	\$	2,314.78	\$	20,120.78	

Ontario Energy Board COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS of Food and Disbursoments Boing Claim



Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- EB-2020-0230

Process:

IESO 2020-2021 Revenue Requirement

Party:

Associaton of Power Producers c

Service Provider Name:

Reena Goyal, McCarthy Tetri

	ent of Disbursements Being Clair			Total		
	Net Cost	HST		Total		
Scanning/Photocopy		\$.	. \$	-		
Printing		\$	- \$			
Courier		\$	- \$			
Telephone/Fax		\$.	\$			
Transcripts		\$	- \$			
Travel: Air		\$	- \$	_		
Travel: Car		\$	- \$	-		
Travel: Rail		\$	- \$	_		
Travel (Other):		\$	- \$	-		
Parking		\$	- \$			
Тахі		\$	- \$	-		
Accommodation		\$	- \$	-		
Meals		\$	- \$	-		
Other:		\$	- \$			
Other:		\$	- \$	-		
Other:		\$	- \$	-		
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:	\$	- \$	- \$	-		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Tkpr</u>	TKPR Name	Status	Bs Hrs	Base Amt	В	s Rate	<u>Narrative</u>
06/18/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2.00	\$ 1,560.0) \$	780.00	Read and consider IESO revenue requirement application record.
								Review and consider IESO 2021 revenue requirement application record; draft intervener request letter on
06/22/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2.00	\$ 1,560.0) \$	780.00	behalf of client; telephone discussion with G. Vegh re same.
06/25/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.10	\$ 78.0) \$	780.00	Revise and finalize intervenor request letter to be filed with Ontario Energy Board.
07/02/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.20	\$ 156.0) \$	780.00	Finalize and file intervenor request letter with Ontario Energy Board et al.
07/12/21	1838	Vegh, George	В	0.50	\$ 590.0) \$		Attend call with client re preparation for fees case.
07/12/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.50	\$ 390.0) \$	780.00	Participate in meeting with D. Butters.
		-						
07/14/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.20	\$ 156.0) \$	780.00	Participate in teleconference with client team during APPrO Market Affairs Working Group meeting.
		Goyal, Reena	В	1.00	\$ 780.0	_		Review and analyze procedural order no. 1; reporting email to client re same.
		• •			•			Review OEB Decision and Order in IEO 2019 revenue requirement application; emails to and from D. Butters
07/19/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	1.30	\$ 1,014.0) \$	780.00	re same.
		• •			,			
07/21/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.40	\$ 312.0) \$	780.00	Participate in telephone discussion with OSEA"s lawyers (0.2); follow-up email to D.Butters re same (0.2).
		• •			•			
								Consider and respond to emails from D. utters re draft issues list; emails to and from D. Butters re
07/22/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.50	\$ 390.0	s	780.00	coordination with Hydro-Quebec; read and consider various intervenor submissions re draft issues list.
- , ,		,-,			,	+		Read and consider various intervenor submissions re draft issues list; emails to and from Hydro-Quebec; read
07/23/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.40	\$ 312.0	sİs	780.00	and consider procedural order no. 2 and updated intervenor list.
517 = 57 = =	- 100				7	1		Read and consider responding submissions of IESO and SEC re draft issues list; emails to and from D. Butters
07/30/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.20	\$ 156.0	sİs	780.00	re same.
		Goyal, Reena	В	0.40	\$ 312.0			Participate in teleconference with Hydro Quebec.
		Goyal, Reena	В		\$ 1,170.0			Review IESO application and prepare written interrogatories.
55,55,==	- 100				7 -/	1		
08/09/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	4.10	\$ 3,198.0) <u>\$</u>	780.00	Research and draft written interrogatories (3.8); telephone discussion with D. Butters re same (0.3).
		Goyal, Reena	В		\$ 2,730.0			Research and draft written interrogatories.
55/ =5/ ==	- 100				7 -/:	1		Research and draft written interrogatories (2.0): participate in teleconference with Hydro-Quebec
08/11/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2.30	\$ 1,794.0	S	780.00	representatives (0.3).
		Goyal, Reena	В		\$ 312.0			Read and consider OEB decision re issues list; emails to and from D. Butters re same.
		Goyal, Reena	В		\$ 156.0	_		Update draft written interrogatories list; emails to and from D. Butters et al. re same.
		Goyal, Reena	В	0.50	\$ 390.0			Participate in coordination teleconference with other intervenors.
-5, -5, -1	3.00		1 -	5.50	+ 550.0	- Y	, 55.50	Review Energy Probe interrogatories; respond to emails from client team and revise APPrO draft IRs
								accordingly draft cover letter for filing IR's with Ontario Energy Board; emails to and from other intervenor
08/18/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	3.00	\$ 2,340.0	ء ا ر	780 00	representatives.
30, 10, 21	3.33	co juij necilu	1	3.00	÷ 2,510.0	+	, 00.00	Review and analyze other intervenor interrogatories; respond to emails from client team; revise and file
08/19/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	1.10	\$ 858.0	ء ا ر	780 00	APPrO interrogatories with Ontario Energy Board.
00, 13, 21	0 /00	oo yan, neena	+ -	1.10	y 050.0	, ,	, 50.00	
08/20/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2 00	\$ 1,560.0	ء ا ر	78N NN	Read and consider written interrogatories from other intervenors and Ontario Energy Board staff.
00/20/21	0433	Goyai, Necila	טו	2.00	0.000,1 ب	ڊ _ا ر	700.00	nead and consider written interrogatories from other intervenors and oritano Energy Doard Staff.

08/28/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.30	\$	234.00	\$ 780.00	View IESO August stakeholder engagement session re replacement of settlement system.
		Goyal, Reena	В	3.00	\$	2,340.00	\$ 780.00	Read and consider IESO responses to intervenor interrogatories.
09/13/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2.30		1,794.00	\$ 780.00	Read and consider IESO responses to intervenor written interrogatories.
		• •				,		, ·
								Read and consider IESO responses to intervenor interrogatories; emails from Ontario Energy Board; emails to
09/14/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2.80	\$	2,184.00	\$	and from Hydro Quebec; emails to and from parties; emails to and from D. Butters re same.
		•				·		Participate in Day 1 of settlement conference; read and consider supplemental responses from IESO; revise
								and finalize follow-up interrogatories; read and consider follow-up interrogatories from other intervenors;
								emails to and from D. Butters; follow-up teleconference with HQ; review and advise on OEB procedural order
09/15/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	6.30	\$	4,914.00	\$ 780.00	no. 3; telephone discussion with D. Butters.
		-						Read and consider IESO responses to intervenor and OEB staff follow-up questions and requests for
								clarifications; read and consider working draft of possible settlement proposal; draft and send reporting
								email to D. Butters re same; prepare for and participate in follow-up discussion with Hydro-Quebec; email
09/16/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	2.50	\$	1,950.00	\$	exchanges and telephone discussion with D. Butters.
		Goyal, Reena	В	3.70		2,886.00	\$ 780.00	Participate in settlement conference; telephone discussion with D. Butters re same.
		-						·
09/20/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	5.30	\$	4,134.00	\$ 780.00	Participate in settlement conference; email exchanges and telephone discussion with D. Butters re same.
09/21/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.80	\$	624.00	\$ 780.00	Draft and send reporting email to D. Butters re settlement conference.
09/28/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	1.10	\$	858.00	\$ 780.00	Review and edit draft settlement proposal; emails to and from other intervenors re same.
								Review and consider further edits to draft settlement proposal by other intervenors; emails to and from
09/29/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	В	0.20	\$	156.00	\$ 780.00	other intervenor representatives re same.
10/01/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	Р	0.20	\$	156.00	\$ 780.00	Review comments of Ontario Energy Bord staff to revised draft settlement proposal.
								Review and consider IESO's comments to draft settlement proposal; emails to and from D. Butters re same;
10/08/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	Р	0.30	\$	234.00	\$ 780.00	emails to and from counsel for other intervenors re same.
								Read and consider applicant responses to written interrogatories of intervenors and Ontario Energy Board
10/09/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	Р	1.50	\$	1,170.00	\$ 780.00	
10/12/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	Р	0.20	\$	156.00	\$ 780.00	Read and consider further edits by other intervenors to draft settlement proposal.
10/13/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	Р	0.20	\$	156.00	\$ 780.00	Review for accuracy final draft settlement proposal filed with the Ontario Energy Board.
10/20/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	Р	0.20	\$	156.00	\$ 780.00	Read and consider OEB staff submissions on proposed settlement agreement; email to D. Butters re same.
11/18/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	W	0.20	\$	156.00	\$ 780.00	Read and consider Decision and Order of the Ontario Energy Board; emails to and from D. Butters re same.
11/19/21	6435	Goyal, Reena	W	2.50	\$	1,950.00	\$ 780.00	Draft submissions in response to Decision and Order of Ontario Energy Board.
				61.90	\$ 4	<u>48,482.00</u>		