
Direct Dial: 416.862.4827 
File: 10268 

Sent by RESS Filing   

November 25, 2021 

Ontario Energy Board 
2300 Yonge Street 
27th Floor 
Toronto, ON  M4P 1E4  

Attention:  Christine Long, Board Registrar 

Dear Ms. Long: 

Re: Ontario Sustainable Energy Association’s (“OSEA”) Cost Claim 
Board File No. EB- 2020-0230 
IESO 2020-2021 Expenditure and Revenue Requirement Submission 

Please find enclosed OSEA’s cost claim in the above-noted matter.  OSEA contributed fully to 
this proceeding, and to a number of portions of the settlement agreement.  

As required by Procedural Order No. 1, OSEA coordinated with the Association of Power 
Producers of Ontario (“APPrO”) to avoid duplication.  OSEA also coordinated with the 
Canadian Renewable Energy Association, Energy Storage Canada, and the Ontario Waterpower 
Association (collectively, “REASCWA”) prior to filing interrogatories, and prior to the 
settlement conference, to minimize overlap.  

Yours truly, 

Raeya Jackiw  

cc: Dan Goldberger, OSEA  
Travis Lusney, Power Advisory LLC

Document #: 2054397 





Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

 

1,821.37$                   

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

14,010.50$                 

-$                             

Ontario Sustainable Energy Association

IESO Expenditures, Revenue & Revenue Requirement2020-0230

Legal/consultant/other fees

Payment Information

Total Cost Claim

HST

15,831.87$                 

Disbursements

Send payment to this address:  

Make cheque payable to:  Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP

1 Toronto Street, Suite 900

Toronto, ON M5V 2V6
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Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one )

Year Called to 

Bar

Legal Counsel 2018

Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly Rate:  $170 

Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst:            CV attached 13.0%
           CV provided within previous 24 months

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

11.00 170.00$       1,870.00$     243.10$       

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

2.60 170.00$       442.00$         57.46$          

Attendance 8.40 170.00$       1,428.00$     185.64$       

Proposal Preparation 2.60 170.00$       442.00$         57.46$          

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

1.00 170.00$       170.00$         22.10$          

4,352.00$     565.76$       

Service Provider Name: Raeya Jackiw

-$                             

-$                             

192.10$                       

Pre-hearing Conference

Preparation

ADR - Settlement Conference

Oral Hearing

-$                             

Case Management

Preparation

Attendance

Responses

Issues Conference

2020-0230 IESO Expenditures, Revenue & Revenue Requirement

Ontario Sustainable Energy Association

4,917.76$                   TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES

Preparation

Attendance

Preparation 499.46$                       

1,613.64$                   

-$                             

Argument

Other Conferences

Preparation

Preparation

Attendance -$                             

-$                             

3

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of Relevant 

Experience

499.46$                       

Technical Conference

Preparation

Attendance

-$                             

-$                             

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Total

-$                             

-$                             Attendance

2,113.10$                   

-$                             

Interrogatories

Preparation

-$                             
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Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one )

Year Called to 

Bar

Legal Counsel 2011

Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly Rate:  $230 

Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst:            CV attached 13.0%
           CV provided within previous 24 months

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

0.20 230.00$       46.00$           5.98$            

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

Attendance 230.00$       -$               -$              

Proposal Preparation 0.50 230.00$       115.00$         14.95$          

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

230.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

161.00$         20.93$          TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES 181.93$                      

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Case Management -$                             

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Other Conferences

Argument

Preparation -$                             

Oral Hearing

ADR - Settlement Conference

Preparation -$                             

-$                             

129.95$                       

Issues Conference

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Preparation 51.98$                         

Responses -$                             

Technical Conference

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Attendance -$                             

10

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Total

Interrogatories

2020-0230 IESO Expenditures, Revenue & Revenue Requirement

Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Service Provider Name: Joanna Vince

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of Relevant 

Experience

Pre-hearing Conference

Preparation -$                             
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Nov/25/2021 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page: 1
Client Fees Listing

Jul/ 1/2021 To Oct/20/2021
Date Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Amount Inv# Billing

Entry # Explanation Type

1341 Ontario Sustainable Energy Association
10268 Re:  EB-2020-0230 - IESO -  Application for A

Jul 19/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
2225814 review and respond to D. Goldberger and Time

T. Lusney's emails re issues list, and
coordinating with APPrO; 

Jul 20/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
2225829 call to discuss issues list with J. Time

Vince; 
Jul 20/2021 Lawyer: 72  2.00 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 2.00 340.00 Unbilled

2252441 review IESO application and proposed Time
issues list, and consider areas of
interest to OSEA and comments on same;
review T. Lusney's comments; 

Jul 21/2021 Lawyer: 72  2.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 2.20 374.00 Unbilled
2252443 review MRP Business Case materials, Time

emails with T. Lusney re same; call
with R. Goyal (counsel for APPrO) to
coordinate and ensure no duplication
of effort on issues and draft issues
list submissions; draft OSEA's
submissions on draft issues list;
draft cover letter for issues list;
call with T. Lusney to discuss
submission; revise submission and send
to T. Lusney; 

Jul 22/2021 Lawyer: 48  0.20 Hrs X 230.00 48 48   - JOANNA VINCE 0.20 46.00 Unbilled
2226251 send revised comments on issues list to Time

client for review and approval;
Jul 22/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.40 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.40 68.00 Unbilled

2226492 revise submission and instruct S. Baksh Time
to file; circulate submission to
distribution list; 

Jul 23/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.60 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.60 102.00 Unbilled
2226504 send update to D. Goldberger on plans Time

for coordinating with APPrO; review
PO2 and instruct S. Baksh to diarize
updated deadlines; 

Aug  5/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.60 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.60 102.00 Unbilled
2229683 review IESO reply submissions on draft Time

issues list, and emails with T. Lusney
re IESO's comments and next steps;

Aug 12/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
2231021 review OEB's decision on issues list; Time

Aug 16/2021 Lawyer: 72  1.00 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 1.00 170.00 Unbilled
2231349 emails with D. Goldberger and T. Lusney Time

re interrogatories; call with APPrO,
OWRA, ESC, and CanREA to collaborate
and confirm no duplication on IRs;

Aug 18/2021 Lawyer: 72  2.50 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 2.50 425.00 Unbilled
2252468 review and comment on draft Time

interrogatories; call with T. Lusney
to discuss; revise draft
interrogatories and send to D.
Goldberger and T. Lusney; circulate
draft interrogatories to APPrO,
CanREA, ESG, and OWA for review to
avoid duplication; review APPrO and
CanREA, ESG, and OWA's
interrogatories; 

Aug 19/2021 Lawyer: 72  1.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 1.20 204.00 Unbilled
2231874 emails with T. Lusney, R. Goyal, and J. Time

Chee-Aloy; emails with D. Goldberger re
interrogatories, and receive
instructions to file; file
interrogatories and send to
distribution list; 

Sep  2/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.60 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.60 102.00 Unbilled
2234162 review and respond to T. Lusney's Time

question re settlement conference and
next steps; review and respond to OEB
email confirming OSEA's participation
in settlement conference; 

Sep  9/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.20 34.00 Unbilled
2235362 review and respond to OEB email re Time

settlement conference facilitation;
Sep 14/2021 Lawyer: 72  2.60 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 2.60 442.00 Unbilled

2252445 review IESO's responses to IRs and Time
prepare for settlement conference;
emails with J. Chee-Aloy and T. Lusney
re strategy for settlement conference;
call with T. Lusney to discuss OSEA's
position for settlement conference;
call with J. Chee-Aloy, S. Simmons,



Nov/25/2021 Willms & Shier Environmental Lawyers LLP Page: 2
Client Fees Listing

Jul/ 1/2021 To Oct/20/2021
Date Fee / Time Working Lawyer Hours Amount Inv# Billing

Entry # Explanation Type

and T. Lusney; update client;
Sep 15/2021 Lawyer: 72  1.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 1.20 204.00 Unbilled

2236810 attend settlement conference day 1; Time
Sep 15/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.00 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.00 0.00 Unbilled

2252473 [TRAVIS PRESENT] attend settlement Time
conference day 1; [4 hours No Charge]

Sep 17/2021 Lawyer: 72  2.80 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 2.80 476.00 Unbilled
2237513 attend settlement conference (Day 2); Time

Sep 20/2021 Lawyer: 72  4.40 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 4.40 748.00 Unbilled
2237525 attend settlement conference (day 3); Time

Sep 22/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.50 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.50 85.00 Unbilled
2238288 draft and send update to D. Goldberger Time

on outcome of settlement conference;
Sep 28/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.80 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.80 136.00 Unbilled

2239182 review, revise and provide comments on Time
draft settlement agreement; 

Oct  8/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.80 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.80 136.00 Unbilled
2242660 review IESO's revised settlement Time

proposal; 
Oct  8/2021 Lawyer: 48  0.50 Hrs X 230.00 48 48   - JOANNA VINCE 0.50 115.00 Unbilled

2242689 review IESO draft settlement proposal Time
and provide comments;

Oct 12/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.40 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.40 68.00 Unbilled
2243090 review emails re settlement proposal, Time

and review final settlement proposal;
Oct 20/2021 Lawyer: 72  0.20 Hrs X 170.00 72 72   - RAEYA JACKIW 0.20 34.00 Unbilled

2244228 review OEB staff's submission on Time
settlement proposal; 

Unbilled: 26.30 4513.00
Billed: 0.00 0.00
Total: 26.30 4513.00

Percent Billed: 0.00 0.00

*** Summary by Working Lawyer ***

Working Lawyer | Hours | | Fees |
Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld

48   - JOANNA VINCE 0.70 2.66 0.00 100.00 0.70 0.00 161.00 3.57 0.00 100.00 161.00 0.00
72   - RAEYA JACKIW 25.60 97.34 0.00 100.00 25.60 0.00 4352.00 96.43 0.00 100.00 4352.00 0.00
Firm Total 26.30 100.00 0.00 100.00 26.30 0.00 4513.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 4513.00 0.00

*** Summary by Responsible Lawyer ***

Responsible Lawyer | Hours | | Fees |
Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld Unbilled Firm % Billed Firm % Total % Bld

48   - JOANNA VINCE 26.30 100.00 0.00 100.00 26.30 0.00 4513.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 4513.00 0.00
Firm Total 26.30 100.00 0.00 100.00 26.30 0.00 4513.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 4513.00 0.00

REPORT SELECTIONS - Client Fees Listing
Layout Template Default(1)
Advanced Search Filter None
Requested by Liba  (Security Restrictions)
Finished Thursday, November 25, 2021 at 02:45:07 PM
Ver 14.1 (14.1.20150324)
Date Range Jul/ 1/2021 To Oct/20/2021
Matters 10268
Clients All
Major Clients All
Client Intro Lawyer All
Matter Intro Lawyer All
Responsible Lawyer All
Assigned Lawyer All
Type of Law All
Select From Active, Inactive, Archived Matters
Matters Sort by Default
New Page for Each Lawyer No
Firm Totals Only No
Client balances only No
Matter balances only No
Entries Shown - Billed Only No
Entries Shown - Unbilled Yes
Entries Shown - Billable Tasks Yes
Entries Shown - Write Up/Down Tasks No
Entries Shown - No Charge Tasks No
Entries Shown - Non Billable Tasks No
Working Lawyer All



Ontario Energy Board

COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS
Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File #  EB- Process: 

Party:

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE (check one )

Year Called to 

Bar

Legal Counsel

Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant Hourly Rate:  $290 

Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst:            CV attached 13.0%
           CV provided within previous 24 months

Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

18.75 290.00$       5,437.50$     706.88$       

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

0.35 290.00$       101.50$         13.20$          

Attendance 12.40 290.00$       3,596.00$     467.48$       

Proposal Preparation 1.25 290.00$       362.50$         47.13$          

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

290.00$       -$               -$              

170.00$       -$               -$              

9,497.50$     1,234.68$    TOTAL SERVICE PROVIDER FEES 10,732.18$                 

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Case Management -$                             

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Other Conferences

Argument

Preparation -$                             

Oral Hearing

ADR - Settlement Conference

Preparation 114.70$                       

4,063.48$                   

409.63$                       

Issues Conference

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Preparation 6,144.38$                   

Responses -$                             

Technical Conference

Preparation -$                             

Attendance -$                             

Attendance -$                             

HST Rate Charged (enter % ):

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Total

Interrogatories

2020-0230 IESO Expenditures, Revenue & Revenue Requirement

Ontario Sustainable Energy Association Service Provider Name: Travis Lusney

Completed Years 

Practising/Years of Relevant 

Experience

Pre-hearing Conference

Preparation -$                             

7 of 8



In Reference To: IESO Revenue Requirement (EB-2020-0230) (Labor)

Technical consulting support for OSEA in the IESO Revenue Requirement (EB-2021-0230).

Date By Services Hours Rates Amount

07/20/2021 TL Review IESO revenue requirement application and 
provide comments on draft issues list

3.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 1,015.00

07/22/2021 TL Review issues list submissions 1.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 290.00

08/15/2021 TL Reviewing IESO materials and drafting IRs. 3.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 870.00

08/16/2021 TL Reviewing IESO materials and drafting IRs. Discuss 
draft IRs with Raeya. Call with other associations on 
aligned issues

2.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 580.00

08/18/2021 TL Review draft IRs with Raeya 1.25 $ 290.00/hr $ 362.50

08/19/2021 TL Review IRs submitted by other intervenors 1.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 290.00

08/20/2021 TL Review IRs submitted by other intervenors 2.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 725.00

09/10/2021 TL Review IR responses from IESO 1.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 290.00

09/13/2021 TL Review IR responses from IESO 3.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 1,015.00

09/14/2021 TL Attend IESO technical conference. Call with Raeya on 
priority issues, summary email to OSEA, call with 
CanREA/ESC/OWA for settlement conference 
strategy

3.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 1,015.00

09/15/2021 TL Prepare and attend settlement conference 4.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 1,160.00

09/17/2021 TL Attending settlement conference 1.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 435.00

09/20/2021 TL Discuss with Raeya IESO settlement conference and 
registration fee settlement, attend settlement 
conference. 

3.75 $ 290.00/hr $ 1,087.50

09/28/2021 TL Review settlement proposal 0.75 $ 290.00/hr $ 217.50

10/08/2021 TL Review IESO responses to settlement proposal 0.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 145.00

Power Advisory LLC
55 University Avenue, Suite 700, PO Box 32
Toronto, ON M5J 2H7

 
Ontario Sustainability Energy Association
Dan Goldberger
720 Bathurst St, 3rd FL
Toronto, Ontario M5S 2R4 

Date Nov 02, 2021

Terms
Service Thru Oct 31, 2021

Invoice 211094

Page 1



Total Hours 32.75 hrs

Labor $ 9,497.50

Labor HST 81338 8691 RT001 $ 1,234.68

Total Labor $ 10,732.18

Total Invoice Amount $ 10,732.18

Previous Balance $ 0.00

Balance (Amount Due) $ 10,732.18

Notes:
Power Advisory LLC remittance address indicated above. Electronic payment instructions available upon request.

For invoice and payment questions contact: 
Julie Glover (jglover@poweradvisoryllc.com)
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User Hours Summary

Billing Period: 07/20/2021 - 10/31/2021

User Hour Totals

User Hours Billed Rate/Hour Amount Billed

Travis Lusney 32.75 $ 290.00 $ 9,497.50
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