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December 9, 2021 

VIA RESS & EMAIL 
 
Christine Long 
Board Secretary 
Ontario Energy Board  
2300 Yonge Street, Suite 2700  
Toronto, ON   M4P 1E4 

 

Dear Ms. Long: 

Re: EB-2021-0136: Hydro One Networks Inc. – RTR Project                                         
Cost Claim of The Association of Power Producers of Ontario 

Pursuant to the Ontario Energy Board (the “OEB”)’s Procedural Order No. 1 dated September 
16, 2021 and Decision and Order dated December 2, 2021, please find enclosed the cost claim 
of The Association of Power Producers of Ontario (“APPrO”) for this proceeding.  

Please note that time spent on considering and responding to all procedural orders and 
decisions issued by the OEB in this proceeding, including those aspects relating to 
confidentiality requests and the IESO’s request to submit separate reply submissions, have 
been included in the ‘Case Management’ line item of the enclosed form. 

APPrO submits that it should be awarded costs as permitted by the OEB’s Practice Direction on 
Cost Awards (the “Practice Direction”) because its participation contributed to the OEB’s 
understanding and determination of the adequacy of the IESO’s needs assessment and related 
evidence filed in support of the application. For instance, APPrO’s participation assisted the 
OEB in finding that its public interest mandate requires that a need for “the factual basis for 
IESO recommendations” filed in future applications “be clear and understood by the OEB” and 
must entail more than a simple reliance on “the expert of the IESO”. APPrO’s participation 
further assisted the OEB in explicitly requiring on a go forward basis that, where possible, 
“timely examinations of alternatives to construction of transmission facilities” must take place 
such that they “are not dismissed as being unable to be implemented simply because of a lack 
of time”. (OEB Decision and Order dated December 2, 2021 at page 8.) 

Moreover, in accordance with subsections 5.01(a), (c), (d) and (e) of the Practice Direction, 
APPrO participated responsibly in the process and complied with the OEB’s direction in 
Procedural Order No. 1 to coordinate its participation with Environmental Defence on common 
issues and avoid duplication, which APPrO did in its preparation of written interrogatories and 
consideration of a need for a technical conference. 
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Christine Long - December 9, 2021 

 

APPrO thanks the OEB for its time and consideration in this proceeding. 

Yours truly, 

McCarthy Tétrault LLP 

Per: 

 

Reena Goyal 
Counsel 

RG/jk 
 

Enclosures 
 
cc.  Mr. David Butters, President & CEO, APPrO 

 



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements
This form should be used by a party to a hearing before the Board to identify the fees and disbursements that form the party's cost
claim. Paper and electronic copies of this form and itemized receipts must be filed with the Board and served on one or more other
parties as directed by the Board in the applicable Board order. Please ensure all required (yellow-shaded) fields are filled in and the
Affidavit portion is signed and sworn' or affirmed.

Instructions

- Required data input is indicated by yellow-shaded fields. Formulas are embedded in the form to assist with calculations.
- All claims must be in Canadian dollars. If applicable, state exchange rate and country of initial currency.

Rate: Country:
- A separate "Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed" (comprising a "Statement of Fees Being C~la""'i-m-e""'dm'''-a-n-;d-a-;"r:=S'''''ta''7t-em-e-n'''''t-ofr--

Disbursements Being Claimed") is required for each lawyer, analyst/consultant and articling student/paralegal.
However, only one "Summary of Fees and Disbursements" covering the whole of the party's cost claim should be provided.
- The cost claim must be supported by a completed Affidavit signed by a representative of the party.
- A CV for each consultant/analyst must be attached unless provided to the Board as prescribed on the Cost Award Tariff.

Except as provided in section 7.03 of the Practice Direction on Cost Awards, itemized receipts must be provided.

Full Registrant

Unregistered

Other

o
o
o

Qualifying Non-Profit

Tax Exempt
o
o

File # EB- 2021-0136 Process: Hydro One Networks Inc. - RTR Project

Party: Association of Power Producers of Ontario Affiant's Name: Reena Goyal~~~~------------------~
HST Number: 12598802 RTOOOl HST Rate Ontario: 13.00%

Affidavit

I, ReenaGoyal , of the City/Townof York
in the Province/Stateof Ontario , swearor affirm that:-----------------
1. I am a representative of the above-noted party (the "Party") and as such have knowledge of the matters attested to herein.
2. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim, including the attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements
Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of Disbursements Being Claimed".
3. The attached "Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed", "Statement(s) of Fees Being Claimed" and "Statement(s) of
Disbursements Being Claimed" include only costs incurred and time spent directly for the purposes of the Party's participation in the
Ontario Energy Board process referred to above.
4. This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as
described in sections 6. 5 and 6. 9 of the Board's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

Swornor affirmed before me at the City/Townof Toronto
__________ o_n_t_a_rio-_-_-_-_-_-_--,-o-n----~12--~-~--'~-----{-t-~---t

(date)

in the Province/Stateof

Commissionerfor taking Affidavits
L-~.4\~r~g4 \5
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Affidavit and Summary of Fees and Disbursements

File # EB- 2021-0136---------------------------- Process: Hydro One Networks Inc. - RTRProject

Party: Association of Power Producers of Ontario

Summary of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed
Legal/consultant/other fees
Disbursements
HST

s 9,026.50
$
$ 1,173.45

Total Cost Claim $ 10,199.95

Payment Information

Make cheque payable to: Association of Power Producers of Ontario

Send payment to this address: McCarthy Tetrault LLP------~---------------------------------66 Wellington Street, Box 48
Toronto, ON M5K 1E6
Attention: Reena Goyal
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2021-0136------------------------------- Process: Hydro One Networks Inc. - RTRProject

Association of Power Producers of Ontario Service Provider Name: Reena Goyal, McCarthy Tetr.Party:

Year Called to

Bar

Completed Years

Practising/Years of Relevant

ExperienceSERVICEPROVIDER TYPE (check one)

legal Counsel
Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant
Analyst

For Consultant/Analyst: D
D

o
D
D
D

2005 16

Hourly Rate:1 $290

CVattached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):L...I 13_._0_%__ -,
CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total

Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Technical Conference
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Interrogatories
Prepa ration 8.90 $ 290.00 $ 2,581.00 $ 335.53 $ 2,916.53
Responses 1.30 $ 290.00 $ 377.00 s 49.01 $ 426.01

Issues Conference
Preparation s 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

ADR - Settlement Conference
Prepa ration $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 s - $ - s -

Proposal Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Argument
Preparation 10.40 $ 290.00 $ 3,016.00 $ 392.08 $ 3,408.08

Oral Hearing
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Other Conferences
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Case Management 8.30 $ - $ - $ -

TOTAL SERVICEPROVIDER FEES $ 5,974.00 $ 776.62 $ 6,750.62
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2021-0136---------------------- Hydro One Networks Inc. - RTRProjectProcess:

Party: Association of Power Producers Service Provider Name: Reena Goyal, McCarthy Tetn

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total

Scanning/Photocopy $ - $ -

Printing $ - $ -

Courier $ - $ -

Telephone/Fax $ - $ -

Transcripts s - $ -

Travel: Air $ - $ -

Travel: Car $ - $ -

Travel: Rail $ - $ -

Travel (Other): $ - $ -

Parking $ - $ -

Taxi $ - $ -

Accommodation s - $ -

Meals $ - $ -

Other: $ - $ -
Other: $ - $ -

Other: $ - $ -

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $ - $ - $ -

2 of 2



Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

Hourly Rate:L...1_....;.$_2_9_0_-,

File # EB- 2021-0136----------------- Process: Hydro One Networks Inc. - RTRProject

Party: Association of Power Producers of Ontario Service Provider Name: Travis Lusney, Power Adviso

Completed Years

SERVICEPROVIDER TYPE (check one)

Year Called to

Bar
Practising/Years of Relevant

Experience

Legal Counsel
Articling Student/Paralegal

Consultant

Analyst

o
oo
D

15

For Consultant/Analyst: D CVattached HST Rate Charged (enter % ):L...1__ 1_3._0_%_-'
o CV provided within previous 24 months

Statement of Fees Being Claimed
Hours Hourly Rate Subtotal HST Total

Pre-hearing Conference
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Technical Conference
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Interrogatories
Preparation 3.75 $ 290.00 $ 1,087.50 $ 141.38 $ 1,228.88
Responses 2.00 $ 290.00 $ 580.00 $ 75.40 $ 655.40

Issues Conference
Prepa ration $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

ADR - Settlement Conference
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -
Proposal Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Argument
Preparation 3.75 $ 290.00 $ 1,087.50 $ 141.38 $ 1,228.88

Oral Hearing
Prepa ration $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Other Conferences
Preparation $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Attendance $ 290.00 $ - $ - $ -

Case Management 1.75 $ 170.00 $ 297.50 $ 38.68 $ 336.18

TOTAL SERVICEPROVIDER FEES $ 3,052.50 $ 396.83 $ 3,449.33
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Ontario Energy Board
COST CLAIM FOR HEARINGS

Detail of Fees and Disbursements Being Claimed

File # EB- 2021-0136 Hydro One Networks Inc. - RTRProjectProcess:

Party: Association of Power Producers Service Provider Name: Travis Lusney, Power Advisol

Statement of Disbursements Being Claimed
Net Cost HST Total

Scanning/Photocopy $ - $ -

Printing $ - $ -

Courier $ - $ -

Telephone/Fax $ - $ -

Transcripts $ - $ -

Travel: Air $ - $ -

Travel: Car $ - $ -

Travel: Rail $ - $ -

Travel (Other): $ - $ -

Parking $ - $ -

Taxi $ - $ -

Accommodation $ - $ -

Meals $ - $ -

Other: $ - $ -

Other: $ - $ -

Other: $ - s -

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: $ - $ - $ -

2 of 2



Date ID Tkpr TKPR Name Status Bs Hrs Base Amt Bl Hrs Billed Amt Narrative

09/03/21 34620947 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.00 780.00$        1.00 780.00$        

Prepare for and participate in teleconference with D. Butters and E. Coyle; follow-up 

emails from D. Butters and E. Coyle re same.

09/06/21 34620898 6435 Goyal, Reena B 2.80 2,184.00$    2.80 2,184.00$     

Draft and revise intervenor request letter to Ontario Energy Board; emails to and from D. 

Butters re same; read and consider Market Surveillance Panel Report 35.

09/07/21 34620949 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.20 156.00$        0.20 156.00$        

Finalize and file intervenor request letter to Ontario Energy Board; read and consider 

intervenor request letter from Capital Power; emails to and from D. Butters and E. Coyle 

re same.

09/16/21 34614625 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.20 156.00$        0.20 156.00$        

Read and consider Ontario Energy Board procedural order no. 1; email to D. Butters et al 

re same.

09/21/21 34631700 6435 Goyal, Reena B 2.20 1,716.00$   2.20 1,716.00$    Read and consider Hydro One application; draft written interrogatories.

09/22/21 34636450 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.00 780.00$        1.00 780.00$        

Read and consider written interrogatories of other intervenors; revise client written 

interrogatories; email to D. Butters et al re same.

09/23/21 34640162 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.40 1,092.00$    1.40 1,092.00$     

Review and consider draft engagement letter; consider and revise draft written 

interrogatories from Power Advisory; telephone discussion with and emails to and from 

D. Butters re same.

09/24/21 34648615 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.00 780.00$        1.00 780.00$        

Revise and finalize client written interrogatories; emails to and from D. Butters et al re 

same; read and consider written interrogatories of Ontario Energy Board staff; consider 

intervenor request of IESO; emails to and from T. Lusney et al. re same.

09/28/21 34659374 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.20 156.00$        0.20 156.00$        

Email to other intervenor representatives; emails to and from representative for 

Environmental Defence; email to client team re same.

09/29/21 34665043 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.20 936.00$        1.20 936.00$        

Draft letter to Ontario Energy Board seeking IESO witness panel and technical 

conference; consult with G. Vegh re same; emails to and from client team re same.

10/12/21 34719247 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.90 702.00$        0.90 702.00$        

Read and consider further written interrogatories of other intervenors; read and 

consider submissions of Ontario Energy Board staff; participate in meeting with D. 

Butters et al.

10/13/21 34724455 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.30 234.00$        0.30 234.00$        Review and advise D. Butters re Ontario Energy Board procedural order number 2.

10/14/21 34727575 6435 Goyal, Reena B 2.80 2,184.00$   2.80 2,184.00$    Draft closing written submissions.

10/15/21 34730510 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.90 1,482.00$   1.90 1,482.00$    Draft closing written submissions.

10/18/21 34740581 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.20 156.00$       0.20 156.00$       Read and consider Ontario Energy Board staff submission on confidentiality.

10/22/21 34760984 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.10 858.00$       1.10 858.00$       Revise closing written submissions; emails to and from T Lusney re same.

10/26/21 34771188 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.10 78.00$         0.10 78.00$         Read and consider Ontario Energy Board decision re confidentiality.

10/27/21 34775469 6435 Goyal, Reena B 0.60 468.00$        0.60 468.00$        

Read and consider comments from T. Lusney to APPrO draft closing submissions; read 

and consider Ontario Energy Board staff submissions; emails to and from D. Butters et al 

re same.



10/28/21 34780851 6435 Goyal, Reena B 2.90 2,262.00$    2.90 2,262.00$     

Review client comments and edit draft closing written submissions; emails to and from 

D. Butters et al re same.

10/29/21 34792866 6435 Goyal, Reena B 1.10 858.00$        1.10 858.00$        

Review further client comments and revise and finalize closing written submissions; 

emails to and from D. Butters et al re same; draft cover letter and file submissions with 

Ontario Energy Board.

11/04/21 34822008 6435 Goyal, Reena P 1.60 1,248.00$    - -$               

Read and consider IESO submission to Ontario Energy Board; emails and meeting with D. 

Butters et al re same; draft and file responding letter with Ontario Energy Board; read 

and consider decision letter from Ontario Energy Board.

11/13/21 34852247 6435 Goyal, Reena P 1.00 780.00$        - -$               

Read and consider applicant reply submissions; numerous emails to and from D. Butters 

et al. re same.

11/15/21 34858194 6435 Goyal, Reena P 0.90 702.00$       - -$              Participate In meeting with D. Butters et al.

12/02/21 34938799 6435 Goyal, Reena W 0.80 624.00$        - -$               

Read and consider decision and order of Ontario Energy Board; emails to and from D. 

Butters et al.

12/06/21 34950311 6435 Goyal, Reena W 1.50 1,170.00$    - -$               

Prepare client cost claim in response to OEB Decision and Order dated December 2, 

2021;

28.90 22,542.00$ 23.10 18,018.00$ 



In Reference To: LTC Trafalgar x Richview Regulatory Support (Labor)

Expert Regulatory Support for EB-2021-0136, Hydro One Leave to Construct for Trafalgar to Richview Upgrade

Date By Services Hours Rates Amount

09/23/2021 TL Review evidence and discuss IR strategy. Review, edit 
and expand on draft IRs

3.75 $ 290.00/hr $ 1,087.50

09/29/2021 TL Review letter for Technical Conference and IESO 
panel

0.25 $ 290.00/hr $ 72.50

10/12/2021 TL Review IR responses, call with APPrO team 2.00 $ 290.00/hr $ 580.00

10/21/2021 TL Review draft submission, provide edits and comments 1.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 435.00

10/22/2021 TL Review and provide edits on second version 0.50 $ 290.00/hr $ 145.00

10/27/2021 TL Review document, provide edits and comments 1.25 $ 290.00/hr $ 362.50

10/28/2021 TL Final review of submission 0.25 $ 290.00/hr $ 72.50

10/29/2021 TL Final review of LTC submission 0.25 $ 290.00/hr $ 72.50

11/04/2021 TL Review IESO letter asking for additional evidence, 
work with APPrO to draft response

0.75 $ 290.00/hr $ 217.50

11/12/2021 TL Review RTR submission by HONI 0.75 $ 290.00/hr $ 217.50

Total Hours 11.25 hrs

Labor $ 3,262.50

Labor HST 81338 8691 RT001 $ 424.13

Total Labor $ 3,686.63

Total Invoice Amount $ 3,686.63

Previous Balance $ 0.00

Balance (Amount Due) $ 3,686.63

Power Advisory LLC
55 University Avenue, Suite 700, PO Box 32
Toronto, ON M5J 2H7

 
Association of Power Producers of Ontario
67 Yonge St
Suite 1040
Toronto, Ontario M5E 1J8 

Date Dec 02, 2021

Terms N/A

Service Thru Nov 30, 2021

Invoice 211174
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Notes:
Power Advisory LLC remittance address indicated above. Electronic payment instructions available upon request.

For invoice and payment questions contact: 
Julie Glover (jglover@poweradvisoryllc.com)
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User Hours Summary

Billing Period: 09/23/2021 - 11/30/2021

User Hour Totals

User Hours Billed Rate/Hour Amount Billed

Travis Lusney 11.25 $ 290.00 $ 3,262.50
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