PROJECT TIME SHEET #1

Project Title	Ontario Power Generation 2022-2026 Payment Amounts		
Project File	EB-2020-0290		
Authority	Ontario Energy Board		
For/Behalf of	Quinte Manufacturers Association		
	Belleville, Ontario		

DATE	WORK DESCRIPTION	ACTIVITY	HOURS
18/19-01-2021	Initiate review of OPG Application/Evidence	Preparation	6.5
15/17-03-2021	Review OPG Application/Evidence – Determination of IRs	Preparation	9.5
18-03-2021	QMA Steering Team Presentation - Review case + coordination	Preparation	N/C
24/25-03-2021	Review OPG Application/Evidence + Draft Issues + Interv. IRs	Preparation	5.5
20/21-04-2021	Review IR Responses	Preparation	5.0
23-04-2021	Review of Draft Issues List + Add'l Evidence Reviewed	Preparation	2.75
30-04-2021	Technical Conference Preparation	Preparation	2.25
03-05-2021	Attend Technical Conference	Attendance	6.5
06-05-2021	Attend Technical Conference	Attendance	6.0
07-05-2021	Attend Technical Conference	Attendance	6.0
10-05-2021	Attend Technical Conference	Attendance	2.5
10-05-2021	Issues Day Preparation	Preparation	0.5
18-05-2021	Attend Issues Day	Attendance	4.0
04-06-2021	Review IR responses + Settlement Conference Preparation	Preparation	5.25
07-06-2021	Attend Settlement Conference	Attendance	6.5
08-06-2021	Attend Settlement Conference	Attendance	6.5
09-06-2021	Attend Settlement Conference	Attendance	6.5
10-06-2021	Attend Settlement Conference	Attendance	4.0
07/08-07-2021	Review Draft Settlement Agreement + QMA Comments/Advice	Preparation	N/C
22-07-2021	Review OEB Staff Comments on Settlement Agreement	Preparation	1.0
04-08-2021	Attend Oral Hearing	Attendance	6.0
09-08-2021	Review Hearing Transcripts	Preparation	2.25
19-08-2021	Review OPG Argument	Preparation	1.25
26/27/30-08-2021	Review QMA Positions + Prep Submission	Preparation	6.25
16-11-2021	Review Decision	Preparation	0.5
30-11-2021	Review Draft Payment Amounts Order	Preparation	0.75
14-01-2022	Review Rate Smoothing Decision	Preparation	0.5
	č	Total Hours	104.25
As Necessary	Zoom-calls with QMA Steering Comm Update/Discussion	Preparation	N/C