



June 16, 2022

VIA RESS

Ontario Energy Board
P.O.Box 2319
2300 Yong Street, 27th Floor
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4
Attention: Registrar

Dear Ms. Marconi:

**Re: Hydro One Networks Inc. (HONI) – Interim Cost Claim (Anwaatin)
Board File No. EB-2021-0110**

Please find attached the cost claim of Anwaatin Inc. (**Anwaatin**) in the above-referenced proceeding (the **Proceeding**), filed pursuant to Procedural Order No. 6 dated June 2, 2022.

Anwaatin respectfully requests an interim cost award of 100% of its eligible costs, given its strategic and principled participation in the Proceeding on behalf of otherwise unrepresented First Nations communities. Anwaatin submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (i) Anwaatin has participated effectively, taking a surgical, principled, and coordinated approach to the issues and undertaking coordination with other intervenors to avoid overlap and maximize efficiency in all aspects of the Proceeding;
- (ii) Anwaatin has participated responsibly and made reasonable efforts to ensure that its participation was not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues; and
- (iii) Anwaatin has contributed to the Board's better understanding of issues in the Proceeding by filing interrogatories, participating in technical conferences, and engaging in other aspects of the proceeding in a principled and efficient manner.

We trust that Anwaatin's approach to-date has maximized efficiency and the right of otherwise unrepresented First Nations communities facing electricity reliability and other energy issues to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's mandate and statutory objectives.

Anwaatin respectfully requests a full award of its interim costs.

Sincerely,

Jonathan McGillivray

Jonathan McGillivray

EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova

COST CLAIM NUMBER 481	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE June 16, 2022	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 2
INTERVENOR Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Anwaatin Inc., Hagersville : Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY Canada
HST NUMBER 78515 4923 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Participant Total (\$)	Participant Claim Status
No	,	DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	6,525.75	Submitted
No	,	McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	6,147.20	Submitted
No	,	McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	4,106.42	Submitted
No	,	Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 993-6338 daniel@resilientllp.com	4,034.10	Submitted
No	,	Daube, Nicholas; +1 (416) 768-8341 nicholas@resilientllp.com	3,637.47	Submitted
No	,	Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086 drichardson.gll@gmail.com	1,976.37	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Attachment Date	Participant	Document Type	Claim Type	Import Message
ANWAA EB-2021-0110 Cost Claim 061620221122.pdf					
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_CoverLetter_20220616.pdf			Cover Letter		

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 23,387.00	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00	TOTAL HST 3,040.31
--	-----------------------------	-----------------------

TOTAL CLAIM 26,427.31	TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED
--------------------------	----------------------

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3
-------------------------	-----------------------------	-----------------------------

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO
Resilient LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS
333 Bay Street, Suite 625
Toronto, ON
M5H 2R2

ATTENTION

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY
Jonathan McGillivray

DATE SUBMITTED
June 16, 2022

Lisa (Elisabeth) DeMarco

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 1997	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 25	HOURLY RATE 330
CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE February 23, 2022		HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No	

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	2.80	330	924.00	13.00	120.12	1,044.12
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	5.80	330	1,914.00	13.00	248.82	2,162.82
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	2.70	330	891.00	13.00	115.83	1,006.83
Technical Conference Attendance	4.30	330	1,419.00	13.00	184.47	1,603.47
Technical Conference Follow Up		330		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	0.70	330	231.00	13.00	30.03	261.03
Attendance		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	1.00	330	330.00	13.00	42.90	372.90
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		330		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		330		13.00		
With Other Parties	0.20	330	66.00	13.00	8.58	74.58
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Decision			
Review	330	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	330	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	330	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	5,775.00	750.75	6,525.75

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_LisaDeMarco_Dockets_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_LisaDeMarco_Dockets_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User
TimeEntry	09/17/2021	0.4	IRP - Instructions to D. Vollmer re interrogatories;	330	132	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	10/06/2021	0.2	Email communications with Ashley Sanasie re Facilitator for the JRAP settlement conference;	330	66	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	10/07/2021	0.5	APR - Coordination call with M. Zajdeman and D. Richardson; Instructions to D. Vollmer and J. McGillivray;	330	165	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	01/11/2022	0.5	APR - Meeting with D. Richardson and J. McGillivray re JRAP;	330	165	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	09/15/2021	2.4	Review application;	330	792	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	09/20/2021	0.4	Review summary of PO1 and report to client re same; Instructions re generic UTR proceeding; Instructions to J. McGillivray;	330	132	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	10/26/2021	4.8	IRP - Finalize interrogatories; Communications with D. Richardson;	330	1584	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	05/25/2022	0.7	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube and J. McGillivray;	330	231	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	05/30/2022	0.8	TCP - Prepare for technical conference; Instructions to N. Daube and J. McGillivray re same;	330	264	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	05/31/2022	0.6	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube and J. McGillivray;	330	198	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	05/31/2022	4.3	TCA - Attend on technical conference (day 1);	330	1419	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	06/01/2022	0.6	TCP - Instructions to N. Daube re technical conference (day 2);	330	198	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	02/04/2022	0.7	SCP - Instructions to team re settlement conference;	330	231	Lisa DeMarco
TimeEntry	04/18/2022	0.6	IRP - Instructions to team on interrogatories;	330	198	Lisa DeMarco
		17.5				

Bill number	ID	Created at
21184	2721118744	09/19/2021 11:38 PM EDT
21184	2851622930	11/10/2021 11:22 AM EST
21184	2851631300	11/10/2021 11:24 AM EST
22138	2996586081	01/12/2022 9:45 AM EST
21184	3029241771	01/23/2022 11:21 PM EST
21184	3029242836	01/23/2022 11:25 PM EST
21184	3029243796	01/23/2022 11:28 PM EST
22138	3405932736	05/31/2022 11:55 AM EDT
22138	3406194246	05/31/2022 12:21 PM EDT
22138	3437405736	06/08/2022 4:40 PM EDT
22138	3437412111	06/08/2022 4:41 PM EDT
22138	3437424426	06/08/2022 4:43 PM EDT
22138	3454687116	06/13/2022 11:31 PM EDT
22138	3454689036	06/13/2022 11:33 PM EDT

Jonathan McGillivray

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
---	---	---	--

FILING PARTICIPANT McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
--	----------------------------------	---	---

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2017	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 5	HOURLY RATE 170
---	-----------------------------------	---	---------------------------

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE February 24, 2022	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
---	--	--------------------------------------

HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		170		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	5.30	170	901.00	13.00	117.13	1,018.13
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	7.70	170	1,309.00	13.00	170.17	1,479.17
Technical Conference Attendance	15.10	170	2,567.00	13.00	333.71	2,900.71
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation	0.40	170	68.00	13.00	8.84	76.84
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		170		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	0.60	170	102.00	13.00	13.26	115.26
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	1.20	170	204.00	13.00	26.52	230.52
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		170		13.00		
With Other Parties	0.80	170	136.00	13.00	17.68	153.68
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)	0.90	170	153.00	13.00	19.89	172.89
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Decision			
Review	170	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	170	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	5,440.00	707.20	6,147.20

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_JonathanMcGillivray_170Hourly_Dockets_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_JonathanMcGillivray_170Hourly_Dockets_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User
TimeEntry	09/22/2021	0.6	CMT - Prepare letter re Anwaatin membership and UTR generic proceeding;	170	102	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	09/22/2021	0.2	CMT - Revise and file letter re Anwaatin membership and UTR generic proceeding;	170	34	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	10/07/2021	0.6	APR - Coordination call with M. Zajdeman and D. Richardson;	170	102	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	10/08/2021	2.2	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	374	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	10/25/2021	3.1	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	527	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	11/29/2021	0.3	TCP - Review interrogatory responses and instructions to D. Vollmer re review and preparation for technical conference;	170	51	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/06/2021	1.4	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	170	238	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/06/2021	0.7	TCP - Prepare and file letter re subject areas and time estimates for technical conference as per instructions of L. DeMarco;	170	119	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/08/2021	0.7	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	170	119	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/08/2021	0.4	ICP - Provide comments on draft Issues List to intervenor group; Discussion with L. DeMarco on approach;	170	68	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/10/2021	1.4	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	170	238	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/13/2021	3.1	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 1);	170	527	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/13/2021	1.4	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	170	238	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/14/2021	3.5	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 2);	170	595	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/15/2021	3.3	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 3);	170	561	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/15/2021	1.8	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	170	306	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/16/2021	3.3	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 4);	170	561	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	12/17/2021	1.9	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 5);	170	323	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	01/05/2022	0.6	SCP - Review undertaking responses;	170	102	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	01/11/2022	0.6	APR - Meeting with D. Richardson and instructions re JRAP;	170	102	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	01/19/2022	0.9	OCA - Attend on Motions Hearing;	170	153	Jonathan McGillivray

Bill number	ID	Created at
21184	2729416624	09/22/2021 3:26 PM EDT
21184	2737152049	09/27/2021 7:40 AM EDT
21184	2851627835	11/10/2021 11:23 AM EST
21184	2851637855	11/10/2021 11:25 AM EST
21184	2851640270	11/10/2021 11:26 AM EST
21184	2921715321	12/09/2021 11:24 AM EST
21184	2921725806	12/09/2021 11:27 AM EST
21184	2921729511	12/09/2021 11:27 AM EST
21184	2921731356	12/09/2021 11:28 AM EST
21184	2921735436	12/09/2021 11:29 AM EST
21184	2938459551	12/15/2021 5:29 PM EST
21184	2938472271	12/15/2021 5:30 PM EST
21184	2938476486	12/15/2021 5:31 PM EST
21184	2938484106	12/15/2021 5:32 PM EST
21184	2938490631	12/15/2021 5:32 PM EST
21184	2938494996	12/15/2021 5:33 PM EST
21184	2946608976	12/20/2021 11:27 AM EST
21184	2946612711	12/20/2021 11:28 AM EST
22138	2987006241	01/07/2022 4:41 PM EST
22138	2994705111	01/11/2022 4:57 PM EST
22138	3018664536	01/19/2022 9:44 AM EST

Jonathan McGillivray

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
---	---	---	--

FILING PARTICIPANT McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
--	----------------------------------	---	---

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2017	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 6	HOURLY RATE 230
---	-----------------------------------	---	---------------------------

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE February 24, 2022	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
---	--	--------------------------------------

HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		230		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	3.00	230	690.00	13.00	89.70	779.70
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	5.60	230	1,288.00	13.00	167.44	1,455.44
Technical Conference Attendance		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		230		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	5.70	230	1,311.00	13.00	170.43	1,481.43
Attendance	1.20	230	276.00	13.00	35.88	311.88
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	0.30	230	69.00	13.00	8.97	77.97
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		230		13.00		
With Other Parties		230		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Decision			
Review	230	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	230	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	3,634.00	472.42	4,106.42

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_JonathanMcGillivray_230Hourly_Dockets_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_JonathanMcGillivray_230Hourly_Dockets_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User
TimeEntry	01/31/2022	0.9	SCP - Intervenor coordination meeting;	230	207	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	02/03/2022	1.1	SCP - Review draft intervenor proposals and prepare for settlement conference;	230	253	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	02/04/2022	1.6	SCP - Coordinate with other intervenors and prepare for settlement conference;	230	368	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	02/07/2022	1.2	SCA - Attend Settlement Conference re adjournment and review and consider Hydro One correspondence re same;	230	276	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	02/08/2022	0.4	SCP - Review and consider Hydro One and intervenor correspondence re evidence update and scheduling;	230	92	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	02/11/2022	0.3	SCP - Review and consider Feb. 11 correspondence from Hydro One re evidence update and scheduling;	230	69	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	02/18/2022	0.3	APR - Review and consider PO4 re abeyance;	230	69	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	04/18/2022	0.4	IRP - Review POS; Instructions to D. Vollmer re preparation of interrogatories on application update;	230	92	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	04/21/2022	0.3	SCP - Review and consider Hydro One correspondence re POS;	230	69	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	04/22/2022	0.2	SCP - Review correspondence on confidentiality decision;	230	46	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	04/27/2022	0.6	SCP - Meeting with client group re Settlement Conference strategy;	230	138	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	04/28/2022	0.3	SCP - Review correspondence on proceeding timeline;	230	69	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/26/2022	1.3	TCP - Prepare for technical conference and instructions to D. Vollmer; Identify relevant IR responses;	230	299	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/02/2022	2.6	IRP - Review evidence update and prepare IRs re same; Instructions to D. Vollmer;	230	598	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/09/2022	0.7	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	230	161	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/20/2022	0.2	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube;	230	46	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/24/2022	0.4	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube; Instructions to D. Vollmer re letter;	230	92	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/25/2022	0.7	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube and L. DeMarco;	230	161	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/27/2022	0.3	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube;	230	69	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/30/2022	1.3	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with N. Daube;	230	299	Jonathan McGillivray
TimeEntry	05/31/2022	0.7	TCP - Prepare for technical conference with L. DeMarco and N. Daube;	230	161	Jonathan McGillivray
		15.8				

Bill number	ID	Created at
22138	3055572186	01/31/2022 2:40 PM EST
22138	3068379966	02/03/2022 5:01 PM EST
22138	3071264091	02/04/2022 4:01 PM EST
22138	3074481066	02/07/2022 9:53 AM EST
22138	3081733581	02/08/2022 11:30 PM EST
22138	3091365336	02/11/2022 9:28 AM EST
22138	3112825131	02/18/2022 5:29 PM EST
22138	3339087546	05/09/2022 1:32 PM EDT
22138	3339101916	05/09/2022 1:35 PM EDT
22138	3339105906	05/09/2022 1:36 PM EDT
22138	3339111966	05/09/2022 1:37 PM EDT
22138	3339114996	05/09/2022 1:37 PM EDT
22138	3405871236	05/31/2022 11:47 AM EDT
22138	3405878151	05/31/2022 11:48 AM EDT
22138	3405886431	05/31/2022 11:49 AM EDT
22138	3405890196	05/31/2022 11:49 AM EDT
22138	3405902256	05/31/2022 11:51 AM EDT
22138	3405906366	05/31/2022 11:52 AM EDT
22138	3406208136	05/31/2022 12:23 PM EDT
22138	3406218171	05/31/2022 12:25 PM EDT
22138	3437395431	06/08/2022 4:38 PM EDT

Daniel Vollmer

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
---	---	---	--

FILING PARTICIPANT Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 993-6338 daniel@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
--	----------------------------------	---	---

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2020	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 1	HOURLY RATE 170
---	-----------------------------------	---	---------------------------

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE February 23, 2022	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
---	--	--------------------------------------

HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	0.90	170	153.00	13.00	19.89	172.89
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	8.20	170	1,394.00	13.00	181.22	1,575.22
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	9.70	170	1,649.00	13.00	214.37	1,863.37
Technical Conference Attendance	1.70	170	289.00	13.00	37.57	326.57
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		170		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	0.50	170	85.00	13.00	11.05	96.05
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		170		13.00		
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		170		13.00		
With Other Parties		170		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Decision			
Review	170	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	170	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	3,570.00	464.10	4,034.10

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_DanielVollmer_Dockets_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_DanielVollmer_Dockets_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill number	ID	Created at
TimeEntry	09/17/2021	1.6	IRP - Prepare interrogatories per L. DeMarco;	170	272	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2717757889	09/17/2021 11
TimeEntry	09/20/2021	0.9	CMT - Review and summarize PO1 for client per instructions from L. DeMarco;	170	153	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2721129049	09/20/2021 12
TimeEntry	10/08/2021	0.3	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	51	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2851635215	11/10/2021 11
TimeEntry	10/26/2021	0.5	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	85	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2851642850	11/10/2021 11
TimeEntry	11/30/2021	1	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	170	170	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2921719221	12/09/2021 11
TimeEntry	12/01/2021	1	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	170	170	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2921721306	12/09/2021 11
TimeEntry	12/03/2021	2.4	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	170	408	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2921722776	12/09/2021 11
TimeEntry	12/13/2021	0.5	TCP - Prepare materials for technical conference Panel 1;	170	85	Daniel Vollmer	21184	2938465881	12/15/2021 5:3
TimeEntry	01/13/2022	2.3	IRP - Review technical conference materials per instructions from J. McGillivray;	170	391	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3002718471	01/13/2022 3:5
TimeEntry	01/18/2022	0.5	SCP - Prepare documents and folder;	170	85	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3015026076	01/18/2022 10
TimeEntry	01/19/2022	1.1	IRP - Review intervenor and board staff evidence;	170	187	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3018563421	01/19/2022 9:3
TimeEntry	04/18/2022	0.6	IRP - Review updated application evidence;	170	102	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3339092511	05/09/2022 1:3
TimeEntry	05/02/2022	1.8	IRP - Prepare IRs;	170	306	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3405881931	05/31/2022 11
TimeEntry	05/24/2022	1	TCP - Technical conference preparation;	170	170	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3405894906	05/31/2022 11
TimeEntry	05/25/2022	1.3	TCP - Technical conference preparation;	170	221	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3405912366	05/31/2022 11
TimeEntry	05/26/2022	1.3	TCP - Prepare technical conference materials;	170	221	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3406284501	05/31/2022 12
TimeEntry	05/31/2022	1.2	TCP - Review application and evidence re technical conference;	170	204	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3437389986	06/08/2022 4:3
TimeEntry	06/01/2022	1.7	TCA - Attend on technical conference (day 2);	170	289	Daniel Vollmer	22138	3437416521	06/08/2022 4:4

Nicholas Daube

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
---	---	---	--

FILING PARTICIPANT Daube, Nicholas; +1 (416) 768-8341 nicholas@resilientllp.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
--	----------------------------------	---	---

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2007	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 15	HOURLY RATE 290
---	-----------------------------------	--	---------------------------

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE June 15, 2022	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
---	--------------------------------------	--------------------------------------

HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		290		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		290		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	7.30	290	2,117.00	13.00	275.21	2,392.21
Technical Conference Attendance	3.80	290	1,102.00	13.00	143.26	1,245.26
Technical Conference Follow Up		290		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		290		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		290		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		290		13.00		
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		290		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		290		13.00		
With Other Parties		290		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Decision				
Review	290	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	290	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	290	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:		3,219.00	418.47	3,637.47

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_NicholasDaube_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_NicholasDaube_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill number	ID	Created at
TimeEntry	05/25/2022	0.7	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	290	203	Nicholas Daube	22138	3405937446	05/31/2022 11
TimeEntry	05/26/2022	0.6	TCP - Reviewing background materials in preparation for technical conference;	290	174	Nicholas Daube	22138	3406203741	05/31/2022 12
TimeEntry	05/27/2022	2.5	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	290	725	Nicholas Daube	22138	3406213011	05/31/2022 12
TimeEntry	05/30/2022	3.5	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	290	1015	Nicholas Daube	22138	3406221351	05/31/2022 12
TimeEntry	06/01/2022	3.8	TCA - Prepare for and attend technical conference (day 2);	290	1102	Nicholas Daube	22138	3437420211	06/08/2022 4:4
		11.1							

Don Richardson

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Monika Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
---	---	---	--

FILING PARTICIPANT Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086 drichardson.gll@gmail.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
--	----------------------------------	---	---

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Consultant	YEAR CALLED TO BAR	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 24	HOURLY RATE 330
--	---------------------------	--	---------------------------

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV DATE February 24, 2022	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
---	--	--------------------------------------

HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		330		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	1.50	330	495.00	13.00	64.35	559.35
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		330		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	1.00	330	330.00	13.00	42.90	372.90
Attendance		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	2.80	330	924.00	13.00	120.12	1,044.12
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		330		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		330		13.00		
With Other Parties		330		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Decision			
Review	330	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	330	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	330	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	1,749.00	227.37	1,976.37

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_DonRichardson_Dockets_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	
Don Richardson Invoice 116.pdf	Invoice	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Anwaatin_EB-2021-0110_DonRichardson_Dockets_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	
Don Richardson Invoice 116.pdf		Invoice	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$ Billable (\$)	User	Bill number
Time entry	2021.09.20	0.4	APR Communications with counsel re PO1 and key issues;	330 \$132.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2021.09.24	0.3	APR Review counsel draft letter re Anwaatin memgership;	330 \$99.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2021.09.28	0.4	IRP Communications with counsel re potential comments;	330 \$132.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2021.10.07	0.5	APR Coordination with M. Zajdeman;	330 \$165.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2021.10.06	1.1	IRP Review draft interrogatories and comments on same;	330 \$363.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2022.01.11	1	APR Review evidence;	330 \$330.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2022.01.11	0.6	APR Meeting with counsel re JRAP;	330 \$198.00	D. Richardson	116
Time entry	2022.02.07	1	SCP Communications with counsel re settlement conference;	330 \$330.00	D. Richardson	116
		5.3				

Mr. Don Richardson

Invoice # 116

Date: June 13, 2022

Bill To

Resilient LLP
333 Bay Street, Suite 625 Toronto ON M5H 2R2
647.971.6771

EB-2021-0110 Hydro One Networks Inc.2023-2027 Joint Distribution and Transmission Rates Application

Item Description	Amount
Sept. 20, 2021 0.4H - APR Communications with counsel re PO1 and key issues	\$132.00
Sept. 24, 2021 0.3H - APR Review counsel draft letter re Anwaatin membership;	\$99.00
Sept. 28, 2021 0.4H - IRP Communications with counsel re potential comments;	\$132.00
Oct. 7, 2021 0.5H - APR Coordination with M. Zajdeman;	\$165.00
Oct. 26, 2021 1.1H - IRP Review draft interrogatories and comments on same;	\$363.00
Jan. 11, 2022 1H - APR Review evidence;	\$330.00
Jan. 11, 2022 0.6H - APR Meeting with counsel re JRAP;	\$198.00
Feb. 7, 2022 1H - SCP Communications with counsel re settlement conference;	\$330.00

Subtotal	\$1,749.00
Tax Rate	13.00%
Other Costs	
Total Cost	\$1,976.37

Make all checks payable to Mr. Don Richardson

Thank you for your business!