

EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Scott Pollock

COST CLAIM NUMBER 486	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE June 16, 2022	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 2
INTERVENOR Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Canadian Manufacturers & Exporters, Toronto: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY
HST NUMBER 10807 5482 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Participant Total (\$)	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	10,136.10	Submitted
No	,	Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	10,008.41	Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Attachment Date	Participant	Document Type	Claim Type	Import Message
CME_CostClaim_20220616.pdf			Time Docket		
CME EB-2021-0110 Cost Claim 061620221633.pdf					

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 17,827.00	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00	TOTAL HST 2,317.51
TOTAL CLAIM 20,144.51	TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED	
REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO
Borden Ladner Gervais LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS
100 Queen Street
Suite 1300
Ottawa, ON K1P 1J9

ATTENTION
Emma Blanchard

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY
Taylor Bell

DATE SUBMITTED
June 16, 2022

Scott Pollock

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Scott Pollock	INTERVENOR NAME Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
---	--	--	--

FILING PARTICIPANT Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
---	----------------------------------	---	---

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2016	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 6	HOURLY RATE 230
---	-----------------------------------	---	---------------------------

CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
--	---------------------	--------------------------------------

HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	5.20	230	1,196.00	13.00	155.48	1,351.48
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		230		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	1.30	230	299.00	13.00	38.87	337.87
Technical Conference Attendance	12.50	230	2,875.00	13.00	373.75	3,248.75
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation	2.80	230	644.00	13.00	83.72	727.72
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses	0.70	230	161.00	13.00	20.93	181.93
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		230		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	11.10	230	2,553.00	13.00	331.89	2,884.89
Attendance		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		230		13.00		
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	4.40	230	1,012.00	13.00	131.56	1,143.56
With Other Parties	1.00	230	230.00	13.00	29.90	259.90
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Decision			
Review	230	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	230	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	8,970.00	1,166.10	10,136.10

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
CME_CostClaim_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
CME_CostClaim_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

ID	Date	Hours	Narrative
38655530	01/18/2022	1.7	Reviewing Board correspondence; preparing statement of issues report for client in advance of settlement conference and potentially hearing.
38660012	01/19/2022	0.2	Reviewing refusals motion transcript.
38666891	01/19/2022	1.7	Reviewing record and creating issue summaries and draft position in advance of settlement conference/hearing.
38659958	01/20/2022	1.1	Creating issues summary and position recommendations for client.
38740003	02/01/2022	5.4	Reviewing distribution OM&A and variance and deferral account issues in advance of settlement conference.
38750644	02/02/2022	1.3	Reviewing and preparing for settlement conference and potential hearing.
38750654	02/03/2022	2.7	Preparing for settlement conference and potential hearing.
38750628	02/04/2022	4.4	Client call regarding issues for settlement conference; reviewing variance and deferral account requests; reviewing HONI correspondence cancelling settlement conference.
38779472	02/08/2022	1	E-mail to client; writing the Board regarding HONI proposed timeline and evidentiary update.
39066013	04/06/2022	2.1	Reviewing additional updated evidence.
39099379	04/12/2022	1.8	Reviewing updated evidence.
39125937	04/22/2022	1.1	Reviewing updated evidence.
39203743	05/02/2022	0.7	Drafting supplementary interrogatories.
39291586	05/24/2022	0.2	Letter for technical conference time estimate.
39326196	05/30/2022	1.1	Preparing questions for technical conference.
39317906	05/31/2022	6.5	Attending day 1 of the updated evidence technical conference.
39334435	06/01/2022	6	Attending day 2 of the technical conference.
38015051	09/01/2021	5.4	Reviewing join Hydro One combined application.
38015053	09/02/2021	1.4	Reviewing application for Hydro One Transmission/Distribution.
38015052	09/03/2021	1.6	Reviewing application.
38055972	09/16/2021	2.3	Reviewing application.
38055956	09/17/2021	2.5	Reviewing application, drafting interrogatories.
38114159	09/22/2021	2.4	Reviewing application.
38097428	09/23/2021	4.4	Reviewing application.
38092432	09/24/2021	2.7	Reviewing application.
38125303	09/27/2021	2.7	Reviewing application materials.
38125420	09/28/2021	3.8	Reviewing application.
38168136	09/28/2021	0.3	Contacting client regarding process submissions; drafting process submissions.
38168138	09/29/2021	1.2	Reviewing application.
38125724	09/30/2021	1.1	Reviewing application.
38168078	10/07/2021	0.2	Discussing the use of Mr. Rosenberg as facilitator with the client; e-mail regarding position facilitator.
38199585	10/12/2021	2.3	Reviewing application.
38194783	10/13/2021	1.2	Reviewing application.
38261006	10/26/2021	5.6	Drafting and submitting interrogatories.
38516879	12/13/2021	7	Attending technical conference.
38565236	12/21/2021	2	Reviewing transcripts of technical conference and developing recommendations for client re: settlement.
38565272	12/22/2021	2	Reviewing transcripts of technical conference and record and developing recommendations for client re: settlement.

Scott Pollock

CASE EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One Networks Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0110 : 2 : Scott Pollock	INTERVENOR NAME Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Pollock, Scott ; +1 (613) 787-3541 spollock@blg.com	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2016	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 5	HOURLY RATE 170
CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE		HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTATIONS No	DISBURSEMENTS No	

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	32.50	170	5,525.00	13.00	718.25	6,243.25
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	8.10	170	1,377.00	13.00	179.01	1,556.01
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance	7.00	170	1,190.00	13.00	154.70	1,344.70
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		170		13.00		
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	4.00	170	680.00	13.00	88.40	768.40
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		170		13.00		
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	0.50	170	85.00	13.00	11.05	96.05
With Other Parties		170		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Decision			
Review	170	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	170	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	8,857.00	1,151.41	10,008.41

Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
CME_CostClaim_20220616.pdf	Time Docket	

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
CME_CostClaim_20220616.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

ID	Date	Hours	Narrative
38655530	01/18/2022	1.7	Reviewing Board correspondence; preparing statement of issues report for client in advance of settlement conference and potentially hearing.
38660012	01/19/2022	0.2	Reviewing refusals motion transcript.
38666891	01/19/2022	1.7	Reviewing record and creating issue summaries and draft position in advance of settlement conference/hearing.
38659958	01/20/2022	1.1	Creating issues summary and position recommendations for client.
38740003	02/01/2022	5.4	Reviewing distribution OM&A and variance and deferral account issues in advance of settlement conference.
38750644	02/02/2022	1.3	Reviewing and preparing for settlement conference and potential hearing.
38750654	02/03/2022	2.7	Preparing for settlement conference and potential hearing.
38750628	02/04/2022	4.4	Client call regarding issues for settlement conference; reviewing variance and deferral account requests; reviewing HONI correspondence cancelling settlement conference.
38779472	02/08/2022	1	E-mail to client; writing the Board regarding HONI proposed timeline and evidentiary update.
39066013	04/06/2022	2.1	Reviewing additional updated evidence.
39099379	04/12/2022	1.8	Reviewing updated evidence.
39125937	04/22/2022	1.1	Reviewing updated evidence.
39203743	05/02/2022	0.7	Drafting supplementary interrogatories.
39291586	05/24/2022	0.2	Letter for technical conference time estimate.
39326196	05/30/2022	1.1	Preparing questions for technical conference.
39317906	05/31/2022	6.5	Attending day 1 of the updated evidence technical conference.
39334435	06/01/2022	6	Attending day 2 of the technical conference.
38015051	09/01/2021	5.4	Reviewing join Hydro One combined application.
38015053	09/02/2021	1.4	Reviewing application for Hydro One Transmission/Distribution.
38015052	09/03/2021	1.6	Reviewing application.
38055972	09/16/2021	2.3	Reviewing application.
38055956	09/17/2021	2.5	Reviewing application, drafting interrogatories.
38114159	09/22/2021	2.4	Reviewing application.
38097428	09/23/2021	4.4	Reviewing application.
38092432	09/24/2021	2.7	Reviewing application.
38125303	09/27/2021	2.7	Reviewing application materials.
38125420	09/28/2021	3.8	Reviewing application.
38168136	09/28/2021	0.3	Contacting client regarding process submissions; drafting process submissions.
38168138	09/29/2021	1.2	Reviewing application.
38125724	09/30/2021	1.1	Reviewing application.
38168078	10/07/2021	0.2	Discussing the use of Mr. Rosenberg as facilitator with the client; e-mail regarding position facilitator.
38199585	10/12/2021	2.3	Reviewing application.
38194783	10/13/2021	1.2	Reviewing application.
38261006	10/26/2021	5.6	Drafting and submitting interrogatories.
38516879	12/13/2021	7	Attending technical conference.
38565236	12/21/2021	2	Reviewing transcripts of technical conference and developing recommendations for client re: settlement.
38565272	12/22/2021	2	Reviewing transcripts of technical conference and record and developing recommendations for client re: settlement.