<u>EB-2021-0118 : 2 : Cathy Galler</u>							
COST CLAIM NUMBER 663	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE September 26, 2022	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance					
EB# EB-2021-0118: Initiatives: Regulatory Direction and Oversight: Ontario Energy Board	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 2					
INTERVENOR Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Industrial Gas Users Association, Ottawa: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant					
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY					
HST NUMBER 89659 3323 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE					

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Participant Total (\$) Claim Status
No	,	Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	34,901.37 Submitted

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Attachment Date	Participant	Document Type	Claim Type	Import Message
GUA EB-2021-0118 Cost Claim 092220220941.pdf					0
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 30,871.50	TOTAL DISBU	IRSEMENTS 14.60			TOTAL HST 4,015.27
TOTAL CLAIM 34,901.37	TOTAL AMOU	NT AWARDED			
REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWAN				ON FOR OWANCE - 3
MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Industrial Gas Users Association					
SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS 851 Industrial Avenue, P.O. Box 30 Ottawa, ON K1G 4L3				ATTEN	TION

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY Ian Mondrow

DATE SUBMITTED September 22, 2022

	arow	PARTICIPANT	
CASE EB-2021-0118: Initiatives: Regulatory Direction and Oversight: Ontario Energy Board	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0118 : 2 : Cathy Galler	INTERVENOR NAME Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com	CLAIM STATUS Submitted
FILING PARTICIPANT Mondrow, lan; +1 (416) 369-467 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	70 NEW 70 PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 1991	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 31	HOURLY RATE 330
CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required	LAST CV DATE		HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
HEARINGS No	CONSULTATIONS Yes	DISBURSEMENTS Yes	

lan Mondrow

CONSULTATION

Description	<u>Maximum</u> <u>Ho</u> <u>Hours</u>	<u>ours</u>	<u>Hourly</u> <u>Rate</u>	<u>Sub</u> Total	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
FEIWG Meeting #12 - February 2, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	7.50	3.90	330	1,287.00) 13.00	167.31	1,454.31
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - February 4, 2022	2.50	2.50	330	825.00) 13.00	107.25	932.25
Benefit/Cost Sub⊡Group Meeting #7 - February 16, 2022	7.50	5.95	330	1,963.50) 13.00	255.26	2,218.76
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - February 18, 2022	2.50	2.20	330	726.00	0 13.00	94.38	820.38
Benefit/Cost Sub⊡Group Meeting #8 - March 3, 2022	5.00	4.35	330	1.435.50) 13.00	186.62	1,622.12
FEIWG Meeting #13 - March 9, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	12.50	7.00	330	2.310.00) 13.00	300.30	2,610.30
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - March 11, 2022	2.50	1.50	330	495.00) 13.00	64.35	559.35
Benefit/Cost Sub⊡Group Meeting #9 - March 14, 2022	7.50	3.80	330	1.254.00) 13.00	163.02	1,417.02
Benefit/Cost Sub⊡Group Meeting #10 - March 23, 2022	2.50	1.35	330	445.50	0 13.00	57.92	503.42
FEIWG Meeting #14 - March 23, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	13.75	3.95	330	1.303.50) 13.00	169.46	1,472.96
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #11 - March 25, 2022	7.50	2.35	330	775.50) 13.00	100.82	876.32
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - March 28, 2022	2.50	0.55	330	181.50	0 13.00	23.60	205.10
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #12 - April 4, 2022	7.50	3.05	330	1.006.50) 13.00	130.85	1,137.35
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - April 8, 2022	2.50	0.60	330	198.00	0 13.00	25.74	223.74
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #13 - April 11, 2022	7.50	3.55	330	1.171.50) 13.00	152.30	1,323.80
FEIWG Meeting #15 - April 13, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	5.00	2.40	330	792.00) 13.00	102.96	894.96
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #14 - April 22, 2022	6.25	4.00	330	1.320.00) 13.00	171.60	1,491.60
FEIWG Meeting #16 - April 27, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	13.75	0.50	330	165.00	0 13.00	21.45	186.45
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - April 29, 2022	2.50	0.70	330	231.00	0 13.00	30.03	261.03
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #17 - May 2, 2022	3.75	2.40	330	792.00) 13.00	102.96	894.96
FEIWG Meeting #17 - May 11, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	13.75	2.35	330	775.50) 13.00	100.82	876.32
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #18 - May 13, 2022	7.50	4.80	330	1,584.00) 13.00	205.92	1,789.92
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - May 16, 2022	2.50	0.75	330	247.50	0 13.00	32.18	279.68
Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #19 - May 26, 2022	7.50	6.95	330	2,293.50) 13.00	298.16	2,591.66
OEB/Co-leads Meeting - May 27, 2022 FEIWG Meeting #19 - June 8, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5	2.50 13.75	0.35 5.65	330 330			15.02 242.39	130.52 2,106.89

	FEIWG Meeting #20 - June 22, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5					0 4.	70	330	1.551.00	13.00	201.63	1,752.63
	OEB/Co-leads Meeting - June 28, 2022 FEIWG Meeting #21 - June 29, 2022 - Meeting Time x 2.5				2.5 13.7		85 70	330 330	610.50 1.221.00			689.87 1,379.73
Consultation	Written comments on FEIWG Report to the OEB (and sub-group reports) Consultation Total Total Legal/Consultant Fees				10.0	0 5.8	85	330	1.930.50 30.871.50			2,181.47 34,884.87
Attachments					<u>e Imp</u>	ort Mes	sage					
DISBURSEMENTS												
<u>Name</u>	<u>Atchmnt</u> <u>Required</u>	<u>Atchmnt</u> Provided	<u>Qty</u>	<u>Cost/</u> <u>Unit</u>	<u>Net</u> Cost	<u>HST</u> Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Other</u> Taxes/	<u>Tip</u> <u>T</u>	<u>otal</u>	<u>Rationa</u> Comme	

Parking	Yes	Yes	1.00	14.60	14.60 13.00	1.90		16.50
Total	No	No			14.60	1.90	0.00	16.50
Disbursements:								

Attachments

AttachmentRelated Disbursement ClaimImport MessageIGUA_EB-2021-0118_CostClaim_DisbParking_20220922.pdf

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

nounigo, concur		Document		
Attachment	Related Disbursement Claim	Туре	Claim Type	Import Message
IGUA_EB-2021-011	Parking		Disbursements	
8_CostClaim_Disb_				
20220922.pdf				
IGUA_EB-2021-011		Time Docke	Consultations	
8_CostClaim_TimeD				
ockets_20220922.pd				
f				



February 11, 2022 INVOICE: 19777829

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	1.45
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	1.45

O GOWLING WLG

ACTIVITY 1

1

1

February 11, 2022 INVOICE: 19777829

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
2022-01-02	0.20	lan Mondrow	Retrieve and scan materials from M. Brouillette regarding customer view on integration work stream for Meeting #10 and circulate to Working Group;
2022-01-04	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review and organize materials for upcoming meeting;
2022-01-05	4.80	lan Mondrow	Attend Working Group Meeting #10;
2022-01-07	1.90	lan Mondrow	Review post-Meeting #10 correspondence regarding forecasting/integration topics; attend Co-Leads/Staff regular update meeting;
2022-01-16	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review recent OEB/Leads e-mail correspondence and consider;
2022-01-17	2.10	lan Mondrow	Review and comment on Meeting #10 notes; review draft Integration Subgroup TOR and provide detailed comments/suggestions; initial consideration of draft workback schedule and provide comment on how to proceed to consider;
2022-01-18	0.40	lan Mondrow	Review Staff/Leads Correspondence regarding Meeting #11 materials finalization; review A. Sasso sub-group governance notes and add comments for consideration;
2022-01-19	2.90	lan Mondrow	Attend Meeting #11;
2022-01-20	1.20	lan Mondrow	Report to AMPCO Board of Directors;
2022-01-20-	-1.40	lan Mondrow	Review agenda for Staff/Leads meeting and comment; review draft work back schedule and provide comments/questions in advance of meeting; provide Leads/Staff group with initial thoughts on Working Group report structure;
2022-01-21	1.30	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Leads meeting;
2022-01-24	0.20	lan Mondrow	Correspondence regarding Integration SG TOR from Working Group member and comments to OEB Staff/Leads;
2022-01-26	1.80	lan Mondrow	Review draft materials for Meeting #12 (including Meeting #11 notes, work back plan and proposed SG governance document) and provide comments; review draft e-mail to Working Group regarding DER Integration TOR and comment;
2022-01-27	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review correspondence regarding DER Integration Subgroup and Leads approval of materials for upcoming meeting;



February 11, 2022 INVOICE: 19777829

1	2022-01-28	0.30	lan Mondrow	Gather and review final materials for Meeting #12;
1	2022-01-31	0.20	lan Mondrow	Correspondence with Working Group member regarding implications of clean energy credit registry initiative for future DERs development;
1	2022-01-31	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with Leads/OEB Staff regarding issues for upcoming meeting;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours	
Mondrow, lan		19.70 2.9	I
	Total	19.70 2.9)



March 14, 2022 INVOICE: 19794137

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	14.85
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	14.85



ACTIVITIES 1, 3, 5, 8 and 11

March 14, 2022 INVOICE: 19794137

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
1	2022-02-02	4.90	lan Mondrow	Review notes for and attend Working Group Meeting #12; review meeting notes and e-mail to Leads/OEB Staff regarding follow-up items;
3	2022-02-03	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review and consider updated workplan from R. Anderson;
3	2022-02-04	1.50	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Leads meeting;
3	2022-02-07	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review OEB Staff note to Working Group regarding schedule/workplan changes and review/file materials circulated;
5	2022-02-14	0.20	lan Mondrow	Correspondence with M. Brouillette regarding BCA subgroup meeting stand in and with C. Codd relating to context for meeting participation;
5	2022-02-15	4.20	Ian Mondrow	Review BCA Working Group draft report; call with M. Brouillette regarding context for upcoming BCA subgroup meeting; considering C. Codd questions for review at upcoming meeting; notes to M. Brouillette and C. Codd with impressions/questions for consideration;
5	2022-02-16	3.60	lan Mondrow	Review materials from C. Codd and other materials in preparation for BCA subgroup meeting; attend sub-group meeting; review R. Anderson note regarding next Staff/Leads meeting;
3	2022-02-17	3.80 3.0	lan Mondrow	Commence review of additional/collected background materials to inform approach to finalizing/reporting work; review cost award Hearing Notice;
5 - 0.5 8 - 1.5	2022-02-18	2.00	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Leads meeting; update note to M. Brouillette on BCA subgroup meeting attended;
8	2022-02-19	1.80	Ian Mondrow	Review FEI update on upcoming meeting schedule changes; continue review of background materials and consider/notes regarding approach to focussing Working Group report;
8	2022-02-21	1.00	lan Mondrow	Continue review of accumulated reference materials to inform input on report approach/drafting;
8	2022-02-23	0.10	lan Mondrow	Correspondence with Co-Leads/Staff regarding scheduling Co-Leads/Staff meetings;
5	2022-02-25	3.40	lan Mondrow	Consider and compose note to C. Codd regarding concerns on BCA subgroup focus vs.WG TOR and required OEB regulatory lense;



March 14, 2022 INVOICE: 19794137

11	2022-02-26	2.00	lan Mondrow	Review and consider C. Codd response to note regarding concerns on BCA topic and provide further comment for consideration;
11	2022-02-27	1.00	Ian Mondrow	Review note/materials from C. Codd, consider, and provide comments and note in response regarding concerns related to BCA framework proposal developing;
11	2022-02-28	0.50	lan Mondrow	Review additional correspondence on BCA subgroup concerns/issues and craft proposed note to subgroup members regarding concerns;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, lan		30.50 29.7
	Total	30.50 29.7



April 18, 2022 INVOICE: 19815995

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	22.95
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	22.95



ACTIVITIES 11, 12, 13, 14, 17, 18, 19 and 20

April 18, 2022 INVOICE: 19815995

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
11	2022-03-01	1.30	lan Mondrow	Review and finalize e-mail to BCA subgroup regarding concerns with approach reflected in draft report; review C. Codd revised suggested materials summarizing BCA issues for Working Group discussion; further correspondence with BCA subgroup members arising from concerns note sent;
11	2022-03-02	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with BCA subgroup members regarding framework issues raised;
11	2022-03-03	3.80	lan Mondrow	Prepare (read) for and attend BCA subgroup meeting (by invitation); review K. Elson discussion document for meeting;
12	2022-03-03	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review note from R. Anderson regarding revised approach to upcoming Working Group meeting and comment;
12	2022-03-04	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence with C. Codd and Leads/OEB Staff regarding participation in BCA subgroup;
14	2022-03-05	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review BCA sub-group meeting notes and provide comments;
12	2022-03-05	1.40	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB Staff package for Meeting #13; update note to clients;
12	2022-03-06	1.50	lan Mondrow	Review and consider first draft of Background section for Working Group report and draft e-mail with comments on alternative approach;
12	2022-03-07	2.70	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Co-leads correspondence regarding issues for upcoming Working Group meeting; review Utility Incentives subgroup report; note to OEB Staff/Co-Leads with comments on first preliminary draft sections for Working Group report; check in discussion with R. Anderson;
12	2022-03-08	2.50	lan Mondrow	Prepare for Working Group meeting: capture and circulate comments on draft incentive subgroup report and on early draft of "Workstream 1" narrative for final report;
12	2022-03-09	4.90	lan Mondrow	Attend Working Group Meeting #13;
12	2022-03-09	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Post-Meeting #13 correspondence with Working Group members;
14	2022-03-10	2.30	Ian Mondrow	Work on BCA subgroup documentation/correspondence, providing input and proposed analytical structure;
13	2022-03-10	2.50	lan Mondrow	Staff/Leads correspondence regarding next steps/set up of next meetings; correspondence with JCS (SEC) regarding



April 18, 2022 INVOICE: 19815995

				drafting issues and approaches; update call with AMPCO/IGUA;
13	2022-03-11	0.50	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Leads meeting; review notice regarding OEB/IESO Joint Engagement session;
14	2022-03-11	1.40	lan Mondrow	Correspondence with Working Group members regarding BCA issues in preparation for subgroup meeting; review BCA subgroup meeting materials circulated by C. Codd in preparation for Monday's meeting;
14	2022-03-14	3.60	lan Mondrow	Attend BCA subgroup meeting; follow-up note summarizing potential approach to description of deliberations for broader group;
20	2022-03-17	0.60	lan Mondrow	Review draft Meeting #13 notes and Meeting #14 agenda and provide comments;
20	2022-03-17	0.40	lan Mondrow	Notes for report drafting;
18	2022-03-18	2.80	lan Mondrow	Review K. Elson summary of BCA discussions for circulation to FEIWG and provide detailed comments; review BCA meeting notes and provide comments; review further BCA subgroup correspondence regarding summary to present to FEIWG for discussion;
20	2022-03-19	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review Staff comments on draft notes from Meeting #12 and revised agenda for Meeting #13;
17	2022-03-21	2.70	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup Meeting; review revised document for review by FEIWG and provide additional comments;
18	2022-03-22	0.10	lan Mondrow	Gather materials for FEIWG Meeting #14;
18	2022-03-23	4.70	lan Mondrow	Attend FEIWG meeting; post-meeting discussion with R. Anderson;
19	2022-03-23	0.20	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup correspondence regarding next meeting/next steps;
19	2022-03-24	0.80	lan Mondrow	Review note from C. Codd and provide initial thoughts for upcoming BCA subgroup meeting topics;
19	2022-03-25	3.70	lan Mondrow	Attend BCA subgroup meeting; post-meeting correspondence (review meeting notes; review notes regarding next steps);

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		45.90
	Total	45.90



May 9, 2022 INVOICE: 19828426

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	14.95
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	14.95



ACTIVITY 18, 22, 24, 25, 26, 28, 29 and 31

May 9, 2022 INVOICE: 19828426

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
22	2022-04-03	0.80	lan Mondrow	Review recent IESO/OEB materials on Grid Innovation Fund projects and consider applicability to BCA subgroup discussions;
22	2022-04-04	5.30	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Review materials in preparation for and attend subgroup meeting; complete review of draft materials and comments, and consider comments from others;
18	2022-04-04	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review draft notes from Working Group Meeting #14 and provide comments;
24	2022-04-08	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence regarding OEB Staff/Co-leads meetings;
25	2022-04-10	3.50	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Review various updated materials in preparation for subgroup meeting; discussion with C. Codd regarding "end of line" community examples;
25	2022-04-11	3.60	Ian Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Attend meeting;
24	2022-04-11	1.00	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Leads meeting regarding status and continuing work program;
26	2022-04-12	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review updated Utility Incentives Subgroup report in preparation for FEIWG meeting;
26	2022-04-12	0.30	lan Mondrow	Prepare for Working Group meeting; continue review of Utility Incentives Subgroup revised report;
26	2022-04-13	1.10	lan Mondrow	Review IESO/OEB Joint Engagement Meeting materials (in lieu of attendance);
26	2022-04-13	3.00	lan Mondrow	Review UI Subgroup report in preparation for and attend FEIWG meeting;
26	2022-04-14	0.20	lan Mondrow	Complete review of revised Utility Incentives Subgroup report and send comments to J.C. Shepherd and Subgroup Chair;
28	2022-04-18	0.90	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Discussion with M. Brouilette regarding BCA Subgroup work (done and undone) and issues;
29	2022-04-19	0.80	lan Mondrow	Discussion with R. Anderson regarding Working Group report drafting approaches and bringing matters to some conclusion;
28	2022-04-21	4.20	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Review/catch up on recent correspondence and comments; review materials from various Subgroup members as input into report; discussion with C. Codd regarding issues and approach to report;
28	2022-04-22	2.90	Ian Mondrow	Attend BCA Subgroup meeting; consider and respond to



May 9, 2022 INVOICE: 19828426

				further Subgroup member correspondence on issues in play;
31	2022-04-27	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review OEB Staff/Leads correspondence regarding work plan for completing Working Group report;
31	2022-04-28	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Notes for input into final Working Group report;
31	2022-04-29	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Review R. Anderson note for Leads/OEB Staff meeting and attend meeting;
29	2022-04-30	0.20	lan Mondrow	Note to J.C. Shepherd regarding idea for FEIWG report;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		29.90
	Total	29.90



June 17, 2022 INVOICE: 19851378

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	14.0
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	14.0



ACTIVITIES 33, 36, 37, 39, 42 and 43

June 17, 2022 INVOICE: 19851378

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
33	2022-05-02	3.10	lan Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group: Review revised draft report and provide detailed comments; note to Sub-Group with comments;
33	2022-05-02	1.70	lan Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group meeting to discuss revised draft report and comments;
39	2022-05-03	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review OEB Staff correspondence regarding upcoming meetings work plan and report drafting process;
36	2022-05-04	0.10	lan Mondrow	Review Working Group meeting notes;
37	2022-05-06	0.80	lan Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group: Detailed review and comment on revised draft Sub-Group report;
37	2022-05-07	2.40	lan Mondrow	Continue detailed review and comment on updated BCA Sub-Group draft report;
36	2022-05-09	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review materials for Meeting #17;
37	2022-05-11	0.90	Ian Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group: Review additional comments provided on draft Sub-Group report and related correspondence;
36	2022-05-11	4.10	Ian Mondrow	Attend Working Group meeting;
37	2022-05-12	2.30	lan Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group work: Review M. Brophy notes from FEIWG discussion of BCA Sub-Group report and supplement and circulate; commence review of updated BCA Sub-Group report draft (various versions) and provide some additional comments;
37	2022-05-13	3.20	Ian Mondrow	Attend BCA Sub-Group meeting;
39	2022-05-16	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with Working Group member regarding status and process to conclusion;
39	2022-05-16	1.30	Ian Mondrow	Staff/Co-Leads: Initial review of early outline for draft Working Group report and call to provide initial comment/direction;
42	2022-05-18	0.20	lan Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group: Review C. Codd update on latest draft and provide initial comment on Working Group member input received;
42	2022-05-18	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Notes for report to IGUA Board of Directors;
42	2022-05-19	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Update to IGUA Board of Directors;
42	2022-05-25	3.00	lan Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group: Detailed review of and comment on revised draft Sub-Group report;
42	2022-05-26	3.10	Ian Mondrow	BCA Sub-Group: Attend meeting;
43	2022-05-26	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review recent correspondence regarding status of report



June 17, 2022 INVOICE: 19851378

43	2022-05-27	0.60	lan Mondrow	drafting and upcoming steps; OEB Staff/Leads meeting;		
Total Fees for Professional Services						

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		28.00
	Total	28.00



July 8, 2022 INVOICE: 19866430

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours	Disb
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	50.0	19.2	\$14.60
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	50.0	19.2	\$14.60



ACTIVITIES 42, 45, 46, 47 and 48

July 8, 2022 INVOICE: 19866430

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
42	2022-06-01	2.30	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Review revised draft report and comments from others and provide comments;
45	2022-06-01	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review recent Working Group correspondence regarding next steps and report preparation;
42	2022-06-02	1.00	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Continued correspondence regarding comments on revised draft report;
45	2022-06-02	0.60	lan Mondrow	Review DERI Subgroup report;
45	2022-06-02	3.10	Ian Mondrow	Review and comment on draft Working Group report;
42	2022-06-03	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Correspondence regarding BCA report comments; review final changes; share report with covering note with IGUA and AMPCO;
45	2022-06-03	0.90	lan Mondrow	Correspondence regarding draft FEIWG report; briefing IGUA Ontario Caucus chair on status and reporting; complete review of draft DERI report; review last meeting notes and provide minor comments;
42	2022-06-06	0.20	lan Mondrow	BCA Subgroup: Review additional correspondence regarding finalizing subgroup report;
45	2022-06-06	0.30	lan Mondrow	Review additional comments circulated on draft FEIWG report;
45	2022-06-08	5.10	lan Mondrow	Gather/review materials for FEIWG meeting; attend FEIWG meeting;
45	2022-06-14	0.30	lan Mondrow	Update to IGUA Ontario Caucus; update note and circulate draft Working Group report to IGUA and AMPCO;
45	2022-06-15	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review client comments on draft report and respond;
45	2022-06-20	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review recent comments on draft Working Group report;
46	2022-06-21	4.30	lan Mondrow	Detailed review and comment on revised draft Working Group report; circulation to Working Group with covering note; discussion with R. Anderson regarding general thoughts and conduct of balance of Working Group review of draft report; OEB Staff/Leads correspondence regarding structure for upcoming Working Group meeting;
46	2022-06-22	5.10	Ian Mondrow	Attend Working Group meeting;
47	2022-06-24	1.40	lan Mondrow	Discussion with R. Anderson regarding "next steps" section and other issues towards resolution of the Working Group report; note to Co-Leads regarding additional material proposed for report and how to respond;



July 8, 2022 INVOICE: 19866430

42	2022-06-26	3.10	lan Mondrow	Review next draft sub-group report in full and provide comments, including proposed "next steps" section and associated sub-group more detailed recommendations list;
48	2022-06-27	0.20	lan Mondrow	Review relevant correspondence and discussion with Working Group member regarding suggestions for report;
48	2022-06-27	0.70	lan Mondrow	Review J.C. Shepherd draft "Next Steps" section and provide comments, including comparison to proposal previously circulated;
47	2022-06-28	1.30	lan Mondrow	OEB Staff/Co-Lead meeting;
48	2022-06-28	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Gather and review materials for next Working Group meeting;
48	2022-06-29	5.50	lan Mondrow	Attend Working Group meeting;
48	2022-06-30	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review e-mail from OEB Staff regarding final sign-off on report and various responses;
47	2022-06-30	1.00	Ian Mondrow	Staff/Co-Leads meeting to confirm transmittal approach and timing; draft transmittal e-mail; transmitting final report;

Total Fees for Professional Services

SUMMARY OF FEES

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		38.40
	Total	38.40

DISBURSEMENTS

Taxable Costs

2022-06-29	Parking & Tolls - Local Travel VENDOR: Mondrow, Ian INVOICE#: 5264670607041607 DATE: 07/04/2022 Mondrow, Ian, Parking for attendance at FEI Working Group meeting at Ontario Energy Board. 06/29/22	\$29.20
	Total Taxable Disbursements	<u>\$29.20</u>

PARKING DISBURSEMENT

Yonge Eglinton Centre AUTOMATED PARKING SYSTEM ***				
RECE	IPT			
CARYonge & Eglinton Ctr SHORT TERM Ø59927	DEVICE: PAID:	Paystation 3 29/06/22 06:28P		
ENTRY: 29/06/22 09:10A PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION: TERM:	EXIT:	29/06/22 06:27P 000 09:17 000 09:17 29/06/22 06:27P		
V.A.T. 13% :	NET	\$29.20 \$3.80		
THANK YOU. HAVE A NICE DAY!				
DO NOT ALLOW EXIT				



August 18, 2022 INVOICE: 19889142

Due From	Fee %	Disb %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	0.0	.85
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	0.0	.85



ACTIVITY 48 and 50

August 18, 2022 INVOICE: 19889142

Industrial Gas Users Association Our Matter: T1025719 Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON-OEB-6)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	Date	Hours	Timekeeper	Description
48	2022-07-05	0.60	lan Mondrow	Final report to clients;
50	2022-07-06	0.50	lan Mondrow	Review OEB Notice to Comment and briefing note to S. Rahbar and C. Anderson;
50	2022-07-07	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Discussion with S. Rahbar regarding instructions on IGUA submission on Working Group reports and co-ordination with AMPCO; note to AMPCO regarding co-ordinated approach;

Total Fees for Professional Services

TK Name		Hours
Mondrow, Ian		1.70
	Total	1.70

gowlinks

ACTIVITY 50	As of September-11-22 11:31:00 PM		
Client Code	190123		
Client Name	Industrial Gas Users Association		
Nature of Client Business	Oil & Gas		
Matter Code	T1025719		
Matter Name	Framework for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Utility Incentives (EB-2021-0118) (IGUA21-ON- OEB-6)		
Client Reference Code			
Practice Area of Work	Energy (SA10)		
Status	Open Open and Active		
Open Date			
Close Date			
Billing Professional	Mondrow, Ian (1760)		
Nature of Work			
Tax Jurisdiction	Ontario HST (ONT)		
WIP Fees Detail All Timekeeper	s 🗸		

Date		Timekeeper	Remarks	Hours
Aug 26	6, 2022	Mondrow, lan 1760	review materials and draft IGUA/AMPCO submission.	4.1
Aug 30), 2022	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Drafting IGUA/AMPCO submission;	2.2
Aug 31	, 2022	Mondrow, Ian 1760	Continue drafting IGUA/AMPCO submission; discuss with another party regarding comments proposed;	3.5
Sep 2,	2022	Mondrow, Ian 1760	review and final revisions to AMPCO/IGUA comments on FEIWG Reports.	0.8

https://gowlinks.gowlings.corp/site/rex/matterDesc/wipdetail.asp?matteruno=2124343 | Cathy Galler

Due From	Fees %	Hours
Industrial Gas Users Association	50.0	5.3
Association of Major Power Consumers	50.0	5.3

PARKING DISBURSEMENT

Yonge Eglinton Centre AUTOMATED PARKING SYSTEM ***					
RECEIPT					
CARYonge & Eglinton Ctr SHORT TERM \$259927	DEVICE: PAID:	Paystation 3 29/06/22 06:28P			
ENTRY: 29/06/22 09:10A PARKING DURATION: CHARGED DURATION: TERM:	EXIT:	29/06/22 06:27P 000 09:17 000 09:17 29/06/22 06:27P			
PAID: \$33.00 V.A.T. 13% :	NET	\$29.20 \$3.80			
DO NOT ALLOW EXIT					