EB-2021-0118: 2: Michael Brophy

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE CLAIM STATUS

September 26, 2022 Approved by Finance

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #*

EB-2021-0118: Initiatives: Regulatory Direction

and Oversight: Ontario Energy Board

INTERVENOR COMPANY*

Brophy, Michael; +1 (647) 330-1217 Pollution Probe, Toronto: Institution INTERVENOR TYPE

Other

Participant

HST RATE ONTARIO EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

13.00 Canada

HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

108092701 RT0001 No

PARTICIPANTS

INTERVENOR

michael.brophy@rogers.com

NewNon-Filing Participant First, Last NameFiling ParticipantTotal (\$)Claim StatusNo,Brophy, Michael; +1 (647) 330-1217
michael.brophy@rogers.com53,921.36Submitted

No , DeVenz, John; + 1 (647) 283-8493 2,237.40 Submitted

johndevenz@outlook.com

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment Document Claim Import

Attachment Date Participant Type Type Message

P_PRO EB-2021-0118 Cost Claim 092120221703.pdf

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS TOTAL HST 49,698.00 0.00 6,460.76

TOTAL CLAIM TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED

56,158.76

REASON FOR REASON FOR REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2 DISALLOWANCE - 3

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO

Pollution Probe

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS

130 Queens Quay East

ATTENTION
Sid Markowski

Suite 902 Toronto, ON M5A 0P6

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY

Michael Brophy

DATE SUBMITTED
September 21, 2022

Michael Brophy

CASE COST CLAIM

EB-2021-0118 : 2 : Michael

Regulatory Direction and Brophy

Oversight: Ontario Energy Board

INTERVENOR NAME

Brophy, Michael; +1 (647)

330-1217

michael.brophy@rogers.com

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

HOURLY RATE

HST RATE

CHARGED

13.00

330

PARTICIPANT

Submitted

CLAIM STATUS

FILING PARTICIPANT

EB-2021-0118: Initiatives:

Brophy, Michael; +1 (647) 330-1217

michael.brophy@rogers.com

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE

NEW PARTICIPANT

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

No

YEAR CALLED TO BAR

COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF

RELEVANT EXPERIENCE

28

CV STATUS (FOR

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

CV Provided within Previous 24 Months

HEARINGS

No

Consultant

LAST CV DATE
February 13, 2022

February 13, 2022

CONSULTATIONS

Yes

DISBURSEMENTS

No

CONSUL	TATION							
<u> </u>	<u>Description</u>	Maximum Ho Hours	<u>urs</u>	Hourly Rate	<u>Sub</u> Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Consultation	FEIWG Meeting #12 - February 2, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	4.50	4.50	330	1.485.0	0 13.00	193.05	1,678.05
	Benefit/Cost Sub□Group Meeting #6 - February 3, 2022	7.50	6.00	330	1.980.0	0 13.00	257.40	2,237.40
	Benefit/Cost Sub □ Group Meeting #7 - February 16, 2022	7.50	4.50	330	1.485.0	0 13.00	193.05	1,678.05
	Benefit/Cost Sub□Group Meeting #8 - March 3, 2022	5.00	5.00	330	1.650.0	0 13.00	214.50	1,864.50
	FEIWG Meeting #13 - March 9, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	7.50	7.00	330	2.310.0	0 13.00	300.30	2,610.30
	Benefit/Cost Sub□Group Meeting #9 - March 14, 2022	7.50	6.00	330	1.980.0	0 13.00	257.40	2,237.40
	Benefit/Cost Sub□Group Meeting #10 - March 23, 2022	2.50	2.50	330	825.0	0 13.00	107.25	932.25
	FEIWG Meeting #14 - March 23, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	8.25	6.50	330	2.145.0	0 13.00	278.85	2,423.85
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #11 - March 25, 2022	7.50	6.00	330	1.980.0	0 13.00	257.40	2,237.40
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #12 - April 4, 2022	7.50	7.00	330	2.310.0	0 13.00	300.30	2,610.30
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #13 - April 11, 2022	7.50	7.50	330	2,475.0	0 13.00	321.75	2,796.75
	FEIWG Meeting #15 - April 13, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	3.00	3.00	330	990.0	0 13.00	128.70	1,118.70
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #14 - April 22, 2022	6.25	6.25	330	2.062.5	0 13.00	268.13	2,330.63
	FEIWG Meeting #16 - April 27, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	8.25	7.50	330	2,475.0	0 13.00	321.75	2,796.75
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #15 - April 29, 2022	7.50	6.75	330	2.227.5	0 13.00	289.58	2,517.08
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #16 - May 2, 2022	2.50	2.50	330	825.0	0 13.00	107.25	932.25
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #17 - May 2, 2022	3.75	3.50	330	1.155.0	0 13.00	150.15	1,305.15
	FEIWG Meeting #17 - May 11, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	8.25	8.25	330	2,722.5	0 13.00	353.93	3,076.43
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #18 - May 13, 2022	7.50	7.50	330	2.475.0	0 13.00	321.75	2,796.75
	FEIWG Meeting #18 - May 25, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	6.00	6.00	330	1.980.0	0 13.00	257.40	2,237.40
	Benefit/Cost Sub-Group Meeting #19 - May 26, 2022	7.50	7.50	330	2.475.0	0 13.00	321.75	2,796.75

				00 353.93 3,076.43
9.00	8.60	330	2.838.00 13.0	00 368.94 3,206.94
10.00	6.50	330	2.145.00 13.0	00 278.85 2,423.85
			47.718.00	6,203.36 53,921.36
_	-1			10.00 6.50 330 2.145.00 13.0

Attachment Document Type Import Message

M Brophy Hours Feb - Sept 2022.pdf Invoice_OEB_18 2022.pdf

Time Docket Invoice

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Related Disbursement Claim Attachment M Brophy Hours Feb

- Sept 2022.pdf Invoice_OEB_18 2022.pdf

<u>Document</u>

<u>Type</u> Claim Type Time Docke Consultations **Import Message**

Invoice Consultations

5.1.		Elizable Assaults	2
Date	Hours	Eligible Activity	Comments
2/2/2022	1.50	Prep FEIWG meeting #12	Review materials, Workplan analysis and send detailed comments to FEI mailbox.
2/2/2022	3.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #12	Meeting Post Post Constant Con
2/1/2022	1.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting #6 Prep	BCA Draft report review and comments
2/3/2022	2.50	BCA Subgroup Meeting #6 Prep	Review comments and prep for meeting
2/3/2022	2.50	BCA Subgroup Meeting #6	Meeting
2/13/2022	1.25	BCA Subgroup Meeting #7 Prep	Review rearranged draft format and provide comments
2/16/2022	1.25	BCA Subgroup Meeting #7 Prep	Review updated draft report and draft issues for resolution
2/16/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting #7	Attend part of BCA Subgroup
3/2/2022	3.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting #8 Prep	Draft report comments and prep for meeting
3/3/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting	BCA meeting
3/9/2022	3.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #13	Review materials, incentive draft and prep
3/9/2022	4.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #13	Meeting
3/13/2022	1.50	BCA Subgroup Meeting #9 Prep	prep
3/14/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting #9 Prep	prep
3/14/2022	2.50	BCA Subgroup Meeting #9	Meeting
3/20/2022	1.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting #10 Prep	Review draft report issues and issues update approach for FEI WG
3/21/2022	0.50	BCA Subgroup Meeting #10 Prep	review notes and emails
3/23/2022	1.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting #10	Short meeting to agree on FEI WG BCA update materials
3/23/2022	3.50	Prep FEIWG meeting #14	prep
3/23/2022	3.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #14	meeting
3/25/2022	3.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #15	prep
3/25/2022	3.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #15	meeting
4/4/2022	4.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting Prep	Review materials and new NSPM material
4/4/2022	3.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting	meeting
4/10/2022	2.50	BCA Subgroup Meeting Prep	Review materials and draft report updates
4/11/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting Prep	Review materials and draft report updates
4/11/2022	3.00	BCA Subgroup Meeting	meeting
4/12/2022	1.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #16	prep and review Incentive report
4/13/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup prep	Joint OEB-IESO DER Session attend 9:30-11:30 Session
4/13/2022	2.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #16	meeting
4/21/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup prep	Report updates and correspondence
4/22/2022	2.25	BCA Subgroup meeting	meeting
4/26/2022	2.50	Prep FEIWG meeting #15	Prep input & review DERI subgroup draft
4/27/2022	5.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #15	meeting
4/28/2022	3.75	BCA Subgroup prep	draft report review and prep for meeting
4/29/2022	3.00	BCA Subgroup meeting	meeting
5/2/2022	3.50	BCA Subgroup prep	draft report review and prep for meeting
5/2/2022	2.50	BCA Subgroup meeting	AM and PM meetings for subgroup
5/3/2022	1.45	Prep FEIWG meeting #15	Report review and updates
5/10/2022		Prep FEIWG meeting #15	Material review and correspondence
5/11/2022	3.30	Attend FEIWG meeting #15	meeting
5/12/2022	2.50	BCA Report edits	Report edits and comments from WG
5/13/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup prep	review comments and proposed edits
5/13/2022	3.00	BCA Subgroup meeting	meeting
5/24/2022	2.00	BCA Subgroup prep	Review & updates to BCA Subgroup report
5/25/2022	2.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #16	prep
5/25/2022	4.00	Attend FEIWG meeting #16	meeting
5/26/2022	2.50	BCA Subgroup prep	Report edits and discussion
5/26/2022	3.00	BCA Subgroup prep BCA Subgroup meeting	Report edits and discussion Report edits and discussion
6/1/2022	2.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #17	Final draft report review
6/8/2022	3.00		Review draft report and materials. Review & respond on final BCA report.
		Prep FEIWG meeting #17	
6/8/2022	3.25	Attend FEIWG meeting #17	meeting Review undated EEL draft and comments
6/14/2022	2.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #18	Review updated FEI draft and comments
6/21/2022	3.00	Prep FEIWG meeting #18	Review report edits and email comments
6/22/2022	3.60	Attend FEIWG meeting #18	Review draft report
9/1/2022	3.00	Comments to OEB on Report	review report and draft comments
9/2/2022	3.50	Comments to OEB on Report	stakeholder correspondence, finalize and file comments
total	144.60		

Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.



28 MacNaughton Road DATE: September 20, 2022
Toronto, Ontario, M4G 3H4 INVOICE # OEB-18-2022
Phone 647-330-1217 email: michael.brophy@rogers.com FOR: EB-2021-0118
FEI

Bill To:

Richard Carlson Director Energy Policy Polution Probe 130 Queens Quay East, Suite 902 Toronto, Ontario M5A 0P6

DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
Consulting - OEB EB-2021-0118 FEI Consultation	
Detailed timesheets for Michael Brophy and John DeVenz attached	
Michael Brophy total: 144.6 hours @ \$330 per hour	47,718.00
John DeVenz total: 6 hours @ \$330 per hour	1,980.00
Subtotal	49,698.00
HST (HST #: 75225 9333 RT0001)	6,460.74
TOTAL	\$ 56,158.74

Make all cheques payable to Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.

If you have any questions concerning this invoice, contact: Michael Brophy, President, Michael Brophy Consulting Inc. Phone: 647-330-1217, email: michael.brophy@rogers.com

Business Number: 75225 9333

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!

John DeVenz

CASE **COST CLAIM**

EB-2021-0118: 2: Michael

Brophy

Oversight: Ontario Energy Board

INTERVENOR NAME

Brophy, Michael; +1 (647)

330-1217

michael.brophy@rogers.com

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

HOURLY RATE

HST RATE

CHARGED

13.00

330

PARTICIPANT

Submitted

CLAIM STATUS

FILING PARTICIPANT

DeVenz, John; + 1 (647) 283-8493

johndevenz@outlook.com

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE

EB-2021-0118: Initiatives:

Regulatory Direction and

NEW

NON-FILING

PARTICIPANT

No

YEAR CALLED TO BAR

PARTICIPANT F. NAME

COMPLETED YEARS

PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE**

31

CV STATUS (FOR

CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24

Months

Invoice_OEB_18 2022.pdf

HEARINGS No

Consultant

LAST CV DATE February 25, 2022

CONSULTATIONS

Yes

DISBURSEMENTS

No

CONSULTATION Description	!	Maximum Ho	ours	Hourly Rate	<u>Sub</u> Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
FEIWG Meeting #21 - June 29, 2022 - Meeting Time x 1.5	-	8.25	6.00	330	1,980.0	0 13.00	257.40	2,237.40
Consultation Total Total Legal/Consultant Fees					1,980.0	0	257.40	2,237.40
Attachments								
<u>Attachment</u>	Document Typ	<u>lmport</u>	Messag	<u>le</u>				
J DeVenz Hours Feb - Sept 2022.pdf	Time Docket							

Invoice

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Related Disbursement Claim

Attachment
J DeVenz Hours Feb
- Sept 2022.pdf
Invoice_OEB_18
2022.pdf

Document

Type Claim Type

Import Message

Time Docke Consultations

Invoice Consultations

EB-2021-0118 OEB Framwork for Energy Innovation: Distributed Resources and Ut J. DeVenz Feb-Sept 2022

Date	hours	
8/20/2021	1.00	Prep for FEIWG meeting
8/23/2021	0.50	Prep for FEIWG meeting
8/24/2021	0.50	Prep for FEIWG meeting
8/29/2021	4.00	Attend FEIWG meeting
total	6.00	

Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.



28 MacNaughton Road DATE: September 20, 2022
Toronto, Ontario, M4G 3H4 INVOICE # OEB-18-2022
Phone 647-330-1217 email: michael.brophy@rogers.com FOR: EB-2021-0118
FEI

Bill To:

Richard Carlson Director Energy Policy Polution Probe 130 Queens Quay East, Suite 902 Toronto, Ontario M5A 0P6

DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
Consulting - OEB EB-2021-0118 FEI Consultation	
Detailed timesheets for Michael Brophy and John DeVenz attached	
Michael Brophy total: 144.6 hours @ \$330 per hour	47,718.00
John DeVenz total: 6 hours @ \$330 per hour	1,980.00
Subtotal	49,698.00
HST (HST #: 75225 9333 RT0001)	6,460.74
TOTAL	\$ 56,158.74

Make all cheques payable to Michael Brophy Consulting Inc.

If you have any questions concerning this invoice, contact: Michael Brophy, President, Michael Brophy Consulting Inc. Phone: 647-330-1217, email: michael.brophy@rogers.com

Business Number: 75225 9333

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!