EB-2022-0086: 1: John Goudy

SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE **CLAIM STATUS** COST CLAIM NUMBER

November 10, 2022 Approved by Finance 739

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #\*

EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct

(New): Enbridge Gas Inc.

HST RATE ONTARIO

INTERVENOR COMPANY\*

**INTERVENOR** INTERVENOR TYPE Canadian Association of Energy Goudy, John; +1 (519) 433-5310 x.236 and Pipeline Landowner Full Registrant jgoudy@scottpetrie.com

Associations, Regina: Corporation

**EXCHANGE RATE** COUNTRY

Canada

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

865849830 RP0001

**PARTICIPANTS** 

HST NUMBER

13.00

Participant Total (\$) Claim Status Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name **Filing Participant** 

No 21.675.66 Submitted Goudy, John; +1 (519) 433-5310 x.236

jgoudy@scottpetrie.com

**ATTACHMENTS** 

Claim **Attachment Document Import** Date Type Type **Attachment Participant** Message CAEPL EB-2022-0086 Cost Claim 110820221031.pdf 1-CAEPL Cost Other Translation Claim\_20221108DisbursementBackUp.pdf disbursement backup TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS TOTAL HST 2.493.66 19.082.00 100.00

**TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED TOTAL CLAIM** 

21.675.66

**REASON FOR REASON FOR REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE** DISALLOWANCE - 2 **DISALLOWANCE - 3** 

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO

Scott Petrie LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS ATTENTION 200-252 Pall Mall St. John D. Goudy

London, ON N6A 5P6

#### SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

DATE SUBMITTED SUBMITTED BY John D. Goudy, Scott Petrie LLP November 08, 2022

#### **John Goudy**

CASE **COST CLAIM** 

EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0086: 1: John Goudy

Gas Inc.

**INTERVENOR NAME** 

Goudy, John; +1 (519) 433-5310 x.236 jgoudy@scottpetrie.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Submitted

**FILING PARTICIPANT** 

Goudy, John; +1 (519) 433-5310 x.236

jgoudy@scottpetrie.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** No

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING** 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

to Construct (New): Enbridge

YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2005

**COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE**  **HOURLY RATE** 290

**HST RATE** 

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

17

**CV STATUS (FOR** CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

**LAST CV DATE** 

**CHARGED** 

13.00

**HEARINGS** 

Yes

**CV** Required

Legal Counsel

**CONSULTATIONS** 

Yes

No

Н	₽	١RI	IN	GS
---	---	-----	----	----

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	3.30	290	957.00	13.00	124.41	1,081.41
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	10.60	290	3,074.00	13.00	399.62	3,473.62
Review Interrogatory Responses	4.40	290	1,276.00	13.00	165.88	1,441.88
Technical Conference Preparation	6.10	290	1,769.00	13.00	229.97	1,998.97
Technical Conference Attendance	11.30	290	3,277.00	13.00	426.01	3,703.01
Technical Conference Follow Up	0.90	290	261.00	13.00	33.93	294.93
ssues List						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		290		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	16.40	290	4,756.00	13.00	618.28	5,374.28
Interrogatory Responses	5.50	290	1,595.00	13.00	207.35	1,802.35
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		290		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	3.00	290	870.00	13.00	113.10	983.10
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		290		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	2.00	290	580.00	13.00	75.40	655.40
With Other Parties	2.00	290	580.00	13.00	75.40	655.40
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Confidentiality		200		. 0.00		

Preparation of Application for		290		13.00		
Confidentiality						
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Decision						
Review	0.30	290	87.00	13.00	11.31	98.31
Rate Order						
Review		290		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees						
Total Service Provider Fees:			19,082.00		2,480.66	21,562.66

**Attachments** 

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

2022 11 03 CAEPLA DCLC OEB Acct.pdf Time Docket Legal Services Invoice

DISBURSEMENTS										
<u>Name</u>	Atchmnt Required	Atchmnt Provided	<u>Qty</u>	Cost/ Unit	<u>Net</u> <u>Cost</u>	HST Rate	Other HST Taxes/T	<u>ip</u>		<u>Rationale/</u> <u>Comment</u>
Other	Yes	Yes	1.00	100.00	100.00	13.00	13.00		113.00	LawPro Civil Transaction Levy re: Application for Intervenor Status
Total Disbursements:	No	No			100.00		13.00	0.00	113.00	

**Attachments** 

Attachment Related Disbursement Claim Import Message

2022 11 03 CAEPLA DCLC OEB Other LawPro Civil Transaction Acct.pdf Levy

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Related Disbursement Claim Type Claim Type Import Message

2022 11 03 CAFPLA

Time Docket Hearings Legal Services Invoice

2022 11 03 CAEPLA Time Docke Hearings Legal Services Invoice DCLC OEB Acct.pdf

2022 11 03 CAEPLA Other Disbursements LawPro Civil
DCLC OEB Acct.pdf Transaction Levy

# IN ACCOUNT WITH Scott Petrie LLP

Law Firm

Main Office 200-252 Pall Mall St. London, Ontario N6A 5P6 TEL. (519) 433-5310

TEL. (519) 433-5310 FAX. (519) 433-7909

CAEPLA

Invoice #:

67092

257-918 Albert Street

Nov 03, 2022

2700

Regina, Saskatchewan S4R 2P7

Matter #:

27883

RE: Enbridge Gas Inc. 2023 Dawn-Corunna Project

The following are the total fees and disbursements outstanding to the date of this account. A detailed breakdown of each is attached.

Total Fees before Discount	\$23,030.00
Less Discount	- \$3,948.00
Total Fees After Discount	\$19,082.00
HST on Fees	\$2,480.66

Total Fees & GST/HST	
Total Disbursements	\$100.00
HST on Dishursements	13.00

Total Disbursements & HST

\$21,562.66

113.00

Total for this Bill

\$21,675.66

Total Tax: \$2,493.66

HST #: R139985063

This is our account herein

SCOTT PETRIE LLP Law Firm

Per:

John D. Youdy

E&OE

### **Details of Fees and Disbursements**

<u>Fees</u>		<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<u>Lawyer</u>
Apr 13/22	OEB: Review OEB Notice of Application; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same, intervenor status, method	0.20	70.00	JDG
May 03/22	of proceeding re same OEB: E-mail correspondence to and from client re: application for intervenor status	0.10	35.00	JDG
May 06/22	OEB: Prepare Intervention Letter to OEB; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.90	315.00	JDG
May 09/22	OEB: File intervenor request letter; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
May 25/22	OEB: Review OEB Procedural Order No. 1; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
May 30/22	OEB: Review project application; Preparation of interrogatories to Enbridge	0.80	280.00	JDG
Jun 07/22	OEB: Prepare interrogatories to Enbridge	1.40	490.00	JDG
Jun 08/22	OEB: Prepare interrogatories to Enbridge; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.00	350.00	JDG
Jun 09/22	OEB: Prepare interrogatories to Enbridge	1.70	595.00	JDG
Jun 10/22	OEB: Prepare and file interrogatories to Enbridge; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	5.70	1,995.00	JDG
Jul 01/22	OEB: Review OEB filings, decision on confidentiality	0.10	35.00	JDG
Jul 04/22	OEB: Review Enbridge Interrogatory Responses; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.20	420.00	JDG
Jul 12/22	OEB: Telephone attendance with client re: OEB Procedural Direction; Review same and determine method of proceeding	0.40	140.00	JDG
Jul 13/22	OEB: Review Procedural Direction; Prepare and file letter to OEB re: intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to and from and telephone attendance with clients re: same;	2.40	840.00	JDG
Jul 15/22	OEB: Review Procedural Order No. 3; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same, intervenor evidence	0.10	35.00	JDG
Jul 17/22	OEB: Review Enbridge Interrogatory Responses; Prepare letter to OEB re: Technical Conference	3.20	1,120.00	JDG
Jul 18/22	OEB: Prepare letter to OEB re: technical conference; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same; Determine method of proceeding re: landowner evidence; Prepare letter to OEB re: same	0.90	315.00	JDG
Jul 19/22	OEB: Prepare letter to OEB re: intervenor evidence; Determine method of proceeding re: evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.40	490.00	JDG
Jul 20/22	OEB: E-mail correspondence to clients re: draft letter to OEB re evidence; Finalize and file letter re evidence; E-mail	0.60	210.00	JDG
Jul 21/22	correspondence to clients re: same OEB: Review OEB letter re: technical conference; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same; Review and respond to intervenor e-mail correspondence re: technical conference preparation meeting	0.20	70.00	JDG

Jul 22/22	OEB: Video meeting with intervenors re: preparation for technical conference; Telephone attendance with client re:	1.30	455.00	JDG
	oEB: Review Enbridge letter re: request for intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
Jul 24/22	OEB: Prepare draft reply to Enbridge response re intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same, landowner evidence	1.10	385.00	JDG
Jul 25/22	OEB: E-mail correspondence to clients re: technical conference; Preparation for technical conference	0.20	70.00	JDG
	OEB: File reply letter to Enbridge response re intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.30	105.00	JDG
Jul 26/22	OEB: Preparation for technical conference; Review schedule and witness panel information for technical conference; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same; Preparation for and attendance on video meeting with clients re: same; E-mail correspondence to clients re: technical conference, OEB Procedural Order No. 4; Review Enbridge evidence updates	2.30	805.00	JDG
Jul 27/22	OEB: Preparation for OEB Technical Conference	0.80	280.00	JDG
	OEB: Attendance on OEB Technical Conference Day 1	6.30	2,205.00	JDG
Jul 29/22	OEB: Review and respond to client e-mail correspondence re: technical conference continuation	0.10	35.00	JDG
Aug 01/22	OEB: Preparation for Technical Conference Day 2	1.20	420.00	JDG
Aug 02/22	OEB: Attendance at OEB Technical Conference Day 2	5.00	1,750.00	JDG
Aug 03/22	OEB: Review Technical Conference Day 2 transcript; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Aug 08/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence	0.90	315.00	JDG
Aug 09/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence	0.80	280.00	JDG
	OEB: Review Enbridge undertakings responses from OEB Technical Conference; E-mail correspondence to clients resame; E-mail correspondence to Charles Keizer resomission	0.50	175.00	JDG
Aug 10/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence	0.60	210.00	JDG
Aug 11/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	3.50	1,225.00	JDG
	OEB: Review undertakings responses from Enbridge from OEB Technical Conference; E-mail correspondence to clients	0.10	35.00	JDG
Aug 12/22	re: same OEB: Prepare and file written evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	3.30	1,155.00	JDG
Aug 15/22	OEB: Review Enbridge undertakings responses from OEB Technical Conference	0.10	35.00	JDG
Aug 17/22	OEB: Review Enbridge Reply evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Aug 18/22	OEB: Prepare and file letter with OEB re: Enbridge request for settlement negotiation order; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.00	350.00	JDG
Aug 22/22	OEB: Review Enbridge responding letter to OEB; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG

Aug 23/22	OEB: Review OEB letter received; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
	OEB: Review Interrogatories received; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Aug 24/22	OEB: E-mail correspondence to Charles Keizer re: OEB letter, negotiations; Review Charles Keizer response; E-mail correspondence to and from OEB Case Manager re: status of negotiations; Prepare and send letter to OEB re: same	0.60	210.00	JDG
Aug 26/22	OEB: Review OEB letter re: negotiations, requirement to file joint letter; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
	OEB: Prepare responses to Interrogatories	1.20	420.00	JDG
Aug 27/22	OEB: Prepare responses to Interrogatories; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	3.30	1,155.00	JDG
	OEB: Prepare final written submissions	3.00	1,050.00	JDG
Aug 29/22	OEB: Finalize and file responses to Interrogatories; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.80	280.00	JDG
	OEB: Review Enbridge responses to Interrogatories	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 06/22	OEB: Review Enbridge argument-in-chief; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 14/22	OEB: Telephone attendance with Enbridge lawyer re: joint letter to OEB re settlement negotiations	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 15/22	OEB: Review e-mail correspondence from Enbridge lawyer re joint letter to OEB; Review and revise draft joint letter; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Sep 16/22	OEB: Telephone call from Charles Keizer re: OEB communications re settlement negotiations	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 19/22	OEB: Review OEB Procedural Order No. 5; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 20/22	OEB: Telephone attendances with and e-mail correspondence to and from Charles Keizer re joint update letter to OEB re settlement negotiations; Prepare and file joint update letter	1.50	525.00	JDG
Sep 23/22	OEB: Prepare draft letter to OEB re: settlement	0.30	105.00	JDG
Sep 26/22	OEB: Review and respond to e-mail correspondence from Charles Keizer re: update to OEB re settlement; Finalize and send letter to OEB re: settlement; E-mail correspondence to	0.20	70.00	JDG
Sep 29/22	clients re: same OEB: Review Enbridge letter to OEB re: extension request; Prepare letter to OEB re: settlement ratification; E-mail correspondence to Charles Keizer re: draft letter; E-mail	0.30	105.00	JDG
Sep 30/22	correspondence to client re: same OEB: Review and respond to e-mail correspondence from Charles Keizer re: draft letter to OEB, draft settlement documents; Finalize and submit update letter to OEB re: settlement ratification; E-mail correspondence to clients re:	0.20	70.00	JDG
Oct 13/22	same OEB: Review Enbridge Reply Argument; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Nov 03/22	OEB: Review OEB Decision; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.30	105.00	JDG

Total Fees HST on Fees				65.80	\$23,030.00
HS1 on rees					2,480.66
<b>Disbursements</b>					
Transactio	n Levy: Other			100.00	
Total Disburseme	ents				100.00
HST on Disburse	ments				13.00
* tax-exempt		Total	for this Bill		<b></b>
Total Tax:	\$2,493.66	Total	TOT UIIS DIII		\$21,675.66
HST #:	R139985063				
Lawyer		Hours	Rate	Am	ount
JDG		65.80	\$350.00	\$19,08	2.00
Totals		65.80		\$23,03	0.00

# IN ACCOUNT WITH Scott Petrie LLP

Law Firm

Main Office 200-252 Pall Mall St. London, Ontario N6A 5P6 TEL. (519) 433-5310

TEL. (519) 433-5310 FAX. (519) 433-7909

CAEPLA

Invoice #:

67092

257-918 Albert Street

Nov 03, 2022

2700

Regina, Saskatchewan S4R 2P7

Matter #:

27883

RE: Enbridge Gas Inc. 2023 Dawn-Corunna Project

The following are the total fees and disbursements outstanding to the date of this account. A detailed breakdown of each is attached.

Total Fees before Discount	\$23,030.00
Less Discount	- \$3,948.00
Total Fees After Discount	\$19,082.00
HST on Fees	\$2,480.66

Total Fees & GST/HST	
Total Disbursements	\$100.00
HST on Dishursements	13.00

Total Disbursements & HST

\$21,562.66

113.00

Total for this Bill

\$21,675.66

Total Tax: \$2,493.66

HST #: R139985063

This is our account herein

SCOTT PETRIE LLP Law Firm

Per:

John D. Youdy

E&OE

### **Details of Fees and Disbursements**

<u>Fees</u>		<b>Hours</b>	Amount La	awyer
Apr 13/22	OEB: Review OEB Notice of Application; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same, intervenor status, method	0.20	70.00 J	DG
May 03/22	of proceeding re same OEB: E-mail correspondence to and from client re: application for intervenor status	0.10	35.00 J	DG
May 06/22	OEB: Prepare Intervention Letter to OEB; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.90	315.00 J	DG
May 09/22	OEB: File intervenor request letter; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00 J	DG
May 25/22	OEB: Review OEB Procedural Order No. 1; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00 J	DG
May 30/22	OEB: Review project application; Preparation of interrogatories to Enbridge	0.80	280.00 J	DG
Jun 07/22	OEB: Prepare interrogatories to Enbridge	1.40	490.00 J	DG
Jun 08/22	OEB: Prepare interrogatories to Enbridge; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.00	350.00 J	DG
Jun 09/22	OEB: Prepare interrogatories to Enbridge	1.70	595.00 J	DG
Jun 10/22	OEB: Prepare and file interrogatories to Enbridge; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	5.70	1,995.00 J	DG
Jul 01/22	OEB: Review OEB filings, decision on confidentiality	0.10	35.00 J	DG
Jul 04/22	OEB: Review Enbridge Interrogatory Responses; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.20	420.00 J	DG
Jul 12/22	OEB: Telephone attendance with client re: OEB Procedural Direction; Review same and determine method of proceeding	0.40	140.00 J	DG
Jul 13/22	OEB: Review Procedural Direction; Prepare and file letter to OEB re: intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to and from and telephone attendance with clients re: same;	2.40	840.00 J	DG
Jul 15/22	OEB: Review Procedural Order No. 3; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same, intervenor evidence	0.10	35.00 J	DG
Jul 17/22	OEB: Review Enbridge Interrogatory Responses; Prepare letter to OEB re: Technical Conference	3.20	1,120.00 J	DG
Jul 18/22	OEB: Prepare letter to OEB re: technical conference; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same; Determine method of proceeding re: landowner evidence; Prepare letter to OEB re: same	0.90	315.00 JI	DG
Jul 19/22	OEB: Prepare letter to OEB re: intervenor evidence; Determine method of proceeding re: evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.40	490.00 J	DG
Jul 20/22	OEB: E-mail correspondence to clients re: draft letter to OEB re evidence; Finalize and file letter re evidence; E-mail	0.60	210.00 J	DG
Jul 21/22	correspondence to clients re: same OEB: Review OEB letter re: technical conference; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same; Review and respond to intervenor e-mail correspondence re: technical conference preparation meeting	0.20	70.00 JI	DG

Jul 22/22	OEB: Video meeting with intervenors re: preparation for technical conference; Telephone attendance with client re:	1.30	455.00	JDG
	oEB: Review Enbridge letter re: request for intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
Jul 24/22	OEB: Prepare draft reply to Enbridge response re intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same,		385.00	JDG
Jul 25/22	landowner evidence OEB: E-mail correspondence to clients re: technical conference; Preparation for technical conference		70.00	JDG
	OEB: File reply letter to Enbridge response re intervenor evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.30	105.00	JDG
Jul 26/22	OEB: Preparation for technical conference; Review schedule and witness panel information for technical conference; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same; Preparation for and attendance on video meeting with clients re: same; E-mail correspondence to clients re: technical conference, OEB Procedural Order No. 4; Review Enbridge evidence updates	2.30	805.00	JDG
Jul 27/22	OEB: Preparation for OEB Technical Conference	0.80	280.00	JDG
	OEB: Attendance on OEB Technical Conference Day 1	6.30	2,205.00	JDG
Jul 29/22	OEB: Review and respond to client e-mail correspondence re: technical conference continuation	0.10	35.00	JDG
Aug 01/22	OEB: Preparation for Technical Conference Day 2	1.20	420.00	JDG
Aug 02/22	OEB: Attendance at OEB Technical Conference Day 2	5.00	1,750.00	JDG
Aug 03/22	OEB: Review Technical Conference Day 2 transcript; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same		70.00	JDG
Aug 08/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence	0.90	315.00	JDG
Aug 09/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence	0.80	280.00	JDG
C	OEB: Review Enbridge undertakings responses from OEB Technical Conference; E-mail correspondence to clients resame; E-mail correspondence to Charles Keizer resomission	0.50	175.00	JDG
Aug 10/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence	0.60	210.00	JDG
Aug 11/22	OEB: Prepare written evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	3.50	1,225.00	JDG
	OEB: Review undertakings responses from Enbridge from OEB Technical Conference; E-mail correspondence to clients	0.10	35.00	JDG
Aug 12/22	re: same OEB: Prepare and file written evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	3.30	1,155.00	JDG
Aug 15/22	OEB: Review Enbridge undertakings responses from OEB Technical Conference	0.10	35.00	JDG
Aug 17/22	OEB: Review Enbridge Reply evidence; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Aug 18/22	OEB: Prepare and file letter with OEB re: Enbridge request for settlement negotiation order; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	1.00	350.00	JDG
Aug 22/22	OEB: Review Enbridge responding letter to OEB; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG

Aug 23/22	OEB: Review OEB letter received; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
	OEB: Review Interrogatories received; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Aug 24/22	OEB: E-mail correspondence to Charles Keizer re: OEB letter, negotiations; Review Charles Keizer response; E-mail correspondence to and from OEB Case Manager re: status of negotiations; Prepare and send letter to OEB re: same		210.00	JDG
Aug 26/22	OEB: Review OEB letter re: negotiations, requirement to file joint letter; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
	OEB: Prepare responses to Interrogatories	1.20	420.00	JDG
Aug 27/22 OEB: Prepare responses to Interrogatories; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same		3.30	1,155.00	JDG
	OEB: Prepare final written submissions	3.00	1,050.00	JDG
Aug 29/22	OEB: Finalize and file responses to Interrogatories; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.80	280.00	JDG
	OEB: Review Enbridge responses to Interrogatories	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 06/22	OEB: Review Enbridge argument-in-chief; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 14/22	OEB: Telephone attendance with Enbridge lawyer re: joint letter to OEB re settlement negotiations	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 15/22	OEB: Review e-mail correspondence from Enbridge lawyer re joint letter to OEB; Review and revise draft joint letter; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Sep 16/22	OEB: Telephone call from Charles Keizer re: OEB communications re settlement negotiations	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 19/22	OEB: Review OEB Procedural Order No. 5; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.10	35.00	JDG
Sep 20/22	OEB: Telephone attendances with and e-mail correspondence to and from Charles Keizer re joint update letter to OEB re settlement negotiations; Prepare and file joint update letter	1.50	525.00	JDG
Sep 23/22	OEB: Prepare draft letter to OEB re: settlement	0.30	105.00	JDG
Sep 26/22	OEB: Review and respond to e-mail correspondence from	0.20	70.00	
Sep 20/22	Charles Keizer re: update to OEB re settlement; Finalize and send letter to OEB re: settlement; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	,DG
Sep 29/22	OEB: Review Enbridge letter to OEB re: extension request; Prepare letter to OEB re: settlement ratification; E-mail correspondence to Charles Keizer re: draft letter; E-mail correspondence to client re: same	0.30	105.00	JDG
Sep 30/22	OEB: Review and respond to e-mail correspondence from Charles Keizer re: draft letter to OEB, draft settlement documents; Finalize and submit update letter to OEB re: settlement ratification; E-mail correspondence to clients re:	0.20	70.00	JDG
Oct 13/22	oEB: Review Enbridge Reply Argument; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.20	70.00	JDG
Nov 03/22	OEB: Review OEB Decision; E-mail correspondence to clients re: same	0.30	105.00	JDG

Total Fees HST on Fees				65.80	\$23,030.00 2,480.66
<b>Disbursements</b>					
Transaction Levy: Other				100.00	
Total Disburseme	ents				100.00
HST on Disburse	ments				13.00
* tax-exempt		Total	for this Bill		\$21,675.66
Total Tax:	\$2,493.66				<b>421,072.00</b>
HST #:	R139985063				
Lawyer		Hours	Rate	Amount	
JDG		65.80	\$350.00	\$19,082.00	
Totals		65.80		\$23,03	0.00