



November 10, 2022

**VIA RESS**

Ontario Energy Board  
P.O. Box 2319,  
2300 Yonge Street, 27<sup>th</sup> Floor  
Toronto, ON M4P 1E4  
Attention: Registrar

Dear Ms. Marconi,

**Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. (“EGI”)  
Dawn to Corunna Replacement Project  
Board File Number: EB-2022-0086**

We are counsel to Three Fires Group Inc. (“**Three Fires**”) in the above-noted proceeding. Further to the Board’s Decision and Order dated November 3, 2022, please find enclosed Three Fires’ cost claim in respect of the Proceeding.

Three Fires respectfully requests an award of 100% of its eligible costs, given its strategic and principled participation in the Proceeding, reflecting the unique interests of otherwise unrepresented EGI customers and impacted Indigenous communities. Three Fires submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (a) Three Fires participated effectively in the Proceeding, taking a surgical, principled, and coordinated approach to matters related to the duty to consult and impacts on affected First Nations and Indigenous communities and assisted in contributing to the Board’s better understanding of such matters;
- (b) Three Fires ensured that its participation in the Proceeding was focused on material issues and consistent with the scope of its intervention, as set out in its Notice of Intervention; and
- (c) Three Fires participated responsibly and undertook coordination with other intervenors and Board Staff to avoid overlap, maximize efficiency, and ensure that its participation was not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues.

We trust that this approach maximizes the efficient use of resources and the right of otherwise unrepresented and important EGI customers to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board’s mandate and statutory objectives.

Three Fires respectfully requests a full award of eligible costs.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "David Vollmer". The signature is fluid and cursive, with the first name "David" being more prominent than the last name "Vollmer".

DT Vollmer

- c. Tania Persad, EGI
- Adam Stiers, Regulatory Applications, EGI
- Charles Keizer, Torys LLP
- Philip Lee, Three Fires
- Chief Mary Duckworth, Caldwell First Nation
- Larry Sault, Caldwell First Nation
- Don Richardson, Three Fires

# EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova

COST CLAIM NUMBER 786	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE November 10, 2022	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Three Fires Group, Lambton Shores: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY Canada
HST NUMBER 712928407 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Participant Claim Status
No	,	DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	1,566.18	Submitted
No	,	McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	9,564.32	Submitted
No	,	Daube, Nicholas; +1 (416) 768-8341 nicholas@resilientllp.com	2,621.60	Submitted
No	,	Ferguson, Emily; +1 (999) 999-9999 emily.ferguson@threefiresgroup.com	12,215.30	Submitted
No	,	Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 993-6338 daniel@resilientllp.com	12,428.87	Submitted
No	,	Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086 don.richardson@threefiresgroup.com	1,584.83	Submitted

## ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Attachment Date	Participant	Document Type	Claim Type	Import Message
Three Fires_EB-2022-0086_CostClaim_CoverLetter_20221110.pdf			Cover Letter		
TFG EB-2022-0086 Cost Claim 111020221536.pdf					

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 35,381.50	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00	TOTAL HST 4,599.60
--	-----------------------------	-----------------------

TOTAL CLAIM 39,981.10	TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED
--------------------------	----------------------

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3
-------------------------	-----------------------------	-----------------------------

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO  
Resilient LLP

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS  
333 Bay Street, Suite 625  
Toronto, ON  
M5H 2R2

ATTENTION

### SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

SUBMITTED BY  
Daniel Vollmer

DATE SUBMITTED  
November 10, 2022

**Lisa (Elisabeth) DeMarco**

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
--	---	---	--

<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
---	----------------------------------	---	---

<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b> Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR</b> 1997	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE</b> 25	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 330
---	-----------------------------------	--	---------------------------

<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> February 23, 2022	<b>HST RATE CHARGED</b> 13.00
---	--	--------------------------------------

<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

**HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence		330		13.00		
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories	0.30	330	99.00	13.00	12.87	111.87
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	2.10	330	693.00	13.00	90.09	783.09
Technical Conference Attendance		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		330		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	1.80	330	594.00	13.00	77.22	671.22
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		330		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		330		13.00		
With Other Parties		330		13.00		
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	330	13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	330	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	330	13.00		
<b>Decision</b>				
Review	330	13.00		
<b>Rate Order</b>				
Review	330	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	330	13.00		
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>				
Total Service Provider Fees:		1,386.00	180.18	1,566.18

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Lisa DeMarco_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_E B-2022-0068.pdf	Time Docket	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Lisa DeMarco_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0068.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$ Billable (\$)	User	Bill number
Time entry	2022.06.03	0.3	IRP - Instructions to D. Vollmer re preparing interrogatories;	330 \$ 99.00	L. DeMarco	22185
Time entry	2022.07.20	1.4	TCP - Attend on call with client and consultant team;	330 \$ 462.00	L. DeMarco	22185
Time entry	2022.07.22	0.7	TCP - Instructions to team re technical conference structure;	330 \$ 231.00	L. DeMarco	22185
Time entry	2022.08.22	1	APR - Prepare for and attend on call with client group;	330 \$ 330.00	L. DeMarco	22185
Time entry	2022.09.19	0.8	APR - Instructions to team re structure of submissions;	330 \$ 264.00	L. DeMarco	22185
Total		4.2		\$ 1,386.00		

**Jonathan McGillivray**

<b>CASE</b>	<b>COST CLAIM</b>	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b>	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b>
EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	Submitted

<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b>	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	No		

  

<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b>	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR</b>	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>
Legal Counsel	2017	6	230

  

<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b>	<b>LAST CV DATE</b>	<b>HST RATE CHARGED</b>
CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	February 24, 2022	13.00

  

<b>HEARINGS</b>	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b>	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b>
Yes	No	No

**HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence	0.20	230	46.00	13.00	5.98	51.98
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories	3.90	230	897.00	13.00	116.61	1,013.61
Review Interrogatory Responses	1.40	230	322.00	13.00	41.86	363.86
Technical Conference Preparation	11.30	230	2,599.00	13.00	337.87	2,936.87
Technical Conference Attendance	11.40	230	2,622.00	13.00	340.86	2,962.86
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		230		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	8.20	230	1,886.00	13.00	245.18	2,131.18
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		230		13.00		
With Other Parties	0.40	230	92.00	13.00	11.96	103.96
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
<b>Decision</b>			
Review	230	13.00	
<b>Rate Order</b>			
Review	230	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00	
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>			
Total Service Provider Fees:	8,464.00	1,100.32	9,564.32

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Jonathan McGillivray_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf	Time Docket	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Jonathan McGillivray_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill number
Time entry	2022.06.07	0.4	IRP - Instructions to D. Vollmer re preparation of IRs;	230	\$ 92.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.06.09	1.7	IRP - Review and revise draft interrogatories and communications with D. Richardson re same;	230	\$ 391.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.06.10	1.8	IRP - Review and revise draft interrogatories and communications with P. Lee and D. Richardson re same; Instructions to D. Vollmer;	230	\$ 414.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.08	0.8	APR - Review interrogatory responses;	230	\$ 184.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.12	0.3	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	230	\$ 69.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.15	0.7	TCP - Communications with D. Richardson and E. Ferguson re preparation for technical conference;	230	\$ 161.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.15	0.2	APR - Review and consider PO3;	230	\$ 46.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.18	0.6	TCP - Communications with D. Richardson and E. Ferguson re preparation for technical conference; Review interrogatory responses;	230	\$ 138.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.20	1.4	TCP - Attend on call with client and consultant team;	230	\$ 322.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.21	0.4	APR - Review and revise letter re Three Fires Group;	230	\$ 92.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.22	1.4	TCP - Prepare for and attend o intervenor coordination call;	230	\$ 322.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.25	3.2	TCP - Prepare for technical conference and related instructions to D. Vollmer;	230	\$ 736.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.26	3.1	TCP - Prepare for technical conference and related instructions to D. Vollmer; Communications with E. Ferguson;	230	\$ 713.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.27	6.1	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 1);	230	\$ 1,403.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.07.29	0.6	TCP - Prepare for technical conference; Meeting with E. Ferguson and CFN Team;	230	\$ 138.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.08.02	5.3	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 2);	230	\$ 1,219.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.08.12	0.6	APR - Review undertaking responses and communications with client group re same;	230	\$ 138.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.08.22	0.9	APR - Prepare argument; Meeting with client group;	230	\$ 207.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.09.07	0.3	APR - Prepare written submissions;	230	\$ 69.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.09.13	1.7	APR - Revisions to draft written submissions and communications with client group;	230	\$ 391.00	J. McGillivray	22185
Time entry	2022.09.16	2.4	APR - Prepare for and attend on meeting with client group re draft submissions; Prepare written submissions;	230	\$ 552.00	J. McGillivray	22158
Time entry	2022.09.19	0.4	APR - Revisions to draft submissions and communications re same;	230	\$ 92.00	J. McGillivray	22158

Time entry	2022.09.22	0.3	APR - Revisions to draft submissions and communications re same;	230	\$ 69.00	J. McGillivray	22158
Time entry	2022.09.23	0.7	APR - Final review of submissions and instructions to D. Vollmer;	230	\$ 161.00	J. McGillivray	22158
Time entry	2022.10.11	1.2	APR - Review reply argument;	230	\$ 276.00	J. McGillivray	22158
Time entry	2022.11.02	0.3	APR - Review evidentiary update and communications with client group re same;	230	\$ 69.00	J. McGillivray	22158
Total		36.8			\$ 8,464.00		

--

**Nicholas Daube**

<b>CASE</b>	<b>COST CLAIM</b>	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b>	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b>
EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	Submitted

<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b>	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
Daube, Nicholas; +1 (416) 768-8341 nicholas@resilientllp.com	No		

<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b>	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR</b>	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>
Legal Counsel	2007	15	290

<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b>	<b>LAST CV DATE</b>	<b>HST RATE CHARGED</b>
CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	June 15, 2022	13.00

<b>HEARINGS</b>	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b>	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b>
Yes	No	No

**HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence		290		13.00		
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories		290		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		290		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		290		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		290		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	8.00	290	2,320.00	13.00	301.60	2,621.60
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		290		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		290		13.00		
With Other Parties		290		13.00		
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
<b>Decision</b>				
Review	290	13.00		
<b>Rate Order</b>				
Review	290	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	290	13.00		
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>				
Total Service Provider Fees:		2,320.00	301.60	2,621.60

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
NicholasDaume_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0068.pdf	Time Docket	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
NicholasDaume_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0068.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill number
Time entry	2022.09.19	0.4	APR - Reviewing submissions and providing comments for new incorporations by D. Vollmer;	290	\$ 116.00	N. Daube	22185
Time entry	2022.09.20	2.8	APR - Reviewing submissions and providing comments for incorporations by D. Vollmer;	290	\$ 812.00	N. Daube	22185
Time entry	2022.09.23	4.8	APR - Reviewing submissions;	290	\$ 1,392.00	N. Daube	22185
Total		8			\$ 2,320.00		

**Emily Ferguson**

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
--	---	---	--

<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Ferguson, Emily; +1 (999) 999-9999 emily.ferguson@threefiresgroup.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
---	----------------------------------	---	---

<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b> Consultant	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR</b>	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE</b> 10	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 230
--	---------------------------	--	---------------------------

<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Attached	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> November 10, 2022	<b>HST RATE CHARGED</b> 13.00
--	--	--------------------------------------

<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

**HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence		230		13.00		
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories	22.50	230	5,175.00	13.00	672.75	5,847.75
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	8.00	230	1,840.00	13.00	239.20	2,079.20
Technical Conference Attendance	11.00	230	2,530.00	13.00	328.90	2,858.90
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		230		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	5.50	230	1,265.00	13.00	164.45	1,429.45
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		230		13.00		
With Other Parties		230		13.00		
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
<b>Decision</b>			
Review	230	13.00	
<b>Rate Order</b>			
Review	230	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00	
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>			
Total Service Provider Fees:	10,810.00	1,405.30	12,215.30

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Emily Ferguson CV - OEB - 2022-11-10.pdf	CV	
Emily Ferguson_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf	Time Docket	
Invoice 1007 - TFG to Resilient - OEB Cost Claim - Dawn to Corunna.pdf	Invoice	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Emily Ferguson CV - OEB - 2022-11-10.pdf		CV	Hearings	
Emily Ferguson_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	
Invoice 1007 - TFG to Resilient - OEB Cost Claim - Dawn to Corunna.pdf		Invoice	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill Number
Time Entry	2022.05.01	2	Prepare intervenor request letter;	230	460.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.05.05	12	IRP – Review application and evidence;	230	2760.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.05.15	8	IRP – Prepare interrogatories;	230	1840.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.06.06	0.5	IRP – Call with Resilient LLP re IR strategy and preparation;	230	115.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.07.04	2	TCP – Review interrogatory responses;	230	460.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.07.10	5	TCP – Prepare questions and material for technical conference;	230	1150.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.07.20	1	TCP – Call with Resilient LLP;	230	230.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.07.27	6	TCA – Technical Conference (Day 1);	230	1380.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.08.02	5	TCA – Technical Conference (Day 2);	230	1150.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.08.03	2	APR – Review technical conference transcript;	230	460.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.08.22	1	APR – Call with Resilient LLP re submission preparation;	230	230.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.09.16	1.5	APR – Call with Resilient LLP re final argument;	230	345.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Time Entry	2022.09.22	1	APR – Review final argument prepared by Resilient LLP;	230	230.00	E. Ferguson	1007
Total		47		230	\$10,810.00	E. Ferguson	



# EMILY FERGUSON



emily.ferguson@threefires.com ~ 782-577-9998 x 104

## SUMMARY AND EDUCATION

### **Consultant with 10 years' experience in regulatory and policy matters on behalf of Indigenous clients**

Honours Bachelor of Arts, Geography and Environmental Studies, McMaster University  
Minor Political Science, McMaster University  
Course Studies: Fundamentals of Indigenous Peoples and Canadian Law, Osgoode Law School  
Course Studies: Environmental Management Practices, Lambton College  
Course Studies: Law Clerk, St. Lawrence College

## PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE

**Regulatory and Policy Team Manager** ~ Three Fires Group

**July 2022 – Present**

**Regulatory Specialist** ~ IBA Braiding

**February 2022 – July 2022**

- Note: IBA Braiding employees were hired into Three Fires Group in July 2022
- Assisting Indigenous clients to manage a range of workflows related to project notices and project regulatory approval reviews in energy, climate, mining, land development, transportation, etc.
- Acting as a client lead, managing projects and monitoring proponent activities for select key clients. Provide project briefs and recommendations for engaging proponents where significant impacts on Indigenous treaty rights and interests occur or are expected
- Researching and staying current on legislation, regulations, policies, frameworks, etc. related to UNDRIP, Duty to Consult, Aboriginal Law, Indigenous laws, environmental law, climate change, and other areas of interest as requested by the client
- Coordinating impact and benefit agreement (IBA) negotiations with respect to environmental, social, cultural, and economic impacts/mitigation/compensation, and supporting negotiations with respect to economic and commercial benefits to clients
- Scheduling, supporting meeting logistics, co-chairing meetings, tracking action items, etc. in coordination with other staff and subconsultants and reporting to Indigenous leadership
- Reviewing various project approvals, permits and site assessments to determine issues and opportunities with respect to Indigenous client rights and interests
- Identifying potential mitigation, accommodation, and compensation measures to assist Indigenous clients in making decisions on projects that impact their rights and interests
- Regular reporting requirements to Indigenous leadership on specific projects
- Assisting with interviews and compiling interview notes for Indigenous knowledge and Indigenous policy input studies and assignments
- Performing project site field visits, organizing, and reporting on client meetings, and managing specific project assignments to benefit client goals and objectives
- Assisting in monitoring proponent activities and project notifications for select key clients, including drafting project briefs and recommendations for engaging proponents where there are significant impacts on treaty rights and Indigenous interests



# EMILY FERGUSON



**Consultant** ~ Self Employed, Global

**June 2016 – January 2022**

- Research: Indigenous Knowledge Framework Review
- Research: Gender Based Analysis Plus (GBA+)
- Review and public engagement on the Pan-Canadian Framework on Climate Change and the impact of Canada's food system and transportation on greenhouse gas emissions
- Regulatory support for individuals and community groups regarding the Energy East pipeline and Bay of Fundy tanker project (technical review, public participation, community engagement, capacity building, funding applications, media relations, research and report writing)
- Active participant in the National Energy Board Modernization process and lead writer of submissions to Natural Resources Canada
- Educational nature trails development for school aged children
- Quantitative surveying of plastic pollution in the Bay Islands, Honduras
- Developing materials and providing environmental education for grades 1-8
- Presentations to high school students grade 9-12 about the connection between fossil fuels and climate change and how to become active citizens
- Mapping past election results to provide insight and develop a strategy for future elections

**Teacher** ~ Island Academy of Roatán, Honduras

**Jan 2016 – May 2016**

- Taught a split grade 3 / 4 class from various cultural backgrounds
- Worked with Calvert Education (science, social studies, history, geography, math, and language)
- Designed and implemented an environmental studies special course for grades one to eight

**Energy and Regulatory Specialist** ~ Shared Value Solutions, Guelph ON

**Oct 2013 – Dec 2015**

- Strategic advisor working for Indigenous communities across Canada
- Meeting with proponents and supporting community interests
- Advocating for Indigenous participation in field work and operations and maintenance
- Review of infrastructure and land use projects (e.g., pipelines, roads, and transmission corridors)
- Organized a bus tour to Michigan, USA for Canadian Indigenous representatives to connect with American Tribal Councils for sharing and learning regarding fossil fuel extraction and transportation across ancestral territory. Co-produced a documentary with a filmmaker from Aroland First Nation to capture trip experiences and strengthen negotiations with proponents
- Navigated Canada's environmental regulatory processes
- Conducted traditional knowledge and land use interviews
- Project management, coordination, and budgeting

**Three Fires Group Inc.**

A- 9119 West Ipperwash Rd  
 KETTLE AND STONY POINT FN ON  
 N0N 1J1  
 GST/HST Registration No.: 712928407  
 RT0001



# INVOICE

**BILL TO**

Resilient LLP  
 333 Bay Street, Suite 625  
 Toronto ON M5H 2R2

**INVOICE #** 1007**DATE** 10/11/2022**DUE DATE** 10/12/2022**TERMS** Net 30

DATE	DESCRIPTION	QTY	RATE	TAX	AMOUNT
01/05/2022	Prepare intervenor request letter	2	230.00	HST ON	460.00
01/05/2022	Review intervenor request letter	0.25	330.00	HST ON	82.50
05/05/2022	IRP – Review application and evidence	12	230.00	HST ON	2,760.00
06/05/2022	IRP – Review application and evidence	2	330.00	HST ON	660.00
15/05/2022	IRP – Prepare interrogatories	8	230.00	HST ON	1,840.00
15/05/2022	IRP – Senior review of interrogatories	0.50	330.00	HST ON	165.00
03/06/2022	IRP – Call with Resilient LLP re preparing interrogatories	0.50	330.00	HST ON	165.00
06/06/2022	IRP – Call with Resilient LLP re IR strategy and preparation	0.50	230.00	HST ON	115.00
04/07/2022	TCP – Review interrogatory responses	2	230.00	HST ON	460.00
10/07/2022	TCP – Prepare material for technical conference	5	230.00	HST ON	1,150.00

## Bank Info for EFT/ACH Payment

Institute #: 003  
 Transit #: 07372  
 Acct #: 1001502

Please send bank confirmation to above email while you completed EFT/ACH

DATE	DESCRIPTION	QTY	RATE	TAX	AMOUNT
20/07/2022	TCP – Call with Resilient LLP	1	230.00	HST ON	230.00
27/07/2022	TCA – Technical Conference (Day 1)	6	230.00	HST ON	1,380.00
02/08/2022	TCA – Technical Conference (Day 2)	5	230.00	HST ON	1,150.00
03/08/2022	APR – Review technical conference transcript	2	230.00	HST ON	460.00
22/08/2022	APR – Call with Resilient LLP re submission preparation	1	230.00	HST ON	230.00
16/09/2022	APR – Call with Resilient LLP re final argument	1.50	230.00	HST ON	345.00
22/09/2022	APR – Review final argument prepared by Resilient LLP	1	230.00	HST ON	230.00
22/09/2022	APR – Review final argument prepared by Resilient LLP	1	330.00	HST ON	330.00

OEB - Enbridge Dawn to Corunna  
EB-2022-0086

SUBTOTAL	12,212.50
HST (ON) @ 13%	1,587.63
TOTAL	13,800.13
BALANCE DUE	<b>\$13,800.13</b>

#### TAX SUMMARY

RATE	TAX	NET
HST (ON) @ 13%	1,587.63	12,212.50

Bank Info for EFT/ACH Payment

Institute #: 003

Transit #: 07372

Acct #: 1001502

Please send bank confirmation to above email while you completed EFT/ACH

**Daniel Vollmer**

<b>CASE</b>	<b>COST CLAIM</b>	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b>	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b>
EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	Submitted

<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b>	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 993-6338 daniel@resilientllp.com	No		

<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b>	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR</b>	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE</b>	<b>HOURLY RATE</b>
Legal Counsel	2020	1	170

<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b>	<b>LAST CV DATE</b>	<b>HST RATE CHARGED</b>
CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	February 23, 2022	13.00

<b>HEARINGS</b>	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b>	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b>
Yes	No	No

**HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence	2.40	170	408.00	13.00	53.04	461.04
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories	10.90	170	1,853.00	13.00	240.89	2,093.89
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	13.10	170	2,227.00	13.00	289.51	2,516.51
Technical Conference Attendance	4.90	170	833.00	13.00	108.29	941.29
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		170		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	33.40	170	5,678.00	13.00	738.14	6,416.14
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		170		13.00		
With Other Parties		170		13.00		
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
<b>Decision</b>			
Review	170	13.00	
<b>Rate Order</b>			
Review	170	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00	
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>			
Total Service Provider Fees:	10,999.00	1,429.87	12,428.87

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Daniel Vollmer_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf	Time Docket	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Daniel Vollmer_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill number
Time entry	2022.05.31	1.9	IRP - Review application and evidence;	170	\$ 323.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.03	0.3	IRP - Receive instructions from L. DeMarco and D. Richardson re preparing interrogatories;	170	\$ 51.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.06	0.5	IRP - Call with Three Fires Team re IR strategy and preparation;	170	\$ 85.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.06	0.8	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$ 136.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.07	0.4	IRP - Call with J. McGillivray re interrogatories;	170	\$ 68.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.07	1.5	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$ 255.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.08	1.8	IRP - Prepare interrogatories; review interrogatories prepared by IBA Three Fires;	170	\$ 306.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.09	3.1	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$ 527.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.10	2.5	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$ 425.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.06.28	0.9	CMT - Prepare and file declarations and undertakings;	170	\$ 153.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.04	1.6	TCP - Review interrogatory responses;	170	\$ 272.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.07	0.4	TCP - Call with J. McGillivray re technical conference;	170	\$ 68.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.12	0.7	CMT - Prepare notice of intervention re Caldwell First Nation;	170	\$ 119.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.12	0.1	CMT - Review Procedural Order No. 2;	170	\$ 17.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.18	0.9	TCP - Prepare technical conference list of subject areas per J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 153.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.20	1.2	TCP - Attend on call with client;	170	\$ 204.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.20	0.5	TCP - Review evidence and IRRs;	170	\$ 85.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.21	0.2	TCP - Prepare material for Technical Conference per J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 34.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.21	0.6	CMT - Review and revise NOI amendment letters and file re Three Fires Group Inc. and Caldwell First Nation per J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 102.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.25	1.3	TCP - Prepare questions and materials for technical conference per J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 221.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.26	3.5	TCP - Prepare questions and materials for technical conference per J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 595.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.07.27	1.3	TCP - Review and prepare materials for technical conference (Day 2);	170	\$ 221.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.08.02	4.9	TCA - Attend on Technical Conference (Day 2);	170	\$ 833.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.08.03	0.2	APR - Review transcript;	170	\$ 34.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.08.16	0.1	APR - Review application evidence;	170	\$ 17.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.08.18	1.7	APR - Prepare submissions;	170	\$ 289.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.08.22	1	APR - Call with clients re submissions preparation;	170	\$ 170.00	D. Vollmer	22185

Time entry	2022.08.30	0.1	CMT - Review PP letter and Board response letter;	170	\$ 17.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.09	2	APR - Prepare final argument;	170	\$ 340.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.12	7.7	APR - Prepare final argument;	170	\$ 1,309.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.13	1.5	APR - Prepare final argument;	170	\$ 255.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.16	1.6	APR - Call with Three Fires; Caldwell First Nation re final argument;	170	\$ 272.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.19	4.1	APR - Prepare final argument;	170	\$ 697.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.20	1.9	APR - Prepare submissions;	170	\$ 323.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.21	2.7	APR - Prepare submissions;	170	\$ 459.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.22	5.9	APR - Prepare submissions;	170	\$ 1,003.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Time entry	2022.09.23	3.3	APR - Prepare comments;	170	\$ 561.00	D. Vollmer	22185
Total		64.7			\$ 10,999.00		

**Don Richardson**

<b>CASE</b> EB-2022-0086: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2022-0086 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova	<b>INTERVENOR NAME</b> Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	<b>PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS</b> Submitted
--	---	---	--

<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Richardson, Don; +1 (226) 820-5086 don.richardson@threefiresgroup.com	<b>NEW PARTICIPANT</b> No	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME</b>	<b>NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME</b>
---	----------------------------------	---	---

<b>SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE</b> Consultant	<b>YEAR CALLED TO BAR</b>	<b>COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE</b> 30	<b>HOURLY RATE</b> 330
--	---------------------------	--	---------------------------

<b>CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)</b> CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	<b>LAST CV DATE</b> March 09, 2022	<b>HST RATE CHARGED</b> 13.00
---	---------------------------------------	--------------------------------------

<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	<b>CONSULTATIONS</b> No	<b>DISBURSEMENTS</b> No
------------------------	----------------------------	----------------------------

**HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence	0.25	330	82.50	13.00	10.73	93.23
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories	3.00	330	990.00	13.00	128.70	1,118.70
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		330		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	1.00	330	330.00	13.00	42.90	372.90
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		330		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		330		13.00		
With Other Parties		330		13.00		
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						

Preparation of Application for Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	330	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	330	13.00	
<b>Decision</b>			
Review	330	13.00	
<b>Rate Order</b>			
Review	330	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	330	13.00	
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>			
Total Service Provider Fees:	1,402.50	182.33	1,584.83

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Don Richardson_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf	Time Docket	
Invoice 1007 - TFG to Resilient - OEB Cost Claim - Dawn to Corunna.pdf	Invoice	

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Related Disbursement Claim</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Claim Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
Don Richardson_TimeDockets_ThreeFiresGroup_EB-2022-0086.pdf		Time Docket	Hearings	
Invoice 1007 - TFG to Resilient - OEB Cost Claim - Dawn to Corunna.pdf		Invoice	Hearings	

Type	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill Number
Time Entry	2022.05.01	0.25	Review intervenor request letter;	330	82.50	D. Richardson	1007
Time Entry	2022.05.06	2	IRP – Review application and evidence;	330	660.00	D. Richardson	1007
Time Entry	2022.05.15	0.5	IRP – Senior review of interrogatories;	330	165.00	D. Richardson	1007
Time Entry	2022.06.03	0.5	IRP – Call with Resilient LLP re preparing interrogatories;	330	165.00	D. Richardson	1007
Time Entry	2022.09.22	1	APR – Review final argument prepared by Resilient LLP;	330	330.00	D. Richardson	1007
Total		4.25		330	\$1,402.50	D. Richardson	

**Three Fires Group Inc.**

A- 9119 West Ipperwash Rd  
 KETTLE AND STONY POINT FN ON  
 N0N 1J1  
 GST/HST Registration No.: 712928407  
 RT0001



# INVOICE

**BILL TO**

Resilient LLP  
 333 Bay Street, Suite 625  
 Toronto ON M5H 2R2

**INVOICE #** 1007**DATE** 10/11/2022**DUE DATE** 10/12/2022**TERMS** Net 30

DATE	DESCRIPTION	QTY	RATE	TAX	AMOUNT
01/05/2022	Prepare intervenor request letter	2	230.00	HST ON	460.00
01/05/2022	Review intervenor request letter	0.25	330.00	HST ON	82.50
05/05/2022	IRP – Review application and evidence	12	230.00	HST ON	2,760.00
06/05/2022	IRP – Review application and evidence	2	330.00	HST ON	660.00
15/05/2022	IRP – Prepare interrogatories	8	230.00	HST ON	1,840.00
15/05/2022	IRP – Senior review of interrogatories	0.50	330.00	HST ON	165.00
03/06/2022	IRP – Call with Resilient LLP re preparing interrogatories	0.50	330.00	HST ON	165.00
06/06/2022	IRP – Call with Resilient LLP re IR strategy and preparation	0.50	230.00	HST ON	115.00
04/07/2022	TCP – Review interrogatory responses	2	230.00	HST ON	460.00
10/07/2022	TCP – Prepare material for technical conference	5	230.00	HST ON	1,150.00

Bank Info for EFT/ACH Payment

Institute #: 003

Transit #: 07372

Acct #: 1001502

Please send bank confirmation to above email while you completed EFT/ACH

DATE	DESCRIPTION	QTY	RATE	TAX	AMOUNT
20/07/2022	TCP – Call with Resilient LLP	1	230.00	HST ON	230.00
27/07/2022	TCA – Technical Conference (Day 1)	6	230.00	HST ON	1,380.00
02/08/2022	TCA – Technical Conference (Day 2)	5	230.00	HST ON	1,150.00
03/08/2022	APR – Review technical conference transcript	2	230.00	HST ON	460.00
22/08/2022	APR – Call with Resilient LLP re submission preparation	1	230.00	HST ON	230.00
16/09/2022	APR – Call with Resilient LLP re final argument	1.50	230.00	HST ON	345.00
22/09/2022	APR – Review final argument prepared by Resilient LLP	1	230.00	HST ON	230.00
22/09/2022	APR – Review final argument prepared by Resilient LLP	1	330.00	HST ON	330.00

OEB - Enbridge Dawn to Corunna  
EB-2022-0086

SUBTOTAL	12,212.50
HST (ON) @ 13%	1,587.63
TOTAL	13,800.13
BALANCE DUE	<b>\$13,800.13</b>

#### TAX SUMMARY

RATE	TAX	NET
HST (ON) @ 13%	1,587.63	12,212.50

Bank Info for EFT/ACH Payment

Institute #: 003

Transit #: 07372

Acct #: 1001502

Please send bank confirmation to above email while you completed EFT/ACH