

December 5, 2022

### **VIA RESS**

Ontario Energy Board P.O. Box 2319 2300 Yonge Street, 27<sup>th</sup> Floor Toronto, ON M4P 1E4 Attention: Registrar

Dear Ms. Marconi,

#### Re: Enbridge Gas Inc. ("EGI") Multi-Year Demand Side Management Plan (2022-2027) Application Board File No.: EB-2021-0002

We are counsel to the Association of Power Producers of Ontario ("**APPrO**") in the above-noted proceeding (the "**Proceeding**"). Further to the Board's Decision and Order dated November 15, 2022, please find enclosed APPrO's cost claim in respect of the Proceeding.

APPrO respectfully requests an award of 100% of its eligible costs, given its strategic and principled participation in the Proceeding. APPrO submits that this request is supported by the following considerations:

- (a) APPrO participated effectively in the Proceeding, taking a surgical, principled, and coordinated approach to matters related to DSM programming for large volume customers and gas-fired generators, and energy conservation and efficiency and assisted in contributing to the Board's better understanding of such matters;
- (b) APPrO has ensured that it has not requested recovery of costs associated with the attendance of more than one representative at the same time at the oral hearing and notes that the attendance of two representatives on Days 1, 3 and 4 of the oral hearing did not overlap with each other as counsel for APPrO was unable to attend throughout the scheduled time on each of these days and was therefore replaced by another representative to ensure that APPrO was able to fully and effectively participate during the oral hearing;
- (c) APPrO ensured that its participation in the Proceeding was focused on material issues and consistent with the scope of its intervention, as set out in its Notice of Intervention; and
- (d) APPrO participated responsibly and undertook coordination with other intervenors and Board Staff to avoid overlap, maximize efficiency, and ensure that its participation was not unduly repetitive and was focused on relevant and material issues.

DT Vollmer • Bay Adelaide Centre • 333 Bay Street, Suite 625 Toronto, ON M5H 2R2 • +1.647.993.6338 • daniel@resilientllp.com

We trust that this approach maximizes the efficient use of resources and the right of otherwise unrepresented and important EGI customers to be heard in a manner that is consistent with the Board's mandate and statutory objectives.

APPrO respectfully requests a full award of eligible costs.

Sincerely,

in RIVES

DT Vollmer

c. Asha Patel, EGI Dennis O'Leary, Aird & Berlis LLP David Butters, APPrO

# EB-2021-0002 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova

COST CLAIM NUMBER 902	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE December 05, 2022	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2021-0002: Rates: Policy-Related: Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Association of Power Producers of Ontario, Toronto: Cooperative	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY
HST NUMBER 125298802RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

	<u>CIPANTS</u>			Participant
New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Claim Status
No	,	Daube, Nicholas; +1 (416) 768-8341 nicholas@resilientllp.com	1,015.87	Submitted
No	,	DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 (647) 991-1190 lisa@resilientllp.com	1,417.02	Submitted
No	,	McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	883.66	Submitted
No	1	Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 993-6338 daniel@resilientllp.com	7,338.22	Submitted
No	,	McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 jonathan@resilientllp.com	13,410.84	Submitted

## ATTACHMENTS

Attachment APPrO_Cost Claim_CoverLetter_EB_2021-0002_20221205.pdf APPRO EB-2021-0002 Cost Claim 120520221507.pdf	Attachment Date	Participant	Document Type Cover Letter	Claim Type	Import Message			
TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 21,297.00	TOTAL DISBUF	RSEMENTS 0.00			TOTAL HST 2,768.61			
TOTAL CLAIM 24,065.61	TOTAL AMOUN	IT AWARDED						
REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANG	CE - 2		REASC DISALL	ON FOR OWANCE - 3			
MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO Association of Power Producers of Ontario								
SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS PO Box 756 Toronto, ON M5C 2K1				ATTEN	TION			
SUBMIT SECTION I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.								
This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.								
The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.								

SUBMITTED BY Daniel Vollmer DATE SUBMITTED December 05, 2022

January 03, 2023

# Nicholas Daube

	<u>l</u>	NICHOIAS L	Daube	PARTICIPANT
<b>CASE</b> EB-2021-0002: Rates: Policy-Related: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2021-0002 : 1 : Mo Pecnikova	nika	INTERVENOR NAME Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com	CLAIM STATUS Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Daube, Nicholas; +1 (416) 768-8 nicholas@resilientllp.com	8341	NEW PARTICIPANT No	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CAL</b> 2007	LED TO BAR	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 15	HOURLY RATE 290
CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	LAST CV I June 15, 2			HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
<b>HEARINGS</b> Yes	CONSULTA No	ATIONS	DISBURSEMENTS No	

## HEARINGS

Name	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		290		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		290		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		290		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		290		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		290		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	3.10	290	899.00	13.00	116.87	1,015.87
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		290		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		290		13.00		
With Other Parties		290		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		290		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	290	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Decision				
Review	290	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	290	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	290	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	899.00		116.87	1,015.87

### Attachment

NicolasDaube\_TimeDockets\_APPrO\_EB-202 1-0002.pdf Document Type Time Docket

Import Message

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

### Attachment

#### Related Disbursement Claim

NicolasDaube\_Time Dockets\_APPrO\_EB -2021-0002.pdf DocumentTypeClaim TypeTime DocketHearings

Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Bill#
			APR - Revise submissions in coordination with J.				
TimeEntry	05/19/2022	3.1	McGillivray;	290	\$ 899.00	Nicholas Daube	22141
Total		3.1			\$ 899.00		

Nicholas Daube EB-2021-0002 Time Dockets

	Lisa (E	lisabeth) DeMarco	January 03, 2023
<b>CASE</b> EB-2021-0002: Rates: Policy-Related: Enbridge Gas Inc.	COST CLAIM EB-2021-0002 : 1 : Monik Pecnikova	INTERVENOR NAME	PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS Submitted .com
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> DeMarco, Lisa (Elisabeth) ; +1 ( lisa@resilientllp.com	NE 647) 991-1190 No	RTICIPANT PARTICIPANT F. NAME	NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CALLE</b> 1997	ED TO BAR COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS C RELEVANT EXPERIEN 25	
CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	<b>LAST CV DA</b> February 23,	TE	HST RATE CHARGED 13.00
HEARINGS Yes	CONSULTAT No	IONS DISBURSEMENTS No	

January 03, 2023

## HEARINGS

Name	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		330		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	0.50	330	165.00	13.00	21.45	186.45
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		330		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		330		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation	2.10	330	693.00	13.00	90.09	783.09
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	1.20	330	396.00	13.00	51.48	447.48
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		330		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		330		13.00		
With Other Parties		330		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	330	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	330	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	330	13.00		
Decision				
Review	330	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	330	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	330	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	1,254.00		163.02	1,417.02

### Attachment

LisaDeMarco\_TimeDockets\_APPrO\_EB-202 1-0002.pdf Document Type Time Docket

Import Message

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

#### Attachment

#### Related Disbursement Claim

LisaDeMarco\_Time Dockets\_APPrO\_EB -2021-0002.pdf DocumentTypeClaim TypeTime DocketHearings

Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Bill	able (\$)	User	Bill#
			APR - Review and revise draft DSM submissions;					
			Instructions to J. McGillivray re same; Email					
			communications with David Butters re DSM					
TimeEntry	07/06/2021	1.2	submissions;	330	\$	396.00	Lisa DeMarco	21185
			IRP - Communications with client re strategy and					
TimeEntry	10/22/2021	0.5	interrogatories;	330	\$	165.00	Lisa DeMarco	21185
			OHP - Instructions to J. McGillivray re oral hearing					
TimeEntry	03/22/2022	0.4	prep;	330	\$	132.00	Lisa DeMarco	22141
			OHP - Prepare for oral hearing; Modify hearing plan;					
TimeEntry	03/27/2022	1.7	Instructions to J. McGillivray re same;	330	\$	561.00	Lisa DeMarco	22141
Total		3.8			\$	1,254.00		

## Lisa DeMarco EB-2021-0002 Time Dockets

PARTICIPANT INTERVENOR NAME COST CLAIM **CLAIM STATUS** EB-2021-0002: Rates: EB-2021-0002 : 1 : Monika Submitted Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) Pecnikova Policy-Related: Enbridge Gas 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com NON-FILING NEW NON-FILING FILING PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT F. NAME PARTICIPANT L. NAME McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 No jonathan@resilientllp.com

SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2017	COMPLETED YEARS PRACTICING/YEARS OF RELEVANT EXPERIENCE 5	HOURLY RATE 170
CV STATUS (FOR CONSULTANT/ANALYST)	LAST CV DATE	5	HST RATE CHARGED
CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	February 24, 2022		13.00

HEARINGS	CONSULTATIONS	DISBURSEMENTS
Yes	No	No

## HEARINGS

Name	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	HST	Total
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	0.10	170	17.00	13.00	2.21	19.21
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	2.90	170	493.00	13.00	64.09	557.09
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation	0.70	170	119.00	13.00	15.47	134.47
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		170		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	0.90	170	153.00	13.00	19.89	172.89
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		170		13.00		
With Other Parties		170		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Jonathan McGillivray

CASE

Inc.

Preparation of Application for	170	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00		
Decision				
Review	170	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	170	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	782.00		101.66	883.66

## Attachment

Document Type Time Docket

Import Message

Jonathan McGillivray\_170.00H\_TimeDockets\_APPrO\_ EB-2021-0002.pdf

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

#### Attachment

#### Related Disbursement Claim

Jonathan McGillivray\_170.00H \_TimeDockets\_APPr O\_EB-2021-0002.pd f

## Document

TypeClaim TypeTime DocketHearings

Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Bil	lable (\$)	User	Bill#
			APR - Instructions to D. Vollmer re July 6					
TimeEntry	07/05/2021	0.2	submissions;	170	\$	34.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
			APR - Review applications; Review and revise					
TimeEntry	07/06/2021	0.7	July 6 submissions;	170	\$	119.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
			ICP - Instructions to D. Vollmer re submissions					
TimeEntry	07/08/2021	0.2	on draft issues list;	170	\$	34.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
			ICP - Review and revise draft submissions on					
			Issues List and related communications with					
TimeEntry	07/12/2021	0.5	D. Butters;	170	\$	85.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
			IRP - Prepare interrogatories and instructions					
TimeEntry	10/07/2021	1.7	to D. Vollmer re same;	170	\$	289.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
TimeEntry	10/14/2021	1.2	IRP - Review and revise draft interrogatories;	170	\$	204.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
TimeEntry	12/14/2021	0.1	Review PO 6;	170	\$	17.00	Jonathan McGillivray	21185
Total		4.6			\$	782.00		

## Jonathan McGillivray EB-2021-0002 Time Dockets

January 03, 2023

# **Daniel Vollmer**

	<u>-</u>	Banner Volimer	PARTICIPANT
CASE EB-2021-0002: Rates: Policy-Related: Enbridge Gas Inc.	<b>COST CLAIM</b> EB-2021-0002 : 1 : Mon Pecnikova	ika Pecnikova, Monika; 971-6771 monika@r	+1 (647) Submitted
<b>FILING PARTICIPANT</b> Vollmer, Daniel; +1 (647) 993-6 daniel@resilientllp.com	338 F	IEW NON-FILING ARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT F. N Io	NON-FILING IAME PARTICIPANT L. NAME
SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE Legal Counsel	<b>YEAR CAL</b> 2020	LED TO BAR COMPLETED PRACTICING/ RELEVANT E	YEARS OF 170
CV STATUS (FOR			HST RATE
CONSULTANT/ANALYST)	LAST CV D	ATE	CHARGED
CV Provided within Previous 24 Months	February 23	3, 2022	13.00
HEARINGS	CONSULTA	TIONS DISBURSEME	NTS
Yes	No	No	

## **HEARINGS**

<u>Name</u>	Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	1.60	170	272.00	13.00	35.36	307.36
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	12.10	170	2,057.00	13.00	267.41	2,324.41
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	4.90	170	833.00	13.00	108.29	941.29
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation	4.70	170	799.00	13.00	103.87	902.87
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		170		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation	2.30	170	391.00	13.00	50.83	441.83
Attendance at Oral Hearing	5.00	170	850.00	13.00	110.50	960.50
Submissions						
Written Submissions	7.60	170	1,292.00	13.00	167.96	1,459.96
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		170		13.00		
With Other Parties		170		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	170	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00		
Decision				
Review	170	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	170	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	6,494.00		844.22	7,338.22

### Attachment

DanielVollmer\_TimeDockets\_APPrO\_EB-202 1-0002.pdf Document Type Time Docket

Import Message

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

## Attachment

#### Related Disbursement Claim

DanielVollmer\_Time Dockets\_APPrO\_EB -2021-0002.pdf DocumentTypeClaim TypeTime DocketHearings

Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billa	ble (\$)	User	Bill#
TimeEntry	06/23/2021	0.3	Review PO No.2 re EB-2021-0002;	170	\$	51.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
			APR - Review PO1 and prepare submissions re re					
			Enbridge's request for approval of "Enbridge Gas's					
TimeEntry	06/28/2021	0.1	2022 DSM program year plan";	170	\$	17.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
			APR - Prepare submissions re Enbridge's request for					
			approval of "Enbridge Gas's 2022 DSM program year					
TimeEntry	06/29/2021	0.1	plan";	170	\$	17.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	07/05/2021	2.5	APR - Review Application; Prepare draft submissions;	170	\$	425.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	07/06/2021	2.5	APR - Prepare submissions;	170	\$	425.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	07/09/2021	2	ICP - Prepare submissions on Issues List;	170	\$	340.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
			ICP - Prepare submissions on draft Issues List per J.					
TimeEntry	07/12/2021		McGillivray;	170		119.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	07/19/2021	2	ICP - Review submissions on draft Issues List;	170	\$	340.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
			Review Applicant's reply submissions re draft Issues					
	07/22/2021	1	List;	170	\$	170.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
-	10/07/2021	0.5	IRP - Call with J. McGillivray re interrogatories;	170	\$	85.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	10/07/2021	1.3	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$	221.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	10/08/2021	2.6	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$	442.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
TimeEntry	10/12/2021	3.7	IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170	\$	629.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
			IRP - Prepare interrogatories; Communications with J.					
	10/13/2021	0.3	McGillivray re same;	170		51.00	Daniel Vollmer	
TimeEntry	10/14/2021	0.1	IRP - Review draft interrogatories;	170	\$	17.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
-	10/22/2021		IRP - Prepare interrogatories;	170		51.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
,	12/06/2021	0.5	TCP - Review IRRs;	170	•	85.00	Daniel Vollmer	21185
	12/14/2021		Review Procedural Order NO. 6;	170			Daniel Vollmer	21185
	12/15/2021		IRP - Review evidence;	170	•		Daniel Vollmer	21185
	02/01/2022		IRP - Review reply evidence;	170		153.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
	02/06/2022	0.4	IRP - Review reply evidence;	170		68.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	02/07/2022	1	IRP - Review reply evidence;	170	\$	170.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141

## Daniel Vollmer EB-2021-0002 Time Dockets

Total		38.2			\$ 6,494.00		
TimeEntry	05/19/2022	1.9	argument;	170	\$ 323.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
			APR - Assist J. McGillivray with preparing final				
TimeEntry	05/18/2022	0.5	APR - Prepare final submissions;	170	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	03/31/2022	2.5	OHA - Attend on hearing (Day 4);	170	\$ 425.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	03/30/2022	2	absence;	170	\$ 340.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
			OHA - Attend on hearing (Day 3) during J. McGillivray				
TimeEntry	03/28/2022	0.5	absence;	170	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
			OHA - Attend on hearing (Day 1) during J. McGillivray				
TimeEntry	03/28/2022	0.8	OHP - Review evidence per J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 136.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	03/22/2022	1	OHP - Hearing preparation;	170	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	03/08/2022	0.5	responses;	170	\$ 85.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
			OHP - Review technical conference transcript and				
TimeEntry	02/28/2022	1.4	TCP - assist J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 238.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	02/25/2022	1	TCP - Technical Conference Preparation;	170	\$ 170.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
TimeEntry	02/24/2022	2	instructions from J. McGillivray;	170	\$ 340.00	Daniel Vollmer	22141
			TCP - Preparations for technical conference per				

January 03, 2023 Jonathan McGillivray PARTICIPANT COST CLAIM INTERVENOR NAME **CLAIM STATUS** CASE EB-2021-0002 : 1 : Monika Pecnikova, Monika; +1 (647) EB-2021-0002: Rates: Submitted Policy-Related: Enbridge Gas Pecnikova 971-6771 monika@resilientllp.com NEW **NON-FILING** NON-FILING FILING PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT **PARTICIPANT F. NAME** PARTICIPANT L. NAME McGillivray, Jonathan; +1 (647) 208-2677 No jonathan@resilientllp.com SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS** HOURLY RATE Legal Counsel 2017 PRACTICING/YEARS OF 230 **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 6 CV STATUS (FOR HST RATE CONSULTANT/ANALYST) LAST CV DATE CHARGED CV Provided within Previous 24 February 24, 2022 13.00 Months

HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS No No Yes

### **HEARINGS**

Inc.

Name	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	HST	Total
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	0.50	230	115.00	13.00	14.95	129.95
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	0.20	230	46.00	13.00	5.98	51.98
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	4.60	230	1,058.00	13.00	137.54	1,195.54
Technical Conference Attendance	9.10	230	2,093.00	13.00	272.09	2,365.09
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		230		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation	10.70	230	2,461.00	13.00	319.93	2,780.93
Attendance at Oral Hearing	10.60	230	2,438.00	13.00	316.94	2,754.94
Submissions						
Written Submissions	15.20	230	3,496.00	13.00	454.48	3,950.48
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance	0.10	230	23.00	13.00	2.99	25.99
Communication						
With Client		230		13.00		
With Other Parties	0.60	230	138.00	13.00	17.94	155.94
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	230	13.00	
Confidentiality			
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Decision			
Review	230	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	230	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	11,868.00	1	1,542.84 13,410.84

### **Attachment**

JonathanMcGillivray\_230.00H\_TimeDockets \_APPrO\_EB-2021-0002.pdf Document Type Time Docket

Import Message

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

#### <u>Attachment</u>

#### Related Disbursement Claim

JonathanMcGillivray \_230.00H\_TimeDoc kets\_APPrO\_EB-20 21-0002.pdf DocumentTypeClaim TypeTime DocketHearings

Туре	Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)		able (\$)	User	Bill#
			IRP - Review Enbridge reply evidence and					
			consider requirement for interrogatories on					
TimeEntry	02/08/2022	0.2	same;	230	\$	46.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	02/22/2022	0.4	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	230	\$	92.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
			TCP - Prepare for technical conference;					
TimeEntry	02/23/2022	1.3	Instructions to D. Vollmer;	230	\$	299.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	02/25/2022	1.1	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	230	\$	253.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	02/27/2022	1.8	TCP - Prepare for technical conference;	230	\$	414.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	02/28/2022	3	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 1);	230	\$	690.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	03/01/2022	3	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 2);	230	\$	690.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	03/02/2022	3.1	TCA - Attend on technical conference (Day 3);	230	\$	713.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
			OCA - Communications with client re					
TimeEntry	03/02/2022	0.1	Presentation Day;	230	\$	23.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	03/21/2022	0.3	OHP - Prepare for oral hearing;	230	\$	69.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
			OHP - Instructions from L. DeMarco re oral					
TimeEntry	03/22/2022	0.5	hearing prep;	230		115.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
-	03/23/2022		OHP - Prepare for oral hearing;	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
-	03/24/2022		OHP - Prepare for oral hearing; Review emails;	230		46.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	03/25/2022	0.2	OHP - Prepare for oral hearing; Review emails;	230	\$	46.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
			OHP - Prepare for oral hearing; Prepare and file					
-	03/26/2022		compendium;	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
-	03/27/2022		OHP - Prepare for oral hearing;	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
-	03/28/2022		OHA - Attend on oral hearing (Day 1);	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
· · · · ·	03/29/2022		OHA - Attend on oral hearing (Day 2);	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
	03/30/2022		OHA - Attend on oral hearing (Day 3);	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
	03/31/2022		OHA - Attend on oral hearing (Day 4);	230		368.00	,	22141
	04/01/2022		OHA - Attend on oral hearing (Day 5);	230	-	782.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
	04/11/2022		Review OEB correspondence;	230		69.00	/	22141
,	04/19/2022		APR - Review undertaking responses;	230			Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	04/21/2022	0.5	Review correspondence and board decision;	230	\$	115.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141

## Jonathan McGillivray EB-2021-0002 Time Dockets

Total		51.6			\$ 11,868.00		
Innechtry	05/19/2022	5.8		230	Ş 1,334.00		22141
TimoEntry	05 /10 /2022	го	APR - Prepare argument; Communications with N. Daube;	230	¢ 1 224 00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	05/18/2022	7.2	APR - Prepare argument;	230	\$ 1,656.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	05/16/2022	1.1	L. DeMarco re same;	230	\$ 253.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
			APR - Prepare argument and instructions from				
TimeEntry	05/12/2022	0.2	prep;	230	\$ 46.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
			APR - Instructions to D. Vollmer re argument				
TimeEntry	04/28/2022	0.1	Review Board correspondence;	230	\$ 23.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	04/25/2022	0.1	Review Enbridge correspondence;	230	\$ 23.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141
TimeEntry	04/22/2022	0.1	Review Enbridge correspondence;	230	Ş 23.00	Jonathan McGillivray	22141