# EB-2022-0140:1: Quinn Ross

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE CLAIM STATUS
882 December 01, 2022 Approved by Finance

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #\*

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave to Construct

(New): Hydro One Networks Inc.

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

qmross@rossfirm.com

INTERVENOR COMPANY\*

The Ross Firm Professional INTERVENOR TYPE

Corporation, Goderich: Corporation Other

HST RATE ONTARIO EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

13.00

No

No

**INTERVENOR** 

HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

834918013 RT0001 Yes December 15, 2022

#### **PARTICIPANTS Participant** Total (\$) Claim Status New Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name **Filing Participant** No 9,028.70 Submitted Bondarenko, Oleksandr (Alex); +1 (519) 524-5532 abonderanko@rossfirm.com 5,940.00 Submitted No Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com No Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 279.00 Submitted qmross@rossfirm.com 1,796.70 Submitted No Horn, Dan; +1 (519) 524-5532 dhorn@rossfirm.com 23,110.76 Submitted No Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com 7,147.25 Submitted No Merjane, Lara; +1 (519) 524-5532 lmerjane@rossfirm.com No Cohen, Eli; +1 (519) 524-5532 524.32 Submitted emcohen@rossfirm.com 15,156.69 Submitted No Kellow, Meryam; +1 (519) 955-7440 mkellow@rossfirm.com No Otten, Nadine; +1 (519) 524-5532 8,529.24 Submitted notten@rossfirm.com 113.00 Submitted No Baroudi-Ginn, Dunya; +1 (519) 524-5532 dunya@rossfirm.com

<u>ATTACHMENTS</u>					
Attachment	Attachment Date	Participant	Document Type	Claim Type	Import Message
EB-2022-0140_RFG_Cost Submissions.pdf			Cost Claim		
nvoice_16968 (1).pdf			Invoice		
Cost Claim for Hearing Form (1).pdf			Cost Claim		
ROSS EB-2022-0140 Cost Claim 121320221359.pdf					

qmross@rossfirm.com

dlandry@rossfirm.com

Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532

Landry, Danielle; +1 (519) 524-5532

160.00 Submitted

181.93 Submitted

EB-2022-0140:1: Quinn Ross

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE CLAIM STATUS
882 December 01, 2022 Approved by Finance

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #\*

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave to Construct

(New): Hydro One Networks Inc.

INTERVENOR INTERVENOR COMPANY\*

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

The Ross Firm Professional
INTERVENOR TYPE
Corporation Goderich: Corporation
Other

qmross@rossfirm.com Corporation, Goderich: Corporation

HST RATE ONTARIO EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

13.00

HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

834918013 RT0001 Yes December 15, 2022

PARTICIPANTS .								
New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Participant Claim Status				
No	,	Bondarenko, Oleksandr (Alex); +1 (519) 524-5532 abonderanko@rossfirm.com		Submitted				
No	,	Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	5,940.00	Submitted				
No	,	Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	279.00	Submitted				
No	,	Horn, Dan; +1 (519) 524-5532 dhorn@rossfirm.com	1,796.70	Submitted				
No	y	Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	23,110.76	Submitted				
No	,	Merjane, Lara; +1 (519) 524-5532 Imerjane@rossfirm.com	7,147.25	Submitted				
No	y	Cohen, Eli; +1 (519) 524-5532 emcohen@rossfirm.com	524.32	Submitted				
No	,	Kellow, Meryam; +1 (519) 955-7440 mkellow@rossfirm.com	15,156.69	Submitted				
No	,	Otten, Nadine; +1 (519) 524-5532 notten@rossfirm.com	8,529.24	Submitted				
No	,	Baroudi-Ginn, Dunya; +1 (519) 524-5532 dunya@rossfirm.com	113.00	Submitted				
No	,	Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	160.00	Submitted				
No	j	Landry, Danielle; +1 (519) 524-5532 dlandry@rossfirm.com	181.93	Submitted				
TOTA	AL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 63,922.00	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 500.00	ד	OTAL HST 7,545.59				
тот	AL CLAIM 71,967.59	TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED						
	SON FOR ALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2	REASON F DISALLOW	_				

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS ATTENTION

144 Courthouse Square

Suite 100 Goderich, ON

N7A1M9

SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

# EB-2022-0140:1: Quinn Ross

COST CLAIM NUMBER SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE CLAIM STATUS
882 December 01, 2022 Approved by Finance

EB# OTHER EB#S PHASE #\*

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave to Construct

(New): Hydro One Networks Inc.

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

INTERVENOR COMPANY\*

The Ross Firm Professional INTERVENOR TYPE

Corporation, Goderich: Corporation Other

HST RATE ONTARIO EXCHANGE RATE COUNTRY

13.00

INTERVENOR

SUBMITTED BY

Quinn Ross

qmross@rossfirm.com

HST NUMBER LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

834918013 RT0001 Yes December 15, 2022

PARTI	CIPANTS			
New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Bondarenko, Oleksandr (Alex); +1 (519) 524-5532 abonderanko@rossfirm.com		Submitted
No	,	Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	5,940.00	Submitted
No	,	Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 gmross@rossfirm.com	279.00	Submitted
No	,	Horn, Dan; +1 (519) 524-5532 dhorn@rossfirm.com	1,796.70	Submitted
No	,	Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	23,110.76	Submitted
No	,	Merjane, Lara; +1 (519) 524-5532 Imerjane@rossfirm.com	7,147.25	Submitted
No	,	Cohen, Eli; +1 (519) 524-5532 emcohen@rossfirm.com	524.32	Submitted
No	,	Kellow, Meryam; +1 (519) 955-7440 mkellow@rossfirm.com	15,156.69	Submitted
No	,	Otten, Nadine; +1 (519) 524-5532 notten@rossfirm.com	8,529.24	Submitted
No	,	Baroudi-Ginn, Dunya; +1 (519) 524-5532 dunya@rossfirm.com	113.00	Submitted
No	,	Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com	160.00	Submitted
No	,	Landry, Danielle; +1 (519) 524-5532 dlandry@rossfirm.com	181.93	Submitted

DATE SUBMITTED

December 13, 2022

# Oleksandr (Alex) Bondarenko

**COST CLAIM** CASE

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

INTERVENOR NAME

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Submitted

**NEW NON-FILING** FILING PARTICIPANT

Bondarenko, Oleksandr (Alex); +1 (519) 524-5532 abonderanko@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT** No

**PARTICIPANT F. NAME** 

**NON-FILING** PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS HOURLY RATE** 

Legal Counsel 2019 PRACTICING/YEARS OF 170

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

3

CV STATUS (FOR **HST RATE** CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE CHARGED CV** Required 13.00

**HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS** 

Yes No Yes

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	10.00	170	1,700.00	13.00	221.00	1,921.00
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		170		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	7.80	170	1,326.00	13.00	172.38	1,498.38
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		170		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	5.30	170	901.00	13.00	117.13	1,018.13
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	3.60	170	612.00	13.00	79.56	691.56
With Other Parties	7.60	170	1,292.00	13.00	167.96	1,459.96
Motions			,			,
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	11.20	170	1,904.00	13.00	247.52	2,151.52
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170	•	13.00		•
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		170		13.00		
Decision						
Review	1.50	170	255.00	13.00	33.15	288.15
Rate Order						
Review		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees						
Total Service Provider Fees:			7,990.00		1,038.70	9,028.70

**Attachments** 

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

AB Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

AtchmntAtchmntQtyCost/NetHSTOtherRationale/NameRequiredProvidedUnitCostRateHSTTaxes/TipTotalComment

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
AB Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Claim Type Import Message

Date Hours	. Description	Pate (\$)	Billable (\$) User Category	Subcategory
Date Hours	TO prepare for landowner meeting; TO meeting with landowner group and Quinn to provide general and	Rate (\$)	Category	Subcategory
6/2/2022	specific updates and answering questions as to process and next steps; TO taking notes of meeting updates 2.5 and questions from landowners to be answered	170	425 Oleksandr Communication	With client
- /- /	TO incoming email from Quinn re independent appraisals; TO outgoing email to Quinn, Dunya and appraiser;			
6/2/2022 6/6/2022	O.3 TO asking Dunya to advise on status of client lists and receipt of update     TO incoming email from OEB and review of notice of application re s.92; TO review HONI evidence	170 170		With Other Parties Review Application and Evidence
0/0/2022	TO incoming emails with Order in council and notice for evidence disclosure on application to OEB; TO review	170	ooo oleksandi newew Application and Evidence	neview Application and Evidence
6/14/2022	1 other intervenor letters	170		Preparation
6/13/2022	0.5 TO review our OEB intervenor letter and provide comments 0.5 TO review incoming order from OEB	170 170		Preparation
7/13/2022	To meeting with Quinn, Lara, and Nadine to review and discuss outcome of and actionables arising out of in-	170	85 Oleksandr(Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence
7/19/2022	1.3 person meeting with landowners and making plan for interrogatories with respect to OEB hearing.	170	221 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
	TO incoming email from Lara and Nadine with landowner update notes on OEB order and to receipt of			
7/20/2022 7/19/2022	0.3 instructions for interrogatories on ESR  1 TO review draft ESR and OEB order and receive instructions from Quinn on drafting interrogatories	170 170		With Other Parties Preparation
7/19/2022	TO meeting with Quinn, Lara, Nadine and Meryam to discuss and review leave to construct record and	1/0	170 Oleksandr/Intervenor Evidence	Preparation
7/27/2022	1 evidence; TO discuss amendments to and review interrogatories	170	170 Oleksandr (Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence
	TO review draft ESR in detail; TO review OEB rules of procedure; TO review issues list; TO review notes from			
7/26/2022	2 Tom Storey to be used in interrogatories and Motion TO incoming and outgoing emails re OEB hearing and upcoming meeting with HONI executives and	170	340 Oleksandr Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence
8/2/2022	0.6 landowners; TO communication with Dunya re upcoming landowner meeting	170	102 Oleksandr/Communication	With Other Parties
8/10/2022	1 TO research, providing comments on and reviewing draft motion	170		Preparation of Motion Materials
	TO research OEB and divisional court cases for motion; TO review team research results; TO amending draft			
8/9/2022	3.2 motion; TO review OEB order; TO review application evidence; TO review draft ESR TO conducting case law research on procedural fairness and natural justice for Motion; TO reviewing OEB rules	170	544 Oleksandr (Motions	Preparation of Motion Materials
8/8/2022	3 of procedure; TO review OEB orders on project; TO review draft motion	170	510 Oleksandr(Motions	Preparation of Motion Materials
8/16/2022	0.5 TO giving Meryam direction on final ESR request; TO meeting with corporate team re motion and next steps	170	85 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
8/16/2022	TO outgoing email to Gary regarding including EAA and OA conditions to agreements; TO discussing EAA and	170	85 Oleksandri Communication	with Other Parties
8/24/2022	0.5 OA agreements and client meetings with Lara, Nadine and Meryam;	170	85 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
	TO review and amend motion; TO drafting BOA; TO review HONI application materials and OEB orders and			
8/25/2022 8/26/2022	0.6 determination on hearing; 0.9 TO review final draft of motion; TO review BOA; TO review OEB documents from application for BOA	170 170		Preparation of Motion Materials Preparation of Motion Materials
8/20/2022	TO review draft update to landowner group re Motion and procedural orders; TO draft email to landowner	1/0	155 Oleksandr (Wotlons	Preparation of Motion Materials
9/2/2022	0.5 group	170	85 Oleksandr(Communication	With Client
	TO review further procedural order from OEB; TO review draft ESR and HONI application evidence; TO drafting			
8/29/2022	2 further interrogatories TO review procedural orders, motion materials and draft email from Meryam to landowners; TO	170	340 Oleksandr Intervenor Evidence	Preparation
9/7/2022	0.6 communication and emails with team on interrogatories and procedural orders	170	102 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
	TO communication with team on status of OEB application, landowner updates and general updates on client			
9/12/2022	0.3 files for status and next steps	170 170		With Other Parties
9/26/2022	0.5 TO review interrogatories filed by intervenors; TO review procedural order 4  TO emails from Quinn on research questions for arguments to OEB; TO communication with team assigning	170	85 Oleksandr(Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence
9/30/2022	0.2 topics	170	34 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
10/6/2022	0.7 TO review TRF argument to OEB and provide comments	170		Written Submissions
10/5/2022	0.6 TO review Dan's memo and further research on jurisdiction issue for argument TO review HONI argument in chief; TO research case law on OEB jurisdiction on s.96.1 and OIC; TO review bill	170	102 Oleksandr(Submissions	Written Submissions
	112 Hansard; TO review cases for argument responding to HONI application; TO review OEB Act; TO providing			
10/3/2022	4 research memo to Quinn for drafting arguments	170	680 Oleksandr(Submissions	Written Submissions
10/25/2022 11/25/2022	0.5 To meeting with Nadine, Meryam and Lara to review files and landowners issues re LACP offer and appraisals 1.5 TO review OEB decision and order	170 170		With Other Parties Review
11/25/2022	TO review draft motion and Quinn's instructions on filing; TO set tasks for BOA and draft motion in team; TO	170	255 Oleksandi (Decision	review
8/24/2022	2 review OEB orders and HONI application materials; TO drafting motion documents and BOA	170	340 Oleksandr(Motions	Preparation of Motion Materials
- / /	TO incoming and outgoing emails and calls with team working on motion and BOA; TO incoming emails from			
8/25/2022	0.6 Quinn and Elli with instructions TO call with Meryam to provide direction on motion record and BOA amendments; TO provide update on	170	102 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
8/26/2022	0.5 status of motion to Lara;	170	85 Oleksandr(Motions	Preparation of Motion Materials
	TO incoming emails from Ed Brill expert re interrogatories; TO call Ed Brill; TO communication with team on			
8/29/2022	further interrogatories due Sep 2; TO outgoing email to Quinn for direction TO incoming email from Quinn; To 1 outgoing email to Ed Brill responding to question on further interrogatories due Sep 2	170	170 Oleksandr(Intervenor Evidence	Preparation
9/1/2022	0.5 TO review of motion materials and procedural orders from OEB for drafting further interrogatories	170		Preparation
-, -,	TO communication with Dunya on draft email to landowners and OEB re intervenor status; TO outgoing email			
6/13/2022	0.5 to OEB enclosing intervenor letter	170	85 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
8/8/2022	TO team meeting assigning tasks for motion drafting and research projects; TO emails and communication 0.5 with team re motion and research	170	85 Oleksandr(Communication	With Other Parties
0/0/2022	TO team meeting and exchanging emails with instructions and findings; TO communicating with Quinn for	1/0	. 55 Oleksandi (Communication	with Other Falties
8/9/2022	0.4 instructions;	170	68 Oleksandr/Communication	With Other Parties
6/6/2022	TO outgoing email to Dunya and Quinn; TO communication with Dunya re notice and email to landowners for	,	or obligation to the	With Other Burther
6/6/2022 7/6/2022	0.5 appraisal and update to application 0.6 TO meeting with Carol Verstraete & Louis Roesch from OFA to discuss landowners concerns	170 170		With Other Parties With Clients
.,0,2022	TO meeting with Quinn, Lara, Meryam, and Nadine to review ESR and first procedural order; TO discuss	1/0		The circus
7/21/2022	0.8 interrogatories and receive instructions for drafting same	170		Preparation
9/9/2022 9/20/2022	1 To review procedural Order 3 and drafting further interrogatories	170 170		Preparation
9/20/2022	2 TO review HONI response to interrogatories	170	340 Oleksandr(Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence

47 7990

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Sum of Billable (\$)
Communication	11.2	1904
With client	3	510
With Clients	0.6	102
With Other Parties	7.6	1292
Decision	1.5	255
Review	1.5	255
Intervenor Evidence	7.8	1326
Preparation	5.3	901
Preparation	2.5	425
Motions	11.2	1904
Preparation of Motion Materials	11.2	1904
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>	10	1700
Review Application and Evidence	10	1700
Submissions	5.3	901
Written Submissions	5.3	901
Grand Total	47	7990

# **Edward Brill**

CASE **COST CLAIM** 

**INTERVENOR NAME** EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

qmross@rossfirm.com

Networks Inc.

FILING PARTICIPANT

Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532

to Construct (New): Hydro One

qmross@rossfirm.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** No

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME** 

**NON-FILING** 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**HOURLY RATE** 

**HST RATE** 

**CHARGED** 

0.00

330

**PARTICIPANT** 

Submitted

**CLAIM STATUS** 

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

Consultant

**COMPLETED YEARS** 

PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

33

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Attached

**LAST CV DATE** December 01, 2022

**CONSULTATIONS** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

**HEARINGS** Yes

No

No

Н	E/	<del>۱</del> ۲	Ν	IGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Sub Total</b>	<b>HST Rate</b>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		330		0.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		330		0.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		0.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		330		0.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		330		0.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		330		0.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		330		0.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		0.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	18.00	330	5,940.00	0.00		5,940.00
Interrogatory Responses		330		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		330		0.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		330		0.00		
Attendance		330		0.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		0.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		0.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		330		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		0.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		330		0.00		
Oral Submissions		330		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		0.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		330		0.00		
Communication						
With Client		330		0.00		
With Other Parties		330		0.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		0.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	330	0.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	330	0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	330	0.00		
Decision				
Review	330	0.00		
Rate Order				
Review	330	0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	330	0.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	5.940.00	)	0.00	5.940.00

# **Attachments**

**Attachment Document Type Import Message** 

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf Brill CV.pdf

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366

4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf

CV Time Docket

Invoice

# Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

**Document Attachment Related Disbursement Claim** Claim Type **Type Import Message** 2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. Invoice Hearings invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf Brill CV.pdf CV Hearings 2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. Time Docke Hearings invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

**CURRENT CHARGES** – S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Professional Services \$ 6,379.00 Expenses 0.00

0.00

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

### Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

<b>Professional Services:</b>		Hours	Amount
Brill, Edward			
08/09/22	Review Discovery Documents	3.50	1,155.00
08/09/22	Review Documents & Photos	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Report Preparation	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Client Contact	0.50	165.00
08/29/22	Review Documents & Photos	3.00	990.00
08/31/22	Report Preparation	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Technical Review	0.50	160.00
07/07/22	Project File Management - Coordination of file material received.	1.00	90.00
08/11/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the summary report.	1.60	144.00
09/02/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the report.	0.50	45.00
	Total Professional Services	21.60	\$ 6,379.00

Total This Invoice:	Amount

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

Page 1 of 1



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

**CURRENT CHARGES** – S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Professional Services \$ 6,379.00 Expenses 0.00

0.00

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

### Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

<b>Professional Services:</b>		Hours	Amount
Brill, Edward			
08/09/22	Review Discovery Documents	3.50	1,155.00
08/09/22	Review Documents & Photos	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Report Preparation	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Client Contact	0.50	165.00
08/29/22	Review Documents & Photos	3.00	990.00
08/31/22	Report Preparation	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Technical Review	0.50	160.00
07/07/22	Project File Management - Coordination of file material received.	1.00	90.00
08/11/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the summary report.	1.60	144.00
09/02/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the report.	0.50	45.00
	Total Professional Services	21.60	\$ 6,379.00

Total This Invoice:	Amount

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

Page 1 of 1



5410 N.W. 33<sup>rd</sup> Ave., Ste.100 Ft. Lauderdale, Florida 33309 954.777.4790 • 888.771.0591 Fax 954.777.4793 www.SEAlimited.com

Boca Raton, Florida

Dayton, Tennessee

# Edward R. Brill, P.E., CFEI

ebrill@SEAlimited.com

### **Education**

Florida Atlantic University
Bachelor of Science
Electrical Engineering
1987

Bryan College
Bachelor of Science
Business Administration
1983

United States Naval Academy 1979 -1981

**Experience** 

Senior Electrical Engineer

SEA, Ltd.

SEA, Ltd.

**Senior Project Engineer** 

2020 to January 2021

Annapolis, Maryland

Fort Lauderdale, Florida

2015 to 2019

Fort Lauderdale, Florida

Project Engineer 2003 to 2015

SEA, Ltd. Fort Lauderdale, Florida

Investigates electrical accidents and determines causation in liability, property, and personal injury claims. Specialized in the following areas: performs investigations relating to electrical design and construction defects; structural and marine fire analysis; electric shock and electrocution; arc flash and electrical worker accidents, including arc flash assessments and utility line worker accidents; lightning damage analysis and validity; illumination (lighting) studies, including slip/trip-and-fall evaluations; identifies product failures and deficiencies, including household appliances, commercial equipment, and industrial machinery; evaluates product adherence to mandatory standards and industry guidelines; proper handling of evidence and chain-of-custody preservation; field and laboratory testing, including nondestructive techniques and product reliability.

## **Senior Power Quality Business Manager**

1998 to 2003

Florida Power & Light

Juno Beach, Florida

Responsible for developing products and services for commercial and industrial customers that met their needs for improved power quality and reliability to their operations and facilities. Developed a power monitoring service, with a budget of over \$4 million.

Developed power quality related services to help customers solve power quality problems through mitigation equipment, as well as tools and techniques to desensitize electronic equipment from power quality disturbances. Supported six Power Quality Engineers around the state for equipment, job and safety training, Personal Protective Equipment (PPE), and consulting needs with power quality issues affecting customers. Coordinated and taught FPL's Power Quality Seminar to Professional Engineers, Electrical Contractors, and Electricians around the state and obtained Professional Engineering Continuation Education approval through the Florida Board of Professional Engineers.

## **Power Quality Engineer**

1988 to 1998

Florida Power & Light

Juno Beach, Florida

Responsible for developing, planning, and coordinating FPL's Power Quality Program. Performed analysis at over 1,000 residential/commercial/industrial customers' facilities to solve power quality problems affecting customers' equipment and operations by responding to complaints and coordinating remedies. Analysis included site inspection of wiring and grounding installations, monitoring and data analysis, and written reports presenting recommendations to improve performance of systems.

Analyzed, inspected, and monitored high- and low-voltage electrical power equipment (e.g., switchgear, transfer switches, power lines, transformers) to determine the cause of failures or malfunctions in the operation. Analyzed facilities and equipment for damage due to lightning. Determined path of entry and made recommendations for protection to minimize exposure to future events. Investigated grounding and wiring for faults and malfunctions that caused electrical shock or electrocution. Testified as expert witness for Regulatory Affairs before the Florida Public Service Commission. Nationally recognized expert in the power quality field and has published and presented numerous papers. Assisted in the development of the Power Quality Group Safety Program. Qualified as Extendo Stick operator for storm restoration team. Selected to be trained for lineman skills.

### **Construction Service Engineer**

1987 to 1988

Florida Power & Light

Delray Beach, Florida

Responsible for the engineering design and layout and project management of FPL's electrical system for new and existing construction. This included large underground subdivisions, commercial and industrial projects, street lighting, road widening, metering. Coordination with developers, residential, commercial and industrial customers, electrical engineers, electrical contractors, builders, and building officials. Training in areas of project management and design, load and voltage calculation, overhead and underground construction, including cable splicing, transformer installation, pole climbing, pole setting, pole framing, primary and secondary conductor installation, and safety/PPE training. Worked with overhead and underground lineman/cable splicer crews as project manager to deal with field issues and design changes during construction.

# **Engineering Support**

1986

Florida Power & Light

Delray Beach, Florida

Responsible for engineering and design of projects including, roadway lighting, recloser and capacitor bank installations, traffic signalization powering, overhead and underground relocations for road widening projects.

Marketing 1985

Florida Power & Light

West Palm Beach, Florida

Responsible for conducting home and business energy surveys to identify area of energy savings to meet FPL's energy conservation goals. These areas included air-conditioning /heating assessments, window treatments, insulation levels, high efficient appliances, and building envelope analysis.

# **Engineering Planning-**

1985

Florida Power & Light

West Palm Beach, Florida

Responsible for conducting analysis of street lighting and designing roadway lighting projects to meet county and state roadway lighting requirements. Conducted fault current analysis of recloser fault current protection. Designed projects to add/move recloser devices to coordinate fault current levels on FPL's distribution system. Conducted load and growth analysis of FPL's distribution system in the West Palm Beach area for substation and system load planning and growth forecasting.

### **Storm Patrolman/Area Coordinator**

1983 to 2003

Florida Power & Light

Various Locations

Participated in yearly storm patrol duties and training exercises. Coordinated engineers to patrol feeders after storms for storm season assignments. Participated in dry run exercises to simulate storm damage, assessment and restoration. Participated in regular Safety/PPE training, worked directly with FPL lineman crews, contractors and foreign crews on overhead line restoration and repairs. Assigned to storm areas around Florida during storm events.

### **Customer Service/Meter Reading Group**

1983 to 1985

Florida Power & Light

Delray Beach, Florida

### Certifications

Certified Fire and Explosion Investigator (CFEI)
American Boat & Yacht Council, Certification No. EC217251205

# **Professional Registration**

State of Florida, License No. 45819 State of North Carolina, License No. 035129 State of South Carolina, License No. 26941 State of Texas, License No. 117717

### **Publications**

"Harmonic Distortion Issues with Energy Conservation Devices," Edward R. Brill, Power Quality Application Conference in Proceedings of the 1992 Power Quality Application Conference, Electric Power Research Institute, Atlanta, Georgia, 1992

"Power Problem Avoidance for Industrial Plants Utilizing a Digital Transfer Switch," Edward R. Brill, Richard Lopez, Conference Proceedings of Power Quality '98 Conference, Santa Clara, California, November 1998

"Smart Meters: Reporting What, When, and How Much," Edward R. Brill, *Power Quality Magazine*, p. 8-12, a Primedia publication, December 2001

### **Professional Affiliations**

Institute of Electrical and Electronic Engineers (IEEE) National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) International Association of Arson Investigators (IAAI) National Association of Fire Investigators (NAFI) International Association of Marine Investigators (IAMI)

### **Seminars and Additional Education**

- 1989 EPRI Power Quality Analysis Course, St. Louis, Missouri
- 1991 Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International Conference on Power Quality, San Francisco, California
- 1992 Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International Conference on Power Quality, Atlanta, Georgia
- 1993 Electric 93 Conference, Atlanta, Georgia
- 1994 Electric 94 Conference, New York City, New York
- 1995 National Conference on Harmonics and Power Quality, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania
- 1995 Electric 95 Conference, Atlanta, Georgia
- 1995 Certified Energy Manager, Association of Energy Engineers, Juno Beach, Florida
- 1998 Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International Conference on Power Quality, Charlotte, North Carolina
- 1999 Certified Power Quality Professional, Association of Energy Engineers, Juno Beach, Florida
- 2000 AMRA (Automated Meter Reading Association) Conference, Tampa, Florida
- 2001 Project Success Method Course, Juno Beach, California
- 2001 Metering Americas Conference, Miami, Florida
- 2001 Electric Power Research Institute (EPRI) Power Quality Applications International Conference on Power Quality, Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania
- 2002 Utility Finance & Accounting Seminar, Juno Beach, California
- 2004 IAAI Investigation of Electrical Appliance-Related Fires, Savannah, Georgia
- 2004 SEA, Ltd. Live Burn, Seminar Class, Columbus, Ohio
- 2005 ABYC Electrical Certification Course, Tampa, Florida
- 2005 National Fire, Arson & Explosion Investigation Training, Sarasota, Florida
- 2010 Red Vector Course Sizing Electric Utility Service Entrance Equipment, RV-6028
- 2010 Red Vector Course Transformers III Connections, RV-6034
- 2010 Red Vector Course Electrical Conductor Sizing, RV-2639
- 2010 Red Vector Course Electrical Equipment: Specifying the 3-Phase Substation Transformer, RV-5746
- 2010 Red Vector Course Lighting and the Visual Environment for Senior Living: Recommended Practices – RV-10195

- 2010 Red Vector Course Electrical Protection Grounding, RV-947
- 2010 Red Vector Course 2008 NEC Code Changes: Part 1, RV-10078
- 2010 Red Vector Course OSHA Electrical Regulations, RV-5400
- 2012 Red Vector Course 2011 NEC Code Changes Introduction Chapter 1 and 2, RV-10265
- 2012 Red Vector Course Surge Protection (RV-10248AW), RV-10248AW
- 2012 Red Vector Course Safety: Electrical Part 2 Hazardous Location, Clearances & Safety Practice, RV-5876
- 2012 Red Vector Course Safety: Electrical Part 1 Fundamentals, Materials & Equipment Grounding, RV-5875
- 2013 Red Vector Course NFPA 70E 2012 Changes from the 2009 Edition, RV10315AD
- 2013 Red Vector Course Florida Engineers' Laws and Rules (V.11), RV-10264
- 2014 Red Vector Course Protecting Your Communications System from Transients and Surges Webcast, RV-10474AW
- 2014 Red Vector Course Medium Voltage Underground Cables, RV-5881
- 2014 Red Vector Course Renewable Sources of Energy: Wind Power, RV-5709
- 2014 Red Vector Course Transformers I Electrical Characteristics, RV-5983
- 2014 Red Vector Course Pole Structural Loading, RV-6020
- 2014 Red Vector Course Transformers II Standards, RV-6031
- 2014 Red Vector Course Solar Electric Generation: Technologies, RV-10005a
- 2015 NFPA Technical Committee on "Hazardous Voltage/Current in Marinas, Boatyards and Floating Buildings," Linthicum, Maryland
- 2015 National Fire, Arson & Explosion Investigation, Training, Sarasota, Florida
- 2015 Laws and Regulations Governing Florida Professional Engineers, Jacksonville, Florida
- 2015 Red Vector Course Florida Engineers' Laws and Rules V.13, RV-10412
- 2016 Red Vector Course Electric Fire Alarm Systems, RV-10365
- 2016 Red Vector Course Arch Flash Hazard Analysis, RV-10747
- 2016 Red Vector Course Electric Power Transformers Webcast, RV-10543AW
- 2016 Red Vector Course Electric Power Substations Webcast, RV-10470AW
- 2016 Red Vector Course Electric Power Substations & Distribution, RV-10326AD
- 2016 Red Vector Course Electric Motors & Generators: Generators and Alternators, RV-5668
- 2016 Red Vector Course Capacitor Applications, RV-5257
- 2017 National Academy of Forensic Engineers Special Seminar Ethics, Forensic Analysis, and Professional Practice, New Orleans, Louisiana
- 2017 National Academy of Forensic Engineers Special Seminar Application of Engineering in the Jurisprudence System
- 2018 Commercial Application Transformers, RedVector
- 2018 Commercial Application Electric Transformers, RedVector
- 2018 Power Transmission and Distribution, RedVector
- 2018 Generating Electricity, RedVector
- 2018 Power Transmission and Distribution Basic Equipment and Terminology, RedVector
- 2018 Fire Alarm Essentials, RedVector
- 2018 Fire Essentials and Fire Science, RedVector

- 2018 Emergency Electric Power, RedVector
- 2018 Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS) System Efficiency, RedVector
- 2018 Electric Tools: Digital Multimeters I Operation, RedVector
- 2018 Electric Tools: Digital Multimeters II Applications, RedVector
- 2019 National Academy of Forensic Engineers Forensic Engineering Seminar, Orlando, Florida

# **Courses Taught/Presentations**

- 2019 Presenter at BoatUS Lightning Damage in the Marine Environment, Jacksonville, Florida
- 2018 Presenter at BoatUS Lightning Damage in the Marine Environment, Jacksonville, Florida
- 2018 Presenter at BoatUS Lightning Damage in the Marine Environment, Alexandria, Virginia
- 2016 Presenter at NASP National Association of Subrogation Professionals Subrogation Litigation: Skills and Management Conference, High-tech tools for scene investigation, preservation, and evidence gathering, Fort Lauderdale, Florida
- 2016 Presenter at DRI Fire Science and Litigation Conference, The Impact of the Smart Home Revolution on Product Liability and Fire Cause Determinations, Scottsdale, Arizona.
- 2012 Presenter at RIMS Broward County Chapter Meeting Assembling the Rapid Response Team: Early Investigation Strategies, Fort Lauderdale, Florida
- 2011 Presenter at Federated National Insurance Company/Superior Adjusting, Origin and Cause, Fort Lauderdale, Florida
- 2011 Presenter at South Florida Claims Association The Forensic Investigation on Lightning Damage Claims, Fort Lauderdale, Florida
- 2011 Presenter at Florida Chapter International Association of Arson Investigators (IAAI) Basic Electricity and Electrical Fire Causes, Miami Lakes, Florida
- 2007 Presenter at US Law Assembling the Rapid Response Team: Early Investigation Strategies for Preparing a Successful Defense, Tucson, Arizona
- 2007 Presenter at the Southeastern Electrical Exchange Claims Section Meeting Investigations of Electrical Fires Origin and Cause, Charleston, South Carolina
- 2007 Presenter at South Florida Claims Summer Conference for the Association of Property and Casualty Claims Professionals on Origin and Cause Investigations, Fort Lauderdale, Florida
- 2006 Presenter at Property Casualty Claims Professional Seminar Forensic Electrical Failure Analysis The Shocking Truth, Fort Lauderdale, Florida

- 2005 Presenter at Northeast Florida Property and Casualty Claims Seminar, Fire and Electrical Investigation, Subrogation and Evidence Collection, Jacksonville, Florida
- 2005 Presenter at Insurance Network Services Seminar on Fire and Electrical Investigation Subrogation and Evidence Collection
- 2005 Presenter at Property Casualty Claims Professional Seminar Forensic Investigation of Lightning Damage Claims, Davie, Florida
- 2004 Presenter at South Florida Claims Seminar for the Association of Property and Casualty Claim Professionals on Origin and Cause Investigations
- 2002 2003 FPL Power Quality Analysis Course for Florida Professional Engineers Continuing Education Credits, Juno Beach, Florida
- 2000 AMRA (Automated Meter Reading Association) Conference, presented paper on FPL's Power Quality Metering Project, Tampa, Florida
- 1998 Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International Conference on Power Quality, presented paper on Power Quality Business Issues, Charlotte, North Carolina
- 1997–1999 Power Quality Analysis Course for Electrical Contractors and Electricians Continuing Education Credits, Sarasota, Ft. Lauderdale, Melbourne, Juno Beach, and Miami, Florida
- 1992–1997 Helped develop and teach the following seminars to Engineers, Facility Managers, Electricians, and Building Owners at multiple locations in Florida:

FPL Power Quality Seminar

FPL Surge and Lightning Protection Seminar

FPL Wiring and Grounding Seminar

**FPL Motor Protection Seminar** 

FPL Harmonic Distortion Seminar

- 1996 Four-day Power Training Seminar to Philadelphia Electric Company (PECO), Philadelphia, Pennsylvania
- 1995 National Conference on Harmonics and Power Quality, presented paper on Harmonic Distortion Issues on Electrical Systems, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania
- 1995 Electric 95 Conference, presented paper on Power Quality Issues for Sensitive Electronics, Atlanta, Georgia
- 1994 National Conference on Harmonics and Power Quality, presented paper on Harmonic Distortion Issues for Utilities and Customers, Chicago, Illinois
- 1994 Electric 94 Conference, presented paper on Power Quality Wiring and Grounding Issues, New York City, New York
- 1993 Electric 93 Conference, presented paper on Lightning and Surge Suppression Protection, Atlanta, Georgia
- 1992 Electric Power Research Institute, Power Quality Applications, International Conference on Power Quality, presented paper on Energy Conservation Equipment Creating Power Quality Problems, Atlanta, Georgia

# **Edward Brill**

CASE **COST CLAIM** 

**INTERVENOR NAME** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Submitted

NEW **NON-FILING** FILING PARTICIPANT

Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532

qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT** No

**PARTICIPANT F. NAME** 

**NON-FILING** 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS HOURLY RATE** 90

Consultant PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

33

**CV STATUS (FOR HST RATE** CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE CHARGED** December 01, 2022 0.00

CV Provided within Previous 24

Months **HEARINGS** 

**CONSULTATIONS** 

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

Yes No

### **HEARINGS**

Yes

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		90		0.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		90		0.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		90		0.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		90		0.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		90		0.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		90		0.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		90		0.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		90		0.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	3.10	90	279.00	0.00		279.00
Interrogatory Responses		90		0.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		90		0.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		90		0.00		
Attendance		90		0.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		90		0.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		90		0.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		90		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		90		0.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		90		0.00		
Oral Submissions		90		0.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		90		0.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		90		0.00		
Communication						
With Client		90		0.00		
With Other Parties		90		0.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		90		0.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		90		0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		90		0.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	90	0.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	90	0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	90	0.00		
Decision				
Review	90	0.00		
Rate Order				
Review	90	0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	90	0.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	279.0	0	0.00	279.00

### **Attachments**

Attachment <u>Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf 2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf Time Docket

Invoice

### **DISBURSEMENTS**

**Atchmnt Other Atchmnt** Qty Cost/ Net <u>HST</u> Rationale/ **Name Provided** Unit Cost Rate HST Taxes/Tip <u>Total</u> Required **Comment** 

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Related Disbursement Claim Type Claim Type Import Message
2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. Time Docker Hearings

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366

4890-8882-6165

v1.pdf

Invoice Hearings



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

**CURRENT CHARGES** – S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Professional Services \$ 6,379.00 Expenses 0.00

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

### Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

<b>Professional Services:</b>		Hours	Amount
Brill, Edward			
08/09/22	Review Discovery Documents	3.50	1,155.00
08/09/22	Review Documents & Photos	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Report Preparation	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Client Contact	0.50	165.00
08/29/22	Review Documents & Photos	3.00	990.00
08/31/22	Report Preparation	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Technical Review	0.50	160.00
07/07/22	Project File Management - Coordination of file material received.	1.00	90.00
08/11/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the summary report.	1.60	144.00
09/02/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the report.	0.50	45.00
	Total Professional Services	21.60	\$ 6,379.00

Total This Invoice:	Amount

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

Page 1 of 1



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

**CURRENT CHARGES** – S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Professional Services \$ 6,379.00 Expenses 0.00

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

### Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

<b>Professional Services:</b>		Hours	Amount
Brill, Edward			
08/09/22	Review Discovery Documents	3.50	1,155.00
08/09/22	Review Documents & Photos	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Report Preparation	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Client Contact	0.50	165.00
08/29/22	Review Documents & Photos	3.00	990.00
08/31/22	Report Preparation	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Technical Review	0.50	160.00
07/07/22	Project File Management - Coordination of file material received.	1.00	90.00
08/11/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the summary report.	1.60	144.00
09/02/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the report.	0.50	45.00
	Total Professional Services	21.60	\$ 6,379.00

Total This Invoice:	Amount

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

Page 1 of 1

# **Dan Horn**

CASE **COST CLAIM**  **INTERVENOR NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

qmross@rossfirm.com

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Horn, Dan; +1 (519) 524-5532 dhorn@rossfirm.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** No

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING** 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

Articling Student/Paralegal

YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS** 

PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

**HOURLY RATE** 100

**HST RATE** 

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST) CV Required

**LAST CV DATE** 

**CHARGED** 

13.00

**HEARINGS** Yes

**CONSULTATIONS** 

No

No

**HEARINGS** 

Review Application and Evidence   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.0	
Preparation of Interrogatories	
Preparation of Interrogatories	
Review Interrogatory Responses   100   13.00   13.00   Technical Conference Preparation   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.0	
Technical Conference Preparation Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Attendance Technical Conference Follow Up  sues List Preparation Attendance at Issues Conference Preparation Intervenor Evidence Preparation Interrogatory Responses Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance Attendance ADR Preparation Preparation Attendance ADR Preparation Attendance Intervence ADR Preparation Attendance ADR Preparation Attendance ADR Preparation Attendance Intervence I	
Technical Conference Attendance 100 13.00 Technical Conference Follow Up 100 13.00 Technical Conference Follow Up 100 13.00 Technical Conference Follow Up 13.00 Technical Conference Follow Up 13.00 Technical Conference 100 13.00 Technical Conference Identification Interrogatory Responses 100 13.00 Technical Conference Identification Identificati	
Technical Conference Follow Up 13.00	
Sesues List	
Preparation	
Attendance at Issues Conference 100 13.00  Intervenor Evidence Preparation 100 13.00 Interrogatory Responses 100 13.00 Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing  Iettlement Conference / ADR Preparation 100 13.00 Attendance 100 13.00 Attendance 100 13.00 Attendance 100 13.00 Attendance at Presentation to Panel 100 13.00  Preparation 100 13.00 Attendance at Oral Hearing 100 13.00  Attendance at Oral Hearing 100 13.00  Written Submissions 4.80 100 480.00 13.00  Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00  Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00  Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00  Other Attendance Other Attendance 100 13.00  O	
Preparation   100   13.00   13.00   Interrogatory Responses   100   13.00   13.00   Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance   100   13.00   13.00   at Hearing   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.	
Preparation   100   13.00   13.00   Interrogatory Responses   100   13.00   13.00   Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance   100   13.00   13.00   at Hearing   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   Attendance   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   Attendance   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00	
Interrogatory Responses 100 13.00 Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing Settlement Conference / ADR Preparation of Settlement Proposal 100 13.00 Attendance at Presentation to Panel 100 13.00 Attendance at Presentation to Panel 100 13.00 Attendance at Oral Hearing 100 13.00 Submissions 4.80 100 480.00 13.00 Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00 Coral Submissions 100 13.00 Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00 Other Attendance Other Attendance Other Attendance Other Attendance Other Attendance Other Parties 100 13.00 With Other Parties 100 13.00 Motions Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 11.10 100 1,110.00 13.00 144.3 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 100 13.00	
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing  Settlement Conference / ADR  Preparation	
## Action	
Settlement Conference / ADR	
Preparation	
Attendance   100   13.00   Preparation of Settlement Proposal   100   13.00   Attendance at Presentation to Panel   100   13.00    Preparation   100   13.00    Preparation   100   13.00    Attendance at Oral Hearing   100   13.00    Attendance at Oral Hearing   100   13.00    Bubmissions   4.80   100   480.00   13.00    Oral Submissions   100   13.00    Attendance at Oral Submissions   100   13.00    Attendance at Oral Submissions   100   13.00    Other Attendance   100   13.00    Other Attendance   100   13.00    Communication   100   13.00    With Client   100   13.00    With Other Parties   100   13.00    Motions   Preparation of Motion(s) Materials   11.10   100   1,110.00   13.00    Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)   100   13.00    144.3i	
Preparation of Settlement Proposal   100   13.00   13.00   Attendance at Presentation to Panel   100   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00   13.00	
Attendance at Presentation to Panel 100 13.00    Drail Hearing	
Oral Hearing       100       13.00         Attendance at Oral Hearing       100       13.00         Submissions       100       480.00       13.00         Written Submissions       100       480.00       13.00       62.4         Oral Submissions       100       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       13.00       144.3       100       13.10       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       144.3       100       13.00       100       13.00       <	
Preparation       100       13.00         Attendance at Oral Hearing       100       13.00         Submissions       4.80       100       480.00       13.00       62.4         Oral Submissions       100       13.00       13.00         Attendance at Oral Submissions       100       13.00       13.00         Other Attendance       100       13.00       13.00         Communication       100       13.00       13.00         With Client       100       13.00       13.00         Wotions       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.3         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.3	
Attendance at Oral Hearing 100 13.00  Submissions  Written Submissions 4.80 100 480.00 13.00 62.40 Oral Submissions 100 13.00 Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00  Other Attendance Other Attendance Other Attendance 100 13.00  Communication With Client 100 13.00 With Other Parties 100 13.00  Motions  Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 11.10 100 1,110.00 13.00 144.30 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 100 13.00	
Submissions       4.80       100       480.00       13.00       62.4         Oral Submissions       100       13.00       13.00         Attendance at Oral Submissions       100       13.00         Other Attendance       100       13.00         Communication       With Client       100       13.00         With Other Parties       100       13.00         Motions       11.10       100       1,110.00       13.00         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.3	
Written Submissions       4.80       100       480.00       13.00       62.40         Oral Submissions       100       13.00       13.00         Attendance at Oral Submissions       100       13.00         Other Attendance       100       13.00         Communication       With Client       100       13.00         With Other Parties       100       13.00         Motions       Preparation of Motion(s) Materials       11.10       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.30         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       13.00       144.30	
Oral Submissions       100       13.00         Attendance at Oral Submissions       100       13.00         Other Attendance       100       13.00         Communication       100       13.00         With Client       100       13.00         With Other Parties       100       13.00         Motions       Preparation of Motion(s) Materials       11.10       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.3         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       13.00       13.00	
Attendance at Oral Submissions 100 13.00  Other Attendance Other Attendance 100 13.00  Communication 100 13.00  With Client 100 13.00  With Other Parties 100 13.00  Motions 100 13.00  Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 11.10 100 1,110.00 13.00 144.30  Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 100 13.00	542.40
Other Attendance         100         13.00           Communication         With Client         100         13.00           With Other Parties         100         13.00           Motions         100         13.00           Preparation of Motion(s) Materials         11.10         100         1,110.00         13.00           Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)         100         1,110.00         13.00	
Other Attendance       100       13.00         Communication       With Client       100       13.00         With Other Parties       100       13.00         Motions       Preparation of Motion(s) Materials       11.10       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.30         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.30	
Communication         With Client       100       13.00         With Other Parties       100       13.00         Motions       Preparation of Motion(s) Materials       11.10       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.30         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       13.00       13.00	
With Client       100       13.00         With Other Parties       100       13.00         Motions       Preparation of Motion(s) Materials       11.10       100       1,110.00       13.00       144.30         Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)       100       13.00       13.00	
With Other Parties 100 13.00  Motions Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 11.10 100 1,110.00 13.00 144.30 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 100 13.00 13.00	
Motions Preparation of Motion(s) Materials Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)  11.10 100 1,110.00 13.00 13.00	
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials 11.10 100 1,110.00 13.00 144.30 Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 100 13.00	
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s) 100 13.00	
	1,254.30
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s) 100 13 00	
rational at the army of motion (b)	

Preparation of Application for	100	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	100	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	100	13.00		
Decision				
Review	100	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	100	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	100	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	1,590.00	)	206.70	1,796.70

Attachments

<u>Attachment Document Type Import Message</u>

DH Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
DH Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type Time Docker Hearings

**Import Message** 

Row Labels	Sum of Hours Sum	of Billable (\$)
Dan Horn	15.9	1590
Motion	11.1	1110
Preparation of Motion Materials	11.1	1110
Submissions	4.8	480
Written Submissions	4.8	480
Grand Total	15.9	1590

Hours	Ac	ctivity cal Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$) User	Category	Subcategory
2022 2.	1	To research concerning other priority projects under OEB Act s. 96.1	100	210 Dan Horn	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
2022 2.	2	To statutory, regulatory, + case law research re evidence relevance	100	220 Dan Horn	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
2022 0.	3	To rec'g LM assg't	100	30 Dan Horn	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
		To Hansard + bill research; to disc'n w/ various; to drafting research memo re meaning OEBA s.				
2022 6.	5	96.1	100	650 Dan Horn	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
2022 0.	4	To receiving NBO assignment	100	40 Dan Horn	Submissions	Written Submissions
2022 2.	9	To OEB research, etc; to discussion w/ NBO	100	290 Dan Horn	Submissions	Written Submissions
2022 1.	5	To OEB decision review; to drafting research memo re costs	100	150 Dan Horn	Submissions	Written Submissions
2 2 2	022 2. 022 2. 022 0. 022 0. 022 6. 022 0. 022 2. 022 1.	022 2.1 022 2.2 022 0.3 022 6.5 022 0.4 022 2.9	1022 2.1 To research concerning other priority projects under OEB Act s. 96.1 1022 2.2 To statutory, regulatory, + case law research re evidence relevance 1023 To rec'g LM assg't 1024 To Hansard + bill research; to disc'n w/ various; to drafting research memo re meaning OEBA s. 1025 6.5 96.1 1026 0.4 To receiving NBO assignment 1027 0.9 To OEB research, etc; to discussion w/ NBO 1028 1.5 To OEB decision review; to drafting research memo re costs	022     2.1     To research concerning other priority projects under OEB Act s. 96.1     100       022     2.2     To statutory, regulatory, + case law research re evidence relevance     100       022     0.3     To rec'g LM assg't     100       024     6.5     96.1     100       025     0.4     To receiving NBO assignment     100       026     2.9     To OEB research, etc; to discussion w/ NBO     100       027     1.5     To OEB decision review; to drafting research memo re costs     100	2.1 To research concerning other priority projects under OEB Act s. 96.1  To statutory, regulatory, + case law research re evidence relevance  100 220 Dan Horn  100 220 Dan Horn  100 30 Dan Horn  100 30 Dan Horn  100 650 Dan Horn  100 100 Dan Horn  100 100 Dan Horn  100 100 Dan Horn  100 100 Dan Horn	2.1 To research concerning other priority projects under OEB Act s. 96.1  To statutory, regulatory, + case law research re evidence relevance  0.3 To rec'g LM assg't  To Hansard + bill research; to disc'n w/ various; to drafting research memo re meaning OEBA s.  0.5 96.1  0.6 50 Dan Horn Motion  100 40 Dan Horn Submissions  100 50 Dan Horn Submissions

15.9

# **Quinn Ross**

CASE **COST CLAIM** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

**INTERVENOR NAME** 

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Submitted

FILING PARTICIPANT

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** No

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING** 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

Legal Counsel 2005

YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

17

290

**HOURLY RATE** 

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

**LAST CV DATE** 

**HST RATE CHARGED** 

13.00

**HEARINGS** Yes

**CV** Required

**CONSULTATIONS** 

Yes No

HEARINGS
<u>Name</u>
Review Application

TILAKINOS						
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	14.20	290	4,118.00	13.00	535.34	4,653.34
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	5.10	290	1,479.00	13.00	192.27	1,671.27
Review Interrogatory Responses	4.10	290	1,189.00	13.00	154.57	1,343.57
Technical Conference Preparation		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		290		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		290		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	4.20	290	1,218.00	13.00	158.34	1,376.34
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		290		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	21.60	290	6,264.00	13.00	814.32	7,078.32
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		290		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	9.80	290	2,842.00	13.00	369.46	3,211.46
With Other Parties		290		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	8.20	290	2,378.00	13.00	309.14	2,687.14
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for		290		13.00		
Confidentiality						
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		290		13.00		
Decision						
Review	1.60	290	464.00	13.00	60.32	524.32
Rate Order						
Review		290		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		290		13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees						
Total Service Provider Fees:			19.952.00		2.593.76	22.545.76

**Attachments** 

**Attachment Document Type Import Message** 

Time Docket QR.pdf

DISBURSEME	NTS									
<u>Name</u>	Atchmnt Required	Atchmnt Provided	<u>Qty</u>	Cost/ Unit	<u>Net</u> Cost	<u>HST</u> Rate	Other HST Taxes/T	<u>ip</u>		Rationale/ Comment
Other	Yes	Yes	1.00	500.00	500.00	13.00	65.00		565.00	group
Total Disbursements:	No	No			500.00		65.00	0.00	565.00	meetings

**Attachments** 

**Attachment Related Disbursement Claim Import Message** 

2022.08.11.Meeting Room Other

Rental.Receipt 4883-5635-2814 v1.pdf

**Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments** 

**Document Attachment Related Disbursement Claim** Import Message <u>Type</u> **Claim Type** Disbursements

2022.08.11.Meeting Other

Room

Rental.Receipt 4883-5635-2814 v1.pdf

QR.pdf Time Docke Hearings

Quirn Ross	User	Date	Description	Hours	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	Subcategory	Category
Author   Commence	Quinn Ross	6/2/2022	To prepare for and meeting with landowners to discuss regulatory process and land compensation offers	3.1	290	899	With Client	Communication
Quinn Ross   614-2022   To review of Lourism. 10 review of Clubs of Public Indications.   1   20   20   Application and Applications   1   20   20   Application and Applications   20   Evidence   20   Evi	Quinn Ross	6/13/2022	To commence draft letter of intervention.	1	290	290	Preparation	
Quinn Ross   02/2/2022   To review of fower placement/bechoology. To review of client comments regarding project generally.   2.9   200   841   Application and Application of Evidence	Quinn Ross	6/14/2022	1 , 1 0	1	290	290	Application and	Application and
Quann Ross   7/8/2022  Meeting with Carol Vestrates & Louis Rosech to discuss Indoorners concerns   0.6   200   174   With Client   Communication   Carolina   Caro	Quinn Ross	6/21/2022	To review of tower placement/technology. To review of client comments regarding project generally.	2.9	290	841	Application and	Application and
Column Ross   1,247,1272   Revenue with a column of the column of the column Ross   1,247,1272   Revenue with a column Ross   1,247,1272   Revenue with Ross   1,24	Quinn Ross	7/6/2022	Meeting with Carol Verstraete & Louis Roesch to discuss landowners concerns	0.6	290	174		Communication
Quinn Ross         7/19/2022 Internal meeting to discuss outcome of meeting with McCarfby Tetrault and discuss next sleps         0.7         290         203         Preparation Entervenor Wideling Control (Control Control Con	Quinn Ross	6/29/2022	Meeting with Ed Brill to discuss report regarding technological options for line	2.5	290	725	Preparation	
Claim Ross   7/19/2022   Internal meeting for adultation of meeting with MicLarithy (ethnal and adultation for the properties of the properties of an attendant at meeting with make a planner to discuss formal heraling participation; meeting with   2.8   290   817   Preparation of which internal team to discuss analysis of weighting criteria and next slopes   12   200   200   Preparation of which internal team to discuss analysis of weighting criteria and next slopes   12   200   200   Preparation of which internal team to discuss analysis of weighting criteria and next slopes   12   200   12   200   12   200   12   200   12   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200   200	Quinn Ross	7/19/2022	Meeting with team to discuss outcomes of in-person meeting with landowners	0.6	290	174	With Client	Communication
Quinn Ross   77/27/2022   Commence review of HONI Application review POND   1.0 commence research   2.0 commence   2.0 comme	Quinn Ross	7/19/2022	Internal meeting to discuss outcome of meeting with McCarthy Tetrault and discuss next steps	0.7	290	203	Preparation	
Courn Ross   1/21/2022   With Circl Rosew with respect to same   1	Quinn Ross	7/21/2022	internal team to discuss analysis of weighting criteria and next steps	2.8	290	812	Interratories	Discovery
Quinn Ross   6/6/2022   To commence review of HONI Application re: s. 92 Leave to Construct.   5   290   1439 (With Client to Communication Serview   1786/2022   To commence review of HONI Application re: s. 92 Leave to Construct.   6.2   290   1798 Application and Serview   Review   Revi	Quinn Ross	7/27/2022	with Q. Ross with respect to same	1	290	290		Discovery
Quinn Ross			and drafting Notice of Motion to Review.	4.2			Matariala	Motions
Quinn Ross   6/4/2022   To commence review of HONI Application re: s.92 Leave to Construct.   6.2   290   1798   Application and Application and Evidence Evidence Evidence   4.1   290   188   Application and Evidence   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290   290	Quinn Ross	7/18/2022	To attending at in person Landowner meeting.	5	290	1450		Communication
Quinn Ross       6/5/2022 To continue to review HONI application and evidence.       4.1       290       1189 Application and Application and Evidence Sudence Sude	Quinn Ross	6/4/2022	To commence review of HONI Application re: s.92 Leave to Construct.	6.2	290	1798	Application and	Application and
Quinn Ross 9/9/2022 Review Procedural Order 3 and draft further written interrogatories 1.3 290 377 Interratories Discovery Review Procedural Order 3 and draft further written interrogatories pursuant to PO 3. 4.1 290 1188 Interrogatory Discovery Review Order Orde	Quinn Ross	6/5/2022	To continue to review HONI application and evidence.	4.1	290	1189	Application and	Application and
Quinn Ross 9/20/2022 To review of HONI responses to further interrogatories pursuant to PO 3. 4.1 290 1189 Interractions Provide instructions regarding motion, further evidence responses and form of hearing 0.4 290 116 Motion Motions 9/27/2022 To review of PO 4. 290 116 Review Decision Quinn Ross 9/27/2022 To review of PO 4. 290 116 Review Decision Quinn Ross 9/27/2022 To review of PO 4. 290 116 Review Decision Quinn Ross 10/4/2022 To review and mark up HONI Argument in Chief. 2.3 290 667 Submissions Submissions Submissions Uninn Ross 10/4/2022 To review pollution Probe submissions. 0.8 290 232 Submissions Subm	Quinn Ross	8/6/2022	Motion to Review - To continued research and drafting Notice of Motion to Review.	3.6	290	1044	Motion	Motions
Quinn Ross 9/20/2022 To review of HONI responses to further interrogatories pursuant to PO 3.  Quinn Ross 9/23/2022 Phone call with Lara to provide instructions regarding motion, further evidence responses and form of hearing 0.4 290 116 Review Decision Motions Wirtien Submissions 9/27/2022 To review of PO 4.  Quinn Ross 9/23/2022 To review and mark up HONI Argument in Chief. 2.3 290 667 Wirtien Submissions Sub	Quinn Ross	9/9/2022	Review Procedural Order 3 and draft further written interrogatories	1.3	290	377		Discovery
Quinn Ross         9/23/2022 Phone call with Lara to provide instructions regarding motion, further evidence responses and form of hearing         0.4         290         116 Motion Motions Motions Motions           Quinn Ross         9/27/2022 To review of PO 4.         0.4         290         116 Motion Motions Motions           Quinn Ross         9/30/2022 To review of PO 4.         2.3         290         667 Written Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/4/2022 To review and mark up HONI Argument in Chief.         2.3         290         667 Written Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/4/2022 To review Pollution Probe submissions.         0.8         290         233 Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/1/2022 To research regarding s.96.1, Public Interest Test, board jurisdiction. To review evidence filed by applicant. To commence outline of submissions.         7.2         290         2088 Written Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/3/2022 To commence drafting submissions.         2.2         290         638 Written Submissions         Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/6/2022 To review of associate research.         2.3         290         667 Written Submissions         Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/6/2022 To review of associate research.         2.3         290         1392 Written Submissions           Submissions         Submissions         Submis	Quinn Ross	9/20/2022	To review of HONI responses to further interrogatories pursuant to PO 3.	4.1	290		Interrogatory Responses	Discovery
Quinn Ross9/30/2022To review and mark up HONI Argument in Chief.2.3290667Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/4/2022To review Pollution Probe submissions.0.8290232Quinn Ross10/1/2022To research regarding s.96.1, Public Interest Test, board jurisdiction. To review evidence filed by applicant. To commence outline of submissions.7.22902088Quinn Ross10/3/2022To commence drafting submissions.2.2290638Submissions Submissions SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To review of associate research.2.3290667Written Submissions SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.4.82901392Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To review OEB Staff submissions.1.5290435Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To review Environmental Defense submissions.1.5290145Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross11/12/2022Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters0.5290145Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross11/12/2022Review of OEB Decision and Order1.2290348ReviewDecision	Quinn Ross	9/23/2022	Phone call with Lara to provide instructions regarding motion, further evidence responses and form of hearing	0.4	290	116		Motions
Quinn Ross 10/4/2022 To review Pollution Probe submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/1/2022 To review of associate research gubmissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review of associate research.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review DEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review DEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review DEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  2.3 290 667 Submissions  Written Submissions  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  Quinn Ross 11/1/25/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  2.3 290 667 Submissions  Written Submissions  On Submissions  Submissions  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  On Submissions  On Submissions  On Submissions  On Submissions  On Submissions  On Submissions  Submissions  On Submissio	Quinn Ross	9/27/2022	To review of PO 4.	0.4	290	116	Review	Decision
Quinn Ross 10/4/2022 To review Pollution Probe submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/1/2022 To commence outline of submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/3/2022 To review of associate research.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.  Quinn Ross 11/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.  Quinn Ross 11/6/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order	Quinn Ross	9/30/2022	To review and mark up HONI Argument in Chief.	2.3	290	667		Submissions
Quinn Ross 10/1/2022 commence outline of submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/3/2022 To commence drafting submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review of associate research.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review of associate research.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  Quinn Ross 11/25/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  Decision Submissions  Submissions Submissions  Submissions Submissions  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  1.2 290 348 Review Decision	Quinn Ross	10/4/2022	To review Pollution Probe submissions.	0.8	290	232		Submissions
Quinn Ross10/3/2022To commence drafting submissions.2.2290638 Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To review of associate research.2.3290667 Written SubmissionsSubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.4.82901392 Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To review OEB Staff submissions.1.5290435 Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross10/6/2022To review Environmental Defense submissions.0.5290145 Written SubmissionsQuinn Ross11/1/2022Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters0.5290145 Writh ClientQuinn Ross11/1/2022Review of OEB Decision and Order1.2290348 ReviewDecision	Quinn Ross	10/1/2022		7.2	290	2088		Submissions
Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.  Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters  Quinn Ross 11/1/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order  2.3 290 667 Submissions Written Submissions Output Communication Submissions Output Communication Output Communica	Quinn Ross	10/3/2022		2.2	290	638		Submissions
Quinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions. 10 commence preparation of cost submissions. 1.5 290 435 Written Submissions Submissions Ouinn Ross 10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions. 0.5 290 145 Written Submissions Ouinn Ross 11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters 0.5 290 145 Writh Client Communication Ouinn Ross 11/25/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order 1.2 290 348 Review Decision	Quinn Ross	10/6/2022	To review of associate research.	2.3	290	667		Submissions
Quinn Ross         10/6/2022 To review OEB Staff submissions.         1.5         290         435 Submissions         Submissions           Quinn Ross         10/6/2022 To review Environmental Defense submissions.         0.5         290         145 Written Submissions         Submissions           Quinn Ross         11/1/2022 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters         0.5         290         145 With Client         Communicati           Quinn Ross         11/25/2022 Review of OEB Decision and Order         1.2         290         348 Review         Decision	Quinn Ross	10/6/2022	To finalize submissions. To commence preparation of cost submissions.	4.8	290	1392		Submissions
Quinn Ross10/6/2022To review Environmental Defense submissions.0.5290145Written SubmissionsSubmissionsQuinn Ross11/1/2022Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters0.5290145With ClientCommunicatingQuinn Ross11/25/2022Review of OEB Decision and Order1.2290348ReviewDecision	Quinn Ross	10/6/2022	To review OEB Staff submissions.	1.5	290	435	Written	Submissions
Quinn Ross11/1/2022Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters0.5290145With ClientCommunicationQuinn Ross11/25/2022Review of OEB Decision and Order1.2290348ReviewDecision	Quinn Ross	10/6/2022	To review Environmental Defense submissions.	0.5	290	145	Written	Submissions
							With Client	Communication
	Quinn Ross	11/25/2022	Review of OEB Decision and Order	1.2	290	348	Review	Decision
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,				68.8		19952		

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Sum of Billable (\$)
Communication	9.8	2842
With Client	9.8	2842
Intevenor Evidence	4.2	1218
Preparation	4.2	1218
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>	14.2	4118
Review Application and Evidence	14.2	4118
Discovery	9.2	2668
Preparation of Interratories	5.1	1479
<b>Review Interrogatory Responses</b>	4.1	1189
Motions	8.2	2378
Preparation of Motion Materials	8.2	2378
Decision	1.6	464
Review	1.6	464
Submissions	21.6	6264
Written Submissions	21.6	6264
Grand Total	68.8	19952

# **TILBURY COLUMBUS CLUB**

20 Dupuis St. - P.O. Box 519 Tilbury, Ontario NOP 2L0 3853

Name: 1	HE ROSS FIRM	Date: Qug	ir ad
	QUINN ROSS	Phone:	3
Quantity			Amount
	MEETING - Aug 1	-22	
	HALL RENT ILAM	To 4PM	500
		27	
	2000	2 p	
	Pol che y	Υ	
	<u> </u>		

Phone (519) 682-0633	Phone	(519)	682-0633
----------------------	-------	-------	----------

TILBURY COLUMBUS CLUB

20 Dupuis St. - P.O. Box 519

Tilbury Ont in 190 212 Tilbury, Ontario NOP 2L0

, au	a	3839	
Ch	equ	e#019	968
Vilu	18	2022	KB

Name: The Ross Firm Address:\_

Quantity			Amount
	Hall Rent - full day	3	5000
		4	5000
	THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS	SUB-TOTAL H.S.T.	\$1,500
S.T. No. 1081	0 9240RT0001	TOTAL	すらんち

### **Lara Merjane**

CASE **COST CLAIM**  **INTERVENOR NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross to Construct (New): Hydro One

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

Submitted

Networks Inc.

FILING PARTICIPANT

Merjane, Lara; +1 (519) 524-5532 lmerjane@rossfirm.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** No

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING PARTICIPANT L. NAME** 

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2011

No

**COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF **HOURLY RATE** 230

**HST RATE** 

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

10

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

Legal Counsel

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

**LAST CV DATE** 

**CHARGED** 

13.00

**CV** Required **HEARINGS** 

Yes

**CONSULTATIONS** 

Yes

HEADINGS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		230		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		230		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
ssues List						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	6.90	230	1,587.00	13.00	206.31	1,793.31
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		230		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	0.90	230	207.00	13.00	26.91	233.91
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	8.70	230	2,001.00	13.00	260.13	2,261.13
With Other Parties		230		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	5.10	230	1,173.00	13.00	152.49	1,325.49
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for		230		13.00		
Confidentiality						
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		230		13.00		
Decision						
Review	5.90	230	1,357.00	13.00	176.41	1,533.41
Rate Order						
Review		230		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		230		13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees						
Total Service Provider Fees:			6,325.00		822.25	7,147.25

<u>Attachment Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

LM Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

**Atchmnt Qty** <u>HST</u> <u>Other</u> **Atchmnt** Cost/ Net Rationale/ **Provided** <u>Name</u> Unit Cost <u>Rate</u> HST Taxes/Tip <u>Total</u> Required **Comment** 

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
LM Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Category	Subcategory
6/2/2022	1.1	Meeting with landowners to discuss regulatory process and land compensation offers	230	253	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
6/29/2022	0.5	Meeting with Ed Brill to discuss report regarding technological options for line	230	115	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
7/6/2022	0.6	Meeting with Carol Verstraete & Louis Roesch to discuss landowners concerns	230	138	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
7/19/2022	0.6	Meeting with team to discuss outcomes of in-person meeting with landowners	230	138	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
7/19/2022	0.7	Internal meeting to discuss outcome of Quinn's meeting with McCarthy Tetrault and discuss next steps	230	161	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
7/21/2022	1.2	Review of documents in preparation of meeting; meeting with Tom Storey to discuss ESR; meeting with expropriation team to	230	276	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
		discuss analysis of weighting criteria			•		
7/26/2022	1.2	Internal meeting to discuss ESG factors for interrogatory process	230	276	Lara Merjane	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
7/26/2022	1.9	Review of ESR report; internal meeting to discuss evidence/interrogatory	230	437	Lara Merjane	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
7/26/2022	1.3	Review of evidence in preparation for interrogatory; correspondence with expropriation team with respect to same	230	299	Lara Merjane	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
7/27/2022	1	Meeting with expropriation team to discuss interrogatory; preparation of questions for interrogatory; correspondence with Q.	230	230	Lara Merjane	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
		Ross with respect to same					
7/27/2022	1	Review of evidence; preparation of questions for interrogatory; meeting with Meryam to discuss same; phone call with Quinn	230	230	Lara Merjane	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
		regading same; several correspondence with Quinn concerning same; correspondence with Meryam about same			•	•	-
8/8/2022	1.6	Motion to Review - Internal meeting with expropriation team to discuss research project for motion re OEB letter designating	230	368	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
		project as a 'priority project'; draft email to expropriation team to assign research; internal meeting with expropriation team to					
		discuss OEB decision searches					
8/8/2022	2.8	Motion to Review - research regarding tribunal rules of evidence; several correspondence with Meryam and Alex with respect to	230	644	Lara Merjane	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
		same; internal meeting with expropriation team to report findings on research					
8/9/2022	0.3	Motion to Review - Meeting with expropriation team to discuss research outcomes and next steps	230	69	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
8/10/2022	0.7	Motion to Review - Review of updated draft motion; review of research regarding duty of fairness and oral hearings; revisions to	230	161	Lara Merjane	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
		motion to include same					
8/25/2022	0.6	Several correspondence with expropriation team, phone call with Becky and meeting with Rochelle regarding motion to OEB	230	138	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
8/29/2022	0.5	Review of procedural order #2; meeting with expropriation team regarding same; incoming correspondence from team with	230	115	Lara Merjane	Decision	Review
		respect to early access agreements; consultation with Meryam with respect to same					
9/7/2022	0.5	Meeting with Quinn and Meryam to discuss drafting of supplemental interrogatories	230	115	Lara Merjane	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
9/23/2022	0.5	Phone call with Quinn to receive instructions regarding motion, further evidence responses and form of hearing; correspondence	230	115	Lara Merjane	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
		with intervenors and OEB with respect to same					
9/27/2022	0.5	Review of Procedural Order #4	230	115	Lara Merjane	Decision	Review
10/3/2022	3.4	Further review of Procedural Order #4; research regarding test for price and reliability; several correspondence with Nadine, Alex,	230	782	Lara Merjane	Decision	Review
		Meryam and Dan regarding research; correspondence with Quinn with respect to same					
10/4/2022	0.6	Meeting with Expropriation team to discuss status of several matters and researches with respect to response to procedural order	r 230	138	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
		#4					
10/6/2022	1.1	Review and revisions of motion to review; correspondence with Expropriation team with respect to same	230	253	Lara Merjane	Motion	Preparation of Motion Materials
10/24/2022	0.9	Review of HONI's reply submissions	230	207	Lara Merjane	Submissions	Written Submissions
10/25/2022	0.6	Meeting with expropriation team to provide updates	230	138	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client
11/25/2022	1.5	Review of OEB Decision and Order	230	345	Lara Merjane	Decision	Review
12/6/2022	0.3	Meeting with Nadine regarding update of status	230	69	Lara Merjane	Communication	With Client

6325

27.5

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Su	m of Billable (\$)
Communication	8.7	\$	2,001.00
With Client	8.7	\$	2,001.00
Decision	5.9	\$	1,357.00
Review	5.9	\$	1,357.00
Discovery	6.9	\$	1,587.00
Preparation of Interrogatories	6.9	\$	1,587.00
Motion	5.1	\$	1,173.00
Preparation of Motion Materials	5.1	\$	1,173.00
Submissions	0.9	\$	207.00
Written Submissions	0.9	\$	207.00
Grand Total	27.5	\$	6,325.00

### Eli Cohen

CASE **COST CLAIM**  **INTERVENOR NAME** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Submitted

NEW **NON-FILING NON-FILING FILING PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT F. NAME PARTICIPANT L. NAME** Cohen, Eli; +1 (519) 524-5532

No

emcohen@rossfirm.com

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS HOURLY RATE** Legal Counsel 2005 PRACTICING/YEARS OF 290

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

17

**CV STATUS (FOR HST RATE** CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE CHARGED** 13.00

CV Required

**HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS** 

Yes No No

$\vdash$	IF A	ΔR	INI	GS
	ᇿᄼ	~ı /	HΝ	S

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	<b>HST Rate</b>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		290		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		290		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		290		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		290		13.00		
ssues List						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		290		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		290		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		290		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance		290		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		290		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		290		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		290		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		290		13.00		
Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		290		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		290		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		290		13.00		
With Other Parties		290		13.00		
Motions		- <del>-</del>				
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	1.60	290	464.00	13.00	60.32	524.32
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		290		13.00		,_
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		290		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for	290	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	290	13.00		
Decision				
Review	290	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	290	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	290	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	464.0	0	60.32	524.32

<u>Attachment Document Type Import Message</u>

EMC Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
EMC Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Category	Subcategory
		To reviewing Notice of Motion and instructions to M. Kellow re: revisions to footnotes and to complete the Book of Authorities and					
		Cited Documents for finalizing and final review before service; to reviewing the OEB practice rules re: service for Motion and					Preparation of Motion
8/25/202	2	1.2 documentary requirements of same	290	0	348 Elli Cohe	en Motions	Materials
		To receipt and review of final version of Notice of Motion and Book of Authorities and approval of same for service; to review of Rules					Preparation of Motion
8/26/202	2	0.4 re: service of same for compliance	290	0	116 Elli Cohe	en Motions	Materials
		1.6			464		

Row Labels	Sum of Hours Sum of Bil	lable (\$)
Elli Cohen	1.6	464
Motions	1.6	464
Preparation of Motion Materials	1.6	464
Grand Total	1.6	464

# **Meryam Kellow**

CASE **COST CLAIM** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

Legal Counsel

**INTERVENOR NAME** 

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

**HOURLY RATE** 

170

Submitted

NEW **NON-FILING NON-FILING** 

FILING PARTICIPANT **PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT F. NAME PARTICIPANT L. NAME** Kellow, Meryam; +1 (519) 955-7440 No

mkellow@rossfirm.com

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS** 

2021 PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

1 **HST RATE** 

**CV STATUS (FOR** CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE CHARGED CV** Required 13.00

**HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS** 

Yes No Yes

HEARINGS Name	Hours	Hourly Rate	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	Total
	110010	riourly reaco	<u>oub rotur</u>	<u> </u>	<u>1101</u>	<u>10tai</u>
Review Application and Evidence Review Application and Evidence	3.40	170	578.00	13.00	75.14	653.14
Discovery	3.40	170	370.00	13.00	75.14	000.14
Preparation of Interrogatories	13.90	170	2,363.00	13.00	307.19	2,670.19
Review Interrogatory Responses	10.50	170	2,000.00	13.00	307.13	2,070.10
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
ssues List		170		10.00		
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
ntervenor Evidence						
Preparation	17.20	170	2,924.00	13.00	380.12	3,304.12
Interrogatory Responses		170	,	13.00		•
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		170		13.00		
at Hearing						
settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Pral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	8.40	170	1,428.00	13.00	185.64	1,613.64
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	2.80	170	476.00	13.00	61.88	537.88
With Other Parties	4.60	170	782.00	13.00	101.66	883.66
lotions	40.00		0.001.05	40.00		0.551.05
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	13.30	170	2,261.00	13.00	293.93	2,554.93
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)	15.30	170	2,601.00	13.00	338.13	2,939.13
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		

Preparation of Application for	170	13.00	
Confidentiality			
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	170	13.00	
Decision			
Review	170	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	170	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	170	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	13,413.00	)	1,743.69 15,156.69

<u>Attachment Document Type Import Message</u>

MK Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

AtchmntAtchmntQtyCost/NetHSTOtherRationale/NameRequiredProvidedUnitCostRateHSTTaxes/TipTotalComment

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
MK Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Date Hour	s Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$) User	Category	Subcategory
07/21/202	0.8 Meeting with land use planner to discuss formal hearing participation; meeting with internal team to discuss analysis of weighting criteria and next steps	170	136 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
07/19/202	0.7 Internal meeting to discuss outcome of Quinn's meeting with McCarthy Tetrault and discuss next steps	170	119 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
07/19/202	0.8 Internal meeting to transfer knowledge and discuss file background	170	136 Meryam Kellow	Intervenor Evide	nr Preparation
07/21/202	0.1 Review email regarding updates to landowners	170	17 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Client
	Review ESR to understand the weighted multi-criteria decision making analysis; assess implications of the method of analysis; prepare for internal meeting to discuss		·		
07/25/202	9 findings	170	1530 Meryam Kellow	Intervenor Evide	n(Preparation
07/26/202	6.2 Continue review, analysis, and consideration of ESR; draft summary of analysis and conclusions of findings; present and discuss findings with internal team	170	1054 Meryam Kellow	Intervenor Evide	•
07/26/202	1 Internal meeting to discuss evidence/interrogatories and ESR report	170	170 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
07/26/202	1.3 Internal meeting to review evidence and discuss interrogatories	170	221 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
07/26/202	1.9 Review evidence and consider questions to be posed for the interrogatories	170	323 Meryam Kellow	Review Applicati	or Review Application and Evidence
07/27/202	1.5 Continue review of evidence and consider questions for the interrogatories	170	255 Meryam Kellow		or Review Application and Evidence
07/27/202	0.7 Internal meeting to discuss evidence and interrogatories	170	119 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
. , , -	Review OEB Rules and Procedure regarding drafting and submission of interrogatories; review procedural order to determine filing requirements; correspondence with		,	,	.,
	QMR, LM, NO, AB, and TGM regarding same; meeting with LM and NO regarding same; correspondence with OEB regarding online filing requirements and setting up an				
	account and completing online form regarding the same; reviewing interrogatory precedent and drafting written interrogatories; correspondence with DBG regarding same,	;			
07/27/202	4.7 phone call with QMR regarding filing and drafting of written interrogatory; filing and serving of same to the OEB and parties involved.	170	799 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
08/08/202	0.4 Internal meeting to discuss OEB's new position re. route selection and oral hearing; obtain instructions from QMR and discus plan of action	170	68 Meryam Kellow	Intervenor Evide	nr Preparation
08/09/202	1 Motion to review - Internal meeting with team to discuss key research findings and next steps; draft email in preparation for meeting discussions	170	170 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)
	Motion to Review - Continue to research the rules of evidence with respect to the admissibility of relevant evidence. Review case law, legislations, and secondary sources.				
08/10/202	6.7 Draft corresponding section in the motion document. Multiple internal correspondences with respect to the same.	170	1139 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)
08/09/202	3.2 Motion to Review - Continue to conduct research regarding law of evidence and the standard for admissibility of relevant evidence	170	544 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)
08/08/202	4.4 Motion to Review - Review QMR's draft motion. Conduct research regarding law of evidence and the standard for admissibility of relevant evidence.	170	748 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)
08/25/202	0.5 Phone call with EC re. preparing book of authorities and making amendments to footnotes of the Notice of Motion	170	85 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials
08/26/202	1.7 Prepare Book of Authorities and Motion document	170	289 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials
, -, -	Make corrections to Motion Record including Notice of Motion and Book of Authorities; prepare cover page and index; organize and finalize documents for prepare for filing	g	,		(-,
08/26/202	4.9 and service; file and serve Motion records via RESS and email; internal meetings and correspondence re. filing and preparation of Motion Record	170	833 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials
, -, -	Research and review precedents for OEB Book of Authority; make corrections to Notice of Motion; prepare Book of Authority; internal meetings and correspondence re.		,		.,
08/25/202	6 same.	170	1020 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials
08/27/202	0.2 Maintain file and keep records re. Notice of Motion	170	34 Meryam Kellow	Motions	Preparation of Motion(s) Materials
08/29/202	0.6 Team meeting to discuss next steps re. Procedural Order 2 and expert report	170	102 Meryam Kellow	Intervenor Evide	n Preparation
09/07/202	0.5 Meeting with Quinn and Lara to discuss drafting of supplemental interrogatories	170	85 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
09/07/202	4.3 Draft written interrogatories with respect to price, quality, and reliability of alternative routes; internal correspondence re. same	170	731 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
09/09/202	0.3 Edit draft of written interrogatories; prepare for filing & service	170	51 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
,,	Motion to Review - to receiving instructions from NBO regarding draft email to landowners regarding motion; sending draft email from QMR; receiving further instruction		,	,	.,
09/09/202	0.1 from QMR	170	17 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Client
09/09/202	1 Prepare and serve Written Interrogatories on all parties; file same with OEB	170	170 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
09/09/202	0.1 Phone call with QMR re. status of Written Interrogatories	170	17 Meryam Kellow	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
09/09/202	2.5 Draft email to landowners to provide an update with respect to more recent development of the Chatham x Lakeshore matter with the OEB	170	425 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Client
09/27/202	0.2 To receipt and review of Procedural Order No. 4	170	34 Meryam Kellow	Intervenor Evide	
09/29/202	0.4 Send draft email to QMR re. update on the OEB's Procedural Order No. 4	170	68 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
09/30/202	0.2 Internal correspondence with QMR re. research topics for written submissions	170	34 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
09/30/202	0.1 Receive and file correspondence from HONI for Argument in Chief; correspond with NBO re. sending communication to group of landowners	170	17 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Client
10/03/202	0.1 To receipt of correspondence from NBO re. timing clarifications to landowner group	170	17 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
10/04/202	0.1 To receipt of correspondence from NBO and QMR re. incoming questions from landowners in response to Procedural Order 4	170	17 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
10/04/202	0.3 Correspondence with NBO to provide documents and context required for research needed for written hearing	170	51 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
, ,	To review Procedural Order #4; review Written Interrogatories and HONI's reply to the same; conduct research re. test for price and reliability; multiple correspondence		•		
10/03/202	4 with LM, AB, NBO, and DH re. same	170	680 Meryam Kellow	Submissions	Written Submissions
, ,	Continue research re, test for price and reliability; review case law, OEB Act, secondary sources; review HONI's Argument-in-Chief and replies to TRF"s Written		•		
10/04/202	4.4 Interrogatories; internal correspondence with QMR and NBO re. same; email QMR with findings	170	748 Meryam Kellow	Submissions	Written Submissions
			,		
10/18/202	0.8 Internal correspondence with QMR re. filing of cost claims; correspondence with OEB re. timelines of filing cost claims and accessing other parties' filings on the RESS system	n 170	136 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
11/01/202	0.5 Expropriation team meeting for update of status in several matters	170	85 Meryam Kellow	Communication	With Other Parties
11/30/202	0.7 Phone calls with QMR re. submission of cost claims and the OEB's filing procedures; team meeting re. same	170	119 Meryam Kellow	Communication	
			. ,		

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Sum of Billable (\$)
Communication	7.4	1258
With Client	2.8	476
With Other Parties	4.6	782
Discovery	13.9	2363
Preparation of Interrogatories	13.9	2363
Intervenor Evidence	17.2	2924
Preparation	17.2	2924
Motions	28.6	4862
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	13.3	2261
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)	15.3	2601
Review Application and Evidence	3.4	578
Review Application and Evidence	3.4	578
Submissions	8.4	1428
Written Submissions	8.4	1428
Grand Total	78.9	13413

### **Nadine Otten**

CASE **COST CLAIM** 

**INTERVENOR NAME** 

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532 EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross to Construct (New): Hydro One

Networks Inc.

qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

Submitted

NEW **NON-FILING NON-FILING** FILING PARTICIPANT

No

Otten, Nadine; +1 (519) 524-5532

notten@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **PARTICIPANT L. NAME** 

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** YEAR CALLED TO BAR **COMPLETED YEARS HOURLY RATE** Legal Counsel 2022 PRACTICING/YEARS OF 170

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

1

**CV STATUS (FOR HST RATE** CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE CHARGED** 13.00

**CV** Required

**HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS** 

Yes No Yes

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	<b>HST Rate</b>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence	3.00	170	510.00	13.00	66.30	576.30
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories	5.20	170	884.00	13.00	114.92	998.92
Review Interrogatory Responses	1.60	170	272.00	13.00	35.36	307.36
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	1.30	170	221.00	13.00	28.73	249.73
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		170		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions	22.00	170	3,740.00	13.00	486.20	4,226.20
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	4.60	170	782.00	13.00	101.66	883.66
With Other Parties	2.80	170	476.00	13.00	61.88	537.88
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						

Preparation of Application for		170		13.00		
Confidentiality						
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		170		13.00		
Decision						
Review	3.90	170	663.00	13.00	86.19	749.19
Rate Order						
Review		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees						
Total Service Provider Fees:			7.548.00		981.24	8.529.24

<u>Attachment Document Type Import Message</u>

NO Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

AtchmntAtchmntQtyCost/NetHSTOtherRationale/NameRequiredProvidedUnitCostRateHSTTaxes/TipTotalComment

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
NO Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docke Hearings

Claim Type Import Message

User Nadine Otten Nadine Otten Nadine Otten	6/29/2022		Hours 1.1 0.5 - 0.8	Rate (\$) \$ 170.00 \$ 170.00 \$ 170.00	\$ \$	187.00 85.00	Category Communication Intervenor Evidence Discovery	Subcategory With Clients Preparation Preparation of Interrogatories
Nadine Otten	7/21/2022	To meeting with land use planner to discuss formal hearing participation. To subsequent meeting with internal team to discuss analysis of weighting criteria and next steps.	0.8	\$ 170.00	\$	136.00	Intervenor Evidence	Preparation
Nadine Otten	7/19/2022	To internal meeting to discuss outcome of senior counsel's meeting with HONI's regulatory counsel (McCarthy Tetrault) and discuss next steps.	0.7	\$ 170.00	\$	119.00	Communication	With Other Parties
Nadine Otten	7/19/2022	To preparing summary of internal meeting and creating task-list arising out of same. To sending summary and task list to team.	0.7	\$ 170.00	\$	119.00	Communication	With Other Parties
Nadine Otten	7/19/2022	To receipt and review of OEB Procedural Order No. 1. To internal meeting to discuss same. To receive instructions from senior counsel for next steps. To preparing summary of action items and sending same to team internally.	1.1	\$ 170.00	\$	187.00	Decision	Review
Nadine Otten	7/19/2022	To meeting with M. Kellow to discuss regulatory process for expropriation, voluntary settlement offers, and providing update on progress of overall file to date.	0.8	\$ 170.00	\$	136.00	Communication	With Other Parties
Nadine Otten	7/20/2022	To drafting summary of PO No. 1, senior counsel's recent meeting with HONI's regulatory counsel, and instructions for landowners re. process for signing agreements and sending same to senior counsel for review and input. To receipt of instructions for revisions. To researching nature of written interrogatories. To implementing revisions and sending final copy to landowners. To creating contact group for all landowner clients.	2	\$ 170.00	\$	340.00	Communication	With Clients
Nadine Otten	7/26/2022	To internal meeting to review evidence and discuss interrogatories.	1.2	\$ 170.00	\$	204.00	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
Nadine Otten	7/27/2022	To revising draft email to opposing counsel per Quinn's instructions and sending same to opposing counsel.	0.6	\$ 170.00	\$	102.00	Communication	With Other Parties
Nadine Otten	7/27/2022	To internal meeting with expropriation team to discuss evidence and written interrogatories.	0.7	\$ 170.00	\$	119.00	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
Nadine Otten	7/27/2022	To call with Meryam regarding filing written interrogatories via OEB online portal. To researching requirements for form of written interrogatories at OEB. To drafting cover letter for serving written interrogatories on all other parties.	2.5	\$ 170.00	\$	425.00	Discovery	Preparation of Interrogatories
Nadine Otten	8/8/2022	Motion to Review - to reading letter from OEB re: determinations on the filing of evidence and form of the hearing. To scheduling and attending internal group meeting to discuss letter and requirements for responding to same. To reviewing Quinn's initial draft motion to vary. To internal meeting re: searching OEB decisions.	2.5	\$ 170.00	\$	425.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/8/2022	Motion to Review - To meeting with Quinn, Lara, Alex, and Meryam to discuss progress of research for motion.	0.5	\$ 170.00	\$	85.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/8/2022	Motion to Review - To researching public policy mandate and duties of Board when approving major infrastructure projects.	2.2	\$ 170.00	\$	374.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/9/2022	Motion to Review - To internal meeting with Q. Ross, L. Merjane, and M. Kellow to discuss research on OEB motion.	0.3	\$ 170.00	\$	51.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/9/2022	Motion to Review - To internal correspondence about research questions.	0.5	\$ 170.00	\$	85.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/10/2022	Motion to Review - To researching OEB policies and to drafting policy section of motion.	6.6	\$ 170.00	\$ 1	,122.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/31/2022	Motion to Review - to receipt of draft report from expert (E. Brill) and to internal correspondence about same.  To emailing E. Brill confirming receipt and next steps for finalizing draft report.	0.4	\$ 170.00	\$	68.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/29/2022	Motion to Review - To email correspondence with team and Ed Brill regarding motion materials. To internal meeting with team to discuss motion and make plan for next steps. To review of procedural order #2 and ESR.	0.7	\$ 170.00	\$	119.00	Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/25/2022	Motion to Review - to internal correspondence with Lara and Meryam regarding obtaining Quinn's final draft of the motion for our completion.	0.4	\$ 170.00	\$	68.00	Submissions	Written Submissions

Nadine Otten	9/9/2022	Motion to Review - to providing instructions to co-counsel regarding draft email to landowners regarding motion.	0.1	\$ 170.00	\$	17.00 Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	9/12/2022		0.2	\$ 170.00	\$	34.00 Communication	With Clients
Nadine Otten	9/13/2022		0.1	\$ 170.00	\$	17.00 Communication	With Clients
Nadine Otten	9/23/2022	To compiling all questions recently received from clients regarding the regulatory aspect of this matter (i.e., OEB processes and procedures; legal requirements for HONI to meet before they can expropriate, etc.) and preparing a draft list of questions to be addressed by senior counsel either via email to the group or at next landowner meeting.	0.4	\$ 170.00	\$ (	68.00 Communication	With Clients
Nadine Otten	9/27/2022	To receipt and review of Procedural Order No. 4 from OEB. To preparing list of topics to be discussed/addressed at internal meeting with HONI team.	0.4	\$ 170.00	\$ (	68.00 Decision	Review
Nadine Otten	9/30/2022	To receipt and review of draft email to landowner group regarding OEB Procedural Order No. 4. To receiving instructions from senior counsel to send same to landowner group. To sending same to landowner group accordingly.	0.3	\$ 170.00	\$ !	51.00 Communication	With Clients
Nadine Otten	9/30/2022	To receipt of instructions to do research related to OEB regulatory hearing. To discussions with co-counsel to distribute research. To advising senior counsel of research topic and expected timeline for producing same.	0.3	\$ 170.00	\$ !	51.00 Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	10/3/2022	To receipt of instructions from senior counsel regarding timeline for closing arguments. To meeting with administrative team to delegate rescheduling meetings with HONI clients to facilitate preparing and filing closing submissions with OEB.  To internal correspondence with team regarding researching Hansard/policy documents to determine legislative intent behind granting government the statutory power to declare priority projects.	0.5	\$ 170.00	\$ 8	85.00 Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	10/3/2022	To receiving instructions from senior counsel to prepare draft email to landowners to update them on status of application and clarify timelines going forward. To drafting same and sending to senior counsel for review and approval. To receiving approval from senior counsel. To sending email to landowner group.	0.5	\$ 170.00	\$ 8	85.00 Communication	With Clients
Nadine Otten	10/4/2022	To receiving instructions from senior counsel regarding researching the test for quality/reliability for use in closing argument submission.  To internal meeting with co-counsel to provide overviews of our individual progress on OEB research and make a plan for next steps and to discuss any other HONI-related questions.	0.7	\$ 170.00	\$ 1:	19.00 Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	9/27/2022	To meeting with co-counsel re procedural order, client questions and next steps for application by HONI.	0.3	\$ 170.00	\$!	51.00 Decision	Review
Nadine Otten	10/6/2022	To receipt of instructions from senior counsel regarding preparing book of authorities for closing submissions. To correspondence with co-counsel to distribute work with respect to same.  To reviewing, editing, and commenting on TRF's draft submissions in advance of filing. To discussing content of submissions with team internally.	1.3	\$ 170.00	\$ 2	21.00 Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	11/25/2022	To receipt and review of decision and order of OEB on HONI's s.92 application. To discussing same with team internally. To reviewing OEB Act and Expropriations Act to determine and confirm next steps in regulatory proceedings. To receipt of instructions from senior counsel to prepare summary of OEB decision and order for delivery to landowners. To drafting summary and sending same to senior counsel for review and remission.	2.1	\$ 170.00	\$ 3!	57.00 Decision	Review
Nadine Otten	11/28/2022	To reviewing HONI's s.92 application. To meeting with senior counsel to discuss submissions re. costs and prior motions and to receive instructions to draft same. To providing instructions to research clerk for researching OEB cost submissions. To reviewing Practice Direction for Cost Claims and researching applicable form for submissions. To drafting submissions and finalizing same with senior counsel.	5	\$ 170.00	\$ 8!	50.00 Submissions	Written Submissions
Nadine Otten	8/15/2022	To reviewing HONI's response interrogatories and noting up same.	1.6	\$ 170.00	\$ 2	72.00 Discovery	Review Interrogatory Responses
Nadine Otten	5/12/2022	To review and noting-up of HONI's s.92 application. To preparing high-level overview of same.	3	\$ 170.00	\$ 5:	10.00 Review Application and Evidence	Review Application and Evidence

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Sum of Billable (\$	
Communication	7.4	\$	1,258.00
With Clients	4.6	\$	782.00
With Other Parties	2.8	\$	476.00
Decision	3.9	\$	663.00
Review	3.9	\$	663.00
Discovery	6.8	\$	1,156.00
Preparation of Interrogatories	5.2	\$	884.00
Review Interrogatory Responses	1.6	\$	272.00
Intervenor Evidence	1.3	\$	221.00
Preparation	1.3	\$	221.00
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>	3	\$	510.00
Review Application and Evidence	3	\$	510.00
Submissions	22	\$	3,740.00
Written Submissions	22	\$	3,740.00
Grand Total	44.4	\$	7,548.00

## **Dunya Baroudi-Ginn**

CASE **COST CLAIM**  **INTERVENOR NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

to Construct (New): Hydro One

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

Submitted

Networks Inc.

qmross@rossfirm.com

FILING PARTICIPANT

**NEW PARTICIPANT**  **NON-FILING** 

**NON-FILING** 

Baroudi-Ginn, Dunya; +1 (519) 524-5532

dunya@rossfirm.com

No

**PARTICIPANT F. NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT L. NAME** 

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR Articling Student/Paralegal

**COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF **HOURLY RATE** 100

**HST RATE** 

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE**  **CHARGED** 13.00

**CV** Required

**HEARINGS** 

**CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS** 

No No Yes

HEARINGS

<u>Name</u>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	Sub Total	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	Total
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		100		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		100		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		100		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		100		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		100		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		100		13.00		
lssues List						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		100		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation	0.60	100	60.00	13.00	7.80	67.80
Interrogatory Responses		100		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		100		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Attendance		100		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		100		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		100		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		100		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		100		13.00		
Oral Submissions		100		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		100		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		100		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	0.40	100	40.00	13.00	5.20	45.20
With Other Parties		100		13.00	0.20	
Motions				. 3.00		
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		100		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		100		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		100		13.00		
Confidentiality		.00		10.00		

Preparation of Application for	100	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	100	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	100	13.00		
Decision				
Review	100	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	100	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	100	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	100.00			113.00

<u>Attachment Document Type Import Message</u>

DBG Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
DBG Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Row Labels	Sum of Hours	Sum of Billable (\$)
Dunya Baroudi-Ginn	1	100
Communication	0.4	40
With Clients	0.4	40
<b>Invevenor Evidence</b>	0.6	60
Preparation	0.6	60
<b>Grand Total</b>	1	100

Date	Hours	Description	Rate (\$)	Billable (\$)	User	Category	Subcategory
		To providing update and information to landowner group regarding HONI			Dunya Baroudi-		
	6/14/2022	0.2 Application for Leave to Construct with OEB.		100	20 Ginn	Communication	With Clients
		To telephone call with Louis Roesch (OFA) to discuss landowner			Dunya Baroudi-		
	6/17/2022	0.2 questions and to schedule meeting with corporate team to discuss same.		100	20 Ginn	Communication	With Clients
		To email communications with S.E.A Limited in order for them to assist			Dunya Baroudi-	Invevenor	
	7/7/2022	0.6 our team with the expropriation process.		100	60 Ginn	Evidence	Preparation
		1			100		

## **Edward Brill**

CASE **COST CLAIM**  **INTERVENOR NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross

to Construct (New): Hydro One

FILING PARTICIPANT

qmross@rossfirm.com

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

Submitted

Networks Inc.

NEW

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING** 

Brill, Edward; +1 (519) 524-5532 qmross@rossfirm.com

**PARTICIPANT** 

No

**PARTICIPANT L. NAME** 

**HOURLY RATE** 

**HST RATE** 

**CHARGED** 

0.00

320

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR

**COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

33

CV STATUS (FOR

Consultant

CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE** 

CV Provided within Previous 24 December 01, 2022

Months

**HEARINGS CONSULTATIONS** 

Yes No Yes

<b>HEAR</b>	INGS
-------------	------

320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320 320	160.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		160.00
320 320 320 320		0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00		
320 320 320		0.00 0.00 0.00		
320 320		0.00 0.00		
320 320		0.00 0.00		
320 320		0.00 0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320		0.00		
320				
- ·				
	320 320 320 320	320 320 320 320	320 0.00 320 0.00 320 0.00 320 0.00	320 0.00 320 0.00 320 0.00 320 0.00

Preparation of Application for	320	0.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	320	0.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	320	0.00		
Decision				
Review	320	0.00		
Rate Order				
Review	320	0.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	320	0.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	160.00		0.00	160.00

Attachment Document Type Import Message

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf 2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf Time Docket

Invoice

### **DISBURSEMENTS**

**Atchmnt Other** <u>Atchmnt</u> Qty Cost/ Net <u>HST</u> Rationale/ **Name Provided** Unit Cost Rate HST Taxes/Tip <u>Total</u> Required **Comment** 

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Related Disbursement Claim Type Claim Type Import Message
2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. Time Docker Hearings

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366 4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf

2022.09.26 SEA Ltd. invoice 7660366

4890-8882-6165 v1.pdf Invoice Hearings



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

#### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

**CURRENT CHARGES** – S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Professional Services \$ 6,379.00 Expenses 0.00

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

#### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

### Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

<b>Professional Services:</b>		Hours	Amount
Brill, Edward			
08/09/22	Review Discovery Documents	3.50	1,155.00
08/09/22	Review Documents & Photos	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Report Preparation	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Client Contact	0.50	165.00
08/29/22	Review Documents & Photos	3.00	990.00
08/31/22	Report Preparation	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Technical Review	0.50	160.00
07/07/22	Project File Management - Coordination of file material received.	1.00	90.00
08/11/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the summary report.	1.60	144.00
09/02/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the report.	0.50	45.00
	Total Professional Services	21.60	\$ 6,379.00

Total This Invoice:	Amount

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

Page 1 of 1



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

#### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

**CURRENT CHARGES** – S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Professional Services \$ 6,379.00 Expenses 0.00

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00



ACH: SEAlimited.com/ACHinfo Credit Card: SEAlimited.com/pay

Remit Checks to SEA, Ltd.

P.O. Box 932837 Cleveland, OH 44193 Invoice Date: September 26, 2022 S-E-A Matter No. 07.124476 S-E-A Invoice No. 7660366

Federal ID. No. 72-1569235

SEAlimited.com/W9

Inquiries: accounting@SEAlimited.com

The Ross Firm Professional Corporation Quinn Ross 100-144 Courthouse Square Goderich, Ontario N7A 1M9

#### **Matter Information**

The Chatham to Lakeshore 230KV Transmission Line / File Review

### Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

<b>Professional Services:</b>		Hours	Amount
Brill, Edward			
08/09/22	Review Discovery Documents	3.50	1,155.00
08/09/22	Review Documents & Photos	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Report Preparation	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Review Drawings & Exhibits	2.00	660.00
08/11/22	Client Contact	0.50	165.00
08/29/22	Review Documents & Photos	3.00	990.00
08/31/22	Report Preparation	2.50	825.00
08/10/22	Technical Review	0.50	160.00
07/07/22	Project File Management - Coordination of file material received.	1.00	90.00
08/11/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the summary report.	1.60	144.00
09/02/22	Report Processing - Preparation/finalization of the report.	0.50	45.00
	Total Professional Services	21.60	\$ 6,379.00

Total This Invoice:	Amount

Total This Invoice \$ 6,379.00

Page 1 of 1

# **Danielle Landry**

CASE **COST CLAIM**  **INTERVENOR NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

EB-2022-0140: Facilities: Leave EB-2022-0140: 1: Quinn Ross to Construct (New): Hydro One

Ross, Quinn; +1 (519) 524-5532

Submitted

Networks Inc.

qmross@rossfirm.com

**FILING PARTICIPANT** 

NEW **PARTICIPANT** 

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING** 

Landry, Danielle; +1 (519) 524-5532 dlandry@rossfirm.com

No

**PARTICIPANT L. NAME** 

**HOURLY RATE** 

**HST RATE** 

230

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR

**CONSULTATIONS** 

2013

**COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

**RELEVANT EXPERIENCE** 

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

Legal Counsel

CONSULTANT/ANALYST) **LAST CV DATE** 

**CHARGED** 13.00

**CV** Required

**HEARINGS** 

Yes No No

$\vdash$	IF.	Δ	R	IN	IGS
	ш	▭		IΙV	S

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Sub Total</b>	HST Rate	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		230		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		230		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
ssues List						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
ntervenor Evidence						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		230		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		230		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance		230		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		230		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		230		13.00		
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		230		13.00		
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
Communication						
With Client		230		13.00		
With Other Parties		230		13.00		
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials	0.70	230	161.00	13.00	20.93	181.93
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Confidentiality		200		. 5.00		

Preparation of Application for	230	13.00		
Confidentiality				
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00		
Decision				
Review	230	13.00		
Rate Order				
Review	230	13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00		
Total Service Provider Fees				
Total Service Provider Fees:	161.0	00	20.93	181.93

<u>Attachment Document Type Import Message</u>

DL Dockets and Totals.pdf Time Docket

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment
DL Dockets and
Totals.pdf

**Related Disbursement Claim** 

**Document** 

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Date	Hours	Description  Motion to Review- inquiry from M. Kellow re: case law on admissibility of relevant evidence and legal test for	,	Billable (\$) User	Category	Subcategory Preparation of Motion
	8/9/2022	0.4 "relevance"; review section in The Law of Evidence Test and provide leading SCC decision on this;	230	92 Danielle Landry	Motions	Materials  Propagation of Motion
	8/10/2022	0.3 Motion to Review- provide further case law on test on "relevancy" of evidence to M. Kellow, as requested;	230	69 Danielle Landry	Motions	Preparation of Motion Materials
		0.7		161		

Row Labels	Sum of Hours Sum of Billable (\$)	
Danielle Landry	0.7	161
Motions	0.7	161
Preparation of Motion Materials	0.7	161
<b>Grand Total</b>	0.7	161