## **Scott Pollock**

CASE

**COST CLAIM** 

**INTERVENOR NAME** 

**PARTICIPANT CLAIM STATUS** 

EB-2021-0110: Rates: Distribution: Hydro One EB-2021-0110:3:Scott

Pollock, Scott; +1 (613) 787-3541

In Progress

Networks Inc.

Pollock

No

spollock@blg.com

FILING PARTICIPANT

Pollock, Scott; +1 (613) 787-3541

spollock@blg.com

NEW **PARTICIPANT** 

**NON-FILING PARTICIPANT F. NAME**  **NON-FILING** 

PARTICIPANT L. NAME

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE** 

YEAR CALLED TO BAR 2016

**COMPLETED YEARS** PRACTICING/YEARS OF **RELEVANT EXPERIENCE**  **HOURLY RATE** 230

**CV STATUS (FOR** 

Legal Counsel

CONSULTANT/ANALYST)

**LAST CV DATE** 

**HST RATE CHARGED** 

13.00

**CV** Required

**HEARINGS** 

Yes

**CONSULTATIONS DISBURSEMENTS** 

No Yes

$\vdash$	IE	Δ	R	INI	IGS
	IC.	М	$\boldsymbol{\Gamma}$	ΗV	SO

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<b>Hourly Rate</b>	<b>Sub Total</b>	<b>HST Rate</b>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
Review Application and Evidence						
Review Application and Evidence		230		13.00		
Discovery						
Preparation of Interrogatories		230		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses	5.50	230	1,265.00	13.00	164.45	1,429.45
Technical Conference Preparation		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		230		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		230		13.00		
Issues List						
Preparation	0.60	230	138.00	13.00	17.94	155.94
Attendance at Issues Conference		230		13.00		
Intervenor Evidence						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses	0.30	230	69.00	13.00	8.97	77.97
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance		230		13.00		
at Hearing						
Settlement Conference / ADR						
Preparation	12.60	230	2,898.00	13.00	376.74	3,274.74
Attendance	34.90	230	8,027.00	13.00	1,043.51	9,070.51
Preparation of Settlement Proposal	7.60	230	1,748.00	13.00	227.24	1,975.24
Attendance at Presentation to Panel	1.70	230	391.00	13.00	50.83	441.83
Oral Hearing						
Preparation		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		230		13.00		
Submissions						
Written Submissions		230		13.00		
Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		230		13.00		
Other Attendance						
Other Attendance		230		13.00		
Communication						
With Client	2.10	230	483.00	13.00	62.79	545.79
With Other Parties	0.50	230	115.00	13.00	14.95	129.95
Motions						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		230		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		230		13.00		
Confidentiality		200		.0.00		

Preparation of Application for	230	13.00	
Confidentiality			
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality	230	13.00	
Decision			
Review	230	13.00	
Rate Order			
Review	230	13.00	
Prepare Submission on Rate Order	230	13.00	
Total Service Provider Fees			
Total Service Provider Fees:	15,134.00	)	1,967.42 17,101.42

**Attachments** 

Attachment <u>Document Type</u> <u>Import Message</u>

Cost Claim 2021-0110.pdf Time Docket Dockets from 2022 only being shown here as there

was a rate change

**DISBURSEMENTS** 

<u>HST</u> Other **Atchmnt Atchmnt** Qty Cost/ Net Rationale/ HST Taxes/Tip <u>Name</u> **Provided** Unit Cost Rate <u>Total</u> Comment Required

Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

Attachment Cost Claim 2021-0110.pdf **Related Disbursement Claim** 

<u>Document</u>

Type Claim Type
Time Docker Hearings

Import Message
Dockets from 2022 only

being shown here as there was a rate change



Date	Base Amt	Bs Hrs	Narrative	OBE Category	
11/29/2021	\$187.00	1.1	Reviewing interrogatory responses.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
11/30/2021	\$272.00	1.6	Reviewing interrogatory responses.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
12/6/2021	\$663.00	3.9	Reviewing interrogatory responses; correspondence to the Board regarding technical conference time estimates.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
12/3/2021	\$272.00	1.6	Reviewing interrogatory responses.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
12/2/2021	\$527.00	3.1	Reviewing interrogatory responses.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
12/7/2021	\$34.00	0.2	Attending technical conference test session.	Attending Technical Conference	
12/7/2021	\$136.00	0.8	Preparing technical conference questions.	Preparing for technical conference	
12/7/2021	\$34.00	0.2	Reviewing issues list.	Preparing issue list	
12/9/2021	\$272.00	1.6	Reviewing interrogatory responses.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
12/14/2021	\$1,275.00	7.5	Attending technical conference.	Attending Technical Conference	
12/15/2021	\$1,190.00	7	Attending technical conference.	Attending Technical Conference	
12/16/2021	\$1,105.00	6.5	Attending technical conference.	Attending Technical Conference	
12/17/2021	\$663.00	3.9	Attending technical conference.	Attending Technical Conference	
12/20/2021	\$51.00	0.3	Final review of draft issues list and previous comments.	Preparing issues list	
1/10/2022	\$46.00	0.2	Reviewing final copy of issues list; e-mail to Board Staff.	Preparing issues list	
1/6/2022	\$529.00	2.3	Reviewing responses to undertakings.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
1/13/2022	\$736.00	3.2	Reviewing productivity expert reports.	Reviewing interrogatory responses	
1/17/2022	\$276.00	1.2	Developing application summary and recommendations for client in advance of settlement conference/hearing.	Preparing for settlement conference	
1/21/2022	\$345.00	1.5	Preparing summary and position recommendations for CME for settlement conference.	Preparing for settlement conference	
1/24/2022	\$69.00	0.3	Drafting interrogatories for PEG.	Interrogatory responses	
1/24/2022	\$483.00	2.1	Preparing client brief regarding issues and advice on potential settlement.	Preparing settlement proposal	
1/7/2022	\$23.00	0.1	Reviewing issues list for additional comments.	preparing issues list	
1/7/2022	\$368.00	1.6	Preparing summary and recommendations for client presentation on this case.	Preparing for settlement conference	
1/31/2022	\$230.00	1	Attending intervenor call regarding settlement conference.	Preparing for settlement conference	
1/31/2022	\$621.00	2.7	Reviewing distribution related issues in advance of settlement conference for intervenor proposal.	Preparing settlement proposal	
2/7/2022	\$391.00	1.7	Attending settlement conference date for updates from Hydro One on new evidence.	attending at presentation to panel	
8/10/2022	\$299.00	1.3	Preparing for Hydro One settlement conference.	Preparing for settlement conference	
8/12/2022	\$46.00	0.2	E-mail to client re: settlement conference.	Communicating with Client	
				Preparing for settlement	
8/11/2022	\$805.00	3.5	Call with intervenors to prepare for settlement conference; reviewing record for settlement conference.	conference Preparing for settlement	
8/14/2022	\$575.00	2.5	Reviewing record in advance of settlement conference.	conference	
8/15/2022	\$1,725.00	7.5	Preparing for and attending day 1 of the settlement conference/storm damage discussion conference.	Attending Settlement conference	
8/16/2022	\$1,932.00	8.4	Attending day 2 of the settlement conference.	Attending Settlement conference	
8/17/2022	\$1,863.00	8.1	Attending day 3 of the settlement conference.	Attending Settlement conference	
8/22/2022	\$1,426.00	6.2	Attending settlement conference.	Attending Settlement conference	
8/23/2022	\$828.00	3.6	Attending settlement conference.	Attending Settlement conference	
8/24/2022	\$253.00	1.1	Attending settlement conference.	Attending Settlement conference	
9/26/2022	\$69.00	0.3	Reviewing settlement draft.	Preparing settlement proposal	
10/4/2022	\$506.00	2.2	Reviewing settlement documents and appendices.	Preparing settlement proposal	
10/3/2022	\$483.00	2.1	Call with client regarding settlement documents; reviewing settlement documents.	Communicating with client	
10/19/2022	\$69.00	0.3	Reviewing CDM settlement issue.	Preparing settlement proposal	
10/21/2022	\$115.00	0.5	Meeting with intervenors re: CDM issue.	Communicating with other	
TOTAL:	\$21,792.00	93.5			