

# EB-2022-0157 : 1 : Cathy Galler

COST CLAIM NUMBER  
1144

SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE  
February 23, 2023

CLAIM STATUS  
Approved by Finance

EB#  
EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct  
(New): Enbridge Gas Inc.

OTHER EB#S

PHASE #\*  
1

INTERVENOR  
Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570  
cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

INTERVENOR COMPANY\*  
Industrial Gas Users Association,  
Ottawa: Corporation

INTERVENOR TYPE  
Full Registrant

HST RATE ONTARIO  
13.00

EXCHANGE RATE

COUNTRY  
Canada

HST NUMBER  
89659 3323 RT0001

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED  
No

EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Participant Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	6,376.59	17.10	Submitted
No	,	Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com	90.40	0.80	Submitted
Yes	Chris , Hummel		4,341.46	22.60	Submitted

## ATTACHMENTS

Attachment	Document Type	Claim Type	Import Message
IGUA EB-2022-0157 Cost Claim 022220231251.pdf			

# EB-2022-0157 : 1 : Cathy Galler

COST CLAIM NUMBER 1144	SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE February 23, 2023	CLAIM STATUS Approved by Finance
EB# EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas Inc.	OTHER EB#S	PHASE #* 1
INTERVENOR Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com	INTERVENOR COMPANY* Industrial Gas Users Association, Ottawa: Corporation	INTERVENOR TYPE Full Registrant
HST RATE ONTARIO 13.00	EXCHANGE RATE	COUNTRY Canada
HST NUMBER 89659 3323 RT0001	LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED No	EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

New	Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name	Filing Participant	Total (\$)	Total Participant Hours	Participant Claim Status
No	,	Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	6,376.59	17.10	Submitted
No	,	Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com	90.40	0.80	Submitted
Yes	Chris , Hummel		4,341.46	22.60	Submitted

TOTAL LEGAL/CONSULTANT/OTHER FEES 9,565.00	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 0.00	TOTAL HST 1,243.45
---	-----------------------------	-----------------------

TOTAL CLAIM 10,808.45	TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED
--------------------------	----------------------

TOTAL HOURS CLAIMED 40.50	TOTAL HOURS DISALLOWED
------------------------------	------------------------

REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 2	REASON FOR DISALLOWANCE - 3
-------------------------	-----------------------------	-----------------------------

MAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TO  
Industrial Gas Users Association

SEND PAYMENT TO ADDRESS  
851 Industrial Avenue, P.O. Box 30  
Ottawa, ON  
K1G 4L3

ATTENTION  
Shahrzad Rahbar

### SUBMIT SECTION

I am a representative of the Party. I have examined all of the documentation in support of this cost claim. The costs incurred and time spent are directly related to the Party's participation in the OEB Process referred to above.

This cost claim does not include any costs for work done, or time spent, by a person that is an employee or officer of the Party as described in section 6.05 and 6.09 of the OEB's Practice Direction on Cost Awards.

The information (fees and disbursements) filed in this cost claim is complete and accurate and in accordance with the OEB's Practice Direction for Cost Awards and Appendix A, the Cost Awards Tariff.

# EB-2022-0157 : 1 : Cathy Galler

COST CLAIM NUMBER  
1144

SUBMISSION DEADLINE DATE  
February 23, 2023

CLAIM STATUS  
Approved by Finance

EB#  
EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave to Construct  
(New): Enbridge Gas Inc.

OTHER EB#S

PHASE #\*  
1

INTERVENOR  
Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570  
cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

INTERVENOR COMPANY\*  
Industrial Gas Users Association,  
Ottawa: Corporation

INTERVENOR TYPE  
Full Registrant

HST RATE ONTARIO  
13.00

EXCHANGE RATE

COUNTRY  
Canada

HST NUMBER  
89659 3323 RT0001

LATE SUBMISSION ALLOWED  
No

EXTENSION DEADLINE DATE

## PARTICIPANTS

<b>New</b>	<b>Non-Filing Participant First, Last Name</b>	<b>Filing Participant</b>	<b>Total (\$)</b>	<b>Total Participant Hours</b>	<b>Participant Claim Status</b>
No	,	Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670 ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com	6,376.59	17.10	Submitted
No	,	Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570 cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com	90.40	0.80	Submitted
Yes	Chris , Hummel		4,341.46	22.60	Submitted

SUBMITTED BY  
Ian Mondrow

DATE SUBMITTED  
February 22, 2023

**Ian Mondrow****CASE**

EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave  
to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas  
Inc.

**COST CLAIM**

EB-2022-0157 : 1 : Cathy  
Galler

**INTERVENOR NAME**

Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416)  
369-4570  
cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

**PARTICIPANT  
CLAIM STATUS**

Submitted

**FILING PARTICIPANT**

Mondrow, Ian; +1 (416) 369-4670  
ian.mondrow@gowlingwlg.com

**NEW  
PARTICIPANT**

No

**NON-FILING  
PARTICIPANT F. NAME****NON-FILING  
PARTICIPANT L. NAME****SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE\***

Legal Counsel

**YEAR CALLED TO BAR**

1991

**COMPLETED YEARS  
PRACTICING/YEARS OF  
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE\***

32

**HOURLY RATE**

330

**HST RATE CHARGED\***

13.00

**CV STATUS (FOR  
CONSULTANT/ANALYST)**

CV Required

**LAST CV DATE****OVERRIDE  
HOURLY RATE**

False

**HST NUMBER**

89659 3323 RT0001

**HEARINGS**

Yes

**CONSULTATIONS**

No

**DISBURSEMENTS**

No

---

# HEARINGS

Hearings Hours	Hearings Subtotal (\$)	Hearings Total Tax (\$)		Hearings Total (\$)		
17.10	5,643.00	733.59		6,376.59		
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence	5.50	330	1,815.00	13.00	235.95	2,050.95
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories		330		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation	1.10	330	363.00	13.00	47.19	410.19
Technical Conference Attendance	2.70	330	891.00	13.00	115.83	1,006.83
Technical Conference Follow Up	0.20	330	66.00	13.00	8.58	74.58
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		330		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		330		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		330		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance		330		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		330		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		330		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		330		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	0.70	330	231.00	13.00	30.03	261.03
Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		330		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		330		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client	1.50	330	495.00	13.00	64.35	559.35
With Other Parties	4.50	330	1,485.00	13.00	193.05	1,678.05
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		330		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		330		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						
Preparation of Application for Confidentiality		330		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	0.90	330	297.00	13.00	38.61	335.61
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		330		13.00		
<b>Decision</b>						
Review		330		13.00		
<b>Rate Order</b>						
Review		330		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		330		13.00		
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>						
Total Service Provider Fees:	17.10		5,643.00		733.59	6,376.59

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_CostClaim_TimeDocket_Mondrow_20230222.pdf	Time Docket	

---

**Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments****Attachment****Related Disbursement Claim****Document****Type****Claim Type****Import Message**

IGUA\_CostClaim\_Ti  
meDocket\_Mondrow  
\_20230222.pdf

Time Docket Hearings

August 18, 2022  
INVOICE: 19889141

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>RAE</b>	2022-07-13	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review intervenor e-mails and Notice of Application; review OEB RESS regarding status of the matter; instructions for preparation of Letter of Intervention;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-07-15	0.20	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing letter of intervention;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-07-15	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review and revise intervention letter for filing;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Galler, Cathy	0.20
Mondrow, Ian	0.70
<b>Total</b>	<b>0.90</b>

September 28, 2022  
INVOICE: 19911847

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>RAE</b>	2022-08-17	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order No. 1; review intervention notices from parties not habitually intervening to identify interests/potential issues raised; review OEB LTC standard issues list and start to consider scope of detailed evidence review/IRs;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Mondrow, Ian	0.50
<b>Total</b>	<b>0.50</b>



October 25, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19928068

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
TCP	2022-09-08	0.10	Ian Mondrow	Review Polution Probe letter regarding Technical Conference presentation request and review status of proceeding;
COM-OP	2022-09-27	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review ED letter regarding intended evidence; correspondence with intervenor representatives regarding issues for the case and initial views;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Mondrow, Ian	0.40
<b>Total</b>	<b>0.40</b>

November 23, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19947107

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
TCP	2022-10-03	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Review status of record and Technical Conference filings;
TCP	2022-10-05	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review Panhandle Expansion Technical Conference-related OEB procedural direction and correspondence/questions; update note to S. Rahbar;
TCA	2022-10-06	2.70	Ian Mondrow	Attend Technical Conference; update note to IGUA;
RAE	2022-10-06	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review various correspondence/filings regarding evidence and updates;
RAE	2022-10-31	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review undertaking responses of interest and other application and OEB materials for briefing to C. Hummel;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Mondrow, Ian	4.40
<b>Total</b>	<b>4.40</b>

December 21, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19967767

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
COM-OP	2022-11-02	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review correspondence from EGI regarding extension for reply, etc. and review note from ED regarding concerns on scope of reply; update note to C. Hummel;
RAE	2022-11-03	0.50	Christopher Hummel	File briefing with I. Mondrow regarding intervention in Panhandle extension application;
COM-OP	2022-11-03	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review and consider Pollution Probe letter regarding 134/188 overlap and request for OEB clarification; meet with C. Hummel to brief him on application and IGUA issue/perspective;
RAE	2022-11-04	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of application materials and commence drafting directions note for C. Hummel;
RAE	2022-11-07	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Conclude preliminary review of application materials;
CONF	2022-11-08	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI letter regarding review of confidentiality ruling on Technical Conference undertaking responses related to customer demand; note to C. Galler regarding execution of confidentiality undertakings;
RAE	2022-11-11	2.30	Ian Mondrow	Conclude preliminary review of file, gather related reference materials and hand-off note to C. Hummel.
RAE	2022-11-16	0.40	Christopher Hummel	Discussion with I. Mondrow regarding application context; downloaded and organized review materials;
SUB	2022-11-21	0.40	Christopher Hummel	Assembled and reviewed documents on cost allocation for Panhandle expansion and prior IGUA submissions in relevant OEB proceedings;
RAE	2022-11-22	2.40	Christopher Hummel	Conducted detailed review of application materials and I. Mondrow briefing notes;
COM-CL	2022-11-29	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Update to Ontario Caucus regarding case status and proposed argument theme;
RAE	2022-11-30	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review recent filings; message to check in with C. Hummel;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

December 21, 2022  
INVOICE: 19967767

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Hummel, Christopher	3.70
Mondrow, Ian	5.40
<b>Total</b>	<b>9.10</b>

December 31, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19990225

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>SUB</b>	2022-12-01	0.20	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding intervenor submissions;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-12-02	1.30	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed background materials and briefing notes from I. Mondrow; phone call with I. Mondrow to discuss strategy for IGUA submissions;
<b>CONF</b>	2022-12-02	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding review of confidentiality decision; note to C. Galler to prepare Undertakings for access to information ruled confidential; update call with C. Hummel to review status and concepts to address in final submissions;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-12-04	2.10	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134 and EBO 188 and recent OEB decisions in the context of Pandhandle expansion; drafted part of IGUA submissions;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-04	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor correspondence sharing positions and issues to be addressed; note to C. Hummel regarding additional perspective on concerns of large industrial customers with undue cross-subsidies;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-05	0.50	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence with other intervenors' counsel and I. Mondrow regarding final submissions;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-05	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review draft confidentiality Declaration and Undertaking and covering letter and make revisions; review EGI letter regarding abeyance request and related intervenor correspondence and comment to co-ordinating intervenors;
<b>CONF</b>	2022-12-06	0.40	Cathy Galler	Drafting, formatting and filing Declaration and Undertakings;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-06	2.40	Christopher Hummel	Prepared for and attended meeting with intervenors' counsel regarding EGI's request for an abeyance and potential responses; correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding same;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-06	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor call regarding abeyance and relevant issues for more work;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-07	0.30	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence regarding IGUA letter on requested abeyance;
<b>COM-OP-0.8</b> <b>COM-CL-0.8</b>	2022-12-07	1.60	Ian Mondrow	<u>Communication with intervenors regarding potential letter to OEB associated with requested abeyance and drafting letter to the OEB for consideration by S. Rahbar; review message from S. Rahbar confirming instructions; review edits from C. Hummel and finalize letter; note to C. Galler for filing;</u>
<b>TC-FOL-UP</b>	2022-12-07	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review confidential Technical Conference undertakings

December 31, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19990225

				received;
SUB	2022-12-08	0.20	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing correspondence regarding EGI's request for abeyance;
SUB	2022-12-08	0.50	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EGI's application evidence and information request responses; read IGUA's submissions on Hourly Allocation Factor;
COM-OP	2022-12-08	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review FRPO letter regarding abeyance and CIAC's; review ED e-mail with proposed letter content and respond;
SUB	2022-12-09	1.70	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed details of EGI's application and drafted IGUA's final submissions;
COM-CL	2022-12-09	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review ED letter regarding abeyance and CIACs; forward recent correspondence to IGUA with note;
SUB	2022-12-11	0.90	Christopher Hummel	Drafted portion of IGUA written submissions speaking to Hourly Allocation Factor;
RAE	2022-12-12	1.70	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134 and 188, and carefully reviewed EGI application Economic Analysis and Project Need Analysis;
SUB	2022-12-12	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review Pollution Probe letter regarding abeyance and note to C. Hummel with comment in the context of IGUA's position; discussion with C. Hummel relating to draft IGUA submissions/issues/approach;
SUB	2022-12-13	4.20	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134; drafted sections of written submissions summarizing test in EBO 134 and meaning of public interest; analyzed prior OEB orders on Panhandle expansions;
SUB	2022-12-14	3.10	Christopher Hummel	Drafted IGUA written submissions on public interest, EBO 134 and history of Panhandle system;
COM-CL	2022-12-14	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding abeyance and CIAC issue consideration update to IGUA;
	<del>2022-12-15</del>	<del>7.10</del>	<del>Christopher Hummel</del>	<del>Drafted IGUA written submissions regarding history of Panhandle and St. Clair systems, EBO 134, cost allocation principles, "undue burden" test and the public interest;</del>
	<del>2022-12-16</del>	<del>5.20</del>	<del>Christopher Hummel</del>	<del>Drafted written submissions of IGUA speaking to Hourly Allocation Factor, introductory section; proofread and revised draft written submissions for IGUA;</del>

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Galler, Cathy	0.60
Hummel, Christopher	18.9 <del>31.20</del>
Mondrow, Ian	5.70
<b>Total</b>	<b>25.2 <del>37.50</del></b>

**Cathy Galler****CASE**

EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave  
to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas  
Inc.

**COST CLAIM**

EB-2022-0157 : 1 : Cathy  
Galler

**INTERVENOR NAME**

Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416)  
369-4570  
cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

**PARTICIPANT  
CLAIM STATUS**

Submitted

**FILING PARTICIPANT**

Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416) 369-4570  
cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

**NEW  
PARTICIPANT**

No

**NON-FILING  
PARTICIPANT F. NAME****NON-FILING  
PARTICIPANT L. NAME****SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE\***

Articling Student/Paralegal

**YEAR CALLED TO BAR****COMPLETED YEARS  
PRACTICING/YEARS OF  
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE\*****HOURLY RATE**

100

**HST RATE CHARGED\***

13.00

**CV STATUS (FOR  
CONSULTANT/ANALYST)**

CV Required

**LAST CV DATE****OVERRIDE  
HOURLY RATE**

False

**HST NUMBER**

89659 3323 RT0001

**HEARINGS**

Yes

**CONSULTATIONS**

No

**DISBURSEMENTS**

No

---

# HEARINGS

Hearings Hours	Hearings Subtotal (\$)	Hearings Total Tax (\$)	Hearings Total (\$)			
0.80	80.00	10.40	90.40			
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence		100		13.00		
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories		100		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		100		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		100		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		100		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		100		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		100		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		100		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		100		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Attendance		100		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		100		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		100		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		100		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		100		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	0.40	100	40.00	13.00	5.20	45.20
Oral Submissions		100		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		100		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		100		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		100		13.00		
With Other Parties		100		13.00		
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		100		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		100		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		100		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						
Preparation of Application for Confidentiality		100		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality	0.40	100	40.00	13.00	5.20	45.20
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		100		13.00		
<b>Decision</b>						
Review		100		13.00		
<b>Rate Order</b>						
Review		100		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		100		13.00		
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>						
Total Service Provider Fees:	0.80		80.00		10.40	90.40

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_CostClaim_TimeDocket_Galler_20230222.pdf	Time Docket	



---

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

### Attachment

IGUA\_CostClaim\_Ti  
meDocket\_Galler\_2  
0230222.pdf

### Related Disbursement Claim

### Document

#### Type

Time Docket

#### Claim Type

Hearings

### Import Message

August 18, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19889141

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>RAE</b>	2022-07-13	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review intervenor e-mails and Notice of Application; review OEB RESS regarding status of the matter; instructions for preparation of Letter of Intervention;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-07-15	0.20	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing letter of intervention;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-07-15	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review and revise intervention letter for filing;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Galler, Cathy	0.20
Mondrow, Ian	0.70
<b>Total</b>	<b>0.90</b>

December 31, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19990225

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
<b>SUB</b>	2022-12-01	0.20	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding intervenor submissions;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-12-02	1.30	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed background materials and briefing notes from I. Mondrow; phone call with I. Mondrow to discuss strategy for IGUA submissions;
<b>CONF</b>	2022-12-02	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding review of confidentiality decision; note to C. Galler to prepare Undertakings for access to information ruled confidential; update call with C. Hummel to review status and concepts to address in final submissions;
<b>SUB</b>	2022-12-04	2.10	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134 and EBO 188 and recent OEB decisions in the context of Pandhandle expansion; drafted part of IGUA submissions;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-04	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor correspondence sharing positions and issues to be addressed; note to C. Hummel regarding additional perspective on concerns of large industrial customers with undue cross-subsidies;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-05	0.50	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence with other intervenors' counsel and I. Mondrow regarding final submissions;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-05	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review draft confidentiality Declaration and Undertaking and covering letter and make revisions; review EGI letter regarding abeyance request and related intervenor correspondence and comment to co-ordinating intervenors;
<b>CONF</b>	2022-12-06	0.40	Cathy Galler	Drafting, formatting and filing Declaration and Undertakings;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-06	2.40	Christopher Hummel	Prepared for and attended meeting with intervenors' counsel regarding EGI's request for an abeyance and potential responses; correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding same;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-06	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor call regarding abeyance and relevant issues for more work;
<b>COM-OP</b>	2022-12-07	0.30	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence regarding IGUA letter on requested abeyance;
<b>COM-OP-0.8</b> <b>COM-CL-0.8</b>	2022-12-07	1.60	Ian Mondrow	<u>Communication with intervenors regarding potential letter to OEB associated with requested abeyance and drafting letter to the OEB for consideration by S. Rahbar; review message from S. Rahbar confirming instructions; review edits from C. Hummel and finalize letter; note to C. Galler for filing;</u>
<b>TC-FOL-UP</b>	2022-12-07	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review confidential Technical Conference undertakings

December 31, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19990225

				received;
SUB	2022-12-08	0.20	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing correspondence regarding EGI's request for abeyance;
SUB	2022-12-08	0.50	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EGI's application evidence and information request responses; read IGUA's submissions on Hourly Allocation Factor;
COM-OP	2022-12-08	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review FRPO letter regarding abeyance and CIAC's; review ED e-mail with proposed letter content and respond;
SUB	2022-12-09	1.70	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed details of EGI's application and drafted IGUA's final submissions;
COM-CL	2022-12-09	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review ED letter regarding abeyance and CIACs; forward recent correspondence to IGUA with note;
SUB	2022-12-11	0.90	Christopher Hummel	Drafted portion of IGUA written submissions speaking to Hourly Allocation Factor;
RAE	2022-12-12	1.70	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134 and 188, and carefully reviewed EGI application Economic Analysis and Project Need Analysis;
SUB	2022-12-12	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review Pollution Probe letter regarding abeyance and note to C. Hummel with comment in the context of IGUA's position; discussion with C. Hummel relating to draft IGUA submissions/issues/approach;
SUB	2022-12-13	4.20	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134; drafted sections of written submissions summarizing test in EBO 134 and meaning of public interest; analyzed prior OEB orders on Panhandle expansions;
SUB	2022-12-14	3.10	Christopher Hummel	Drafted IGUA written submissions on public interest, EBO 134 and history of Panhandle system;
COM-CL	2022-12-14	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding abeyance and CIAC issue consideration update to IGUA;
	<del>2022-12-15</del>	<del>7.10</del>	<del>Christopher Hummel</del>	<del>Drafted IGUA written submissions regarding history of Panhandle and St. Clair systems, EBO 134, cost allocation principles, "undue burden" test and the public interest;</del>
	<del>2022-12-16</del>	<del>5.20</del>	<del>Christopher Hummel</del>	<del>Drafted written submissions of IGUA speaking to Hourly Allocation Factor, introductory section; proofread and revised draft written submissions for IGUA;</del>

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

TK Name	Hours
Galler, Cathy	0.60
Hummel, Christopher	18.9 <del>31.20</del>
Mondrow, Ian	5.70
<b>Total</b>	25.2 <del>37.50</del>

**CASE**

EB-2022-0157: Facilities: Leave  
to Construct (New): Enbridge Gas  
Inc.

**COST CLAIM**

EB-2022-0157 : 1 : Cathy  
Galler

**INTERVENOR NAME**

Galler, Cathy ; +1 (416)  
369-4570  
cathy.galler@gowlingwlg.com

**PARTICIPANT  
CLAIM STATUS**

Submitted

**FILING PARTICIPANT****NEW  
PARTICIPANT**

Yes

**NON-FILING  
PARTICIPANT F. NAME**

Chris

**NON-FILING  
PARTICIPANT L. NAME**

Hummel

**SERVICE PROVIDER TYPE\***

Legal Counsel

**YEAR CALLED TO BAR**

2019

**COMPLETED YEARS  
PRACTICING/YEARS OF  
RELEVANT EXPERIENCE\***

3

**HOURLY RATE**

170

**HST RATE CHARGED\***

13.00

**CV STATUS (FOR  
CONSULTANT/ANALYST)**

CV Required

**LAST CV DATE****OVERRIDE  
HOURLY RATE**

False

**HST NUMBER**

89659 3323 RT0001

**HEARINGS**

Yes

**CONSULTATIONS**

No

**DISBURSEMENTS**

No

---

# HEARINGS

Hearings Hours	Hearings Subtotal (\$)	Hearings Total Tax (\$)	Hearings Total (\$)			
22.60	3,842.00	499.46	4,341.46			
<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hourly Rate</u>	<u>Sub Total</u>	<u>HST Rate</u>	<u>HST</u>	<u>Total</u>
<b>Review Application and Evidence</b>						
Review Application and Evidence	5.00	170	850.00	13.00	110.50	960.50
<b>Discovery</b>						
Preparation of Interrogatories		170		13.00		
Review Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Preparation		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Attendance		170		13.00		
Technical Conference Follow Up		170		13.00		
<b>Issues List</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Issues Conference		170		13.00		
<b>Intervenor Evidence</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Interrogatory Responses		170		13.00		
Preparation of Witness(es) for Attendance at Hearing		170		13.00		
<b>Settlement Conference / ADR</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance		170		13.00		
Preparation of Settlement Proposal		170		13.00		
Attendance at Presentation to Panel		170		13.00		
<b>Oral Hearing</b>						
Preparation		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Hearing		170		13.00		
<b>Submissions</b>						
Written Submissions	14.40	170	2,448.00	13.00	318.24	2,766.24
Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
Attendance at Oral Submissions		170		13.00		
<b>Other Attendance</b>						
Other Attendance		170		13.00		
<b>Communication</b>						
With Client		170		13.00		
With Other Parties	3.20	170	544.00	13.00	70.72	614.72
<b>Motions</b>						
Preparation of Motion(s) Materials		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on the Motion(s)		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Motion(s)		170		13.00		
<b>Confidentiality</b>						
Preparation of Application for Confidentiality		170		13.00		
Prepare Submissions on Confidentiality		170		13.00		
Attendance at Hearing on Confidentiality		170		13.00		
<b>Decision</b>						
Review		170		13.00		
<b>Rate Order</b>						
Review		170		13.00		
Prepare Submission on Rate Order		170		13.00		
<b>Total Service Provider Fees</b>						
Total Service Provider Fees:	22.60		3,842.00		499.46	4,341.46

## Attachments

<u>Attachment</u>	<u>Document Type</u>	<u>Import Message</u>
IGUA_CostClaim_TimeDocket_Hummel_20230222.pdf	Time Docket	

---

## Hearings, Consultations, Disbursements Attachments

### Attachment

IGUA\_CostClaim\_Ti  
meDocket\_Hummel  
\_20230222.pdf

### Related Disbursement Claim

### Document

#### Type

Time Docket

#### Claim Type

Hearings

### Import Message

December 21, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19967767

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
COM-OP	2022-11-02	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review correspondence from EGI regarding extension for reply, etc. and review note from ED regarding concerns on scope of reply; update note to C. Hummel;
RAE	2022-11-03	0.50	Christopher Hummel	File briefing with I. Mondrow regarding intervention in Panhandle extension application;
COM-OP	2022-11-03	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review and consider Pollution Probe letter regarding 134/188 overlap and request for OEB clarification; meet with C. Hummel to brief him on application and IGUA issue/perspective;
RAE	2022-11-04	1.10	Ian Mondrow	Continue review of application materials and commence drafting directions note for C. Hummel;
RAE	2022-11-07	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Conclude preliminary review of application materials;
CONF	2022-11-08	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review EGI letter regarding review of confidentiality ruling on Technical Conference undertaking responses related to customer demand; note to C. Galler regarding execution of confidentiality undertakings;
RAE	2022-11-11	2.30	Ian Mondrow	Conclude preliminary review of file, gather related reference materials and hand-off note to C. Hummel.
RAE	2022-11-16	0.40	Christopher Hummel	Discussion with I. Mondrow regarding application context; downloaded and organized review materials;
SUB	2022-11-21	0.40	Christopher Hummel	Assembled and reviewed documents on cost allocation for Panhandle expansion and prior IGUA submissions in relevant OEB proceedings;
RAE	2022-11-22	2.40	Christopher Hummel	Conducted detailed review of application materials and I. Mondrow briefing notes;
COM-CL	2022-11-29	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Update to Ontario Caucus regarding case status and proposed argument theme;
RAE	2022-11-30	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review recent filings; message to check in with C. Hummel;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**



December 21, 2022  
INVOICE: 19967767

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Hummel, Christopher	3.70
Mondrow, Ian	5.40
<b>Total</b>	<b>9.10</b>

December 31, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19990225

**Industrial Gas Users Association**  
**Our Matter: T1030316**  
**EGI Panhandle Regional Expansion Project (EB-2022-0157) (IGUA22-ON-EGI-LTC-7)**

**PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

	<b>Date</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>
SUB	2022-12-01	0.20	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding intervenor submissions;
SUB	2022-12-02	1.30	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed background materials and briefing notes from I. Mondrow; phone call with I. Mondrow to discuss strategy for IGUA submissions;
CONF	2022-12-02	0.70	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding review of confidentiality decision; note to C. Galler to prepare Undertakings for access to information ruled confidential; update call with C. Hummel to review status and concepts to address in final submissions;
SUB	2022-12-04	2.10	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134 and EBO 188 and recent OEB decisions in the context of Pandhandle expansion; drafted part of IGUA submissions;
COM-OP	2022-12-04	0.50	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor correspondence sharing positions and issues to be addressed; note to C. Hummel regarding additional perspective on concerns of large industrial customers with undue cross-subsidies;
COM-OP	2022-12-05	0.50	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence with other intervenors' counsel and I. Mondrow regarding final submissions;
COM-OP	2022-12-05	0.90	Ian Mondrow	Review draft confidentiality Declaration and Undertaking and covering letter and make revisions; review EGI letter regarding abeyance request and related intervenor correspondence and comment to co-ordinating intervenors;
CONF	2022-12-06	0.40	Cathy Galler	Drafting, formatting and filing Declaration and Undertakings;
COM-OP	2022-12-06	2.40	Christopher Hummel	Prepared for and attended meeting with intervenors' counsel regarding EGI's request for an abeyance and potential responses; correspondence with I. Mondrow regarding same;
COM-OP	2022-12-06	0.60	Ian Mondrow	Intervenor call regarding abeyance and relevant issues for more work;
COM-OP	2022-12-07	0.30	Christopher Hummel	Correspondence regarding IGUA letter on requested abeyance;
<u>COM-OP-0.8</u> <u>COM-CL-0.8</u>	2022-12-07	1.60	Ian Mondrow	<u>Communication with intervenors regarding potential letter to OEB associated with requested abeyance and drafting letter to the OEB for consideration by S. Rahbar; review message from S. Rahbar confirming instructions; review edits from C. Hummel and finalize letter; note to C. Galler for filing;</u>
TC-FOL-UP	2022-12-07	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review confidential Technical Conference undertakings

December 31, 2022  
 INVOICE: 19990225

				received;
SUB	2022-12-08	0.20	Cathy Galler	Formatting and filing correspondence regarding EGI's request for abeyance;
SUB	2022-12-08	0.50	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EGI's application evidence and information request responses; read IGUA's submissions on Hourly Allocation Factor;
COM-OP	2022-12-08	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review FRPO letter regarding abeyance and CIAC's; review ED e-mail with proposed letter content and respond;
SUB	2022-12-09	1.70	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed details of EGI's application and drafted IGUA's final submissions;
COM-CL	2022-12-09	0.20	Ian Mondrow	Review ED letter regarding abeyance and CIACs; forward recent correspondence to IGUA with note;
SUB	2022-12-11	0.90	Christopher Hummel	Drafted portion of IGUA written submissions speaking to Hourly Allocation Factor;
RAE	2022-12-12	1.70	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134 and 188, and carefully reviewed EGI application Economic Analysis and Project Need Analysis;
SUB	2022-12-12	0.40	Ian Mondrow	Review Pollution Probe letter regarding abeyance and note to C. Hummel with comment in the context of IGUA's position; discussion with C. Hummel relating to draft IGUA submissions/issues/approach;
SUB	2022-12-13	4.20	Christopher Hummel	Analyzed EBO 134; drafted sections of written submissions summarizing test in EBO 134 and meaning of public interest; analyzed prior OEB orders on Panhandle expansions;
SUB	2022-12-14	3.10	Christopher Hummel	Drafted IGUA written submissions on public interest, EBO 134 and history of Panhandle system;
COM-CL	2022-12-14	0.30	Ian Mondrow	Review Procedural Order regarding abeyance and CIAC issue consideration update to IGUA;
	2022-12-15	7.10	Christopher Hummel	Drafted IGUA written submissions regarding history of Panhandle and St. Clair systems, EBO 134, cost allocation principles, "undue burden" test and the public interest;
	2022-12-16	5.20	Christopher Hummel	Drafted written submissions of IGUA speaking to Hourly Allocation Factor, introductory section; proofread and revised draft written submissions for IGUA;

**Total Fees for Professional Services**

**SUMMARY OF FEES**

<b>TK Name</b>	<b>Hours</b>
Galler, Cathy	0.60
Hummel, Christopher	18.9 <del>31.20</del>
Mondrow, Ian	5.70
<b>Total</b>	25.2 <del>37.50</del>